
Regular Meeting
Tuesday, January 22, 2019 6:00 PM
Central 301 District Office, 275 South St, P.O. Box 396, Burlington, IL 60109

1. Pledge of Allegiance
2. Public Open Forum
A. Recognition of Visitors
B. Public Comments
C. Recognition - Larson and Darby
3. Action Reports
A. Consent Agenda
1) Minutes
B. Treasurer's Report
1) Payment of Bills
C. Bus bid for School Year 2018-2020
D. Review Closed Session Items for Public Release
E. Approve Board Policy 6:135 Accelerated Placement
4. Information Reports
A. Committee Reports
B. Student Services Department Staffing
C. Nominees for Educator of the Year
D. Board Candidate Community Forum - March 7, 2019
E. Legislative Breakfast - Monday, March 4, 2019 at Central High School
F. Enrollment Report
5. Freedom of Information Act (FOIA)
A. Merritt Credit Bureau Inc. - requested information for work performed 
by Mechanical Concepts of Illinois

6. Executive Session
A. Open Session
B. Action Items from Closed Session
1) Approve the Personnel Report
7. Board Open Forum
8. Adjourn



 

Central Community Unit School District 301 

Board of Education Minutes 
 

Where: Central Middle School Library Meeting:                         Regular 

Date: December 17, 2018 Time:                              6:00 p.m. 

 

Board Members Present  Administrators Present 
Gorman, Jeff Y   Stirn, Todd  Y 

C. Johnson Y  Mongan, Esther Y 

J. Marlovits Y  Pflug, Daina Y  

E. Nolan Y  Ahlsted, Carrie N 

M. Penar Y  Birkmeier, Shayne Y  

Rabe, Laura Y     Britts-Axen, Cathy Y 

Kellenberger, Jeff Y  Bushman, Kristine N 

   Diversey, Steve N 

   Jeff Gerard Y 

   Haug, Matthew Y 

   Jurs, Rebecca Y 

    Lewis, Kim Y 

   McCastland, Kerrie N  

   Mirenda, Pamela N  

   Moretti, Megan N 

   Paszt, Alex N 

   Polowy, Dan N  

   Porto, Pam Y 

   Potsic, Mike Y 

   Schreiber, Jill N  

   Stroh, Terry N 

   Testone, Chris N 

   Tobin, Brian Y 

   Vaughn, Michelle Y  

   Walter, Carie N 

    

Roll Call Roll was called at 6:00 p.m.   

 

 Present:  Gorman, Johnson, Marlovits, Nolan, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Absent:  None 

 

Agenda Motion by Johnson second by Nolan to approve the agenda as presented. 

  

 Voting yes:  Gorman, Johnson, Marlovits, Nolan, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Consent Agenda Motion by Gorman second by Johnson to approve the consent agenda as presented. 

  

 Voting yes:  Gorman, Johnson, Marlovits, Nolan, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

 



 

2018 Tax Levy Motion by Johnson second by Penar to approve the 2018 Tax Levy as presented. 

  

 Voting yes:  Gorman, Johnson, Marlovits, Nolan, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Property Tax  Motion by Johnson second by Penar to approve the property tax relief grant 

application 

Relief Grant as presented 

 

 Voting yes:  Gorman, Johnson, Marlovits, Nolan, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Executive Session Motion by Johnson second by Marlovits to adjourn open session and enter into 

executive session at 7:00 p.m. 

 

 Voting yes:  Gorman, Johnson, Marlovits, Nolan, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  None 

 

Open Session Motion by Marlovits second by Gorman to adjourn executive session and return to 

open session at 7:39 p.m. 

 

 Voting yes:  Gorman, Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  Nolan 

 

Personnel Report Motion by Gorman second by Penar to approve the personnel report for December as 

presented. 

 

 Voting yes:  Gorman, Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  Nolan 

 

BEST Contract Motion by Marlovits second by Gorman to approve the BEST contract as presented. 

 

 Voting yes:  Gorman, Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  Nolan 

 

Adjourn Motion by Penar second by Gorman to adjourn at 7:45 p.m. 

 

 Voting yes:  Gorman, Johnson, Penar, Rabe, Marlovits, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent:  Nolan 

 

BOE Meeting  

1. Roll Call 

2. Pledge of Allegiance  

3. Public Open Forum 



 

 3.1 Recognition of Visitors – Dr. Stirn and President Kellenberger welcomed visitors.   

 3.2 Public Comment –BEST President Dieckoff thanked the board for their work on the 

negotiation agreement.  Lily Lake teacher Kathie Dickson thanked everyone for the 

support the Lily Lake staff received during their recent loss of a staff member.  LeeAnn 

Larson addressed the board related to the upcoming board elections and asked if the 

District could advertise the open board positions in some manner.  Rob Larson had 

questions related to the difference between advanced placement classes, honors classes 

and accelerated classes. 

 

4.0  Action Items 

 4.1 Consent Agenda – Business Manager Pflug reported that revenues are at 36.13% 

compared to 39.21% last years.  Expenditures are at 36.14% compared to 36.49% a year 

ago.  The November and December impact fees have not been received as of tonight. The 

bills payable report is typical for this time of year.  The board will act on a resolution 

regarding estimated amounts to be levied this year. 

 

 4.2 Approve 2018 Tax Levy – The tax levy was presented last month, no changes have 

occurred.  The expected tax rate will decrease $0.08 lowering the total tax rate to $6.70. 

 

 4.3 Approve the Property Tax Relief Grant – The State Board is offering grant money to 

eligible school districts.  The awarded amount of money cannot be greater than 1% of the 

EAV of a district.  Fifty million dollars will be provided for the grant. 

 

5.0 Information Reports 

5.1 Committee Reports - Foundation – The end of year meeting was spent reflecting 

on what went well and the things that did not go well.   The date for 2019 Trivia is 

November 9, 2019 at the Elgin boat. 
   

5.2 Instructional Coaches Update – The team of Instructional Coaches presented a 

Power Point to the board detailing the numerous projects they are working on.  

The coaches have instituted Central University (Online professional development 

developed by our coaches), and provide countywide professional development 

and presentations at numerous conferences.  The district tech fair was a huge 

success due to their hard work.  The coaches have begun podcasting sessions 

hosted by Stacy Regan and Mike Doyle highlighting different areas in the district. 

Several area districts have requested to visit our facilities and programs to use as a 

model for their district.  The instructional coaches are excited about their work 

and will continue to provide programs to our staff and county teachers. 

 

5.3 Accelerated Placement – Shayne Birkmeier reviewed the screening process and 

criteria for early entrance to kindergarten and/or first grade.  Mrs. Birkmeier 

presented future goals to implement for accelerated math in grades 4-8 (similar to 

what we are doing at Central Middle School with algebra).  Mrs. Birkmeier also 

touched on future ideas for grade acceleration and the criteria that will need to be 

achieved to qualify for this program. 

 

 5.5 Enrollment Report – The enrollment figures from December 13, 2018 show an 

increase of seven (7) students. 

 



 

6.0 Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) 

 6.1 The Daily Herald– The Daily Herald annually requests Board of Education 

Meeting Dates. 
 

7.0 Executive Session 

 7.1 Adjourn Open Meeting 

 7.2 Return to Open Session 

 7.3 Action Items from Closed Session 

 

8.0 Adjourn 

 

 

 

 

 

Jeff Kellenberger, President              Christina Johnson, Secretary 

 

 

 

Next Meeting:  January 22, 2019  



 
 

   

 
  

 Central Community Unit School District 301 

 Special Meeting Minutes 

 

Where: Central High School Conference Room Meeting: Special 

Date: December 27, 2018 Time:                          10:30 a.m. 

 

Board Members Present  Administrators Present 
Jeff Gorman Y Todd Stirn Y 

Christine Johnson N Esther Mongan Y    

Janet Marlovits N Chris Testone  Y 

Eric Nolan N Terry Stroh  Y  

Mitch Penar  Y  

Laura Rabe Y   

Jeff Kellenberger Y (Telephonically)  

  

1. Board member Gorman called the meeting to order at 10:45 a.m. and the roll was called.  Board 

President Kellenberger joined the meeting telephonically from work.  There was no public 

comment offered to the Board from any community member.  

  

2. Executive Session 

2.1 Motion by Penar second by Rabe to enter into executive session at 10:45 a.m. 

 

 Voting yes:     Gorman, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger  

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: Johnson, Marlovits, Nolan  

 

3.  Open Session 

3.1 Motion by Penar second by Rabe to adjourn closed session at 11:22 a.m. 

 

 Voting yes:     Gorman, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger  

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: Johnson, Marlovits, Nolan  

 

 

4 Action Items from Closed Session 

 4.1 Student #15319 

  Motion by Penar second by Rabe to uphold the administrative recommendation and 

expel student #15319 for the remainder of the 2018-2019 school year with the expulsion 

held in abeyance to allow the student an opportunity to attend an alternative educational 

setting.  If the student fails to complete the alternative program, the expulsion will be 

enforced with no further action of the Board of Education.  

 

 Voting yes:     Gorman, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger  

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: Johnson, Marolvits, Nolan 

 

 

 

 



 
 

   

 
  

4. Adjournment  

 3.1 Motion by Rabe second by Penar to adjourn at 11:30 a.m. 

  

 Voting yes:     Gorman, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger  

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: Johnson, Marolvits, Nolan 

 

 

 

  Recording Secretary 





















































































Central Community Unit School District 301
Burlington, IL 60109

School Bus Lease-Bid Tabulation
1/11/2019 @ 12:00 PM

Lease Year 1 Midwest Transit Midwest Bus Sales Southern Bus & Mobility Central States Bus Sales
8 28 pass 10,893.00 87,144.00 no bid - no bid - 13,996.00 111,968.00
3 18+2 11,236.00 33,708.00 no bid - no bid - 14,743.00 44,229.00

47 72 pass 13,980.00 657,060.00 17,058.95 801,770.65 no bid - 17,677.00 830,819.00
3 luggage 595.00 1,785.00 - - no bid - 988.00 2,964.00
1 54+2 15,943.00 15,943.00 no bid no bid 19,192.00 19,192.00

Total 795,640.00 801,770.65 - 1,009,172.00

Lease Year 2 Midwest Transit Midwest Bus Sales Southern Bus & Mobility Central States Bus Sales
8 28 pass 10,893.00 87,144.00 no bid - no bid - 13,996.00 111,968.00
3 18+2 11,236.00 33,708.00 no bid - no bid - 14,743.00 44,229.00

47 72 pass 13,980.00 657,060.00 17,058.95 801,770.65 no bid - 17,677.00 830,819.00
3 luggage 595.00 1,785.00 - - no bid - 988.00 2,964.00
1 54+2 15,943.00 15,943.00 no bid no bid 19,192.00 19,192.00

795,640.00 801,770.65 - 1,009,172.00

Lease Year 1 Midwest Transit Midwest Bus Sales Southern Bus & Mobility Central States Bus Sales
72 pass bid only

47 72 pass 13,980.00 657,060.00 17,058.95 801,770.65 no bid - 17,677.00 830,819.00
3 luggage 595.00 1,785.00 - - no bid - 988.00 2,964.00

658,845.00 801,770.65 - 833,783.00

Lease Year 2
47 72 pass 13,980.00 657,060.00 17,058.95 801,770.65 no bid - 17,677.00 830,819.00
3 luggage 595.00 1,785.00 - - no bid - 988.00 2,964.00

658,845.00 801,770.65 - 833,783.00

Lowest bidder: Midwest Transit



2018-2019 and 2019-2020
Bus Bid

Year 1 Midwest Transit Midwest Transit Midwest Bus Midwest Bus Southern Bus Southern Bus Central States Central States
8 9,833.00 78,664.00 10,707.19 85,657.52 10,842.68 86,741.42 13,418.75 107,350.00
2 9,802.00 19,604.00 11,621.95 23,243.90 11,685.84 23,371.67 13,709.03 27,418.06
9 12,463.00 112,167.00 14,596.38 131,367.42 - - 15,144.96 136,304.64

210,435.00 240,268.84 110,113.09 271,072.70
19 Discount (3,800.00)

206,635.00

Year 2 Midwest Transit Midwest Transit Midwest Bus Midwest Bus Southern Bus Southern Bus Central States Central States
8 9,833.00 78,664.00 10,707.19 85,657.52 10,842.68 86,741.42 13,418.75 107,350.00
2 9,802.00 19,604.00 11,621.95 23,243.90 11,685.84 23,371.67 13,709.03 27,418.06
9 12,463.00 112,167.00 14,596.38 131,367.42 - - 15,144.96 136,304.64

210,435.00 240,268.84 110,113.09 271,072.70
Discount (3,800.00)

206,635.00

No 72 bid comparison
8 9,833.00 78,664.00 10,707.19 85,657.52 10,842.68 86,741.42 13,418.75 107,350.00
2 9,802.00 19,604.00 11,621.95 23,243.90 11,685.84 23,371.67 13,709.03 27,418.06

98,268.00 108,901.42 110,113.09 134,768.06

8 9,833.00 78,664.00 10,707.19 85,657.52 10,842.68 86,741.42 13,418.75 107,350.00
2 9,802.00 19,604.00 11,621.95 23,243.90 11,685.84 23,371.67 13,709.03 27,418.06

98,268.00 108,901.42 110,113.09 134,768.06
all bid requirements no bid bond bid bond sent in upon award of bid no bid bond
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MEMORANDUM 

 

FROM: Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent  

TO:  Central 301 Board of Education  

DATE: January 22, 2019 

RE: Review Executive Session Minutes from July - December 2018 

 

 Issues addressed in executive session from July 2018 – December 2018 included items related to 

personnel, items related to negotiations with the Burlington Education Support Team (BEST), 

the sale or purchase of land, and student discipline.  The personnel reports are public 

information. Any items related to student discipline, and ongoing discussions regarding the 

potential sale or purchase of land will be kept closed and not released for public review.  The 

agendas and personnel reports from July 2018 to January 2018 are included with this memo.   

 

 













































 

 

6:135                                                                                                                          Page 1 of 1 

Central Community Unit School District 6:135 

 

Instruction 

Accelerated Placement Program  

The District provides an Accelerated Placement Program (APP). The APP advances the District’s 

goal of providing educational programs with opportunities for each student to develop to his or her 

maximum potential. The APP provides an educational setting with curriculum options usually 

reserved for students who are older or in higher grades than the student participating in the APP.  APP 

options include, but may not be limited to: (a) accelerating a student in a single subject; (b) other 

grade-level acceleration; and (c) early entrance to kindergarten or first grade. Participation in the APP 

is open to all students who demonstrate high ability and who may benefit from accelerated placement. 

It is not limited to students who have been identified as gifted and talented. Eligibility to participate in 

the District’s APP shall not be conditioned upon the protected classifications identified in School 

Board policy 7:10, Equal Educational Opportunities, or any factor other than the student’s 

identification as an accelerated learner. 

The Superintendent or designee shall implement an APP that includes: 

1. Decision-making processes that are fair, equitable, and involve multiple individuals, e.g. 

District administrators, teachers, and school support personnel, and a student’s 

parent(s)/guardian(s); 

2. Notification processes that notify a student’s parent(s)/guardian(s) of a decision affecting a 

student’s participation in the APP; and 

3. Assessment processes that include multiple valid, reliable indicators. 

The Superintendent or designee shall annually notify the community, parent(s)/guardian(s), students, 

and school personnel about the APP, the process for referring a student for possible evaluation for 

accelerated placement, and the methods used to determine whether a student is eligible for accelerated 

placement. Notification may: (a) include varied communication methods, such as student handbooks 

and District or school websites; and (b) be provided in multiple languages, as appropriate. 

LEGAL REF.: 105 ILCS 5/14A. 

CROSS REF.: 6:10 (Educational Philosophy and Objectives), 6:130 (Program for the Gifted), 

7:10 (Equal Educational Opportunities), 7:50 (School Admissions and Student 

Transfers To and From Non-District Schools) 
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MEMORANDUM 

 

FROM: Mike Potsic, Director of Student Support Services and Special Education  

TO:  Central 301 Board of Education  

DATE: January 22, 2019 

RE: Student Services Department Staffing 

 

Student Services: Positions Added 2017-2018: 

● Central High School: added 0.4 FTE Social Worker.  CHS had 1.6 Social Workers and 

this increase created 2 full-time Social Workers at CHS 

● Central Middle School: 

○ Added 0.4 FTE Social Worker.  Position went from 2 days per week to 4 days per 

week 

○ Added 0.5 FTE Special Education Teacher.  CMS had 1.5 Special Education 

Teachers and this increase created 2 full-time Special Education Teachers at CMS 

●  Prairie Knolls Middle School:  

○ Added 0.4 FTE School Psychologist.  PKMS had a School Psychologist 3 days 

per week and this increase changed position to 5 days per week 

○ Added 1.0 FTE Special Education Teacher (added winter of 2017) 

● Lily Lake Grade School: added 0.5 FTE Special Education Teacher 

● Prairie View Grade School: added 0.5 FTE Special Education Teacher 

● Country Trails Elementary: added 0.5 FTE Special Education Teacher 

● Howard B. Thomas Grade School: added 0.5 FTE Special Education Teacher 

● District Office: added 0.5 FTE Administrative Assistant 

○ Note: 2018-2019: Administrative Assistant position changed from part-time to 

full-time.  Also added Assistant Director position 

 

Title I Grant: 2018-2019: 

● Additional Social Work services 

○ An increase of 0.6 FTE: finalizing plan for implementing services within the 

district 
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Annual Needs Assessment:  

● Survey Related Services: School Psychologists, Social Workers, Speech Pathologists, 

Special Education Teachers, Administrators 

○ Caseloads, evaluations, annual review meetings, enrollment, potential needs 

○ What is needed to meet the needs of our students effectively? 

● Meet with Related Services groups, Administrators for feedback 

● Mid-Valley Special Education Cooperative: 

○ Annual Needs Assessment sent out by each district to parents and staff 

■ Review Needs Assessment with Liaisons and Behavioral/Instructional 

Coaches 

● Look at trends, services and program needs, individual district 

needs 

● The Northwestern Illinois Association: 

○ Annual Needs Assessment meeting to determine district needs for such services 

as: Occupational Therapy, Physical Therapy, Vision, Hearing, Deaf and Hard of 

Hearing Program 

 

Outcome of Needs Assessment: 

● Develop student services needs and priorities proposal for the following school year 

● Share needs and priorities with district leadership. Share with the Board of Education at 

the spring Board Retreat 

● Look at traditional and innovative ways to support our students and meet their needs 

● Identify areas for professional development 

  

 



Central Community Unit School District 301
Student Enrollment Report Date  January 22, 2019

School Count EE KDG 1st 2nd 3rd 4th 5th 6th 7th 8th 9th 10th 11th 12th Current Last Month Change
Total Total

Country Trails 2018 31 98 83 117 103 111 116 659 656 +3
17-18 79 118 100 116 112 96 621

H.B. Thomas 2018 46 92 94 106 90 108 78 614 607 +7
17-18 92 89 106 93 93 76 84 633

Lily Lake 2018 39 36 28 49 38 40 230 227 +3
17-18 34 27 47 37 34 35 214

Prairie View 2018 25 96 97 120 101 111 105 655 654 +1
17-18 95 118 107 113 104 107 644

Prairie Knolls MS 2018 328 323 651 652 -1
17-18 310 328 638

Central MS 2018 325 325 328 -3
17-18 339 339

Central HS 2018 351 280 292 254 1177 1177 0

17-18 279 284 252 259 1074

TOTAL DISTRICT Head 102 325 310 371 343 368 339 328 323 325 351 280 292 254 4311 4301 +10
17-18 92 297 369 347 359 326 322 310 328 339 279 284 252 259 4163

Special Education 2 0 7 3 5 1 8 2 6 3 2 2 13 54
Out-of-District  0

 
Contract Class Size Language Aide/Split 6th Day Enrollment Year to Date +/-
Kindergarten - 2 23/26 6th day 2017-2018 4146
Grade 3 - 5 25/28 4264 47
Grade 6-8 30 split

Grades 9th -12th 31 split
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