
Regular Meeting of the Board of Education
Wednesday, March 9, 2022 6:30 PM
District Office, 12809 S. McVickers Avenue, Palos Heights, IL 60463

1. Call to Order

1.A. Pledge to the Flag

1.B. Roll Call

2. Superintendent's Report

2.A. Grade 8 Entrepreneur Projects

2.B. Community Recognition

3. Approval of the Consent Agenda Items
 

3.A. Minutes of the Regular Meeting of January 26, 
2022

3.B. Approval of Bills & Payroll

3.C. Review of Schools' Activity Accounts
 

3.D. Policy

3.E. Final 2022-2023 School Calendar

4. Old Business

4.A. Facility Updates

4.B. Bid Approval for Masonry (Action Item)

4.C. Bid Approval for Sitework (Action Item)

4.D. COVID Mitigation Update

5. New Business

5.A. Intergovernmental Agreement Palos Heights Parks 
and Recreation Summer Camp 2022 (Action Item)

5.B. Resolution to Abate the Working Cash Fund of 
the District (Action Item)

5.C. Reduction in Force (Action Item)

6. Audience Participation
We are at the audience participation portion of 
the meeting. If you are coming up to speak, 
please identify yourself by name and connection 
to the district and we ask that comments remain 
brief to accommodate everyone wishing to speak. 
Policy provides up to 3 minutes per speaker. If 
multiple speakers are addressing the same topic, 
policy provides for a maximum of 15 minutes per 
topic to allow for others topics to be addressed 



in the 30 minute time period designated for 
comments.

7. Information Items

7.A. YTD Financial Summary

7.B. Extended Leave

7.C. Resignation

7.D. Retirement

7.E. Freedom of Information Act Request

8. Closed Session
Discuss the appointment, employment, 
compensation, discipline, performance, or 
dismissal of a specific employee; collective 
negotiating matters or deliberations concerning 
salary schedules for classes of employees; 
discussion of possible litigation; and student 
disciplinary issues. The placement of individual 
students in special education programs and other 
matters relating to individual students.

9. Return to Open Session

10. Adjournment



Palos Heights School District 128
Minutes of Board of Education Meeting

January 26, 2022

The regular meeting of the Board of Education of Palos Heights School District 128 was held on
Wednesday, January 26, 2022, at the Dr. Edward T. Rancic Administrative Center, 12809 S.
McVicker Ave., Palos Heights, Illinois.

Mr. Grady called the meeting to order at 6:30pm and led the Pledge to the Flag.

Roll Call:
Present: Dr. Powell Mrs. Restivo, Dr. Facko, Mr. Grady, & Mrs. Lyons
Absent: Mrs. Lachowicz & Mrs. Rubio
Dr. Brownlow was also in attendance.
Mrs. Lachowicz arrived at 6:38pm

Visitors
Jason Smit, Kaitlin Curran, Kevin Kirk, Kim Anoman, Mary Lynn Duffy, Nikki Bridges, Chris
Kamberos, Cassidy Smith, Grace Woolwine, Eric Woolwine, Bella Bettio, Callie Riley,
Heather Meskimen & Family, Gayle Greenwald, Clare Pizer & Family, Chris Petitgout, Joe
Young, Ashley Prohaska, & Adelicia Brienzo

Superintendentʼs Report
To begin Dr. Brownlow’s Superintendent’s Report, seventh graders from Ms. Meskimen’s social
studies classes presented digital self identity portraits, a project that was in response to the book
they read, The Barren Grounds, by David Robertson. Students shared aspects of their identities that
are reflected inside and out.

Dr. Brownlow then discussed the Certified Staffing Recommendations for the 2022-2023 School
Year. She also stated that the current plan is to return to typical class sizes.

Dr. Brownlow’s Superintendent’s Report concluded with a Strategic Planning Update presented by
Jason Smit. The first Strategic Plan Design Team meeting was held on January 19, 2022. There
were 26 participants. The team explored the concept of student competencies in developing the
Plan. The intent of plan development is to have a living document that supports systems alignment
for all major decisions that are made at the district level.



Approval of Consent Agenda Items
It was moved by Mr. Grady to approve the consent agenda items as follows: the Minutes of the
Regular Meeting of December 8, 2021; the Bills and Payroll; the Schools’ Activity Accounts;
the Employment of Personnel (Claudia DeMent, Paraprofessional IJHS; Lucas Bauer (LTS) -
Elementary Music); and the Policy Updates. The motion was seconded by Dr. Facko.

Roll Call:
Ayes: Mrs. Lachowicz, Mrs. Lyons, Mr. Grady, Dr. Facko, Ms. Restivo, & Dr. Powell
Motion carried.

Old Business
A general contracting bid was approved for renovating the Chippewa Library Resource Center into
a 21st century learning space. In addition to the work at Chippewa, the district is also planning to
create a more secure entrance at Indian Hill Early Learning Center, and address mechanical work at
Navajo and Independence. The bid also includes the addition of a storage shed at the back of
Navajo for housing custodial equipment that is currently stored indoors or has to be transported
from other schools when needed.

Also included in Old Business was the Action Item of a “Resolution providing for the issue of not
to exceed $5,000,000 General Obligation Limited Tax School Bonds for the purpose of increasing
the Working Cash Fund of the District, providing for the levy of a direct annual tax to pay the
principal and interest on said bonds, and authorizing the sale of said bonds to the purchaser
thereof.” Mr. Grady made a motion to approve the Resolution as presented. The motion was
seconded by Dr. Facko.

Roll Call:
Ayes: Dr. Facko, Mrs. Restivo, Mrs. Lachowicz, Dr. Powell, Mrs. Lyons, & Mr. Grady
Motion carried.

New Business
The School Calendar was discussed as an Action Item for approval. It was presented that all start
dates, end dates and non-attendance dates be approved and not change. The Board also discussed
the naming of Columbus Day being written as Columbus Day/Indiginous Peoples’ Day on the
2022-2023 School Calendar. Mrs. Lachowicz made a motion to approve the 2022-2023 School
Calendar as presented. The motion was seconded by Mrs. Lyons, and approved by unanimous
consent.



Preschool and Kindergarten registration plans were presented as an Action Item to open on
February 7, 2022 for families new to the district. Registration fees were proposed to remain the
same. It was also proposed that registration for returning students in Grades 1-8 open on April 4,
2022. Mr. Grady made a motion to approve the plans for registration and fees as presented. The
motion was seconded by Dr. Facko, and approved by unanimous consent.

The addition of a Curriculum Instructional Specialist position to create student and staff teaching
and learning support in the areas of English Language Arts and Social Studies was presented as an
Action Item. This will be a teacher contracted position. Mrs. Lyons made a motion to approve the
addition of a Curriculum Instructional Specialist position as presented. The motion was seconded
by Mrs. Restivo, and approved by unanimous consent.

The FY23 Tentative Budget Authorization Resolution was presented as an Action Item. Mr. Grady
made a motion to approve the FY23 Tentative Budget Authorization Resolution as presented. The
motion to approve was seconded by Dr. Facko.

Roll Call:
Ayes: Dr. Powell, Mrs. Restivo, Dr. Facko, Mr. Grady, Mrs. Lyons, & Mrs. Lachowicz
Motion carried.

As an item of new business, Dr. Brownlow stated that the Parks and Recreation Summer
Day Camp will be held at Independence Jr. High School.

The Policy Updates, First Read was included on the Agenda as an Item of New Business.

The advanced approval of estimated bills & payroll for February 2022 and estimated educational
expenditures not to exceed $300,000 was presented as an Action Item. Mr. Grady made a motion
to approve the estimated bills & payroll for February 2022 and estimated educational
expenditures not to exceed $300,000 as presented. The motion to approve was seconded by Dr.
Facko.

Roll Call:
Ayes: Mrs. Lachowicz, Mrs. Lyons, Mr. Grady, Dr. Facko, Dr. Facko, Mrs. Restivo,
& Dr. Powell
Motion carried.

As the final item of New Business, Dr. Brownlow provided a COVID-29 Mitigation Litigation
Update.

Audience Participation
None



Information Items
The following were included in the Board Packet as Information Items:

A. YTD Financial Summary Report
B. Retirement - Linda Anicich
C. Resignations - Allison Miller, Music; Christine O’Grady, Social Worker
D. Staff FMLA - Evan Katsenis, 7th Grade Science
E. Freedom of Information Act Request:

Received via email from Zoe Yalcin of SmartProcure on December 22, 2021
SmartProcure is submitting a commercial FOIA request to the Palos Heights School
District #128 for any and all purchasing records from 09/15/2021 (mm/dd/yyyy) to
current. The request is limited to readily available records without physically
copying, scanning or printing paper
documents. Any editable electronic document is acceptable.
The specific information requested from your record keeping system is:
1. Purchase order number. If purchase orders are not used a comparable substitute is
acceptable, i.e., invoice, encumbrance, or check number
2. Purchase date
3. Line item details (Detailed description of the purchase)
4. Line item quantity
5. Line item price
6. Vendor ID number, name, address, contact person and their email address
Complied via email December 28, 2021

F. Freedom of Information Act Request:
Received via email from Karen Garcia of SmartProcure on January 12, 2022
SmartProcure is submitting a commercial FOIA request to the Palos Heights School
District #128 for all current employee/staff contact information. The request is
limited to readily available records without physically copying, scanning or printing
paper documents. Any editable electronic document is acceptable.



The specific information requested from your record keeping system is:
1. First Name
2. Last Name
3. Position Title
4. Department
5. Direct Phone Number (if does not exist, list main phone number with extension)
6. Business Cell Phone (if provided by Palos Heights School District #128)
7. Email Address
8. Office Address (Address, City, State, Zip)
Complied via Digital Upload January 18, 2022

G. Freedom of Information Act Request:
Received from Nathan Mihelich of the Illinois Retired Teachers Association on
January 18, 2022
RECORDS REQUESTED: Please provide the name and email address of any
certified staff (teachers, administrators, nurses, counselors, etc.) who are retiring this
year.
Please provide the requested records electronically. Please email to
freedom@irtaonline.org.
If your district has NO RETIREES this year, simply reply to this email with the
word NONE and please include your name, district name and number of your
district and I will consider the request fulfilled.
This is a request by the Illinois Retired Teachers Association, a 501c4 not-for-profit
Illinois organization.
Complied via email January 19, 2022

Closed Session
It was moved by Mr. Grady and seconded by Mrs. Lyons that the Board enters into Closed
Session to discuss the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, performance, or
dismissal of a specific employee; collective negotiating matters or deliberations concerning
salary schedules for classes of employees; discussion of possible litigation; and student
disciplinary issues. The placement of individual students in special education programs and other
matters relating to individual students.

Roll call:
Present: Mr. Grady, Mrs. Lyons, Mrs. Restivo, Dr. Powell, Dr. Facko,
& Mrs. Lachowicz
Dr. Brownlow was also in attendance.



The Board of Education entered into Closed Session at 8:15pm.

The Board reconveniened into Open Session at 8:50pm.

Adjournment
With no further business to discuss, Mr. Grady made a motion to adjourn at 8:51pm, seconded
by Mrs. Lyons, and approved by unanimous consent. Meeting Adjourned.

________________________________________
President

________________________________________
Secretary
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Merryl Brownlow
Recommend as presented
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Merryl Brownlow
Recommend as presented (see rewrite also attached)
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School Board 

Exhibit - School Board Records Maintenance Requirements and FAQs 

Open Meetings Act 

The Open Meetings Act (OMA) requires public bodies to “keep written minutes of all their meetings, 
whether open or closed, and a verbatim record of all their closed meetings in the form of an audio or 
video recording.” 5 ILCS 120/2.06(a). Minutes must include, but are not limited to: (1) the date, time, 
and place of the meeting; (2) the members of the public body recorded as either present or absent and 
whether the members were physically present or present by means of video or audio conference; and 
(3) a summary of discussion on all matters proposed, deliberated, or decided, and record of any votes 
taken. Id. 

The remainder of Section 2.06 addresses the approval of open meeting minutes, the treatment of 
verbatim recordings of closed meetings, the semi-annual review of closed meeting minutes, the 
confidential nature of closed meeting minutes, and the right of persons to address public officials 
under rules established and recorded by the public body. The requirements of Section 2.06, as well as 
OMA requirements pertaining to Board agendas, are included in policy 2:220, School Board Meeting 
Procedure. 

Exhibit 2:220-E3, Closed Meeting Minutes, provides a sample template for keeping closed meeting 
minutes that incorporates the requirements of Section 2.06 of OMA. It also includes an area to 
designate if the Board has determined, pursuant to Section 2.06(d), that the closed meeting minutes 
no longer need confidential treatment. 

Exhibit 2:220-E4, Open Meeting Minutes, contains an open meeting minute’s protocol for open 
meeting minutes that incorporates the requirements of Section 2.06 of OMA. It also provides a 
sample template for keeping open meeting minutes. 

Exhibit 2:220-E5, Semi-Annual Review of Closed Meeting Minutes, contains a process for 
implementing the semi-annual review of closed meeting minutes, and exhibit 2:220-E6, Log of 
Closed Meeting Minutes, is designed to facilitate this semi-annual review  
(every six months, or as soon after as is practicable, taking into account the nature and meeting 
schedule of the Board). 5 ILCS 120/2.06(d), amended by P.A. 102-653. 

Exhibit 2:220-E9, Requirements for No Physical Presence of Quorum and Participation by Audio or 
Video During Disaster Declaration, contains a process for compliance with 105 ILCS 120/7(e), 
added by P.A. 101-640, when a board is meeting without a physical quorum present at the meeting 
location during a disaster declaration related to public health concerns. 

Local Records Act 

The Local Records Act (LRA) provides that public records, including “any book, paper, map, 
photograph, digitized electronic material, or other official documentary material, regardless of 
physical form or characteristics, made, produced, executed or received by any agency or officer 
pursuant to law or in connections with the transaction of public business and preserved or appropriate 
for preservation by such agency or officer” must be preserved unless the State Local Records 
Commission has given permission to destroy those records. 50 ILCS 205/3 and 7. Board records, 
including agendas, meeting packets and meeting minutes, fall into this definition. 
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Public bodies located in Cook County must work with the Local Records Commission of Cook 
County to determine how long they must retain public records. Public bodies located outside of Cook 
County must work with the Downstate Local Records Commission to determine how long they must 
retain public records. 

Policy 2:250, Access to District Public Records, contains a subhead entitled Preserving Public 
Records which provides as follows: 

Public records, including email messages, shall be preserved and cataloged if: (1) they are 
evidence of the District’s organization, function, policies, procedures, or activities, (2) they 
contain informational data appropriate for preservation, (3) their retention is required by State or 
federal law, or (4) they are subject to a retention request by the Board Attorney (e.g., a litigation 
hold), District auditor, or other individual authorized by the School Board or State or federal law 
to make such a request. Unless its retention is required as described in items numbered 3 or 4 
above, a public record, as defined by the Illinois Local Records Act, may be destroyed when 
authorized by the Local Records Commission. 

See the sample policy, 2:2200, School Board Meeting Procedure, for all relevant footnotes. Also see 
administrative procedure 2:250-AP2, Protocols for Record Preservation and Development of 
Retention Schedules, for recommendations regarding school district records retention protocols and 
links to web-based record management resources. 

Open Meeting Minutes 

Are weyou required to 
approve them? 

Must they be semi-
annually reviewed? 

May weyou release them 
to the public? 

May weyou destroy 
them? 

Yes, within 30 days or at the 
next subsequent meeting, 
whichever is later. 

A public body shall approve 
the minutes of its open 
meeting within 30 days after 
that meeting or at the public 
body’s second subsequent 
regular meeting, whichever 
is later. 5 ILCS 120/2.06(b). 

No. 

Unlike the closed 
meeting requirement, 
OMA does not contain 
semi-annual review 
requirements for open 
meeting minutes. 

Yes, must within 10ten 
days after minutes are 
approved. 

The minutes of meetings 
open to the public shall be 
available for public 
inspection within 10 days 
after the approval of such 
minutes by the public body. 
Beginning July 1, 2006, at 
the time it complies with 
other requirements of this 
subsection, a public body 
that has a website that the 
full-time staff of the public 
body maintains shall post 
the minutes of a regular 
meeting of its governing 
body open to the public on 
the public body’s website 
within 10 days after the 
approval of the minutes by 
the public body. Beginning 
July 1, 2006, any minutes of 
meetings open to the public 
posted on the public body’s 
website shall remain posted 

No. 

There is no OMA 
provision permitting the 
destruction of open 
meeting minutes, and they 
must be preserved unless 
the State Local Records 
Commission has given 
permission to destroy 
them. 

If a public body would like 
to destroy open meeting 
minutes, then it must 
comply with the LRA and 
work with its Local 
Records Commission. It is 
highly unlikely, however, 
that the Local Records 
Commission would 
approve of their 
destruction. 
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Are weyou required to 
approve them? 

Must they be semi-
annually reviewed? 

May weyou release them 
to the public? 

May weyou destroy 
them? 

on the website for at least 
60 days after their initial 
posting. 5 ILCS 
120/2.06(b). 

Open Meeting Verbatim Recordings 

Closed Meeting Minutes 

Are weyou required to 
approve them? 

Must they be semi-
annually reviewed? 

May weyou release them 
to the public? 

May weyou destroy 
them? 

Are weyou required to 
approve them? 

Must they be semi-
annually reviewed? 

May weyou release them 
to the public? 

May weyou destroy 
them? 

No. 

OMA does not require 
public bodies to approve 
verbatim recordings of open 
meetings. 

No. 

Unlike the closed 
meeting requirement, 
OMA does not require 
public bodies to keep 
verbatim recordings of 
open meetings, unless 
the public body is 
meeting without the 
physical presence of a 
quorum during a 
disaster declaration 
related to public health 
concerns. 5 ILCS 
120/7(e). OMA does not 
contain semi-annual 
review requirements for 
open meeting verbatim 
recordings. 

Yes. 

Unlike the closed meeting 
requirement, OMA does 
not require public bodies to 
keep verbatim recordings of 
open meetings, unless the 
public body is meeting 
without the physical 
presence of a quorum 
during a disaster 
declaration related to public 
health concerns. 5 ILCS 
120/7(e). If a public body 
makes verbatim recordings 
of open meetings, then such 
recordings are subject to 
public disclosure pursuant 
to the Freedom of 
Information Act. (5 ILCS 
140/). 

Open meeting verbatim 
recordings made of 
meetings held without the 
physical presence of a 
quorum of a public body 
during a disaster 
declaration related to 
public health concerns may 
be destroyed after 18 
months if prerequisites are 
met. (See Closed Meeting 
Verbatim Recordings 
subhead, below). 

[P]ublic bodies holding 
open meetings under this 
subsection (e) must also 
keep a verbatim record of 
all their meetings in the 
form of an audio or video 
recording. Verbatim 
records made under this 
paragraph (9) shall be 
made available to the 
public under, and are 
otherwise subject to, the 
provisions of Section 2.06. 
5 ILCS 
120/7(e)(9).Possibly. 

In all other cases, iIf a 
public body would like to 
destroy open meeting 
verbatim recordings, then 
it must comply with the 
LRA and work with its 
Local Records 
Commission. 
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Are weyou required to 
approve them? 

Must they be semi-
annually reviewed? 

May weyou release them 
to the public? 

May weyou destroy 
them? 

Yes. 

OMA does not directly state 
public bodies are required to 
approve closed meeting 
minutes, nor does it set a 
time frame for such 
approval. However, OMA 
Section 2.06(d) requires 
public bodies to meet at 
least semi-annually to 
“review minutes of all 
closed meetings.” 5 ILCS 
120/2.06(d).  

Moreover, OMA Section 
2.06(c) specifically allows 
the destruction of closed 
meeting verbatim 
recordings only if certain 
conditions are met, one of 
which is that “the public 
body approves minutes of 
the closed meeting that meet 
the written minutes 
requirements of subsection 
(a) of this Section.” 5 ILCS 
120/2.06(c)(2). Both of 
these tasks would be 
difficult to achieve if closed 
meeting minutes were not 
first approved.  

One practice is to approve 
closed meeting minutes 
within the same time frame 
that open meeting minutes 
are approved – within 30 
days of the meeting or at the 
next subsequent meeting, 
whichever is later. 

Yes. 

Each public body shall 
periodically, but not less 
than semi-annually, 
meet to review all 
existing minutes of all 
prior closed meetings 
(this includes records 
from all time that the 
board has been in 
existence). Meetings to 
review minutes shall 
occur every 6 months, 
or as soon thereafter as 
is practicable, taking 
into account the nature 
and meeting schedule of 
the public body. At such 
meetings a 
determination shall be 
made, and reported in 
an open session that (1) 
the need for 
confidentiality still 
exists as to all or part of 
those minutes or (2) that 
the minutes or portions 
thereof no longer 
require confidential 
treatment and are 
available for public 
inspection. 5 ILCS 
120/2.06(d), amended 
by P.A. 102-653. 

Yes, if prerequisites are 
met. 

Minutes of meetings closed 
to the public shall be 
available only after the 
public body determines that 
it is no longer necessary to 
protect the public interest 
or the privacy of an 
individual by keeping them 
confidential. 5 ILCS 
120/2.06(f). 

No. 

There is no OMA 
provision permitting the 
destruction of closed 
meeting minutes, and they 
must be preserved unless 
the State Local Records 
Commission has given 
permission to destroy 
them. 

In addition, per OMA 
Section 2.06(f), as 
amended by P.A. 99-515: 

No minutes of meetings 
closed to the public shall 
be removed from the public 
body’s main office or 
official storage location, 
except by vote of the public 
body or by court order. 5 
ILCS 120/2.06(f). 

If a public body would like 
to destroy closed meeting 
minutes, then it must 
comply with the LRA and 
work with its Local 
Records Commission. It is 
highly unlikely, however, 
that the Local Records 
Commission would 
approve of their 
destruction. 

Closed Meeting Verbatim Recordings 

Are weyou required to 
approve them? 

Must they be semi-
annually reviewed? 

May weyou release them 
to the public? 

May weyou destroy 
them? 

No. 

OMA does not require 
approval of closed meeting 
verbatim recordings. 

No. 

OMA does not require 
semi-annual review of 
closed meeting verbatim 
recordings. 

Possibly but unlikely. 

Unless the public body has 
made a determination that 
the verbatim recording no 
longer requires confidential 
treatment or otherwise 

Yes, after 18 months if 
prerequisites are met. 

The verbatim record may 
be destroyed without 
notification to or the 
approval of a records 
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consents to disclosure, the 
verbatim record of a 
meeting closed to the public 
shall not be open for public 
inspection or subject to 
discovery in any 
administrative or judicial 
proceeding other than one 
brought to enforce this Act. 
5 ILCS 120/2.06(e). 

But see Kodish v. 
Oakbrook Terrace Fire 
Protection Dist.rict (235 
F.R.D. 447 (N.D. IllL. 
2006)), where a federal 
district court ordered that 
closed meeting verbatim 
recordings be disclosed to 
the Plaintiff in discovery 
because his primary claim 
was brought under federal 
law.  

commission or the State 
Archivist under the Local 
Records Act or the State 
Records Act no less than 
18 months after the 
completion of the meeting 
recorded but only after: 1.) 
the public body approves 
the destruction of a 
particular recording; and 
2.) the public body 
approves minutes of the 
closed meeting that meet 
the written minutes 
requirements of subsection 
(a) of this Section. 5 ILCS 
120/2.06(c). 

In addition, per OMA 
Section 2.06(f), as 
amended by P.A. 99-515: 

No verbatim recordings 
shall be recorded or 
removed from the public 
body’s main office or 
official storage location, 
except by vote of the public 
body or by court order. 5 
ILCS 120/2.06(e). 
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http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-21b
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http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=code&loc=il&id=23&spec=25.520
Merryl Brownlow
Recommend as Presented - extended date
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Merryl Brownlow
Recommend as Presented - Current understanding is Juneteenth is not a paid holiday when falling on a Saturday or Sunday
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http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-24
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-10
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-24
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-24
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=330&spec=61
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=820&spec=147
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=IL&id=820&spec=154
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=820&spec=180
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http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-2
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-2
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-2
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-2
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-2
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-2
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-2
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-2
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-2
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-2
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-2
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-10
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-27
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=code&loc=il&id=23&spec=1
Merryl Brownlow
Recommend as Presented - legal ref
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http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-10
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-10
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-10
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-10
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-10
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-18
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-18
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-24
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-27
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-27
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-27
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-27
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-27
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-27
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=20
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=10&spec=5-11
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=code&loc=il&id=23&spec=1.420
Merryl Brownlow
Recommend as Presented - legal ref
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Merryl Brownlow

Merryl Brownlow
INSERT: for a minimum of three days per five day week with such frequency as determiend by the Board of Education after recommendation by the Superintendent

Merryl Brownlow

Merryl Brownlow
Recommend with district edits
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http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=code&loc=il&id=23&spec=22
Merryl Brownlow
Recommend as presented; legal updates
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Merryl Brownlow
Recommend as Presented - Legal Ref
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http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-3
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Merryl Brownlow
Recommend as Presented - Legal precedent…Students must be given due process
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Recommend as Presented - School Code Update
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http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=usc&loc=us&id=20-1232g&
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=cfr&loc=us&id=34&spec=99
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=10
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=85
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=325&spec=17
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=750&spec=5
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=code&loc=il&id=23&spec=226
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=code&loc=il&id=23&spec=375
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=case&loc=us&id=110&
Merryl Brownlow
Recommend as Presented - School Code Update
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http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=usc&loc=us&id=20-1232g&
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=cfr&loc=us&id=34&spec=99
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=10
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=85
Merryl Brownlow
Recommend as Presented -Legal Reference update
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Palos Heights School District 128 
2022 – 2023 School Calendar 

AUGUST 
S M T W Th F S 

 1 2 3 4 5 6 

7 8 9 10 11 12 13 

14 15 I I 18 19 20 

21 22 23 24 25 27 27 

28 29 30 31    

 
 

SEPTEMBER 
S M T W Th F S 

    1 2 3 

4 X 6 7 8 9 10 

11 12 13 14 15 16 17 

18 19 20 21 22 23 24 

25 26 27 28 29 30  

 
 

Important Dates 
AUG 16 & 17 Teacher & Staff Institute Days 

AUG 18 First Day for Students – Early Dismissal at 12:00 PM 

SEPT 5 Labor Day – No School 

OCT 7 Institute Day – Student Non-Attendance Day 

OCT 10 
Columbus Day / Indigenous Peoples' Day 
 – No School 

NOV 8 Election Day – No School 

NOV 21 & 22 Parent Teacher Conferences – No School 

NOV 24 - 26 Thanksgiving Break – No School 

DEC 22, 2022 - JAN 6, 2023  Winter Break – No School 

JAN 16 Martin Luther King Jr. Day – No School 

FEB 20 Presidents’ Day – No School 

MAR 27 – 31 Spring Break – No School 

APR 4 Institute Day – Student Non-Attendance Day 

APR 7 Non-Attendance Day 

APR 10 Non-Attendance Day 

MAY 29 Memorial Day – No School 

JUNE 1 Last Day for Students – Early Dismissal at 11:00 AM 

 

Professional Learning Early Release Days 
Dismissal Times: Navajo 1:15 PM; Independence 1:20 PM;  

Chippewa 1:25 PM; Indian Hill 1:30 PM 

September 14, 2022 September 28, 2022 October 19, 2022 

November 16, 2022 December 14, 2022 January 25, 2023 

February 8, 2023 February 22, 2023 March 8, 2023 

April 19, 2023 May 10, 2023  
 

OCTOBER 
S M T W Th F S 

      1 

2 3 4 5 6 X 8 

9 X 11 12 13 14 15 

16 17 18 19 20 21 22 

23 24 25 26 27 28 29 

30 31      
 

NOVEMBER 
S M T W Th F S 

  1 2 3 4 5 

6 7 X 9 10 11 12 

13 14 15 16 17 18 19 

20 PT PT X X X 26 

27 28 29 30    

 
 

DECEMBER 
S M T W Th F S 

    1 2 3 

4 5 6 7 8 9 10 

11 12 13 14 16 17 18 

18 19 20 21 X X 24 

25 X X X X X 31 

 
 

JANUARY 
S M T W Th F S 

1 X X X X X 7 

8 9 10 11 12 13 14 

15 X 17 18 19 20 21 

22 23 24 25 26 27 28 

29 30 31     

 
 

FEBRUARY 
S M T W Th F S 

   1 2 3 4 

5 6 7 8 9 10 11 

12 13 14 15 16 17 18 

19 X 21 22 23 24 25 

26 27 28     

 
 

MARCH 
S M T W Th F S 

   1 2 3 4 

5 6 7 8 9 10 11 

12 13 14 15 16 17 18 

19 20 21 22 23 24 25 

26 X X X X X  

 
 

APRIL 
S M T W Th F S 

      1 

2 3 I 5 6 X 8 

9 X 11 12 13 14 15 

16 17 18 19 20 21 22 

23 24 25 26 27 28 29 

30       
 

MAY 
S M T W Th F S 

 1 2 3 4 5 6 

7 8 9 10 11 12 13 

14 15 16 17 18 19 20 

21 22 23 24 25 27 27 

28 X 30 31    

 
 

JUNE 
S M T W Th F S 

    1 2 3 

4 5 6 7 8 9 10 

11 12 13 14 15 16 17 

18 19 20 21 22 23 24 

25 26 27 28 29 30  

 
 

Calendar Key 
 Student’s First and Last Day of School 

 Student Non-Attendance Day 

 PLC Day – Student Early Dismissal 

 Emergency Days 
 

Note: The recommendation for inclement weather 
is to utilize the District E-Learning plan to avoid 

adding days to the end of the school year. 

Final Date of Trimesters 
Trimester 1: November 11, 2022 
Trimester 2: February 28, 2023 
Trimester 3: May 31, 2023 

Report Card Dates 
Trimester 1: November 18, 2022 
Trimester 2: March 7, 2023 
Trimester 3: June 1, 2023 

School Attendance Hours 
Indian Hill Half Day Pre-K AM: 8:30 AM – 11:00 AM 
Indian Hill Half Day Pre-K PM: 12:00 PM – 2:30 PM 

Indian Hill Kindergarten: 8:30 AM – 2:30 PM 
Chippewa Grades 1 - 3: 8:15 AM – 2:50 PM 

Navajo Grades 4 - 5: 8:00 AM – 2:35 PM 
Independence Jr. High School Grades 6 - 8: 7:55 AM – 2:43 PM 

 



memo
To: District 128 Board of Education

From: Merryl Brownlow

Date: March 4, 2022

Re: Veregy VRF Replacement Plan

As you know, we have continued to experience challenges with the VRF HVAC
system installed by CTS in 2018. Last spring, the Vice President of Operations,
Al Willis, addressed the Board of Education with a commitment to evaluate the
functioning of the system this fall, after troubleshooting and implementing
changes that were thought to be able to resolve our challenges.

Unfortunately, the adjustments made in preparation for this heating system did
not solve our challenges and we continued to experience failures and a system
that was not functioning as designed. At the time of the meeting last spring, Mr.
Willis had committed to considering replacement of the system at the expense of
the company (now known as Veregy) if we continued to experience failures.

Our team met with Mr. Willis and his new team on February 25, 2022. At that
meeting Mr. Willis acknowledged that our issues remained unresolved. The
company enlisted a new engineer to provide a thorough analysis of our system
and its chronic failure. After examining the product components, engineering
design and functionality of the system, it was determined that the VRF system is
not the proper system to support our building needs.

Given the constraints of our building configurations, Veregy provided two options
for replacement of the system.

1. An electrical duct heater system specified to the appropriate
measurements to operate as the primary heating system and continue to
maintain the VRF system for the cooling season. The duct system would
operate with its own stand alone controls. The performance energy
savings would not be realized at the same level with this system, given the
heating season is the time when buildings are most often occupied.



2. Remove the VRF system entirely and replace it with high efficiency gas
fired furnaces for heating and a separate condenser system for cooling.
This system is intended to result in performance savings similar to that of
a VRF system.

Veregy is scheduled to provide the detailed options and drawings to the district
by March 18, 2022. It is anticipated that the district will select Option 2, as long
as the drawings and design are received as anticipated. Upon receipt of the
drawings, Studio GC and their engineering team will review the plans to affirm
that the proposal meets our desired specifications.

The project is anticipated to be completed this summer at no cost to the district.
We will affirm the decision with Veregy prior to the April 13, 2022 Board Meeting,
and you will approve a final contract at that meeting. The new contract will
include the scope of the full replacement at no cost with a full coverage 1-year
warranty from the time of project completion.

2



Merryl Brownlow

Merryl Brownlow
The maker space area  will be the existing computer lab room, where project based furniture will be added.

Merryl Brownlow

Merryl Brownlow

Merryl Brownlow
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223 West Jackson Boulevard
Suite 1200
Chicago, IL 60606
Phone:  312 253 3400
Fax:  312 253 3401

March 3, 2022

Dr. Merryl Brownlow, Ed. D.
Superintendent
Palos Heights School District 128
12809 S. McVickers Avenue
Palos Heights, IL 60463

RE: Masonry Restoration at Navajo Heights
Project No. 21109

Dear Dr. Brownlow:

Bids for the above referenced project were received at 1:00 p.m. on Thursday, February 22,
2022. There were six (6) bidders of record; five (5) bids were received. A bid tabulation sheet is
herein attached for your review.

The lowest bid was submitted by Bee Liner Lean Services. Bee Liner withdrew their bid on
3/1/22. The second lowest bid was submitted by Otto Baum Co. We have analyzed the bids and
the qualifications of Otto Baum and recommend that the contract for the Masonry Restoration at
Navajo Heights project be awarded to the lowest responsible, responsive bidder, Otto Baum
Co. Their Base Bid amount is $99,820.

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

Sincerely,

Nikki D. Bridges, AIA, LEED-AP

Enclosure – Bid Tabulation
cc: Vicki Luczynski, StudioGC

P:\Palos Heights SD 128\21109 - Masonry Restoration at Navajo Heights\F-Bid Negotiation\_Bids\LOR-Masonry Otto Baum.doc



223 W. Jackson Blvd., Suite 1200 Client: Palos Heights SD 128
Chicago, IL  60606 Project Name: Masonry Restoration at Navajo Heights
P:  312.253.3400

Project No.: 21109
Bid Date: Tuesday, February 22, 2022 @ 1:00 p.m.
Project Architect: Nikki Bridges

Total Bid Addendum Addendum Bid
Amount #1 #2 Bond

X

X

X

X

X X

$170,000.00

Otto Baum Co

BID TAB WORKSHEET

Contractor Remarks

Berglund Construction

X

X

No Bid

$112,000.00

Bee Liner Lean Services

Burroak Masonry

X

X

X X

$153,300.00

$99,820.00 X

All Masonry Construction

Dynamic Building Restoration

$72,390.00 X

X

 Page 1 P:\Palos Heights SD 128\21109 - Masonry Restoration at Navajo Heights\F-Bid Negotiation\_Bids\Bid Tab-21109-MasonryBid Tab-21109-Masonry



223 West Jackson Boulevard
Suite 1200
Chicago, IL 60606
Phone:  312 253 3400
Fax:  312 253 3401

March 3, 2022

Dr. Merryl Brownlow, Ed. D.
Superintendent
Palos Heights School District 128
12809 S. McVickers Avenue
Palos Heights, IL 60463

RE: Site Improvements at Chippewa, Independence and Navajo Heights Schools
Project No. 21108

Dear Dr. Brownlow:

Bids for the above referenced project were received at 2:00 p.m. on Wednesday, March 2,
2022. There were five (5) bidders of record; one (1) bid was received. A bid tabulation sheet is
herein attached for your review.

There were numerous Alternate Bids which are indicated on the Bid Tabulation Sheet. A
description of each is provided below:

Alternate Bid No. 1:  Amount ADDED to remove the existing playground surface to the depth
indicated and associated perimeter curb at Chippewa School.  Provide new playground
section and timber curb in accordance with the drawings. ADD:     $ 74,000

Alternate Bid No. 2:  Amount ADDED to remove the asphalt sidewalk at Chippewa School
and provide new 6’ wide concrete sidewalk. ADD:     $ 12,500

Alternate Bid No. 3:  Amount ADDED to delete sod in the designated area at Chippewa and
provide Butterfly seed mix in accordance with the drawings. ADD:     $ 4,000

Alternate Bid No. 4:  Amount DEDUCTED to have the remaining disturbed grassy areas not
covered in Alternate Bid No. 3 be restored with seed in lieu of sod. DEDUCT     ($ 2,480)

Alternate Bid No. 5:  Amount DEDUCTED to revise the bollard lighting at Independence
School to be wall mounted light fixture and wall mounted outlet. DEDUCT     ($ 9,050)

We have analyzed the bids and the qualifications of the bidder and recommend that the contract
for the Site Improvements at Chippewa, Independence, Indian Hill and Navajo Heights project
be awarded to the lowest responsible, responsive bidder, Abbey Paving Co, Inc. Their Base
Bid amount is $547,800.



223 West Jackson Boulevard
Suite 1200
Chicago, IL 60606
Phone:  312 253 3400
Fax:  312 253 3401

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

Sincerely,

Nikki D. Bridges, AIA, LEED-AP

Enclosure – Bid Tabulation
cc: Vicki Luczynski, StudioGC

P:\Palos Heights SD 128\21108 - 2022 Sitework at Independence, Chippewa and Navajo\F-Bid Negotiation\_Bids\LOR-21108 Sitework - Abbey.doc



223 W. Jackson Blvd., Suite 1200 Client: Palos Heights SD 128
Chicago, IL  60606 Project Name: 2022 Site Improvements at
P:  312.253.3400 Chippewa, Independence & Navajo Hts.

Project No.: 21108
Bid Date: Wednesday, March 2, 2022 @ 2:00 pm.
Project Architect: Nikki Bridges

Total Bid Bid
Amount No. 1 No. 2 No. 3 No. 4 No. 5 Bond

Abbey Paving
312-799-1699

Alt. No. 1:  Remove existing playground surface to depth indicated & associated perimeter curb at Chippewa; provide new playground section/timber curb.
Alt. No. 2:  Remove asphalt sidewalk at Chippewa and provide new 6' wide concrete sidewalk.
Alt. No. 3:  Delete sod in designated area at Chippewa and provide butterfly seed mix.
Alt. No. 4:  Remaining disturbed grassy areas not covered in Alt. #3 be restored with seed in lieu of sod.
Alt. No. 5:  Revise bollard lighting at Independence to be wall mounted light fixture and wall mounted outlet.

815-923-4380

BID TAB WORKSHEET

Contractor Remarks

Matthew Paving

$547,800.00

No Bid

Alternates

-$9,050.00

708-907-5784

No Bid

No Bid

Advantage paving
708-205-1449

Misfits Construction
312-420-5041

Schroeder Asphalt

$74,400.00 $12,500.00 $4,000.00 -$2,480.00 X

No Bid

 Page 1 P:\Palos Heights SD 128\21108 - 2022 Sitework at Independence, Chippewa and Navajo\F-Bid Negotiation\_Bids\Bid Tab-21108-2022 Site ImprvmtsBid Tab-21108-2022 Site Imprvmts













RESOLUTION abating the working cash fund of School District
Number 128, Cook County, Illinois.

* * *

WHEREAS, the Board of Education (the “Board”) of School District Number 128, Cook

County, Illinois (the “District”), has heretofore created and maintained a working cash fund in

and for the District (the “Fund”); and

WHEREAS, the Board has determined and does hereby determine that it is necessary and in

the best interests of the District that the Fund be abated; and

WHEREAS, Section 20-10 of the School Code of the State of Illinois, as amended (the

“Code”), authorizes the Board to abate the Fund:

NOW, THEREFORE, Be It and It Is Hereby Resolved by the Board of Education of School

District Number 128, Cook County, Illinois, as follows:

Section 1. Incorporation of Preambles. The Board hereby finds that all of the recitals

contained in the preambles to this Resolution are full, true and correct and does incorporate them

into this Resolution by this reference.

Section 2. Amount of Abatement. The Fund shall be abated as of the date hereof by the

amount of $5,004,639.72 (the “Abatement Amount”).

Section 3. Permanent Transfer. The School Treasurer of the District is hereby

authorized and directed to permanently transfer on the date hereof the Abatement Amount to the

operations and maintenance fund of the District (the “O&M Fund”), the same being the fund of

the District most in need of the Abatement Amount. It is also hereby found and determined that

Abatement Resolution (WCF) 4862-1755-7778 v3.docx
2296556



(a) the Abatement Amount, when added to the O&M Fund and regardless of any subsequent

transfers of the Abatement Amount, will not result in an excessive accumulation of assets in the

O&M Fund, and (b) following said abatement, the balance to the credit of the Fund, including

the amount of any taxes heretofore levied by the District for the Fund pursuant to Section 20-3 of

the Code, but not yet collected and deposited into the Fund, and amounts transferred pursuant to

Section 20-4 of the Code and to be reimbursed to the Fund, is at least equal to 0.05% of the

value, as equalized or assessed by the Department of Revenue, of the taxable property in the

District.

Section 4. Outstanding Loans. If necessary to effectuate such abatement and

permanent transfer, any outstanding loans from the Fund to other funds of the District in an

amount, together with any cash immediately transferred pursuant to Section 2 above, equal in the

aggregate to the Abatement Amount shall be paid to the O&M Fund, and any remaining

outstanding loans shall be paid to the Fund at the time and in the manner required by the Code.

Section 5. Transfer to Capital Projects Fund. In accordance with the rules and

regulations of the Illinois State Board of Education and specifically Section 100.50(d)(2) of

Title 23 of the Illinois Administrative Code, the Abatement Amount may be further transferred

from time to time from the O&M Fund to the District’s Capital Projects Fund to be used as

provided in said rules and regulations.

Section 6. Severability. If any section, paragraph, clause or provision of this

Resolution shall be held to be invalid or unenforceable for any reason, the invalidity or
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unenforceability of such section, paragraph, clause or provision shall not affect any of the

remaining provisions of this Resolution.
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Section 7. Repealer and Effective Date. All resolutions or parts thereof in conflict

herewith be and the same are hereby repealed and that this Resolution shall be in full force and

effect forthwith upon its adoption.

Adopted March 9, 2022.

President, Board of Education

Secretary, Board of Education
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STATE OF ILLINOIS )
)  SS

COUNTY OF COOK )

CERTIFICATION OF SECRETARY

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that I am the duly qualified and acting Secretary of
the Board of Education of School District Number 128, Cook County, Illinois (the “Board”), and
that as such official I am the keeper of the records and files of the Board.

I do further certify that the foregoing constitutes a true, correct and complete copy of a
resolution adopted at a meeting of the Board held on the 9th day of March, 2022, entitled:

RESOLUTION abating the working cash fund of School District
Number 128, Cook County, Illinois.

I do further certify that the deliberations of the Board on the adoption of said resolution

were conducted openly, that the vote on the adoption of said resolution was taken openly, that
said meeting was called and held at a specified time and place convenient to the public, that
notice of said meeting was duly given to all of the news media requesting such notice, that an
agenda for said meeting was posted at the location where said meeting was held and at the
principal office of the Board on a day other than a Saturday, Sunday or legal holiday in the State
of Illinois and at least 48 hours in advance of the holding of said meeting, that a true, correct and
complete copy of said agenda as so posted is attached hereto as Exhibit A, that at least one copy
of said agenda was continuously available for public review from the time of such posting until
said meeting, that said meeting was called and held in strict compliance with the provisions of
the Open Meetings Act of the State of Illinois, as amended, and with the provisions of the School
Code of the State of Illinois, as amended, and that the Board has complied with all of the
provisions of said Act and said Code and with all of the procedural rules of the Board.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I hereunto affix my official signature, this 9th day of March, 2022.

______________________________________

Secretary, Board of Education



BOARD OF EDUCATION

2:230 Public Participation at Board of Education Meetings and Petitions to the
Board

For a period of 30 minutes during each regular and special open meeting, any person may comment
to or ask questions of the Board (public participation), subject to the reasonable constraints
established and recorded in this policy’s guidelines below. During public participation, there will be a
15-minute total length of time for any one subject. When public participation takes less time than these
minimums, it shall end.

To preserve sufficient time for the Board to conduct its business, any person appearing before the
Board is expected to follow these guidelines:

1. Address the Board only at the appropriate time as indicated on the agenda and when
recognized by the Board President.

2. Identify oneself and be brief. Ordinarily, the time for any one person to address the Board during
public participation shall be limited to three minutes. In unusual circumstances, and when an
individual has made a request to speak for a longer period of time, the person may be allowed
to speak for more than three minutes.

3. Observe, when necessary and appropriate, the:
a. Shortening of the time for each person to address the Board during public participation to

conserve time and give the maximum number of people an opportunity to speak;
b. Expansion of the overall 30 minutes for public participation and/or the 15-minute total

length of time for any one subject; and/or
c. Determination of procedural matters regarding public participation not otherwise covered

in Board policy.
4. Conduct oneself with respect and civility toward others and otherwise abide by Board policy

8:30, Visitors to and Conduct on School Property.

Petitions or written correspondence to the Board shall be presented to the Board in the next regular
Board packet.

LEGAL REF.:        

5 ILCS 120/2.06, Open Meetings Act.

105 ILCS 5/10-6 and 5/10-16.

CROSS REF.: 2:220 (Board of Education Meeting Procedure), 8:10 (Connection with the
Community), 8:30 (Visitors to and Conduct on School Property)

Adopted: September 18, 2019

Palos Heights SD 128

2:230

2:230
1 of 1

http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=5&spec=120
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-10
http://redirector.microscribepub.com/?cat=stat&loc=il&id=105&spec=5-10


(Over)/Under Prior YTD (Over)/Under Prior YTD vs. 

Current YTD Current Budget Budget % of Budget January-21 Prior Budget Budget % of Budget Current YTD

BEGINNING BALANCE $9,883,213.00 $11,212,496.83

REVENUES
Real Estate Taxes  1100 $4,283,906.87 $9,394,346.00 $5,110,439.13 46% $4,209,667.61 $8,753,804.00 $4,544,136.39 48% $74,239.26

Other Local Sources  1000 $284,706.64 $457,100.00 $172,393.36 62% $167,117.89 $541,618.79 $374,500.90 31% $117,588.75

General St Aid  3001 $328,200.00 $601,701.00 $273,501.00 55% $327,828.00 $601,011.42 $273,183.42 55% $372.00

Other State  3000 $165,880.12 $176,394.00 $10,513.88 94% $142,125.61 $232,317.27 $90,191.66 61% $23,754.51

Federal  4000 $217,978.97 $367,034.00 $149,055.03 59% $264,173.43 $342,205.00 $78,031.57 77% ($46,194.46)

ESSER Grants $409,219.00 $735,000.00 $325,781.00 56% $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 n/a $409,219.00

TOTAL REVENUES $5,689,891.60 $11,731,575.00 $6,041,683.40 49% $5,110,912.54 $10,470,956.48 $5,360,043.94 49% $578,979.06

EXPENDITURES
Salaries  100 $3,358,657.38 $6,806,232.00 $3,447,574.62 49% $3,164,070.24 $5,726,296.71 $2,562,226.47 55% $194,587.14

Benefits  200 $854,799.86 $1,741,203.00 $886,403.14 49% $815,813.67 $1,419,813.56 $603,999.89 57% $38,986.19

Purchased Services  300 $816,445.82 $1,288,943.00 $472,497.18 63% $752,330.93 $1,064,279.00 $311,948.07 71% $64,114.89

Supp/Materials  400 $414,946.67 $708,106.00 $293,159.33 59% $330,913.39 $470,785.00 $139,871.61 70% $84,033.28

Capital Outlay  500 $1,665,320.53 $2,085,580.00 $420,259.47 80% $351,325.73 $1,052,500.00 $701,174.27 33% $1,313,994.80

Out of Dist Tuition  670 $164,811.89 $350,000.00 $185,188.11 47% $76,840.56 $451,976.00 $375,135.44 17% $87,971.33

Other  600 $894,804.29 $892,500.00 ($2,304.29) 100% $891,731.17 $910,500.00 $18,768.83 98% $3,073.12

Non-Capitalized Equip  700 $76,347.00 $117,244.00 $40,897.00 65% $1,798.00 $41,000.00 $39,202.00 4% $74,549.00

Termination Benefits  800 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 n/a $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 n/a $0.00

TOTAL EXPENDITURES $8,246,133.44 $13,989,808.00 $5,743,674.56 59% $6,384,823.69 $11,137,150.27 $4,752,326.58 57% $1,861,309.75

  

LIABILITES ($293,199.27) ($243,582.83)

TOTAL FUND BALANCE $7,326,971.16 $9,938,585.68

9,695,002.85

489,510.88TOTAL FUND BALANCE 
EXCLUDING CAPITAL 
PROJECTS

5,580,465.04 9,449,074.80

TOTAL LIAB & FUND BALANCE 
EXCLUDING CAPITAL 

5,287,265.77 9,205,491.97

CAPITAL PROJECTS $1,746,506.12

School District 128
Financial Summary Report - All Funds
JANUARY 2022 

TOTAL LIAB & FUND BALANCE $7,033,771.89



(Over)/Under Prior YTD (Over)/Under Prior YTD vs. 

Current YTD Current Budget Budget % of Budget February-21 Prior Budget Budget % of Budget Current YTD

BEGINNING BALANCE $9,883,213.00 $11,212,496.83

REVENUES
Real Estate Taxes  1100 $4,283,906.87 $9,394,346.00 $5,110,439.13 46% $4,209,667.61 $8,753,804.00 $4,544,136.39 48% $74,239.26

Other Local Sources  1000 $286,653.94 $457,100.00 $170,446.06 63% $167,117.89 $541,618.79 $374,500.90 31% $119,536.05

General St Aid  3001 $382,900.00 $601,701.00 $218,801.00 64% $382,946.34 $601,011.42 $218,065.08 64% ($46.34)

Other State  3000 $165,880.12 $176,394.00 $10,513.88 94% $142,125.61 $232,317.27 $90,191.66 61% $23,754.51

Federal  4000 $312,597.63 $367,034.00 $54,436.37 85% $363,458.75 $342,205.00 ($21,253.75) 106% ($50,861.12)

ESSER Grants $466,375.00 $735,000.00 $268,625.00 63% $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 n/a $466,375.00

TOTAL REVENUES $5,898,313.56 $11,731,575.00 $5,833,261.44 50% $5,265,316.20 $10,470,956.48 $5,205,640.28 50% $632,997.36

EXPENDITURES
Salaries  100 $3,882,172.58 $6,806,232.00 $2,924,059.42 57% $3,659,126.70 $5,726,296.71 $2,067,170.01 64% $223,045.88

Benefits  200 $986,652.90 $1,741,203.00 $754,550.10 57% $944,911.16 $1,419,813.56 $474,902.40 67% $41,741.74

Purchased Services  300 $909,644.53 $1,288,943.00 $379,298.47 71% $909,285.90 $1,064,279.00 $154,993.10 85% $358.63

Supp/Materials  400 $467,672.06 $708,106.00 $240,433.94 66% $357,344.69 $470,785.00 $113,440.31 76% $110,327.37

Capital Outlay  500 $1,665,320.53 $2,085,580.00 $420,259.47 80% $354,643.72 $1,052,500.00 $697,856.28 34% $1,310,676.81

Out of Dist Tuition  670 $186,093.58 $350,000.00 $163,906.42 53% $102,473.19 $451,976.00 $349,502.81 23% $83,620.39

Other  600 $894,804.29 $892,500.00 ($2,304.29) 100% $891,731.17 $910,500.00 $18,768.83 98% $3,073.12

Non-Capitalized Equip  700 $76,347.00 $117,244.00 $40,897.00 65% $1,798.00 $41,000.00 $39,202.00 4% $74,549.00

Termination Benefits  800 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 n/a $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 n/a $0.00

TOTAL EXPENDITURES $9,068,707.47 $13,989,808.00 $4,921,100.53 65% $7,221,314.53 $11,137,150.27 $3,915,835.74 65% $1,847,392.94

  

LIABILITES ($304,307.22) ($257,158.29)

TOTAL FUND BALANCE $6,712,819.09 $9,256,498.50

8,999,340.21

564,588.61TOTAL FUND BALANCE 
EXCLUDING CAPITAL 
PROJECTS

4,966,312.97 8,691,909.89

TOTAL LIAB & FUND BALANCE 
EXCLUDING CAPITAL 

4,662,005.75 8,434,751.60

CAPITAL PROJECTS $1,746,506.12

School District 128
Financial Summary Report - All Funds
FEBRUARY 2022 

TOTAL LIAB & FUND BALANCE $6,408,511.87



From: Kim Anoman <kanoman@palos128.org>
Date: Thu, Jan 27, 2022 at 10:25 AM
Subject: Response to FOIA request for the 2022 Alternations and Life Safety
To: Thomas Haley <THaley@iiiffc.org>

Mr. Haley please see the attached bid tabulation and responses in red below to your FOIA
request.

To Whom it May Concern:

Pursuant to the Illinois Freedom of Information Act (5 ILCS 140/1 et. Seq.), the Indiana, Illinois,
Iowa Foundation for Fair Contracting (III FFC) respectfully requests the following information
regarding the 2022 Alterations and Life Safety project:

1. Please provide the bid tabulation and engineer’s estimate engineer's estimate s
$494,644.75.

2. Please advise if the project has been awarded, to whom it has been awarded, the start
date, and estimated end date the project was approved and awarded last night 1/26
at our board meeting to K.M. Holly.  The start date is 6/3/2022 and the substantial
completion date is 8/4/22 and the final completion date is 8/12/22

3. Please provide a list of sub-contractors if applicable. There are no sub-contractors
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