Proposal Project: Choir Dresses and Tuxedos

Proposal Project Number: 0501-02
Date: January 12, 2005

Est. Tuxedo Junction Tuxedo Junction
Item Description Quantity| Al's Formal Wear | Formal Fashions Stage Accents | Tote Unlimited (Bid 1) (Bid 2) Tuxedo Wholesaler
KELLER HIGH SCHOOL.:
CHOIR DRESS 80 No Bid No Bid $56.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HILLWOOD MIDDLE SCHOOL:
TUXEDO SHIRT 40 $12.95 $11.50 $11.35 No Bid $18.50 $15.50 $11.50
See additional
TUXEDO PANT 40 $19.95 $19.00 $22.50 $31.00 $25.00 $23.10 comments
VEST 40 $17.95 $21.00 No Bid No Bid $21.50 $19.00 $28.50
BOW TIE 40 $2.95 $2.00 $2.00 $4.00 $3.00 $3.00 $2.00
CHOIR DRESS 105 No Bid $49.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.00

Additional Information:

Al's Formal Wear: Pants will have belt loops as specified. Coats over size 46 - add 20%. Pants over size 46 - add 20%.
Formal Fashions: No name tags on gowns.

Tote Unlimited: Does not include freight.

Tuxedo Junction (Bid 1): bid based upon Tuxedo Junction furnishing the following services in addition to bid specifications:
1) Onsite measurements of students by Tuxedo Junction

2) Hem pants (without cutting) to student's length

3) Assemble each unit and deliver to school on strut hanger with student's name attached

4) Pick up units that need adjustments from school

5) Alter or exchange any items that do not fit and deliver altered items back to school

Tuxedo Junction (Bid 2): bid based upon the exact specifications described and sizes being furnished to Tuxedo Junction by school representative. Items will be shipped to the appropriate school.

Tuxedo Wholesale: KHS choir dress not available from our company. Exact waist tuxedo pants, no belt loops from rental stock, sizes 28 waist thru 44 waist for $12.00 each pair, new exact waist tux pants $19.00
no belt loops, or adjustable waist pants for easy fit $25.00. Vest has shawl lapels, made of 100% polyester, available in black, red or royal blue.



