ECTOR COUNTY INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid #12-026

Copy and Print Shop Paper

Opened on 10/5/2012 2:00:00 PM Central

Line Items

Line1l 20# Bond, White, 81/2" x 11", 3
hole punched.

Name QTY uomM Unit Price Extended
Unisource * 600 EA $26.20  $15,720.00
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 600 EA $27.10  $16,260.00
Contract Paper Group, Inc. 600 EA $27.97  $16,782.00
TipsBizSupplies 600 EA $31.28  $18,768.00
Graphic Equipment & Supply 600 EA $35.20  $21,120.00
School Specialty 600 EA No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 600 EA No Bid

School Specialty (Alt 1) 600 EA 3.65 2190
TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 600 EA 32.35 19410
WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 600 EA 35.8 21480
Line 2 8.5x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS -

LIPSTICK OR ASTROBRIGHTS Fireball

Fuchsia

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Contract Paper Group, Inc.* 16 Cartons $46.80 $748.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 Cartons $55.52 $888.32
Unisource 16 Cartons $63.52 $1,016.32
TipsBizSupplies 16 Cartons $65.22 $1,043.52
School Specialty 16 Cartons $84.16 $1,346.56
Graphic Equipment & Supply 16 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 16 Cartons No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 54.66 874.56
Graphic Equipment & Supply (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 65.03 1040.48
TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 73.06 1168.96
Line 38.5x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS Lime or

ASTROBRIGHTS Terra Green

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Contract Paper Group, Inc.* 16 Cartons $46.80 $748.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 Cartons $55.52 $888.32
Unisource 16 Cartons $63.52 $1,016.32
School Specialty 16 Cartons $63.84 $1,021.44
Graphic Equipment & Supply 16 Cartons $65.03 $1,040.48
TipsBizSupplies 16 Cartons $65.22 $1,043.52
Buffalo Business Products 16 Cartons No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 54.66 874.56
TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 73.06 1168.96
Line 4 8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS Lemon

or ASTROBRIGHTS Solar Lemon

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended




Contract Paper Group, Inc.* 16 Cartons $46.80 $748.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 Cartons $55.52 $888.32
Unisource 16 Cartons $63.52 $1,016.32
School Specialty 16 Cartons $63.84 $1,021.44
Graphic Equipment & Supply 16 Cartons $65.03 $1,040.48
TipsBizSupplies 16 Cartons $65.22 $1,043.52
Buffalo Business Products 16 Cartons No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 54.66 874.56
TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 73.06 1168.96
Line 585 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS Blue or

ASTROBRIGHTS Lunar Blue

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Contract Paper Group, Inc.* 16 Cartons $46.80 $748.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 Cartons $55.52 $888.32
Unisource 16 Cartons $63.52 $1,016.32
School Specialty 16 Cartons $63.84 $1,021.44
Graphic Equipment & Supply 16 Cartons $65.03 $1,040.48
TipsBizSupplies 16 Cartons $65.22 $1,043.52
Buffalo Business Products 16 Cartons No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 54.66 874.56
TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 73.06 1168.96
Line 6 8.5x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS

Turquoise ASTROBRIGHTS Terrestrial

Teal

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Contract Paper Group, Inc.* 16 Cartons $46.80 $748.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 Cartons $55.52 $888.32
Unisource 16 Cartons $63.52 $1,016.32
TipsBizSupplies 16 Cartons $65.22 $1,043.52
School Specialty 16 Cartons $84.16 $1,346.56
Buffalo Business Products 16 Cartons No Bid

Graphic Equipment & Supply 16 Cartons No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 54.66 874.56
TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 73.06 1168.96
Line 7 8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS Grape or

ASTROBRIGHTS Planetary Purple

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Contract Paper Group, Inc.* 16 Cartons $46.80 $748.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 Cartons $55.52 $888.32
Unisource 16 Cartons $63.52 $1,016.32
Graphic Equipment & Supply 16 Cartons $65.03 $1,040.48
TipsBizSupplies 16 Cartons $65.22 $1,043.52
School Specialty 16 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 16 Cartons No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 54.66 874.56
TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 73.06 1168.96



Line 8 8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS Red or
ASTROBRIGHTS Re-Entry Red

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Contract Paper Group, Inc.* 16 Cartons $46.80 $748.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 Cartons $55.52 $888.32
Unisource 16 Cartons $63.52 $1,016.32
Graphic Equipment & Supply 16 Cartons $65.03 $1,040.48
TipsBizSupplies 16 Cartons $65.22 $1,043.52
School Specialty 16 Cartons $84.16 $1,346.56
Buffalo Business Products 16 Cartons No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 54.66 874.56
TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 73.06 1168.96
Line 9 8.5x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS Orange

or ASTROBRIGHTS Orbit Orange

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Contract Paper Group, Inc.* 16 Cartons $46.80 $748.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 Cartons $55.52 $888.32
Unisource 16 Cartons $63.52 $1,016.32
Graphic Equipment & Supply 16 Cartons $65.03 $1,040.48
TipsBizSupplies 16 Cartons $65.22 $1,043.52
School Specialty 16 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 16 Cartons No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 54.66 874.56
TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 16 Cartons 73.06 1168.96
Line 10 8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS Lipstick

or ASTROBRIGHTS Fireball Fuchsia

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Unisource * 32 Cartons $52.35 $1,675.20
Contract Paper Group, Inc. 32 Cartons $59.76 $1,912.32
TipsBizSupplies 32 Cartons $64.56 $2,065.92
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $70.00 $2,240.00
School Specialty 32 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 32 Cartons No Bid

Graphic Equipment & Supply 32 Cartons No Bid

Graphic Equipment & Supply (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 62.4 1996.8
TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 62.53 2000.96
WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 68.27 2184.64
Line 11 8.5x 11 - 60# Text HOTS Blue or

ASTROBRIGHTS Lunar blue

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Unisource * 32 Cartons $52.35 $1,675.20
Contract Paper Group, Inc. 32 Cartons $59.76 $1,912.32
Graphic Equipment & Supply 32 Cartons $62.40 $1,996.80
TipsBizSupplies 32 Cartons $64.56 $2,065.92
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $70.00 $2,240.00
School Specialty 32 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 32 Cartons No Bid



TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 62.53 2000.96
WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 68.27 2184.64
Line 12 8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS Red or

ASTROBRIGHTS Re-Entry Red

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Unisource 32 Cartons $52.35 $1,675.20
Contract Paper Group, Inc. 32 Cartons $59.76 $1,912.32
Graphic Equipment & Supply 32 Cartons $62.40 $1,996.80
TipsBizSupplies 32 Cartons $64.56 $2,065.92
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $70.00 $2,240.00
School Specialty 32 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 32 Cartons No Bid

TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 62.53 2000.96
WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 68.27 2184.64
Line 13 8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS Orange

or ASTROBRIGHTS Orbit Orange

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
Unisource * 32 Cartons $52.35 $1,675.20
Contract Paper Group, Inc. 32 Cartons $59.76 $1,912.32
Graphic Equipment & Supply 32 Cartons $62.40 $1,996.80
TipsBizSupplies 32 Cartons $64.56 $2,065.92
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $70.00 $2,240.00
School Specialty 32 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 32 Cartons No Bid

TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 62.53 2000.96
WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 68.27 2184.64
Line 14 8.5x 11 - 60# Text HOTS Lemon

or ASTROBRIGHTS Solar Lemon

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Unisource * 32 Cartons $52.35 $1,675.20
Contract Paper Group, Inc. 32 Cartons $59.76 $1,912.32
Graphic Equipment & Supply 32 Cartons $62.40 $1,996.80
TipsBizSupplies 32 Cartons $64.56 $2,065.92
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $70.00 $2,240.00
School Specialty 32 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 32 Cartons No Bid

TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 62.53 2000.96
WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 68.27 2184.64
Line 15 8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS

Turquoise or ASTROBRIGHTS Terrestrial

Teal

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Unisource * 32 Cartons $52.35 $1,675.20
Contract Paper Group, Inc. 32 Cartons $59.76 $1,912.32
TipsBizSupplies 32 Cartons $64.56 $2,065.92
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $70.00 $2,240.00
School Specialty 32 Cartons No Bid



Buffalo Business Products 32 Cartons No Bid

Graphic Equipment & Supply 32 Cartons No Bid

TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 62.53 2000.96
WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 68.27 2184.64
Line 16 8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS Lime or

ASTROBRIGHTS Terra Green

Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Unisource * 32 Cartons $52.35 $1,675.20
Contract Paper Group, Inc. 32 Cartons $59.76 $1,912.32
Graphic Equipment & Supply 32 Cartons $62.40 $1,996.80
TipsBizSupplies 32 Cartons $64.56 $2,065.92
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $70.00 $2,240.00
School Specialty 32 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 32 Cartons No Bid

TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 62.53 2000.96
WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 68.27 2184.64
Line 17 8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS Grape or

ASTROBRIGHTS

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
Unisource * 32 Cartons $52.35 $1,675.20
Contract Paper Group, Inc. 32 Cartons $59.76 $1,912.32
Graphic Equipment & Supply 32 Cartons $62.40 $1,996.80
TipsBizSupplies 32 Cartons $64.56 $2,065.92
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $70.00 $2,240.00
School Specialty 32 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 32 Cartons No Bid

TipsBizSupplies (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 62.53 2000.96
WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY (Alt 1) 32 Cartons 68.27 2184.64

*AWARDED VENDOR



