Bid Request Number

Bid 09-59

Title School Furniture
Bid Type BID
Open Date 9/18/2009 8:00:01 AM Central
Close Date 10/9/2009 2:00:00 PM Central
STUDENT DESKS[]
Regular 22" to 29"
Line 1
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $ 4467 Royal Seating item # 1607
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $ 45.29 Academia ACD-1100WS. Price FOB destination.
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 47.85 ABC #9500,state frame color,and laminate color
Worthington Direct 1 $ 62.65 Scholar Craft model 2900
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $ 41.31 Artco Bell ABC#R90D ABCR90D ABC #R90D, state frame color and laminate color
STUDENT DESKS![
Wheel Chair Accessible(]
26" - 34"
Line 2
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
ABC #2900, ADA desk, does not have bookrack, as it would interfere with
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 69.21 wheelchair entry. State frame color and laminate color
Academia WAD-1800HP. Price FOB destination, min order 5. For orders
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $116.61 5 or less, please call for special freight quote.
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
School Specialty 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
11" STACKING CHAIRS -
Line 3 POWDER COAT
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $ 16.38 Royal Seating Item # 1101-12 PC
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1$ 17.34 ABC #7101 or #D10D,state frame color and shell color
Worthington Direct 1 $ 26.55 Scholar Craft model 121 polyethylene seat with powder-coated frame
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid

Line 4

11" STACKING
CHROME

CHAIRS -




Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 18.16 ABC#7101 or #D10D, state shell color
School Specialty 1 $ 18.22 Royal Seating Item # 1101-12 CH
Academia ACD-122. Price FOB destination. [

Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $ 23.22
Worthington Direct 1 $ 25.89 Scholar Craft model 121 polyethylene seat with chrome frame
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid

13" STACKING CHAIRS -
Line 5 POWDER COAT
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $ 16.99 Royal Seating Item # 1101-14 PC
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1$ 17.34 ABC#7101 or #D10C, state frame color and shell color
Worthington Direct 1 $ 26.55 Scholar Craft model 123 polyethylene seat with powder-coated frame
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid

13" STACKING CHAIRS -
Line 6 CHROME
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 18.19 ABC#7103 or D10C,state shell color
School Specialty 1 $ 1897 Royal Seating Iltem # 1101-14 CH
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $ 23.46 Academia ACD-124. Price FOB destination.
Worthington Direct 1% 26.13 Scholar Craft model 123 polyethylene seat with chrome frame
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid

15" STACKING CHAIRS -
Line 7 POWDER COAT
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $ 19.53 Royal Seating Item # 1101-16 PC
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 20.02 ABC#7105 or #D10B, state frame color and shell color
Worthington Direct 1 $ 2750 Scholar Craft model 125 polyethylene seat with powder-coated frame
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid

15" STACKING CHAIRS -
Line 8 CHROME
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $ 20.40 Royal Seating Item # 1101-16 CH
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 20.99 ABC#7105 or #D10B,stateshell color
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $ 26.49 Academia ACD-126 Price FOB destination.
Worthington Direct 18 27.31 Scholar Craft model 125 polyethylene seat with chrome frame
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid



Copy Craft

No Bid

17"-18" STACKING CHAIRS -

Line 9 POWDER COAT
Name Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1% 21.32 Royal Seating Item # 1101-18 PC
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 2212 ABC#7107 or #D10A, state frame color and shell color
Worthington Direct 1 $ 26.55 Royal Seating model 1101-18" w/ powder-coated frame
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
17"-18" STACKING CHAIRS -
Line 10 CHROME
Name Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $ 2259 Royal Seating Item # 1101-18 CH
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 23.20 ABC#7107 or #D10A, state shell color
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1% 26.73 Academia ACD-128 Price FOB destination.
Worthington Direct 1 $ 2750 Scholar Craft Model 127 - polyethylene seat with chrome frame
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
17" STACKING
CHAIRS/CASTERS POWDER
Line 11 COAT
Name Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 37.60 ABC#7167 or #D16A, state frame color and shell color
School Specialty 1 $ 41.80 Royal Seating Item # 1141-18 PC
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
17" STACKING
Line 12 CHAIRS/CASTERS CHROME
Name Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

Indeco Sales,Inc.
Worthington Direct

Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC
School Specialty

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC
Copy Craft

$ 39.44
$ 39.85

$ 42.11
$ 45.13
No Bid
No Bid

ABC#7167 or #D16A,state shell color

Scholar Craft model 127C - polyethylene seat, chrome frame, with
casters

Academia ACD-128C price FOB destination, min order 10. For orders 10
or less call for special freight quote.

Royal Seating Item # 1141-18 CH



13 1/2" COMBINATION
CHAIR/DESK Powder/Chrome

Line 13 COAT

Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 61.90 ABC#7453 or #D75C, state frame color and shell color
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $ 8280 Academia ACD-2214WS Price FOB destination.
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid

School Specialty 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Copy Craft 1 No Bid

Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $ 64.71 Artco Bell ABC#7453 or : ABC#7453 or #D10C Chrome frame

15 1/2" COMBINATION
CHAIR/DESK CHROME/Powder

Line 14 coat
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
ABC#7455 or #D75B, state frame color,shell color,and laminate color.
Indeco Sales,Inc. $ 61.90 Chrome frame will run $64.72 ea
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC $ 82.80 Academia ACD-2216WS Price FOB destination

1
1

Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
School Specialty 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid

17 1/2" COMBINATION

CHAIR/DESK -Chrome POWDER

COAT(

SPECIFICATIONS[

These combination units shall be

self-supporting and non-tilting of

16 gauge swaged steel front legs

and 18 gauge back legs. The top

support tube shall be of 1 1/8" 14
Line 15 gauge steel. A 3/
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $ 66.06 Royal Seating 1401-18 PC

deduct $2.00 for no bookrack, ABC#7457 or #D75A, state frame

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 66.17 color,shell color, and laminate color. Chrome frame will run$68.81 ea.
Worthington Direct 1 $ 81.65 Royal Seating Model 1401-18" w/ black powder-coated frame
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $ 82.80 Academia ACD-2218WS
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid

18 1/2" COMBINATION
Line 16 CHAIR/DESK - CHROME/Powder




Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

School Specialty 1 $ 68.86 Royal Seating Item # 1401-18 CH
ABC#7458 or #D75X,state frame color,shell color, and laminate color,

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 70.66 Chrome frame will run $74.81ea.

Worthington Direct 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Copy Craft 1 No Bid

Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid

[Line 17 30" x 72" RECTANGLE TABLE

Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 97.38 ABC#1250, state laminate color

Worthington Direct 1 $101.94 Activity Table

School Specialty 1 $107.78 Royal Seating ltem # 2238 A

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Copy Craft 1 No Bid

Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid

[Line 18 48" x 72" KIDNEY TABLE

Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $137.05 ABC#1275, state laminate color

School Specialty 1 $138.98 Royal Seating Item # 2268 E

Worthington Direct 1 $172.90 Activity Table

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Copy Craft 1 No Bid

Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid

[Line 19 60" X 66" HORSESHOE TABLE

Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $175.27 ABC#1277, state laminate color

School Specialty 1 $186.96 Royal Seating Item # 2270 N

Worthington Direct 1 $223.77 Activity Table

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Copy Craft 1 No Bid

Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid

[Line 20 42" ROUND TABLE

Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 83.31 ABC#1281, state laminate color

Worthington Direct 1 $117.28 Activity table

School Specialty 1 $120.43 Royal Seating Item # 2255 B

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Copy Craft 1 No Bid

Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid

[Line 21 60" ROUND TABLE

Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer




Indeco Sales,Inc. 1
School Specialty 1
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1
Copy Craft 1
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1
Worthington Direct 1

$ 129.92
$ 166.96
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

ABC#1286, state laminate color
Royal Seating Item # 2207 B

24" x 24" x 48" TRAPEZOIDAL

Line 22 TABLE
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 75.26 ABC#1291,state laminate color
School Specialty 1 $ 80.74 Royal Seating ltem # 2276 C
Worthington Direct 1 $ 87.50 Activity Table
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
30" x 30" x 60" TRAPEZOIDAL
Line 23 TABLE
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 88.62 ABC#1290, state laminate color
School Specialty 1 8 9242 Royal Seating ltem # 2287 C
Worthington Direct 1 $115.47 Activity Table
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
30" x 72" RECTANGLE
Line 24 (FOLDING) TABLE
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $110.45 ABC#1550, state laminate color
School Specialty 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
36" x 72" RECTANGLE
Line 25 (FOLDING)TABLE
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $116.73 ABC#1560, state laminate color
School Specialty 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid



[Line 26 30" x 72" RECTANGLE TABLE
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 97.08 ABC#1250, state laminate color
Worthington Direct 1 $101.94 Activity Table
School Specialty 1 $107.78 Royal Seating Item # 2238 A
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
[Line 27 36" x 72" RECTANGLE
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $103.91 ABC#1260,state laminate color
Worthington Direct 1 $138.04 Activity Table
School Specialty 1 $152.92 Royal Seating ltem # 2248 A
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
42"x 60" RECTANGLE TABLED
Line 28
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $116.23 ABC#1270, state laminate color
School Specialty 1 $150.81 Royal Seating Item # 2257 A
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
Planner Art Table by Smith System.
Square legs - 24"-34" adj.[]
Worthington Direct (Alt 1) 1 $299.20 Smith System 25700 1 1/4" tops. 42"x60" rectangular.
36" x 60"RECTANGLE TABLE®
Line 29
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 96.67 ABC#1240, state laminate color
School Specialty 1 $147.01 Royal Seating Item # 2247 A
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid

Worthington Direct (Alt 1)

$ 246.95 Smith System 25560

Planner Art Table by Smith System.
Square legs - 24"-34" adj.[]
1 1/4" tops. 36"x60" rectangular.

[Line 30

Flower 60" TABLE




Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $151.03 ABC#128F, state laminate color
School Specialty 1 $163.33 Royal Seating Item # 2207 K
Worthington Direct 1 $199.45 Mahar 60" Flower Table, 20"-30" legs.
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
MOBILE FOLDING STOOL
Line 31 TABLE (Cafeteria Table)
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Amtab AMS-202 Price FOB destination. Min order 4 tables. For order of
less them 4 tables, please call of special freight price. ]
Warranty 15 years.[]
Stools are 14" diameter of added comfort.[J
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $877.73 Stools are supported by a square tube, this ensures that the se
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $937.61 Midwest #NSU1012, state frame color, laminate color,and stool color
School Specialty 1 HEHEH Sico ltem # TTC 31 F
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
STUDENT/LAB[
ADJ. HEIGHT 18" - 27" FRAME:
CHROME[
Line 32
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $ 38.67 Royal Seating Item # 1500 CH
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 49.49 ABC#0801, state seat color
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
STUDENT/LAB STOOL[]
ADJ. HEIGHT 21" - 30" FRAME:
CHROME(]
0
Line 33
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $ 38.67 Royal Seating Item # 1500 CH
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 51.32 ABC#0802, state seat color
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid



TEACHER STOOL [

HEIGHT ADJUSTABLE ]
Line 34 ARTCO 7990
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. $ 68.45 ABC#7990 or #D99A,state shell color
School Specialty $ 84.24 Royal Seating Iltem # 1551 CH

1
1
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
['FOLDING CHAIRS[]
201" steel frame[)
?[Heavy gauge tubular steel
framel
?0Polyethylene leg caps(]
?0Leg supports are riveted to
front and back legs for added
lateral support’’
?0Embossed 14-gauge link
straps [
Line 35
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $ 14.03 National Public Seating Item # 50 Series
Worthington Direct 1 $ 15.50
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 15.88 NPS#50, state color
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $ 19.42 National Public Seating FHC-101 Price FOB destination
Mfg is National Public Seating. 200 series. Available in Beighe, Gray,
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $ 2228 Brown, Blue, Black. Minimum Qty of 20 required per order.
Part # ALE FC94__ [}
Copy Craft 1 $ 92.80 Price is for a carton of 4 chairs. Color options are grey and tan.
[ JFOLDING CHAIR WITH VINYL
UPHOLSTERY[J
201" steel frame()
?0Heavy gauge tubular steel
frameD
2?0 Polyethylene leg caps(]
?0Leg supports are riveted to
front and back legs for added
lateral support’’
?0Embossed 14-gauge link
straps [
Line 36
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Worthington Direct 1 $ 20.50

School Specialty 1 $ 21.20 National Public Seating Item # 1200 Series



Indeco Sales,Inc.

$ 2255

NPS#1200, state color

Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $ 26.45 NPS FHC-1200 Price FOB destination
Mfg is National Public Seating. 1200 series. Available in Beighe, Gray,
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $ 27.05 Brown, Blue, Black. Minimum Qty of 20 required per order.
Part # ALE FC94VY____ 1]
Copy Craft 1 $100.80 Price is for a carton of 4 chairs. Color options are grey and tan.
[ICHAIR TRUCKJ
(42 CHAIR CAPACITY)O
Line 37
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $193.21 National Public Seating Item # DY 50
Worthington Direct 1 $218.45 Holds 40-54 chairs.
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $243.08 NPS NCT-50 Price FOB destiantion
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $270.68 Mfg is National Public Seating. Item# DY50. Holds 50 chairs.
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $273.30 NPS#DY50,holds up tp 50 chairs
Part # ICE 64048(]
Copy Craft 1 $403.94 Capacity: 37
Part # HON FC320)
Capacity: 32 (no vinyl on seat)[]
Copy Craft (Alt 1) 1 $223.46 HON FC32 Capacity: 24 (with vinyl on seat) Special order from Hon. Requires 4-6 weeks.
[l CHAIR TRUCK!]
[1(84 CHAIR CAPACITY)!
Line 38
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty 1 $279.54 National Public Seating Item # 84
Double-tier chair truck. Holds up to 84 metal folding chairs. Holds up to
Worthington Direct 1 $284.95 60 padded folding chairs.
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 $331.01 NPS HCT-505-HD Price FOB destination.
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $350.25 NPS#84,holds up to 84 chairs
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $371.64 Mfg is National Public Seating. Iltem# 84
Part # SAF 4199BL [}
Copy Craft 1 $429.52 Capacity: 84
[Line 39 Workstation Computer Tables
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

Indeco Sales,Inc.

Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC
Worthington Direct

School Specialty

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC
Copy Craft

Copy Craft (Alt 1)

$ 354.83

$ 373.25

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 236.83 HON

AM3060G2QC Part # HON AM3060G2QQ

ABC#CY05,w/(2)keyboards,state frame color,laminate color
Academia HEX-3060 with 2x RIT-245 with 87WMP-60(]

Price FOB destination, 5 table min order. For order less then 5 tables
please call for special freight costs.

Available in several different color laminates.



[Line 40

ArtCo Teache D500

L TEACHER DESK

Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
ABC#D500, double pedestal teachers desk, statebody color and laminate
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $516.55 color
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
School Specialty 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Indeco#TD3060,30"x60" double
pedestal teachers desk,Black frame
Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $ 347.43 Indeco #TD3060 and Medium oak top, Stocking ltem
[Line 41 HON 5901, 5991 TASK CHAIR
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 73.98 Hon#5901,state color,Gr2 fabric, TXMAS Contract
School Specialty 1 $117.96 Hon ltem # 5901/5991
Must be ordered separately, e.g. HON 5901AB10T 1 ea & HON 5991T 1
Copy Craft 1 $133.66 pr
OFM chair FMO-105AA[]
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid Price FOB destination
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
[Line 42 HON 5901,5991 TASK CHAIR
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $ 96.97 Hon#5991, task chair w/arms,state color,Gr2 fabric, TXMAS contract
Copy Craft 1 $105.13 Chair only
School Specialty 1 $117.96 Hon ltem # 5901/5991
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
OFM FMO-1050]
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid Price FOB destination
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
Vertical File Cabinets[’
12 door - letter(]
128 1/2"D w/lock!(]
Line 43 HON 210 Series
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $214.85 Hon#212P,state color, TXMAS contract
School Specialty 1 $239.40 Hon ltem # 212 P
HON 212P_1J
Copy Craft 1 $284.41 Available in several different colors
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid



Vertical File Cabinets
13 door - letter(]
128 1/2"D w/lock[]

Line 44 HON 210 Series
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 No Bid NOT AVAILABLE
School Specialty 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid 3-Drawer is not available in any Hon vertical file cabinet series
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid

Vertical File Cabinets(’

(4 door - letter(]

128 1/2"D w/lock!(’

0
Line 45 HON 210 Series
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $279.22 Hon#214P,state color, TXMAS contract
School Specialty 1 $306.13 Hon Item # 214 P

Part # HON 214P_[]

Copy Craft 1 $369.63 Available in several different colors
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid

Vertical File Cabinets[’

15 door - letter(]

128 1/2"D w/lock[]
Line 46 HON 210 Series
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $374.52 Hon#215P,state color, TXMAS contract
School Specialty 1 $404.93 Hon ltem # 215 P

Part # HON 215P_[]

Copy Craft 1 $495.79 Available in several different colors
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid

Vertical File Cabinets(’

12 door - legal(!

128 1/2"D w/lock!(’
Line 47 HON 210 Series
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $245.36 Hon#212CP,state color, TXMAS contract
School Specialty 1 $271.03 Hon ltem # 212 CP




Part # HON 212CP_[]

Copy Craft 1 $324.80 Available in several different colors
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid

Vertical File Cabinets’]

13 door - legal(’]

128 1/2"D w/lock[’
Line 48 HON 210 Series
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 No Bid Not Available
School Specialty 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid There are no 3-drawer file cabinets in any Hon file cabinet series.
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid

Vertical File Cabinets’]

14 door - legal’!

128 1/2"D w/lock! ]

0
Line 49 HON 210 Series
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $312.66 Hon#214CP, state color, TXMAS contract
School Specialty 1 $340.80 Hon Item # 214 CP

Part # HON 214CP_[J

Copy Craft 1 $413.89 Available in several different colors
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid

Vertical File Cabinets’!

(15 door - legal (!

128 1/2"D w/lock! ]

0
Line 50 HON 210 Series
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $418.00 Hon#215CP,state color, TXMAS contract
School Specialty 1 $450.00 Hon Item # 215 CP

Part # HON 215CP_[J

Copy Craft 1 $553.33 Available in several different colors
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid



Lateral File Cabinets’"
[12 drawer/locking !
JConventional(’

0
0
Line 51 HON 400 Series
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $201.89 Hon#432L,state color, TXMAS contract
School Specialty 1 $225.97 Hon ltem # 432 L
Part # HON 432L_[7
Copy Craft 1 $267.25 Available in several different colors
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
Lateral File Cabinets[’
[13 drawer/locking !
JConventional(]
0
Line 52 HON 400 Series
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 No Bid NOT AVAILABLE
School Specialty 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Copy Craft 1 No Bid There are no 3 drawer lateral files available in the Hon 400 series.
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
There are several colors to choose from.[
Part # HON 673L_[1 This is a special order item and would require 4 - 6 weeks to arrive from
Copy Craft (Alt 1) 1 $440.45 HON 673L_ the factory.
Lateral File Cabinets[’
14 drawer/locking !
[JConventional(]
0
Line 53 HON 400 Series
Name QTY  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $274.63 Hon#434L ,state color, TXMAS contract
School Specialty 1 $301.37 Hon ltem # 434 L
Part # HON 434L_[7
Copy Craft 1 $363.53 There are several colors to choose from.
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC 1 No Bid
Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid
Worthington Direct 1 No Bid



