AGENDA ITEM
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop X Regular Special
(A) Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

(B) X

Action Item

Presenter(s):

ISMAEL MIJARES, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED
PROPOSAL NO. 130620 FOR JUICES AND NON-CARBONATED BEVERAGES AND THE
BOARD DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE
RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH

©)

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.
BUDGETED FUNDS

(D)

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

Fasted frov Ceeellonse

To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Assistant Superintendent for Business and Finance
Digitally signed by Luis A.

From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director % R
-05'00'

Date: Thursday, June 27, 2013

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 130620 for Juices and

Non-Carbonated Beverages

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal Number 130620 for Juices and Non-Carbonated Beverages be
awarded in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as
per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson Roap @  EaGLE Pass, Texas 78852 @  TeL (830) 773-5181 @  W\W\W.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

An EquaL OrrortuniTy EMPLOYER
F-280



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 130620
JUICES AND NON-CARBONATED BEVERAGES - TABULATION SHEET

LAREDO
COCA-COLA
LABATT FOOD | BOTTLING | BORDEN
SERVICE co. MILK
DESCRIPTION (SAN ANTONIO, TX) (LAREDO, TX) PRODUCTS
BOTTLED WATER $ 5.52
|unrT cosT: $ 0.2300 NO BID
COUNT PER PACKAGE/SIZE: 24 COUNT/16.9 0Z
[BRAND: DASANI
LEMONADE $ 17.32
|unrT cosT: $ 0.7216 |8 NO BID
COUNT PER PACKAGE/SIZE: 24 COUNT/12 0Z
[BRAND: TRUE BREW
ORANGE JUICE $ 17.46 $ 18.00
UNIT COST: $ 0.7275 $ 0.360
COUNT PER PACKAGE/SIZE: 24 COUNT/10 0Z 50 COUNT/8 0Z
BRAND: TROPICANA BORDEN
APPLE JUICE $ 17.46
Junrr cos: $ 0.7275 NO BID
COUNT PER PACKAGE/SIZE: 24 COUNT/10 0Z
BRAND: TROPICANA
ICE TEA $ 17.32
UNIT COST: $ 0.7216 NO BID
COUNT PER PACKAGE/SIZE: 24 COUNT/12 0Z
BRAND: TRUE BREW

FRUIT-FLAVORED DRINKS
UNIT COST:

COUNT PER PACKAGE/SIZE:
BRAND:

11.50
0.9600

12 COUNT
V8 SPLASH

NO BID

SPORTS DRINK
UNIT COST:

COUNT PER PACKAGE/SIZE:
BRAND:

$ 11.81
$ 0.4920

24 COUNT/12 OZ
GATORADE

NO BID

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE SHADED AREA(S) REFLECTS THE RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)



