
   

 

GOVERNING BOARD AGENDA ITEM  

AMPHITHEATER UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 10 

_________________________________________________________________________ 
 
DATE OF MEETING:   August 13, 2013 

 

TITLE: Award of Contract for HVAC (Heating, Ventilation, and Air Conditioning) 

Compressors Based Upon Responses to Request for Bid (RFB) 13-0002 

 
________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

BACKGROUND: 

Request for Bid (RFB) 13-0002 was e-mailed to eleven vendors and published on the District’s website.  This 

request for bid requested pricing for a market basket of HVAC compressors used throughout the District.  Five 

vendors responded; one vendor was deemed non-responsive because they submitted the incorrect bid for this 

solicitation.   

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
_________________________________________________________________________ 
 

RECOMMENDATION: 
It is the recommendation of the Administration that the Governing Board award a contract to Trane Southwest 

based on their response to RFB 13-0002. 
 

_________________________________________________________________________ 
INITIATED BY:                                                     
      

 
                                                                

_________________________________________________________________________ 
Scott Little, Chief Financial Officer                                                                                 Date:  August 7, 2013 

          

                         
 ______________________________    

                                                                                              Patrick Nelson, Superintendent 
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TABULATION FOR RFB 13-0002 HVAC COMPRESSORS 
 

Description Part Number 

Arctic 

Refrigeration 

Unit Price 

Interline 

Brands, Inc. 

Trane 

Southwest Sigler 

COMPRESSORS 
COPELAND OR 

EQUAL         

2.0 HP COMP 230 MO 

S R22 AC 

CR24KQ-PFV-

980WB 417.25 281.00 323.77 321.35 

2.5 HP COMP 230 MO 

S R22 AC 

CR30KQ-PFV-

980WB 467.25 286.00 337.30 330.55 

3.0 HP COMP 230 MO 

S R22 AC 

CR37KQ-PFV-

980WB 505.00 344.00 379.65 691.05 

3.5 HP COMP 230 MO 

S R22 AC 

CR47KQ-PFV-

980WB 568.65 No Bid 388.50 412.75 

3.5 HP COMP 230 3PH 

MO S R22 AC 
CR47KQ-TF5-980WB 

774.00 No Bid 538.88 547.20 

4.0 HP COMP 230 MO 

S R22 AC 

CR53KQ-PFV-

980WB 686.50 No Bid 509.29 485.75 

4.0 HP COMP 230 3PH 

MO S R22 AC 
CR53KQ-TF5-980WB 

880.35 No Bid 617.43 623.15 

5.0 HP COMP 230 MO 

S R22 AC 
CRN5-0500-PFV-970 

778.60 No Bid 594.18 551.12 

5.0 HP COMP 230 3PH 

MO S R22 AC 
CRN5-0500-TF5-970 

871.75 No Bid 575.40 616.89 

3.25 HP COMP 230 

MO S R22 AC 
ZR38K5-PFV-800 

597.50 450.00 407.61 418.62 

4.0 HP COMP 230 MO 

S R22 AC 
ZR48K5-PFV-800 

712.85 520.00 461.68 500.43 

4.0 HP COMP 230 3PH 

MO S R22 AC 
ZR48K5-TF5-800 

816.30 No Bid 559.28 573.62 

5.0 HP COMP 230 MO 

S R22 AC 
ZR61K3-PFV-930 

850.25 No Bid 562.56 603.76 

5.0 HP COMP 230 3PH 

MO S R22 AC 
ZR61K3-TF5-930 

917.00 No Bid 595.93 650.73 

COMPRESSORS TRANE (NO SUB)         

10 HP COMP 460 3PH 

MO S R22 AC 
COM06430 

3478.80 No Bid 2512.24 No Bid 

5.5 HP COMP 230  

3PH MO S R22 AC 
COM03748 

1080.00 No Bid 766.50 No Bid 

4.0 HP COMP 230  MO 

S R22 AC 
COM03722 

960.00 No Bid 681.74 No Bid 

 
 


