
Agenda Item No.: H.6 

 
 

Governing Board Agenda Item 
 

Meeting Date:​​ June 12, 2025​ ​ ​  

From:                       ​ Caitlyn Kauffman, Marana High School Principal 

Subject:                   ​ Out-of-State Travel ​  

Priority:                   ​ To provide rigorous, relevant, and innovative academics 

Consent     [X]​​ Action     []​ ​ Discussion [] 
 

Background: 
 
I would like to request permission for Marana High School (MHS) Skills USA Auto Club 
Sponsors, Christopher Citro and David Williams, a Marana Unified School District Career and 
Technical Education (CTE) staff member (to be determined - Christy Oldham, Stephanie Lippert, 
or Keri Stanford), and the MHS Skills USA Auto Club students to travel to Las Vegas, Nevada to 
attend the Specialty Equipment Market Association (SEMA) Education Days on November 3-7, 
2025. 
 
Students will attend daily seminars hosted by automotive industry leaders and have round table 
discussions on how to network and market themselves. Students will attend a nationwide Career 
Day with over 50 companies who are actively hiring. Mr. Citro, Mr. Williams, and the CTE 
representative will attend meetings with instructors nationwide to discuss trends in CTE, 
classroom strategies, and the latest tool technology and relevance to the classroom. Students will 
also be introduced to new business owners actively competing to launch their product or service 
at the SEMA Show and see the latest automotive trends, tools, businesses, and possibilities in the 
automotive world. 
  
 
Recommended Motion: 
  
I move that the Governing Board approve out-of-state travel for Marana High School (MHS) 
Skills USA Auto Club Sponsors, Christopher Citro and David Williams, a Marana Unified 
School District Career and Technical Education (CTE) staff member (to be determined - Christy 
Oldham, Stephanie Lippert, or Keri Stanford), and the MHS Skills USA Auto Club students to 
travel to Las Vegas, Nevada to attend the Specialty Equipment Market Association (SEMA) 
Education Days on November 3-7, 2025. 
  
 
 
 



 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
  
 
 
  
Approved for transmittal to the Governing Board: _____________________________             ​  
                                                                    ​      ​ Dr. Daniel Streeter, Superintendent    

Questions should be directed to: Caitlyn Kauffman, Marana High School Principal 
Phone: (520) 616-6400 



Agenda Item No.: H.6  

 
 

Governing Board Agenda Item 
 

Meeting Date:​​ June 12, 2025​ ​ ​  
 
From:​ ​ ​ Dr. Daniel Streeter, Superintendent 
 
Subject:​ ​ Out-of-State Travel​  
 
Priority:​ ​ To provide rigorous, relevant, and innovative academics 
 
Consent     [X]​​ Action     []​ ​ Discussion [] 

 
Background: 
I would like to request permission to travel to Washington, D.C. to attend AASA’s 2025 
Governing Board Meeting July 8 - 10, 2025. Travel will commence on July 7, 2025.  
 
AASA, The School Superintendents Association, is the premier association for school system 
leaders and serves as the national voice for public education and district leadership on Capitol 
Hill. Its practicing superintendents and other school system leaders establish and oversee 
AASA's goals. AASA's governance structure engages the considerable talents of its diverse, 
dynamic membership. This structure assures that AASA is truly a national organization with an 
agenda that reflects the viewpoints of school administrators throughout the country. 
 
Governing Board members have dual responsibilities. They represent their home state on the 
Governing Board and they report the work of the Governing Board to their home state affiliate. 
Through the Governing Board elected representatives, members have a voice in AASA decision 
making. 
 
As a new AASA Governing Board member, all expenses will be paid by AASA. There is no cost 
to the District. 
 
Recommended Motion: 
 
I move that the Governing Board approve out-of-state travel for Dr. Daniel Streeter, 
Superintendent, to travel Washington D.C. to attend AASA’s 2025 Governing Board Meeting 
July 8 - 10, 2025.  
  
Approved for transmittal to the Governing Board: _____________________________             ​  
                                                                    ​      ​ Dr. Daniel Streeter, Superintendent    
 
Questions should be directed to: Dr. Daniel Streeter, Superintendent 
Phone: (520) 682-4774 
 


	H6 Travel MHS
	H6 TravelSuperintendent.docx

