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BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA

Workshop

Regular

Special

Report Only

Presenter(s):

Recognition

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

X Action Item

CH.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED
PROPOSAL NO. 130733 FOR MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD
DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE
RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding

this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DiISTRICT

To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Assistant Superintendent for Business and Finance
/ Digitally signed

2 . : . . by Luis A. Vélez
From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director {1{’ Date: 2013.07.31

17:57:06 -05'00'

Date: Wednesday, July 31, 2013
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 130733 for Music Instruments
and Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends
that Sealed Proposal Number 130733 for Music Instruments and Supplies be
awarded in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal
and as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson Roap @  EacLe Pass, Texas 78852 @  Ten (830) 773-518]1 @  wwwW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

An Equar OrrorruniTy EMpLOYER
F-280



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 130733

MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES
mews | qrv. DESCRIPTION NORTHEASTMUSIC, | ercussion | BROOKMAYS | ey pan usic | WASHINGTON
SOURCE
LATHAM, NY WAYNE, NE & BARBARA, CA — 1- D —
CC WINN HIGH SCHOOL S R
1| 1 ROLAND FANTOM G7 NO BID NO BID ' :
2 1 ROLAND FANTOM G6 NO BID NO BID
3 1 YAMAHA MOTIF XF7 NO BID NO BID
4 1 CYMBALS-ZILDJIAN K0950 NO BID $ 189.45
5 1 CYMBALS-ZILDJIAN K1068 NO BID $ 300.15
6 1 CYMBALS-ZILDJIAN A20826 NO BID $ 172.35
7 1 CYMBALS-ZILDJIAN K0997 NO BID $ 277.20
8 1 CYMBALS-ZILDIIAN K1224 NO BID $ 335.00
9 1 BARITONE SAXOPHONE NO BID NO BID
10 1 MUSIC STAND-MANHASSET M48 NO BID $ 183.36
11 1 CONCERT TOMS-PEARL PTE1012 NO BID $ 337.50
12 1 CONCERT TOMS-PEARL PTE1314 NO BID $ 364.28
13 1 Bb CLARINET-BUNDY BCL-300 NO BID NO BID
14 1 FRENCH HORN-HOLDON H179 FARKAS NO BID NO BID

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE SHADED AREA(S) REFLECTS THE RECOMMENDED VENDOR




EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 130733

MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES
WEST MUSIC/
NORTHEAST MUSIC, BROOK MAYS WASHINGTON
ITEMS | QTY. DESCRIPTION e PERCUSSION MUsTc NICK RAIL MUSIC |\ 1oy et n InG.
SOURCE
LATHAM, NY WAYNE, NE DALLAS, TX SANTA BARBARA, CA i WHEATON

15 1 MARCHING BARITONE-KING 11275P NO BID NO BID $ 1,770.00| $ 1,795.00

16 1 ENDURANCE FIELD FRAME FOR MCKF-43 NO BID $ 3,956.65 NO BID $ 3,709.00

17 1 PEARL PNEUMATIC TIMPANI THRONE NO BID $ 241.98 NO BID $ 208.00'$ 99.00

18 1 MARCHING TROMBONE-KANSTRUL 955-2 NO BID NO BID NO BID (

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE SHADED AREA(S) REFLECTS THE RECOMMENDED VENDOR



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 130733

MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES
WEST MUSIC/
NORTHEAST MUSIC, BROOK MAYS WASHINGTON
mEeMs | Qrv. DESCRIPTION INC. PERCUSSION MUSIC NICK RAIL MUSIC |\ s1c CENTER INC.,
SOURCE
LATHAM, NY '."""'_‘_“_0 X SANTA BARBA| CA WHEATON, MD
’,’.“.‘."‘..’..‘.‘0
000994
EAGLE PASS HIGH SCHOOL :,:,:,.,.,‘,.,’,:,’.:,
d L [HveriD comMBo BASS AMPLIFIERS- MARSHALL NO BID NO BID —— —
MB4210
Bb CLARINET-BUFFET CRAMPTON R13
2 1 il Tl NO BID NO BID $ 2,390.00| $ 2,289.00
BACH 4280 STRADIVARIUS SERIES F
3 1 bbb Lt b NO BID NO BID $ 2,360.00 | $ 2,385.00
4 1 HARMONY DIRECTOR-YAMAHA HD-200 NO BID $ 1,190.00 NO BID $ 965.00
ELECTRIC BASS-FENDER AMERICAN DELUXE

5 1 et " Myt o NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 || MARCHING F MELLOPHONE-vaNAHA Y- Ny i NG B s 1,310.00| $ 1,214.00

7 1 EUPHONIUM-YAMAHA YEP-321 $ 1,578.00 NO BID NO BID $ 1,709.00

8 1 FRENCH HORN-HOLTON H379 NO BID NO BID $ 2,375.00| $ 2,429.00

9 1 | BEREINE L ENEARR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

POSAL NOTES:

1. A "No Bid" was submitted by: The Mariachi Connection, Opti-Case, Inc. and Shar Products Company.
2. * Denotes Not Bid as Specified.

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE SHADED AREA(S) REFLECTS THE RECOMMENDED VENDOR



