
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 877
BUFFALO - HANOVER - MONTROSE

BID TABULATION
MILK PRODUCTS

April 17, 2014, 10:00 AM CENTRAL TIME
BIDDERS DEAN FOODS/LAND-O-LAKES KEMPS

BIDDER'S ASSURANCE OF COMPLIANCE X X
USDA CERTIFICATION X X
ACCEPT PROCUREMENT CARD No No
ORDERING by district, on-line by company
DELIVERY Twice/week delivery Daily:  Secondary,  EOD:  Elementary (MWF, TTH)
BASE BID : 1/2 PINT MILK IN PAPER CARTONS
# DESCRIPTION YTD QTY FIRM
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PER UNIT

ESCALATIO
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NOTES
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1 ½ Pint Skim White Milk in carton 165,552 No bid $0.2140 $35,428.13 No Biid $0.2230 $36,918.10

2
½ Pint Skim Chocolate Milk in
carton 350,273 No bid $0.2240 $78,461.15 No Biid $0.2360 $82,664.43

3
½ Pint Lactose Reduced Milk  in
carton 1,068 No bid $0.6840 1% $730.51 No Biid $0.5500 Skim $587.40

4 Soft Serve, Vanilla.5%, 2.5 Gal 202 No bid $15.2800 2/2.5 cs $3,086.56 No Biid $15.5700 2/2.5 cs $3,145.14
Total $117,706.35 Total $123,315.06

MINNESOTA APRIL 2014 ESCALATOR CLAUSE
Under the terms of the Federal Milk Market Order #30. KEMPS:   If the Class I price is decreased or increased, for
each $.01 per hundredweight decrease or increase, the quotation on fluid   milk will decrease or increase $.000054 per
1/2 pint.   DEAN FOODS:   If the Class I price is decreased or increased, for each $.10 per hundredweight decrease or
increase, the quotation on fluid   milk will decrease or increase $.000054 per 1/2 pint.

BUTTERFAT DIFFERENTIAL
Price change will occur as butterfat differentials are announced by the Federal announcements.  Formula as follows:  For
each change in the announced butterfat differential the price will increase or decrease by the following formula:

DEAN FOODS per $.10 KEMPS per $.001
Butterfat Differential: Skim Milk per 1/2 pint $0.0001 $0.0001
** YTD totals are from time period 9/1/13 to 3/14/14


