
South San Antonio ISD

RFQ 2022-08

Delta-T Group 

Western 

Pennsylvania, 

Inc

Cindy L Haughn 

LLC (Cynthia L 

Haughn)

Teaching for 

Tomorrow, LLC

Final Graphic, 

LLC

Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Description Unit Unit Unit Unit

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

(BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH) No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

ASSISTANTS (BILINGUAL 

ENGLISH/SPANISH)  No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00

AUDIOLOGY SERVICES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

PHYSICAL THERAPY SERVICES  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY 

SERVICES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

EDUCATIONAL DIAGNOSTICIAN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

LSSP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY 

SERVICES No Bid $87.50 No Bid No Bid

VISUAL IMPAIRMENT SERVICES No Bid No Bid $90.00 No Bid

CONSULTATION SERVICES: 

BEHAVIOR, SOCIAL SKILLS, AND 

AUTISM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

INTERPRETER SERVICES  No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00

NURSING SERVICES  $40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

ADAPTIVE PHYSICAL SERVICES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



South San Antonio ISD

RFQ 2022-08

Description

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

(BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH) 

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

ASSISTANTS (BILINGUAL 

ENGLISH/SPANISH)  

AUDIOLOGY SERVICES

PHYSICAL THERAPY SERVICES  

OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY 

SERVICES 

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

EDUCATIONAL DIAGNOSTICIAN 

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

LSSP

ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY 

SERVICES

VISUAL IMPAIRMENT SERVICES

CONSULTATION SERVICES: 

BEHAVIOR, SOCIAL SKILLS, AND 

AUTISM 

INTERPRETER SERVICES  

NURSING SERVICES  

ADAPTIVE PHYSICAL SERVICES 

CompHealth 

Medical Staffing 

(CHG Medical 

Staffing Inc.)

PresenceLearnin

g, Inc.

NURSES Etc 

STAFFING 

(Donald L. 

Mooney 

Enterprises, LLC)

Applied 

Pediatrics

Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Unit Unit Unit Unit

$82.00 $90.00 $71.00 $70.00

No Bid No Bid $51.00 $79.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$80.00 No Bid $85.00 $65.00

$80.00 $75.00 $85.00 $65.00

No Bid $90.00 No Bid $75.00

No Bid $90.00 No Bid $83.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



South San Antonio ISD

RFQ 2022-08

Description

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

(BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH) 

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

ASSISTANTS (BILINGUAL 

ENGLISH/SPANISH)  

AUDIOLOGY SERVICES

PHYSICAL THERAPY SERVICES  

OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY 

SERVICES 

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

EDUCATIONAL DIAGNOSTICIAN 

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

LSSP

ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY 

SERVICES

VISUAL IMPAIRMENT SERVICES

CONSULTATION SERVICES: 

BEHAVIOR, SOCIAL SKILLS, AND 

AUTISM 

INTERPRETER SERVICES  

NURSING SERVICES  

ADAPTIVE PHYSICAL SERVICES 

Supplemental 

Health Care 

(SHC SERVICES, 

INC)

Attain Therapy, 

LLC

CareStaff 

Partners

SA Therapy in 

Motion

Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Unit Unit Unit Unit

$75.00 $145.00 $71.00 $73.00

$63.00 $90.00 $61.00 $55.00

No Bid No Bid $73.00 $70.00

$70.00 $100.00 $71.00 $70.00

$70.00 $100.00 $71.00 $68.00

$80.00 No Bid No Bid $65.00

$85.00 No Bid $73.00 $75.00

No Bid No Bid $68.00 $70.00

No Bid No Bid $68.00 $70.00

No Bid $105.00 No Bid $70.00

No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid

$62.00 No Bid $65.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00



South San Antonio ISD

RFQ 2022-08

Description

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

(BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH) 

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

ASSISTANTS (BILINGUAL 

ENGLISH/SPANISH)  

AUDIOLOGY SERVICES

PHYSICAL THERAPY SERVICES  

OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY 

SERVICES 

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

EDUCATIONAL DIAGNOSTICIAN 

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

LSSP

ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY 

SERVICES

VISUAL IMPAIRMENT SERVICES

CONSULTATION SERVICES: 

BEHAVIOR, SOCIAL SKILLS, AND 

AUTISM 

INTERPRETER SERVICES  

NURSING SERVICES  

ADAPTIVE PHYSICAL SERVICES 

ProLink Staffing

The Stepping 

Stones Group 

LLC

National 

Recruiting 

Consultants

HelloHero 

(Enable My 

Child, Ltd.)

Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Unit Unit Unit Unit

$79.00 $85.00 $78.00 $93.00

$60.00 $65.00 $65.00 $89.00

No Bid $70.00 $72.00 $79.00

$79.00 $70.00 $74.00 $79.00

$79.00 $68.00 $74.00 $79.00

$68.00 $75.00 $75.00 $117.00

$98.00 $90.00 $85.00 $117.00

$68.00 $65.00 $70.00 $79.00

$68.00 $65.00 $65.00 $79.00

$85.00 $85.00 $83.00 $79.00

$29.00 $55.00 $65.00 No Bid

$52.75 $62.00 $70.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



South San Antonio ISD

RFQ 2022-08

Description

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

(BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH) 

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

ASSISTANTS (BILINGUAL 

ENGLISH/SPANISH)  

AUDIOLOGY SERVICES

PHYSICAL THERAPY SERVICES  

OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY 

SERVICES 

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

EDUCATIONAL DIAGNOSTICIAN 

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

LSSP

ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY 

SERVICES

VISUAL IMPAIRMENT SERVICES

CONSULTATION SERVICES: 

BEHAVIOR, SOCIAL SKILLS, AND 

AUTISM 

INTERPRETER SERVICES  

NURSING SERVICES  

ADAPTIVE PHYSICAL SERVICES 

AMN Allied 

Services, LLC

Accountable 

Healthcare 

Staffing, Inc.

EDU Healthcare, 

LLC

Candor 

Consulting and 

Diagnostics, LLC

Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Unit Unit Unit Unit

$83.00 $75.00 $78.00 $90.00

$73.00 $61.00 $65.00 $70.00

No Bid $72.00 $75.00 $90.00

$78.00 $72.00 $80.00 $90.00

$78.00 $72.00 $75.00 $90.00

No Bid $73.00 $85.00 $85.00

$93.00 $81.00 $90.00 $90.00

No Bid $70.00 $80.00 $80.00

No Bid $70.00 $70.00 $80.00

$83.00 $85.00 $70.00 $85.00

$357.00 $60.00 $60.00 $90.00

$73.00 $64.00 $55.00 No Bid

No Bid $72.00 $70.00 $85.00



South San Antonio ISD

RFQ 2022-08

Description

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

(BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH) 

SPEECH/LANGUAGE SERVICES 

ASSISTANTS (BILINGUAL 

ENGLISH/SPANISH)  

AUDIOLOGY SERVICES

PHYSICAL THERAPY SERVICES  

OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY 

SERVICES 

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

EDUCATIONAL DIAGNOSTICIAN 

BILINGUAL ENGLISH/SPANISH 

LSSP

ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY 

SERVICES

VISUAL IMPAIRMENT SERVICES

CONSULTATION SERVICES: 

BEHAVIOR, SOCIAL SKILLS, AND 

AUTISM 

INTERPRETER SERVICES  

NURSING SERVICES  

ADAPTIVE PHYSICAL SERVICES 

Specialized 

Assessment & 

Consulting 

(Specialized 

Assessment & 

Consulting, LLC)

Educating 

Diverse Learners
Global VIDA

Total Price Total Price Total Price

Unit Unit Unit

$90.00 No Bid No Bid

$70.00 No Bid $699.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$85.00 No Bid No Bid

$85.00 No Bid No Bid

$90.00 No Bid $699.00

$90.00 No Bid No Bid

$125.00 No Bid No Bid

$125.00 No Bid No Bid

$125.00 $1,500.00 $699.00

$125.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$65.00 No Bid No Bid


