



UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT AGENDA ACTION ITEM

TOPIC: Approval of rescission of award to Indeco Sales under RFP 008-2017 Furniture and Equipment for two (2) 9th Grade Campuses and one (1) Elementary Campus during the April 19, 2017 Board Meeting.

SUBMITTED BY: Cordelia Flores Jackson of: Purchasing Department

APPROVED FOR TRANSMITTAL TO SCHOOL BOARD: August 16, 2017

Recommendation:

Administration recommends the rescission of board action taken on April 19, 2017 for the Common Area Section awarded to Indeco Sales in the amount of \$89,542. Aforementioned vendor rescinded his bid proposal due to an error in the submission and he cannot longer honor price.

Administration purchased the common area furniture through a purchasing cooperative.

Rationale:

Staff has complied with all applicable federal, state and local purchasing policies and procedures in obtaining pricing information for the items listed above. Staff is recommending the awards based on being the best value to the district.

Budgetary Information:

The budget includes the funds for these purchases

Board Policy Reference and Compliance

CH local – purchasing and acquisition

CH legal – purchasing and acquisition

RFP 008-2017

**Furniture and Equipment for two (2) 9th Grade Campuses and one (1)
Elementary Campus**

United High School 9th Grade Campus

Section	Amount	Recommended Vendor
Administration Furniture	\$81,003.69	J. R., Inc.
Nurse Furniture	\$1,578.80	School Specialty Inc.
Cafeteria Furniture	\$43,808.37	School Specialty Inc.
Outdoor and Locker Furniture	\$18,133.15	J. R., Inc.
Art Equipment	\$21,014.70	J. R., Inc.
Classroom Furniture	\$280,401.46	J. R., Inc.
Common Area Section	\$44,771.00	Indeco
Total	\$490,711.17	

Line #	Description	Mfg	Qty	Indeco		J. R., Inc.		Lakeshore Learning Materials		SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.		School Specialty Inc.		South Texas School Furniture	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
Administration Section															
1.1	Administration: 60" Executive Desk	Hon or Equal	13	\$773.00	\$10,049.00	\$699.92	\$9,098.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.2	Administration: 66" Executive Desk	Hon or Equal	2	\$800.00	\$1,600.00	\$724.31	\$1,448.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.3	Administration: 72" Executive Desk	Hon or Equal	1	\$821.00	\$821.00	\$743.54	\$743.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.4	Administration: Bookcase for Testing Rox	Hon or Equal	1	\$249.00	\$249.00	\$225.29	\$225.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.5	Administration: Bookcase for Offices in A	Hon or Equal	23	\$290.00	\$6,670.00	\$262.04	\$6,026.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.6	Administration: Conference Table 10 Feet	Hon or Equal	1	\$553.00	\$553.00	\$529.23	\$529.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.7	Administration: Conference Table 8 Feet	Hon or Equal	2	\$500.00	\$1,000.00	\$514.47	\$1,028.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.8	Administration: File Cabinet Legal	Hon or Equal	30	\$199.00	\$5,970.00	\$208.67	\$6,260.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.9	Administration: Guest Chairs	Hon or Equal	35	\$161.00	\$5,635.00	\$148.02	\$5,180.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.10	Administration: High Back Chair	Hon or Equal	1	\$208.00	\$208.00	\$190.60	\$190.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.11	Administration: L Shaped Desk with Left	Hon or Equal	6	\$675.00	\$4,050.00	\$658.64	\$4,011.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.12	Administration: L Shaped Desk with Right	Hon or Equal	1	\$1,179.00	\$1,179.00	\$1,067.74	\$1,067.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.13	Administration: Lateral Cabinet	Hon or Equal	1	\$473.00	\$473.00	\$428.27	\$428.27	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.14	Administration: Lounge Caf Stool Vinyl Ic	Hon or Equal	12	\$152.00	\$1,824.00	\$134.96	\$1,619.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.15	Administration: Lounge Caf Table for Adr	Hon or Equal	3	\$261.00	\$783.00	\$347.21	\$1,041.63	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.16	Administration: Lounge Chair Vinyl for Ai	Hon or Equal	12	\$239.00	\$2,868.00	\$105.78	\$1,269.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.17	Administration: Lounge Soft Square Table	Hon or Equal	3	\$342.00	\$1,026.00	\$311.83	\$935.49	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.18	Administration: Mid Back Chair Offices	Hon or Equal	43	\$198.00	\$8,514.00	\$182.02	\$7,826.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.19	Administration: Reception Chairs	Hon or Equal	20	\$72.00	\$1,440.00	\$63.62	\$1,272.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.20	Administration: Rectangular Activity Tab	Virco or Equal	1	\$210.00	\$210.00	\$147.60	\$147.60	\$189.05	\$189.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$444.00
1.21	Administration: Rectangular Table for Te	Virco or Equal	2	\$117.00	\$234.00	\$88.65	\$177.30	\$189.05	\$378.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$222.00
1.22	Administration: Secretarial Chairs	Hon or Equal	10	\$140.00	\$1,400.00	\$136.68	\$1,366.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.23	Administration: Stacking Chairs for Work	Virco or Equal	6	\$32.00	\$192.00	\$60.15	\$360.90	\$47.49	\$284.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.00
1.24	Administration: Storage Cabinet with Lox	Hon or Equal	2	\$301.00	\$602.00	\$312.70	\$625.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.25	Administration: Student Chairs for Nurse	Virco or Equal	23	\$96.00	\$2,208.00	\$88.60	\$2,036.40	\$47.49	\$1,092.27	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.00
1.26	Administration: Teacher Chair for Testing	Hon or Equal	1	\$367.00	\$367.00	\$342.41	\$342.41	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,196.00
1.27	Administration: Teacher Desk for Testing	Hon or Equal	1	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$284.06	\$284.06	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.28	Administration: Computer Desk for Testir	Virco or Equal	1	\$773.00	\$773.00	\$699.92	\$699.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$353.55	\$353.55	No Bid	No Bid
1.47	Library: 60" Executive Desk	Hon or Equal	1	\$290.00	\$290.00	\$265.05	\$265.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.48	Library: Bookcase for Office	Hon or Equal	1	\$199.00	\$199.00	\$208.67	\$208.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.49	Library: File Cabinet Legal	Hon or Equal	1	\$198.00	\$198.00	\$182.02	\$182.02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.50	Library: Mid Back Chair for Librarian and c	Hon or Equal	9	\$161.00	\$1,449.00	\$148.02	\$1,332.18	\$189.05	\$1,701.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.51	Library: Guest Chairs for Librarian	Hon or Equal	2	\$225.00	\$450.00	\$145.20	\$290.40	\$189.05	\$378.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.52	Library: Rectangular Activity Table	Virco or Equal	1	\$225.00	\$225.00	\$145.20	\$145.20	\$189.05	\$378.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.53	Library: Stacking Chair	Virco or Equal	4	\$32.00	\$128.00	\$61.16	\$244.64	\$47.49	\$189.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$208.00
1.54	Library: Conference Table 8 Feet	Hon or Equal	1	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$514.47	\$514.47	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.36	Cafeteria: Chair Storage/Truck	Virco or Equal	12	\$297.00	\$3,564.00	\$362.85	\$4,354.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$298.40	\$3,580.80	\$266.00	\$3,192.00
1.37	Cafeteria: Folding Chairs	Virco or Equal	162	\$15.25	\$2,470.50	\$18.15	\$2,940.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.73	\$2,852.76	\$18.00	\$2,916.00
				\$81,998.00	\$81,003.69	\$2,588.42	\$2,588.42	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$21,664.35	\$21,664.35	\$23,352.00	\$23,352.00
Nurse Section															
1.29	Nurse Area: Recovery Couch	se Supply or Ec31250 Royal Blue	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$576.27	\$2,305.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$499.00	\$1,996.00	\$394.70	\$1,578.80	\$628.00	\$2,512.00
				No Bid	No Bid	\$2,305.08	\$2,305.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,996.00	\$1,996.00	\$1,578.80	\$1,578.80	\$2,512.00	\$2,512.00
Cafeteria Section															
1.34	Cafeteria: Cafeteria Tables with 12 Stooler	Hamilton or 50T11293012 51	45	\$1,341.00	\$60,345.00	\$1,180.00	\$53,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$928.17	\$41,767.65	\$1,294.95	\$58,272.75
1.35	Cafeteria: Cafeteria Tables with Stools	Aler Hamilton or rT11303012 58*V	2	\$1,341.00	\$2,682.00	\$1,315.00	\$2,630.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,020.36	\$2,040.72	\$1,294.95	\$2,589.90
				\$63,027.00	\$63,027.00	\$55,730.00	\$55,730.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$43,808.17	\$43,808.17	\$60,862.65	\$60,862.65

**United High School -
9th Grade Campus**

Indeco		J. R., Inc.		Lakeshore Learning Materials		SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.		School Specialty Inc.		South Texas School Furniture		
Outdoor and Locker Furniture												
1.30 Athletics: Benches for Boys locker room/vecoat or Equi.	86ULPERFP	18	\$227.00	\$4,086.00	\$212.45	\$3,824.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$494.94	\$8,908.92	\$265.00	\$4,770.00
1.38 Cafeteria: Outdoor Dining Portable Rectra/vecoat or Equi.	T6ULPERF	5	\$617.00	\$3,085.00	\$682.05	\$3,410.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$858.45	\$4,292.25	\$737.00	\$3,685.00
1.39 Cafeteria: Outdoor Dining Portable Squa/vecoat or Equi.	T46ULPERFADA	1	\$692.00	\$692.00	\$707.15	\$707.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$957.95	\$957.95	\$768.00	\$768.00
1.40 Cafeteria: Outdoor Dining Portable Squa/vecoat or Equi.	T46ULPERF	4	\$658.00	\$2,632.00	\$682.05	\$2,728.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$796.19	\$3,184.76	\$737.00	\$2,948.00
1.45 Library: ADA Outdoor Common Area 46" Vebcoat or Equi.	WEBRACPSM /	1	\$1,101.00	\$1,101.00	\$980.15	\$980.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$876.98	\$876.98	\$1,122.00	\$1,122.00
1.46 Library: Outdoor Common Area 46" Round/vecoat or Equi.	S46WEBRACPSF	6	\$1,101.00	\$6,606.00	\$1,080.55	\$6,483.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$915.02	\$5,490.12	\$1,247.00	\$7,482.00
			\$18,202.00		\$18,133.15		No Bid		\$14,802.06		\$16,005.00	
Art Section												
1.63 Art: Drafting Tables	th System or Et	27346	No Bid	No Bid	\$269.67	\$16,719.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.64 Art: Art Cabinet Metal Storage	th System or Et	09450	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.65 Art: All Around Cart	sal Manufacturer	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$804.97	\$1,609.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.66 Art: partitions for the racks 12"x32"	Bailey Pottery	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.10	\$62.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.67 Art: partitions for the racks 24"x32"	Bailey Pottery	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$57.20	\$114.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.68 Art: Steel Flat Files 5 Drawer	SAFCO	4998TSR	2	No Bid	\$1,254.31	\$2,508.62	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,321.79	\$2,643.58	\$1,782.00	\$3,564.00
			No Bid		\$21,034.70		No Bid		\$2,643.58		\$3,564.00	
Classrooms Section												
1.70 Classrooms: Bookcase for Classroom	Hon or Equal	105534	\$249.00	\$12,699.00	\$225.29	\$11,489.79	\$265.05	\$13,517.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.72 Classrooms: Option 8 Desk and Chair (Colr and Virco Des)	18 and Virco Des	1170	\$133.00	\$155,610.00	\$123.85	\$144,904.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$200.00	\$234,000.00
1.74 Classrooms: Option 8 Desk and Chair	ADP Virco or Equal	10	\$133.00	\$1,330.00	\$123.85	\$1,238.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$125.00	\$1,250.00
1.76 Classrooms: Computer Desk 30x72	Virco or Equal	137	\$270.00	\$36,990.00	\$279.90	\$36,346.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$353.55	\$48,436.35	No Bid	No Bid
1.77 Classrooms: Conference Table 8 Feet	Hon or Equal	TL84966/HTLP:	4	\$500.00	\$2,000.00	\$514.47	\$2,057.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.78 Classrooms: File Cabinet Legal	Hon or Equal	314CP	2	\$199.00	\$398.00	\$208.67	\$417.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.79 Classrooms: File Cabinet Letter	Hon or Equal	314P	50	\$171.00	\$8,550.00	\$177.24	\$8,862.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.80 Classrooms: Mid Back Chair (Conference)	Hon or Equal	2092	\$198.00	\$6,534.00	\$182.02	\$6,006.66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.81 Classrooms: Rectangular Activity Table	Virco or Equal	503672ADJSU	1	\$725.00	\$725.00	\$147.60	\$147.60	\$189.05	\$189.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.82 Classrooms: Secretarial Chairs	Hon or Equal	7701	\$140.00	\$5,040.00	\$136.68	\$4,920.48	\$47.49	\$284.94	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.00	\$312.00
1.83 Classrooms: Stacking Chairs for BMI Work	Virco or Equal	2U418	6	\$32.00	\$192.00	\$61.16	\$366.96	\$47.49	\$284.94	No Bid	\$75.00	\$16,650.00
1.84 Classrooms: Adjustable Stool Hard Plastic	Virco or Equal	AN18	222	\$52.00	\$11,544.00	\$58.16	\$12,911.52	\$47.49	\$22,225.32	No Bid	\$52.00	\$24,336.00
1.85 Classrooms: Student Chairs 18"	Hon or Equal	5901	\$32.00	\$14,976.00	\$38.75	\$18,135.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.00	\$24,336.00
1.86 Classrooms: Teacher Chair	Hon or Equal	88251	\$96.00	\$4,896.00	\$88.60	\$4,518.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.87 Classrooms: Teacher Desk	Hon or Equal	105534	\$367.00	\$18,717.00	\$342.41	\$17,462.91	\$265.05	\$1,590.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.31 Athletics: Bookcase for Classroom	Hon or Equal	314P	6	\$171.00	\$1,026.00	\$177.24	\$1,063.44	\$265.05	\$1,590.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.32 Athletics: File Cabinet Letter	Hon or Equal	5901	\$96.00	\$1,344.00	\$88.60	\$1,240.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.33 Athletics: Teacher Chair	Hon or Equal	88251	\$367.00	\$734.00	\$342.41	\$684.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.41 Cafeteria: Teacher Desk for Cafeteria Dirr	Hon or Equal	105534	\$249.00	\$498.00	\$225.29	\$450.58	\$379.05	\$758.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.42 Cafeteria: Bookcase for Classroom for Ca	Hon or Equal	314CP	2	\$199.00	\$398.00	\$208.67	\$417.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.43 Cafeteria: File Cabinet Legal for Cafeteria	Hon or Equal	5901	\$96.00	\$192.00	\$88.60	\$177.20	\$177.20	\$265.05	\$795.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.44 Cafeteria: Teacher Chair for Cafeteria Dir	Hon or Equal	105534	\$249.00	\$747.00	\$225.29	\$675.87	\$265.05	\$795.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.55 FFA & Dance: Bookcase for Classroom	Virco or Equal	FTT3072	1	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$279.90	\$279.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.57 FFA & Dance: File Cabinet Letter	Hon or Equal	314P	3	\$171.00	\$513.00	\$177.24	\$531.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.58 FFA & Dance: Secretarial Chairs for Guard	Hon or Equal	7701	1	\$140.00	\$140.00	\$136.68	\$136.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.59 FFA & Dance: Storage Cabinet with lock	Hon or Equal	5C2472	1	\$301.00	\$301.00	\$312.70	\$312.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.60 FFA & Dance: Teacher Chair for Dance am	Hon or Equal	5901	3	\$96.00	\$288.00	\$88.60	\$265.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.61 FFA & Dance: Teacher Desk for Dance ant	Hon or Equal	88251	3	\$367.00	\$1,101.00	\$342.41	\$1,027.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.62 FFA & Dance: Work Bench with heavy du	laboratory Syste	WEB-843	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
			\$288,747.00		\$280,401.46		\$39,360.41		\$48,789.90		\$276,548.00	

United High School - 9th Grade Campus		Indeco	J. R., Inc.	Lakeshore Learning Materials	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	School Specialty Inc.	South Texas School Furniture
1.89	Common Area: Vendor must quote the c	\$44,771.00	\$65,409.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,000.00
		\$44,771.00	\$65,409.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,000.00
Common Area Section							
		\$44,771.00	\$65,409.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,000.00
		\$44,771.00	\$65,409.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,000.00

RFP 008-2017

**Furniture and Equipment for two (2) 9th Grade Campuses and one (1)
Elementary Campus**

United South High School 9th Grade Campus

Section	Amount	Recommended Vendor
Administration Furniture	\$81,003.69	J. R., Inc.
Nurse Furniture	\$1,578.80	School Specialty Inc.
Cafeteria Furniture	\$43,808.37	School Specialty Inc.
Outdoor and Locker Furniture	\$18,133.15	J. R., Inc.
Art Equipment	\$21,014.70	J. R., Inc.
Classroom Furniture	\$280,401.46	J. R., Inc.
Common Area Section	\$44,771.00	Indeco
Total	\$490,711.17	

United South High School - 9th Grade Campus		Indeco		J. R., Inc.		Lakeshore Learning Materials		SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.		School Specialty Inc.		South Texas School Furniture	
Line #	Description	Mfgr	Mfgno	QTY	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit
Administration Section													
1.1	Administration: 60" Executive Desk	Hon or Equal	94251	13	\$773.00	\$10,049.00	\$699.92	\$9,098.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.2	Administration: 66" Executive Desk	Hon or Equal	94276	2	\$800.00	\$1,600.00	\$724.31	\$1,448.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.3	Administration: 72" Executive Desk	Hon or Equal	94271	1	\$821.00	\$821.00	\$743.54	\$743.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.4	Administration: Bookcase for Testing Rct	Hon or Equal	105534	1	\$249.00	\$249.00	\$225.29	\$225.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.5	Administration: Bookcase for Offices in A	Hon or Equal	105535	23	\$290.00	\$6,670.00	\$262.04	\$6,026.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.6	Administration: Conference Table 10 Feet	Hon or Equal	TLB4810G/HTLP1	1	\$553.00	\$553.00	\$529.23	\$529.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.7	Administration: Conference Table 8 Feet	Hon or Equal	TLB4896H/HTL9	2	\$500.00	\$1,000.00	\$514.47	\$1,028.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.8	Administration: File Cabinet Legal	Hon or Equal	314CP	30	\$199.00	\$5,970.00	\$208.67	\$6,260.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.9	Administration: Guest Chairs	Hon or Equal	2093	35	\$161.00	\$5,635.00	\$148.02	\$5,180.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.10	Administration: High Back Chair	Hon or Equal	2091	1	\$208.00	\$208.00	\$190.60	\$190.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.11	Administration: L Shaped Desk with Left	Hon or Equal	See Description	6	\$676.00	\$4,056.00	\$668.64	\$4,011.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.12	Administration: L Shaped Desk with Right	Hon or Equal	94286L/94215R	1	\$1,179.00	\$1,179.00	\$1,067.74	\$1,067.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.13	Administration: Lateral Cabinet	Hon or Equal	94223	1	\$473.00	\$473.00	\$428.27	\$428.27	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.14	Administration: Lounge Cal Stool Vinyl fc	Hon or Equal	Motivate HMG7	12	\$152.00	\$1,824.00	\$134.96	\$1,619.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.15	Administration: Lounge Cal Table for Adr	Hon or Equal	TREC2460/HCT4	3	\$261.00	\$783.00	\$347.21	\$1,041.63	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.16	Administration: Lounge Chair Vinyl for At	Hon or Equal	Motivate HMG2	12	\$239.00	\$2,868.00	\$105.78	\$1,269.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.17	Administration: Lounge Soft Square Table	Hon or Equal	TSTFT42N/HCT29	3	\$342.00	\$1,026.00	\$311.83	\$935.49	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.18	Administration: Mid Back Chair Offices	Hon or Equal	2092	43	\$198.00	\$8,514.00	\$182.02	\$7,826.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.19	Administration: Reception Chairs	Hon or Equal	Motivate HMS1	20	\$72.00	\$1,440.00	\$63.62	\$1,272.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.20	Administration: Rectangular Activity Table	Virco or Equal	50372ADJSU	1	\$210.00	\$210.00	\$147.60	\$147.60	\$189.05	\$189.05	No Bid	No Bid	\$222.00
1.21	Administration: Rectangular Table for Te	Virco or Equal	483060	2	\$117.00	\$234.00	\$88.65	\$177.30	\$189.05	\$378.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.00
1.22	Administration: Secretarial Chairs	Hon or Equal	7701	10	\$140.00	\$1,400.00	\$136.68	\$1,366.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$312.00
1.23	Administration: Stacking Chairs for Work	Virco or Equal	ZU418	6	\$32.00	\$192.00	\$60.15	\$360.90	\$47.49	\$284.94	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.00
1.24	Administration: Storage Cabinet with Loc	Hon or Equal	SC2472	2	\$301.00	\$602.00	\$312.70	\$625.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,196.00
1.25	Administration: Student Chairs for Nurse	Virco or Equal	AN18	23	\$96.00	\$2,208.00	\$88.60	\$2,036.40	\$47.49	\$1,092.27	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.26	Administration: Teacher Chair for Testing	Hon or Equal	5901	1	\$367.00	\$367.00	\$342.41	\$342.41	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.27	Administration: Teacher Desk for Testing	Hon or Equal	88251	1	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$284.06	\$284.06	No Bid	No Bid	\$353.55	\$353.55	No Bid
1.28	Administration: Computer Desk for Testir	Virco or Equal	FTT3072	1	\$773.00	\$773.00	\$699.92	\$699.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.47	Library: 60" Executive Desk	Hon or Equal	94251	1	\$773.00	\$773.00	\$699.92	\$699.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.48	Library: Bookcase for Office	Hon or Equal	105535	1	\$290.00	\$290.00	\$262.04	\$262.04	\$265.05	\$265.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.49	Library: File Cabinet Legal	Hon or Equal	314CP	1	\$199.00	\$199.00	\$208.67	\$208.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.50	Library: Mid Back Chair for Librarian and c	Hon or Equal	2092	9	\$198.00	\$1,782.00	\$182.02	\$1,638.18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.51	Library: Guest Chairs for Librarian	Hon or Equal	2093	2	\$161.00	\$322.00	\$148.02	\$296.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.52	Library: Rectangular Activity Table	Virco or Equal	503672ADJSU	1	\$225.00	\$225.00	\$145.20	\$145.20	\$189.05	\$189.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.53	Library: Stacking Chair	Virco or Equal	ZU418	4	\$32.00	\$128.00	\$61.16	\$244.64	\$47.49	\$189.96	No Bid	No Bid	\$208.00
1.54	Library: Conference Table 8 Feet	Hon or Equal	TLB4896H/HTLP	1	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$514.47	\$514.47	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.56	Library: Chair Storage/Truck	Virco or Equal	HCT6072	12	\$292.00	\$3,504.00	\$362.85	\$4,354.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$298.40	\$3,580.80	\$266.00
1.37	Cafeteria: Folding Chairs	Virco or Equal	162	1000	\$15.25	\$15,250.00	\$18.15	\$18,150.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.73	\$17,730.00	\$18.00
					\$81,998.00	\$81,003.69	\$2,588.42	\$2,588.42	No Bid	\$21,664.35	\$21,664.35	\$23,352.00	\$23,352.00
Nurse Section													
1.29	Nurse Area: Recovery Couch	See Supply or Ec31250	Royal Blue	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$576.27	\$2,305.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$394.70	\$1,578.80	\$628.00
					No Bid	\$2,305.08	No Bid	\$1,996.00	\$1,996.00	\$1,996.00	\$1,996.00	\$2,512.00	
Cafeteria Section													
1.34	Cafeteria: Cafeteria Tables with 12 Stooler	Hamilton or 50T11293012-51		45	\$1,341.00	\$60,345.00	\$1,180.00	\$53,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$928.17	\$41,767.65	\$1,294.95
1.35	Cafeteria: Cafeteria Tables with Stools	Alert Hamilton or FT11303012-58*v		2	\$1,341.00	\$2,682.00	\$1,315.00	\$2,630.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,020.36	\$2,040.72	\$1,294.95
					\$63,027.00	\$55,730.00	No Bid	\$43,808.37	No Bid	\$43,808.37	\$60,862.65	\$60,862.65	

United South High School - 9th Grade Campus		Indeco	J. R., Inc.	Lakeshore Learning Materials	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	School Specialty Inc.	South Texas School Furniture						
Outdoor and Locker Furniture													
1.30 Athletics: Benches for Boys locker room/vecoat or Equ.	BGULPERFP	18	\$227.00	\$4,086.00	\$212.45	\$3,824.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$494.94	\$8,908.92	\$265.00	\$4,770.00
1.38 Cafeteria: Outdoor Dining Portable Recte/vecoat or Equ.	T6LULPERF	5	\$617.00	\$3,085.00	\$682.05	\$3,410.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$858.45	\$4,292.25	\$737.00	\$3,685.00
1.39 Cafeteria: Outdoor Dining Portable Squa/vecoat or Equ.	T46LULPERFADA	1	\$692.00	\$692.00	\$707.15	\$707.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$957.95	\$957.95	\$768.00	\$768.00
1.40 Cafeteria: Outdoor Dining Portable Squa/vecoat or Equ.	T46LULPERF	4	\$658.00	\$2,632.00	\$682.05	\$2,728.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$796.19	\$3,184.76	\$737.00	\$2,948.00
1.45 Library: ADA Outdoor Common Area 46"vecoat or Equ.	WEBRACSPSM /	1	\$1,101.00	\$1,101.00	\$980.15	\$980.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$876.98	\$876.98	\$1,122.00	\$1,122.00
1.46 Library: Outdoor Common Area 46" Roun/vecoat or Equ.	S46WEBRACSPS /	6	\$1,101.00	\$6,606.00	\$1,080.55	\$6,483.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$915.02	\$5,490.12	\$1,247.00	\$7,482.00
			\$18,202.00		\$18,133.15		No Bid	No Bid		\$14,802.06		\$16,005.00	
Art Section													
1.63 Art: Drafting Tables	th System or Et	27346	No Bid	No Bid	\$289.67	\$16,719.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.64 Art: Art Cabinet Metal Storage	th System or Et	09450	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.65 Art: All Around Cart	sal Manufacturer	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$804.97	\$1,609.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.66 Art: partitions for the racks 12"x32"	Bailey Pottery	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.10	\$62.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.67 Art: partitions for the racks 24"x32"	Bailey Pottery	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$57.20	\$114.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.68 Art: Steel Flat Files 5 Drawer	SAFCO	4998TSR	2	No Bid	\$1,254.31	\$2,508.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,321.79	\$2,643.58	\$1,782.00	\$3,564.00
			No Bid		\$21,014.70		No Bid			\$2,643.58		\$3,564.00	
Classrooms Section													
1.70 Classrooms: Bookcase for Classroom	Hon or Equal	105534	\$249.00	\$12,699.00	\$225.29	\$11,489.79	\$265.05	\$13,517.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.72 Classrooms: Option B Desk and Chair (Colr and Virco Des18 and Virco Des 1170	Hon or Equal	105534	\$133.00	\$155,610.00	\$123.85	\$144,904.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$200.00	\$234,000.00
1.74 Classrooms: Option B Desk and Chair AD/ Virco or Equal vir and Zuma Des 10	Hon or Equal	105534	\$133.00	\$1,330.00	\$123.85	\$1,238.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$125.00	\$1,250.00
1.76 Classrooms: Computer Desk 30x72	Virco or Equal	FTT3072	\$270.00	\$36,990.00	\$279.90	\$38,346.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$353.55	\$48,436.35	No Bid	No Bid
1.77 Classrooms: Conference Table 8 Feet	Hon or Equal	TLB4896H/HTLP:	4	\$500.00	\$2,000.00	\$514.47	\$2,057.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.78 Classrooms: File Cabinet Legal	Hon or Equal	314CP	2	\$199.00	\$398.00	\$208.67	\$417.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.79 Classrooms: File Cabinet Letter	Hon or Equal	314CP	50	\$171.00	\$8,550.00	\$177.24	\$8,862.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.80 Classrooms: Mid Back Chair (Conference)	Hon or Equal	2092	33	\$198.00	\$6,534.00	\$182.02	\$6,006.66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.81 Classrooms: Rectangular Activity Table	Virco or Equal	503672ADJSU	1	\$225.00	\$225.00	\$147.60	\$147.60	\$189.05	\$189.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.82 Classrooms: Secretarial Chairs	Hon or Equal	7701	36	\$32.00	\$5,040.00	\$136.68	\$4,920.48	\$47.49	\$284.94	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.00	\$312.00
1.83 Classrooms: Stacking Chairs for BMI Work	Virco or Equal	ZU418	6	\$52.00	\$11,544.00	\$58.16	\$12,911.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$75.00	\$16,650.00
1.84 Classrooms: Adjustable Stool Hard Plastic	Hon or Equal	AN18	222	\$32.00	\$4,896.00	\$38.75	\$4,518.60	\$47.49	\$22,225.32	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.00	\$24,336.00
1.85 Classrooms: Student Chairs 18"	Virco or Equal	AN18	468	\$96.00	\$44,928.00	\$88.60	\$41,488.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.86 Classrooms: Teacher Chair	Hon or Equal	5901	51	\$367.00	\$18,717.00	\$342.41	\$17,462.91	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.87 Classrooms: Teacher Desk	Hon or Equal	88251	51	\$367.00	\$18,717.00	\$342.41	\$17,462.91	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.31 Athletics: Bookcase for Classroom	Hon or Equal	105534	6	\$171.00	\$1,026.00	\$177.24	\$1,063.44	\$265.05	\$1,590.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.32 Athletics: File Cabinet Letter	Hon or Equal	314P	6	\$96.00	\$1,344.00	\$88.60	\$1,240.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.33 Athletics: Teacher Chair	Hon or Equal	5901	14	\$367.00	\$734.00	\$342.41	\$684.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.41 Cafeteria: Teacher Desk for Cafeteria Dir.	Hon or Equal	88251	2	\$367.00	\$734.00	\$342.41	\$684.82	\$379.05	\$758.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.42 Cafeteria: Bookcase for Classroom for Ca	Hon or Equal	105534	2	\$249.00	\$498.00	\$225.29	\$450.58	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.43 Cafeteria: File Cabinet Legal for Cafeteria	Hon or Equal	314CP	2	\$199.00	\$398.00	\$208.67	\$417.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.44 Cafeteria: Teacher Chair for Cafeteria Dir	Hon or Equal	5901	2	\$96.00	\$192.00	\$88.60	\$177.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.55 FFA & Dance: Bookcase for Classroom	Hon or Equal	105534	3	\$249.00	\$747.00	\$225.29	\$675.87	\$265.05	\$795.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.56 FFA & Dance: Computer Desk 30x72	Virco or Equal	FTT3072	1	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$279.90	\$279.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.57 FFA & Dance: File Cabinet Letter	Hon or Equal	314P	3	\$171.00	\$513.00	\$177.24	\$531.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.58 FFA & Dance: Secretarial Chairs for Guard	Hon or Equal	7701	1	\$140.00	\$140.00	\$136.68	\$136.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.59 FFA & Dance: Storage Cabinet with lock	Hon or Equal	5C2472	1	\$301.00	\$301.00	\$312.70	\$312.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.60 FFA & Dance: Teacher Chair for Dance an	Hon or Equal	5901	3	\$96.00	\$288.00	\$88.60	\$265.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.61 FFA & Dance: Teacher Desk for Dance an	Hon or Equal	88251	3	\$367.00	\$1,101.00	\$342.41	\$1,027.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1.62 FFA & Dance: Work Bench with heavy duboratory Syste	WEB-843	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
			\$288,747.00		\$280,401.46		\$39,360.41			\$48,789.90		\$276,548.00	

United South High School - 9th Grade Campus		Indeco	J. R., Inc.	Lakeshore Learning Materials	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	School Specialty Inc.	South Texas School Furniture
1.89	Common Area: Vendor must quote the c	\$44,771.00	\$65,409.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,000.00
		\$44,771.00	\$65,409.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,000.00
Common Area Section							
		\$44,771.00	\$65,409.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,000.00
		\$44,771.00	\$65,409.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,000.00