

Proposal Description Beef Crumbles	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	Advance Food	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	King's Command	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	Seasoned Beef Crumbles				Cooked Seasoned Beef Crumbles		
Product Code	22210-328				A594		
Commodity Code	22210-328				S14130		
Commercial Code	320700-0				n/a		
Serving Size	2.2 oz				2.2 oz		
Servings per case	228				218		
Case Weight	30#				6/5# bags = 30# case		
Fee for Service	\$24				\$38.75 2000# min.		
Commercial Price per Case	\$17				n/a		
Indirect Sales Discount					n/a		
Commodity Net Price					n/a		

Commodity Processing for 2008-09 Tabulation

2/7/2008

J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.	M.C.I. Foods, Inc.	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
NO BID	NO BID	Advance Food	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	King's Command	NO BID	NO BID
		FB Char Beef Patties				Ckd Old Fashioned Beef Patties		
		1-155-530-20				A594		
		1-155-530-21				s126		
		3-155-530-20				n/a		
		2.8 oz				2.6 oz		
		175				93		
		30.62#				15#		
		\$24.95				\$15.95 2000# min		
		\$64.20				n/a		
						n/a		
						n/a		

Proposal Description Breaded Beef Patty	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.	M.C.I. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name															
Product Code															
Commodity Code															
Commercial Code															
Serving Size															
Servings per case															
Case Weight															
Fee for Service															
Commercial Price per Case															
Indirect Sales Discount															
Commodity Net Price															

Proposal Description Breaded Beef Patty	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	Advance Food	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	King's Command	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	CB Beef Pattie				Ckd Chicken Fried Breaded Beef Patties		
Product Code	1-144-20				A594		
Commodity Code	1-144-20				S1240		
Commercial Code	3-144-20				n/a		
Serving Size	3.8oz				4 oz		
Servings per case	130				60		
Case Weight	30.88#				15#		
Fee for Service	\$21.95				\$22 2000# min		
Commercial Price per Case	\$46.50				n/a		
Indirect Sales Discount					n/a		
Commodity Net Price					n/a		

Proposal Description Breaded Beef Fingers	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.	M.C.I. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name															
Product Code															
Commodity Code															
Commercial Code															
Serving Size															
Servings per case															
Case Weight															
Fee for Service															
Commercial Price per Case															
Indirect Sales Discount															
Commodity Net Price															

Proposal Description Breaded Beef Fingers	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	Advance Food	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO NIB	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	Breaded Beef Fingers						
Product Code	1-1416-20						
Commodity Code	1416-20						
Commercial Code	3-1416-20						
Serving Size	3-88 oz						
Servings per case	125						
Case Weight	30.31#						
Fee for Service	\$21.75						
Commercial Price per Case	\$45.50						
Indirect Sales Discount							
Commodity Net Price							

Proposal Description Beef Taco Filling	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees	
Manufacturer	Advance Food	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	King's Command	NO BID	NO BID	
Product Name	FC Taco Meat Filling				Cooked Taco Meat Filling			
Product Code	32412-328				A594			
Commodity Code	32412-328				n/a			
Commercial Code	32412-330				S159			
Serving Size	2.4 oz				2.25 oz			
Servings per case	22				107			
Case Weight	33#				15# (3/5# bags)			
Fee for Service	\$28.50				\$18.92 2000# min			
Commercial Price per Case	\$58				n/a			
Indirect Sales Discount					n/a			
Commodity Net Price					n/a			

Proposal Description Spaghetti Sauce w/Meat	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	Advance Food	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	Spaghetti Sauce						
Product Code	32413-328						
Commodity Code	32413-328						
Commercial Code	32413-330						
Serving Size	4.6 oz						
Servings per case	115						
Case Weight	33#						
Fee for Service	\$28.95						
Commercial Price per Case	\$49.20						
Indirect Sales Discount							
Commodity Net Price							

Proposal Description Additional Beef	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.	M.C.I. Foods, Inc.	Advance Food Company				Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Food	
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Advance Food	Advance Food	Advance Food	Advance Food	Advance Food	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	King's Command	King's Command
Product Name				A+ CB Beef Fingers	A+ CB Beef Patties	A+ Char Beef Pattie	FB Char Beef Pattie	A+ Char Beef Meatball				Cooked Chicken Fried Breaded Beef Nuggets	Cooked Beef Patties for Salisbury
Product Code				1-14164-20	1-1444-20	1-155-425-20	1-155-525-20	1-17-405-20				A594	A594
Commodity Code				1-14164-20	1-1444-20	1-155-425-20	1-155-525-20	1-17-405-20				S12110	S198
Commercial Code				14164-20	1444-20	155-425-20	3-155-525-20	3-17-405-20				n/a	n/a
Serving Size				3.88 oz	3.8 oz	2.5 oz	2.5 oz	2.5 oz				4/1 oz = 4 oz serving	3 oz
Servings per case				123	126	200	200	192				60	80
Case Weight				30#	29.93#	31.25#	31.25#	30#				15#	15#
Fee for Service				\$30.50	\$29.90	\$29.95	\$23.50	\$36				\$19.84 2000#	\$19.15 2000# min
Commercial Price per Case				\$53.50	\$50.50	\$57.00	\$60.70	\$17.50				n/a	n/a
Indirect Sales Discount												n/a	n/a
Commodity Net Price												n/a	n/a

Proposal Description Additional Beef	is, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	King's Command	King's Command	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	Ckd Meatballs	Ckd Beef Nuggets w/Teriyaki Sauce		
Product Code	A594	A594		
Commodity Code	S135	S15007		
Commercial Code	n/a	n/a		
Serving Size	2.5 oz (5/.5 = 2.5 oz serving)	4/.7 oz = 2.8 oz serving		
Servings per case	76	85		
Case Weight	2/6# bags = 12# cs	15#		
Fee for Service	\$16.91 2000# min	\$24.05 2000# min		
Commercial Price per Case	n/a	n/a		
Indirect Sales Discount	n/a	n/a		
Commodity Net Price	n/a	n/a		

Proposal Description American Slices, RF	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	Land O Lakes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name			RF 160 Slice American				
Product Code			46253				
Commodity Code			B049				
Commercial Code			46253				
Serving Size			1/2 oz slice				
Servings per case			960				
Case Weight			30#				
Fee for Service			\$24				
Commercial Price per Case			\$57.45				
Indirect Sales Discount			\$33.08 Net off invoice; Pass thru valus				
Commodity Net Price			\$24.37				

Proposal Description American Shredded Pro Cheese RF	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	Land O Lakes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name		Shredded RF American				
Product Code		41728				
Commodity Code		B049				
Commercial Code		41728				
Serving Size		1/2 oz				
Servings per case		640				
Case Weight		20#				
Fee for Service		\$21.10				
Commercial Price per Case		\$44.10				
Indirect Sales Discount		\$22.78 net off invoice; pass thru value				
Commodity Net Price		\$21.32				

Proposal Description Cheddar or American Portions RF	Advance Food Co	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	Land O Lakes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name			RF Mild Cheddar Portions				
Product Code			44802				
Commodity Code			B049				
Commercial Code			44802				
Serving Size			1 oz				
Servings per case			100				
Case Weight			6.25#				
Fee for Service			\$12.56				
Commercial Price per Case			\$21.81				
Indirect Sales Discount			\$9.18 net off invoice; pass thru value				
Commodity Net Price			\$12.63				

Proposal Description Mozz. String Cheese	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	Land O Lakes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	Mozz String Cheese				
Product Code	59701				
Commodity Code	B049				
Commercial Code	59701				
Serving Size	1 oz				
Servings per case	160				
Case Weight	10#				
Fee for Service	\$12.10				
Commercial Price per Case	\$26.90				
Indirect Sales Discount	\$14.7 NOI pass thru value				
Commodity Net Price	\$12.10				

Proposal Description Cheddar Cheese Sauce	Advance Food Co	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	Land O Lakes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name			Ultimate Cheddar Sauce 6/#10				
Product Code			39908				
Commodity Code			B049				
Commercial Code			39908				
Serving Size			3 oz				
Servings per case			212				
Case Weight			39.75#				
Fee for Service			\$36.77				
Commercial Price per Case			\$57.01				
Indirect Sales Discount			\$19.84 NOI pass thru value				
Commodity Net Price			\$37.20				

Proposal Description Cheese Sauce Cup	Advance Food Co	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	Land O Lakes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name			Ultimate Cheddar Cheese Dip Cup				
Product Code			39927				
Commodity Code			B049				
Commercial Code			39927				
Serving Size			3 oz				
Servings per case			140				
Case Weight			26.25#				
Fee for Service			\$47.25				
Commercial Price per Case			\$60.64				
Indirect Sales Discount			\$13.11 NOI pass thru value				
Commodity Net Price			\$47.53				

Proposal Description Jalapeno Cheese Sauce RF	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	Land O Lakes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name			Mucho Queso Jalapeno Cheese Dip Cup				
Product Code			39929				
Commodity Code			B049				
Commercial Code			39929				
Serving Size			3 oz				
Servings per case			140				
Case Weight			26.25#				
Fee for Service			\$47.25				
Commercial Price per Case			\$60.64				
Indirect Sales Discount			\$13.11 NOI pass thru value				
Commodity Net Price			\$47.53				

Proposal Description Prep. Mac & Cheese RF	Advance Food Co	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	Land O Lakes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name			RF Macaroni & Cheese				
Product Code			43284				
Commodity Code			B049				
Commercial Code			43284				
Serving Size			6 oz				
Servings per case			80				
Case Weight			30#				
Fee for Service			\$39.60				
Commercial Price per Case			\$49.05				
Indirect Sales Discount			\$9.23 NOI pass thru value				
Commodity Net Price			\$39.82				

Proposal Description Additional Cheese	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.	M.C.I. Foods, Inc.	Advance Food Co	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.							
					Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes
Product Name					25% RF CoJack Cheese Portions	CoJack Cheese Portions	Light Mozz String Cheese	Macaroni & Cheese	American Cheese Roll	Zesty Cheese Roll	Mucho Queso Jalapeno Cheese Sauce 6/#10	Ultimate Cheddar Cheese Sauce Pouch 6/106 oz
Product Code					44804	44805	59703	43280	43211	43241	39649	39930
Commodity Code					B049	B049	B049	B049	B049	B049	B049	B049
Commercial Code					44804	44805	59703	43280	43211	43241	39649	39930
Serving Size					1 oz	1 oz	1 oz	6 oz	2.4 oz/1 roll	2.4 oz/1 roll	3 oz	3 oz
Servings per case					100	100	160	80	144	144	212	212
Case Weight					6.25#	6.25#	10#	30#	21.6#	21.6#	39.75	39.75#
Fee for Service					\$11.81	\$8.44	\$12.60	\$35.55	\$38.12	\$38.12	\$36.77	\$36.77
Commercial Price per Case					\$21.06	\$17.69	\$27.40	\$48.75	\$49.68	\$49.68	\$57.04	\$56.64
Indirect Sales Discount					\$9.18 NOI pass thru value	\$9.18 NOI pass thru value	\$14.7 NOI pass thru value	\$12.90 NOI pass thru value	\$11.40 NOI pass thru value	\$11.40 NOI pass thru value	\$19.84 NOI pass thru value	\$19.47 NOI pass thru value
Commodity Net Price					\$11.88	\$8.51	\$12.70	\$35.85	\$38.28	\$38.28	\$37.20	\$37.17

Proposal Description Additional Cheese	Land O Lakes, Inc.									ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	Land O Lakes	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	Mucho Queso Jalapeno Cheese Sauce Pouch6/106 oz	Shredded Mozz Cheese	Shredded Sharp American	Shredded Mild Cheddar	Alpine Lace Readi-Pac RF Swiss Slice	Mild Cheddar Cheese Portions	160 Slice American, White	160 Slice American, Yellow	Loaf American Yellow		
Product Code	39932	41698	41725	41749	00405	44803	46219	46255	48174		
Commodity Code	B049	B049	B049	B049							
Commercial Code	39932	41698	41725	41749	00405	44803	46219	46255	48174		
Serving Size	3 oz	1/2 oz	1/2 oz	1/2 oz	.75 oz/ 1 slice	1 oz	1/2 oz/1 slice	1/2 oz/1 slice	1/2 oz		
Servings per case	212	640	640	640	256	100	960	960	960		
Case Weight	39.75#	20#	20#	20#	12#	6.25#	30#	30#	30#		
Fee for Service	\$36.77	\$11.60	\$15.40	\$12.60	\$24.36	\$8.31	\$24.30	\$21.00	\$21.60		
Commercial Price per Case	\$56.44	\$40.90	\$39.30	\$42.10	\$42.12	\$17.56	\$52.80	\$53.25	\$55.35		
Indirect Sales Discount	\$19.47 NOI pass thru value	\$29.10 NOI pass thru value	\$23.75 NOI pass thru value	\$29.33	\$17.63 NOI pass thru value	\$9.18 NOI pass thru value	\$28.23 NOI pass thru value	\$31.99 NOI pass thru value	\$33.46 NOI pass thru value		
Commodity Net Price	\$37.17	\$11.80	\$15.55	\$12.77	\$24.49	\$8.38	\$24.57	\$21.26	\$21.89		

Proposal Description Additional Cheese	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	East Side Entrees
Product Name		Mac & Cheese Pouch
Product Code		05906
Commodity Code		05906
Commercial Code		05906
Serving Size		3.6 oz
Servings per case		128
Case Weight		28.8#
Fee for Service		\$37.75
Commercial Price per Case		\$46.29
Indirect Sales Discount		n/a
Commodity Net Price		\$37.75

Proposal Description Chicken Nuggets	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer	Tyson	NO BID	Pilgrim's Pride	NO BID	No Bid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Kings Delight	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	Chicken Nugget w/VPP		Gold Kist Farms CN Breaded Chicken Nuggets								CN Breaded Chicken Nuggets			
Product Code	3732-328		71110								11211			
Commodity Code	A522		71110								A522 Item #11211			
Commercial Code	3732-328		71110								11211			
Serving Size	3.65 oz		3.40 oz								3 oz			
Servings per case	115		141								160			
Case Weight	26.23 lbs		30 lbs								30#			
Fee for Service	\$27.02/case		\$30.00/case								\$29.75			
Commercial Price per Case			\$43.00/case								\$47.40			
Indirect Sales Discount			\$13.00/case								\$17.65 rebate			
Commodity Net Price			\$30.00/case								\$29.75 cs (does not include dttributor markup)			

Commodity Processing for 2008-09 Tabulation

2/7/2008

Proposal Description	Chicken Strips	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer		Tyson	NO BID	Pilgrims Pride	NO BID	No Bid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Kings Delight	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name		Krisp n Krunchy Tenders		Gold Kist Farms CN Breaded Chicken Strips								CN Breaded Chicken Tenders			
Product Code		3859-328		62110								CP11430N			
Commodity Code		A522		62110								A-522 Item # #11430N			
Commercial Code		3859-328		62110								11430			
Serving Size		3.39 oz		3.40 oz								2.85 oz			
Servings per case		30.51 lbs		141								112			
Case Weight		\$33.56/case		30 lbs								20#			
Fee for Service				30/cs;1/lb;.213 serv								\$22.40			
Commercial Price per Case				\$43/case								\$32.20			
Indirect Sales Discount				\$13/case								n/a			
Commodity Net Price				\$30/case								\$.20 per serving			

Proposal Description	Chicken Patties	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer		Tyson	NO BID	Pilgrim's Pride	NO BID	No Bid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	King's Delight	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name		CN FC Homestyle Natural Pattie		Gold Kist Farms CN Breaded Chicken Patty								CN Breaded Chicken Patties			
Product Code		3731-328		76110								12211			
Commodity Code		A522		76110								A522 Item #12211			
Commercial Code		3731-328		76110								12211			
Serving Size		3.62 oz		3.37 oz								3 oz			
Servings per case		115		142								160			
Case Weight		26.01 lbs		30 lbs								30#			
Fee for Service		\$30.69/case		30/case;1/lb;.211 serv								\$30.60			
Commercial Price per Case				\$43/case								\$48.25			
Indirect Sales Discount				\$13/case								\$17.65 rebate amt.			
Commodity Net Price				\$30/case								\$30.60 cs (does not include distributor mark-up)			

Proposal Description Home Style Chicken Sticks	Advance Food Co	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name							
Product Code							
Commodity Code							
Commercial Code							
Serving Size							
Servings per case							
Case Weight							
Fee for Service							
Commercial Price per Case							
Indirect Sales Discount							
Commodity Net Price							

Proposal Description	Chicken	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer		Tyson	NO BID	Pilgrim's Pride	NO BID	No Bid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Kings Delight	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name		Chicken Fajita Strips		Gold Kist Farms CN Chicken Fajita Strips								CN Chicken Fajita Strips			
Product Code		3522-328		1325								CP50206			
Commodity Code		A522		1325								A522			
Commercial Code		3522-328		1325								50206			
Serving Size		2.3 oz		2.05 oz								3.6oz			
Servings per case		277		234								91			
Case Weight		39.93 lbs		30 lbs								20#			
Fee for Service		\$71.08/case		48/cs;1.6/lbs; .205serv								\$28			
Commercial Price per Case				\$71.41/case								\$52.60			
Indirect Sales Discount				\$23.41/case								n/a			
Commodity Net Price				\$48/case								\$0.3076 case			

Commodity Processing for 2008-09 Tabulation

2/7/2008

Proposal Description Popcorn Style Chicken	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer	Tyson	NO BID	Pilgrim's Pride	NO BID	No Bid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Kings Delight	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	Popcorn Chicken		Gold Kist Farms Breaded Popcorn Chicken								CN Breaded Popcorn Chicken			
Product Code	2940-328		7915								11097			
Commodity Code	A522		7915								A522 Item #11097			
Commercial Code	2940-328		7915											
Serving Size	3.85 oz		3.08 oz								3.2oz			
Servings per case	124		103								100			
Case Weight	30 lbs		20 lbs								20#			
Fee for Service	\$37.50/case		29/cs;1.45/lb; .282/serv								\$25.80			
Commercial Price per Case			\$36.80/case								\$34.87			
Indirect Sales Discount			\$7.80/case								\$9.07 rebate			
Commodity Net Price			\$29/case								\$25.80 cs (does not include distributor mark- up)			

Proposal Description Chicken Crispito, Chili	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name							
Product Code							
Commodity Code							
Commercial Code							
Serving Size							
Servings per case							
Case Weight							
Fee for Service							
Commercial Price per Case							
Indirect Sales Discount							
Commodity Net Price							

Proposal Description	Chicken Patty, Hot & Spicy	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer	Tyson	NO BID	Pilgrim's Pride	NO BID	No Bid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Kings Delight	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	FC Hot & Spicy Breaded Chicken Pattie		Gold Kist Farms CN Hot & Spicy									CN Breaded Hot & Spicy Chicken Patty			
Product Code	5567-328		66560									12212			
Commodity Code	A522		66560									A522 Item 12212			
Commercial Code	5567-328		66560									12212			
Serving Size	3.23 oz		3.05 oz									3oz			
Servings per case	150		157									160			
Case Weight	30.28		30 lbs									30#			
Fee for Service	\$41.48/case		31.8/cs;1.06/lb; .203/serv									\$31.85			
Commercial Price per Case			\$44.80/cs									\$49.50			
Indirect Sales Discount			\$13/cs									\$17.65 rebate			
Commodity Net Price			\$31.80									\$31.85cs (does not include distributor mark- up)			

Proposal Description Additional Chicken	Tyson Sales & Distribution					Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight
Manufacturer	Tyson	Tyson	Tyson	Tyson	Tyson	NO BID	NO BID	No Bid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	Whole Grain Pattie	Whole Grain Nugget	Taco Chunk - Never Fried	Never Fried Chuck	Never Fried Patty									
Product Code	2154-328	2155-328	11784-328	11560-328	11783-328									
Commodity Code	A522	A522	A522	A522	A522									
Commercial Code	2154-328	2155-328	11784-328	11560-328	11783-328									
Serving Size	3.08 oz	3.35 oz	4 PCS	4 PCS	1 patty									
Servings per case	150	144	47	50	48									
Case Weight	28.87 lbs	30.13 lbs	10 lbs	10 lbs	10 lbs									
Fee for Service	\$30.31/case	\$33.75/case	27.90/case	29.40/case	\$28.60/case									
Commercial Price per Case														
Indirect Sales Discount														
Commodity Net Price														

Proposal Description Additional Chicken	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID
Product Name	
Product Code	
Commodity Code	
Commercial Code	
Serving Size	
Servings per case	
Case Weight	
Fee for Service	
Commercial Price per Case	
Indirect Sales Discount	
Commodity Net Price	

Proposal Description Cheese Pizza Wedge	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer	NO BID	Tony's	NO BID	NO BID	No Bid	Profera	NO BID	NO BID	Nardone	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name		Classic Wedge SmartPizza				Ultimate 16" Round Cheese Pizza			Pizza Wedge Cheese					
Product Code		74709				30752			96SWMA1					
Commodity Code		74709				B077			96SWMA1					
Commercial Code		74709							96SWMA1					
Serving Size		4.61 oz				5 oz			4.75oz					
Servings per case		80				80 ct			96					
Case Weight		23.05 lbs (net)				25 #			28.5#					
Fee for Service									\$30.59					
Commercial Price per Case		\$34.47				\$34.18			\$35.00					
Indirect Sales Discount		\$5.51												
Commodity Net Price		\$28.96				\$27.84			\$30.59					

Commodity Processing for 2008-09 Tabulation

2/7/2008

Proposal Description Cheese Pizza Wedge	M.C.I. Foods, Inc.	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	ConAgra	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name					The Max Whole Grain Real Slice Cheese			
Product Code					77387-12680			
Commodity Code					77387-12680 B077 M022			
Commercial Code					77387-12681			
Serving Size					4.67 oz			
Servings per case					96			
Case Weight					28#			
Fee for Service					n/a			
Commercial Price per Case					\$33.46			
Indirect Sales Discount					\$6.08			
Commodity Net Price					\$27.38			

Proposal Description Breakfast Pizza, Sausage & Gravy	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC
Manufacturer	NO BID	Tony's	NO BID	NO BID	No Bid	Profera	NO BID	NO BID	Nardone	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name		Breakfast Pizza, Sausage & Gravy				Ultimate 3x5 BKFST Sausage Pizza w/gravy USC3x5MIMIL			Breakfast Pizza, Sausage & Gravy				
Product Code		63164				12501			80MSGA100				
Commodity Code		63164				13077			80MSGA100				
Commercial Code		63164							80MSGA100				
Serving Size		3.00 oz				3.08 oz			3.2oz				
Servings per case		128				120 ct			80				
Case Weight		24.00 lbs (net)				23.1 #			16#				
Fee for Service									\$21.06				
Commercial Price per Case		\$39.30				\$33.47			\$24.00				
Indirect Sales Discount		\$3.47											
Commodity Net Price		\$35.83				\$30.78			\$21.06				

Commodity Processing for 2008-09 Tabulation

2/7/2008

Proposal Description Stuffed Cheese Stick	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer	NO BID	Tony's	NO BID	NO BID	No Bid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Nardone	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name		Stuffed Sticks							72BCS					
Product Code		73329							72BCS					
Commodity Code		73329							72BCS					
Commercial Code		73329							72BCS					
Serving Size		4.20 oz							3 oz					
Servings per case		100							72					
Case Weight		25.00 lbs (net)							13.5#					
Fee for Service									\$17.39					
Commercial Price per Case		\$47.83							\$24					
Indirect Sales Discount		\$8.82												
Commodity Net Price		\$39.01							\$17.39					

Commodity Processing for 2008-09 Tabulation

2/7/2008

Proposal Description Stuffed Cheese Stick	M.C.I. Foods, Inc.	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.		East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Con Agra	NO BID	Bosco's Pizza	Bosco's Pizza	NO BID
Product Name					The Max MaxStix		Bosco Sticks	Higher Fiber RF Bosco Sticks	
Product Code					77387-12439		2108	2110	
Commodity Code					77387-12440 B077 M022		B077	B077	
Commercial Code					77387-12441				
Serving Size					3.86 oz		2-3 oz	2-3 oz	
Servings per case					96 / 2 stix serving		54	54	
Case Weight					23.2#		20#	20#	
Fee for Service					n/a		No	None	
Commercial Price per Case					\$33.98		\$37 + Dist. Mark-up	\$38.05 + Dtis. Mark-up	
Indirect Sales Discount					\$8.82				
Commodity Net Price					\$25.16		\$27.08	\$28.13	

Proposal Description Bake to Rise Cheese Pizza	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer	NO BID	Red Baron	NO BID	NO BID	No Bid	Profera	NO BID	NO BID	Nardone	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name		Solo 7" cheese Pizza				5" round Personal Cheese /box			Bake to Rise Cheese					
Product Code		73162				53904 C5MIMB+			7RM Box					
Commodity Code		73162				B077			7RM Box					
Commercial Code		73162							7RM Box					
Serving Size		7.91 oz				5.55 oz			8 oz					
Servings per case		48				40 ct			48					
Case Weight		23.74 lbs				13.88 #			24#					
Fee for Service									\$44.18					
Commercial Price per Case		\$49.78				\$32.55			\$53.00					
Indirect Sales Discount		\$8.82												
Commodity Net Price		\$40.96				\$28.18			\$44.18					

Commodity Processing for 2008-09 Tabulation

2/7/2008

Proposal Description Bake to Rise Cheese Pizza	M.C.I. Foods, Inc.	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Bosco's Pizza	NO BID
Product Name							Bosco's 7" Deep Dish Cheese Pizza w/boxes	
Product Code							0736	
Commodity Code							B077	
Commercial Code								
Serving Size							1 - 263 grams	
Servings per case							36	
Case Weight							23#	
Fee for Service							None	
Commercial Price per Case							\$41.64 + Dist. Mark-up	
Indirect Sales Discount								
Commodity Net Price							\$35.02	

Commodity Processing for 2008-09 Tabulation

2/7/2008

Proposal Description	Baked to Rise Pepp. Pizza	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profera, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.	Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.
Manufacturer		NO BID	Red Baron	NO BID	NO BID	No Bid	Profera	NO BID	NO BID	Nardone	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name			Solo 7" Pepperoni Pizza				5" Round Personal Pepp./Cheese in box			Bake to Rise Pepp					
Product Code			73163				53916 / NP5MIMB			7RMP Box					
Commodity Code			73163				B077			7RMP Box					
Commercial Code			73163							7RMP Box					
Serving Size			7.91 oz				5 oz			8.06					
Servings per case			48				40 ct			48					
Case Weight			23.74 lbs (net)				12.5#			24.18#					
Fee for Service										\$47.30					
Commercial Price per Case			\$48.21				\$32.92			\$53					
Indirect Sales Discount			\$6.39												
Commodity Net Price			\$41.82				\$29.64			\$47.30					

Proposal Description Quesadilla, Chicken & Cheese	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	ConAgra	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name				The Max Pizza Quesadilla Chicken			
Product Code				77387-12532			
Commodity Code				77387-12533 B077 M022			
Commercial Code				77387-12534			
Serving Size				5 oz			
Servings per case				48			
Case Weight				15#			
Fee for Service				n/a			
Commercial Price per Case				\$24.19			
Indirect Sales Discount				\$1.81			
Commodity Net Price				\$22.38			

Proposal Description Additional Pizza	Tyson Sales & Distribution	Schwan's Food Service, Inc.							Pilgrim's Pride Corp.	Wawona Frozen Foods	Integrated Food Service	Profer
Manufacturer	NO BID	Big Daddy's	Big Daddy's	Tony's	Big Daddy's Personal	Big Daddy's Personal	Big Daddy's Personal	Big Daddy's Personal	NO BID	NO BID	No Bid	Profera
Product Name		16" Harvest Cheese Pizza CN	16" harvest Pepperoni Pizza CN	Turkey Sausage Breakfast Bagel IW	7" Cheese Pizza w/Box	7" Pepperoni Pizza	Cheese Pizza	Pepperoni Pizza				16" Stuffed Crust Wedge Cheese Pizza Whole Grain
Product Code		78531	78533	78710	73137	73138	73142	73143				40901 WGW16RMIMS C
Commodity Code		78531	78533	78710	73137	73138	73142	73143				B077
Commercial Code		78531	78533	78710	73137	73138	73142	73143				
Serving Size		5.53 oz	5.54	2.60 oz	6.59 oz	6.44 oz	6.31 oz	6.34 oz				5.75 oz
Servings per case		72	72	96	48	48	72	72				64ct
Case Weight		24.88 # (net)	24393 # (net)	15.60 # (net)	19.77 # (net)	19.32 # (net)	28.40 # (net)	28.54 # (net)				23 #
Fee for Service												
Commercial Price per Case		\$50.55	\$51.95	\$36.90	\$57.58	\$58.43	\$52.46	\$52.32				\$34.91
Indirect Sales Discount		\$9.10	\$6.00	\$5.82	\$6.29	\$4.63	\$13.23	\$10.12				
Commodity Net Price		\$41.45	\$45.95	\$31.08	\$51.29	\$53.80	\$39.23	\$42.20				\$27.91

Proposal Description Additional Pizza	a, Inc.	Jennie-O Turkey Store	Schreiber Foods, Inc	Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Inc	Alpha Foods Co.							
Manufacturer	Profera	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Alpha Foods	Alpha Foods	Alpha Foods	Alpha Foods	Alpha Foods	Alpha Foods	Alpha Foods	
Product Name	6: French Bread Cheese Pizza 6FBMIM				Alpha Gold Whole Grain Cheese Pizza Kit !6"	Alpha Gold Cheese Pizza Kit, 16"	Alpha Gold Whole Grain Pepp Kit 16"	Alpha Gold Pepp Pizza Kit 16"	Alpha Gold Pepp Calzone Kit	Alpha Gold Sausage Calzone Kit	Alpha Gold Pepp Pizza Kit 7"	
Product Code	55904				1501WG	1501	2001WG	2001	C7041	C7061	3031	
Commodity Code	B077				1501WG	1501	2001WG	2001	C7041	C7061	3031	
Commercial Code					1501WG	1501	2001WG	2001	C7041	C7061	3031	
Serving Size	5.05 oz				6.12 oz	6.12 oz	6.20 oz	6.20 oz	10.36 oz	10.76 oz	7.84 oz	
Servings per case	60ct				96	96	96	96	40	40	80	
Case Weight	18.94#				36.72oz	36.72#	37.22#	37.22#	25.91#	26.91#	39.22#	
Fee for Service					\$41.19cs	\$39.94 cs	\$42.11 cs	\$40.86 cs	\$38.56 cs	\$40.56 cs	\$44 cs	
Commercial Price per Case	\$32.32				\$62 cs	\$57.75 cs	\$60 cs	\$55.75 cs	\$45.50 cs	\$47.50 cs	\$58.75 cs	
Indirect Sales Discount					\$17.28 cs	\$17.28 cs	\$14.40 cs	\$14.40 cs	\$7.20 cs	\$7.20 cs	\$14.40 cs	
Commodity Net Price	\$25.76				\$44.72 cs	\$40.47 cs	\$45.60 cs	\$41.35 cs	\$38.30 cs	\$40.30 cs	\$44.35 cs	

Proposal Description Additional Pizza	Alpha Foods Co.				Kings Delight	Culinary Standards Corp.	Red Gold, LLC	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.			
	Manufacturer	Alpha Foods	Alpha Foods	Alpha Foods	Alpha Foods	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	J.O.Y.Foods	J.O.Y.Foods	J.O.Y.Foods
Product Name	Alpha Gold Cheese Pizza Kit 7"	Alpha Gold Pepp Calzone Kit	Alpha Gold Sausage Calzone Kit	Alpha Gold Breakfast Sausage Pizza Kit, 16"				14" Café Pizza Papa Johns Thin Crust Cheese	14" Café Pizza Papa Johns Thin Crust Cheese	14" Café Pizza Papa Johns Thin Crust Slice Pepp.	14" Café Pizza Papa Johns Thin Crust Slice Pepp.
Product Code	3011	C7041	C7061	4251				631401	631401	631402	631402
Commodity Code	3011	C7041	C7061	4251				631401	631401	631402	631402
Commercial Code	3011	C7041	C7061	4251				631401	631401	631402	631402
Serving Size	7.34 oz	10.36 oz	10.76 oz	5.75 oz				1 slice / 1/8 oz Pizza	1 slice / 1/8 oz Pizza	1 slice / 1/8 oz Pizza	1 slice / 1/8 oz Pizza
Servings per case	80	40	40	96				64	64	64	64
Case Weight	36.72#	25.91#	26.91#	34.5#				16.78#	16.78#	17.05#	17.05#
Fee for Service	\$42.40 cs	\$38.30 cs	\$40.30 cs	\$48.70 cs				NOI	Freight Direct Ship; Min 216 cs @ \$1 /cs	NOI	Freight Direct Ship; Min 216 cs @ \$1 /cs
Commercial Price per Case	\$56.85 cs	\$45.50 cs	\$47.50 cs	\$63.10 cs				\$35	\$36	\$35	\$36
Indirect Sales Discount	\$14.40 cs	\$7.20 cs	\$7.20 cs	\$14.40 cs				\$11.87	\$11.87	\$9.46	\$9.46
Commodity Net Price	\$42.45 cs	\$38.30 cs	\$40.30 cs	\$48.70cs				\$23.13 cs (does not include dist. Mark-up)	\$24.13 cs	\$25.54 cs (does not include dist. Mark-up)	\$26.54 cs

Proposal Description Additional Pizza	J.O.Y. Foods, Inc.							M.C.I. Foods, Inc.	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	
Manufacturer	J.O.Y.Foods	J.O.Y.Foods	J.O.Y.Foods	J.O.Y.Foods	J.O.Y.Foods	J.O.Y.Foods	J.O.Y.Foods	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Con Agra
Product Name	14" Café Pizza Papa Johns Pan Crust Cheese Fully Topped	14" Café Pizza Papa Johns Pan Crust Cheese Fully Topped	14" Café Pizza Papa Johns Pan Crust Slice Pepp Fully Topped	14" Café Pizza Papa Johns Pan Crust Slice Pepp Fully Topped	14" Rizzo'a Whole Grain Pizza Crust Cheese	14" Rizzo'a Whole Grain Pizza Crust Sliced Pepp	14" Rizzo'a Whole Grain Pizza Crust Turkey Pepp					The Max Double Stuff 100% Mozz Whole Grain Pizza
Product Code	611401	611401	611402	611402	251401	251402	251407					77387-12683
Commodity Code	611401	611401	611402	611402	251401	251402	251407					77387-12683 B077 M077
Commercial Code	611401	611401	611402	611402	251401	251402	251407					77387-12683
Serving Size	1 slice / 1/8 oz Pizza	1 slice / 1/8 oz Pizza	1 slice / 1/8 oz Pizza	1 slice / 1/8 oz Pizza	1 slice / 1/8 oz Pizza	1 slice / 1/8 oz Pizza	1 slice / 1/8 oz Pizza					3.74 oz
Servings per case	64	64	64	64	64	64	64					96
Case Weight	21.33#	21.33#	20.93#	20.93#	19.55#	19.75#	19.75#					22.4#
Fee for Service	NOI	Freight Direct Ship; Min 216 cs @ \$1 /cs	NOI	Freight Direct Ship; Min 216 cs @ \$1 /cs	NOI	NOI	NOI					n/a
Commercial Price per Case	\$38	\$39	\$38	\$39	\$35.00	\$35	\$35					\$36.28
Indirect Sales Discount	\$11.87	\$11.87	\$9.17	\$9.17	\$11.81	\$9.23	\$9.23					\$12.34
Commodity Net Price	\$26.13 cs (does not include dist. Mark-up)	\$27.13 cs	\$28.83 cs (does not include dist. Mark-up)	\$29.83 cs	\$23.19 cs (does not include dist. Mark-up)	\$25.77 cs (does not include dist. Mark-up)	\$25.77 cs (does not include dist. Mark-up)					\$23.94

Proposal Description Additional Pizza	ConAgra Foods, Inc.							King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	Con Agra	Con Agra	Con Agra	Con Agra	Con Agra	Con Agra	Con Agra	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name	The Max MaxSnax Totally Taco	The Max Real Slice SouthWest Whole Grain	The Max Twisted Edge Roasted Chicken Sicilian	The Max Twisted Edge Three Meat Pizza	The Max Twisted Edge 100% Mozz Cheese	The Max Twisted Edge Garlic Cheese	The Max MaxWrap Chili Cheese			
Product Code	77387-12657	77387-12623	77387-12620	77387-12621	77387-12622	77387-12666	77387-12646			
Commodity Code	77387-12657 B077 M022	77387-12623 B077 M022	77387-12621 B077 M022	77387-12622 B077 M022	77387-12623 B077 B022	77387-12667 B077 M022	7738712646 B077 M022			
Commercial Code	77387-12657	77387-12623	77387-12622	77387-12623	77387-12624	77387-12668	77387-12646			
Serving Size	4.09 oz	5 oz	5.6 oz	6 oz	5.9 oz	5.85 oz	4.8 oz			
Servings per case	96	96	72	72	72	72	60			
Case Weight	24.5#	30#	25.2#	27#	26.6#	26.3#	18#			
Fee for Service	n/a	n/a	n/a	n/a	n/a	n/a	n/a			
Commercial Price per Case	\$42.60	\$38.28	\$40.08	\$36.76	\$39.28	\$35.32	\$27			
Indirect Sales Discount	\$3.10	\$4.63	\$4.66	\$5.92	\$13.28	\$6.64	\$2.50			
Commodity Net Price	\$39.50	\$33.65	\$35.42	\$30.84	\$26	\$28.68	\$24.50			

Proposal Description Turkey Sausage Patty	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name							
Product Code							
Commodity Code							
Commercial Code							
Serving Size							
Servings per case							
Case Weight							
Fee for Service							
Commercial Price per Case							
Indirect Sales Discount							
Commodity Net Price							

Proposal Description Sliced Turkey Ham	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name							
Product Code							
Commodity Code							
Commercial Code							
Serving Size							
Servings per case							
Case Weight							
Fee for Service							
Commercial Price per Case							
Indirect Sales Discount							
Commodity Net Price							

Proposal Description Oven Roasted Turkey Breast	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name							
Product Code							
Commodity Code							
Commercial Code							
Serving Size							
Servings per case							
Case Weight							
Fee for Service							
Commercial Price per Case							
Indirect Sales Discount							
Commodity Net Price							

Proposal Description Turkey Chili	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name							
Product Code							
Commodity Code							
Commercial Code							
Serving Size							
Servings per case							
Case Weight							
Fee for Service							
Commercial Price per Case							
Indirect Sales Discount							
Commodity Net Price							

Proposal Description Additional Turkey Products	Advance Food Company	Out of the Shell, LLC dba Ling's	Land O Lakes, Inc.	ConAgra Foods, Inc.	King's Command Foods, Inc.	Bosco's Pizza Co.	East Side Entrees
Manufacturer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Product Name							
Product Code							
Commodity Code							
Commercial Code							
Serving Size							
Servings per case							
Case Weight							
Fee for Service							
Commercial Price per Case							
Indirect Sales Discount							
Commodity Net Price							

Proposal Description Misc.	Wawona Frozen Foods				Red Gold, LLC						
Manufacturer	Wawona				Red Gold						
Product Name	Fruit Cups various	Turnover various	Shortcakes various	Cobblers various	Redpack Tomato Sauce 6 #10 cans	Red Gold Fancy Ketchup 6 #10 cans	Red Gold Fancy Ketchup 6 #10 pouches	Red Gold Fancy Ketchup #10 Jugs w/pumps	Red Gold Fancy Ketchup BagInBox for wall rack	Red Gold Fancy Ketchup BagInBox for Wunder-Bar Disp.	2/1.5 Red Gold Fancy Ketchup Dispenser Pouch Pack
Product Code					RPKHA99	REDY599	REDY572	REDY59P	REDYA3G	REDYA3GWB	REDY57D
Commodity Code					A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste
Commercial Code					RPKHA99	REDY599	REDY572	REDY59P	REDYA3G	REDYA3GWB	REDY57D
Serving Size	4 to 4.5 oz	4 oz	4 oz	4.21 oz	2.2 oz	.6 oz	.6 oz	.6 oz	.6 oz	.6 oz	.6 oz
Servings per case	96	80	96	76	289	1,151	1,141	1,141	760	760	760
Case Weight	24-27 lbs	20 lbs	24lbs	20 lbs	39.7#	43.1#	42.8#	42.8#	28.5#	28.5#	28.5#
Fee for Service					\$10.47	\$10.77	\$10.69	\$15.76	\$9.56	\$10.06	\$9.96
Commercial Price per Case					\$14.80	\$15.14	\$15.06	\$20.09	\$12.45	\$12.95	\$12.85
Indirect Sales Discount					\$4.33	\$4.37	\$4.37	\$4.33	\$2.89	\$2.89	\$2.89
Commodity Net Price					\$10.47	\$10.77	\$10.69	\$15.76	\$9.56	\$10.06	\$9.96

Proposal Description Misc.	Red Gold LLC										Red Gold LLC
Manufacturer	Red Gold										Red Gold
Product Name	1000/9 gm Red Gold Fancy Ketchup Packets	Redpack Spaghetti Sauce	Red Gold Salsa 6 #10 cans	Redpack Nutritionally Enhanced Spaghetti Sauce 6 #10 cans	Redpack Marinara Sauce 6 #10 cans	Redpack Fully Prepared Pizza Sauce 6 #10 cans	Redpack tomato paste 6 #10 cans	Redpack 1.06 Puree 6 #10 cans	Redpack Conc. Crushed All Purpose Tomatoes 6 #10 cans	Redpack Sloppy Joe Sauce 6 #10 cans	Redpack Extra Heavy Pizza Saice w/Basil 6 #10 cans
Product Code	REDY59G	RPKMA9C	REDSC99	RPKMA9E	RPKNA99	RPKIL99	RPKUA99	RPKH69X	RPKDX99	RPK1A99	RPKIX99
Commodity Code	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste	A245 Tomato Paste
Commercial Code	REDY59G	RPKMA9C	REDSC99	RPKMA9E	RPKNA99	RPKIL99	RPKUA99	RPKH69X	RPKDX99	RPK1A99	RPKIX99
Serving Size	.3 oz	4.3 oz	1 oz	4.3 oz	4.4 oz	2.2 oz	1.2 oz	2.2 oz	2.2 oz	2.3 oz	2.2 oz
Servings per case	1000	144	618	144	145	291	570	289	293	282	293
Case Weight	19.84#	39.7#	38.6#	39.7#	39.8#	39.7#	41.6#	39.7#	39.3#	40.5#	39.3#
Fee for Service	\$12.12	\$13.90	\$17.37	\$16.06	\$17.28	\$12.06	\$10.45	\$9.63	\$6.88	\$14.90	\$8.18
Commercial Price per Case	\$14.00	\$18.66	\$19.82	\$20.66	\$20.76	\$19.03	\$24.25	\$15	\$15.06	\$19.59	\$15.20
Indirect Sales Discount	\$1.88	\$4.76	\$2.45	\$4.60	\$3.48	\$7.24	\$13.80	\$5.72	\$8.18	\$4.69	\$7.02
Commodity Net Price	\$12.12	\$13.90	\$17.37	\$16.06	\$17.28	\$12.06	\$10.45	\$9.63	\$6.88	\$14.90	\$8.18

Proposal Description Misc.		M.C.I. Foods							M.C.I. Foods	
Manufacturer		M.C.I. Foods							M.C.I. Foods	
Product Name	Sacramento Tomato Juice 12/46 oz cans	Los Cabos Bean & Cheese Burrito	Los Cabos Whole Grain Bean & Lite American Cheese Burrito	Los Cabos Bean & Cheese Burrito	Los Cabos Beef & Cheese Taco Snack	Los Cabos Breakfast Burrito, egg, cheese, turkey sausage	Los Cabos Breakfast Burrito, egg, cheese, turkey sausage, potato	Cabo Primo, bean, beef, cheese, salsa, Burrito	Cabo Primo Macho Chili Burrito Bean & Cheese	Losa Cabos Lite American Cheese Enchilada
Product Code	SACVA46	97575CN	92540CN	17625	94627	98876	98878	17344	71688	6821CN
Commodity Code	A245 Tomato Paste	97575CN/CM B072	92540CN/CM B072	17625/CN B072	94627/CN B072	98876/CM B072	98878/CM B072	17344/CM B072	71688/CM B072	6821CN/CM B072
Commercial Code	SACVA46	97575CN	92540CN	17625	94627	98876	98878	17344	71688	6821CN
Serving Size	8.6 oz	5.75	5.75	6.25	6.25	3	3.2	6.81	6	2 oz = 1 enchilada
Servings per case	69	96	96	48	96	96	96	80	64	72 4 oz portions
Case Weight	36.8#	34.5#	34.5#	18.75#	37.5#	18#	19.2#	34.10#	24#	17.10#
Fee for Service	\$10.75	\$34.15	\$36.16	\$19.35	\$49.85	\$30.86	\$30.86	\$33.07	\$33.33	\$24.10
Commercial Price per Case	\$13.62	\$39.48	\$40.20	\$22.02	\$53.19	\$33.77	\$33.77	\$35.92	\$35.64	\$34.10
Indirect Sales Discount	\$2.87	NOI 5.33	NOI 4.04	NOI 2.67	NOI 3.34	NOI 2.91	NOI 2.91	NOI 2.85	NOI 2.31	NOI 10.02
Commodity Net Price	\$10.75	\$34.15	\$36.16	\$19.35	\$49.85	\$30.86	\$30.86	\$33.07	\$33.33	\$24.10