P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Assistant Superintendent for Business and Finance
From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director

Date: Tuesday, June 24, 2014

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 140512 for Charter

Bus Transportation Services

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal Number 140512 for Charter Bus Transportation Services be awarded
in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the
attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson Roap @  EAGLE Pass, Texas 78852 @  TeL (830) 773-5181 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140512 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET BY DATE OF TRIP

DATE OF BUS City Tours, | Cougar Bus Kerrville Regent zg’:crhcélsty Star Shuttle,|] OK Tours,
TRIP oty DESTINATION GROUP Inc. Lines LTD Bus Co.  Coach Lines ne. Inc. LLC
San Antonio, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
8/8/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,400 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,050  $ 1,925
8/9/14 1 San Antonio, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
8/13/14 1 Crystal City, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,400 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,328 $ 975 | $ 2,500 @ $ 1,250
08/14-16/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 2,900 | $ 2,250 | $ 4,740 3591* | $ 3,090 3400* | $ 3,300
8/15/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles JV/9 Volleyball | $ 1,400 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
08/15-16/14 1 San Antonio, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 2,200 | $ 1,750 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 2,195 2300* | $ 2,395
8/15/14 2 Pearsall, TX. CCW Freshman Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,698  $ 975 | $ 1,800 | $ 1,850
8/15/14 2 Pearsall, TX. CCW Junior Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,698 | $ 1,140 | $ 1,800 | $ 1,850
8/15/14 2 Pearsall, TX. CCW Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,698 | $ 1,140 | $ 1,800 | $ 1,850
08/21-23/14 1 Floresville, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 2,900 | $ 2,250 | $ 4,740 3591* 3240* 3400* | $ 3,495
08/21-23/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 2,700 | $ 2,250 | $ 4,740 3591* | $ 3,240 3400* | $ 3,595
8/22/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Freshman Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,925
8/22/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Junior Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
8/22/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
8/23/14 1 Uvalde, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles JV/9 Volleyball | $ 1,400 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438 | $ 1,140 | $ 1,500 | $ 1,595
8/26/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,400 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,595
08/28-30/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 2,900  $ 2,250 | $ 4,740 3591* 3240* 3400* NO BID
08/28-30/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 2,900 | $ 2,250 | $ 4,740 3591* 3240* 3400* NO BID
8/29/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 NO BID
8/29/14 2 Laredo, TX CCW Varsity Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 NO BID
8/29/14 5 Laredo, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,750 | $ 2,040 NO BID
8/30/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,885 | $ 2,166 NO BID
8/30/14 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 NO BID
8/30/14 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,150 NO BID
9/2/14 1 Del Rio, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410  $ 1,080 | $ 1,600 | $ 1,350
9/5/14 1 | Carrizo Springs, TX. CCW Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,324 NOBID | $ 1,581 | $ 1,450
9/5/14 1 | Carrizo Springs, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,450  $ 1,250 | $ 1,900  $ 1,324 | $ 1,140 | $ 1581 | $ 1,450
9/5/14 2 | Carrizo Springs, TX. CCW Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,324 NOBID | $ 1,581 | $ 1,895
9/5/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,450 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,895
9/5/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,895
9/5/14 6 Laredo, TX. EPHS Band $ 1,450 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 NOBID | $ 2,250 | $ 1,925
9/6/14 1 Uvalde, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438 | $ 975 | $ 1,698 | $ 1,525
9/6/14 1 Uvalde, TX MJH Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438  $ 975 | $ 1,698 | $ 1,525
9/9/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,895
9/13/14 1 Laredo, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,925
9/15/14 1 Laredo, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,895
9/15/14 5 Carrizo Springs, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,324 | $ 1,555 | $ 1,581 | $ 1,200
9/15/14 1 Uvalde, TX MJH Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438 | $ 1,080 | $ 1,698 | $ 1,450
9/16/14 1 Pearsall, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,698 | $ 1,080 | $ 2,007 | $ 1,450
9/18/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,930 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 1of 4
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140512 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET BY DATE OF TRIP

River City

City Tours, | Cougar Bus Kerrville Regent Star Shuttle,|] OK Tours,
D'?TREW? i g%s{ DESTINATION GROUP Inc. LinesLTD = BusCo.  Coach Lines CO?r(i:.es, Inc. LLC
San Antonio, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
9/18/14 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
9/18/14 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
9/19/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,500  $ 1,350  $ 1,900  $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
9/20/14 1 Laredo, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,925
9/22/14 1 Del Rio, TX MJH Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410 $ 975 | $ 1,673 | $ 1,300
9/23/14 1 Jordanton, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,983 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,351 | $ 1,410
9/24/14 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Freshman Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
9/24/14 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Junior Varsity Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
9/25/14 2 San Antonio, TX. CCW Junior Varsity Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
9/30/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,895
10/2/14 2 Castroville, TX. CCW Freshman Football $ 1,750 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,851 | $ 1,080 | $ 2,000  $ 1,695
10/2/14 1 Del Rio, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,750 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410 | $ 1,080 | $ 1,675 | $ 1,300
10/3/14 5 Castroville, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,851 NOBID | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/3/14 1 Castroville, TX. CCW Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,851 | $ 1,140 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
10/3/14 1 Castroville, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,800  $ 1,350  $ 1,900  $ 1,851 @ $ 1,140 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/3/14 2 Castroville, TX. CCW Varsity Football $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,851 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/4/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
10/4/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
10/4/14 5 San Antonio, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,800  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
10/4/14 1 Del Rio, TX MJH Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,800 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410 | $ 1,080 | $ 1,675 | $ 1,895
10/6/14 1 Uvalde, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438  $ 975 | $ 1,700 | $ 1,525
10/7/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
10/8/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Freshman Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/8/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Junior Varsity Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
10/9/14 2 Uvalde, TX. CCW Junior Varsity Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438 | $ 1,080 | $ 1,700 | $ 1,525
10/10/14 1 Uvalde, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,700 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438 | $ 1,080 | $ 1,700 | $ 1,950
10/11/14 1 Del Rio, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,700 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410  $ 1,140 | $ 1,675 | $ 2,100
10/11/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 2,100
10/11/14 5 San Antonio, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,800  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 159 | $ 2,200 | $ 2,100
10/14/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
10/14/14 1 Laredo, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/16/14 1 Comstock, TX MJH Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,645 NOBID | $ 1,775 | $ 1,650
10/16/14 1 Del Rio, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,600 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410 NOBID | $ 1,675 | $ 1,395
10/16/14 2 Laredo, TX CCW Freshman Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
10/16/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Freshman Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/16/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Junior Varsity Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,640 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
10/17/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
10/18/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,925
10/18/14 2 Laredo, TX CCW Varsity Football $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
10/18/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,925
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 2 of 4
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140512 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET BY DATE OF TRIP

River City

City Tours, | Cougar Bus Kerrville Regent Star Shuttle,|] OK Tours,
D'?TREW? i g%s{ DESTINATION GROUP Inc. LinesLTD = BusCo.  Coach Lines CO?r(i:.es, Inc. LLC
San Antonio, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
10/18/14 5 Laredo, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 NOBID | $ 2,000  $ 1,950
10/18/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 1,950
10/18/14 5 San Antonio, TX. CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 1,950
10/21/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,895
10/23/14 2 Laredo, TX CCW Junior Varsity Football $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/23/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,640 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
10/23/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/23/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 1,950
10/25/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 2,050
10/25/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,815 | $ 2,200 NO BID
10/29/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Freshman Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/29/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Junior Varsity Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
10/30/14 2 Laredo, TX CCW Junior Varsity Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 NOBID | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/31-11/01/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000 | $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 | $ 2,394 NO BID 2200* NO BID
11/6/14 2 San Antonio, TX. CCW Freshman Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,895
11/7/14 1 Del Rio, TX EPHS Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,600 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410 | $ 1,080 | $ 1,675 | $ 2,100
11/7/14 2 Del Rio, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410  $ 1,250 | $ 1,675 | $ 2,100
11/7/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CCW Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,815 | $ 2,200 | $ 2,100
11/7/14 2 San Antonio, TX. CCW Varsity Football $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 2,100
11/7/14 5 Somerset, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,922 NOBID | $ 2,000  $ 2,100
11/14/14 6 Laredo, TX. EPHS Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 NOBID | $ 2,050  $ 2,100
11/14/14 5 Laredo, TX CC Winn Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,495 | $ 2,050 | $ 2,100
11/14-15/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 2,280 3500* | $ 2,795
11/21/14 5 Laredo, TX CC Winn Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,495 | $ 2,050 | $ 2,100
11/21/14 6 Laredo, TX. EPHS Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 NOBID | $ 2,050  $ 2,100
11/30-12/01/14 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 1,140 2300* | $ 2,795
12/05-06/14 1 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 2,280 2300* | $ 2,795
12/07-08/2014 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 1,250 2300* | $ 2,795
12/13/14 2 Castroville, TX CC Winn Band $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,851 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
01/18-19/15 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 1,140 2300* | $ 2,795
01/23-24/15 1 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 1,140 2300* | $ 2,795
2/7/15 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,895
2/7/15 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,895
2/7/15 1 San Marcos, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,200 | $ 1,450 | $ 1,987 | $ 2,381 | $ 1,385 | $ 2,565 | $ 2,100
2/21/15 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
2/21/15 1 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
2/28/15 1 Jordanton, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,983 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,150 | $ 1,900
3/7/15 1 New Braunfels, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,200 | $ 1,450 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,257 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,430 NO BID
3/7/15 2 New Braunfels, TX. EPHS Band $ 2,200 | $ 1,450 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,257 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,430 NO BID
3/21/15 1 San Antonio, TX. EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,950
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 3 of 4
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SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140512 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY DATE OF TRIP

EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

DATE OF BUS City Tours, | Cougar Bus Kerrville Regent E:;/:crhcelsty Star Shuttle,  OK Tours,
TRIP oty DESTINATION GROUP Inc. Lines LTD Bus Co.  Coach Lines ne. Inc. LLC

San Antonio, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
3/28/15 1 San Antonio, TX. CC Winn Band $ 2,000 $ 1,350 $ 1,900 $ 2,036  $ 1,250 $ 2,200 $ 1,895
3/28/15 1 San Antonio, TX. EPHS Band $ 2,000 $ 1,350 $ 1,900 $ 2,036  $ 1,250  $ 2,200 $ 1,895
04/10-11/15 1 Austin, TX. CC Winn Band $ 2,400 $ 2,050 $ 3,400 2595* 1,580* 2800* | $ 3,125
04/10-11/15 1 San Diego, TX. CC Winn Band $ 2,600  $ 2,250 $ 3,400 2394* 2,280* 2800* | $ 3,495
4/11/15 5 San Antonio, TX. EPHS Band $ 2,000 $ 1,350 $ 1,900 $ 2,036 | $ 1,495 $ 2,800 $ 1,895
4/15/15 4 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,000 $ 1,350  $ 1,900 $ 2,036  $ 1,250  $ 2,200 $ 1,695
4/18/15 1 Kingsville, TX EPHS Band $ 1,600 $ 1,750  $ 2,142 $ 2,500  $ 1,495 $ 2,700 $ 1,895
4/18/15 1 Kingsville, TX EPHS Band $ 1,600 $ 1,750  $ 2,142 $ 2,500  $ 1,495  $ 2,700 $ 1,895
04/24-25/15 1 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,300  $ 1,850 $ 3,400 2394* | $ 2,280 2800* | $ 2,495
04/24-25/15 1 San Marcos, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,500  $ 1,950  $ 3,400 2394* 2,280* 2800* | $ 2,750
04/24-25/15 1 San Marcos, TX EPHS Band $ 2,500  $ 1,950 $ 3,400 2394* 2,280* 2800* | $ 2,750
4/25/15 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000 $ 1,350 $ 1,900 $ 2,036  $ 1,250  $ 2,200 $ 1,975
5/2/15 1 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,000 $ 1,350 $ 1,900 $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 $ 2,200 $ 1,925
5/2/15 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000 $ 1,350 $ 1,900 $ 2,036  $ 1,250  $ 2,200 $ 1,925
5/4/15 1 Austin, TX EPHS Band $ 2,700 $ 1550 $ 2,180 $ 2,59  $ 1,580 $ 2,800 $ 2,800
6/21/15 1 Kingsville, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000 $ 1,750  $ 2,142 $ 2,500  $ 1,495  $ 2,700 $ 2,100

Proposal Notes:

Prices are per bus

Dates and quantity of buses needed are subject

to change

Prices are limited to dates outlined in this proposal.

Additional trips will need to be g

uoted once dates become availab

e.

* Does not include driver's hotel room expense.

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor.

Page 4 of 4
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140512 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

River City

City Tours, = Cougar Bus Kerrville Regent Star OK Tours,
D?LE'F? i (B;#\S, DESTINATION GROUP Inc. LinesLTD = BusCo.  Coach Lines Coi“rcl:es’ Shuttle, Inc. LLC
San Antonio, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
8/22/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Freshman Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
9/24/14 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Freshman Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
10/8/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Freshman Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/16/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Freshman Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
10/29/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Freshman Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
Recommended expense: $ 12,500.00
Average per trip: $ 2,500.00
8/15/14 2 Pearsall, TX. CCW Freshman Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,698  $ 975 | $ 1,800 | $ 1,850
10/2/14 2 Castroville, TX. CCW Freshman Football $ 1,750 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,851 | $ 1,080 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,695
10/16/14 2 Laredo, TX CCW Freshman Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
11/6/14 2 San Antonio, TX. CCW Freshman Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,895
Recommended expense: $ 9,110.00
Average per trip: $ 2,277.50
8/22/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Junior Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,925
9/24/14 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Junior Varsity Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
10/8/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Junior Varsity Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
10/16/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Junior Varsity Football $ 1,600  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,640 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/29/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Junior Varsity Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
Recommended expense: $ 12,700.00
Average per trip: $ 2,540.00
8/15/14 2 Pearsall, TX. CCW Junior Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,698 | $ 1,140 | $ 1,800 | $ 1,850
9/25/14 2 San Antonio, TX. CCW Junior Varsity Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
10/9/14 2 Uvalde, TX. CCW Junior Varsity Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438 | $ 1,080 | $ 1,700 | $ 1,525
10/23/14 2 Laredo, TX CCW Junior Varsity Football $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/30/14 2 Laredo, TX CCW Junior Varsity Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 NOBID | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
Recommended expense: $ 12,140.00
Average per trip: $ 2,428.00
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 1 of 6
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140512 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP

DATE OF BUS City Tours, | Cougar Bus Kerrville Regent zgl:crhcélsty Star OK Tours,
TRIP oty DESTINATION GROUP Inc. Lines LTD Bus Co.  Coach Lines inc. Shuttle, Inc. LLC
San Antonio, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
8/22/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
8/30/14 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,150 NO BID
9/5/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,895
9/18/14 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
10/23/14 2 Laredo, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
11/7/14 2 Del Rio, TX EPHS Varsity Football $ 1,600 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,675 | $ 2,100
Recommended expense: $ 15,000.00
Average per trip: $ 2,500.00
8/15/14 2 Pearsall, TX. CCW Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,698 | $ 1,140 | $ 1,800 | $ 1,850
8/29/14 2 Laredo, TX CCW Varsity Football $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 NO BID
9/5/14 2 | Carrizo Springs, TX. CCW Varsity Football $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,324 NOBID | $ 1,581 | $ 1,895
10/3/14 2 Castroville, TX. CCW Varsity Football $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,851 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/18/14 2 Laredo, TX CCW Varsity Football $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
11/7/14 2 San Antonio, TX. CCW Varsity Football $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 2,100
Recommended expense: $ 14,928.00
Average per trip: $ 2,488.00
8/30/14 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 NO BID
9/5/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,450 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,895
9/18/14 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 @ $ 1,895
10/23/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,640 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
11/7/14 1 Del Rio, TX EPHS Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,600 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410  $ 1,080 | $ 1,675 | $ 2,100
Recommended expense: $ 6,180.00
Average per trip: $ 1,236.00
8/29/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 NO BID
9/5/14 1 | Carrizo Springs, TX. CCW Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,324 NOBID | $ 1,581 | $ 1,450
10/3/14 1 Castroville, TX. CCW Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,851 | $ 1,140 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/18/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,925
11/7/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CCW Cheer & Dance Team $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,815 | $ 2,200 | $ 2,100
Recommended expense: $ 6,240.00
Average per trip: $ 1,248.00
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 2 of 6



O O ~NO UL, WNPE

NNNNRNNRPRRRERRERRRE R
ORWONROOONODUNWNLEREO

EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140512 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP

DATE OF BUS City Tours, | Cougar Bus Kerrville Regent Eg’:crhce:lsty Star OK Tours,
TRIP oty DESTINATION GROUP Inc. Lines LTD Bus Co.  Coach Lines inc. Shuttle, Inc. LLC
San Antonio, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
8/29/14 5 Laredo, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,750 | $ 2,040 NO BID
9/15/14 5 | Carrizo Springs, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,324 | $ 1,555 | $ 1,581 | $ 1,200
10/3/14 5 Castroville, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,851 NOBID | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/4/14 5 San Antonio, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
10/11/14 5 San Antonio, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,59 | $ 2,200 | $ 2,100
10/18/14 5 Laredo, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 NOBID | $ 2,000  $ 1,950
10/18/14 5 San Antonio, TX. CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 1,950
11/7/14 5 Somerset, TX. CC Winn Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,922 NOBID | $ 2,000 | $ 2,100
11/14/14 5 Laredo, TX CC Winn Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,495 | $ 2,050  $ 2,100
11/14-15/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CC Winn Band $ 2,000 | $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* 2280* 3500* | $ 2,795
11/21/14 5 Laredo, TX CC Winn Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,495 | $ 2,050  $ 2,100
12/05-06/14 1 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* 2280* 2300* | $ 2,795
12/13/14 2 Castroville, TX CC Winn Band $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,851 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
01/23-24/15 1 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 1,140 2300* | $ 2,795
2/7/15 1 San Marcos, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,200 | $ 1,450 | $ 1,987 | $ 2,381 | $ 1,385 | $ 2,565 | $ 2,100
2/21/15 1 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
2/28/15 1 Jordanton, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,983 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,150 | $ 1,900
3/7/15 1 New Braunfels, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,200 | $ 1,450 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,257 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,430 NO BID
3/28/15 1 San Antonio, TX. CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,895
04/10-11/15 1 Austin, TX. CC Winn Band $ 2,400 | $ 2,050 | $ 3,400 2595* 1,580* 2800* | $ 3,125
04/10-11/15 1 San Diego, TX. CC Winn Band $ 2,600  $ 2,250 | $ 3,400 2394* 2,280* 2800* | $ 3,495
4/15/15 4 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,695
04/24-25/15 1 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,300  $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 2,280 2800* | $ 2,495
04/24-25/15 1 San Marcos, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,500 | $ 1,950 | $ 3,400 2394* 2,280* 2800* | $ 2,750
5/2/15 1 San Antonio, TX CC Winn Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
Recommended expense: $ 94,505.00
Average per trip: $ 3,780.20
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 3 of 6
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140512 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP

River City

City Tours, = Cougar Bus Kerrville Regent Star OK Tours,
D?LE'F? i (BD%S, DESTINATION GROUP Inc. LinesLTD = BusCo.  Coach Lines CO?'::.ES, Shuttle, Inc. LLC
San Antonio, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
8/30/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,885 | $ 2,166 NO BID
9/5/14 6 Laredo, TX. EPHS Band $ 1,450 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 NOBID | $ 2,250 | $ 1,925
9/18/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,930 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
10/4/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
10/11/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 2,100
10/18/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000 | $ 1,350  $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 1,950
10/23/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 NOBID | $ 2,200 | $ 1,950
10/25/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350  $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,815 | $ 2,200 NO BID
10/31-11/01/14 6 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* NO BID 2200* NO BID
11/14/14 6 Laredo, TX. EPHS Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 NOBID | $ 2,050 | $ 2,100
11/21/14 6 Laredo, TX. EPHS Band $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 NOBID | $ 2,050  $ 2,100
11/30-12/01/14 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 1,140 2300* | $ 2,795
12/07-08/2014 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 1,250 2300* | $ 2,795
01/18-19/15 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,850 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 1,140 2300* | $ 2,795
2/7/15 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,895
2/7/15 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,895
2/21/15 2 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
3/7/15 2 New Braunfels, TX. EPHS Band $ 2,200 | $ 1,450 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,257 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,430 NO BID
3/21/15 1 San Antonio, TX. EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,950
3/28/15 1 San Antonio, TX. EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,895
4/11/15 5 San Antonio, TX. EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,495 | $ 2,800  $ 1,895
4/18/15 1 Kingsville, TX EPHS Band $ 1,600 | $ 1,750 | $ 2,142 | $ 2,500 | $ 1,495 | $ 2,700 | $ 1,895
4/18/15 1 Kingsville, TX EPHS Band $ 1,600 | $ 1,750 | $ 2,142 | $ 2,500  $ 1,495 | $ 2,700 | $ 1,895
04/24-25/15 1 San Marcos, TX EPHS Band $ 2,500 | $ 1,950  $ 3,400 2394* 2,280* 2800* | $ 2,750
4/25/15 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036  $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,975
5/2/15 1 San Antonio, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
5/4/15 1 Austin, TX EPHS Band $ 2,700 | $ 1,550 | $ 2,180 @ $ 2,595 | $ 1,580 | $ 2,800  $ 2,800
6/21/15 1 Kingsville, TX EPHS Band $ 2,000  $ 1,750 | $ 2,142 | $ 2,500 | $ 1,495 | $ 2,700 | $ 2,100
Recommended expense: $ 126,610.00
Average per trip: $ 4,521.79
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 4 of 6
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140512 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP

DATE OF BUS City Tours, | Cougar Bus Kerrville Regent zgl:crhcélsty Star OK Tours,
TRIP oty DESTINATION GROUP Inc. Lines LTD Bus Co.  Coach Lines inc. Shuttle, Inc. LLC
San Antonio, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
8/8/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,400 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,050  $ 1,925
8/9/14 1 San Antonio, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925
8/15/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles JV/9 Volleyball | $ 1,400 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
08/15-16/14 1 San Antonio, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 2,200 | $ 1,750 | $ 3,400 2394* | $ 2,195 2300* | $ 2,395
08/21-23/14 1 Floresville, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 2,900  $ 2,250 | $ 4,740 3591* 3,240* 3400* | $ 3,495
8/23/14 1 Uvalde, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles JV/9 Volleyball | $ 1,400 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438 | $ 1,140 | $ 1,500 | $ 1,595
8/26/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,400 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,595
08/28-30/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 2,900 | $ 2,250 | $ 4,740 3591* 3,240* 3400* NO BID
9/16/14 1 Pearsall, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,698 | $ 1,080 | $ 2,007 | $ 1,450
9/23/14 1 Jordanton, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,983 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,351 | $ 1,410
10/4/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
10/11/14 1 Del Rio, TX. EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,700 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410 | $ 1,140 | $ 1,675 | $ 2,100
10/14/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/18/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,925
10/25/14 1 Laredo, TX EPHS Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 2,050
Recommended expense: $ 20,860.00
Average per trip: $ 1,390.67
8/13/14 1 Crystal City, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,400 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,328 $ 975 | $ 2,500  $ 1,250
08/14-16/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 2,900 | $ 2,250 | $ 4,740 3591* 3,090* 3400* | $ 3,300
08/21-23/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 2,700 | $ 2,250 | $ 4,740 3591* 3,240* 3400* | $ 3,595
08/28-30/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 2,900 | $ 2,250 | $ 4,740 3591* 3,240* 3400* NO BID
9/2/14 1 Del Rio, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410  $ 1,080 | $ 1,600 | $ 1,350
9/5/14 1 | Carrizo Springs, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,324 | $ 1,140 | $ 1,581 | $ 1,450
9/9/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,895
9/19/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,409 | $ 1,895
9/30/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,895
10/3/14 1 Castroville, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,800 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,851 | $ 1,140 | $ 2,000 | $ 1,895
10/7/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/10/14 1 Uvalde, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,700 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438 | $ 1,080 | $ 1,700 | $ 1,950
10/17/14 1 Laredo, TX CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,700 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,925
10/21/14 1 San Antonio, TX. CCW Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 2,036 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,895
Recommended expense: $ 19,665.00
Average per trip: $ 1,404.64
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 5 of 6
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140512 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP

DATE OF BUS City Tours, | Cougar Bus Kerrville Regent E:;/:crhcelsty Star OK Tours,
TRIP oty DESTINATION GROUP Inc. Lines LTD Bus Co.  Coach Lines inc. Shuttle, Inc. LLC
San Antonio, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
9/6/14 1 Uvalde, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,450  $ 1,250 | $ 1,900  $ 1,438 | $ 975 | $ 1,698  $ 1,525
9/13/14 1 Laredo, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,925
9/15/14 1 Laredo, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,450  $ 1,350  $ 1,900  $ 1,901 @ $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,895
9/20/14 1 Laredo, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,901 | $ 1,250 | $ 2,250 | $ 1,925
10/2/14 1 Del Rio, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,750 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900  $ 1,410 @ $ 1,080  $ 1,675 | $ 1,300
10/6/14 1 Uvalde, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438 | $ 975 | $ 1,700 | $ 1,525
10/14/14 1 Laredo, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,500  $ 1,350  $ 1,900  $ 1,901 @ $ 1,250 | $ 2,000  $ 1,895
10/16/14 1 Del Rio, TX EPJH Lady Eagles Volleyball $ 1,600 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410 NOBID | $ 1,675 | $ 1,395
Recommended expense: $ 9,425.00
Average per trip: $ 1,178.13
9/6/14 1 Uvalde, TX MJH Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,450 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,438 | $ 975 | $ 1,698 | $ 1,525
9/15/14 1 Uvalde, TX MJH Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,450  $ 1,250 | $ 1,900  $ 1,438 | $ 1,080  $ 1,698  $ 1,450
9/22/14 1 Del Rio, TX MJH Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,500 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,410  $ 975 | $ 1,673 | $ 1,300
10/4/14 1 Del Rio, TX MJH Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,800  $ 1,250 | $ 1,900  $ 1,410 @ $ 1,080  $ 1,675 | $ 1,895
10/16/14 1 Comstock, TX MJH Lady Mavericks Volleyball $ 1,600 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,900 | $ 1,645 NOBID | $ 1,775 | $ 1,650
Recommended expense: $ 5,460.00
Average per trip: $ 1,092.00
Total Recommended expense: $ 365,323.00
Total number of trips in this proposal: 136
Average per trip: $ 2,686.20
Proposal Notes:
Prices are per bus
Dates and quantity of buses needed are subject to change
Prices are limited to dates outlined in this proposal. Additional trips will need to be quoted once dates become available.
* Does not include driver's hotel room expense.
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 6 of 6





