AGENDA ITEM

(A)

(B)

©

(D)

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop X Regular Special
Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS & FINANCE

LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR
Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 250206 FOR JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD
DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE
RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD

POLICY CH.

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




EaGrLE PAss INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DisTRICT

MEMORANDUM

To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
Luis A. Vélez

From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director T 2024.06.27
15:41:01 -05'00'

Date: Thursday, June 27 2024

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 250206 for

Janitorial Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends
that Sealed Proposal 250206 for Janitorial Supplies be awarded in accordance with
the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the attached
Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the Purchasing Department.

587 Madison Streect ® EacLE Pass, TExas 78852 @ TevL (830) 773-5181 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

AN EquaL OrrorTunNiTY EMPLOYER
F-280



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 250206 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
A&S A&S VENADOS
':’;" Description ’f;::‘;';d ENTs:l;:usss JANITORIAL | JANITORIAL G";ﬁﬁgﬁ“ Lﬁiﬂ*g:ﬁ “‘;’QE,?‘;” M:Kf,f‘:"’ °'S’§L‘§,“Ts,2‘,f§s sg;::mv UNIPAKCORP.|  QUILL | DISTRIBUTIO |VICCO SUPPLY
SUPPLY | SUPPLY(2) N
T | J005 |ANT KILLER 25| _NOBID $16.62 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.49
2 | 020 |BELT, RUBBER 1] __nNoBID 933 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 | 021 |BELT, SAFETY 1] __NoBID §18.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.60
4 J022 |BELT, SAFETY 1 NO BID $18.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.60
5 | 1023 |BELT, SAFETY 30 | NOBID S18.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.60
6 | J024 |BELT, SAFETY 20| __NOBID s18.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.60
7 [ 1025 |BLEACH, GERMICIDAL 2625 | $357 $4.08 NO BID $3.65 NO BID 204 $3.49 $3.67 $3.90 NO BID $37.57 NO BID 5490
& | 1030 |CLEANER, DISINFECTANT (LI 115 | 8193 $4051 NO BID $3.05 NO BID $9.72 NO BID $8.99 $4.01 NO BID $2.76 NO BID s7.42
9 | 1039 |BROOM, PLASTIC (ANGLE) 270 | $8.75 $95.51 NO BID $7.51 NO BID NO BID $6.24 NO BID $390 NO BID $18.59 NO BID $22.46
10 | 1040 |BROOM, STRAW 1] s859 S1L.13 NO BID $8.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.00
11 | 1055 [BRUSH, COMMODE 80| 299 $3.03 NO BID $4.01 NO BID NO BID SL77 $3.62 $2.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.49
12 | 068 |BRUSH, UTILITY (FOOD SERV 1| NOBID $7.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.50
13 | 1070 |BRUSH, PAVEMENT 5| _NOBID $2631 NO BID $19.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.00
14 | 1075 |BRUSH, SCRUB 15| s295 $4.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5059 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6:50
15 | J078 [BUCKET AND WRINGER 35| $5175 $179.59 NO BID $89.00 NO BID $5036 $6331 $124.06 $79.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID $197.10
16 | 1080 |CABINET, ROLL TOWEL 5[ __NOBID $56.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.56 NO BID 5958 NO BID NO BID $29.71 NO BID $105.00
17 | 085 |CAN, GARBAGE(STEEL) 1| NOBID $67.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 | 1086 |CAN, GARBAGE (PLASTIC) 35| 52980 $31.84 $15.47 $3084 NO BID $54.92 NO BID $44.01 $2698 NO BID $1697 NO BID $62.00
19 | 1095 |CAN, GAS SAFETY 10| _NOBID $2698 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $108.72
20 | J100 [CART, JANITORIAL 5| $149.00 $124.98 S141.27 $169.61 NO BID NO BID NO BID $210.93 $104.00 NO BID s172.43 NO BID $19938
21 | 1110 |CLEANER, CARPET 1| ss565 $3.19 $556 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.99
22 | 116 |CLEANER, CHALKBOARD 10| $527 $5.29 $7.75 $69.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 | 1119 |CLEANER, DISINFECTANT 1] s1795 $1261 NO BID $10.03 NO BID $9.90 NO BID $1007 $14.20 NO BID $14.59 NO BID $16.00
24 | J120 |CLEANER, DISINFECTANT 175 NO BID $87.81 NO BID $83.34 NO BID 12.45* $46.21 NO BID $44.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.90
25 | 1121 [CLEANER, DISINFENCTANT 155 | _NOBID 51698 NO BID $47.66 NO BID 25.22¢ S16.21 $85.39 $58.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.99
26 | J123 [CLEANER, DRAIN 1] sas7 $1.68 NO BID $3.19 NO BID 2522 NO BID $8.49 NO BID NO BID $7.04 NO BID $14.50
27 | 1125 |CLEANER, GENERAL PURPOS 315 | s1179 $12.13 NO BID $9.71 NO BID $10.76 $6.99 $9.16 $12.90 NO BID $11.39 NO BID $15.75
28 | 1130 |CLEANER, GLASS 190 | $899 $10.00 $10.19 §7.71 NO BID $7.07 $5.10 $9.00 $8.49 NO BID $6.58 NO BID $8.00
29 | J135 [CLEANER, HAND 15| __NOBID $6.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.50
30 | 140 |CLEANER, BOWL 1| _NOBID $12.68 NO BID 1425 NO BID 5996 NO BID NO BID 343° NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.20
31 | 1145 |CLEANER, FLOOR 850 | 887 $10.62 NO BID $8.21 NO BID $10.76 $6.99 NO BID 5698 NO BID S12.14 NO BID $12.69
32 | 1150 |CLEANER, PORCELAIN AND | 90 | 347 Sh.22 NO BID $3.72 NO BID $9.96 $2.60 NO BID $3.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.67
33 | 1160 |CLEANER, STAINLESS STEEL 10| 5369 $5.80 $5.89 544 NO BID $5.57 NO BID $332 $2.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID §7.55
34 | 1165 |CLEANER, OVEN & GRILL 10| $5.07 $3.3 $8.86 $5.06 NO BID $7.10 NO BID $6.13 $3.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.56
35 | 1170 |CLEANSER, POWDER 160 | s145 $1.50 NO BID $3.01 NO BID 132 s2.11 $1.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S2.45
36 | 1195 [DEODORANT, BLOCK 315 | 51500 $1630 NO BID $8.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.49 S12.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.16
37 | J197 [DEODORANT, CARPET 30 [ $397 $39.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID st21 NO BID $6.50
38 | 1200 |DEODORANT, GRANULES 255 | 8997 $10.16 NO BID 282 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.00
39 | J201 |DEODORANT, URINAL SCREE] 25 | siled $19.98 NO BID 52331 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.99 $10.00 NO BID s12.52 NO BID $20.20
20 | J204 |DEODORIZER, SPRAY 350 | s625 5633 NO BID 572 NO BID NO BID NO BID $571 $2.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#1 | J210 |DETERGENT, LAUNDRY 1] $3050 $2896 NO BID 54061 NO BID $30.90 NO BID $36.99 $33.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.00
42 | 1220 |DISINFECTANT, SPRAY 265 | s453 $4.86 NO BID $231 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.73 $3.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.49
43 | 222 |DISINFECTANT, FOAMY CLEA| 1415 | $3.27 s1.17 NO BID $3.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.49
44 | J224 |DISINFECTANT, TOTAL RELE. 1 $9.27 $4.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 | 255 |DUSTMOP, FRAME/HANDLE 30 | NOBID $12.75 NO BID 8.2 NO BID 734 NO BID NO BID $11.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.50
6 | 1260 [DUSTMOP, FRAME/HANDLE 15| NOBID S14.51 NO BID $9.60 NO BID $33.98 NO BID NO BID $12.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.68
47 | 1265 |DUSTMOP, FRAME/HANDLE 10| NOBID 52041 NO BID $10.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.66
48 | 1267 |DUSTMOP, FRAME/HANDLE 1| __NOBID $18.15 NO BID 284 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1690 NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.57
9 | 1279 [HEAD, DUSTMOP 85 | __NOBID S1632 NO BID $3.75 NO BID $11.48 $5.36 NO BID $3.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.99
50 | 1285 [HEAD, DUSTMOP 250 | __NOBID $2025 NO BID $551 NO BID NO BID $8.06 NO BID $5.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2099
51 | J290 |HEAD, DUSTMOP 90 NO BID $22.94 NO BID $8.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.99
52 | 295 |HEAD, DUSTMOP 25| NOBID 52023 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.46
53 | 1310 [HOSE, RUBBER (GARDEN) 25| __NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 | 1335 |LAMP, FLUORESCENT (F34/C 1]|__NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 | 1336 |LAMP, FLUORESCENT (F32T8 1] __NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S133.44 NO BID NO BID
56 | 1380 [LAMP, INCADESCENT 1| __NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.43 NO BID NO BID
57 | 1385 [LAMP, INCADESCENT 1[__NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
56 | 1390 [LAMP, INCADESCENT 1| __NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
59 | 1395 [LAMP, INCADESCENT 1| __noBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 | J#15 [LUBRICANT, MULTIPURPOSE 20| 5953 S12.51 NO BID $5.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.88 NO BID $15.69

Please note shaded areas denote r

i

ded product and pi
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 250206 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
A&S A&S VENADOS
Item Estimated AHI GULF COAST | INTERBORO |LABATTFOOD| MAYFIELD |ODP BUSINESS| SAFEWAY
e Description uantity | ENTERPRIsEs | JANITORIAL | JANITORIAL SAbER e il o iPER e cuppLy |UMIPAKCORP.|  QUILL DISTRIBUTIO |VICCO SUPPLY
SUPPLY SUPPLY (2) N
61 | J420 |LINER, CAN 2,510 $1535 $24.01 NO BID $19.79 $10.72 $12.11 $23.87 $44.06 $12.75 $11.10 $22.90 $13.90 $30.99
62 | J421 |LINER, CAN 775 $26.47 $38.50 NO BID $31.93 $16.68 $25.96 $19.04 NO BID $17.05 $16.85 $22.84 $23.00 $39.99
63 | J424 |LINER, CAN 860 $29.75 $42.08 NO BID $35.76 $20.34 $31.63 $25.00 $19.56 $21.68 $20.88 $55.99 $27.25 $40.99
64 | ]425 |MAT, FLOOR 1 $22.25 $18.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.31 $37.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.29
65 | J430 |MAT, FLOOR 25 $43.50 $42.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.88 $79.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.50
66 | ]435 |[MOP, BOWL 120 $1.27 $2.25 NO BID $1.15 NO BID NO BID $1.30 $1.49 $1.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.26
67 | 440 [MOP, HANDLE (WET) 85 NO BID $24.26 NO BID $7.72 NO BID $27.05 $10.50 $13.45 $10.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.07
68 | J441 |MOP, HANDLE (WOOD) 34| NOBID $9.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.47 $9.99 $14.99 $6.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.99
69 | J445 |MOP, HEAD (24 oz.) 525 NO BID $5.95 NO BID $6.76 NO BID $9.57 $2.85 $12.09 $2.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.08
70 | J446 |MOP, HEAD (16 0z.) 460 | NOBID $4.90 NO BID $4.73 NO BID $3.19 $2.15 $7.69 $2.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.31
71 | J460 |PADS, CLEANING 530 $0.31 5032 NO BID $0.60 NO BID $0.80 NO BID $7.90 $0.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.33
72 | 470 |PAD, POLISHING 1 $3.19 $4.50 NO BID $27.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.99 $3.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.68
73 | J472 |PAD, POLISHING 215 $3.15 $4.30 NO BID $33.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.69 $4.25 NO BID $35.09 NO BID $7.58
74 | 480 |PAD, STRIPPING 25 $3.19 $9.25 NO BID $28.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.29 $3.75 NO BID $59.49 NO BID $7.58
75 | J482 |PAD, STRIPPING 200 $3.15 $5.25 NO BID $6.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.69 $4.25 NO BID $36.04 NO BID $6.68
76 | J485 [PAN, DUST 125 $1035 $21.52 $31.25 $13.27 NO BID $33.98 §7.99 $22.65 $8.10 NO BID $17.24 NO BID $20.99
77 | 1495 |[PLUNGER, TOILET BOWL 35 $4.31 $9.50 $11.50 451 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.08 $4.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.99
78 | 500 |POLISH, FURNITURE 35 $3.65 $3.88 $441 $4.07 NO BID $5.57 NO BID $8.59 $3.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.99
79 | 505 |RAGS, CLEANING 545 $21.99 $9.31 NO BID $13.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.05* NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.99
80 | J510 |RAKE, GARDEN 1 NO BID $39.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.79 NO BID NO BID $25.49 NO BID NO BID
81 | J515 |RAKE, LAWN 1 NO BID $24.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.79 NO BID NO BID $32.60 NO BID NO BID
82 | J520 |[REMOVER, GUM 5 $4.69 $3.93 NO BID $62.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID $78.90 $3.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.99
83 | J522 |REMOVER, MILDEW STAIN 35 $3.45 $4.25 NO BID $4.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.06 $4.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.99
84 | J525 |REMOVER, VANDALISM MARH 40 $6.27 $5.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $100.99 $4.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.99
85 | J530 |[SANITIZER, HAND (LIQUID) 1 $5.09 $23.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.69 $3.90 NO BID $5.69 NO BID NO BID
86 | 550 [SHOVEL, FLAT HEAD 5 NO BID $24.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
87 | J555 |SHOVEL, ROUND HEAD 1 NO BID $24.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
86 | J557 |SIGN, CAUTION (WET FLOOR) 35 $10.45 $7.41 NO BID $12.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.53 $6.98 NO BID $27.20 NO BID $13.99
89 | J558 |SANITIZER, DISPENSER 1 $29.00 $2.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.01 NO BID $67.42 $20.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $117.63
90 | J559 |SANITIZER, REFILL 5 $85.86 $73.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.82 NO BID $49.30 $83.43 NO BID $46.99 NO BID $129.32
91 | 560 [SANITIZER, HAND ANTISEPTI 3. $5.09 $61.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.88 NO BID NO BID $3.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
92 | J561 |SANITIZER, HAND ANTISEPTI 1 $21.95 $68.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.85 NO BID NO BID $23.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
93 | J562 |SOAP, HAND 1,305 $8.79 $11.26 $15.35 $8.15 NO BID $8.91 $11.32 NO BID $10.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.48
94 | J563 |SOAP, DISHWASHING 20 | $145.00 $146.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID $96.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $164.04
95 | 565 |SOAP, HAND 1 $1.39 $51.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.50
96 | J574 |SPONGE, SCRUBBING 1 $16.20 $22.12 $54.18 $44.08 NO BID $11.77 NO BID $49.30 $15.50 NO BID $25.79 NO BID $26.26
97 | 1575 [SPONGES 1 NO BID $29.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID $027 NO BID $2.69 $1.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.09
98 | J580 |SPRAYGUN, PLASTIC 1 $2.09 $18.98 $33.78 $1.49 NO BID $2.38 NO BID NO BID $1.97 NO BID $3.67 NO BID $2.00
99 | J581 |PUMP, PLASTIC 1 $0.89 $3.34 NO BID $1.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.25 NO BID $5.16 NO BID $3.25
100 J615 |STRIPPER, WAX 120 $86.00 $55.68 NO BID $69.48 NO BID NO BID $47.42 $119.47 $51.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $106.52
101 1625-A| TISSUE, TOILET - ECONOMY 2,150 $59.52 $41.56 NO BID $49.33 NO BID $49.25 $35.15 $75.58 $37.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $43.97
102 |1625-B| TISSUE, TOILET - STANDARD 2,150 $59.52 $52.39 NO BID $49.33 NO BID $44.06 NO BID NO BID $40.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $43.97
103 |)625-C| TISSUE, TOILET - PREMIUM 2,150 $59.52 $62.73 NO BID $49.33 NO BID $59.69 NO BID NO BID $44.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $43.97
104] J630 |TISSUE, TOILET FIXTURE 1 $14.95 $17.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.99
105| 1633 | TOWELS, PAPER (MULTI-FOL 405 $23.20 $21.95 NO BID $20.65 NO BID $20.86 $20.12 $25.26 $19.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.00
106] 1635 |TOWELS, PAPER (ROLL) 600 $26.55 $28.71 NO BID $33.49 NO BID $29.84 $20.98 $51.67 $21.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.63
107| J640 |[TREATMENT, DUSTMOP 1 $28.39 $14.95 NO BID $8.33 NO BID $10.97 NO BID NO BID $30.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.00
108| J655 |WAX, FLOOR 525 $69.00 $95.38 NO BID $92.66 NO BID NO BID $64.50 $63.51 $60.10 NO BID $144.65 NO BID $152.90
109 | M429 |GLOVES, DISPOSABLE 205 $1.99 $4.48 NO BID NO BID $0.98 $6.81 $2.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.95
110 | M430 |GLOVES, LATEX 280 NO BID $4.48 NO BID NO BID $2.98 $4.81 $3.38 NO BID $3.42 NO BID NO BID $6.00 $6.50
111| M432 |GLOVES, LATEX 1,395 NO BID $4.48 NO BID NO BID $2.98 $4.81 $3.38 NO BID $3.42 NO BID NO BID $6.00 $6.50
112 | M434 |GLOVES, LATEX 690 | NOBID $4.48 NO BID NO BID $2.98 $4.81 $3.38 NO BID $3.42 NO BID NO BID $6.00 $6.50
113 | M436 |GLOVES, VINYL 1 $3.59 $4.89 NO BID $3.55 $1.89 $3.90 $2.39 $12.09 $2.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.50
114 | M438 |GLOVES, VINYL 335 $3.59 $4.89 NO BID $3.55 $1.89 $3.90 $2.39 $3.00 $2.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.50
115 | M440 |GLOVES, VINYL 515 $3.59 $4.89 NO BID $3.55 $1.89 $3.90 $2.39 $3.00 $2.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.50
116 T995 |WASTEBASKET 1 $5.69 $4.34 $9.27 $7.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.88 $5.55 NO BID $8.14 NO BID $9.97
117| T996 |WASTEBASKET 35 $5.37 $4.34 $9.46 $7.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.36 $5.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.15
118] T997 |WASTEBASKET 40 $9.57 9.28* $11.52 $11.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.43 $9.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.99
119 J180 |DEGREASER, NON-BUTYL 230 $11.97 $11.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.73 $8.69 NO BID $10.70 NO BID $10.98 NO BID $17.30
120 J450 |PAPER, NAPKINS 590 $33.75 $34.55 $41.33 NO BID NO BID $42.81 NO BID NO BID $35.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID $44.50

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 250206 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET _
A&S A&S VENADOS
tem Estimated|  AHI GULF COAST | INTERBORO |LABATTFOOD| MAYFIELD |ODP BUSINESS| SAFEWAY
No. Description Quantity | ENTERPRISES "‘;‘l';‘l’,ﬁ‘“‘ ':Jﬂ:f;‘:‘:;‘ PAPER | PACKAGING | SERVICE PAPER | SOLUTIONS | suppLy |UNPAKCORP.|  QUILL D'STRLBUT"’ YICCO SUPELY

121 M200 | APRONS, DISPOSABLE 265 | $1090 $5631 NO BID NO BID NO BID S62.11 NO BID NO BID $13.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.69

122 M201 |FORKS, PLASTIC 1140 | $9.05 $10.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.67 NO BID 52925 $5.70 NO BID $23.55 NO BID $8.50

123 | M202 [SPOONS, PLASTIC 1965 | 5931 $10.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.67 NO BID $29.25 $5.70 NO BID §36.44 NO BID $8.50

124 | M203 |STRAWS, INDIVIDUAL (UNWR 1 $58.00 $47.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID 26.00* NO BID NO BID $39.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID $108.36
125 M204 |FORKS, STAINLESS STEEL 1|__NOBID $2.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.00
126 M205 [SPOONS, STAINLESS STEEL 1]|__NOBID $2.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.01 NO BID $10.00
127] M206 | BAGS, BUN PAN 130 | $36.00 $32.50 NO BID NO BID §12.82 $15.60 NO BID NO BID 1432 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3649
128 M207 | BAGS, FREEZER 105 | __NOBID $72.50 NO BID NO BID $932 $9.00 NO BID NO BID $9.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID 52849
129 | M208 |BAGS, FREEZER 1] 3995 $52.98 NO BID $23.16 NO BID s1284 NO BID NO BID $28.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.60
130 M209 |BAGS, SANDWICH 1| s2725 1592 NO BID $11.13 1234 $34.18 NO BID NO BID $8.46 NO BID NO BID NO BID §48.24
131 M220 [FILM, PLASTIC (127) 1] s1129 $18.50 NO BID $18.45 NO BID $15.56 NO BID NO BID $12.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.14
132 M221[FILM, PLASTIC 60 | $22.29 $21.49 NO BID $25.53 NO BID $23.21 NO BID NO BID $1695 NO BID NO BID NO BID §37.50
133 | M223 |FOIL, ALUMINUM 25 | 53337 $63.03 NO BID $67.28 NO BID $60.87 NO BID $43.99 $64.98 NO BID $70.76 NO BID 57933
134] M225 | FOIL, SHEET 910 | $1035 $58.50 NO BID $13.06 NO BID $9.11 NO BID NO BID $9.70 NO BID NO BID $8.00 $8.00

135 M226 | FOIL, SHEET 630 | 797" $61.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID $82.65 NO BID 524684 $11.85 NO BID NO BID 51230 $11.00
136 M240 |LINERS, PAN 105 | $67.49 $78.50 NO BID $13.88 NO BID $45.79 NO BID NO BID §52.25 NO BID $7076 NO BID $55.00
137 M245 |NETS, HAIR 25 |__NOBID $55.99 NO BID $102.20 5934 $7.02 NO BID NO BID $31.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5385

138 M250 [SACK, LUNCH 220 |__NOBID $19.75 NO BID $32.01 NO BID $22.94 NO BID NO BID $19.95 NO BID $23.53 NO BID $18.07
139 | M255 |SPONGE, HEAVY-DUTY STAIN 45 | __NOBID $21.50 NO BID $17.99 NO BID 5578 NO BID 5693 $6.75 NO BID $30.64 NO BID s7.41

140 M259 | TOWEL, FOOD SERVICE 85 | _NOBID $55.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID s42.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.99
141| M260 [ TRAY, BREAKFAST 1] 2095 $37.50 NO BID $33.46 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $65.00
142] M261 [TRAY, OFFER/SERVE 165 |__NOBID NO BID NO BID §38.62 NO BID $32.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.26
143 | M262 [TRAY, SCHOOL LUNCH 3125 | 83473 $37.50 NO BID $31.66 NO BID $29.45 NO BID NO BID $2720 NO BID NO BID $29.00 $54.00
144 | M426 |GLOVES, RUBBER 1]__NoBID $21.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 213 NO BID NO BID 335 NO BID NO BID NO BID §18.49
145 | M427 |GLOVES, RUBBER 30| _NOBID $21.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.13 NO BID NO BID $335 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.49
146 M428 | GLOVES, RUBBER 1|__NOBID $21.50 NO BID NO BID NOBID 52.13 NO BID NO BID $335 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1849
147 M#42 [SANITARY NAPKINS 10| s4825 $56.77 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.00 $46.00 NO BID $41.99 NO BID $68.13
148 | PPEOL|MASK, DISPOSABLE, STUDEN| 1] 1599 $4.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5253 NO BID NO BID $14.68 NO BID NO BID
149 | PPE02|MASK, DISPOSABLE, ADULT 1] 1999 $1.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.00 170 NO BID $9.49 NO BID NO BID
150 PPEO3|MASK, REUSABLE, STUDENT 1] NOBID 52,99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.02 NO BID NO BID
151 | PPE04|MASK, REUSABLE, ADULT 1 NO BID $2.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.19 NO BID NO BID
152 | PPEOS|SHIELD, FACE (REUSABLE) 1| __NOBID $55.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 155 NO BID $24.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
153 | PPE0G| THERMOMETER 1| s1795 $16.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.00 NO BID NO BID $5.99 NO BID NO BID

Proposal Notes:

Prices are per unit cost
* Not bid as specified
** minimum order quantity/weight requirement on orders

Approval: Mr. Samuel Mijares, Superintendent of Schools

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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