Proposal Tabulation For Project 20130304-56

Base Proposal 1 Fred

Base Proposal 2 Denton

Lump Sum Proposal 1

Bidders Moore High Alternate Proposal 2A Alternate Proposal 2B Alternate Proposal 2C Both Schools
Anchor Roofing No Bid $3,418,575.00 $202,400.00 $257,600.00 $193,200.00 N/A
Benco Roofing $404,400.00 $2,617,000.00 $147,800.00 $160,000.00 $104,500.00 $3,021,400.00
CBS Roofing $319,000.00 $2,395,000.00 $110,000.00 $135,000.00 $95,000.00 $2,694,000.00
CS Advanatge Roofing $290,000.00 $2,452,000.00 $145,000.00 $170,000.00 $140,000.00 $2,742,000.00
Heritage One Roofing $387,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Rain Seal Roofing $416,500.00 $2,856,400.00 $179,900.00 $173,150.00 $208,450.00 $3,272,900.00
Saratoga Roofing $467,200.00 $3,094,172.00 $187,895.00 $253,810.00 $143,128.00 $3,536,372.00




Denton HS and Fred Moore Re-Roof RFP

Project 20130304-56

Total Anchor Heritage
Possible | Roofing CBS CS One Rain Seal | Saratoga
Criteria Points Systems Benco Roofing | Advantage | Roofing Master Roofing
Proposed Fee 53 48 51 53 52 48 50 49
Quality of the proposer's good and
services 10 10 9 10 9 9 10 9
a. Does the proposer have an experience
level and equipment available to perform Did not include Did not include all | Did not include Did not include
the required tasks? all submittals submittals all submittals all submittals
b. Did the proposer include all submittals
requested?
References 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5
The extent to which the services meets
the district's needs and approach of
the vendor 10 9 9 10 9 9 10 10
Subs out ; Tends Not able to
Can'tdo in time | Tends to be late All inhouse to be late complete
Past Relationship with the district 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10
Has the district had any bad experiences?
HUB Certified 2 2 0 0 2 0 0 0
Does the proposer have a Historically
Underutilized Business Certification?
Long term cost to the district to
acquire the vendor's service 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10
Possible Points: 100 94 94 98 97 91 95 93
Ranking: 4 4 1 2 6 3 5




