Organization ECISD Purchasing
Bid Creetor Rebecca Mull Director of Purchasing
Emall
Phone (432) 334-7187
Fax (432) 331-7828
Bid Request Number Bid 09-043
Title Classroom Equipment
Description
Bid Type BID
Open Date 6/8/2009 8:00:00 AM Central
Close Date 6/26/2009 2:00:00 PM Central
Need by Date
Line Quantity UOM Description M Manuf. Number Award P Award Quantity |Awarded Suppl Award Reason
10 1 EA Projector - 2500 Lumens ANSI-XGA 1024 x 768 Resolutnon Infocus 2104EP 533 1]Abacus Comp Inc. Lowest Bidder
20 1 EA Projector - 2500 Lumens ANSI-XGA 800 X 600 In Focus 2102EP 425 1|Abacus Comp Inc. Lowesl Bidder
3.0 1 EA Projector Ceiling Mount Universat for InFocus Projector 2 1]Abacus Computers Inc Lowest 8id did not meet sp
4.0 1 EA Man Pult-up/Pull-down Projection Screen 84" Screen with 84 67.73 1|COWG Lowes1 bid
50 1 EA Man Pull-up/Puli-dawn Projection Screen . 100" Screen with 1 83.21 1|COWG Lowes! bid
6.0 1 EA Document Camera Memory Card SD memory card ready (r ELMO HV-5100XG 1825 1]COWG Lowest bid
70 1EA Digital Camera._Megaxpixels 8.0, XP & Vista Compatible . .1 126.09 1|COWG Lowest bid
8.0 1 EA Dig'nal Camcorder Hard Drive 30GB,Rec 387.99 CDWG Lowest bid
9.0 1 EA ion Cener?Media Cartfor Large Projectors with lockit 192 AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE|Lowest bid
0.0 1 EA Compmer Headphones Without Microphone _must be oompa 1.4 CDWG Lowest bid
0 1 EA Computer Head| s Compatible wiwith mi 3. ACP Direct Lowest bid
20 1 EA GPS Systam Garmin _ Approximate Dimensions: 4"x2"x Garmin 14 CDWG Lowest bid
0 1 EA UHF Wireless Headset and Mic System  Wireless headsel 13 191 1{AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE]Lowest bid
14.0 1EA 2.4 Ghz Cordless Presenter  LCD limer, buitt in 35 QUILL CORPORATION Lowest bid
15.0 1EA Digital Flip Video Camcorder Ura AV cable, LCD dlsﬂg[f 126.5 AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE|Lowest bid
16.0 1 EA Listening Center (8 positions w/ivolume control) 48 Valiant IMC Lowest bid
17.0 1EA CD Player/Cassette Player Recorder Boombox 30, 1|COWG Lowes! bid
18.0 1 EA Laminator (Heat) Heatseal Ultima 65 1419.95 1]|Pyramid School Products Lowesl bid
8.0 1 EA Utility Cart 3-shetf with outlets 81 1}Valiant IMC Lowest bid
0.0 1E Flat Panel T i and Wall Mounting Kits 377 TV 840.7: 1]CDWG Lowest bid
1.0 1 EA Flat Panel Televisions and Wall Mounting Kit 26" Television 407 1{vakant IMC Lowest bid
22.0 1 EA DVDACR Combo P! 7 1{AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE(Lowest bid
23.0 1 EA DVD Players +/- Recorders 114 1|AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTElLowest bid
240 1EA DVD Home Theater System _ DVD Player/AV Receiver Surmo 17 1]Valiant IMC Lowest bid




ECISD Pur

Bid Crestor  Rebecta Mud Ovector of Purchening
Emait

Phona (432) 3347987

Fux 143213317820

Bt Ruquest Number 643 900045 Addendum 3
Tite Athierc EQuipment
Description

Bl Type 8D

Open Date /1772000 8 00 00 AM Contre)
Clows Date 71212009 4 00 00 PM Centra!
Nesd by Date

[Rewponding Suppliers

Nams Ty Ste Note 1o Buyer ore Submitied arme em Offer Forv Fetany e Certificats AMidavit ¢ Confiict of Imavest Quastionnaire(Required)
ALUMINUM ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT CO ROYERSFOR PA 81182008 1 10 53 PM Corral T have rem ) canly ey aluminum [ certify 1| h#ve comphet wih e fequaements
Athietic Supply. Inc ests ™ 812972000 4 01 42 PM Caniral 1 have 1w | Cornily thy My comps The pancy | certy | have compled wih M raquirements
BSN SportwCallegmie Pacific Oulias i F OB Destraton/ Net 30 day / 10 - 30 days aro/ prices do not include 1 6/26/2000 3 18 37 P Centrel 1 have rows | certly th MY COMF 1901 DIPL { cartfy | have complled with the requirements
Commrciat lce Machine Company Ocesss ™ | harve acded the prce los a storage bin end 3 bin sdsoter to ox 4 option £/17/2009 4 50 51 PM Cantral Vhave o | Conlily thi nome  Odwssa Te 1 carty | have complied with he requrrements
Medco Suoply Compeny Chicago w Plasse referonce Madco bed number 100200550 Sew soucisl tem notes 6/30/2009 8 07 22 AM Ceraral ( have reer | coftify Iy Pubicly H: New York | cerdy | have complied with he requirements
Stadum Sporis Midiano ™™ 71120089 2 25 55 PM Cortie! ) have res | certly the NONE migiend te | cortity ! have camphed with the requiremants
[Line t CNECor  Carryall Turl Turf Vehick _Gas Power, 4-cycle engine, 115 with ©
Namo QTY UOW UmiPree  Erended | Migr MigNo ‘Aneimate Specibeetion Note 10 Buyer
Alhistic Supply, Inc 1 EA No Bid
BSN Sposis/Collemrete Pacriic 1EA No Bid
ALUMINUM ATHLETICEQUI 1 EA  NoBd
Medea Supply Compeny 1EA  NoBd
Stadum Sporty 1EA  NoBd
[Line 2 Goal Posts:. . 72" setback; 48" ground bury: § /18 OD schedule 40| ]
Neme OTY UOM UnfPrge  Exterded Migr MigNo ARernsie Specdicstion Nots 1o Buyer
Athlete Supply, Inc 1 EA a148 6148
ALUMINUM ATMLETIC EQUI 1 EA 7835 835 AAE ASG-HS/, AAE FOOTBALL GOAL POST HAS A LIFE TIME WARRANTY 20° UPRIGHTS OF 4" OD.5-72 DA HEAVY WALL ALUMINUM CROSSBAR EIGHT FOOT OFFSET CENTERPOST FABRICATED 2INC CGATED SRIMED STEEL WHITEIYELLOW F
Medco Supply Company Y EA  MoBa
Stadium Spora 1 EA No B
B5N Sports/Colkegisie Pectfic t EA Ne B
Line 3 FB-2005 G 50" W10 0" DG A" |
QTY UOM UndPrce  Extended Mtgr MigNo ANernate Specificenan Note to Buyer
Athistic Supply, Inc 1EA  NoBW
BSN Sporta/CoRegiate Pecic 1EA No Bd
ALLMINUM ATHLETIC ECUIl 1 EA No Bid
Medco Supply Company 1EA  NoBd
Stedum Sporls 1EA No Bid
[Cinea T O Matic  GEMOBS0A _ios maker _ Must produce 700 pounds in & 74 hour period 1500 vo
Nome OTY UOM UntPrics  Emended  Migr MigNo “ARernate Specification Note 1o Buyer
Medco Supply Company 1 EA 3040 $304D DO o1 Seateman ice machine onfy Model COB30SA 776 [bs production Pleass spectly ewrcooled of wateicocled Bin optons betow  Bin Optian 1 BSI0P S858 00 Scowman b for CDB30SA $38 Lb capechty Does nol requare cannecting ket Bin Optior
Commercisl Ice Machine Corm 1 EA 317925 37925 As & Option thy s § $742 50 end Ibe stminless sleel bin saapter for tha 22° machine 1o 11 8 30" bin 1s 3130 5D all components sre atotel sum of $4 052 25 end The warranly is Iyears pars and labar 5 yrs compressor
Stadwm Sporty 1TEA  NoBio
Attietic Supply. Inc 1 EA No B
BSN Spora/Cofugure Pectfic 1 EA No Brg
ALUMINUM ATHLETICEQUIL 1 EA No B
Line s Slazer 1284 Olympic Pole VeuR Vaius Package ]
me UQM UnAPrics  Extendad g Migho ARemais Specificetion Nate 1o Buyer
ALUMINUM ATHLETIC EQUE 1 EA 15040 15040 AAE SPV-32XLI2IEX24XIZ WITH A 2'SKIRTED TOP PAD, SWC-12XLIWEATHER COVER) PYS-HSX( T 10 19'.SIDE PADS INCLUDED WiTH AAE PITS 2 XG5 CROSSBARS AAE'S PACKAGE HAS A LIFE. TIME WARRAMTY
Aunietc Supply. Inc 1 EA 25420 25420
BSN SportwCallegmte Pacrfic 1 EA L) 0 ALT PORTAPIT
Medco Supply Company TEA  NoBu
ALUMINUM ATHLETIC EQUI 1 EA 13095 13095 AAE SPV-10XL/PA AAE SAME AS THE ABOVE PACKAGE, WTH EXCERTION OF THE PIT SAME AS ABOVE PACKAGE WITH EXCEPTION TO PIT HEIGHT 30" WITH SKIRTED BREATHER COVER THE 32 PIT HAS A Z'SKIRTED TOP PAD
BSN Sporta/Collegrete Pacific 1 EA 1411921 1411921 PORTAPIT GP2222X37 1 POLE VAULT VALUE PACK 8 ) PORTAPIT 22' X 22' X 37 peck inciud ALT BSN/CP PP 285 PORT A PIT



Organizstion  ECISD Purchasing
Bid Creator Rebecca Mull Diractor of Purchasing

Email
Phone (432) 3347187
Fax (432) 331-7829
Bid Request Number Bid 08-043
Title Classroom Equipment
Description
Bid Type -1}
Open Date 61872009 8 00 00 AM Central
Close Date 8/26/2009 2 00 00 PM Central
Need by Date
ndiny liers

Name City State Note 10 Buyer Response mitted ECISD Te1 Offer Forn Felony Co AFFIDAVY Certificats Conflict of Pricing will be good through December 31
Abacus Computers Inc Midiand TX 872672009 1.29°41 PM Centra! Yes. | agre | certity the No & No (/| certify the Texas Res | will comp | agree to lhese terms.
ACP Direct Dallas ™ All POs must reference "Clessroom Equipment bid 09-043" 6/26/2009 12:24:27 PM Central Yes. | agre | certfy the My firm is 1 | cartify the | certify ths | will comp ( agree to these terms.
All Pro Sound, Inc Pensecola  FL 6/1172009 4 1243 PM Central Yes. | agre | certfy the not ownad [ certity the non-reside | will comp | agree to these terms.
AUDID VISUAL AIDS CORP San Antonio TX /2372009 11:24 11 AM Central Yas. | agre | certrly the My firm 13 1 | certrty the | cartify the | will comp ( agree to thase terms.
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS. INC SUGAR LANC TX 6/25/2009 2:53:20 PM Central Yas. | agre | cartify the CORPORY | certify the RESIDEN" | will comp | agree to these terms.
Batts Audio, Video & Lighting. inc Denisan ™ 672612009 1-49:34 PM Central Yes. | agre | certify the My firm is 1 | cartty the Resient | will comp | agree to lhese terms
bookbinding & laminating inc fubbock ™ 6/15/2009 2 28:48 PM Cantral Yes. | agre | certify the my firm 13 1 | certfy the texas owni | will comp | egree to these terms
CDWG Chicago L This offer is based on the contract pricing n place betwaen CDW Govemn 672572009 1.06:08 PM Certrai Yes, | agre | certity the To the bes | carity the Vemon Hil | will comp | agree lo these terms.
Long?s Efectronics, Inc Irondale AL Delivery 7-31 days Terms net30 days  Orders must be over $100 to 672572009 5 05:37 PM Central Yes. } agre | certify the NO X Ye | certify the Non-reside | wii comp | agree to these terms
Pyramd School Products Tampe FL ***Our bid reference number for this project i1s #09-043(ECTOR} This nu 8/25/2009 2 53 56 PM Central Yes. | agre | certy the My firm 18 1 | cartity the We are no | will comp | agree lo Lhese terms
QUILL CORPORATION PHILADELPH PA QUILL BID ATTACHMENTS SENT VIA UPS 6/23/2009 149 12 PM Central Yes.  agre | certy the My firm 1s : | certily the NON RES! | will comp | agree to these terms
Rhythm Band Instruments, LLC FotWorth  TX 6/1072009 5:04:25 PM Central Yes. | agre | certify the My firm s 1 | certify the | cartify thi | will comp | agree to these terms
Southwast TV & Appliance Odessa T 6/8/2009 3 23 08 PM Central Yes. | agre | cartity the no { cartity the resident o« | wili comp | agree to these terms
Valant IMC South Hacken NJ 672512009 10'29.40 AM Central Yes. | agre | certity the No my firm | cartify the Non-Resid | will comp | agree to these terms
Line 1 Infocus 2104EP Projector - 2500 Lumens ANSI-XGA 1024 x 768 Resolution
Name QTY UOM UnitPnce  Extended  Mfgr MfgNo Altemate Spacification Note to Buyer Projector - 2500 Lumens ANSI-XGA 1024 x 768 Resolution{Required)
Abacus Computers Inc 1EA 5; 533 533
COWG 1EA 534 534 534 00
QUILL CQRPORATION 1EA 810 810 #BID-TECH-2018312 INFOCUS IN2104EP 7 10 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVERY 610 00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA 818 618 IN2104EP 618.00
valant IMC 1EA 6194 6194 £19 40
Batts Audio, Video & Lighting, 1EA 835 635 635 00
Long?s Electroncs Inc 1EA 649 649 649 00
ACP Drrect 1EA No Bd
SouthWest TV & Appliance 1EA  NoBd
Pyrsmid School Products 1EA No Bd
Rhythm Band instruments, L1 1EA No Bid
AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 EA No Bd
All Pro Sound. inc 1EA No 8id

2 In Focus 2102EP Projector - 2500 Lumens ANSI-XGA 800 X 600
Name QTY UOM Uit Pnce  Extended  Mfgr MigNo ‘Alternate Specrication Note to Buyer
CDWG 1 EA 425 425
Abacus Computers Inc. 1EA 425 425
AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA 449 449 aiso suggesting Proxima A1100 $421 00 ea Same projector same lamp
Long?s Electronics, Inc 1EA 479 479
Vahant IMC 1EA 4935 493 5
QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 495 495 #BID-TECH-2016311 INFOCUS IN2102EP  3-5 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVERY
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA 496 496 IN2102EP
Batis Audw, Video & Lighting. 1EA 508 509
Pyramid School Products 1EA  NoBid
ACP Dwect 1 EA No Bid
Southwest TV & Appliance 1 EA No 8
Rhythm Band Instruments. LL' 1EA No Bid
All Pro Sound, Inc 1EA No Bid
Line 3 Universai for Projector Cedling Mourt
Name QTY UOM UniPrnce  Extended  Migr MfaNo ‘Allemnate Specification Note to Projector Ceiling MountiRaquired)
All Pro Sound. Inc 1EA 8338 8338 vmp universal projactor mount pm-3 8328
Abacus Computers Inc. 1EA 2 82 92
CDWG 1EA 99 99 InFocus SP-CEIL-UNIV  Mfg Part: SP-CEIL-UNIV | COW Part 818767 | UNSPSC 3116231 99 00
AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA 107 107 Peeriess PRG-UNV 107 00
Vabant IMC 1 EA 109 47 109 47 109 47
Long?s Electronics, inc 1EA 15 115 Quoting Pearless PRSUNV 115.00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA 120 120 CHIEF RPAU 12000




Batts Audio, Video & Lighting, 1EA 125 125 PBC-UMW 125.00
QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 135 135 #B8ID-TECH-8SP-CEIL-UNIV INFOCUS UNIVERSAL CEILING MOUNT 2.3 BUSINESS DAYS 135 00
Rhythm Band Instruments. LLi 1 EA  No Bid

Pyramd School Products 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1EA  NoBid

Southwest TV & Appliance 1EA  NoBid
[Une 4 Man Pull-up/Pull-down Projection Screen 84~ Scraen with 84" Wail

Name QTY UOM UntPrice  Extended  Mfgr MigNo Atemate Specfication Nota to Buyer Man Pull-up/Puli-down Projection Screen - 84"(Optional)
CDWG 1 EA 8773 6773 AccuScreen Manual Screen proection screen - 84in Mig Parl 800010 | COW Part 122388

Abacus Computers Inc 1EA 88 88 DA-LITE (MF#74847)  B4IN DIA MODEL B MANUAL SCREEN MATTE WHITE 4 3 SOX67IN

Al Pro Sound, Inc 1 EA 9245 9245 Draper puil down screen B4xB4” 9245
Pyramid School Products 1 EA 11375 11375 DRAPER #207004 & 227212 1375
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA 19 19 DRAPER V SCREEN W/ 6 INCH BRACKET 119 00
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA 135 135 Da-lite (DAL40197/40932)

Valiant MC 1 EA 154 154 Draper 207004 w/AWS 154 00
QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 185 185 #BID-TECH-H768108 DA LITE 92917  7-10 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVERY 185 00
Batts Audio, Video & Lighting. 1EA 225 225 Da-Lite Model B w/CSR (Controlled Screen Retum) 85300 22500
ACP Drract 1EA  NoBu

SouthWest TV & Appliance 1EA  NoBid

Rhythm Band instuments. LL 1 EA  No Bid

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA  NoBu

[Gine s Man Pull-upPull-down Projection Screen 100" Screen with 100" W

Name QTY (UOM Und Pnce  Extended  Mfar #4faNo ‘Aftemate Specific Note 1o Buyer #an Pullup/Puil-down Projection Scresn(Optional]
CDWG 1EA 8321 8321 AccuScreen Manual Screen projsction screen - 100 0 Mfg. Part: 800002 | CDW Pert 122381

Abacus Computers inc 1€ a8 88 DA-LITE (MF#40194) 100N DIA MODEL B MANUAL SCREEN MATTE WHITE 4 3 60X80IN

Pyramd School Products 1EA 10595 105 95 DRAPER #207009 & 227212 10595
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA 109 109 DRAPER LUMA 100" WITH 6" BRACKET 109 00
Long?s Electronics. Inc 1EA 123 123 Ouoling Da-itte (DAL40184/40832)

Vatiant IMC 1EA 152 152 Draper 207009 wAWS 152 00
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 450 450 #BID-TECH-BC6010 DA LITE BCBO10  7-10 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVERY 450 00
Batts Audra. Video & Lighting, 1EA a 0 “see afternate” 265 00
ACP Direct 1EA  NoBd

SouthWest TV & Apphance 1EA  NoBid

Rhythe 8and (nstruments. LL' 1EA  NoBd

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA  NoBid

All Pro Sound. Inc 1EA  NoBd o bid
Bans Audio Videa & Lighting, 1EA 285 265 Da-Lite 85308 Da-Lrte Model 8 w/CSR (Controlled Screen Retum) 96"x96" 265 00
[Line s ELMO HV-5100XG _Document Camera _Memory Card SD memory card ready [includesy’

Name QTY UOM Unit Prce Extended Mfgr MfgNo Allernate Specification Note to Buyer Documert Camera|Optional)
CDWG 1EA 1825 1825

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA 1868 1868 ELMO HV5100XG 1888 00
Abacus Computars Inc 1 EA 1682 1882

ACP Direct 1 EA 1895 1895 As spec'd

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 EA 2014 2014

valiant IMC 1EA 2040 2040 2040
Long?s Electronics. Inc 1 EA 2070 2070

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 2450 2450 #BID-TECH-HV5100X8 ELMO HV5100XG 2.3 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVERY 2450 DO
Rhythm Band Instrumants. LL 1 EA  NoBd

All Pro Sound. inc 1EA  NoBud

SouthWast TV & Appliance 1EA  NoBig

Pyramid Schoo! Products 1EA  NoBd

Bans Audio, Video & Lighting, 1 EA ] a *s8@ aftemate® 583 DO
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA 512 512 ELMO £00-947.3566 (1) EA , DOCUMENT CAMERA_ ELMO MODEL TTO2S OFFER (1} ELMO TT02S, STOCK # 403023 1866 00
Batts Audio. Video & Lighting, 1 EA 583 583 AverMedia  VISIAFPLS 300+ ELMO camera flexible neck document camera with VGA pass-through 583 00
Line 7 Digital Camera  Megaxpixeis B.0, XP & Vista Compatible image R

Name QTY JOM Unit Pnca Exianded Mfgr MtaNa Alternate Specification Note to Buyer Digital Camera(Optional}
CDWG 1 EA 126 09 126 09 Canon PowerShot A480 - digilal camera  Mfg Pari. 34748001 | COW Part 1692215 | UNSF

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA 135 135 CANON POWERSHOT A1000  OFFER SONY DSC-S950 AS ALTERNATE $130 00 135 00
Valiam 1MC 1 EA 1835 1835 Canon Powershot A1100IS 183 50
Batts Audio, Video & Lighting 1EA NoBw

Pyramut School Products 1EA  NoBu

Abacus Computars Inc 1 EA No B

Rhythm Band Instruments, LL 1 EA No B

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA  NoBid

All Pro Sound. Inc 1EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA  NoBd

Long?s Electronics. Inc. 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1EA  NoBd

SouthWast TV & Apphance 1EA  NoBid



[Une s Digitai Cameorder. 21 " ‘Hard Drive?Minimum 30GB,Recomment ]

Name QTY UOM UnitPrics  Extended Mfor Migho Alemate Specification Note 16 Buyer Digital Camcorder{Optional)
COWG 1 EA 387.99 387 99 Sony Hendycam DCR SR47/R - camcorder - hard disk drive - Mfg Part: DCRSR47/R | CDW F
Valiant IMC 1EA 192 382 INC GZ-MGBIAUS 352 00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA 398 308 SONY DCR-SR47 HYBRID HARD DISK & MEMORY STICK 398 00
QUILL CQRPORATION 1EA 850 850 WBID-TECH-GZHD300R JVC EVERIO GZHD300 HD CAMCORDER  3-7 BUSINESS DAYS F( 850 00
Long?s Electronics, Inc 1EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1EA No Bid

SouthWest TV & Appliance 1 EA  NoBid

Rhythm Band Instruments, LL+ 1EA No Bid

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA  NoBu

All Pro Sound, Inc. 1EA NoBwd

Abacus Computers Inc 1EA  NoBid

Batts Audio, Video & Lighting, 1EA No Bid

Pyramid School Products 1EA No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA 398 398 PANASONIC 201-348.7000 OFFER (1) DIGITAL CAMCORDER. PANASONIC MODEL SDRHB0K OFFER (1) PANASONIC SDRHBOK, STOCK PANADY 3388 00
Line 9 Presantation Center?Media Cartfor Large Projectors with locking cab |

Nar UOM  Untt Prica Extended Migr Migho Altemate Specification Note to Buyer Presentation Center - Media Cart{Optional}
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA 192 192 BRETFORD CA2B42NSE 192 00
COWG 1EA 3251 3251 Da-Lte PIXMotwe AVCT2C42J -can  Mfg Part 6315 | COW Part 1823350 | UNSPSC 58

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 350 350 #BID-TECH-OHT42PSC LUXOR  3-7 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVERY 35000
Long?s Electronics. Inc 1EA  NoBid

ACP Direct 1EA No Bid

SouthWest TV & Appliancs 1EA  NoBid

Batts Audio, Video & Lighting, 1EA No B

Pyramid School Products 1EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1EA No Bd

Rhythm Band (nstruments LL! 1EA No Bid

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA No Bid

All Pro Sound. Inc 1EA  NoBd
[Line 10 Computer Headphones Without Microphone  must be compatible w |

Name UOM  Unrt Prea Extended Miar Migho Altemate Specification Note to Buyer Computer without Optional)
COWG 1EA 143 143 COBY CV H47 - heedphones  Mfg Part CVH47 | CDW Pert 1771817 | UNSPSC 5218151

ACP Direct 1EA 23 23 Labsonic LS400 Sample availabie upon request

Vatiant IMC 1EA 299 299 Hamitton MS2L 299
Pyramid Schoal Products 1EA 579 579 CALIFONE #3088AV 579
Long?s Electronis. inc 1EA 85 85 Catfora (CLF3088AV)

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 12 12 #BID-TECH-33137Q KENSINGTON HIFI HEADPHONES  2-3 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVE 12 00
All Pro Sound, Inc, 1 EA 17 96 17 96 ath-p1 audio-technica headphone 1798
Rhythm Band instruments, LL 1 EA No Bid

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA No Bid

SouthWest TV & Appliance 1 EA No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA No Bid

Batts Audio. Video & Lighting, 1EA  Noad

Abacus Computers Inc 1EA  NoBd

Line 11 Computer Headphomnes Compatible wiwith microphone  Dell Comp: 1

Name UOM  uUnnt Prce Extended Migr MigNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

ACP Direct 1 EA 35 35 Labsonic LS350 Sample evailable upon request

Vahant IMC 1 EA 39 39 Hamikton HAZM

CDWG 1EA 712 72 Cyber Acoustics AC 101 - headset  Mig Part AC-109 | CDW Part 754184 | UNSPSC 43191609 Headset ( semi-open )
QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 9 9 #BID-TECH-580238 LABTEC MONO 341 2 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVERY

Long?s Electronics. inc 1EA 195 19§ Calfona (CLFI0BBAV)

Pyramid School Products 1 EA 1598 1998 CALIFONE #3068AV

Abacus Computers inc. 1 EA No Ba

Rhythm Band Instruments. LL« 1EA  NoBi

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 EA No Bid

All Pro Sound, Inc. 1 EA Na Big

SouthWest TV & Appliance 1 EA  NoBw

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA No Bid

Batts Audio, Video & Lightng. 1 EA No 8

Line 12 Garmin GPS System Garmin Approximate Dimeneions: 4"x2"°x1" R« }

Name UOM UnitPnce  Extended Mige MigNo Ahernate Specrfication Nots 1o Buyer GPS System{Optional)
CowG 1 EA 147 147 min eTrex Venture HC - GPS receiver  Mfg Part 010-00632-00 | CDW Part 1300077 | L
Abacus Computers Inc 1EA 188 166 Garmmin, Ld (MF#010-00833)  eTrex Summit HC Porlable Navigator

Rhythm Band Instruments, LUt 1 EA No Bid

AUD!O VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 EA No Bd

Al Pro Sound, Inc 1EA  NoBid



QUILL CORPORATION 1EA  NoBd
Long?s Electronics. Inc 1EA No Bid

ACP Dirwct 1EA No Bid

Sovthwest TV & Apphance 1EA  NoBid

AVESAUDIO VISUALSYSTE 1 EA  No Bid

Batts Audio, Video & Lighting. 1 EA No Bid

Pyramid School Products 1EA  NoBid

Vvaliant IMC 1EA  NoBid
[Uine 13 o UHF Wirsless Handset and Mic Svstam _ Wirelass headset system w

Name Qry VYot Prica Extended Mfar MigNo Aftemate Speciffication Note to Buyer

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA 191 191 AUDID TECHNICA ATW-701H e irolass Hosdsat and Mic Systsm{Optional)
Abacus Computers Inc 1 EA 206 208 Plantromes Inc (MFRCS7ON-HL 10} WIRELESS HEADSET SYSTEM W/ LIFTER FOR OFFICH

All Pro Sound, Inc 1 EA 21677 21677 Audio-Techmica ATW-701/L LAVALIER WIRELESS SYSTEM 0877
Long?s Electronics, Inc 1 EA 442 442 Sennheiser (SNH EW1526G2)

Batts Audio. Video & Lighting 1EA 845 645 Audio Technica ATW-2120 beltpack wireless microphone system, 10 chennel. UHF with clip-on ¢ 845 00
Pyramid School Products 1EA  NaoBid

Vatiant IMC 1EA  NoBig

CDWG t1EA  NoBid

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA NoBu

Rhytnm Band Instruments, LL¢ 1 EA No Bid

AUDID VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA  NoBd

ACP Direct 1EA  NoBd

Southwest TV & Apphance 1EA  NoBid
[Cina 14 2.4 Ghz Cordless Presentsr LD timer, built in shdeshow controls,

e QTY UOM UnitPnce  Extanded  Mige MigNo Altemate Specdication Note 10 Buyer 2.4 Ghz Cordless Presenter{Dptional)
L CORPORATION 1EA 35 S #BID-TECH-33374Q KENSINGTON WIRELESS PRESENTER WITH LASER POINTER 2 BU235 00

Valiant IMC 1EA 1898 3898 Atek RM200 B8
Abacus Computers Inc 1EA aa 44 LOGITECH (MF#931307-0403) CORDLESS PRESENTER 2 4GHZ USB LCD TIMER LASER

COWG 1EA a7 a7 Logitech Wireless 2 4 GHz Presanter  Mfg Part 931307-0403 | COW Part 745853 | UNSPS
Rhythm Band Insiruments, LL! 1 EA No Bid

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA No Bid

All Pro Sound. Inc 1EA No Bl

Long?s Electronis. Inc 1EA No Bid

ACP Drrect 1EA  NoBid

Southwest TV & Appliance 1EA  NoBid

AVES AUOIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA  No Bid

Batts Aucdro  Video & Lightng 1EA Na Bid

Pyramid School Products 1EA  Nabid
[Line 15 Uhra ANV cable, LCD display71.5" col

Name QTY UOM \nt Price Exiended Mfgr MigNo Aftemate Specfication Nole to Buyer Digital Flip Video Camcorder Utra{Optional)
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA 12685 1265 FLIP VIDEO F260 ULTRA 126 50
Valiant IMC t EA 134 134 Fip U208 134 00
Abacus Computers Inc 1 EA 135 135 Pure Digital Fhip Ulira Video Camcorder (MF¥U1120B}  widgb flash. 2° LCD screen, USB, ANV ¢
COWG 1EA 154 150 PURE Digtei Flip Mino F360 - camcorder - flash cerd  Mfg Pan F360W | CDW Part 152428

Hatts Audo_ Video & Lighting. 1EA  No B

Pyramid School Products 1 EA No Big

Rhythm Band Instruments LL t EA No Big

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA  NoBig

All Pra Sound, Inc 1 EA No Big

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA  NoBid

Long?s Electronics, Inc 1EA  NoBid

ACP Direct 1EA  NoBid

Southwest TV & Applisnce t EA  NoBid

Line 18 Listening Centar (8 positians wivolume control) — 1

Name QrY UOM Untt & Extended Migr MigNo Altemate Speciication Note to Buyer Listening Center (8 positions wivolume contro{Optional}
Vatiant IMC. 1EA 49 49 Hamilton MPC-29PC-8VFKit 48 00
Long?s Elsctromics inc 1 EA 64 64 Caifone (CLF 1218AV)

Pyramid Schoo! Products 1EA 68.95 68 95 CALIFONE #1218AVP-01 68 95
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA 68 68 CALIFONE 1218AVPO1 68 00
ACP Dract 1EA 104 95 104 95 Labsonic LC250-8 powered listening center

Rhythm Band Instumants. LL¢ 1EA 138 68 138 68 Calfone 1218AVPS-01 Erght stereo 2924AVPS headphones wih storaga case

AUDIO VIS UAL AIDS CORP 1EA  NoBid

All Pro Sound. Ine 1EA  NoBid

QuILL CORPORATION 1EA  NoBid

Batts Audio, Video & Lighting. 1EA  NoBid

SouthWest TV & Appliance 1EA  NoBd

COWG 1EA  No B

Abacus Computars Inc 1 EA No Bid

ACP Dwect (Alt 1) 1 EA 8895 6895 Labsonic  LC300ONP-8 Listering Center (6 postions wrvolume controf) Labsonic LC3000NP-8 non-powsred listefing center with rack



Line 17

CD PlaysriCassstte Playsr Recorder Boombox

Name UOM Unit Prics  Extended  Mifgr MigNo Afternate cati Note 10 Buyer

CDWG 1EA 30 30 COBY CX CD248 - boombox - radio / CO / cassetie  Mig Pan. CXCD248 | CDW Par 1584204 | UNSPSC 52161508
QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 35 35 #BID-TECH-CXCD250 COBY CX-CD250  5-7 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVERY

Long?s Electronics Inc. 1EA 48 a8 Caifone (CLF 1778)

Valiant IMC 1EA 48 48 Hamitton MPC-5050

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA 485 48.5 CALIFONE 1778

ACP Direct 1EA 48 95 48 95 Labsonic LSB4000 CO Radio Cassetia Portable System

Pyramid School Products 1 EA 5198 5198 CALIFONE #1776

Batts Audio, Video & Lighting, 1EA 549 99 54999 DN-T825 Denon CD/Cessette combinabon deck with belancad in/out Professional start'stop functions
Rhythm Band Instruments, LL' 1EA  NoBid

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA  NoBid

All Pro Sound, Inc 1 EA  NoBd

SouthWast TV 8 Appliance 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers inc 1EA No Bid
{Line 18 Heatseal Ultir Laminator {Heat) ]

Name UOM  Uni Price Extended Mtqr MfgNo Altemate Specfication Note to Buver Laminator (HeatjOptional)
Pyramid School Products 1EA 1413 95 141995 GBC #ULTIMA 85 1419 95
Valiant IMC 1EA 144395 1443 95 1443 95
OUILL CORPQRATION 1 EA 1475 1475 #BID-TECH-1701720EZ GBC PINNACLE 27 E LOAD LAMINATOR  5-10 BUSINESS DAYS F 1475.00
boakbinding & laminating nc 1 EA 15395 15395

Long?s Electronics, (nc 1EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1EA No B

Southwest TV & Appliance 1EA  NoBid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA No B

Batts Audio. Video & Lighting, 1EA No B

CDWG 1EA No 8id

Abacus Computers Inc 1EA  NoBd

Rhythm Band Instruments. LLi 1EA  NoBd

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 EA No Bid

Al Pra Sound, Inc 1EA No Bid

Line 19 Utility Cart 3-shelf with electrical outiets

Name ¢ UOM Unt Price Extended Miar Migho Allemate Specification Note to Buyer Utility Cart 3-shalf with Electricat outleta(Qptional)
Valant IMC 1EA 81 61 Buhi PC1642E 8100
Pyramid School Products 1EA 66 95 66 95 H WILSON #WT34E 6895
Long?s Electronics. Inc 1 EA 945 945 Bretford (BRE A2642 E)

OUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 100 100 #BID-TECH-AVJ42 LUXOR ADY STEEL CARTS 7.6 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVERY 100 00
AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 EA 108 105 Brettord A2642E

ACP Direct 1 EA 15495 154 85 H Wilson 370301 Metat 3-Shelt 26-42" Ad) Ht Utility Cart w/3-outiet UL electncal assambly w/ 15

COWG 1 €A 208 02 20802 Bratford Basics Plastic Duo Can BPDUO-E4 - can  Mfg Part BPDUC-E4 | COW Part 39274

Abacus Computers Inc 1 EA No Bid

Southwest TV & Appliance 1EA No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA No Bid

Batts Audio. Video & Lighting 1EA  NoBw

All Pro Sound. Inc 1EA  NoBud

Rhythm Band Instruments, LLt 1 EA No Bid

Line 20 Flat Panel Telavisions and Wall Mounting Kits 37" TV ]

Name UOM Unt Price  Extended  Mfar Migho Ahemate Specification Note to Buyer Flat Penel Televisiona and Wall Mounting Xits{Optional}
CDWG 1 €A 64073 64073 Toshiba 37AV502R - 377 LCD TV Mig Part 37AV502R | CDW Pant 1898445 | UNSPSC 5

Abacus Computars inc 1EA 879 679 LG 37IN LCD HDTV (MF#37LH200C) ~ 1366X788 12K 1 16 9 BLK HDMURF/VGA/SVID incls 1

Valiant IMC 1EA 743 743 Sansui HDLCD-3700 wiPeariass ST835 743 00
OUILL CORPORATION 1EA 775 775 #BID-TECH-37Cv510U TOSHIBA 37° THINLINE TV 37AV502R $69500  3-5 BUSINESS DAY 775 00
Long?s Electronics, inc 1EA 784 784 Toshiba TOS37AVS5Q2R/PLS STBS0 (PEERLESS MOUNT -PLS)

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA 840 840 SANSUI HDLCD 4212 42" LCD TV W/WALL MOUNT 640 00
Southwest TV & Appliance 1EA 1045 1045 In37H550 samsung tv with wallmount

Bats Audio, Video & Lighting 1EA  NoBwx

Pyramd School Products 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1EA No Bid

Rhythm Band Instruments. LL 1EAa No Bid

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA No Bid

All Pro Sound. Inc 1EA  NoBd

21 Flat Panel Televisions and Wall Mounting Kit  26™ Televiaion |

Name UOM Unit Pace  Extended Miar MigNo ANemate Specitication Note to Buyer Flat Panel Talevisions and Wall Mounting Kt{Optional)
Valiant IMC 1EA 4075 407 5 Coby TFTV2817 w/Peeriess PT632 407 50
Abacus Computers Inc 1 EA 409 408 26IN LCD HDTV (MF 1366X766 800 1 16 8 HDMI VGA TV incls TUNER

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA 418 418 SANSUIHDOLCD2812 26" LCD TV WAWALL MOUNT 418 00
COWG 1EA 453 453 ViewSonic N2835w 26° wadescreen LCO TV Mfg Part N2635W | CDW Part 1237351 | UN

Long?s Electronics, tnc 1 EA 549 549 Tosbibe TOS28AV502R/ PLS ST832 (mount)

CD248 - Boombox - radia / CD / cassetle - siiver



Southwest TV & Appliance 1EA 595 585 In266380 samsung tv with welimount

ACP Direct 1EA No Bid :
Betts Audio. Video & Lighting, 1EA No B

Pyramid School Products 1EA No Bid

Rhythm Band Instrumenta, {L( 1EA  NoBd

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1EA No Bid

All Pro Sound. Inc. 1EA No Bid

OUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid *

Line 22 DVDVCR Combo Player

Name UOM UnitPrice  Extended Migr Migho Aitemate Specification Note to Buyer DVD/VCR Combo Player{Optional)
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA 71 71 2ENITH XBV713 7100
Valiant IMC 1EA 734 734 2endh XBV713 7340
Long?s Electronics. Inc 1 EA 78 78 JVC HRXVC118

CDWG 1EA 7934 7934 LG DVDVCR combo  Mfg Part: XBv713 | COW Part: 1604339 | UNSPSC 52181529

ACP Direct 1 EA 88 88 Referance ACP Direct #DVDVCR-P Dual Deck VCR/DVD Combo Player

OUILL CORPORATION 1EA 90 90 #BID-TECH-SDV295 TOSHIBA  8-10 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVERY 90 00
SouthWaest TV & Appliance 1EA 107 107 dvdv8B00 samsung dvd/ver

Rhythm Band Instruments. LL+ 1 EA No Bid

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 EA No Bid

All Pro Sound, Inc 1EA  NofBd

Abacus Computers tnc 1 EA No Bid

Batts Audio, Video & Lighting 1 EA No 8id

Pyramud School Products 1EA No Bid

Line 23 DVD Players +/- Recorders

Name QTY UOM Ut Pnca  Extended  Migr MigNo ‘Alternale Specification Note to Buyer DVD Playsrs +/- Recorder{Optional)
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1EA 114 114 TOSHIBA DR420 114 00
Long?s Electroncs. inc 1 EA 138 128 SONY RDRGX257

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 185 185 ¥BID-TECH-DR570 TOSHIBA  8-10 BUSINESS DAYS FOR DELIVERY 165 00
SouthWest TV & Appliance 1 EA 178 178 dvd-v375 samsung recorder

ACP Dvect 1EA  NoBid

Rtythm Band Instruments, Li! 1EA No Bid

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 EA No B

All Pro Sound. Inc 1EA  NoBd LG DVD

Bans Audwo, Video & Lighting 1 EA Ne Bid

Pyramid School Products 1EA  NoBid

Vahant IMC 1EA  NoBd

COWG 1EA No Bid

Abacus Computars Inc 1 EA No Bid
[Line 24 DVD Home Theater System DVD Player/AV Receiver s

Name QTY UOM Unt Price Extended Migr MigNo Altemate Specfication Note to Buyer DVD Home Theater System{Optional)
Valant IMC 1EA 171 171 Coby DVD966 17100
COWG 1EA 230 230 Samsung HT 23207 - home theater system - 5 1 channel  Mfg Part HT-Z320T | CDW Part 1
SouthWest TV & Appliance 1 EA 357 357 hE310t samsung 5 1 suround

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE 1 EA No Bg

Batts Audio. Video & Lighting 1t EA No Bd

Pyramid School Products 1EA  NoBd

Rhythm Band instruments LL: 1EA  NoBd

AUDIO VISUAL AICS CORP 1EA No B

Al Pro Sound, Inc 1EA  NoBd

QuItt CORPORATION 1EA  NoBd



