
TABULATIONS FOR RFP 2508 CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT

ITEMS QTY

Buckeye Cleaning Center-

Houston Central Poly-Bag Corp

1 Chemical Proportioning System 1 $0.00 No Bid

2 Glass Cleaner 1/cs $87.00 No Bid

3 Germicidal Disinfectant/Detergent/Deodorant 1/cs $120.91 No Bid

4 Neutral Floor Cleaner 1cs $52.79 No Bid

5 All Purpose Cleaner 1/cs $56.28 No Bid

6 Acid Cleaner 1/cs $61.34 No Bid

7 Foam Soap 1/cs $49.00 No Bid

8 Foam Soap Dispensers 1 $0.00 No Bid

9 Floor Stripper 1/5gl $108.53 No Bid

10 Floor Stipper 1/5gl $140.93 No Bid

11 Floor Finish 1/5gl $96.73 No Bid

12 Liners 24X32 1/cs $25.50 $18.92

13 Liners 55 gallon 1/cs $25.42 $14.88

14 Liners 30X36 1/cs $18.70 $12.88

15 Roll Towel 1/cs $41.68 No Bid

16 Roll Towel Dispensers 1 $0.00 No Bid

17 Toilet Tissue 1/cs $37.51 No Bid

18 Toilet Tissue Dispensers 1 $0.00 No Bid

19 Pads 1/cs $30.43 No Bid

20 Finish Mops 1 $84.15

Liners Specifically $69.62 $46.68

TOTALS $1,036.90 $46.68


