Bid Request Number
Title

Open Date

Close Date

*Awarded Vendor

Bid #12-001 Addendum 1

Classroom Technology Equipment Bid

1/5/2012 8:00:00 AM Central
1/26/2012 2:00:00 PM Central

Line ltems
Powerlite Projector - XGA
X12 resolution and 2800
Multimedia lumens of color/white
Line 1 Epson Projector light output.
Name QTY uom Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
Abacus Computers Inc.* 1 EA $398.88 $398.88
CDWG 1 EA $404.00 $404.00
Summit Integration Systems 1 EA $425.00 $425.00
Engage Educational Technologies 1 EA $429.00 $429.00
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc 1 EA $438.88 $438.88
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $479.14 $479.14
GovConnection, Inc 1 EA $481.34 $481.34
Troxell Communications, Inc. 1 EA $481.55 $481.55
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $489.00 $489.00
ACP Direct 1 EA $499.00 $499.00
ComData Solutions 1 EA $515.00 $515.00
Data Projections 1 EA No Bid
CommercialElectronic Supply 1 EA No Bid
Projector Ceiling
Mount
Line 2 EPSON ELPMBPJF
Name QTY UuoMm Unit Price Extended Mfgr  MfgNo Alternate Specification
cCDWG* 1 EA $68.96 $68.96
Summit Integration Systems 1 EA $69.00 $69.00
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc 1 EA $70.44 $70.44
Engage Educational Technologies 1 EA $72.00 $72.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $72.24 $72.24
GovConnection, Inc 1 EA $73.76 $73.76
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $77.00 $77.00
Troxell Communications, Inc. 1 EA $82.40 $82.40
ComData Solutions 1 EA $87.00 $87.00



ACP Direct 1 EA $89.00 $89.00
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $149.00 $149.00
Data Projections 1 EA No Bid
Document Camera
Must be compatible with
SMART Technologies
Line 3 AVerVision 30 white boards.
Name QTyYy UuoMm Unit Price Extended Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification
CDWG* 1 EA $385.00 $385.00
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $408.00 $408.00
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc 1 EA $459.26 $459.26
Summit Integration Systems 1 EA $470.00 $470.00
Engage Educational Technologies 1 EA $485.00 $485.00
ACP Direct 1 EA $489.00 $489.00
Troxell Communications, Inc. 1 EA $495.32 $495.32
GovConnection, Inc 1 EA $506.99 $506.99
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $519.00 $519.00
ComData Solutions 1 EA $525.00 $525.00
Data Projections 1 EA $568.03 $568.03
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA No Bid
SP-LAMP- REPLACEMENT LAMP
Line 4 InFocus 057 for InFocus IN2112
Name QTY UoMm Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
CDWG* 1 EA $148.00 $148.00
Summit Integration Systems 1 EA $150.00 $150.00
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc 1 EA $151.76 $151.76
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $154.88 $154.88
GovConnection, Inc 1 EA $155.62 $155.62
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $156.59 $156.59
Troxell Communications, Inc. 1 EA $160.95 $160.95
ACP Direct 1 EA $174.00 $174.00
ComData Solutions 1 EA $175.00 $175.00
Data Projections 1 EA $185.90 $185.90
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $535.00 $535.00
Engage Educational Technologies 1 EA $0.00 $0.00



Pro Digital Teacher Amplifier
Line 5 Front Row PD-IR System
Name QTY UoM Unit Price Extended Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification
Abacus Computers Inc.* 1 EA $832.00 $832.00
Summit Integration Systems 1 EA $880.00 $880.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $974.39 $974.39
Troxell Communications, Inc. 1 EA $992.36 $992.36
ComData Solutions 1 EA $1,015.00 $1,015.00
Data Projections 1 EA $1,155.34 $1,155.34
Engage Educational Technologies 1 EA $1,235.00 $1,235.00
GovConnection, Inc 1 EA No Bid
CDWG 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc 1 EA No Bid
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid



