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ATHLETIC FACILITY MATCHING GRANTS ISSUE DATE: 11/12/09

Matching Grant Application

1. Statement of Need:

A. Group Applying for Grant: VMS & VHS Baseball Teams

B. School: Vancleave Middle & High School

C. Who Benefits: Team, Coaches

2. Capital Project Design/Description:
A. Goals and Objectives: _Protect and improve the field from adverse

weather conditions, decrease costs in maintenance and extend field life.

B. Participants: Coaches, VAC Athletics, Baseball Booster Club

C. Capital Project: N/A

D. Project Management: Coaches, Dean Lepoma

E. Building Permit Documentation: _N/A

3. Project Resources:

A. Completion Date: b
B. Budget:
i. District; > 359589

ii. Group: __ $3595.89

C. Matching Monemmjﬁzi_m:/ﬂm)tg.ﬁank Statement
Assistant Superintendent: u \(

Superintendent:

JCSD Board of Education President:
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Vancleave Attendance Center Matching Grant 24-25

Project PO number District Portion [Booster Club Portion|Total Project Amount |Balances
$35,000.00
Mirrors for
2530197 1,477.50 1,477.50 2,955.00
Dance Teams ° > 50 |5 $33,522.50

Baseball Infield |Pending

S 3,595.89 | S 3,595.89 | S 7,191.78
Tarp Approval

$29,926.61




REX TEAM SPORTS
75 COL. JOHN PITCHFORD PKWY

NATCHEZ, MS 39120
601-408-8513 fax 866-387-2758

SALES QUOTE
CUSTOMER
Name VANCLEAVE BASEBALL Date 9/26/2024
Address Order #
City MS Zip Rep Brad
Attn: DEAN LEPOMA FOB
Qty Unit Price TOTAL
1 BASEBALL FIELD TARP ( 160°X160") WITH 20' ROLL TUBE COVER $9,795.00 | $ 9,795.00
- FOR STORAGE FOR TARP. INCLUDES BULLDOG LOGO $ -
$ -
$ -
1 FREIGHT $1,795.00 | $ 1,795.00
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
3 -
$ -
$ -
NO SALES TAX IF PAYING BY SCHOOL PO
Sub Total 3 11,590.00
Shipping & Handling
QUOTED BY: Brad Willcuit Taxes If Applicable
DATE: 9/26/2024 TOTAL $ 11,590.00




9/27/24, 5:36 AM Jackson County School District Mail - Fwd: Tarp Quote

Tty Sk,

. ‘.h]%
S0

: Jennifer Cox <jcj824@jcsd.ms>

Fwd: Tarp Quote

1 message

Dean Lepoma <d|j211@jcsd.ms>
To: Jennifer Cox <jcj824@)jcsd.ms>

Thu, Sep 26, 2024 at 2:04 PM

-----—--- Forwarded message ---------

From: bradley willcutt <willcutt23@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, Sep 26, 2024 at 1:56 PM

Subject: Tarp Quote

To: Dean Lepoma <dlj211@)jcsd.ms>

Here is the quote that you needed for the baseball tarp. Let me know if you have any questions on this

thanks

Brad Willcutt
Rex Team Sports
601-408-8513

DEAN LEPOMA

ATHLETIC DIRECTOR

DLI2N@ICSD.MS [228]283-3700 @VACBULLDOGWAY|

=) VANCLEAVE BASEBALL TARP.xls
23K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=ca82c357f8&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1811286598106222872%7Cmsg-f:1811286598106222872&... M



QUOTATION

‘ ATHLETICGS Quote Number: 37412-2
Quote Date: Sep 20, 2024
~ Page: 1

160 Parkinson Drive - Richland, MS 39218
1-800-895-2902 - Fax (601) 420-8442
www.Richardson Athletics.com
E-mail: info@RichardsonAthletics.com

'~ Quoted To: Ship To:
| VANCLEAVE ATTENDANCE CENTER | VANCLEAVE HIGH SCHOOL
VANCLEAVE ACTIVITY FUNDS/ACCOUTNS ' DEAN LEPOMA 228-297-2540
PAYABLE 4724 BULLDOG LANE
4724 BULLDOG LANE | VANCLEAVE, MS 39565
| VANCLEAVE, MS 39565 \
E Customer ID Good Thru | Payment Terms [ Sales Rep !
L VANGLEAVEHS - 1veues |  _ Met3dDeys | SR NN NS,
 Quantity | item | Description | UnitPrice | Amount
'BASEBALL |
1.00 | RTC-CU Roll Tube Cover - Custom Size - 38 "H x 364.990 364.99
j | 38" W x 20" L - Color: Royal Blue :
1.00 | T16068 6.8 oz. Poly Infield Cover 160’ x 160 - 6,529.990 6,529.99

‘ Grommets &.Sewn-In Pull Handles spaced
|around perimeter. ‘ ‘
1.00 RA-CLF "BULLDOGS" in White 191.990 191.99
1.00 | DISC Sales Discount per Quantities Specified 320.000 -320.00

Subtotal ' 6,766.97

Wikson
%ﬂu\\\ A Sales Tax
A1010HS1 | A1030 T T T — |
. Rl I
=8 = TOTAL 7,191.78

If paying with a Credit or Debit Card, there will be a 3% processing fee applied to the total.

Customer is responsible for unloading products off the truck at time of delivery. Customer is responsible for cost associated with any a
services requested of the trucking company. Some of these services include lift gate, change of address, inside delivery, etc. The truc
company may require a redelivery fee if the initial delivery is missed within normal operating hours.

Thank vou for considering Richardson Athletics for your equipment needs!
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Fwd: Quote # 37412-2

1 message
Dean Lepoma <dlj211@jcsd.ms>
To: Jennifer Cox <jcj824@jcsd.ms>

Fri, Sep 20, 2024 at 9:29 AM

Should have received 2 quotes for the tarp.

DEAN LEPOMA

ATHLETIC DIRECTOR

OLIZN@ICSD.MS (228]2B3-3700 @VACBULLDDGWAY)

--m-meme= FOrwarded message ---------

From: Mattie Walker <mattie@richardsonathletics.com>
Date: Fri, Sep 20, 2024 at 8:27 AM

Subject: Quote # 37412-2

To: Dean Lepoma <dlj211@jcsd.ms>

Coach-

This quote is still valid. | just changed the date on it.

Please see the attached quote. If you have any questions, please let me know.
Thanks,

Mattie Walker

160 Parkinson Drive | Richland MS 39218
800.895.2902 Toll Free | 601.420.8488 Local | 601.420.8442 Fax

Bt szt

ATHLETICS
T

Attached is Quote # 37412-2 from Richardson Athletics

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=ca82c357f8&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1810725668655971703%7Cmsg-f:181072566865597 1703&.... 12
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To view the attachment, you must have the Adobe® Reader® software installed on your computer. To get a free version of
this software from Adobe, click here: https://www.adobe.com/support/downloads/main.html

a Quote # 37412-2.PDF
1285K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=caB82c357f8&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:181072566865597 1703%7Cmsg-f:1810725668655971703&... 2/2



