Dr. Jieun Pando

Ector County ISD Director of School Nutrition
(432) 456-9741
1120 W 10™ St Odessa, TX

Odessa, TX 79763
Jieun.Pando@ectorcountyisd.org

Sch& el Nutrition

IFB#Bid 23-03SN — Small Kitchen Equipment

Purpose: The School Nutrition Department seeks to acquire new small
kitchen equipment.

Background Info: Some small kitchen equipment has exceeded the expected
life span and needs to be replaced. The new small kitchen equipment will
include bun racks, bus carts, sheet pans, can openers, fruit slicers, steam
table pans, etc.

Cost: $102,041.89
Funding Source: Federal Funds 240

Recommended Supplier/Service Provider:
Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co
Sam Tell and Son Inc.
Commercial Food Service
Misson Restaurant Supply

Board Approval Date




BUN / SHEET PAN RACK 1
Supplier ary  uom Estimated  Unit Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer  Manufacturer &
Mission Restaurant Supply 86 EA | have included Channe! # 401AN as alternate. Please see atrached quots for full details. Gusto GUSBPR-Z-FULL
JALTI] 11300 inc % EA 5106.14 £10,189 24 Regency 10 Pan End Load izh Regency GOOPRI0ZK.
[ALT1] Pollock Investments DBA Poliock r Distributors 96 EA 5199.53 $19,154.85 20-TIER PAN RACK W/4 CASTERS - THIS IS NOT PRE-ASSEMBLED FOR DELIVERY THUNDER GROUP ALSPRO20
Sam Tell and Son Inc %6 EA $270.71 325,553.16 Guste GUSBPR-Z-FULL
[ALT1] Commercial Food Servics %6 EA 5295.00 $28,320.00 Nesting Shest Pan Rack, 22°L x 27-1/2"W x 70"H, (20] full-size 18" x 26" shest pans capacity, 650 Ib. capacity, 3" spacing, front loading, open sides, (4) casters | Winco AWEZK-20
[ALT1] Mission Restaurant Supply %6 EA 532413 531,116,423 | have included Channel # 401AN as alternate. Please see attached quote for full details. Channel Manufact 401AN
Puehlo Hotel Supply 86 EA 532999 531,673.04 Gusto GUSBPR-Z-FULL
11400 inc k=3 EA No Bid Gusts GUSBPR-Z-FULL
Empire Paper Compar %6 EA No Bid Guste GUSBPR-Z-FULL
Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors: 56 EA No Bid Guste GUSBPR-Z-FULL

[T1 U/ SHEET PAN RACK
Supplier Criteria 1 Criteria 2 Criteria 3 Criteria 4 Criteria 5 Criteria 6 Criteria 8 Total Awarded Vendor
Mission Restaurant Supply
[ALT1] 11400 Inc 0 5 0 4 5 26
[ALT1] Peliock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors L) 5 0 2 4 5 5 5 26
‘Sam Teil and Son Inc 55 5 10 5 4 5 5 5 94
[ALT1] Commercial Food Service 0 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 35
[ALT1] Mission Restaurant Supply 0 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 35
Pueblo Hote! Supply 50 5 10 5 4 5 5 5 89
11400 Inc o 0 a 0 0 0 0 4] 4]

Empire Paper Company 0 0 0 [ [ 0 [ 0 0
Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors 0 o 0 0 o 0 0 o 1]

[ oo v wsron et \
Supplier Qv uom Estimated  Unit Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer | Manufacturer £
Pueblo Hote! Supply 111 EA $201.16 322,328 76 Lakeside LAK311
Sam Tell and Son Inc 111 EA 5205.58 522,819.38 Lekeside LAK311
Commercial Food Semvice 11 EA $227.00 525,197.00 Lakeside LAK311
11400 Inc 111 EA $238.70 325,!95 70 Lakeside LAK311
Empire Paper Company 111 EA No Bid Lakeside LAK311
Poliock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors: 111 EA No Bid Lakeside LAK311

B T T A e —

Supplier Criteria 1 Criteria 2 Criteria 3 Criteria 4 Criteria 5 Criteria 6 Criteria 7 Criteria 8 Total Awarded Vendor

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co 55 5 10 5 5 5 5 5 95
S T T |
Pueblo Hotel Supply 50 5 10 5 4 5 5 5 39

Sam Tell and Son Inc 45 5 10 5 4 5 5 5 24

Commercial Food Service 40 5 10 5 5 5 5 5 30

11400 Inc 35 5 10 5 4 5 5 5 74

Empire Paper Company [ 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors o 0 0 0 0 0 ] o




3 |BUN / SHEET PAN

Supplier oy uom Estimated _ Unit Price Extended supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer _ Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Commercial Food Service 558 EA 5981 55,473.88 Sheet Pan, full-size, 187 x 26", 18 gauge aluminum ThunderGroup  ALSPM

Sam Tell and Son inc 558 EA 51136 56,338.88 Velirath vOLS002
[ALT1] Pallock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors 558 EA 51170 56,528.60 13X26 FULL SIZE ALUM SHEET PAN - MUST BE SOLD BY CASE OF 12 EACH THUNDER GROUP ALSP1826M
Commercial Food Service 556 EA 51454 58,113.32 Vallrath voLs002
Mission Restaurznt Supply 556 EA 514.56 $8,124.48 Vellrath voLs00Z
Pueblo Hote! Supply 558 EA 51555 $8,676.90 Velirath voLS002
11400 Inc 558 EA 51584 $8,338.72 Vellrath VL5002
Empire Paper Company 558 EA 52035 511,355.30 part# 3363002 Vallrath VOLS002
Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors 558 EA Mo Bid Vollrath VOLS002

3 |BUN / SHEET PAN

Supplier Criteria 1 Criteria 2 Criteria 3 Criteria 4 Criteria 5 Criteria 6 Criteria 7 Criteria 8 Total Awsrded Vendor

[ALT1] Commercial Food Service 0 0 [ [ [ [ 0 a [

Sam Tell and Son Inc 55 s 10 5 [ 5 5 5 94

[ALT1] Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors 0 0 0 [] [ [ ] o [

Commercial Food Service 50 5 0 5 5 5 5 5 90

Mission Restaurant Supply a5 5 10 5 5 5 5 5 &

Pueblo Hotel Supply 40 5 10 5, 4 5 5 5 79

11400 Inc 35 5 0 5 4 5 5 5 7

Empire Paper Company 30 s 10 5 5 5 5 5 70

Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors 0 [ 0 0 4 5 5 5 19

[ Toun s o ]
Supplier QTY UOM  Estmated  UnitPrice Extended  Supplier Nates / Alternate Description Manufacturer  Manufacturer &
[ALT1] Commercial Food Service 321 EA 55.60 51.797.60 Sheet Pan, 1/2 size, 18" x 13" aluminum, 18 gauge. Thunder Grouj ALSP1813
[ALT1] Pollock Investments DBA Poliock Paper Distributors Eral EA 5663 $2,128.23 18X13 HALF SIZE ALUM SHEET PAN - MUST BE SOLD BY CASE OF 24 EACH. THUNDER GROUP ALSP1813
Mart Restaurant Supply Co 321 EA 57.0293 $2,256.4053 Price includes install & delivery fee of $3987.50 divided into 11 line items, $362.50. Volirath voLs303

Commercial Food Service 321 EA 510.00 $3,21000 Wollrath VOL5303
Mission Restaurant Supply 3 EA $1083 53,3803 Vollrath VOL5303
Pueblo Hotel Supply 321 EA 51065 5341865 Wollrath VOL5303
11400 Inc. 321 EA 51085 5348285 Vollrath VOL5303
Empire Paper Company 321 EA 51393 54,47153 pant# 5365303 Vollrath VOL5303
Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors 321 EA No Bid Woilrath VOL5303

j BUN / SHEET PAN

Supplier Criteria 1 Criteria 2 Criteria 3 Criteria 4 Criteria 5 Criteria 6 Criteria 7 Criteria 8 Total Awarded Vendor

[ALT1] Commercial Food Service

-
°
°
-
°
o
°
°
o

[ALT1] Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distribuiors [] ] 0 0 ] 0 [ 0 0
Ace Mart Restaurant Suply Co 55 B 1 5 5 5 5 5 95
Commerdial Food Service 50 B 1 5 5 5 5 5 90
Mission Restaurant Supply 5 B 1 5 5 5 5 5 85
Pueblo Hotel Supply 40 5 1 5 4 5 5 5 73
11400 Inc 35 5 10 S 4 5 5 5 74
Empire Paper Company 30 B 10 5 4 5 5 5 63
Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors. o 0 0 0 o 0 o ] 0




|_s_[appLE suicer/wEDGER
Su

pplier QrTyY  UOM Estimated Unit Price Extanded Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Mission Restaurant Supply El EA 5158.16 5142344 Nemco NEMNSS550-2
Pueblo Hotel Supply 9 EA 516319 $1,46871 Nemco NEMNS5550-8
Sam Tell and Son Inc L] EA 5184.26 51,658.34 Nemco NEMNSS550-8
11400 Inc ) EA 519179 5172611 Nemco NEMNSS5550-8
Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co L] EA 5154338 $1,743.04 Price indudes install & delivery fee of 53387 50 divided into 11 line items, $362.50. Nemco NEMNSS550-8
Empire Paper Company L) EA 524641 52,217.69 part# 531NS55508 Nemeo NEMNS5550-8
Poliock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors 9 EA No Bid Nemco NEMNS5550-8

[ 5 [APPLE SLICER/WEDGER
Supplier Criteria 1 Criteria 2 Criteria 3 Criteria 5 Criteria § Criteria 7 Criteria 8 Total Awarded Vendor
Mission Restaurant Supply 55 5 10 5 5 5 5 5 95
Pueblo Hotel Supply 50 5 10 5 ] 5 5 5 8
‘5am Teil and Son Inc a5 5 10 5 4 5 5 5 84
11400 Inc 40 5 10 5 4 5 5 5 79
Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co 35 5 10 5 5 5 5 5 7S
Empire Paper Company 30 5 10 5 3 5 5 5 6
Pollock investments DBA Poilock Paper Distributors 0 o o 0 o 0 0 0 0
(e Tommes sucearwenaen \
Supplier ary  uom Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Mission Restaurant Supply 14 EA $159.63 $2,234.82 Nemco 555504
Pueblo Hotel Supply 14 EA 516319 52,284 66 Nemes 555504
Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co 14 EA 5179.953 $2,519.34 Price includes install & delivery fee of $3987 50 divided into 11 line items, $362.50. Nemco 555504
Sam Tell and Son inc 13 EA $184.26 $2,579.64 Nemco 555504
11400 inc 1 EA 19179 52,685.06 Nemco 555504
Empire Paper Company. 14 EA $246.41 $3,448.74 part# S31INS55504 Nemco 555504
Poliock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors 14 EA No Bid Nemco 555504
6 | ORANGE SLICER/WEDGER

Supplier Criteria 1 Criteria 2 Criteria 3 Criteria 4 Criteria 5 Criteria 6 Criteria 7 Criteria 8 Total Awarded Vendor

Mission Restaurant Supply 55 5 10 5 5 5 3 5 95

Pueblo Hotel Supply 50 5 10 5 a 5 5 5 £

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co a5 5 10 5 5 5 5 5 85

Sam Tell and San Inc a0 5 10 5 4 5 7 5 79

11400 Inc 35 5 10 5 1 5 5 5 74

Empire Paper Company 30 5 10 5 5 5 5 5 70

Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors 0 0 0 0 0 o 0 0 0




7_|DRYING RACKS (NO AWARD)

|7 TORYING RACKS (MO AWARD)

Supplier

Mission Restaurant Supply

11400 Inc

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co

Puebio Hotel Supply

‘Sam Tell and Son Inc

Commercial Food Service

Poliock Investmants DBA Pollock Paper Distributors
Empire Paper Company

wwwmwwwwg

Supplier

Mission Restaurant Supply

11400 Inc

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co

Pueblo Hotel Supply

Sam Tell and Son Inc

Commercial Food Service

Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors
Empire Paper Company

uom Estimated  Unit Price
EA $1,010.00
Ea $1,01050
Ea 51019258
s1,00897

EA 5105158
EA 51,0850
Mo Bid

Ea No Bid

Criteria 1 Criteria 2

Extended  Supplier Notes
$9,090.00
9,098.10
5$9,173.68 Price includes install & defivery fee of 53987 .50 divided into 11 line items, $362.50.
5926073
$9,464.22
58,830.10

Criteria 3 Criteria 4 Criteria 5 Criteria 6 Criteria 7 Criteria 8 Total

Awarded Vendor

CAMBRO

ololololo|a|ale

[s_[FulL size DEEp sTEAM TABLE PAN

Supplier

[ALT1] Pollock Investments DBA Pollack Paper Distributors

Commercial Food Service
Mission Restaurant Suppiy.

Pueblo Hotsl Supply

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co

11800 1nc.

Empire Papar Company

Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors

uom Estimated  Unit Price

52382
53100
529.70
s3z222
5367393
4012
$5155
NoBid

PEEREERE

(& TFULL SIZE DEEP STEAM TABLE PAN

Supplier

[ALT1] Pol Pollock Paper

Criteria 1 Criteria 2

Extended  Supplier otes / Alternate Description

51,157.38 4" DEEP FULL SIZE S5 H/D STEAM PAN - MUST BE SOLD BY CASE OF 12 EACH.
51,513.00
5145530
51578.78

$1,800.26 Price includes install & delivery fee of 53987 50 divided into 11 line items, 5352 50. Price also includes a 55.00 from
$1.365.88
$2,525.95 part# 32230042

Criteria 3 Criteria 4 Criteria 5 Criteria 6 Criteria 7 Criteria 8 Total

Awarded Vendor

Manufacturer

Manufacturer &

THUNDER GROUP STPAZ004

Volirath
Volirath

Commercial Food Service
Mission Restaurant Supply
Pueblo Hotel Supply

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co
11400 Inc

Empirs Paper Company

Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors

10

10

10

10

10

10
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S [STAINLESS STEEL PITCHERS -{HO AWARD)

Supplier ary uom Estimated  Unit Price Extended  Supplier Notes | Alternate Description nufacturer  Manufacturer &
Pueblo Hotsl Supply T EA s1751 5138325

Commercial Food Service B OEA $58.87 5441525

[ALT1] Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co B EA 5603138 54,522.51 Volirath Model No. 82040 (789SPECORDER) Packed 4 ea Pitcher, Bell Shaped, 4-1/8 qt. {132 02, 10-3/8"H, welded hollow handle, stainless steel, satin finish, | Vollrath 22040

Sam Tell and Son Inc 7 EA $65.10 54,882.50

Empire Paper Company B EA s88.32 56,624.00 part# 92252040

Mission Restaurant Supply T EA NoBid

11400 Ine s EA No Bid

Pollack Investments DBA Pollack Paper Distributors T EA NoBid

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co s EA NoBid

9 |STAINLESS STEEL PITCHERS -{NO AWARD)

Supplier Criteria 1 Criteria 2

Criteria 4 Criteria 5 Criteria 6 Criteria 7 Criteria 8 Total Awarded Vendor

Pueblo Hote! Supply

Commercial Food Service

[ALT1] Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co

Sam Tell and Son Inc

Empire Paper Company

Mission Restaurant Supply

11400 Inc

ole|lo|ele|elale

Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributers

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co

10 |EDLUND ELECTRIC CAN OPENER

Supplier OTY _UOM ___ Estimated _ Unit Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer _ Manufacuurer §

Commercial Food Service 31
Sam Tell and Son Inc 34
Mission Restaurant Supply

Puebla Hotel Supply 34
11400 Inc

Empire Paper Company 32
Poliock Investments DBA Pollack Paper Distributars 38

$1,486.91 55055434 EDLUND
5143554 550,861.36 EDLUND
5150213 551,075.82 EDLUND
51,589.97 554,058.98 EDLUND
51,692.950 $57,558.60 EDLUND
52,175.12 5§73,954.08 part#333270 EDLUND

Mo Bid EDLUND

FPERRERE

i EDLUND ELECTRIC CAN OPENER

Supy

Criteria 1 Criteria 2 Criteria 3 Criteria 4 Criteria 5

3 Criteria 7 Criteria 8 Total Awarded Vendor

‘Commercial Food Service 55

Sam Tell and Sen Inc 50

Mission Restaurant Supply (5

Pueblo Hotel Supply [

11400 Inc 35

(RN [P0 P P ) P

Empirs Paper Company 30
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Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors 0




11 [ADJUSTABLE MOBILE TRAY DRYING RACKS - [NO AWARD]

Supplier ary  uom Estimated  Unit Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer  Manufacturer #
[ALT1] 11400 Inc 5 EA 5101970 $15,295.50 Metro MAX4-PRASVX2 Metrohax & Mobile Three Tier TrayDrying Rack - 24" x 48" x 63" Metro MAX4-PRASVX2
Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Ca 15 EA 52092709 $31,39064 Price includes install & delivery fee of $3587.50 divided into 11 line items, $362.50_ Price aiso includes In i 565014 per NEW AGE
Mission Restaurant Suppiy 5 EA 52,167.18 $32,507.70 INEW AGE INDUSTI 95333
Publo Hotel Supply 15 EA 5219188 $32,878.20 NEW AGE INDUSTI 95333
‘Sam Tell and Son Inc 15 EA $2,755.38 $41,33070 NEW AGE INDUSTI 95333
Commercial Food Service 15 EA 53,625.50 £54,382.50 NEW AGE INDUSTI 95333
Poliock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors 5 EA Hio Bid NEW AGE INDUSTI 95333
11300 inc 5 EA Mo Bid NEW AGE INDUSTI $5333
Empire Paper Company EA Mo Bid NEW AGE INDUSTI 95333
-ADJUSTABLE MOBILE TRAY DRVING RACKS - (NO AWARD)
Supplier Criteria 1 Criteria 2 Criteria 3 Criteria 4 Criteria 5 Criteria 6 Criteria 7 Criteria & Total Awarded Vendor
[ALT1] 11400 Inc
Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Co 0
Mission Restaurant Supply 0
Pueblo Hotel Supply
‘Sam Teil and Son Inc
Commercial Food Service [}
Pollock Investments DBA Pollock Paper Distributors.

11400 Inc

Empire Faper Company




