PROJECT NO.:
PROJECT NAME:
PRE-BID DATE:
BID DATE:

25-1051-49B - BASE PROPOSAL
WYLIE ISD - 2025 HAIL DAMAGE AT MULTIPLE FACILITIES
4/1/2025
4/8/2025

PROPOSAL TABULATION FORM

Page 1 of 4

BIDDERS

ATTENDED
PRE-BID

BID BOND

BASE PROPOSAL 1
HIGH SCHOOL
ROOF SECTIONS (A & B)

ADD ALTERNATE
(CODES & UPGRADES)

BASE PROPOSAL 2
HIGH SCHOOL
ROOF SECTIONS
(C,D,F,G,H K&P)

ADD ALTERNATE
(CODES & UPGRADES)

BASE PROPOSAL 3
HIGH SCHOOL
ROOF SECTION €

ADD ALTERNATE
(CODES & UPGRADES)

BASE PROPOSAL 4
HIGH SCHOOL
ROOF SECTION (J)

ADD ALTERNATE
(CODES & UPGRADES)

BASE PROPOSAL 5
HIGH SCHOOL
ROOF SECTION (L)

ADD ALTERNATE
(CODES & UPGRADES)

BASE PROPOSAL 6
HIGH SCHOOL
ROOF SECTIONS (M & N)

CS ADVANTAGE V $570,000.00 $44,000.00 $1,700,000.00 $600,000.00 $440,000.00 $35,000.00 $470,000.00 $100,000.00 $130,000.00 $38,000.00 $95,000.00
BARR ROOFING COMPANY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LYDICK HOOKS $739,305.00 $55,125.00 $2,519,361.00 $185,325.00 $750,000.00 $55,125.00 $476,000.00 $85,800.00 $215,900.00 $16,000.00 $149,000.00

WYLIE ISD - BASE PROPOSAL BID TABS - with bids



PROJECT NO.:
PROJECT NAME:
PRE-BID DATE:
BID DATE:

25-1051-49B - BASE PROPOSAL
WYLIE ISD - 2025 HAIL DAMAGE AT MULTIPLE FACILITIES

4/1/2025
4/8/2025

PROPOSAL TABULATION FORM

Page 2 of 4

BIDDERS

ADD ALTERNATE
(CODES & UPGRADES)

TOTAL PRICE
High School

BASE PROPOSAL 7
WEST ELEMENTARY
ROOF SECTIONS
(8,C,D&E)

ADD ALTERNATE
(CODES & UPGRADES)

BASE PROPOSAL 8
WEST ELEMENTARY
ROOF SECTIONS (A)

ADD ALTERNATE
(CODES & UPGRADES)

TOTAL PRICE
Elementary

BASE PROPOSAL 9
WEST INTERMEDIATE
ROOF SECTIONS
(A.B,C,F,G&H)

ADD ALTERNATE
(CODES & UPGRADES)

BASE PROPOSAL 10
WEST INTERMEDIATE
ROOF SECTIONS (D & E)

ADD ALTERNATE
(CODES & UPGRADES)

TOTAL PRICE
Intermediate

CS ADVANTAGE $20,000.00 $4,242,000.00 $1,070,000.00 $140,000.00 $350,000.00 $40,000.00 $1,600,000.00 $1,220,000.00 $150,000.00 $250,000.00 $35,000.00 $1,655,000.00
BARR ROOFING COMPANY NO BID NO BID $1,479,055.00 $138,650.40 $468,940.00 $43,959.60 $2,130,605.00 $1,507,915.00 $158,510.00 $360,210.00 $37,865.00 $2,064,500.00
LYDICK HOOKS $10,740.00 $5,257,681.00 $1,147,807.00 $98,865.00 $396,565.00 $71,000.00 $1,714,237.00 $1,653,000.00 $118,000.00 $370,900.00 $39,000.00 $2,180,900.00

WYLIE ISD - BASE PROPOSAL BID TABS - with bids



PROPOSAL TABULATION FORM

Page 3 of 4

PROJECT NO.: 25-1051-49B - BASE PROPOSAL

PROJECT NAME: WYLIE ISD - 2025 HAIL DAMAGE AT MULTIPLE FACILITIES
PRE-BID DATE: 4/1/2025

BID DATE: 4/8/2025

BASE PROPOSAL 11
JUNIOR HIGH BASE PROPOSAL 12 BASE PROPOSAL 13 BASE PROPOSAL 14 | ADD ALTERNATE | BASE PROPOSAL 15 BASE PROPOSAL 16
BIDDERS ROOF SECTIONS ADD ALTERNATE JUNIOR HIGH ADD ALTERNATE JUNIOR HIGH ADD ALTERNATE JUNIOR HIGH (CODES & JUNIOR HIGH ADD ALTERNATE JUNIOR HIGH ADD ALTERNATE

(CODES & UPGRADES) (CODES & UPGRADES) (CODES & UPGRADES) (CODES & UPGRADES), (CODES & UPGRADES)

(A.B,C,E,F,G,H,J) ROOF SECTION (D) ROOF SECTIONS (K & R) ROOF SECTION (N) UPGRADES) ROOF SECTION (P) ROOF SECTION (Q)
(LM, S&T)
CS ADVANTAGE $990,000.00 $210,000.00 $32,000.00 $3,000.00 $230,000.00 $25,000.00 $275,000.00 $20,000.00 $130,000.00 $35,000.00 $210,000.00 $20,000.00
BARR ROOFING COMPANY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LYDICK HOOKS $1,263,192.00 $191,648.00 $49,580.00 $3,900.00 $282,600.00 $25,000.00 $365,000.00 $26,300.00 $185,925.00 $28,000.00 $251,000.00 $19,200.00

WYLIE ISD - BASE PROPOSAL BID TABS - with bids



PROPOSAL TABULATION FORM
Page 4 of 4

PROJECT NO.: 25-1051-49B - BASE PROPOSAL
PROJECT NAME: WYLIE ISD - 2025 HAIL DAMAGE AT MULTIPLE FACILITIES
PRE-BID DATE: 4/1/2025
BID DATE: 4/8/2025
UNIT PRICE PROPOSAL | UNIT PRICE PROPOSAL | UNIT PRICE PROPOSAL | UNIT PRICE PROPOSAL
BIDDERS TOTAL PRICE REMOVE & REPLACE REMOVE & REPLACE INSTALL 4" INSTALL 4"
Junior High GYPSUM DECKING | DETERIORATED NAILERS|  CAST IRON DRAINS PVC DRAIN

(Price per SQFT)

(Price per Board Ft)

(Price Each)

(Price per Linear FT)

CS ADVANTAGE $2,180,000.00 $20.00 $10.00 $3,000.00 $50.00
BARR ROOFING COMPANY NO BID $45.00 $3.50 $500.00 $16.00
LYDICK HOOKS $2,691,345.00 $35.00 $4.00 $4,500.00 $10.00

WYLIE ISD - BASE PROPOSAL BID TABS - with bids




