Bid Request Number Bid #10-29

Title Classroom Technology-Related Equipment
Open Date 7/23/2010 7:00:00 AM Central
Close Date 8/6/2010 3:00:00 PM Central
Projector - 3000 Lumens ANSI-XGA
Line 1 1024 x 768 Resolution
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $509.41 $509.41
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $677.00 $677.00
CDWG 1 EA $725.00 $725.00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $737.00 $737.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $763.70 $763.70
Valiant IMC 1 EA $768.60 $768.60
MicroAge College Station 1 EA $799.00 $799.00
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $845.00 $845.00
Security General International, 1 EA $870.00 $870.00
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
Projector - 3000 Lumens ANSI-
Line 2 SVGA 800 X 600 Resolution
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $448.00 $448.00
CDWG 1 EA $467.00 $467.00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $488.00 $488.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $503.59 $503.59
Valiant IMC 1 EA $504.79 $504.79
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $529.00 $529.00
MicroAge College Station 1 EA $557.00 $557.00
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $565.00 $565.00
Security General International, 1 EA $568.00 $568.00
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $807.37 $807.37
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid



CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid
Universal for Projector Ceiling Mount
Line 3 InFocus Projector
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $39.95 $39.95
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $92.00 $92.00
CDWG 1 EA $105.00 $105.00
Valiant IMC 1 EA $105.91 $105.91
MicroAge College Station 1 EA $120.00 $120.00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $127.00 $127.00
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $130.00 $130.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $131.40 $131.40
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA $140.00 $140.00
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
Security General International, 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
Man Pull-up/Pull-down Projection
Screen
84" Screen with 84" Wall Mounting
Line 4 Bracket
Name Q UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $43.30 $43.30
CDWG 1 EA $84.00 $84.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $86.70 $86.70
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $95.00 $95.00
MicroAge College Station 1 EA $99.00 $99.00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $99.00 $99.00
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $99.50 $99.50
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA $115.00 $115.00
Valiant IMC 1 EA $117.00 $117.00
Security General International, 1 EA $129.00 $129.00
Pyramid School Products 1 EA $179.95 $179.95
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $201.97 $201.97
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid



CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

Man Pull-up/Pull-down Projection

Screen
100" Screen with 100" Wall
Line5 Mounting Bracket
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $57.73 $57.73
CDWG 1 EA $84.00 $84.00
Valiant IMC 1 EA $89.32 $89.32
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $106.39 $106.39
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $108.00 $108.00
MicroAge College Station 1 EA $109.00 $109.00
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA $110.00 $110.00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $121.00 $121.00
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $125.00 $125.00
Security General International, 1 EA $142.25 $142.25
Pyramid School Products 1 EA $185.95 $185.95
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
Document Camera
Must be compatible with SMART
Line 6 AverVision CP355 Technologies white boards.
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $508.00 $508.00
CDWG 1 EA $510.00 $510.00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $522.00 $522.00
Valiant IMC 1 EA $555.98 $555.98
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $563.11 $563.11
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $580.29 $580.29
MicroAge College Station 1 EA $619.00 $619.00
Security General International, 1 EA $650.00 $650.00
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $677.00 $677.00
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid



Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
Document Camera
Must be compatible with SMART
Line 7 AVerVision 355AF Technologies white boards.
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
CDWG 1 EA $560.00 $560.00
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $612.00 $612.00
Valiant IMC 1 EA $633.98 $633.98
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $641.33 $641.33
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $670.26 $670.26
MicroAge College Station 1 EA $710.00 $710.00
Security General International, 1 EA $742.25 $742.25
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $771.00 $771.00
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
Document Camera
Must be compatible with SMART
Line 8 AVerVision CP155 Technologies white boards.
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $397.00 $397.00
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $457.00 $457.00
CDWG 1 EA $460.00 $460.00
Valiant IMC 1 EA $477.98 $477.98
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $483.85 $483.85
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $513.62 $513.62
MicroAge College Station 1 EA $532.00 $532.00
Security General International, 1 EA $557.00 $557.00
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $582.00 $582.00
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid



Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
pligital Lalricoract
Hard Drive?Minimum
30GB,Recommend 60GB, Secure
Digital
SD Cards?SDHC Compatible USB
2.0 cord, IEEE 1394 Firewire
(opt)A/V Connectors?2 Audio RCA,
1 Video RCA and S?Video
Zoom: Minimum 10X software,

Line 9 Panasonic or Sony charger, and extra 4gb memory ¢

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $309.22 $309.22

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $318.00 $318.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $324.38 $324.38

CDWG 1 EA $330.00 $330.00

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

Security General International, 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
FTESETIlAallUTNT CETILET 7ivieUla Ldal Llul
Large Projectors with locking
cabinet (Large enough to hold mini-
tower) and
steel pull-out mouse and keyboard
shelf.
Attached power strip/surge
protector
Adjustable/removable shelves

Line 10 Includes large work area for doc

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification




CompUSA B2B 1 EA $395.18 $395.18

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $415.00 $415.00

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA No Bid

Security General International, 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

CDWG 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
Computer Headphones Without
Microphone
must be compatible with HP and/or

Line 11 Dell Computers

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

CDWG 1 EA $1.38 $1.38

ACP Direct 1 EA $2.49 $2.49

Valiant IMC 1 EA $3.39 $3.39

Pyramid School Products 1 EA $5.99 $5.99

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $6.60 $6.60

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $7.72 $7.72

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA $8.00 $8.00

Security General International, 1 EA $12.50 $12.50

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $16.50 $16.50

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $22.66 $22.66

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Line 12

Computer Headphones with
microphone compatible with HP
and/or Dell Computers




Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification

Valiant IMC 1 EA $3.99 $3.99

ACP Direct 1 EA $4.28 $4.28

Pyramid School Products 1 EA $6.99 $6.99

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $7.99 $7.99

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $8.00 $8.00

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA $13.00 $13.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $16.11 $16.11

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $17.62 $17.62

Security General International, 1 EA $18.75 $18.75

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $39.50 $39.50

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

CDWG 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
GPS System Garmin
Approximate Dimensions:
4"x2"x1"
Resolution(WxH) 176 x 220 Pixels
Display type: 256 level color TFT
High Sensitivity Receiver, ROHS
Version
USB Interface with USB cable
included
US Basemap included, ability to
add Basemaps

Line 13 Garmin 24MB

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $152.46 $152.46

CDWG 1 EA $160.00 $160.00

Security General International, 1 EA $302.25 $302.25

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $358.43 $358.43

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid



AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA No Bid
UNFE WITEIESS FIcauscl allu vile
System
Wireless headset system with 150
+ feet typical operating range up to
300 + feet line of sight. Power,
signal, AF LED status indicators,
and adjustable audio output level
for optimal sound. Externally
powered

Line 14 by DC

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $194.00 $194.00

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $232.32 $232.32

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $420.00 $420.00

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

CDWG 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA No Bid

Security General International, 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
PGX Wireless Lavalier System w/
WL93 Omnidirectional Micro-Lavalier

MicroAge College Station (Alt 11 EA $406.00 $406.00 Shure PGX14/93 Condenser Microphone



Z.4 GNZ CLOTraress rFreserter
LCD timer, built in slideshow
controls,

Integrated laser pointer. 50 foot

operating
Range. Wireless mini receiver,
carrying
Case, installation guide.

Line 15

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification

CDWG 1 EA $35.00 $35.00

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $44.00 $44.00

Valiant IMC 1 EA $52.70 $52.70

Security General International, 1 EA $56.50 $56.50

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $66.77 $66.77

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $77.50 $77.50

MicroAge College Station 1 EA $95.00 $95.00

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $160.00 $160.00

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid
I.IIUIL(ZI T II'J viutu oanmnrceurucl
Ultra
A/V cable, LCD display?1.5"
color
Flash card, digital zoom 2 x, video
capture -3600 sec., 2GB flash-
integrated
(soldered memory), USB cord, 1
composite
video/audio output, built in
microphone

Line 16

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification

Security General International, 1 EA $55.25 $55.25



AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $128.00 $128.00

Valiant IMC 1 EA $128.46 $128.46
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $132.94 $132.94
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $146.50 $146.50
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $172.68 $172.68
CDWG 1 EA $174.59 $174.59
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $208.00 $208.00
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
Listening Center (8 positions
w/volume control)
Line 17
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
Valiant IMC 1 EA $7.93 $7.93
Pyramid School Products 1 EA $67.98 $67.98
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $74.00 $74.00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $76.00 $76.00
Security General International, 1 EA $82.50 $82.50
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $122.45 $122.45
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA No Bid
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid
CDWG 1 EA No Bid
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
CompUSA B2B 1 EA No Bid
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid



STEreo SYSTEm 530 wartls o1 total
power(190W x 2: 150W)into a
complete easy to use system
charge, play and control your iPod.
CD player, AM/FM stereo radio, CD-
R/RW discs and MP3 and iPod
player

Line 18 Sony
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $107.55 $107.55

Valiant IMC 1 EA $175.40 $175.40

CDWG 1 EA $193.51 $193.51

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $214.00 $214.00

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

Security General International, 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

CompUSA B2B 1 EA No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA No Bid

Line 19 Heatseal Ultima 65 Laminator (Heat)
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
Valiant IMC 1 EA $879.00 $879.00

Pyramid School Products 1 EA $1,409.95 $1,409.95

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $1,454.48 $1,454.48

Security General International, 1 EA $1,628.00 $1,628.00

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

CDWG 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

CompUSA B2B 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA No Bid



Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA No Bid
Utility Cart 3-shelf with electrical
Line 20 outlets
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
Valiant IMC 1 EA $66.80 $66.80
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $93.50 $93.50
Pyramid School Products 1 EA $129.95 $129.95
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $228.00 $228.00
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $638.93 $638.93
MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA No Bid
Security General International, 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid
CDWG 1 EA No Bid
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
CompUSA B2B 1 EA No Bid
[Line 21 DVD/VCR Combo Player
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
Valiant IMC 1 EA $77.00 $77.00
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $80.19 $80.19
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $84.00 $84.00
CDWG 1 EA $87.29 $87.29
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $90.00 $90.00
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $105.00 $105.00
Security General International, 1 EA $105.00 $105.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $177.84 $177.84
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

[Line 22 DVD Players +/- Recorders




Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $116.00 $116.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $121.91 $121.91

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $122.00 $122.00

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $142.45 $142.45

Valiant IMC 1 EA $156.95 $156.95

CDWG 1 EA $193.51 $193.51

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $225.00 $225.00

Security General International, 1 EA $292.25 $292.25

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid
DVD Home Theater System
DVD Player/AV Receiver
Surround
Sound, Dolby Pro Logic I, Dolby
Digital, DTS decoder, 125 watt-4
Channels: 250 watt-2 channels.
USB direct input, iPod ready.
1xaudio line-in front, 1 x USB
front

Line 23 1x HDMI output rear, 1 x com

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

CDWG 1 EA $166.41 $166.41

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $228.86 $228.86

Security General International, 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

CompUSA B2B 1 EA No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid



MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
Bluetooth over the ear
microphone. Must be compatible

Line 24 with HP and/or Dell computers.

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $47.92 $47.92

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $78.33 $78.33

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $80.68 $80.68

CDWG 1 EA $90.95 $90.95

Security General International, 1 EA $129.50 $129.50

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

[Line 25 USB Microphone

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $16.48 $16.48

CDWG 1 EA $23.11 $23.11

Pyramid School Products 1 EA $23.98 $23.98

MicroAge College Station 1 EA $25.00 $25.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $31.05 $31.05

Valiant IMC 1 EA $51.90 $51.90

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $52.50 $52.50

Security General International, 1 EA $77.50 $77.50

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid



Line 26 USB Headphone with microphone

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $17.68 $17.68
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $22.89 $22.89
Valiant IMC 1 EA $23.00 $23.00
Pyramid School Products 1 EA $23.98 $23.98
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA $24.50 $24.50
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $26.50 $26.50
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $30.83 $30.83
CDWG 1 EA $34.00 $34.00
MicroAge College Station 1 EA $35.00 $35.00
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $39.50 $39.50
Security General International, 1 EA $57.50 $57.50
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, |11 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

DIGITAL CAMERA Kit includes 8gb
memory card, and deluxe soft

Line 27 Canon Powershot A480 carrying case
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $129.90 $129.90

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $130.00 $130.00

CDWG 1 EA $146.30 $146.30

Security General International, 1 EA $156.50 $156.50

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

CompUSA B2B 1 EA No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid



DIGITAL CAMERA Kit Lumix
Camera includes 8 gb memory

Line 28 Panasonic DMC-FS42K card, and deluxe soft carry case
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $131.00 $131.00
Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid
CDWG 1 EA No Bid
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
CompUSA B2B 1 EA No Bid
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA No Bid
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA No Bid
Security General International, 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
DIGITAL CAMERA xs W/18-55MM
xs W/18- includes 8 gb memory card and
Line 29 Canon 55MM deluxe soft carry case
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $524.00 $524.00
CDWG 1 EA $564.05 $564.05
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $603.00 $603.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA No Bid
Security General International, 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
CompUSA B2B 1 EA No Bid
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid
Markertek Video Supply 1 EA No Bid
Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid
SP-LAMP- REPLACEMENT LAMP for InFocus
Line 30 InFocus 057 IN2112 & IN2114




Name OTY UOM Unit Price Extended Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Abacus Computers Inc. 5 EA $142.00 $710.00
CDWG 5 EA $158.27 $791.35
CompUSA B2B 5 EA $163.33 $816.65
Valiant IMC 5 EA $167.67 $838.35
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI5 EA $171.00 $855.00
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 5 EA $171.00 $855.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 5 EA $176.15 $880.75
Markertek Video Supply 5 EA $184.00 $920.00
Security General International, 5 EA $187.00 $935.00
MicroAge College Station 5 EA $188.00 $940.00
Buffalo Business Products 5 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 5 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 115 EA No Bid
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 5 EA No Bid
SP-LAMP- REPLACEMENT LAMP for InFocus
Line 31 InFocus 039 IN2102 & IN2104
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
Abacus Computers Inc. 5 EA $142.00 $710.00
CDWG 5 EA $155.20 $776.00
CompUSA B2B 5 EA $163.04 $815.20
Valiant IMC 5 EA $167.67 $838.35
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI5 EA $170.00 $850.00
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 5 EA $171.00 $855.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 5 EA $179.79 $898.95
Security General International, 5 EA $187.00 $935.00
MicroAge College Station 5 EA $188.00 $940.00
Markertek Video Supply 5 EA $192.00 $960.00
Pyramid School Products 5 EA $229.95 $1,149.75
Schoolhouse Audio Visual 5 EA No Bid
ACP Direct 5 EA No Bid
CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, II5 EA No Bid
SHREDDER Shreds up to 17
sheets, paper clips, staples,and
Line 32 Fellows DVD's
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $188.32 $188.32

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $197.24 $197.24



CDWG 1 EA $216.73 $216.73

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, II1 EA $307.64 $307.64

Security General International, 1 EA $1,687.00 $1,687.00

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
FAX Fax auto feed up to 30 ppm --
gives fax transmittal to show fax

Line 33 Canon -- Brother complete --- no copies

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $109.15 $109.15

CDWG 1 EA $168.99 $168.99

Security General International, 1 EA $340.00 $340.00

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $451.09 $451.09

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA $764.00 $764.00

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
SCANNER Top teed paper
scanner, up to 50ppm scanner
capablity, must include software,
USB cord and

Epson Workforce -- operates with Window 7 HP and

Line 34 Xerox DocuMate -- Dell computers

Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $262.09 $262.09

CDWG 1 EA $360.00 $360.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $377.99 $377.99



Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $698.00 $698.00

Security General International, 1 EA $935.00 $935.00

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA $3,336.00 $3,336.00

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

MicroAge College Station 1 EA No Bid

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
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Includes
Over the Ear style Headset
Noise-Cancelling Microhone
Adustable Volume
Up to 33' Range
Voice Activated Dialing
Works w/ Office Phone &
Bluetooth Mobile Phone
HL-10 Features

Plantronics Automatically Lifts Headset &

Line 35 Voyager 510SL Returns it

Name Q UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $213.00 $213.00

Markertek Video Supply 1 EA $248.00 $248.00

Security General International, 1 EA $249.50 $249.50

CDWG 1 EA $250.00 $250.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $250.65 $250.65

MicroAge College Station 1 EA $252.00 $252.00

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEI1 EA $258.00 $258.00

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual 1 EA No Bid

CompUSA B2B 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

CMC BUSINESS SYSTEMS, 111 EA No Bid

If low bid was not accepted, bid did not meet specifications per Bid document.



