1 |Buttermi|k 1%, 1 quart, 8 per case

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $16.59 $16.59
| 2 |Cheese Chdr Shrp Prnt Yel, 10 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 Cs $30.89 $30.89
| 3 |Cheese Ricotta Wm Unwhipped, 5 Ib, 4 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $35.59 $35.59
| 4 |Cream Sour Pure Gr A, 5 b, 4 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Split price $7.69
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $29.70 $29.70 each
| 5 |Cream Whipping Hvy 40% Frsh, 32 oz, 8 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $42.85 $42.85
| 6 |Egg Shell Large Gr Aa Usda Wht, 15 doz per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $37.75 $37.75
| 7 |Egg White Lig W/Tec Opt Choice, 2 Ib., 12 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $55.90 $55.90

8 |Beef Grnd Bulk 85/15 Frsh Gf, 5 Ib average, 2 per case

Supplier Notes /

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $37.75 $37.75
Beef Ground Bulk
Chilled 80%-20%
Ground Fine, 5 Ib, 2
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $37.75 $37.75 per case
| 9 |Beef Tenderloin Psmo CAB, 5 Ib UP, 1 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
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Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $12.89 $12.89
| 10 |Ham Hock Smkd Frsh, 10 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $2.35 $2.35
| 11 |Pork Butt Bnls Fresh Cellar Trimmed, 5lb, 2 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $3.08 $3.08
| 12 |Pork Loin Boneless CcStrap off 1/8 fresh, 2 each, 6-9 Ib avg
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $2.19 $2.19
| 13 |Pork Belly Sknls trimmed, fresh, 2 each, 8 Ib avg
Supplier Notes /
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $4.39 $4.39
Pork Belly Skingless
Single Rib, 4, 9.5 |b
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $4.39 $4.39 avg
| 14 |Crab Meat Special Pasteurized, 1 Ib, 12 per case
Supplier Notes /
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $419.85  $419.85
Crab Meat Jumbo
Lump Pasteurized,
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $419.85 $419.85 1 lb, 12 per case
| 15 |Musse| Fresh Pei, 10 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier Notes /
Supplier Qry uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $26.95 $26.95
Mussel Whole Shell
Vacuum Pack 23-29
per Ib, 10 Ib, 1 per
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $26.95 $26.95 case

| 16 |0yster Shuck STD Frsh, .5 gal, 1 per case

4176 - Page 2



Supplier Notes /

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $56.65 $56.65
Oyster Shell Fresh
Gulf USA, 100ct per
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $56.65 $56.65 case

| 17 |Salmon Whi Atl Fresh Hd-On 12-14, 12 AVG, 1 per case

Supplier Notes /

Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $7.65 $7.65
Salmon Whole Bay
of Fundy 12-14 Ib
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $7.65 $7.65 avg, 1 per case

| 18 |Sca|lop Sea 10/20Ct Drypk Frsh, 8 Ib, 1 per case

Supplier Notes /

Supplier Qry uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cS $122.80 S$122.80
Scallop Sea 10/20
Dry Bristol, 8 Ib, 1
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $122.80 $122.80 per case

| 19 |Shrimp Gh Brn Block 16/20 Usa, 5 |b, 10 per case

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $492.85  $492.85
| 20 |Shrimp Gh Wht Block 26/30 Usa, 5 Ib, 10 per case
Supplier Notes /
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $147.75 $147.75
Shrimp White
Green Headless 26-
30 perlb,41b, 6
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $147.75  S147.75 per case
| 21 |Ti|apia Fil Skils 7-9 Oz, 10 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $42.95 $42.95
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| 22 [Tilapia Fil Skis Bnls 5-7 Oz, 10 Ib, 1 per case

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $39.90 $39.90
| 23 |Ti|apia Whole, 40 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier Notes /
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $87.79 $87.79
Tilapia Whole 550-
750 g Gutted Gilled
& Scaled, 40 Ib, 1
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $87.79 $87.79 per case
| 24 |Chicken Bone Frsh, 40 Ib, 1 case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $0.66 $0.66
| 25 |Chicken Brst Cvp 5 Oz Single B/S frozen, 5 |b., 4 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $52.59 $52.59
| 26 |Chicken Cvp Whl Wog, 3.25-3.5 Ib AVG Fresh, 12 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $1.55 $1.55
| 27 |Duck Brst Bnls Raw Skin On, 7-8 oz, 32 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $12.29 $12.29
| 28 |Duck Whl Gold Label, 5 - 5.5 |b each, 6 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 o) $4.79 $4.79
| 29 |Apple Slice Igf Granny Smith, 30 Ibs per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $52.70 $52.70
| 30 |Blueberry Wild Maine Iqf, 5 Ib, 2 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $30.85 $30.85
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31

|Bread Baguette Frch Parbkd, 10.5 oz, 30 per case

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $68.65 $68.65
32 |Cherry Red Tart Ptd Igf Gr A, 5 |b, 2 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $25.75 $25.75
33 |Pie Shell Veg Deep Dish 9 in, 8 oz, 20 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $30.55 $30.55
34 |Raspberry Red Whole Iqf Gr A, 5 Ib, 2 per c ase
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $44.85 $44.85
35 |Strawberry Whl Igf, 10 Ib per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $24.69 $24.69
36 |Bread Crumb Jap Panko Toasted, 25 Ib per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $21.90 $21.90
37 |Bread Crumb Plain Med, 7.5 Ib, 2 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 2 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 2 Cs $21.96 $43.92
38 |Caper Nonpareil Imported, 32 oz, 6 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $50.88 $50.88
39 |Cocoa Bkng Pwdr Nat, 5 Ib, 6 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $207.90  $207.90 Split price $34.65
40 |Corn Meal Yellow, 25 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $12.55 $12.55
41 |Corn Starch, 1 lb, 24 per case
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Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $21.59 $21.59
| 42 |Cracker Crumb Graham, 10 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $27.85 $27.85
| 43 |Extract Vanilla Pure, 16 0z, 12 per case
Supplier Notes /
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $260.75  $260.75
Extra Vanilla Pure,
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $260.75 $260.75 16 oz, 6 per case
| 44 |Paste Vanilla Bean, 32 oz, 1 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $145.70  $145.70
| 45 |Flour Baker, 12% protein hard red winter wheat, 50 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $19.97 $19.97
| 46 |Flour Cake Purasnow, 50 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $19.65 $19.65
| 47 |Flour H&R All Purpose, 50 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $15.85 $15.85
| 48 |Flour Polyana Pie & Cookie, 50 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $21.99 $21.99
| 49 |Juice Clam Ocean No Msg, 46 oz, 12 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $50.78 $50.78
| 50 |0i| Olive Extra Virgin Italy, 1 gal, 3 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
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Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $107.90 S$107.90
51 |0i| Olive Pomace ltaly, 1 gal, 3 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $66.79 $66.79
52 |0i| Vegetable Pure, 1 gal, 6 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $51.89 $51.89
53 |0Iive Kalamata Pitted, 2 kilo, 6 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Split price $19.99
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $115.89  $115.89 each
54 |Rice Long Grain, 50 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $23.70 $23.70
55 |Salt Kosher, 3 Ib, 12 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cS $29.69 $29.69
56 |Spice Pepper White Ground, 18 oz, 6 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Split price $19.59
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $107.85 $107.85 each
57 |Shortening Liq ZTF, 35 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $48.89 $48.89
58 |Sugar Brown Light Cane, 2 lb, 12 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $28.78 $28.78
59 |Sugar Confectioner 10X Cane, 50 Ib, 1 per case
Supplier Qry UoM Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $45.70 $45.70

60

|Sugar Granulated Extra Fine Cane, 50 Ib, 1 per case
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Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $33.98 $33.98
| 61 |Syrup Corn Light Red Label, 1 gal, 4 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $14.99 $14.99
| 62 |Tomato Crushed All Purp Fcy, No.10, 6 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $34.85 $34.85
| 63 |Tomato Diced In Juice No Salt, No.10, 6 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $35.80 $35.80
| 64 |Tomato Paste Fancy, 120z, 24 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $46.65 $46.65
| 65 |Tomato Whole Pld In Jce Xstd, No.10, 6 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cS $34.79 $34.79
| 66 |Vinegar Apple Cider, 1 gal, 4 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $35.99 $35.99
| 67 |Vinegar Balsamic Italy, 5 LTR, 2 per case
Supplier Notes /
Supplier Qry uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $46.65 $46.65
Vinegar Balsamic
Italy, 5 LTR, 2 per
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $46.65 S46.65 case
| 68 |Yeast Instant Direct, 1 Ib, 20 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $62.79 $62.79
| 69 |Bag Plas 10X14 Hi-Den Clr, 10X14, 1000 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
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Unipak Corporation 1 BX No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 BX $66.75 $66.75
70 |Bag Plas Reclose Gal Xx-Heavy, 250 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 BX No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 BX $26.68 $26.68
71 |Bag Plas Reclose Qrt 7X8 Xxhvy, 500 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 BX No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 BX $26.69 $26.69
72 |Box Pastry 10X10X5.5, 100 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $53.89 $53.89
73 |Box Pastry White 10X10X4, 100 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs S42.97 $42.97
74 |Cloth Chs Reg Wgt 36 in, 60 yds per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $57.77 §57.77
75 |Cup Portion Plas Trans 2 Oz, 250 CT, 10 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $35.89 $35.89
76 |Foi| Almn Roll Hvy Wgt 500 Ft , 18 in
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 RO No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 RO $34.60 $34.60
77 |Glove Latex Fdsvc Pwdrfree Lrg, 100 CT, 4 per CS
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $40.85 $40.85
78 |Glove Latex Fdsvc Pwdrfree Med, 100 CT, 4 per CS
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $37.68 $37.68
79 |Glove Latex Fdsvc Pwdrfree Sml. 100 CT, 4 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
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Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $39.97 $39.97
80 |Liner Pan Paper Quillon, 16x24, 1000 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $47.99 $47.99
81 |Liner Trash 38X58 1.1 Mil Grey, 60 gal, 100 per box
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
UPC3858C1.1 as
Unipak Corporation 1 BX $16.40 $16.40 per spec
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 BX $40.95 $40.95
82 |Pad Scour Grn 6X9In Antimicro, 20 per box
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 BX No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 BX $9.99 $9.99

83

|Plate Paper Wht Lt Wt 9 in., Uncoated, 100 CT per pkg, 12 pkg per box

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $45.90 $45.90
84 |Cleaner Degrsr Oven & Grl Arsl, 20 oz, 6 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $37.59 $37.59
85 |Parsley Italian Frsh, 6 CT per pkg
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 PKG No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 PKG $10.95 $10.95
86 |Pepper Green Bell, whole, fresh, 5 Ib pkg
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 PKG No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 PKG $15.85 $15.85
87 |Squash Zucchini, Med, Fresh, 5 |b pkg
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 PKG No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 PKG $13.98 $13.98
88 |Pecan Half Med Fancy Raw, 5 Ib pkg
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 PKG No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 PKG $62.85 $62.85
89 |Wa|nut Halves and PCS Raw, 5 Ib Pkg
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 PKG No Bid
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Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 PKG $47.66 $47.66
90 |BEEF GRND BULK 90/10 FRSH GF
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $3.84 $3.84
91 |Mustard Dijon, 8 oz, 6 per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $33.59 $33.59
92 |Pan Coating ARSL Hi Ht Baking
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $35.97 $35.97
93 |FILM Pvc Roll 2000Ft, 24 IN
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 BX No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 BX $30.59 $30.59
94 |BUTTER SOLID UNSALTED GRD A
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $118.98 $118.98
95 |Cheese Cream Grade A, 3 |b., 10 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $77.70 $77.70
96 |Mi|k Homogenized, 1 gal, 4 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $22.62 $22.62
97 |Cheese, Grana Padano 1/8 S
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $8.79 $8.79
98 |Creamer Half & Half, 8/32 oz
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $25.79 $25.79
99 |Bacon Layflat 18/22 Ct Tx Smkd, 15 Ib per case
Supplier Qry UoM Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $75.65 $75.65
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| 100 |Egg Yolk unsugared Liq, 15/ 1 Ib per case

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $31.89 $31.89
| 101 |Dough Phyllo,12/1 Ib per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $39.70 $39.70
| 102 |Peach Sliced, IQF, 2/5 Lb per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $29.79 $29.79
| 103 |Spice Pepper Blk Table Grnd Ground, 18 oz, 6 per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Split Price $19.59
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $106.85  $106.85 each
| 104 {Cup Souffle Papr 2 oz BX PLT, 10/250 ct per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $55.59 $55.59
| 105 |Detergent Hand Solid Solitaire, 2/5 Ib per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $157.98 $157.98
| 106 |Sanitizer Oasis 146 Multi Quat, 1/2.5 Gal
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $187.90 $187.90
| 107 |Nut, Almond Whl w/skin, 1/5 Ib per case
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $62.75 $62.75
| 108 |Nut, Pistachio, Shelled, Raw, 3/2 Ib per case
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $125.85 $125.85
| 109 |Nut, Filbert HZLNT Blanched WHL, 1/ 5 Ib
Supplier Qry UoM Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $68.85 $68.85
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[ 110 |[MILK 2% GALLON

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $19.93 $19.93

[ 111 [MILK WHOLE GALLON

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $21.50 $21.50

[ 112 |[MILK CHOCOLATE

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $20.75 $20.75

| 113 [BEEF PATTY GRD SEA RND FRZ

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $76.80 $76.80

| 114 |CHICKEN CVP TENDER MARINATED

Supplier Notes /

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $115.85 $115.85

Chicken Breast

Tenders Jumbo

Controlled Vacuum
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $115.85 $115.85 Packed

| 115 [CHICKEN BREAST BREADED RAW

Supplier Notes /

Supplier Qry uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $39.90 $39.90

Chicken Breast
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $39.90 $39.90 Breaded Fillets Raw

| 116 [CHICKEN BRST GRILL PCK MBE

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cS $54.86 $54.86

| 117 |POTATO FRY SKON WAFFLE SPICY

Supplier Notes /
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
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Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $41.70 $41.70
Potato Fry Skin-On
Waffle Spicy, 4.5 Ib,
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $41.70 $41.70 6 per case
| 118 [POTATO FRY 3/8 HNY SRIRACHA
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $39.96 $39.96
| 119 |PIZZA CRUST PARBK OVAL
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $38.89 $38.89
| 120 [BUN HAMBURGER PLAIN 4 1.720Z
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $41.89 $41.89
| 121 |POTATO FRY SKON 1/4 RCPCH
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $39.99 $39.99
| 122 [DOUGH BISCUIT BTRMLK DROP
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs S44.77 S44.77
| 123 |BUN SAND KRISPY KRUNCHY
Supplier Notes /
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $62.69 $62.69
Bun Sandwich
White Sourdough, 4
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $62.69 $62.69 0z, 96 per case
| 124 [WATER SPRING ECO SHAPE
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $8.65 $8.65
| 125 |WATER SPRING ECO SHAPE
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $8.65 $8.65
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| 126 |BREADING CHICKEN BALE PK

Supplier Notes /

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $32.60 $32.60
Breading Mix
Chicken Traditional
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $32.60 $32.60 West Style
| 127 [SHORTENING LIQ ZTF
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $48.89 $48.89
| 128 |SODA DR PPR REG
Supplier QTYy Uuom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $11.99 $11.99
| 129 [JUICE APPLE PET
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $21.80 $21.80
| 130 |SODA SPRITE PET PROPR DIMPLE
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $38.89 $38.89
| 131 [DRINK RASP COOL BLUE WIDEMOUTH
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $25.65 $25.65
| 132 |CONTAINER FOAM HNG 3C DBL TAB
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $22.98 $22.98
| 133 [TOMATO 2 LAYER 5X6 FRESH
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $25.63 $25.63
| 134 |[SPREAD HUMMUS
Supplier Qry UuoM Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $22.75 $22.75
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| 135 |SPREAD HUMMUS CLS W/ PRETZELS

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $25.70 $25.70
| 136 [TOMATO CHERRY FRESH
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $22.69 $22.69
| 137 |CUCMBER FRESH
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $24.68 $24.68
| 138 |CABBAGE RED SHRED 1/8
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $28.68 $28.68
| 139 |[BROCCOLI FCY FRESH ICELE
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $28.80 $28.80
| 140 [SPINACH CLIPPED FRESH
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $26.96 $26.96
| 141 |YOGURT STW/BLU BLK CHRY GREEK
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $17.99 $17.99
| 142 [CREAMER HALF & HALF
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cS $25.88 $25.88
| 143 |CHEESE CHEDDAR MILD CUBED YEL
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $36.96 $36.96
| 144 [ROLL DINNER YEAST PARBAKED
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $20.96 $20.96
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| 145 [ENTR?E MACARONI & CHS

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas cs $40.79 $40.79
| 146 |SODA COKE CLS CONTOUR TRAY PK
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas CS $38.75 $38.75
| 147 [DRESSING RANCH DIP CUP
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas cs $33.59 $33.59
| 148 |DRINK ENERGY RED BULL
Supplier Notes /
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas CS $50.95 $50.95
Drink Energy
Monster, 16 oz, 24
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas CS $50.95 $50.95 per case
| 149 |[KETCHUP PACKET POLY
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas CS $26.66 $26.66
| 150 [JUICE ORANGE PET 100%
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas cs $23.65 $23.65
| 151 |SAUCE HONEY MUST DIPPING CUP
Supplier Notes /
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas CS $20.90 $20.90
Sauce Mustard
Honey Dip Cup, 1
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas CS $20.90 $20.90 oz, 100 per case
| 152 |SAUCE ORIGINAL DIPPING CUP
Supplier Notes /
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended Alternate
Description
Unipak Corporation CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas CS $42.70 $42.70
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Sauce Barbecue
Reserve Dip Cup, 1

[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $42.70 $42.70 oz, 200 per case
| 153 |DRINK FRUIT PUNCH WIDEMOUTH PL
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $24.99 $24.99
| 154 |LETTUCE ICEBERG PREMIUM PLTIZD
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $27.65 $27.65
| 155 [DRINK PROTEIN CHOC RTD
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $37.74 $37.74
| 156 |MILK SKIM GALLON
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $17.97 $17.97
| 157 [FRANK ALL MEAT 5X1 6IN
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $34.60 $34.60
| 158 |[BACON LAYOUT 18/22 SMOKED
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $69.95 $69.95
| 159 |[TURKEY BURGER ALL WHITE 5.330Z
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $31.70 $31.70
| 160 |BEAN RED WHOLESOME HALAL
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $46.88 $46.88
| 161 [DRINK ENERGY MONSTER
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $50.95 $50.95
| 162 |SNACK CHEESE CRUNCHY HOT LSS
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
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Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $36.69
| 163 [SODA cOLA PET
Supplier Qry UuoM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $22.99
| 164 [SODA DR PPR DIET
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $28.90
| 165 |CHIP POTATO KETTLE VARIETY PAK
Supplier Qry UuoM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $31.85
| 166 [SAUCE RANCH HMSTY DIPPING CUP
Supplier Notes /
Supplier Qry uom Unit Price
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $33.65
Sauce Ranch Dip
Cup, 1.5 oz, 128 per
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $33.65 $33.65 case
| 167 [SNACK BAR RICE KRISPIES TREAT
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $49.98
| 168 |SNACK CHIP MES BBQ LAY S STAX
Supplier Qry UuoM Unit Price Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $15.98
| 169 [SAUCE BBQ SWT STHRN DIP CUP
Supplier Notes /
Supplier Qry uom Unit Price
Description
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $24.70
Sauce BBQ Cup, 1.5
[ALT1] Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $24.70 $24.70 oz, 100 per case
| 170 [SODA COKE ZERO CONTOUR PET
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
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Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $39.97 $39.97
| 171 [Soda Mt Dew PET
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $22.98 $22.98
| 172 |JUICE DRINK BERRY BLEND SPLASH
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $17.75 $17.75
| 173 [CHIP MULTIGRAIN CARIETY PAK
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $31.96 $31.96
| 174 |[TOPPING HONEY SWEET
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $48.85 $48.85
| 175 [TORTILLA FLOUR PRESS 6 IN.
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $30.59 $30.59
| 176 |CONTAINER FOAM HNG 1C DBL TAB 9X9X3
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $19.98 $19.98
| 177 [CUP PLS CLR PET 2402
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $80.86 $80.86
| 178 |FORK PLAS REFILL MW SMTSK BLK
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $44.92 $44.92
| 179 [NAPKIN DISP XPRESSNET NAT
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $53.89 $53.89
| 180 [MUSHROOM SLICED FRESH
Supplier Qry UuoM Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $22.95 $22.95
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| 181 |LETTUCE ROMAINE FRESH W/LINER

Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $31.75 $31.75
| 182 [SQUASH YELLOW MED FRESH
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $14.99 $14.99
| 183 |PEPPER RED BELL FRESH
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $29.96 $29.96
| 184 |ONION YELLOW JUMBO FRESH
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $18.89 $18.89
| 185 |BANANA GREEN TIP FRESH
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $21.88 $21.88
| 186 |BASIL FRESH HERB
Supplier QTYy uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 cs $7.87 $7.87
| 187 |GUACAMOLE FRESH SABRA WITH TOSTITOS G&G
Supplier QTY uom Unit Price  Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 CS No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 CS $28.85 $28.85
| 188 |Dairy
Percent
Supplier QTY uom Markup Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 16
| 189 |Canned and Dry
Percent
Supplier QTY uom Markup Extended  Supplier Notes
Unipak Corporation 1 No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 1 16
| 190 |Produce
Percent
Supplier QTY uom Markup Extended  Supplier Notes
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Unipak Corporation No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 16
| 191 |Frozen
Percent
Supplier TY uom Extended  Supplier Notes
PP Q Markup pp
Unipak Corporation No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 16
[ 192 |Poultry
Percent
Supplier TY uom Extended  Supplier Notes
PP Q Markup pp
Unipak Corporation No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 16
| 193 |Seafood
Percent
Supplier TY uom Extended  Supplier Notes
PP Q Markup pp
Unipak Corporation No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 16
| 194 |Shellfish
Percent
Supplier TY uom Extended  Supplier Notes
PP Q Markup e
Unipak Corporation No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 16
[ 195 |Meats
Percent
Supplier TY uom Extended  Supplier Notes
PP Q Markup e
Unipak Corporation No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 16
| 196 |Paper and Disposal
Percent
Supplier TY uom Extended  Supplier Notes
PP Q Markup e
Unipak Corporation No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 16
| 197 |Supp|ies and Equipment
Percent
Supplier TY uom Extended  Supplier Notes
PP Q Markup e
Unipak Corporation No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 16
| 198 |Chemica|s and Janitorial
Percent
Supplier TY uom Extended  Supplier Notes
PP Q Markup e
Unipak Corporation No Bid
Sysco Foods of Dallas 16
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