Ambassador Wheelchair Service Inc

Curtin Motor Livery Service Inc

2P24-060 Bid Tabulation SPED Transportation (1).xlsx

B-Line Transportation

CT Transportation Solutions

Collaborative Student Transportation

Kids Wheels LLC

WALLINGFORD

ScHOOL Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip
TRANSPORTATION SITE van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation
[ACES MILL ACADEMY 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 222.00 302.00 222.00 302.00 261.00 321.00 309.38 315.00 367.00 315.00 386.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
ACES SAIL PROGRAM 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 222.00 322.00 222.00 322,00 261.00 321.00 309.38 314.00 366.00 314.00 372.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
|ACES VILLAGE SCHOOL 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 222.00 302.00 222.00 302.00 24650 306.50 292.19 318.00 371.00 318.00 376.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
'ACES WHITNEY »
CADEMY 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 282.00 362.00 282.00 362.00 320.00 374.00 320.00 396.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
ADELBROOK LEARNING
TR OF CROMWELL 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 186.00 266.00 186.00 266.00 188.50 248.50 223.44 276.00 294.00 276.00 317.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 155.00 155.00
ADELBROOK LEARNING
CTR OF EAST 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 216.00 296.00 216.00 296.00 246.50 292.00 275.00 326.00 379.00 326.00 360.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 155.00 155.00
HARTFORD
ADELBROOK LEARNING
290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 234.00 314.00 234.00 314.00 24650 306.50 292.19 336.00 393.00 336.00 374.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
CTR OF MANCHESTER
AMERICAN SCHOOL :
FOR THE DEAF 250.00 360.00 240.00 80.00 174.00 254.00 174.00 254.00 21750 27750 257.81 292.00 337.00 292.00 325.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
[ARCH BRIDGE SCHOOL 290.00 280.00 270.00 80.00 192.00 272.00 192.00 272.00 261.00 321.00 309.38 231.00 266.00 231.00 314.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
ASPIRE LIVING AND
80.00 462.00 542.00 462.00 542.00 522.00 582.00 618.75 185.00 215.00 180.00 bid 250.00 250.00
LEARNING STAMFORD 350.00 440.00 320.00 no ol
ASPIRE LIVING AND
80.00 372.00 452.00 372.00 452.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 bid 250.00 250.00
LEARNING STRATFORD 320.00 400.00 300.00 no ol
ASPIRE LIVING AND
320.00 400.00 300.00 80.00 372.00 452.00 372.00 452.00 406.00 466.00 481.25 378.00 441.00 378.00 464.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
LEARNING TRUMBULL
BEN BRONZ ACADEMY 250.00 360.00 240.00 80.00 162.00 242.00 162.00 242.00 21750 27750 257.81 300.00 348.00 300.00 335.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
BENHAVEN ACADEMY 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 164.00 244.00 164.00 244.00 232.00 292.00 275.00 281.00 325.00 281.00 344.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
BENHAVEN SCHOOL 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 196.00 276.00 196.00 276.00 232.00 292.00 275.00 278.00 320.00 278.00 342.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
CHARLES F. HAYDEN :
S CHOOL MILFORD 320.00 400.00 320.00 80.00 303.00 383.00 303.00 383.00 377.00 437.00 446.88 372.00 433.00 372.00 469.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
CREC FGTN VALLEY
REGIONAL DIAGNOSTIC 250.00 360.00 240.00 80.00 168.00 248.00 168.00 248.00 299.00 346.00 299.00 323.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
cTR
CREC IMP PLAINVILLE 250.00 360.00 240.00 80.00 119.00 199.00 119.00 199.00 215.00 299.00 215.00 248.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 110.00 110.00
I
ﬁgii;i“g; ALLISON 290.00 380.00 240.00 80.00 216.00 296.00 216.00 296.00 325.00 378.00 325.00 358.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
CREC RIVER STREET
S CHOOL WINDSOR 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 221.00 301.00 221.00 301.00 24650 306.50 292.19 373.00 434.00 373.00 406.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 200.00 200.00
CREC RIVER STREET
SCHOOL BIRKEN 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 221.00 301.00 221.00 301.00 232.00 292.00 275.00 368.00 427.00 368.00 401.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
cAMPUS
CREC SOUNDBRIDGE 250.00 360.00 260.00 80.00 162.00 242.00 162.00 242.00 290.00 350.00 343.75 284.00 326,00 284.00 317.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
CTJUNIOR REPUBLIC :
LTCHRIELD 290.00 380.00 260.00 80.00 197.00 277.00 197.00 277.00 232.00 292.00 275.00 242.00 278.00 242.00 308.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
DEVEREUX :
290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 210.00 290.00 210.00 290.00 27550 335.50 326.56 263.00 304.00 263.00 332.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
GLENHOLME SCHOOL
EAGLE HOUSE 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 192.00 272.00 192.00 272.00 203.00 263.00 24063 304.00 352.00 304.00 337.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 bid 170.00 170.00
EDUCATION PROGRAM - - - : . : . : - . - - : - : - - - no ol - -
EDADVANCE —
PARTNERSHIP 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 174.00 254.00 174.00 254.00 63.80 123.80 75.63 185.00 203.00 185.00 237.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 110.00 110.00
LEARNING ACADEMY
EDADVANCE - STEPS 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 262.00 342.00 262.00 342.00 203.00 263.00 240.63 230.00 244.00 230.00 287.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 165.00 165.00
NCE—
EE:E;’E Df\EN BG[;[;ESS 350.00 440.00 320.00 80.00 312.00 392.00 312.00 392.00 377.00 437.00 446.88 379.00 442.00 379.00 476.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
| EZEGEEE )
oo 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 258.00 338.00 258.00 338.00 261.00 321.00 309.38 310.00 360.00 310.00 378.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
FAVARH RIVER BEND 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 162.00 242.00 162.00 242.00 188.50 24850 223.44 294.00 288.00 294.00 284.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 160.00 160.00
TRANSITION ACADEMY - - - : 8 8 8 : - - - - - : - - - - : -
FFVTA ARMINGTON
VALLEY TRANSITION 250.00 360.00 240.00 80.00 162.00 242.00 162.00 242.00 232.00 292.00 275.00 277.00 346.00 277.00 333.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
ACADEMY
R RT
EAi‘STZSJA scHoot 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 162.00 242.00 162.00 242.00 203.00 263.00 24063 266.00 307.00 266.00 301.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
;ﬁf&i’;ﬂm scHoot 320.00 400.00 320.00 80.00 303.00 383.00 303.00 383.00 406.00 466.00 481.25 376.00 438.00 376.00 473.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
Ziizz’:ﬂw scroot 320.00 400.00 320.00 80.00 303.00 383.00 303.00 383.00 319.00 379.00 37813 340.00 362.00 340.00 427.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
FUTURES SCHOOL
MIDDLEIOWN 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 204.00 284.00 204.00 284.00 276.00 320.00 276.00 329.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
FUTURES SCHOOL )
ST HARTEORD 250.00 360.00 240.00 80.00 162.00 242.00 162.00 242.00 174.00 234.00 206.25 277.00 319.00 277.00 310.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
GENGRAS CENTER 250.00 360.00 240.00 80.00 162.00 242.00 162.00 242.00 203.00 263.00 24063 295.00 341.00 295.00 328.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 165.00 165.00
GRACE WEBB I0L 240.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 185.00 265.00 185.00 265.00 203.00 263.00 24063 305.00 353.00 305.00 338.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 165.00 165.00
I
HIGH ROAD SCHOOL 320.00 400.00 320.00 80.00 432.00 512.00 432.00 512.00 464.00 524.00 550.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 250.00 250.00
FAIRFIELD COUNTY
HIGH ROAD SCHOOL :
HARTFORD HIGH 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 210.00 290.00 210.00 290.00 203.00 263.00 24063 314.00 366.00 314.00 348.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
HIGH ROAD SCHOOL
HARTEORD PRIMARY 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 196.00 276.00 196.00 276.00 188.50 248.50 223.44 316.00 331.00 316.00 321.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
HIGH ROAD SCHOOL :
290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 196.00 276.00 196.00 276.00 24650 306.50 292.19 283.00 327.00 283.00 342.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00




Ambassador Wheelchair Service Inc

Curtin Motor Livery Service Inc

2P24-060 Bid Tabulation SPED Transportation (1).xlsx
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SOMERSVILLE

scHoOL Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth|Nurse round trip
TRANSPORTATION SITE van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation
INTENSIVE ED
acAdmmy 290.00 38000 270.00 80.00 185.00 265.00 185.00 265.00 203.00 263.00 240.63 297.00 344.00 297.00 33100 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
MANCHESTER
MEMORIAL CLINICAL 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 221.00 301.00 221.00 301.00 261.00 32100 30038 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
DAY SCHOOL
MELORIA ACADEMY 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 214.00 294.00 214.00 294.00 217.50 277.50 257.81 257.00 297.00 257.00 31600 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
MIDDLESEX 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 210.00 290.00 210.00 290.00 203.00 263.00 240.63 277.00 32200 277.00 33000 185.00 215.00 180.00 bid 185.00 185.00
[ TRANSITION ACADEMY - - - i - - - - . . - ’ : ’ - - - - no ol - -
MILESTONES
BEHAVIORAL SVCS 320,00 40000 320,00 80.00 270.00 350.00 270.00 35000 42050 48050 498.44 37400 435.00 37400 469.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
MILESTONES
BEHAVIORAL SVCS 320,00 40000 320,00 80.00 312.00 392.00 312.00 39200 42050 48050 498.44 38100 43100 38100 466.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
JORANGE
T PIT,
NATCHAUG HOSPITAL 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 36000 44000 36000 44000 377.00 437.00 44688 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
INPATIENT SCHOOL
T PIT,
T:uﬁzéyfc:cci: AL 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 36000 44000 36000 44000 377.00 437.00 44688 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
NATCHAUG HOSPITAL
MANSFIELD CDT GREEN 320.00 400.00 320.00 80.00 36000 44000 36000 44000 435.00 495.00 515.63 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 250.00 250.00
VALLEY
NATCHAUG HOSPITAL
SCHOOL CDT 320.00 400.00 320.00 80.00 36000 44000 36000 44000 39150 45150 464.06 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 250.00 250.00
MANSFIELD
NATCHAUG HOSPITAL
SCHOOL CDT 320.00 40000 320.00 80.00 264.00 344.00 264.00 344.00 39150 45150 464.06 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 250.00 250,00
SHORELINE
NATCHAUG HOSPITAL
SCHOOL JOSHUA CTR 32000 40000 32000 80.00 306.00 386.00 306.00 386.00 522.00 582.00 618.75 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 250,00 250.00
NE
NATCHAUG HOSPITAL
SCHOOL JOSHUA CTR 320.00 400.00 320.00 80.00 42000 500.00 42000 500.00 406.00 466.00 48125 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 250.00 250.00
THAMES
NATCHAUG HOSPITAL
SCHOOL JOSHUA CTR 32000 40000 32000 80.00 306.00 386.00 306.00 386.00 319.00 379.00 37813 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
ENFIELD
[NORTAWEST VILLAGE
SCHOOL / WHEELER 250.00 360.00 240.00 80.00 119.00 199.00 119.00 199.00 87.00 147.00 103.13 219.00 249.00 219.00 245.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 110.00 110,00
INIC
OAK HILL SCHOOL AT )
290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 210.00 290.00 210.00 290.00 203.00 263.00 240.63 272.00 31000 272.00 32000 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
[ANN ANTOLINI SCHOOL
;’:‘::[LLLL SCHOOL AT 250.00 36000 240.00 80.00 79.00 159.00 79.00 159.00 183.00 200.00 183.00 226.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 90.00 90.00
g:ﬁ;‘; ii:om AT 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 79.00 159.00 79.00 159.00 43.50 103.50 51.56 183.00 200.00 183.00 226.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 90.00 90.00
OAK HILL SCHOOL AT
FGTN VALLEY 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 162.00 242.00 162.00 242.00 246.50 306.50 292.19 293.00 338.00 293.00 317.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
INT
OAK HILL SCHOOL AT
HADDAM- 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 204.00 284.00 204.00 284.00 261.00 32100 30038 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
ILUINGWORTH
OAK HILL SCHOOL AT )
FARTFORD PRIVARY 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 210.00 290.00 210.00 290.00 232.00 292.00 275.00 31000 36000 31000 343.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
OAK HILL SCHOOL AT 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 210.00 290.00 210.00 290.00 232.00 292.00 275.00 31000 36000 31000 343.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 bid 150.00 150.00
HARTFORD SECONDARY, - - - : ' ' ' - : ) - - - - - - - - no ol - -
OAK HILL SCHOOL AT
290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 32400 404.00 32400 404.00 333.50 393.50 395.31 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
HEMLOCKS CENTER
OAK FILL SCHOOL AT
PLAINVILLE MIDDLE 250.00 36000 240.00 80.00 102.00 182.00 102.00 182.00 101.50 161.50 120.31 220,00 251.00 220,00 243.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 11000 11000
cHoOL
Sg::&;;mom AT 290.00 38000 270.00 80.00 210,00 290.00 210.00 290.00 203.00 263.00 240.63 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
oPTIONS
EDUCATIONAL 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 185.00 265.00 185.00 265.00 174.00 234.00 206.25 287.00 333.00 287.00 32000 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 150.00 150.00
SERVICES HARTFORD
PACES 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 162.00 242.00 162.00 242.00 292.00 437.00 292.00 325.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
PATHWAYS ACADEMY
ST HAVEN 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 318.00 398.00 318.00 398.00 406.00 466.00 48125 41200 48100 41200 47000 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
PRISM ACADEMY 290.00 38000 270.00 80.00 132.00 212.00 132.00 21200 130.50 190.50 154.69 237.00 27100 237.00 27100 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 155.00 155.00
Y|
:éHggf‘D HiLL 250.00 360.00 240.00 80.00 143.00 223.00 143.00 223.00 139.20 199.20 165.00 237.00 271.00 237.00 270.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 155.00 155.00
RIVER RUN ACADEMY
AT sUSAN WAYNE 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 462.00 542.00 462.00 542.00 565.50 625.50 67031 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 250.00 250.00
CENTER
RUSHFORD ACADEMY 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 208.00 288.00 208.00 288.00 246.50 306.50 292.19 293.00 341.00 293.00 353.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 185.00 185.00
INT RII
Z}::L\DE(i;I\:HE NE 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 37200 452.00 37200 45200 42050 48050 49844 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 250,00 250.00
SOLTERRA ACADEMY 250.00 360.00 240.00 80.00 143.00 223.00 143.00 223.00 174.00 234.00 206.25 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 155.00 155.00
ST VINCENT SPECIAL
NEEDS SCHOOL 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 31800 398.00 31800 398.00 42050 48050 49844 356.00 413.00 356.00 442,00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 250,00 250.00
PROGRAM
[THE LEARNING CLINIC
80.00 462.00 542.00 462.00 542.00 522.00 582.00 618.75 185.00 215.00 180.00 bid 250.00 250.00
e e 320.00 400.00 320.00 noti
Y
Z::TSSZECH reRoR 320.00 400.00 320.00 80.00 342.00 422.00 342.00 422.00 42050 480.50 498.44 418.00 489.00 418.00 504.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 250.00 250.00
Y
[HE SPEECH ACADEM 320.00 400.00 320.00 80.00 34200 42200 34200 42200 42050 48050 49844 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00
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2P24-060 Bid Tabulation SPED Transportation (1).xlsx
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SCHOOL Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth[Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth [Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth[Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth[Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth[Nurse round trip Daily rate per run | Daily rate per run HC | Daily rate per run oth[Nurse round trip
[TRANSPORTATION SITE van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation van van veh transportation
VW:LT:‘(SCHOOL INTHE 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 162.00 242.00 162.00 242.00 246.50 306.50 292.19 309.00 353.00 309.00 332.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 165.00 165.00
SWC:T;C':[ORDCOUNTRV 320.00 400.00 320.00 80.00 432.00 512.00 432.00 512.00 565.50 625.50 670.31 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 250.00 250.00

WHITNEY HALL SCHOOL| 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 214.00 294.00 214.00 294.00 319.00 379.00 378.13 317.00 370.00 317.00 391.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00

Zgggmu“ 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 336.00 416.00 336.00 416.00 406.00 466.00 481.25 375.00 437.00 375.00 467.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00

YALE CHILD STUDY

CENTER SCHOOL 290.00 380.00 270.00 80.00 306.00 386.00 306.00 386.00 333.50 393.50 395.31 350.00 409.00 350.00 430.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 225.00 225.00

IN-TOWN SPED
|mmsmRT 240.00 280.00 220.00 80.00 79.00 159.00 79.00 159.00 193.00 214.00 193.00 215.00 185.00 215.00 180.00 no bid 90.00 90.00

Per 2 way ride Per addl student Per 2 way ride Per addl student Per 2 way ride Per addl student Per 2 way ride Per addl student Per 2 way ride Per addl student Per 2 way ride Per addl student

MCKINNEY VENTO MCKINNEY VENTO MCKINNEY VENTO MCKINNEY VENTO MCKINNEY VENTO MCKINNEY VENTO

SHORT 250.00 10.00 SHORT SHORT SHORT no bid no bid SHORT 185.00 5.00 SHORT 150.00 175.00

MCKINNEY VENTO MCKINNEY VENTO MCKINNEY VENTO IMCKINNEY VENTO IMCKINNEY VENTO MCKINNEY VENTO

LONG 290.00 10.00 LONG LONG LONG no bid no bid LONG 205.00 5.00 LONG 15.00 15.00

S M L XL S M L XL S M L XL S M L XL S M L XL S M L XL
HARNESS CHARGE
200.00 200.00 220.00 240.00 145.00 145.00 145.00 145.00 151.00 151.00 151.00 151.00 180.00 180.00 180.00 230.00 75.00 75.00 75.00 75.00 150.00 150.00 180.00 180.00

| 2024-2025 | 2025-2026 |  2026-2027 | | 2024-2025 | 2025-2026 |  2026-2027 | | 2024-2025 | 2025-2026 |  2026-2027 | | 2024-2025 | 2025-2026 |  2026-2027 | | 2024-2025 | 2025-2026 |  2026-2027 | | 2024-2025 | 2025-2026 |  2026-2027 |
Jwneeichair s incr n/a 5% | 5% | | 1% | 2% | 3% | | | | | | [ 3% | 3% | | 20 | 20% [ 20% | | ox | o [ 0% |

Monitor 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027

incremental charge 28.00 29.12 30.28 125.00 130.00 135.00 60.00 65.00 65.00 27.00 28.00 29.00 65.00 67.70 70.50 100.00 110.00 120.00

NEW LOCATION 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027 2024-2025 2025-2026 2026-2027

Rate per Hour 58.00 60.32 62.73 129.00 132.87 137.52 8D ? 8D ? 8D ? 60.00 62.50 65.10 8D ? 8D ? 8D ?

Rate per Mile 2.75 2.86 2.97 8D ? 8D ? 8D ? 3.00 3.13 3.25 8D ? 8D ? 8D ?

| Escalator Rate FY2025-2026 4% FY2026-2027 4% | Fv2025-2026 FY2026-2027 | Fv2025-2026 3% FY2026-2027 3.5% | | Fv2025-2026 3% FY2026-2027 3% | Fv2025-2026 | 4% | FY2026-2027 | 4% | Fv2025-2026 5% FY2026-2027 5%

Brokered service, removed from consideration




