No.

UNITED INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

AGENDA ACTION ITEM

TOPIC: CONSIDERATION FOR APPROVAL OF BIDS, PROPOSALS, AND QUALIFICATIONS
SUBMITTED BY: MS. CORDELIA FLORES-JACKSON 0F: PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
APPROVED FOR TRANSMITTAL TO SCHOOL BOARD: SEPTEMBER 17, 2008

RECOMMENDATIONS:

STAFF RECOMMENDS THE UISD BOARD OF TRUSTEES APPROVE THE FOLLOWING BIDS, PROPOSALS, &
QUALIFICATIONS AS PRESENTED:

BIDS/PROPOSALS/QUALIFICATIONS

FACILITIES & MAINTENANCE DEPT:

CSP 2008-066 METAL CANOPY STRUCTURE FOR PEREZ ELEMENTRY
REP 2008-075 ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

FINE ARTS DEPT:
RFP 2008-041 BAND EQUIPMENT

FOOD SERVICE DEPT:
RFP 2008-074 CLEANING OF FOOD SERVICE GREASE TRAPS

RENEWALS:
RFP 061-2007 HARDWOOD FLOOR REPAIRS & MAINTENANCE

RATIONALE:

STAFF HAS COMPLIED WITH ALL APPLICABLE FEDERAL, STATE AND LOCAL PURCHASING POLICIES AND
PROCEDURES IN OBTAINING PRICING INFORMATION FOR THE ITEMS LISTED ABOVE. STAFF IS
RECOMMENDING THE AWARDS BASED ON BEING THE BEST VALUE TO THE DISTRICT.

BUDGETARY INFORMATION:
THE BUDGET INCLUDES THE FUNDS FOR THESE PURCHASES

BOARD POLICY REFERENCE AND COMPLIANCE
CH LOCAL - Purchasing and Acquisition
Texas Education Code 44.031




|BIDS! PROPOSALS/! QUALIFICATIONS
FACILITIES & MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT
(CSP 2008-068

RFP 2008.075
ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

FINE ARTS DEPARTMENT
RFP 2008-041
BAND EQUIPMENT

FOOD SERVICE DEFARTMENT
RFP 2008-074
CLEANING QF FOOD SERVICE GREASE TRAPS

JRENEWALS
RFP (81-2007
HARDWOOD FLOOR REPAIRS & MAINTENANCE

METAL CANOPY STRUCTURE FOR PEREZ ELEMENTRY

SUMMARY OF RECOMMENDATION(S)

RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S}
ZERTUCHE CONSTRUGTION
$29,600.00

RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)

3.G ELECTRICAL SUPPLY
CONSOLIDATED ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTORS
SEXAUER
VOSS LIGHTING
SEE ATTACHED TABULATION

RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)
PRIMARY VENDORS
BROCK MAYS MUSIC

KYR MUSIC
NEMC
WASHINGTON MUSIC CENTER
SECONDARY VENDORS
ALAMO MUSIC CENTER
DF MUSIC ENTERPRISES
ELMO LOPEZ MUSIC
HILLJE MUSIC CENTER
K&S MUSIC
MSA MUSIC
SAM ASH MUSIC CORP
LONE STAR PERCUSSION
STEVE WEISS MUSIC
THE WOODWIND & BRASSWIND
SEE ATTACHED TABULATION

RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)
RC SERVICES
CHAVARRIA'S PLUMBING
SEE ATTACHED TABULATION

RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)
JONES HARDWOOD FLOORS
SEE ATTACHED TABULATION




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
SEPTEMBER 17, 2008

CSP# 2008-066 METAL CANOPY STRUCTURE FOR PEREZ ELEMENTRY

RECOMMENDATION;
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

RECOMMENDED VENDOR EST. ANNUAL AMOUNT
ZERTUCHE CONSTRUCTION $29,600.00

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED FOURTY FIVE (45) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON JUNE 15,
2008 AND JUNE 22, 2008. FOUR (4) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON JULY 2, 2008 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE
UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2008-2009 FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT

RESOURCE PERSONNEL:

JUAN DAVILA, DIRECTOR OF FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING

HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER




TO:

FROM:

DATE:

SUBJECT:

Lyt

FOR CHILDREN

DEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Juan A, Davila
Facilities Maintenance and Operations Director

ITED: I}
- —— -

Memorandum

Ms. Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing
Juan A. Davila, Director of Facilitics Maintenance & Operations
September 3, 2008

CSP 2008-066 METAL CANOPY STRUCTURE FOR PEREZ
ELEMENTARY

After careful review of the tabulation information provided to me by your staff, for
CSP 2008-066 METAL CANOPY STRUCTURE FOR PEREZ ELEMENTARY, I
recommend, for your consideration, based on, value to the district, ability to perform or
provide the needed services and materials,

ZERTUCHE CONSTRUCTION

Please insure that all procurement and bid requirements have been met and that all
references have been checked on the vendor/s listed above. If any reference checks conilict
with the district in any way please notify me to discuss these issues.

If you have any questions, please let me know.

3501 E Saunders — Laredo, TX 78041 - (956)473-7934 - Fax(956)473-7951
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CSP 2008-066 METAL CANOPY STRUCTURE FOR PEREZ ELEMENTRY

ADMIRAL BUILDERS

7511 MCPHERSON RD

LAREDC, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-722-2746

FAX: 956-722-6230

JAVIER TREVINO/ROBERT R GONZALEZ

AMERICAN CONTRACTING CORP.
4507 E. SAUNDERS #1
LAREDQO, TEXAS 73041
PHONE: {956) 724-5453
FAX: (956) 717-9551

CELL: (956) 592-2328 /JOE
CELL: (956) 592-1947

LUPE ESCOBEDO
stang1523@yahgo.com

CELL: 956-640-0834
acc.gescobedob2@yahoo.com

ADVANTAGE USA ROOFING
13350 REBECCA CREEK RD.
SPRING BRANCH, TEXAS 78070
PHONE: (830) 885-2951

FAX: (830) 885-2061
advainternational02@yahoc.com

AET GARCIA ROOFING

116 S. MEADOW AVE.
PHONE: (958) 723-5335
FAX: (956) 723-5484
garcia-roofing@sbeglobal net

BANES GENERAL CONTRACTORS
6040 LUCKETT CT.

EL PASO, TX 72932

PHONE: 915-584-0404

FAX: 815-584-2432

CHARLEY HECKER

shir@juno com

BJ'S PARK & RECREATION PRODUCTS
4003 BRIAR LANE

MAGNOLIA, TX 77354

PHONE: 800.392.6158

FAX: 281.356.1802

KEVIN HANES

kthanes@direcpc.com

CG CONSTRUCTION

1808 COMMERCE DR STE 2
LAREDQ, TX 78041

PHONE: 856-753-8689

FAX: 956-753-6097

DAVID CANTU
david@cgcconstruclion.us

CREATIVE COMPONENTS
4080 PEALE RD
WIMBERLY, TX 78676
PHONE: 888-370-6532
FAX: 830-935-4090
DARRELL LAWSON
dlawson@texas-skies.com

VENDOR LIST

DIAMOND BACK SERVICES
2611 ALDAMA ST

LAREDOQ, TX 78043

PHONE: 956-725-1549/286-7747
FAX: 956-725-1549

ALEX HINQJOSA

DURASHADE

10873 HILLPOINT,

SAN ANTONIQ, TX 78217
PHONE: 956-722-0064
CELL: 958-251-0615
ALFREDO GALA

DON KRUEGER CONSTRUCTION CO.
P.O.BOX 3613

VICTORIA, TEXAS 77903

PHONE: 3561-573-5291

FAX: 361-573-0162

DON KRUEGER
kkrueger@dondriiegerconstruclion.com

€.Q. ENTERPRISES

1019 8§ ZAPATA HWY

LAREDQ, TX 78043

PHONE: 956-727-8123

FAX: 956-791-5501

VIRGILIO DIAZIALBERT VILLALON
egenterprises@six.rr.com

FAULKNER USA

17006 RIO GRANDE
AUSTIN, TX 78701
PHONE: 512-652-4000
FAX: 512-652-4001
info@faulknerusa com

ICE CONTRACTORS, INC
103 GROSS RD
MESQUITE, TX 75149
PHONE: 972-288-8700
FAX: 972-288-8715
DAVID CROSS
ice@icecontractors.com

J.M. FLORES ROOFING & CONSTRUCTION, INI
5003 MAHER

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: (956) 723-4334

FAX: (056) 728-1611
palsyimilores@notmail.com

KIVA BUILDING & DESIGN INC
1303 CALLE DEL NORTE
LAREDOQ, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-796-0218

kivainc@@sheglobal. net

LITTLE TIKES f PLAYPOWER
5508 SOUTH SCOUT
AUSTIN, TX 78731

PHONE: 800-325-8828

FAX; 866-697-0728
kevin.rambaud@itcps.com




LEYENDECKER CONSTRUCTION CO.
P.O. BOX 1827

LAREDO, TEXAS 78044-1827
PHONE: 956. 722.0531

FAX: 956. 722.8215

GARY A. LEYENDECKER
leycon@netscorp.net
cortes@ieycaon.net

LOHMER COMMERCIAL RESIDENTIAL REPAIR
506 SHILOH #28

LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-791-3042

FAX: 956-791-3042

BEN LOHMER

blohmer@six.rr.com

LONESTAR RECREATION INC
10601 GRANT RD STE 217
HOUSTON, TX 77070

PHONE: 800-867-2070

FAX: 281-970-9088

JIM BAKER
info@lonestarreplaygrounds.com
www lonestarrecplayrounds.com

MAHONE ROOFING CO.

P.C. BOX 790069

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78279
PHONE: (210) 494-3443

FAX: (210) 494-3477
manoneroofingco@acl.com

MARSHALL COMPANY GENERAL CONTRACTORS
PO. BOX 4995

CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78469

PHONE: 361-883-4369

FAX: 361-883-6265

DON BOYD

donboyd@marshalicompanyinc.com

MCNEIL ROOFING & SHEET METAL CO.
P.O. BOX 33313

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78265

PHONE: 210-653-4636

meneilrgofing@satx.rr.com

MITCHELL ENTERPRISES LTD
112 E. COTTAGE

SHERMAN, TX 75090

PHONE: 903-893-6593

FAX: 803-868-0679

STEVE MITCHELL
steve@mitchellgc.com

MODERN CONSTRUCTION, INC.
2000 BLAINE STREET

LAREDO, TEXAS 78044

PHONE: 256-724-8001

FAX: 956-722-3262

GERARDO GARCIA
cafiosg@modern-laredo.com

PEREZ ROOFING

604 CAMBRIDGE LOOP
LAREDQ, TEXAS 78045
PHONE: (956) 726-4239
FAX: (956) 726-4239
perezroofing@hotmail.com

PARK PLACE RECREATION DESIGNS
P.0O. BOX 18186

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78218

PHONE; 800.626.0238

FAX; 210.832.0115

MARILYN AHRENS
marilyn@miracleparkplace.com

PRADA CONSTRUCTION
600 PRADA MACHIN
LAREDO, TX 78046
PHONE: 856-722-4911
MR. PORTUGAL
lepradad45@hotmail.com

PU-MA BUILDERS CO.

1505 CALLE DEL NORTE STE 410
LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-724-4454

FAX: 956-723-0333

RIYED ENTERPRISES LLC
8370 SAN GABRIEL
LAREDOQ, TX 78045
QOSCAR GARCIA

PHONE: 956-724-4969
oscar@riyed.com
www.laredoshade.nel

SAMUEL DEAN CO.

P.O. BOX 5400

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78201
PHONE: (210} 734-4219

FAX: (210} 734-0422
tblack2011@acl.com

SHADEPRO, LLC
15879 |H 35N

SELMA, TX 78154-3819
PHONE: 210-651-1041
FAX: 210-652-1042
www shadeproilc.com

SHADEFORTS INC
10873 HILLPOINT

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78217
PHONE: 210-342-3755
FAX: 210-654-7431

SHADE CONCEPTS
9044 LONG POINT
HOUSTON, TX 77055
PHONE: 877-266-4668
PHONE: 956-266-4665
infoshadeconcepls.net

www. shadeconcepts.com




SPORTS & RECREATIONAL PRODUCTS, INC

2416 JACKSON KELLER RD
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78230
PHONE: 210.341.7688

FAX: 210.341.7720

HOLLY MILLER
playarounds@@sportsandrec.net

THE TURNER CORP
2001 N. LAMAR STE 100
DALLAS, TEXAS 75202
PHONE: 214-721-8400
FAX: 214-721-8493

DAN PEARSE
Dpearse@tcco,com

TF HARPER & ASSOCIATES LP
103 RED BIRD LANE

AUSTIN, TX 78745

PHONE: 800-976-0107

FAX: 512-440-0736

ELAYNE HAYNES
playground@tfharpes.com

www Itharper.com

THE PLAYWELL GROUP INC
2750 NORTHAVEN RD STE 103
DALLAS, TX 75229

PHONE: 800-726-1816

FAX: 800-560-9150
diana@playwellgroup.com

www. blaywellgroup.com

TRICOSHADE

14003 TOEPPERWEIN,
SAN ANTONIQ, TX 78233
PHONE: 877-742-3399
info@tricoshade.com

USA SHADE & FABRIC STRUCTURE INC

P.Q.BOX 560168

DALLAS, TX 75356-0168
PHONE: 800-966-5005
FAX: 214-905-9514
SUZANNE BENINATE
sbeninate@usa-shade.com
www.usa-shade.com

URBANO CONSTRUCTION
1102 SHERMAN ST
LAREDQ, TX 78040

PHONE: 956-242-6062

FAX: 956-242-4957

DAVID DELGADC
mail@urbanoconslruction.com

VISION CONSTRUCTION CO.
6017 MCPHERSON STE A
LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-337-2375/ 206-3979
FAX; 956-723-8782

NOEL FLORES/JERRY VALADEZ
visignconstructionf@birch.net

WHAT A GATE INC
219 VINTAGE LANE
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-235-8351
FAX: 956-717-9456
FRANCISCO ANGER
what-a-gate@six.rr.com

ZACHRY CONSTRUCTION CO.
527 LOGWOOD

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78227
PHONE: 210-475-8000

FAX: 210-475-8060
marketingsales@@zachry.com

ZERTUCHE CONSTRUCTION LLC
107 CALLE DEL NORTE

LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-727-3112

FAX: 956-727-0092

RODOLFQO CABELLO
rudyz@bizlaredo.rr.com




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSAILS
SEPTEMBER 17, 2008

RF¥P# 2008-075 ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

RECOMMENDED VENDOR EST. ANNUAL AMOUNT
3-G ELECTRICAL SUPPLY

CONSOLIDATED ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTORS SEE TABULATION
SEXAUER

VOSS LIGHTING

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED TWENTY-THREE (23) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON
AUGUST 3, 2008 AND AUGUST 10, 2008. SIX (6) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON AUGUST 20, 2008 @
3:00 P.M. AT THE UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2008-2009 FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT

RESQURCE PERSONNEL.:

JUAN DAVILA, DIRECTOR OF FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING

HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER

KARINA MENDOZA, PROCUREMENT OFFICER



Juan A. Davila
Facilities Maintenance and Operations Director

Memorandum
TO: Ms. Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing
FROM: Juan A. Davila, Director of Facilities Maintenance & Operations

DATE: September 3, 2008

SUBJECT:  RFP 2008-075 ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

After careful review of the tabulation information provided to me by your staff, for
RFP 2008-075 ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES, I recommend, for your consideration, based on,
value to the district, ability to perform or provide the needed services and materials,

3-G Electric

Consolidated Electrical Dist. (CED)
Sexaur

Voss Lighting

for the 2008-2009 Fiscal Year. Awarding of this bid does not constitute or guarantee that
work or contracts will be given to the vendor/s mentioned above. This simply means that, if
awarded, they may be called upon during the award period to provide services or materials
to the district.

Please insure that all procurement and bid requirements have been met and that all
references have been checked on the vendor/s listed above. If any reference checks conflict

with the district in any way please notify me to discuss these issues.

If you have any questions, please let me know.

3501 E Saunders — Laredo, TX 78041 - (956)473-7934 - Fax (956)473-7951



UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES
RFP 2008-075

VENDOR BREAKER
DESCRIPTION INTERNATIONAL SEXAUER | VOSS LIGHTING CED 3-G ELECTRIC
1|BALLAST 120/277 Emergency $64.64 NO BID $41.05 $43.90 $40.00
2|BALLAST 120V 1FC12T9 $34.80 $9.65 $14.15 $20.76 $18.92
3|BALLAST 120V 1FCT9 $29.78 $8.32 $8.20 $10.90 $18.92
4|BALLAST 120V 1-2D38W NO BID NO BID $24.96 $36.10 $31.00
5|BALLAST 120V 1F32T8 $29.15 NO BID $9.98 $33.70 $16.42
6[BALLAST 120V 1279 NO BID NO BID $14.15 $21.76 $18.92
7|BALLAST 120V 2F20T12 $34.73 $13.19 $19.55 $44.60 $24.16
8|BALLAST 120V 2F32T8 NO BID $12.01 $9.98 $13.90 $16.42
9[BALLAST 120V 2F40T12 $37.75 $20.64 $10.74 $11.90 $13.68
10|BALLST 120V 2F96T8 $38.86 NO BID $20.51 $24.90 $27.73
11|BALLAST 120V 2F96T12 HIGH OUTPUT $45.29 NO BID $30.86 $39.79 $48.73
12|BALLAST 120V 2F96T12 SLIMLINE $25.20 $40.68 $24.03 $21.59 $19.68
13|BALLAST 120V 3F32T8 $24.06 $13.21 $11.28 $14.90 $17.88
14|BALLAST 120V 4F32T8 $24.06 $14.52 $12.04 $16.90 $19.33
15|BALLAST 2F96T12 HIGH/OUTPUT $39.56 NO BID $31.94 $40.79 $48.73
16|BALLAST 277V 1F32T8 $29.15 NO BID $9.98 $13.38 $16.42
17|BALLAST 277V 1F40T12 NO BID NO BID $11.05 $21.30 $16.08
18|BALLAST 277V 1-2D 38W $31.00 NO BID $24.96 $36.10 $34.00
19|BALLAST 277V 2F32T8 $29.15 $8.46 $9.98 $13.90 $16.42
20|BALLAST 277V 2F40T12 $23.60 NO BID $11.05 $25.90 $18.53
21|BALLAST 277V 2F96T8 NO BID NO BID $27.15 $23.90 $27.73
22|BALLAST 277V 3F32T8 $34.00 NO BID $11.28 $14.90 $17.88
23|BALLAST 277V 4F32T8 $34.00 NO BID $12.04 $16.90 $19.33
24|BALLAST KIT 250 HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM $92.00 $42.59 $78.15 $84.00 $76.25
25|BALLAST KIT 250WATT METAL HALIDE MULTITAP $62.17 NO BID $54.54 $67.90 $63.75
26|BALLAST KIT 400W $94.00 $55.98 $89.00 $89.00 $63.75
27|"400W MTL HALIDE MLTI TAP $69.98 $42.66 $56.11 $89.00 $63.75
28|BALLAST KIT 480V NO BID NO BID $61.37 NO BID $63.75
29|BALLAST KIT 50W HI PRESSURE NO BID $10.26 $91.84 $79.00 $37.50
30|BALLAST KIT 70 WATT NO BID $12.42 $94.20 $79.00 $58.75
31|BOX HANDY %" K.O. $3.20 $0.98 NO BID $1.79 $1.46
32|BOX HANDY %" K.O. $3.20 $0.89 NO BID $1.08 $0.83
33|BOX METAL EXTENSION 2X4 $2.08 $1.39 NO BID $1.18 $1.73
34|BOX METAL 4 11/16" EXT COMB % & 3/4 $3.36 $1.64 NO BID $5.59 $3.65
35|BOX METAL 4X4 % K.O. $0.60 $1.69 NO BID $0.79 $0.91
36|BOX METAL 4X4 1 %" DEEP COMB ¥%” & 3 $1.18 NO BID NO BID $1.24 $0.72
37|BOX METAL 4X4 1 %" DEEP %" & %" K.O. $1.96 $1.07 NO BID $0.79 $0.72
38[BOX METAL 4X4 1 1/4” DEEP % K.O. $2.31 NO BID NO BID $1.24 $2.22
39|BOX METAL COMBINATION 4 11/16” $1.66 $3.59 NO BID $2.89 $1.51
40|BOX WIREMOLD 4X4 METAL $11.00 NO BID NO BID $10.79 $9.81
41|BOX WIREMOLD 4X4 PLASTIC $9.88 NO BID NO BID $7.98 $6.93
42|BREAKER 100 BOLT ON DBL NO BID NO BID NO BID $98.50 $55.00
43|BREAKER 100AMP DBL ITE NO BID $23.97 NO BID $29.50 $31.25
44 |BREAKER 100AMP DBL S.D. $125.00 NO BID NO BID $62.41 $52.50
45|BREAKER 100AMP 3 I.T.E. NO BID $44.19 NO BID $70.90 $60.00
46|BREAKER 100 AMP 3 S.D. NO BID NO BID NO BID $183.87 $110.00
47|BREAKER 20 AMP BOLT ITE NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.50 $9.00
48|BOX METAL EXTENSION 4 X4 $2.09 $2.34 NO BID $1.31 $1.41
49|BOX METAL OCTAGONAL 1"K.O. 2" DEEP $3.73 NO BID NO BID $3.29 $2.02
50|BOX METAL OCTAGONAL ¥2" K.O. $5.77 $1.01 NO BID $1.04 $0.87
51|BOX METAL OCTOGONAL % KO 1%"D $1.26 NO BID NO BID $2.69 $1.71
52|BOX METAL OCTAGONAL EXT %" KO 1 %" D $2.32 NO BID NO BID $2.19 $2.05
53|BOX METAL SWITCH %" KO NO BID $1.23 NO BID $1.31 $1.08
54| WEATHERPROOF %" KO SINGLE GANG $1.81 $1.43 NO BID $2.29 $1.88
55|BOX WEATHERPROOF 1" SINGLE GANG $12.26 NO BID NO BID $6.68 $4.44
56 [BOX WEATHERPROOF % KO SINGLE GANG NO BID $1.60 NO BID $2.91 $2.34
57|BOX WEATHERPROOF 4X4 5" KO NO BID $2.39 NO BID $6.98 $5.48
58|BOX WEATHERPROOF 4x4 %" KO NO BID $10.14 NO BID $7.45 $5.99
59(BOX WIREMOLD 2X4 1 %’ METAL $6.37 NO BID NO BID $5.98 $6.12
60|BOX WIREMOLD 2X4 METAL $6.37 NO BID NO BID $4.91 $4.67
61|BOX WIREMOLD 2X4 PLASTIC $5.55 NO BID NO BID $4.59 $4.66
62|BOX WIREMOLD 2X4 PLASTIC DEEP $9.47 NO BID NO BID $5.14 $5.29
63|BOX HANDY %" K.O. NO BID $0.80 NO BID $1.08 $0.83
64|BOX METAL EXTENSION 2X4 NO BID $1.39 NO BID $1.18 $1.73
65|BOX METAL 4 11/16” EXT COMB ¥ & 3/4 NO BID $1.64 NO BID $5.59 $3.65
66|BOX METAL 4X4 % K.O. NO BID $0.76 NO BID $0.89 $0.91
67 |BREAKER 60 AMP DOUBLE ITE NO BID $7.73 NO BID $8.90 $8.75




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES
RFP 2008-075

VENDOR BREAKER
DESCRIPTION INTERNATIONAL SEXAUER | VOSS LIGHTING CED 3-G ELECTRIC
68|BREAKER 80 AMP DOUBLE ITE NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.90 $31.25
69|BREAKER 80 AMP DOUBLE SD $85.56 NO BID NO BID $59.90 $52.50
70|BREAKER BOLT ON DOUBLE 60 AMP NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.06 $20.00
71|BUSHING FIBER 2" $0.41 NO BID NO BID $0.35 $0.38
72|BUSHING FIBER 2 %" $0.84 NO BID NO BID $0.54 $0.78
73|BUSHING FIBER 4" $1.22 NO BID NO BID $1.17 $0.90
74|BUSHING REDUCER 1" X %" $1.44 $0.59 NO BID $0.88 $0.85
75|BUSHING REDUCER %" X %" NO BID $0.31 NO BID $0.60 $0.55
76|BUSHING REDUCER %" X 1” NO BID $0.59 NO BID $1.40 $0.85
77|CABLE S.0. CORD 12/3 CONDUCTOR NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.89 $0.98
78|CLAMP GROUND ROD 5/8” $1.70 $1.34 NO BID $1.38 $1.60
79|CONDUIT EMT %" X 10' $3.12 NO BID NO BID $2.89 $2.66
80|CONDUIT EMT 17X 10’ $10.14 NO BID NO BID $9.65 $8.45
81|CONDUIT EMT 1 %" X 10’ $15.39 NO BID NO BID $14.85 $12.87
82|CONDUIT EMT 2" X 10’ $23.19 NO BID NO BID $22.05 $19.31
83|CONDUIT EMT 3" X 10’ $46.72 NO BID NO BID $44.85 $38.90
84[CONDUIT EMT %" X 10° $6.09 NO BID NO BID $5.65 $5.06
85|CONDUIT FLEX MC 3/8 $0.52 NO BID NO BID $23.00 $0.51
86|CONDUIT FLEXIBLE %" $0.33 $0.35 NO BID $37.50 $0.45
87|CONDUIT FLEXIBLE 1 ¥4’ $1.10 NO BID NO BID $119.50 $1.42
88[CONDUIT FLEXIBLE % $0.47 $0.62 NO BID $50.29 $0.61
89|CONDUIT FLEXIBLE 3/8” $0.30 $0.28 NO BID $33.29 $0.39
90|CONDIUT PVC 1/2" X 10’ $1.60 NO BID NO BID $1.59 $1.44
91|CONDIUT PVC 1" X 10’ $3.24 NO BID NO BID $3.15 $2.59
92|CONDIUT PVC 1 ¥4" X 10’ $4.54 NO BID NO BID $4.10 $3.56
93|CONDIUT PVC 1 1/2" X 10" NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.10 $4.40
94|CONDIUT PVC 2" X 10’ $6.53 NO BID NO BID $7.10 $5.56
95|CONDIUT PVC 3" X 10’ $14.13 NO BID NO BID $12.10 $11.57
96|CONDIUT PVC %" X 10’ $2.22 NO BID NO BID $2.25 $1.87
97|conpiuT PVC 4" NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.10 $1.58
98[CONDUIT RIGID 2" $6.18 NO BID NO BID $58.50 $51.48
99[CONNECTOR FEMALE 1" PVC $0.33 NO BID NO BID $0.42 $0.37
100|CONNECTOR FEMALE 1 1/4” PVC $0.43 NO BID NO BID $0.56 $0.50
101|CONNECTOR FEMALE 2" PVC $0.63 $0.79 NO BID $0.81 $0.73
102|CONNECTOR FEMALE 2 1/2" PVC $1.41 NO BID NO BID $1.79 $1.61
103|CONNECTOR FEMALE 3/4” PVC $0.24 $0.29 NO BID $0.31 $0.28
104|CONNECTOR FEMALE 3 1/2" PVC $1.11 NO BID NO BID $2.91 $2.00
105[CONNECTOR FEMALE 4" PVC $2.35 NO BID NO BID $2.98 $2.69
106|CONNECTOR FLEX 1/2” $0.26 $0.55 NO BID $0.44 $0.55
107|CONNECTOR FLEX 1" 90 DEGREE $6.19 NO BID NO BID $1.27 $4.51
108|CONNECTOR FLEX 2" $6.12 NO BID NO BID $4.07 $5.69
109[CONNECTOR FLEX %4 $0.65 $0.83 NO BID $0.93 $0.83
110[CONNECTOR FLEX 3/8" -90 DEGREE $0.66 $0.60 NO BID $0.63 $0.58
111|CONNECTOR FLEXIBLE 3/8" $0.44 $0.41 NO BID $0.41 $0.45
112[CONNECTOR INTERCHANGEABLE %" $1.56 NO BID NO BID $2.12 $0.51
113|CONNECTOR INTERCHANGE 2" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.49
114|CONNECTOR INTERCHANGE %" $2.07 NO BID NO BID $2.60 $0.89
115|CONNECTOR MALE PVC %" $0.13 $0.13 NO BID $0.16 $0.17
116[CONNECTOR MALE PVC 1" $0.45 $0.33 NO BID $0.36 $0.33
117[CONNECTOR MALE PVC 1 1/4” $0.59 $0.55 NO BID $0.47 $0.42
118[|CONNECTOR MALE PVC 1 %" $0.66 $0.59 NO BID $0.56 $0.51
119|CONNECTOR MALE PVC 2" $0.96 $0.69 NO BID $0.81 $0.73
120[|CONNECTOR MALE PVC 2 %" NO BID $1.32 NO BID $1.37 $1.24
121 [CONNECTOR MALE PVC 3" $2.28 $1.50 NO BID $2.02 $1.82
122|CONNECTOR MALE PVC 3/4” $0.23 $0.25 NO BID $0.29 $0.26
123|CONNECTOR MALE PVC 3 %" NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.76 $2.35
124|CONNECTOR MALE PVC 4" $4.12 NO BID NO BID $3.45 $3.12
125[CONNECTOR RAINTIGHT %" $0.30 $0.33 NO BID $0.27 $0.27
126|CONNECTOR RAINTIGHT 1" NO BID $0.97 NO BID $0.60 $0.79
127|CONNECTOR RAINTIGHT 1 %" NO BID $1.34 NO BID $1.23 $1.54
128|CONNECTOR RAINTIGHT 1 %" NO BID $1.93 NO BID $1.70 $2.16
129|CONNECTOR RAINTIGHT %" $0.42 $0.57 NO BID $0.37 $0.52
130[CONNECTOR SEALTIGHT ¥%" NO BID $0.62 NO BID $1.65 $1.57
131 [CONNECTOR SEALTIGHT ¥%" 90 DEGREE NO BID $0.93 NO BID $2.99 $2.71
132|CONNECTOR SEALTIGHT 2" 90 DEGREE $30.36 NO BID NO BID $28.66 $19.56
133|CONNECTOR SEALTIGHT %" NO BID $0.86 NO BID $2.05 $2.16
134|CONNECTOR SEALTIGHT 3/4” 90 DEGREE $5.04 $1.38 NO BID $3.89 $3.92
135[CONNECTOR SET SCREW %" NO BID $0.22 NO BID $0.14 $0.18
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136[CONNECTOR SET SCREW 1" $0.58 $0.65 NO BID $0.45 $0.55
137[CONNECTOR SET SCREW 1 1/4” EMT CONDUIT NO BID $1.15 NO BID $0.81 $0.98
138|CONNECTOR SET SCREW 1 %" NO BID $2.04 NO BID $1.26 $1.40
139|CONNECTOR FEMALE 1 1/4” PVC $1.39 $0.62 NO BID $0.56 $0.50
140[CONNECTOR FEMALE 2" PVC $0.90 $0.87 NO BID $0.80 $0.73
141|CONNECTOR FEMALE 2 1/2" PVC $1.98 NO BID NO BID $1.78 $1.61
142|CONNECTOR SET SCREW 2" $2.54 NO BID NO BID $1.72 $1.91
143|CONNECTOR SET SCREW ¥’ $0.44 $0.37 NO BID $0.23 $0.29
144|COPPER WIRE #4 THHN $0.90 NO BID NO BID $958/M $0.72
145|COPPER WIRE #8 THHN $0.46 NO BID NO BID $389/M $0.29
146|COPPER WIRE #1 THHN NO BID NO BID NO BID $1908/M $1.43
147 |COPPER WIRE #10 THHN/THWN (BLACK) $0.27 NO BID NO BID $189/M $0.18
148|COPPER WIRE #10 THHN/THWN (BLUE) $0.27 NO BID NO BID $189/M $0.18
149|COPPER WIRE #10 THHN/THWN (GRAY) $0.27 NO BID NO BID $189/M $0.18
150[COPPER WIRE #10 THHN/THWN (GREEN) $0.27 NO BID NO BID $189/M $0.18
151 |COPPER WIRE #10 THHN/THWN (RED) $0.27 NO BID NO BID $189/M $0.18
152|COPPER WIRE #10 THHN/THWN (WHITE) $0.27 NO BID NO BID $189/M $0.18
153|COPPER WIRE #10 THHN/THWN (YELLOW) $0.27 NO BID NO BID $189/M $0.18
154|COPPER WIRE #12 THHN/THWN (BLACK) $0.19 NO BID NO BID $118/M $0.12
155|COPPER WIRE #12 THHN/THWN (BLUE) $0.19 NO BID NO BID $118/M $0.12
156 |COPPER WIRE #12 THHN/THWN (GRAY) $0.19 NO BID NO BID $118/M $0.12
157 [COPPER WIRE #12 THHN/THWN (GREEN) $0.19 NO BID NO BID $118/M $0.12
158|COPPER WIRE #12 THHN/THWN (RED) $0.19 NO BID NO BID $118/M $0.12
159|COPPER WIRE #12 THHN/THWN (WHITE) $0.19 NO BID NO BID $118/M $0.12
160|COPPER WIRE #12 THHN/THWN (YELLOW) $0.19 NO BID NO BID $118/M $0.12
161|COPPER WIRE #2 THHN STRANDED $1.82 NO BID NO BID $1249/M $1.12
162|COPPER WIRE #6 THHN $0.76 NO BID NO BID $508/M $0.45
163|COPPER WIRE 1/0 $2.71 NO BID NO BID $1989/M $1.71
164|COPPER WIRE 3/0 THNN $4.40 NO BID NO BID $3648/M $2.69
165[COUPLING COMBINATION %" — 3/8" NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.07 $1.16
166 [COUPLING PVC 3/4 $0.14 $0.17 NO BID $0.16 $0.13
167|COUPLING PVC %" $0.11 $0.15 NO BID $0.12 $0.11
168|COUPLING PVC 1" $0.19 $0.24 NO BID $0.23 $0.21
169|COUPLING PVC 1 ¥4’ $0.24 $0.37 NO BID $0.31 $0.28
170[COUPLING PVC 1 %" $0.34 $0.60 NO BID $0.43 $0.39
171|COUPLING PVC 2" $0.59 $0.57 NO BID $0.56 $0.51
172[COUPLING PVC 2 32" $1.10 $1.53 NO BID $0.99 $0.83
173|COUPLING PVC 3" $1.29 $1.86 NO BID $1.64 $1.48
174|COUPLING PVC 4 $2.00 NO BID NO BID $2.53 $2.28
175[COUPLING RAINTIGHT %" $0.30 $0.66 NO BID $0.31 $0.15
176[COUPLING RAINTIGHT 1” NO BID $0.68 NO BID $0.70 $0.96
177|COUPLING RAINTIGHT 1 % NO BID $1.22 NO BID $1.29 $1.95
178|COUPLING RAINTIGHT 3/4” $0.42 $0.85 NO BID $0.43 $0.56
179|COUPLING RIGID %" $0.96 $0.46 NO BID $1.08 $1.16
180|COUPLING RIGID 5/16” NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
181|COUPLING SET SCREW ¥2" $0.17 $0.23 NO BID $0.17 $0.19
182|COUPLING SET SCREW %" $0.27 $0.35 NO BID $0.29 $0.29
183|COUPLING SET SCREW 1” $0.41 $0.68 NO BID $0.44 $0.58
184 |COUPLING SET SCREW 1 1/4” $0.82 $1.18 NO BID $0.96 $0.98
185|COVER BLANK 1 GANG GALV. $0.37 $0.30 NO BID $0.33 $0.32
186[COVER BLANK 1 GANG S.S. $0.93 $1.03 NO BID $1.79 $0.86
187|COVER BLANK 1 GANG IVORY $0.44 $0.27 NO BID $0.30 $0.20
188[COVER BLANK 1 GANG WP. $0.52 $0.31 NO BID $0.75 $0.68
189|COVER BLANK 2 GANG GALV. $0.33 $0.42 NO BID $0.29 $0.29
190|COVER BLANK 2 GANG IVORY $0.42 $0.38 NO BID $0.89 $1.10
191 |COVER BLANK 2 GANG WP $2.14 $0.57 NO BID $1.45 $1.30
192[COVER BLANK 4 11/16 GALV $1.57 $0.76 NO BID $0.55 $0.63
193[COVER BLANK OCTAGONAL GALV. $0.50 $0.40 NO BID $0.36 $0.32
194[COVER BOX PVC NO BID $0.54 NO BID $34.91 $1.00
195[COVER CENTER BLANKED GALV NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.12 $1.00
196|COVER COMB. 1 GANG WP NO BID $1.03 NO BID $1.89 $2.32
197|COVER COMB. 2 GANG IVORY NO BID $0.38 NO BID $0.35 $0.42
198|COVER COMB. 2 GANG WP NO BID $2.65 NO BID $7.19 $5.69
199|COVER DEVICE 1 GANG GALV NO BID $0.28 NO BID $0.33 $0.31
200|COVER DEVICE 2 GANG GALV NO BID $0.94 NO BID $0.98 $1.10
201[COVER GFCI 1 GANG WP NO BID $1.54 NO BID $3.89 $2.81
202|COVER GFCI 2 GANG WP $13.05 $13.95 NO BID $7.19 $5.93
203|COVER GUTTER 6X6 GALV NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.89 $4.28
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204|COVER INDUSTRIAL 1 GANG GALV NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.33 $0.32
205|COVER INDUSTRIAL 2 GANG GALV NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.29 $0.93
206|COVER RECEPTACLE 1 GANG GALV NO BID $0.30 NO BID $0.39 $0.32
207|COVER RECEPTACLE 1 GANG IVORY NO BID $0.17 NO BID $0.21 $0.20
208|COVER RECEPTACLE 1 GANG S.S. NO BID $1.03 NO BID $1.89 $0.87
209|COVER RECEPTACLE 2 GANG GALV NO BID $0.92 NO BID $1.09 $0.93
210|COVER RECEPTACLE 2 GANG IVORY NO BID $0.28 NO BID $0.69 $0.42
211|COVER RECEPTACLE 2 GANG S.S. NO BID $2.05 NO BID $2.69 $1.73
212|COVER SWITCH 1 GANG GALV NO BID $0.18 NO BID $0.33 $0.87
213|COVER SWITCH 1 GANG IVORY NO BID $0.18 NO BID $0.20 $0.20
214|COUPLING RIGID 5/16" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.10
215|COUPLING SET SCREW ¥%" $0.18 $0.23 NO BID $0.17 $0.19
216|COUPLING SET SCREW ¥ $0.27 $0.35 NO BID $0.29 $0.29
217|COUPLING SET SCREW 1" $0.41 $0.25 NO BID $0.44 $0.58
218|COUPLING RIGID 5/16" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.10
219|COVER SWITCH 1 GANG S.S. NO BID $1.04 NO BID $1.29 $0.87
220|COVER SWITCH 2 GANG GALV NO BID $0.94 NO BID $0.98 $1.10
221|COVER SWITCH 2 GANG IVORY NO BID $0.32 NO BID $0.35 $0.49
222|COVER SWITCH 2 GANG S.S. NO BID $2.05 NO BID $2.89 $1.73
223|COVER SWITCH 3 GANG IVORY NO BID $0.77 NO BID $1.07 $0.62
224|DIFUSSERS NO BID $4.81 NO BID $8.59 $3.00
225|ELBOW PVC 1/2” 90 DEGREE $0.52 $0.45 NO BID $0.46 $0.46
226|ELBOW PVC ¥%” 90 DEGREE $0.76 $0.57 NO BID $0.53 $0.51
227 |ELBOW PVC 1" 90 DEGREE $1.20 $0.81 NO BID $0.81 $0.73
228|ELBOW PVC 1 %" 90 DEGREE $1.71 $1.47 NO BID $1.16 $1.15
229|ELBOW PVC 1 %" 90 DEGREE $2.25 $1.62 NO BID $1.55 $1.53
230|ELBOW PVC 2” 90 DEGREE $2.92 $2.20 NO BID $2.12 $2.09
231|ELBOW PVC 2 %" 90 DEGREE $4.11 $4.29 NO BID $3.70 $3.64
232|EMERGENCY LIGHT $43.75 $18.41 $19.93 $33.50 $20.00
233|EXIT SIGN VOLTAGE 120 $40.82 $13.92 $18.00 $32.27 $20.00
234|EXIT SIGN VOLTAGE DUAL $76.23 $21.50 $18.00 $32.27 $20.00
235|FEMALE CAP 120V NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.93 $5.30
236|FILLERS FOR ITE BREAKERS NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.53 $2.18
237|FILLERS FOR SQUARE D $2.14 NO BID NO BID $1.59 $2.18
238|FIXTURE LAMP LAYIN 2X4 $62.00 $59.05 NO BID $43.90 $41.00
239|FIXTURE LIGHT WRAPAROUND NO BID $60.31 NO BID $52.90 $36.25
240|FLEX SEAL TIGHT %" $6.09 $0.45 NO BID $83.50 $0.89
241 |FLEX SEAL TIGHT % $7.42 $0.60 NO BID $114.10 $1.21
242 |FUSE FRN R 200 $25.21 NO BID NO BID $26.50 $38.43
243|FUSE FRN R 80 $11.50 NO BID NO BID $10.90 $19.21
244|FUSE FRS R 70 $23.25 NO BID NO BID $10.10 $19.21
245|FUSE MINIATURE NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.39 $6.12
246|GROUNG ROD 5/8" X 8 $13.05 $10.08 NO BID $10.28 $11.00
247|GUTTER OUTDOOR 8X8X72 NO BID NO BID NO BID $138.69 $136.00
248[HAND DRYER VOLTAGE 115 NO BID $173.68 NO BID $339.50 $390.00
249[HAND DRYER VOLTAGE 208 NO BID NO BID NO BID $339.50 $390.00
250]IGNITOR ELECTRONIC NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.25 $35.00
251 [KENDORF 1/2 “ X 10’ NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.40 $15.95
252|KENDORF STRAP %" $0.97 $0.96 NO BID $0.63 $0.86
253|KENDORF STRAP ¥ $0.97 $1.14 NO BID $0.68 $0.89
254 |KENDORF STRAP 1" $1.08 $1.14 NO BID $0.73 $1.02
255[KENDORF STRAP 1 ¥4 $1.21 $1.29 NO BID $0.94 $1.15
256|KENDORF STRAP 1 45" $1.51 $1.47 NO BID $0.97 $1.41
257|KENDORF STRAP 2" $1.59 $1.81 NO BID $1.12 $1.49
258|KENDORF STRAP 2 %" $1.80 NO BID NO BID $1.26 $1.69
259|KENDORF STRAP 3" $1.95 NO BID NO BID $1.36 $1.85
260|KENDORF STRAP 3 %" $2.32 NO BID NO BID $5.61 $2.24
261|KNOCKOUT SEAL 3/4” $0.26 $1.81 NO BID $0.23 $0.17
262|KNOCKOUT SEAL 1/2” $0.22 $1.51 NO BID $0.19 $0.15
263[KNOCKOUT SEAL 17 $0.69 NO BID NO BID $0.46 $0.39
264[KNOCKOUT SEAL 1%" $0.84 NO BID NO BID $0.71 $0.78
265|KNOCKOUT SEAL 1 %" $0.56 NO BID NO BID $0.53 $0.46
266 [KNOCKOUT SEAL 2" $1.43 NO BID NO BID $1.11 $0.94
267|LAMP 2 D 38W NO BID NO BID $11.68 $11.49 $15.00
268|LAMP CIRCLINE 12"/32W/T-9 NO BID $1.39 $1.81 $14.62 $2.92
269|LAMP CIRCLINE 6"/20W/T-9 NO BID $2.71 NO BID $18.64 $3.43
270|LAMP CIRCLINE 8"/22W/T-9 NO BID $2.51 $1.66 $13.71 $2.96
271 |LAMP EXIT 25W PLUG TYPE NO BID NO BID $139.00 $3.62 $1.31
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272|LAMP EXIT 25W SCREW TYPE NO BID $0.29 $0.83 $5.98 $1.31
273|LAMP EXIT COMPACT 13W NO BID $0.97 $1.17 $7.62 $3.70
274|LAMP EXIT COMPACT 5W NO BID $1.15 $1.15 $6.57 $3.00
275|LAMP EXIT COMPACT 7W NO BID $0.97 $1.15 $6.87 $3.00
276|LAMP EXIT PLUG TYPE NO BID NO BID $1.28 $4.45 $1.31
277|LAMP EXIT SCREW TYPE NO BID NO BID $1.07 $3.89 $1.31
278|LAMP F-20/T-12 $3.66 $1.39 $0.97 $2.59 $1.24
279|LAMP F-40/T-12/U-6 $4.90 NO BID $2.95 $6.99 $5.39
280|LAMP F-96/T-8/SP41 $7.18 NO BID $4.21 $6.99 $3.25
281 [LAMP F-17/T-8/SP41 $3.33 $2.11 $1.56 $3.98 $1.92
282 [LAMP F-32/T-8/SP41 $3.05 $1.48 $0.93 $1.89 $1.45
283 [LAMP F-32/T-8/SP65 $6.09 $1.36 $2.13 $3.50 $3.30
284|LAMP F-32/T-8/U-6 $7.40 $5.88 $4.02 $10.59 $5.50
285|LAMP F40/T-12/U3 NO BID NO BID $3.15 $18.29 $5.90
286 |LAMP F40/T12/SP41 NO BID $1.27 $1.08 $1.29 $2.45
287 |LAMP F48/T-12/H.0 $7.22 $3.63 $1.91 $6.29 $3.45
288|LAMP F96/T-12/SLIMLINE $3.96 $2.41 $1.60 $3.09 $2.10
289 |LAMP F96/T-12/H.0. $5.36 $2.96 $2.20 $4.79 $3.00
290|LAMP FLOOD 150 W INDOOR NO BID NO BID $1.72 $2.49 $2.65
291 [LAMP FLOOD 75 WATT IN/OUTDOOR NO BID $1.64 $1.70 $3.79 $1.85
292|LAMP FLOOD 75W SIDE PRONGE NO BID NO BID $7.45 $16.34 $6.50
293|LAMP H.P.S. 100 W MED. BASE $14.88 $11.62 $7.82 $20.90 $12.00
294 |LAMP H.P.S. 100 W MOGUL BASE $14.88 $11.85 $7.94 $18.90 $12.00
295|LAMP H.P.S. 150W MED BASE $14.88 $11.50 $7.82 $19.69 $12.00
296 |LAMP H.P.S. 150W MOGUL BASE $14.88 $13.94 $7.94 $19.69 $12.00
297 |LAMP H.P.S. 250W MOGUL BASE $14.88 $13.45 $8.04 $19.69 $12.00
298|LAMP H.P.S. 400W MOGUL BASE $14.88 $12.70 $8.04 $19.69 $12.00
299|LAMP H.P.S. 50W MED BASE $14.88 $11.85 $10.65 $19.90 $12.00
300|LAMP H.P.S. 50W MOGUL BASE $14.88 $12.22 $12.88 $19.90 $12.00
301|LAMP H.P.S. 70W MED. BASE $14.88 $11.62 $10.65 $19.90 $12.00
302|LAMP H.P.S. 70W MOGUL BASE NO BID $11.85 $10.86 $19.90 $12.00
303|LAMP HOLDER HIGH OUTPUT PLUNGER NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.20 $2.90
304|LAMP HOLDER HIGH OUTPUT STATIONARY NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.20 $2.90
305|LAMP HOLDER MED. BI PIN SCREW MOUNT NO BID $0.40 NO BID $1.15 $1.50
306|LAMP HOLDER MED. Bl PIN U SHAPE NO BID $0.26 NO BID $1.25 $1.50
307|LAMP HOLDER PORCELAIN PULL CHAIN NO BID $1.40 NO BID $3.68 $2.18
308 |LAMP HOLDER SLIMLINE PLUNGER NO BID $0.79 NO BID $2.50 $2.60
309|LAMP HOLDER SLIMLINE STATIONARY NO BID $0.76 NO BID $2.50 $2.60
310|LAMP INCANDESCENT 100W $0.26 $0.41 $0.23 $0.49 $0.32
311|LAMP INCANDESCENT 60W $0.36 $0.41 $0.23 $0.49 $0.32
312|LAMP INCANDESCENT 75W $0.26 $0.43 $0.23 $0.49 $0.32
313|LAMP LF 8/T5/8W $2.19 $0.50 $1.13 $5.89 $1.72
314|LAMP MERCURY VAPOR 100W MED BASE NO BID $12.19 $10.82 $27.52 $8.70
315|LAMP MERCURY VAPOR 100W MOGUL BASE NO BID $10.81 $7.15 $28.91 $8.70
316|LAMP MERCURY VAPOR 175W MOBUL BASE NO BID $6.30 $4.82 $32.59 $8.50
317|LAMP MERCURY VAPOR 400 W MOGUL BASE NO BID $11.29 $6.97 $26.62 $10.70
318|LAMP METAL HALIDE 100W MED BASE NO BID $23.93 $15.54 $37.90 $21.00
319|LAMP MELA ARC 175W MOGUL BASE $14.88 $16.43 $8.85 $18.90 $11.90
320|LAMP MELA ARC 250W MOGUL BASE $14.88 $16.62 $8.85 $18.90 $11.90
321|LAMP SCOREBOARD 7 %" RED $2.26 NO BID $0.44 $12.50 $1.05
322|LAMP SCOREBOARD 7 % YELLOW $2.00 NO BID $0.55 $12.50 $1.05
323|LAMP FLOURESCENT 4 PIN COMPACT" NO BID NO BID $3.98 $11.28 $13.00
324(LB " $2.64 $2.94 NO BID $2.98 $2.90
325|LB %" $2.85 $3.68 NO BID $3.59 $3.79
326|LB 1" $3.18 $5.29 NO BID $5.19 $5.54
327|LB1%” $8.15 $10.20 NO BID $10.52 $12.17
328|LB 2" $16.15 $16.82 NO BID $18.66 $19.19
329|LB 2 %" NO BID NO BID NO BID $43.22 $36.00
330|LB 3" $58.28 NO BID NO BID $121.50 $46.00
331[LOAD CENTER NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.00 $33.00
332|LOCKNUT GALV. %" $8.50 $0.05 NO BID $0.10 $0.05
333|LOCKNUT GALV. %" $9.45 $0.07 NO BID $0.15 $0.07
334|LOCKNUT GALV. 1” $0.20 $0.11 NO BID $0.23 $0.14
335[LOCKNUT GALV. 1 % $0.33 $0.14 NO BID $0.33 $0.19
336|LOCKNUT GALV. 2 $0.60 $0.24 NO BID $0.63 $0.38
337|LOCKNUT GALV. 4 $3.18 NO BID NO BID $3.02 $1.72
338|LUBRICANT WIRE PULLING $7.38 $3.62 NO BID $7.69 $5.76
339|MALE CAP 15A 125V $10.84 NO BID NO BID $4.69 $2.03
340|MALE CAP 250V 20AMP NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.79 $4.20




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES
RFP 2008-075

VENDOR BREAKER
DESCRIPTION INTERNATIONAL SEXAUER | VOSS LIGHTING CED 3-G ELECTRIC
341|NIPPLE OFFSET 2" EMT CONDUIT $6.69 $4.33 NO BID $8.15 $5.34
342|PHOTO CONTROL 120 LOCKING TYPE NO BID $4.35 NO BID $8.15 $5.73
343|PHOTO CONTROL120/480 LOCKING TYPE NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.80 $16.34
344|PHOTO CONTROL 120V (MALE THREAD) NO BID $5.51 NO BID $7.71 $9.36
345|PHOTO CONTROL 200/277 (MALE THREAD) NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.23 $11.72
346|PHOTO CONTROL 480V LOCKING TYPE NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.80 $16.34
347|PLUG MOLD 6" SPACING NO BID NO BID NO BID $57.07 $51.32
348|PLUGS, SAFETY NO BID $0.60 NO BID $3.50 NO BID
349(POWER PACK WATT STOPPER 277V NO BID $24.00 NO BID $32.00 $31.00
350(POWER PACK WATT STOPPER 120V NO BID $22.26 NO BID $32.00 $31.00
351|POWER POLE 20 AMP 125VOLTS NO BID NO BID NO BID $119.50 $100.00
352|RECEPTACLE 30 AMPS DRYER 215/250 NO BID $2.28 NO BID $5.69 $2.27
353|RECEPTACLE 50AMP STOVE 125/250 NO BID $2.50 NO BID $5.69 $2.27
354|RECEPTACLE DUPLEX 15AMP NO BID $0.44 NO BID $0.42 $0.49
355|RECEPTACLE DUPLEX 20AMP NO BID $1.47 NO BID $1.29 $1.29
356|RECEPTACLE DUPLEX GFI NO BID $11.90 NO BID $12.90 $9.50
357|RECEPTACLE SINGLE 15AMP 125V NO BID $3.96 NO BID $2.29 $1.83
358|RECEPTACLE SINGLE 20AMP 125V NO BID $0.91 NO BID $2.29 $1.83
359|ROD THREADED ¥4" NO BID $9.18 NO BID $4.90 $0.37
360|ROD THREADED %" NO BID $30.97 NO BID $9.80 $1.52
361|ROD THREADED 3/8" NO BID $16.59 NO BID $6.90 $0.52
362|ROAD THREADED 5/16” NO BID $12.63 NO BID NO BID $0.42
363|SECURITY LIGHT 150W HPS NO BID $89.41 NO BID $71.60 $59.00
364|SENSOR WATT STOPPER NO BID NO BID NO BID $136.00 $63.00
365|SLB ¥ NO BID $3.52 NO BID $3.69 $2.78
366|SOCKETS MOGUL BASE NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.75 $10.00
367|SPLITBOLT #2 $2.22 $5.51 NO BID $3.36 $1.30
368|SPLITBOLT #2-4/0 NO BID $6.66 NO BID $6.16 $8.60
369|SPLITBOLT #6-8 $3.33 $2.66 NO BID $1.52 $0.96
370|SPLITBOLT #1/0 NO BID $2.66 NO BID $3.86 $1.88
371|SPRING NUT v NO BID $2.74 NO BID $0.85 $1.25
372|STAPLES PLASTIC NO BID $1.69 NO BID $0.14 $0.13
373|STRAP EMT %" $0.15 $0.05 NO BID $0.07 $0.06
374|STRAP EMT % $0.12 $0.05 NO BID $0.08 $0.08
375|STRAP EMT 1" $0.22 $0.06 NO BID $0.09 $0.15
376|STRAP EMT 1 ¥4 $0.30 $0.17 NO BID $0.29 $0.19
377|STRAP EMT 2" $0.60 $0.23 NO BID $0.43 $0.65
378|STRAP EMT 1 %" $0.60 $0.15 NO BID $0.33 $0.33
379|STRAP EMT 2 %" $1.32 NO BID NO BID $0.47 $2.35
380|SwWITCH DIMMER NO BID $12.77 NO BID $39.40 $4.76
381|SWITCH DOUBLE NO BID $2.93 NO BID $4.98 $5.26
382|SWITCH LOCKING DBL POLE 20 AMP NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.50 $8.96
383|SWITCH LOCKING 4-WAY 20AMP NO BID NO BID NO BID $67.94 $16.24
384|SWITCH LOCKING SINGLE POLE 20AMP NO BID $12.49 NO BID $10.98 $7.85
385|SWITCH LOCKING 3-WAY 20AMP NO BID $14.25 NO BID $15.98 $8.72
386|SWITCH MANUAL CONTROLLER SINGLE POLE NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.35 $20.65
387|SWITCH MOTOR SPEED CONTROL NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.95 $10.72
388|SWITCH TOGGLE DBL POLE 20 AMP NO BID $3.10 NO BID $18.48 $6.59
389|SWITCH TOGGLE 4-WAY 20AMP NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.23 $8.65
390|SWITCH TOGGLE SINGLE POLE 15AMP NO BID $2.43 NO BID $1.59 $0.64
391|SWITCH TOGGLE SINGLE POLE 20AMP NO BID $2.50 NO BID $1.69 $1.95
392|SWITCH TOGGLE 3-WAY 20AMP NO BID $2.71 NO BID $3.98 $2.67
393|SWITCH PLUG COMBINATION NO BID $3.07 NO BID $5.49 $5.42
394|TAPE ELECTRICAL $5.00 $0.75 NO BID $0.98 $0.78
395|TAPE RUBBER SPLICING NO BID $1.59 NO BID $12.98 $9.85
396|TIMER HAND DRYER NO BID NO BID NO BID $481.50 $70.00
397|TIMER INDOOR 277 VOLT NO BID NO BID NO BID $64.90 $60.73
398|TIMER INDOOR 110 VOLT NO BID $22.84 NO BID $59.90 $52.32
399|WALL PACK HPS 100 NO BID $38.83 NO BID $129.00 $90.00
400|WALL PACK HPS 150 NO BID $89.28 NO BID $129.00 $120.00
401|WALL PACK HPS 70 NO BID $38.73 NO BID $63.50 $59.38
402|WASHER REDUCER 1 %" X %" $0.45 NO BID NO BID $0.30 $0.38
403|WASHER REDUCER 1" X %" NO BID $0.63 NO BID $0.13 $0.15
404|WASHER REDUCER %" X %" $0.10 $0.37 NO BID $0.08 $0.07
405|WASHER REDUCER 2" X 1 1/2" $0.56 NO BID NO BID $0.37 $0.47
406 |WEATHERHEAD 2" $8.00 $7.93 NO BID $6.70 $7.28
407 |WEATHERHEAD 3" $47.00 NO BID NO BID $34.00 $41.74
408|WEATHERHEAD 4" $82.50 NO BID NO BID $72.47 $54.56
409|WIRE NUTS BLUE LARGE $0.50 $5.67 NO BID $0.58 $0.27




ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES
RFP 2008-075

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

VENDOR BREAKER
DESCRIPTION INTERNATIONAL SEXAUER | VOSS LIGHTING CED 3-G ELECTRIC
410|WIRE NUTS BLUE SMALL $0.09 $1.35 NO BID $0.05 $0.05
411|WIRE NUTS GREY $0.09 NO BID NO BID $0.33 $0.05
412|WIRE NUTS ORANGE $0.11 $1.54 NO BID $0.06 $0.05
413|WIRE NUTS RED $0.22 $2.75 NO BID $0.16 $0.08
414|WIRE NUTS YELLOW $0.20 $1.99 NO BID $0.12 $0.07
415|WIRE THHN MCI #350 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.99 $5.66
416|WIREMOLD 400 SERIES NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.80 $1.75
BREAKER
VENDOR INTERNATIONAL SEXAUER | VOSS LIGHTING CED 3-G ELECTRIC
% OFF CATALOG PRICE 0% 0% 0% 35% 20%
86.1% & 60%
PHILIPS LAMPS
58%, 67%, 71.5%
ADVANCE
% OFF LIST PRICE 15% 25% BALLASTS 35% 20%

*One (1) vendor submitted a "No Bid"




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

3-G ELECTRICAL SUPPLY
811 E. CALTON

LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956.724.2151

FAX: 956.723.0016
david@3gelectric.com
DAVID RUIZ

C.E.D WAREHOUSE

1010 E. CALTON ROAD

LAREDOQ, TX 78041

PHONE: 956.722.4951

FAX: 956.722.0035

ALAN RUDDER & SEVERIANO MEDINA
arudder@cedlaredo.com

smedina@cedlaredo,com

VILLARREAL ELECTRONIC CO., INC
1400 LINCOLN ST

LAREDO, TX 78040

PHONE: 956.722.2471

FAX: 956.722.0947

JOHN CHARLES & MIKE VILLARREAL
jcveco@shcglobal.net
mveco@sbeglobal.net

GRAINGER

LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956.717.0050; 956.566.0388
FAX: 956.682.9121

ENRIQUE GONZALEZ
Enrique.Gonzalez@grainger.com

MID-COAST ELECTRIC
10700 SENTINEL

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78217
PHONE: 800.656.6325
FAX: 210.520.8504
juanital@mecesi.com
grege@meesi.com
JUANITA LEAL

GREG CARRANCO

QA SYSTEMS INC
6620 MANOR ROAD
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78723
PHONE: 800-331-4132
FAX: 512-637-8811
AIDA REGALADO
aidag@aqasystems.com

ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES
RFP 2008-075
VENDOR LIST

DAUSIN ELECTRIC COMPANY
16294 (H 35 NORTH

SELMA, TX 78154

PHONE: 210.661.6736

FAX: 210.651.7598
ronnied@dausinelectric.com

brucew@dausinelectric.com

CANTU ELECTRIC

1717 BOB BULLOCK LOOP
PO BOX 3166 78044

LAREDO, TX 78043

PHONE: 956.723.3062

FAX: 956.722.3422
cantuelectric@cantuelectric.com
melissavela@cantuelectric.com

TECH-DEPOT

6 CAMBRIDGE DRIVE
TRUMBULL, CT 06611

PHONE: 800.625.9866 EXT.7416
FAX: 203.615.7006
cmontanez@techdepot.com

A.M.P ELECTRIC COMPANY
P.O. BOX 430471

LAREDO, TX 78043

PHONE: 956.712.4200

FAX: 956.723.6638

alfredo@ampelectricompany.com
ALFREDO PEREZ

PCI SERVICES INC
2620 N. MEADOW
LAREDQ, TX 78041
PHONE: 956.724 4684
FAX: 956.724.8084
gerardom@sc2000.net

REXEL

2400 BROCKTON

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78217
PHONE: 210-352-1000

FAX: 210-824-0419

mmorin@rexelusa.com
MIKE MORIN



PETE'S ELECTRIC INTER LINE BRANDS

P.O. BOX 39233 DBA SEXAUER

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78218 531 CENTRAL PARK AVE

PHONE: 210-656-1891 SCARSDALE, NY 10583

FAX: 210-856-1778 PHONE: 800-431-1872

PEDRO OLVERA JR FAX: 210-366-0823
glen1327@hotmail.com RENE GARCIA Sr. 210-381-8671 cell

rgarciasr@sexauer.net

CDI TECHNOLOGY SERVICES

P.0. BOX 831146 LAREDO HARDWARE COMPANY
SAN ANTONIQO, TEXAS 78283 401 MARKET ST
PHONE: 210-488-3066 LAREDOQO, TEXAS 78040
FAX: 210-488-9025 PHONE: 956-722-0981
JOSEPH WEYEL FAX: 956-722-0938
info@cdi-tech.net JOSE MOJCA
BREAKER INTERNATICNAL
14421 IMPORT ROAD QUALITY FAST SERVICE
LAREDOQ, TEXAS 78045 801 UNION PACIFIC #3
PHONE: 956-523-1407 LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
FAX: 956-523-1406 PHONE: 956-728-1550
CEL:956-206-9400 FAX: 956-728-9819
HUMBERTO GONZALEZ HOMERQ SALDIVAR
hbreakerintl@stx.rr.com lilly@afselectricinc.com
LILY GARCIA
VALL ELECTRIC
5317 CAMPOS DRIVE VOSS LIGHTING
LAREDO TEXAS 78041 5670 RANDOLPH BLVD
PHONE: 956-722-4441 SAN ANTONIO, TX 78233
FAX: 956-722-3527 PHONE: 210-967-8766
EDWARD VALLS FAX: 210-967-8767
edvalls@@sbcglobal.net DAVID MAYNARD
david maynard@vosslighting.com
McCOY’S BUILDING SUPPLY
3809 E. SAUNDERS LOWE'S
LAREDOQ, TEXAS 78041 6623 SAN DARIO AVE
PHONE: {956) 722-0596 LAREDQ, TEXAS 78041
FAX: (956} 722-0713 PHONE: 956-753-7033
DAN STAUFFER FAX: 956-753-6646
storeC41@meccoys.com ARMANDO DUARTE
dstauffer@mccoys.com
DR. IKE’'S
4200 IH 35

LAREDQ, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 721-7300
FAX:(956) 723-5988
ELISAAORTIZ
elisa@drikes.com




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
SEPTEMBER 17, 2008

RFP# 2008-041 BAND EQUIPMENT

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

PRIMARY VENDORS EST. ANNUAL AMOUNT
BROOK MAYS MUSIC
KYR MUSIC
NEMC
WASHINGTON MUSIC CENTER

SECONDARY VENDORS
ALAMO MUSIC CENTER SEE TABULATION
DF MUSIC ENTERPRISES
ELMO LOPEZ MUSIC
HILLJE MUSIC CENTER
K&S MUSIC
MSA MUSIC
SAM ASH MUSIC CORP.
LONE STAR PERCUSSION
STEVE WEISS MUSIC
THE WOODWIND & BRASSWIND

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED THIRTY (30) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON JULY 16, 2008 AND
JULY 20, 2008. SIXTEEN (16) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON JULY 30, 2008 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE
UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2008-2009 FINE ARTS DEPARTMENT

RESOURCE PERSONNEL.:

JAVIER VERA, DIRECTOR OF FINE ARTS

CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER

VENESA NAVARRO, PROCUREMENT OFFICER



UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

TO: Cordy Flores-Jackson, Director of Purchasing
FROM: Javier R. Vera, Director of Fine Arts f/{ %M/
THROUGH: Dr. Guadalupe Gorordo, Executive Director of Instructional Accountability

SUBJECT: RFP 2008-041 Band Equipment

DATE: September 4, 2008

Regarding RFP 2008-041, Band Equipment, we are recommending approval of the
following vendors listed as primary and secondary. Specific award will depend on the
Jowest and best price per item, that met our specifications.

- PRMARY VENDORS: SECONDARY VENDORS:

Brook Mays Music Alamo Music Center
KYR Music DF Music Enterprises
NEMC Elmo Lopez Music
Washington Music Center Hillje Music Center

K&S

MSA Music

Sam Ash Music Corp

Steve Weiss Music

The Woodwind & Brasswind

Lone Star Percussion

Having a wide variety of vendors will allow our band directors to select and purchase a
specific brand and type of instrument from these approved veadors during the 2008-2009
school year.

Fine Arts Department
Javier R. Vera, Director Leticia Leal, Fine Arts Coordinator
jvera@uisd.net Heal@uisd.net

5208 Santa Claudia Ln. - Laredo, Texas 78043 - (956)473-7121 - Fax (956) 473-7135

RECEIVED @9-84-'08 82:57  FROM- TO- UISD Purchasing Pae2/e02
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BAND EQUIPMENT

RFP 2008-041
VENDOR LIST

ALAMO MUSIC

425 N. MAIN

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78205-1482
FAX: 210-226-8742

UNIVERSAL MELODY SERVICES
used to be BROOK MAYS MUSIC CO
8605 CARPENTER FREEWAY
DALLAS, TEXAS 75247

PHONE: 1-800-421-6090

FAX: (214) 224-1869
mikemariar@brookmays.com
ordersbrookmays.com

ELMO LOPEZ MUSIC
1101 SAUNDERS
LAREDQ, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 726-9111

FAX: 210-729-9111
elmo@netscorp.net

FREDERIC H WEINER INC

168 JERICHO TPKE

MINEOLA, NY 11501

PHONE: 800-622-2675/516-747-5004
FAX: 516-294-4289

H & H MUSIC CO.

6132 BANDERA RD.

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78238
PHONE: (210) 520-7948

FAX: (210) 520-6965
bandera@hbrookmays.com

HILLJE MUSIC CENTER
3703 COLONY DR

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78230
PHONE; 210-696-0039
FAX: 210-696-7927
SCOTT HILLJE
hilllemusic@acl.com

HUMES & BERG

4801 RAILROAD AVE
EAST CHICAGQC, IN 46312
PHONE: 800-348-9737
FAX: 219-397-4534
info@humes-berg.com

INTERSTATE MUSIC SUPPLY

P.0. BOX 510865

13819 W. NATIONAL AVE

NEW BERLIN, WI 53151

PHONE: 800-982-2263

ALT PHONE: 800-877-0665 EXT 139
FAX: 262-957-4538

ROBERT GOODEN
hgoodden@interstatemusic.com

KAWAI AMERICA CORP

2055 E UNIVERSITY DR
RANCHO DOMINGUEZ, CA 80220
PHONE: 310-631-1771

FAX: 310-604-6913
ccallies@kawaius.com

KYRMUSIC LLC
14560 PIPELINE AVE
CHINO, CA 91710
PHONE: 909-597-0750
FAX: 909-597-7002
ADRIAN KIST
kyrmusic@verizon.net

LONE STAR PERCUSSION
10611 CONTROL PLACE
DALLAS, TEXAS 75238

PHONE 214-340-0835

ALT PHONE: 866-792-0143
FAX: 214-340-0835
support@lonestarpercussion.com

K&S MUSIC

61 INDUSTRIAL RD

BERKELEY HEIGHTS, NJ 07922
PHONE: 908-790-0400 OR 0420
FAX: 908-790-0407

KEN FRAGNER
kif@kandsmusic.com

MCCORMICKS ENTERPISE
P.O. BOX 577

ARLINGTON HIEHGTS, IL 60006
PHONE: 800.323.5201

FAX: 800.324.3884

KAREN LANG
karen@mccormicksnet.com

MIDWEST MUSICAL IMPORTS
2021 E. HENNEPIN AVE. STE 374
MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55413
PHONE: 800-926-5587

FAX: 612-331-4718

MICHAEL AAMOTH
mmi@mmimports.com

NATIONAL EDUCATIONAL MUSIC CO.
1181 U.S. ROUTE 22, BOX 1130
MOUNTAINSIDE, NJ 07092

PHONE: 908-232-6700

FAX: 908-789-3025

RAYMOUND BENEDETTO
sales@neme.com

bids@neme.com

info{@nemc.com



PERIPOLE BERGERAULT, INC.
F.O. BOX 129090

SALEM, OR 97309-0909
PHONE: 800-443-3592

FAX: 888-724-6733

SYLVIA PERRY / SUE CASE
sue@bergerauliusa.com

SAM ASH MUSIC

1305 WEST DUNDEE RD
BUFFALO GROVE, IL 60089
PHONE

FAX: 847-25-3199

DANIEL FISCHER

daniel fisher@samashmusic.com

STEVE WEISS MUSIC

2324 WYANDOTTE ROAD
WILLOW GROVE, PA 19090
PHONE: 215-659-0100

FAX: 877-582-2494
purchasing@steveweissmusic.com

SOUTHWEST STRINGS

1721 5. CHERRY BELL STRAV.
TUCSON, AZ 85713

PHONE: 800.723.6900

FAX: 520-624-9390
swsEswstrings.com
tiohnsongswstrings, com

SWEETWATER MUSIC TECHNOLOGY DIRECT

5335 BASS ROAD

FORT WAYNE, IN 46808
PHONE: 800.222.4700 EXT 1292
FAX: 260.432.1758

STEWART HISEY

stewart hisey@sweetwater.com

SUZUKI MUSIC CORP.

P.O. BOX 710459

SANTEE, CA 92072-0459
PHONE: (800) 854-1594 ext 156
FAX: 619-873-1997
education@suzukicorp.com
TRICIA BARCLAY
tharclay@suzukicorp.com

TAYLOR MUSIC, INC.

P.Q. BOX 670

ABERDEEN, 8D 57402-0670
PHONE: 1-800-872-2263
FAX; (605) 225-2051
sales@1800usaband.com

TEXAS BAND & ORCHESTRA
301 N. MCCOLL STE |
MCALLEN, TX 78501

PHONE: 956-683-0700
DANIEL RIVERA
danielrivera@texasbo.com

NICK RAIL MUSIC

2801 DE LAVINADR
SANTA BARBARA, CA 93105
PHONE: 800-649-5354

FAX: 800-743-8481
lucky@nickrailmusic.com

PERFECT TIMING DRUM SHOP
1212 BURNSIDE

LAREDO, TX 78040

PHONE: 956-722-5779

FAX: 856-722-5779

CARLOS CASTILLO

chale castillo@yahoo.com

THE STRING & HORN SHOP
119 N MAIN

BRYAN, TX 77803

PHONE: 979-779-8548

FAX: 979-779-7576

SUSAN RIEGER

gstrings@tca.net

THE BAND ROOM
P.0.BOX 1777

FOREST CITY, NC 28043
PHONE: 800.261.2370
FAX:888.816.2263

MIKE
mike@thebandroom.com

THE WOODWIND & BRASSWIND
4004 TECHNOLOGY DR

SOUTH BEND, IN. 46628
PHONE; 800-346-4448

FAX: 800-266-5962

qregs@wwbw.com

WASHINTON MUSIC CENTER
11151 VEIRS MILL RD.
WHEATON, MD 20902-2597
PHONE: 301-946-2300 OR 3448
FAX: 301-948-0487

CHUCK LEVIN'S
chuck{@chucklevins.com

JUDY DRENGWITZ
judyd@chucklevins.com

WHITTAKER

2222 BELLFLOWER BLVD.
LONG BEACH, CA 90815-2097
PHONE: 800.424.2263 x303
FAX: 562.598.6409

DAVID HARMS

wmi1946{@api.com



BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
SEPTEMBER 17, 2008

RFP# 2008-074 CLEANING OF FOOD SERVICE GREASE TRAPS

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

PRIMARY VENDOR EST. ANNUAL AMOUNT
RC SERVICES
SEE TABULATION
SECONDARY VENDOR

CHAVARRIA’S PLUMBING

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED ELEVEN (11) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON AUGUST 3, 2008
AND AUGUST 10, 2008. TWO (2) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON AUGUST 20, 2008 @ 3:00 P.M. AT
THE UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2008-200% FOOD SERVICE DEPARTMENT

RESOURCE PERSONNEL:

ADALBERTO RAMIREZ, DIRECTOR OF FOOD SERVICES
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER

VENESA NAVARRO, PROCUREMENT OFFICER



FOR CHILDREN

Adalberto Ramirez
Director of Food Service

MEMORANDUM

TO : Cordelia Flores
Director of Purchasing
United ISD

FROM : Adalberto Ramirez
Director of Foo ce

SUBJECT : RFP No. 2008-07
CLEANING OF FOOD SERVICE GREASE TRAPS

DATE : September 1, 2008

I have reviewed the tabulation of RFP No. 2008-074 for Cleaning of Food Service Grease
Traps provided by the Purchasing Department.

Based on the Tabulation Sheet, I recommend that R.C. Services be awarded as the
primary vendor and Chavarria’s Plumbing as secondary vendor for the Cleaning of Food
Service Grease Traps as the lowest and best proposals meeting specifications.
Specifications as to the number of clean outs are dependent on the size of the grease trap
at each of the schools and the Food Production Center. This is a one-year proposal
rencwable annually for up to three years.

The justification for this purchase is that as per city ordinance, all large commercial
kitchens need to remove all grease from the sewer system before it winds up in the city

sewer treatment plant where the grease can not be processed.

If you have any questions, please contact me.

XC! Eddie Zufiiga, Associate Superintendent

201 Lindenwood Drive — Laredo, Texas — (956) 764-6474 — Fax (956) 764-6476



UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CLEANING OF FOOD SERVICE GREASE TRAPS
RFP 2008-074

D::glglg'ﬁ?)hi CHAVARRIA'S PLUMBING R C SERVICES
(Bateria, Enz-;:r?z g Ig?iror Treatment) $5.00 $10.00
(Lei;e;?;z%%os Galons) $70.00 $75.00
(Greaterthan 1,000 Galons) 570.00 $75.00
Disposal Fee { Per Galion) $0.18 30.10
(Fof;fﬁ;'ibiﬁﬁrnzna \t;ork) $95.00 $65.00
—
{For anéo l[\)(lifi(i:tci’g:;lolg’]aftzﬂrjeeded) 10% N/A




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CLEANING OF FQOD SERVICE GREASE TRAPS
RFP NO. 2008-074
VENDOR LIST

FN SUPPLY CO

P Q BOX 581
RICHMOND, TX 77406
PHONE: 800-231-6647
FAX: 800-295-7924
F.N. MCORE
fnsupplv@intertex.net

LIQUID ENVIROMENTAL
11301 NEWKIRK ST.
DALLAS, TEXAS 75229
PHONE: (972} 243-4505
FAX: (469)461-6065

ALAN GOHEKE
alan.goheke@liguidenviro.com

RC SERVICES

1512 DRAKE

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE:956.717.5870
CELL: 956.206.0075
RICARDO CALDERON

rcservices2004 @yahoo.com

ECOLAB, INC.

370 WABASHA ST.

ST. PAUL, MN 55102
PHONE: (651) 293-2674
FAX: (651)293-2682
RON CHRISTOFFERSEN

bid.sales@ecolab.com

CAVAZOS WHOLESALE INC
2805 SAN BERNARDO AVE
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 956-722-4523

FAX: 956-727-7674

ALMA CAVAZOS
almacavazos@excite.com

STATE

WORLD HEADQUARTERS
3100 HAMILTON AVENUE
CLEVELAND, OH 44114
PHONE; 1-800-299-3482
FAX: (830)663-9424
CELL: (210) 827-2800
ROSE DEL TORO

CONSOLIDATED CLEANING COMPANY
5004 SAN BERNARDO AVE., 2ND FLOOR
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: {956) 725-7900

FAX: (956) 725-7882

SCOTT LOWENBERG

scolt lowenherg@hotmait.com

DUTCH GLO CHEMICAL COMPANY
P.O.BOX 574

DEVINE, TX 78016

PHONE: (830) 665-2823

FAX: (830) 663-3934

ANN B. CHESSER
dutchglo@agol.com

A CHAVARRIA'S PLUMBING
6320 KRONE

LAREDQ, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 956-726-9999

FAX: 956-725-1574

ADRIANA FLROES
chavarriasplumbin ahgo.com

STATE INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS
3100 HAMILTON AVE
CLEVELAND, OH 44114

PHONE: 800-782-2436

FAX: 888-771-8670

JIM VINSON
wvinson@stateindustrial.com

ARROW MAGNOLIA

2646 ROONEY LINE

DALLAS, TX 75229

PHONE: 800-527-2101 OR 972-247-7111
FAX: 972-484-2896

MARK KENNAR



BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
SEPTEMBER 17, 2008
RENEWAL

RFP NO. 061-2007 HARDWOOD FLOOR REPAIRS & MAINTENANCE

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

RECOMMENDED VENDOR AMOUNT
JONES HARDWOOD FLOORS SEE TABULATION

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED TWENTY (20) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON SEPTEMBER 2,
2007 AND SEPTEMBER 9, 2007. THREE (3) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON SEPTEMBER 19,2007 @
2:00 P.M. AT THE UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2008 - 2009 FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS

RESOURCE PERSONNEL.:

JUAN A. DAVILA, DIRECTOR OF FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING

HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER



Juan A. Davila
Facilities Maintenance and Operations Director

Memorandum
TO: Ms. Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing
FROM: Juan A. Davila, Director of Facilities Maintenance & Operations

DATE: Septmber 3, 2008

SUBJECT: RENEWAL OF RFP 061-2007 Hardwood Floors Repair and Maintenance

[ recommend renewal of RFP 061-2007 Hardwood Floors Repair and Maintenance, to:
Jones Hardwood Floors

for the 2008-2009 fiscal year. Based on, value to the district and ability to perform or
provide needed services or materials to the district.

This company has performed satisfactorily and provided prompt and quality service in the
past. The purpose of this proposal is to qualify a reputable company to provide needed
services or materials to the district when needed.

If you have any questions, please let me know.

3501 E Saunders — Laredo, TX 78041 - (956)473-7934 - Fax (956) 473-7951



UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
HARDWOOD FLOORS REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE

RFP 061-2007

JONES QUALITY
DESCRIPTION HARDWOOD FLOORS HARDWOOD FLOORS ZFLOOR CO
.GYMNASIUM FLOORS (sanding & Price per sq.
revarnishing) Sq. ft Total Cost  Price persq. ft. | Total Cost Price per sq. ft. Total Cost ft.
Col. Santos Benavides Elem. School 6,880.00 $1,255.00 $0.18 $1,170.00 $0.17 $10,320.00 $1.50
Clark Middte School 7,195.00 $1,313.00 $0.18 $1,223.00 $0.17 $10,792.00 $1.50
Gonzalez Middle School 7,515.00 $1,371.00 $0.18 $1,278.00 $0.17 $11,272.00 $1.50
United Middle Schaool 10,400.00 $1,808.00 $0.18 $1,768.00 $0.17 $15,600.00 $1.50
United South Middle School 8,334.00 $1,520.00 $0.18 $1,417.00 $0.17 $12,501.00 $1.50
*Lamar Bruni Vergara Middle Scheol 7,128.00 $1,300.00 $0.18 1,212.00 $0.17 $10,692.00 $1.50
JB Alexander High School 13,054.00 $2,382.00 $0.18 $2,219.00 $0.17 $19,581.00 $1.50
JB Alexander High School (New Gym) 8,531.00 $1,739.00 $0.18 $1,620.00 $0.17 $14,286.00 $1.50
JB Alexander High School {Dance Drill) 3,080.00 $562.00 $0.18 $524.00 $0.17 $4,620.00 $1.50
Lyndon B, Johnson High School (Large Gym) 12,554.00 $2,291.00 $0.18 $2,134.00 §0.17 $18,831.00 $1.50
Lynden B. Johnsan High School (Small Gym) 8.683.00 $1,584.00 $0.18 $1,476.00 $0.17 $13,024.00 $1.50
United High School 13,333.33 $2,433.00 $0.18 $2,267.00 $0.17 $18,909.00 $1.50
United South High Scheol 12,269.00 $2,239.00 $0.18 $2,086.00 $0.17 $18,403.00 $1.50
United South High Schoal (Dance Drill) 3,395.00 $619.00 $0.18 $577.00 $0.17 $5,092.00 $1.50
SECTION TOTAL $22,506.00 $20,971.00 $185,023.00
Ii. FACILITY FLOORS (sanding & revarnishing) TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST
Fine Arts Stage (Student Activity Complex) 2,235.50 $410.00 $0.18 $380.00 5017 $4,000.00 $1.79
United Middle School Auditorium Stage 553.00 $300.00 $0.54 $94.00 $0.17 $3,000.00 $5.42
Lynden B. Johnson Dance Drill Room 3,725.22 $679.00 $0.18 $633.00 $0.17 $5,587.00 $1.50
SECTION TOTAL $1,3689.00 $1,107.00 $12,587.00
ImAMAGED WOOD
SURFACES AND REPLACING WITH
NEW MATERIALS TO MATCH
(Cost per Square Foot) TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST
100-500 sq. ft. $10.50 $12.00 $20.00
501-1000 sq. ft. $9.75 $9.60 $20.00
1000+ sq. ft. $9.75 $9.60 $15.00




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
HARDWOOD FLOORS REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE

ARROW MAGNOLIA
2646 RODNEY LANE
DALLAS, TEXAS 75229
PHONE: 800-527-2101
FAX: 972-484-2896
ROBERT MCCOLLUM

BAGLEY FLOOR SERVICE
4896 CENTER PARK BLVD.
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78218
PHONE: 210-946-3490

FAX: 210-946-3490

CARL A. BAGLEY
tonyhagley@bagleysiloorservices

BRICKS & TILE INTERNATIONAL
6423 MCPHERSON ROAD STE #1
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 956-722-5038

FAX: 956-722-3551

JUAN FLORES
brickstile@|aredo.globalpc.net

D. JONES HARDWOOD FLOORS INC.

P.O. BOX 181

SAN MARCOS, TEXAS 78667
PHONE: (512) 353-8089

FAX: (512) 353-5608
rhoffman@grandecom .net

DUTCH GLO CHEMICAL COMPANY
P.O. BOX 574

DEVINE, TEXAS 78016

PHONE: 830-665-2823

FAX: 830-663-3934

ANA CHEESHER

dutchglo@aol.com

DIRECT FLOOR AND PAINT CENTER
6019 MCPHERSON SUITE 10
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 956-791-6180

FAX: 856-753-2606

RFP 061-2007
VENDOR LIST

EMTEX

P.O. BOX 33746

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78265
PHONE: 210-657-3301

FAX: 210-735-3044

E.C. MORENO
gcmoreno@juno.com

FERRIONIS HOME DESIGNS INC
3660 E. DEL MAR BLVD STE 3
LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-722-5383

FAX: 956-722-5385

JONATHAN FREYRE

FLOORING ASSOCIATES
P.O. BOX 820870

FORT WORTH, TX 76182
PHONE: 817-267-4568
KATIE MARTIN

GIL SOTOS HOME CONSTRUCTION
2104 QUALI CREEK RD.
LAREDO, TEXAS 78045

GLOBAL FLOORING DESIGNS
2601 E. SAUNDERS STE 5B
LAREDOQ, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-712-1924

FAX: 956-712-1878

g designs@sbcgiobal.net

JELCO GYM FLOORS
P.O. BOX 151085
AUSTIN, TX 78715
PHONE: 800-366-8306
FAX; 800-342-4076
info@jellisioncompany.com

JUNKERS HARDWOOD INC

95 Grand St Unit 3

NY, NY 10013

PHONE: 800-878-9663

FAX: 212-334-8062
information@junkershardwooed.com
www. junckershardwood.com




LEONIDES LOPEZ
410 CHEVY CHASE
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

LOPEZ FLOOR & WALL COVERING
1411 JOHNSON DR.

LAREDO, TEXAS 78046

PHONE: 712-0410

FAX: 724-9639

MELISSA LOPEZ

PK DASS SPORTS SURFACES
9288 LAKESHORE DR.

TYLER, TEXAS 75709

PHONE: (903) 597-5264

FAX: (903) 596-9310

QUALITY HARDWOOD FLOORS INC
2011 CLOVIS BARKER RD

SAN MARCOS, TX 78666

PHONE: 512-754-9077

FAX: 512-754-0919

JUSTIN VOLGT
brandon@gqualityhardwoodfloors.biz
www . qualityhardwoodfloors.biz

TRACK MASTER, INC.

1380 N US HWY 287 #102
MANSFIELD, TEXAS 76063
PHONE: (817) 477-1898 EXT 14
FAX: (817) 447-05H1

BRET ALLEN
bret@runningtracks.com
linda@runningtracks.com

TWIN TILE FLOORING CO.
6003 RITTIMAN PLAZA

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78218
PHONE: 210-822-6080

RUDY GUTIERREZ
twintile@texas.net

ZFLOORCO

9213 SOVEREIGN ROW
DALLAS, TX 75247
PHONE: 214-879-0730
FAX: 214-879-0733
KEVIN ZABLOSKY
Zfloor@shcglobat.net




