Playground Mulch
Feb. 18,2010 @ 1:00 p.m.

BIDDER: McAdam Landscaping

2001 Des Plaines

Forest Park

Forms: X
Bid Deposit: Check # 50891
Qualifications: X
Base Bid: S 4,480.00 S
{Mulch & delivery)
Alternate: $ 3,200.00 S
(Spread mulch)
Total: s 7,680.00 S
Comments:

U.S Arbor Products U-bee's LLC McGinty Bros, Bluegrass Playgrounds
1881 Commerce 2135 Newcastle 3744 E, CubaRd, 1056 Fedde Lane
Elk Grove Village Westchester Long Grove Ashland, NE

b X X X
NOT INCLUDED Check # 61618398 Bid Bond Check # 329502405
X X X Not included
2,736.00 § 3,520.00 S 3,360.00 § 6,520.00
3,360.00 $ 5,280.00 S 2,450.00 No Bid
6,096.00 $ 8,800.00 $ 581000 $ 6,520.00

Reese Recreation

3327 N. Ridge Ave.

Arlington Hts

NO BID

NO BID

George's Landscaping

1410 Mills Rd.
loliet
X
Bid Bond
X
$ 3,876.00
s 8,255.00 $
S 12,131.00 §

dv

Harrison Co.
24215. 25th St,

Broadview

NOT INCLUDED

NO BID

9,580.00

9,580.00




