
RFP 2510 Printing Services  TABULATIONS

Altom
Consulting &
Marketing Inc

Safeguard
Business
Systems

Tharp's
Printing
Services

Walker
County Press

Delivery: min-max wk days 7-15 5-10 3-5 No Response

BUSINESS CARDS  
Natural White Linen, Green & Black Ink - 2 sided 500 58.00 285.00 89.00 40.00
 1,000 64.00 615.00 109.00 50.00
 1,500 No Bid 615.00 129.00 60.00
LETTERHEAD, BOX OF 500
Natural White Linen, Green & Black Ink 1 bx. 169.00 188.00 95.00 180.00
 5 bx. 344.00 505.00 412.00 650.00
 10 bx. 493.00 832.00 1,510.00 1,100.00
Natural White Linen, Green Ink 1 bx. 164.00 188.00 95.00 140.00
 5 bx. 339.00 505.00 412.00 600.00
 10 bx. 489.00 832.00 1,510.00 1,050.00
20# White, Green & Black Ink 1 bx. 121.00 198.00 85.00 160.00
 5 bx. 294.00 246.00 380.00 400.00
 10 bx. 393.00 832.00 1,400.00 750.00
20# White, Green Ink 1 bx. 181.00 365.00 85.00 130.00
 5 bx. 294.00 895.00 380.00 350.00
  10 bx. 393.00 623.00 1,400.00 700.00
ENVELOPES, #10, , BOX OF 500  
Natural White Linen, Green & Black Ink 1 bx. 224.00 365.00 198.00 275.00
 5 bx. 437.00 899.00 862.00 900.00
 10 bx. 699.00 623.00 2,875.00 1,500.00
White, Green & Black Ink 1 bx. 106.00 365.00 138.00 140.00
 5 bx. 271.00 899.00 590.00 350.00
 10 bx. 472.00 623.00 1,100.00 600.00
White, Green Ink 1 bx. 99.00 365.00 118.00 130.00
 5 bx. 248.00 899.00 515.00 325.00
 10 bx. 434.00 623.00 950.00 550.00
White, Black Ink 1 bx. 91.00 365.00 108.00 130.00
 5 bx. 242.00 899.00 495.00 325.00
 10 bx. 426.00 623.00 900.00 550.00
White Window, Black Ink 1 bx. 92.00 365.00 118.00 130.00
 5 bx. 250.00 899.00 515.00 325.00
  10 bx. 445.00 623.00 950.00 550.00
DISTRICT FORMS
Discipline Report 50,000 16,995.00 6,985.00 16,950.00 22,500.00
Student Referral to Nurse 50,000 4,779.00 2,805.00 4,150.00 7,000.00
Counseling Referral 10,000 994.00 735.00 875.00 1,450.00
Clinic Visit Record 5,000 1,059.00 712.00 525.00 850.00
Student Health Record 5,000 1,079.00 867.00 580.00 950.00
Student Permanent Record Folder 5,000 No Bid 190.00 5,985.00 3,875.00
Cash Receipt 5,000 No Bid 500.00 No Bid 1,850.00
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FORMS BOUND INTO BOOKS   
Tardy Slip Book (GES) 5 books No Bid 1,018.89 595.00 450.00
Early Pick-Up Book, 2-pt (SES GES SHE HES) 12 books No Bid 177.00 651.00 No Bid
Early Pick-Up Book, 3-pt (SJE) 12 books No Bid 177.00 808.00 No Bid
Permananent Inventory Slip Book (HHS) 12 books No Bid 177.00 265.00 400.00
Deposit Receipt Book (HHS) 50 books No Bid 478.00 685.00 600.00
Textbook Receipt Book (HHS) 50 books No Bid 478.00 685.00 750.00
Maintenance Express Ticket Book 50 books No Bid 470.00 715.00 750.00
PEEL & STICK LABELS
HHS Student Immunization Label 1,000 135.00 177.00 185.00 250.00
CAMPUS / DEPT. FORMS  
HIS/
MPMS ID Badge Referral 2,000 No Bid 302.00 255.00 275.00
MPMS MPMS Textbook Record Card 1,000 86.00 No Bid 115.00 150.00
HHS HHS Commencement Program 3,000 No Bid 740.00 1,475.00 2,800.00
HHS HHS Learning Lab Pass 10,000 905.00 571.00 775.00 1,250.00
HHS HHS No ID Detention Slip 10,000 No Bid 571.00 630.00 750.00
HHS HHS Tardy Admit Slip 25,000 No Bid 1,619.00 1,100.00 1,875.00
CATE CATE Contact Form 1,500 No Bid 345.00 285.00 325.00
CATE CATE Career Prep Employer Handbook 250 No Bid 4,000.00 2,475.00 1,000.00
CATE CATE Enrollment Form (HHS) 1,500 238.00 345.00 300.00 325.00

CATE Diversified Career Preparation Contact
Form (HHS) 1,500 238.00 345.00 300.00 325.00

CATE Huntsville FFA Project Visitation Form
(HHS) 1,500 168.00 265.00 255.00 250.00
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