Red Wing Public Schools
2451 Eagle Ridge Drive
Red Wing, MN 55066

Red Wing

Public Schools

ISD # 256

Frr—

Phone 651.385.4500 WWW.Irwps.org

Date: February 22, 2022

To:  Karsten Anderson

From: Alan Gaylor\Kevin Johnson

Re:  RWHS Tennis Courts & Running Track

Fax 651.385.4510

Bids were opened on Thursday February 3, 2022 to perform scheduled maintenance on the tennis courts & the
stadium track at the high school, and we received some very good bids. We received six bids, five on the track

project & one on the tennis courts.

Bid tab:
BID TABULATION
roject: rack and Tennis Rehabilitation - Re ng High School
Date: February 3, 2022 @ 10:00am
REST TETTITS OTIT TETTITS O TTaCK O]
Contr Bid Item #1 Bid Item #2 Price #1 - Price #2 Armor |Track Unit Price Price #2
Contractor Add#1 Add #2 Form | Bid Bond] Tennis Rehab Track Rehab | Crack Sealing Cracks #1 Surfacing Cracks
Upper Midwest Athletic Construction Yes Yes Yes Yes $50,745.00 $110,698.00 $3.00 $20.00 $30.00 $4.00
|Athletic Field Services Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid $91,000.00 No Bid No Bid $20.00 $10.00
IMidwest Track & Tennis Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid $105,500.00 No Bid No Bid $28.00 56.70
Beynon Sports Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid $273,300.00 No Bid No Bid $5.820.00 54,850 00
Fisher Tracks Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid $96,585.00 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $1.50

Budgets from LTFM for these projects:
Tennis courts project: $70,000
Stadium track project: $165,000

Our recommendation for the track project is Athletic Field Services for $91,000.

Our recommendation for the tennis courts project is Upper Midwest Athletic Construction for $50,745.


http://www.rwps.org/

