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UNITED INDEPENDENT ScHooL DiIsTRICT

AGENDA ACTION ITEM

Topic: Approval of Awarding Bids, Proposals, and Qualifications

Submitted by: Ms. Cordelia Flores-Jackson of:_ Purchasing Department

Approved for transmittal to school board: October 17, 2012

Recommendations:

Staff recommends the UISD board of trustees approve the following Bids, Proposals, & Qualifications as
presented:

District-Wide:
RFP 2012-068 Drinking Water
RFP 2012-069 District-Wide Publications

Rationale:

Staff has complied with all applicable federal, state and local purchasing policies and procedures in obtaining pricing
information for the items listed above. Staff is recommending the awards based on being the best value to the district.

Budgetary Information:
The budget includes the funds for these purchases

Board Policy Reference and Compliance
CH local - purchasing and acquisition
CH legal - purchasing and acquisition




Summary of Recommendation(s)

District Wide
RFP 2012-068
Drinking Water

RFP 2012-069
District-Wide Publications

Recommended Vendor(s)
Laredo Spring Water
See Attached Tabulation

Recommended Vendor(s)
Adams Printing
Laredo Morning Times
Liberty Press
Marketing Depot
Princo
RABO Business Solutions
Rapidprint
Sledge Media
See Attached Tabulation




Board Approval
Awarding of Bids/Proposals
October 17, 2012

RFEP# 2012-068 Drinking Water

Recommendation:
Requesting approval to purchase from the best bidder(s) / offer(s) meeting specifications as follows:

Recommended Vendor(s) Est. Annual Amount

Laredo Spring Water See Tabulation

Administration distributed three (3) proposals and advertised on September 2, 2012, and September 9,
2012. Two (2) proposals were received on September 19, 2012, at 3:00 p.m. at the UISD Service Center
Purchasing Department.

Budget Information:
2012-2013 District Wide

Resource Personnel:

Cesar Trevifio, Director of Energy/Environmental Management
Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing

Karina Mendoza Guerra, Purchasing Manager




FOR CHILDREN

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Cesar O. Trevino
Director of Energy and Environmental Management

TO: Ms. Cordelia Flores [Jackson, Director of Purchasing
FROM: Cesar O. Trevino
DATE: October 3, 2012.

SUBJECT:  RFP 2012-068: DRINKING WATER

This RFP was requested to provide drinking water for the schools at the Rio Bravo and El
Cenizo area, following the recommendation from City of Laredo Health Department to
provide bottled water for the students and staff at the schools.

I recommend consideration of awarding RFP 2012-068 to the lowest and best proposer
meeting specifications:

Laredo Spring Water Ozarka

This company has excellent references, highly qualified and experienced staff and meets all
requirements set forth in the bid specifications. ~

If you need further information, please let me know.

Energy and Environmental Management Department
3501 E. Saunders - Larcdo, Texas 78041 - (956) 473-7930 - Fax (956) 473-7951



UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
DRINKING WATER
RFP 2012-068

VENDOR(S) Culligan Water of Laredo Laredo Spring Water
SECTION 1.
EST. MTHLY
Qry DESCRIPTION Unit Price
25 Room Temperature/Cold Water Dispenser, $6.00 $4.50
2222 5-Gallon Purified Drinking Water $5.75 $4.99
25 Cup Dispenser $0.00 No Charge
75 Cases Cup/Cones .02/cone - .04/cup $.015 cup
8 Bottle Storage Racks $0.00 No Charge
SECTION 1l
Replacement cost for Water Dispenser $250.00 No Charge
Broken Spigots $15.00 No Charge
Service Call Charge $60.00 $15.00
Other Charges $7.00 for lost/damaged bottles N/A




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
Drinking Water
RFP 2012-068

MAILING LIST

Culligan Water Conditioning
3020 E. Locust

Laredo, Texas 78041

Phone: (956) 727-1207

Fax: (956) 727-1985
sheri@culliganlaredo.com

Laredo Spring Water/Ozarka
P.O. Box 450071

805 Gale

Laredo, Texas 78045

Phone: (956) 727-0794

Fax: (956) 712-3049

Leticia Serna
Isw-inc@hotmail.com

Oneta Company

1401 SPID

Corpus Christi, Texas 78416
Phone: (361) 853-0123

Fax: (361)853-5327



Board Approval
Awarding of Bids/Proposals
October 17, 2012

RFP No. 2012-069 District Wide Publications
Recommendation:
Requesting approval to purchase from the best bidder(s)/ offer(s) meeting specifications as follows:

Vendor(s) See Estimated Amount

Adams Printing

Laredo Morning Times See Tabulation
Liberty Press

Marketing Depot

Princo

Rabo Business Forms

Rapidprint

Sledge Media

Administration advertised on September 9, 2012, and September 16, 2012. Eighty-four (84) proposals were sent.
Eight (8) were received on Monday, October 1, 2012 at 3 p.m. at the UISD Service Center Purchasing Department.

Budget Information:
2012-2013 Communications Department

Resource Personnel:

Gloria Rendon, Assistant Superintendent- Administration
Rocio Moore, Communications Specialist/Publications
Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing

Karina M. Guerra, Purchasing Manager




FOR CHILDREN

Board of Trustees

Judd Gilpin
President
District 7

Juan Roberto Ramirez
Vice President
District 6

Ricardo”Rick” Rodriguez
Secretary
District 2

Ricardo Molina, Sr.
Parliamentarian
District 1

Pat Campos
Member
District 3

Juan Antonio Molina, Jr.
Member
District 4

Javier Montemayor, Jr.
Member
District 5

Roberto J. Santos
Superintendent

201 Lindenwood Drive
Laredo, Texas 78045
Phone: (956) 473-6219
Facsimile: (956) 728-8691

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

To: Cordy Flores-Jackson, Dirgctor of Purchasing
From: Gloria S. Rendon

Date: October 4, 2012

Re: RFP 2012-069 —District wide publications

The District wide publications committee members consisting of the Communications
Specialist Rocio Moore and I reviewed the proposed bids. As such, the committee
recommends the following vendors to provide publication services to the District for
tabulation projects as well as other publication projects that may come up in the future.

Adams Printing

Laredo Morning Times
Liberty Press

Marketing Depot

Princo

RapidPrint

Sledge Media

¢ Rabo Business Solutions

Should you have any questions regarding the recommendations, please feel free to contact me
at extension 6243,



UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
RFP 2012-069

District Wide Publications

Taredo Morning | Laredo Morning Tiberty Press Tiberty Press Rabo Business
Vendors| Adams Printing Times (Option 1) | Times (Option 2) (Option 1) (Option 2) Marketing Depot Princo Solutions Rapidprint Sledge Media

Est.
Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Brochures - Department Brochures, Program Brochures, etc.
*8.5x11
:::: ;’;Z;"" Both Sides 500 $240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $440.00 $110.00 $675.00 $175.81 $300.00
*Tri-Fold Brochure Format
*100 Ib Gloss Book with aqueous coating both sides
Flyers - For Departments and Programs, etc. 500
*8.5X 11 $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $390.00 $96.00 $815.00 $153.41 $215.00
*Full Color on Both Sides 1000
*Full Bleed $270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $410.00 $105.00 $845.00 $163.97 $250.00
*1001b Gloss Book with aqueous coating both sides 5000 . . . .

$640.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,220.00 $300.00 $995.00 $486.67 $360.00
Flyers - For Departments and Programs, etc. 500
*11x17 $370.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $790.00 $195.00 $849.00 $275.07 $400.00
*Full Color on Both Sides 1000
*Full Bleed $410.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $860.00 $215.00 $890.00 $319.22 $435.00
*1001b Gloss Book with aqueous coating both sides 5000
$870.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,540.00 $635.00 $1,190.00 $950.62 $785.00

Postcards - Birthday Cards 56
*4x6 $140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00 $37.50 $1,290.00 $70.34 $88.00
*Full Color on Both Sides 1000
*Full Bleed $190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $180.00 $45.00 $1,390.00 $82.33 $100.00
*15-Pt. Card Stock 2500
*Gloss Finish $270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $300.00 $75.00 $1,495.00 $140.85 $165.00
Postcards - Birthday Cards %59
5x7 $170.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.00 $51.00 $1,395.00 $92.00 $125.00
*Full Color on Both Sides 1000
*Full Bleed $225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $240.00 $60.00 $1,495.00 $108.23 $150.00
*15-Pt. Card Stock 2500
*Gloss Finish $310.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $430.00 $107.50 $1,695.00 $191.54 $245.00
Postcards - Birthday Cards -
*8.5x11 $210.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $460.00 $115.00 $1,495.00 $183.41 $175.00
*Full Color on Both Sides 1000
*Full Bleed $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $560.00 $140.00 $1,595.00 $223.06 $225.00
*15-Pt. Card Stock 2500
*Gloss Finish $340.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,280.00 $320.00 $1,995.00 $511.60 $355.00
Posters 250
*11x17 $320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $595.00 $150.51 $275.00
*Full Color 500
*Full Bleed $370.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $850.00 $210.00 $650.00 $294.18 $315.00
*100# Gloss Book 1000
*Gloss Finish $425.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $890.00 $220.00 $695.00 $330.21 $465.00
Posters 250
*18x24 $525.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $599.00 $247.50 $485.00
*Full Color 500
*Full Bleed $550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,495.00 $375.00 $649.00 $522.69 $550.00
*100# Gloss Book 1000
*Gloss Finish $670.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,920.00 $480.00 $779.00 $719.62 $700.00
Posters 10
*11"x17" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*Full Color 25
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $260.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*1004# Gloss Book 50
*Gloss Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $325.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

G No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $490.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

= No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




RFP 2012-069

District Wide Publications

Taredo Morning Taredo Morning Tiberty Press Tiberty Press Rabo Business
Vendors| Adams Printing Times (Option 1) Times (Option 2) (Option 1) (Option 2) Marketing Depot Princo Solutions Rapidprint Sledge Media
Est.
Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Posters 250 ) ) . . ) ) . . ) )
*24"x36" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 500 ) . . . ) ) . . ) .
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*100# Gloss Book
e 210% 500 1000 ) ! . . . . . . ' '

Gloss Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Posters 10 ) ) . . ) . . ) i
*24"x36" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $420.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 25 » ) ) ) » ) ) _ )
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $760.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

1

00# G!o.ss Book 50 ) ) ) ) ) ) ) ) )
*Gloss Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,030.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 ) ' . . ) . . ) '
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,060.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Posters 250 , A . . , A . . , A
*36"x48" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 500 ) i . . ) i . . ) i
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*100# Gloss Book
N 088 Bo0 1000 _ _ ) ! ) ’ ) ' ) '

Gloss Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Posters 10 ) ) . . ) . . ) )
*36"x48" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 25 ) i . ‘ ) . . ) i
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $990.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

100# G!o.ss Book 50 ) ) . ‘ ) . . ) )
*Gloss Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,340.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

75 . . . . . . . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,020.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 . . . . . . . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,680.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Posters 250 ) ) : ) : ) ' . ;
*18"x24" $525.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 500 . ) X . . . " ;
*Full Bleed $550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,490.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

100# paper 1000 . ) X . . " n i

$670.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,920.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Posters 10 ) ) . . ) . . ) )
*18"x24" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $260.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 25 » ) ) ) » ) ) ) )
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $415.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

1

00# paper 50 ) ! ) ) ) . ! ' !
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

75 . . . . . . . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $840.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

100 . " . . . . . " .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




RFP 2012-069
District Wide Publications

Taredo Morning | Laredo Morning Tiberty Press Tiberty Press Rabo Business
Vendors| Adams Printing Times (Option 1) | Times (Option 2) (Option 1) (Option 2) Marketing Depot Princo Solutions Rapidprint Sledge Media
st
Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Programs/Calendar - Employee Banquet, Administrative Calendar, etc. 4 Pages - $985 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4 pages - $582.40 4 pages - $1,950
*Cover and Back Cover 100# UV Coating 500 8 Pages - $1,140 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $851.20 | 8 pages - $2,250
*60# or 80# Gloss Text 24 Pages - $1,800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 24 pages - $1,838.40] 24 pages - $3,800
*Saddle Stitched 36 Pages - $2,350 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 36 pages - $2,579.20 36 pages - $4,900
*Full Color 4 Pages - $1,120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4 pages - $932.80 4 pages - $2,360
*Full Bleed 1000 8 Pages - $1,385 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $1,382.40| 8 pages - $2,715
*8.5x11 (8 3/8 x 10 7/8 is acceptable) 24 Pages - $1,995 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 24 pages - $3,094.40 24 pages - $4,650
*4 pages, 8 pages, 24 pages & 36 pages. Please Quote each. 36 Pages - $2,695 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 36 pages - $4,379.20| 36 pages - $5,975
Magazine - Parent Connection (District will print this on average 3 4 Pages - $2,299 plus
times/year) District reserves the right to change frequency. 4 Pages - $6,100 4 Pages - $2,150 4 Pages - $2,475 4 Pages - $4,800 4 Pages - $5,000 No Bid No Bid freight 4 pages - $3,891.20 No Bid
*Cover and Back Cover 100# UV Coating 20,000 | 8 Pages - $8,625 8 Pages - $3,675 8 Pages - $4,300 8 Pages - $5,600 8 Pages - $5,900 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $6,216.00 No Bid
*60# or 80# Gloss Text 24 Pages - $12,600 | 24 Pages - $8,300 | 24 Pages-$9,280 | 24 Pages - $9,400 | 24 Pages - $11,900 No Bid No Bid No Bid D4 pages - $11,422.4¢ No Bid
*Saddle Stitched 36 Pages - $16,900 | 36 Pages - $10,200 | 36 Pages - $11,600 | 36 Pages - $12,300 | 36 Pages - $14,300 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 pages - $14,251.2 No Bid
4 Pages - 52,499 plus
*Full Color 4 Pages - $6,710 4 Pages - $2,250 4 Pages - $2,600 4 Pages - $5,100 4 Pages - $5,300 No Bid No Bid freight 4 pages - $4,102.40 No Bid
*Full Bleed; collate, stitch, fold and trim 22,000 | 8 Pages-$9,100 8 Pages - $3,850 8 Pages - $4,500 8 Pages - $5,900 8 Pages - $6,200 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $6,516.80 No Bid
*8.5x11 (8 3/8 x 10 7/8 is acceptable) 24 Pages - $13,800 | 24 Pages - $8,700 | 24 Pages - $9,750 | 24 Pages - $9,900 | 24 Pages - $11,200 No Bid No Bid No Bid D4 pages - $11,984.0 No Bid
*Number of Pages: 4 pages, 8 Pages, 24 Pages, 36 Pages. 36 Pages - $17,300 | 36 Pages - $10,650 | 36 Pages - $12,150 | 36 Pages - $12,900 | 36 Pages - $14,300 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 pages - $14,948.8 No Bid
4 Pages - $2,659 plus
4 Pages - $7,300 4 Pages - $2,350 4 Pages - $2,750 4 Pages - $5,400 4 Pages - $5,500 No Bid No Bid freight 4 pages - $4,331.20 No Bid
24000 8 Pages - $9,850 8 Pages - $4,025 8 Pages - $4,725 8 Pages - $6,200 8 Pages - $6,600 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $6,833.60 No Bid
24 Pages - $14,700 | 24 Pages - $9,150 | 24 Pages - $10,275 | 24 Pages - $10,400 | 24 Pages - $12,900 No Bid No Bid No Bid b4 pages - $12,632.0 No Bid
*Design: Camera ready (PDF Document) 36 Pages - $19,650 | 36 Pages - $11,250 | 36 Pages - $12,850 | 36 Pages - $13,700 | 36 Pages - $16,200 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 pages - $15,812.8 No Bid
Directory/Booklets - (Phone Directory, Bus Routes, etc.) 4 Pages - $920 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4 Pages - $410 No Bid No Bid 4 Pages - $360 No Bid
*70lb white paper (not glossy) 500 8 Pages - $995 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 Pages - $780 No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $610 No Bid
12 Pages - $1,025 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12 Pages -$1,040 No Bid No Bid 24 pages - $780 No Bid
*Saddle Stitched 58 Pages - $3,075 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60 Pages - 5,632 No Bid No Bid 58 pages - $980 No Bid
*Black Ink 4 Pages - $1,075 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4 Pages - $440 No Bid No Bid 4 Pages - $460 No Bid
*11x17 Folded to 8.5x11 700 8 Pages - $1,120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 Pages - $860 No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $720 No Bid
12 Pages - $1,225 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12 Pages - $1,140 No Bid No Bid 24 pages - $890 No Bid
*4 pages, 8 pages, 12 pages and 58 pages (Final Size 8.5x11) 58 Pages - $3,510 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60 Pages - $6,100 No Bid No Bid 58 pages - $960 No Bid
Tickets - (Graduation, Employee Banquet, etc.)
*2.25x5.5
*Full Color . X X . X
*1 side only 24,000 $1,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $860.00 $1,350.00 No Bid $2,200.00 $4,500.00
*Numbered

*15pt card stock




RFP 2012-069
District Wide Publications

Taredo Morning | Laredo Morning Tiberty Press Tiberty Press Rabo Business
Vendors| Adams Printing Times (Option 1) | Times (Option 2) (Option 1) (Option 2) Marketing Depot Princo Solutions Rapidprint Sledge Media
st
Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Graduation Booklets 20 Pages - 53,050 No Bid No Bid 20 Pages - 53,600 N/A 20 Pages - 55,370 No Bid No Bid 20 pages - No Bid
24 Pages - $3,250 No Bid No Bid 24 Pages - $3,700 N/A 24 Pages - $5,580 No Bid No Bid 24 pages - No Bid
4oy 28 pages -
*5.5x8.5 28 Page - $3,470 No Bid No Bid 28 Page - $3,900 N/A 28 Pages - $7,100 No Bid No Bid $5,233.60 No Bid
*Cover and Back Cover 100# UV Coating 20 Pages - $3,650 No Bid No Bid 20 Pages - $4,000 N/A No Bid No Bid 20 pages - No Bid
S0 24 Pages - $3,800 No Bid No Bid 24 Pages - $4,100 N/A No Bids No Bid No Bid 24 pages - No Bid
! 28 pages -
*Full Color 28 Page - $4,085 No Bid No Bid 28 Page - $4,400 N/A No Bid No Bid $5,876.80 No Bid
20 pages -
*Full Bleed 20 Pages - $4,585 No Bid No Bid 20 Pages - $4,300 20 Pages - $8,040 No Bid No Bid $4,558.40 No Bid
2,000 24 pages -
¢ 24 Pages - $4,975 No Bid No Bid 24 Pages - $4,500 24 Pages - $8,420 No Bid No Bid $5,988.80 No Bid
28 pages -
*Inside Pages: 60# Gloss Text 28 Page - $5,240 No Bid No Bid 28 Page - $4,900 28 Pages - $13,480 No Bid No Bid $6,342.40 No Bid
20 pages -
20 Pages - $4,950 No Bid No Bid 20 Pages - $4,600 20 Pages - $10,000 No Bid No Bid $4,932.80 No Bid
10,000 24 pages -
*Saddle Stitched ! 24 Pages - $5,220 No Bid No Bid 24 Pages - $4,800 24 Pages - $10,520 No Bid No Bid $6,420.80 No Bid
28 pages -
*20 Pages, 24 Pages, 28 Pages. 28 Page - $5,630 No Bid No Bid 28 Page - $5,300 28 Pages - $13,480 No Bid No Bid $6,865.60 No Bid
Activity Book (2nd Graders)
*60lb White Paper (not Glossy)
:;‘I’;’Ci' Ii':d'”g 6,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*8.5x11
*100 Pages
Bookmarks
*2x6 $230.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.00 $50.00 No Bid $93.38 $85.00
*15pt card stock 1,000
*UV Coating
*Full Color on Both Sides $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $470.00 $115.00 No Bid $209.93 $180.00
*Full Bleed 5,000

Notes|

60# Paper for Parent
Connection Magazine

80# Paper for Parent
Connection Magazine

60# Paper for Parent
Connection Magazine

80# Paper for Parent
Connection Magazine

*Bidding 17x24
instead of 18x24
where applicable.
Bidding 24x34"instead
of 24x36 where
applicable.




RFP 2012-069
District Wide Publications

Adams Laredo Morning Marketing Rabo Business
Vendors Printing Times Liberty Press Depot Princo Solutions Rapidprint | Sledge Media

Catalog Discount 5% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%




United Independent School District
District Wide Publications
RFP 2012-069

Accu Print

3503 Crosspoint

San Antonio, Tx 78217
Phone: 210-692-1927

Info@accu-print.com

Aladdin Print Shop
5918 Mcpherson
Laredo, Tx 78041
Phone: 956.724.7941
Fax: 956.724.7941

aladdin@border.net

Aldi Printing

8512 Michigan Ave
Laredo, Tx 78045
Phone: 956-744-6523
Fax: 956-724-6130
Javier & Martha Diaz

sotoprint@yahoo.com

Adams Printing

P.O. Box 450261
Laredo, Tx 78041
Phone: 956.724-5412
Fax: 956.717.9906

adams.printing@yahoo.com

Adgraphics

801 S Laurent
Victoria, Texas 77901
Phone: 361-578-6411
Fax: 361-576-2321
Bernie

Anna Daniels
adaniels@adgrtx.com
bkoliba@adgrtx.com

Amsterdam Printing

P.O. Box 701

Amsterdam, New York 12010
Phone: 800-833-6231

Fax: 518-843-7518

Jessica Uebrick

Scott Duesler
aoutbound@taylorcorp.com
juebrick@taylorcorp.com

sduesler@taylorcorp.com

Anahi Printing

3415 S. Buena Vista Ave
Laredo, Tx 78041
Phone: 956.723.8962

Animal Custom Graphics
5460 Springfield Ave #106
Laredo, Texas 78041
Phone: 956-753-8272

Fax: 956-729-7743
Armando Garcia

info@animalcustoms.com

Art Print

2813 Emory Loop

Laredo, Texas 78043
Phone: 956-242-5176
Arturo Ortega
arturo.artprint@gmail.com

Bay Area Digital

1705 E Del Mar Blvd

Ste A 101

Laredo, Texas 78045
Phone: 956-753-6792

Fax: 956-753-6792

Homer Villalon

Sylvia Villalon
bayareadigital@gmail.com

Best Computer Supplies

895 E. Patriot Blvd #110
Reno, Nv 89511

Phone: 800.544.3472

Fax: 800.829.4881
sales@theschoolsupplies.com

BCT San Antonio

8610 Botts Lane

San Antonio, Texas 78217
Phone: 210-524-9229
print@bctsatx.com

Brenner Printing

1234 Triplett St.,

San Antonio, Texas 78216
Phone: 210-349-4024

Fax: 210-349-1501
comics@brennerprinting.com

Brown Industries, Inc
101 South Chester Road
Swarthmore, Pa 19081
Phone: 800-522-7696
Karen Bower
Info@browninc.com

CENVEO

5101 S. Zarzamora

San Antonio, Texas 78211
Phone: 210-923-7591
Fax: 210-923-7537

Rudy Ayala
rudy.ayala@cenveo.com

Class Uniforms

502 W Calton Rd Ste 102
Laredo, Texas 78041

Phone: 956-753-2527
Gerardo Pena
gerardo@class-uniforms.com

Clear Visions, Inc.

121 Interpark Blvd. #3801
San Antonio, Texas 78216
Phone: 210-496-6006
Fax: 210-496-9225

Commercial Printing Co.
1217 Clark Blvd

Laredo, Tx 78041
Phone: 956.722.1142
Fax: 956.722.1142

Custom Sportswear, Inc
8 Enterprise Court
Sewell, NJ 08080
Phone: 800-697-0330
Fax: 856-589-1033

Ron Duzenski

bids@customsportswear.net

Dallas Print

2639 EIm Street Ste. 203
Dallas, Texas 75226
Phone: 214-760-9761
Fax: 214-760-9762
contact@dallasprint.com
nick@dallasprint.com

Discount Imaging of Laredo
5702 Mc Pherson Ste 11
Laredo, Texas 78041
Phone: 956-795-8258

Fax: 956-795-8254
Francisco E Garcia

pacodil@sbcglobal.net

El Manana

5901 McPherson
Centre Plaza Ste. 12A
Laredo, Texas 78041
Phone: (956) 712-1122
Fax: (956) 717-5091
Attn: Mariana Fuentes

art @elmanana.com.mx

Embellish Athletics
101 N Ballard Ave
Wylie, Texas 75098
Phone: 972-442-2402
Ashley Westbrook

ashley@embellishathletics.com

Fina's Screen Printing
1717 San Bernardo Ave
Laredo, Texas 78040
Phone: 956-729-8193
Fax: 956-725-6313
Josefina Martinez

finaslaredo@yahoo.com
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Gallant, Inc.

775 S. Kirkman Road #117
Orlando, FL 32811

Phone: 800-Gallant
Phone: 407-856-4288
Fax: 407-856-2991

Dan Levin

dan@gallantgifts.com

customerservice@gallantgifts.com

Global Diplomas & Global Datebooks

144 Turnpike Rd. Ste 250
Southborough, MA 01172
Phone: 508-232-7725
Fax: 508-342-7100
Jonathan Feldman

rfp@gprinting.com

| Color Printing & Mailling
22873 Lockness Avenue
Torrance, CA 90501
Phone: 310-997-1452 x 28
Fax: 310-997-1457
sameer@icolorprinting.net

Image Net Office System
6050 North Course
Houston, Texas 77072
Phone: 832-775-1200
Fax: 832-775-1239

Lee Roberson

jroberson@imagenetos.com

Ink Connection

dba Cartridge Depot
McPherson 6202 Ste 12
Cell: 956-693-3026
Cell: 956-326-5461
Office: 956-725-5929
Fax: 956-725-5929

Alex Quezada

laredo@thecartridgedepot.com

Jose A. Serrano Printing
1503 Los Ebanos
Laredo, Tx 78041
Phone: 956.791.5531

serranoprint @yahoo.com

Kwik Kopy Printing
616 W. Calton Rd Ste. 8
Laredo, Tx 78041
Phone: 956.723.1367
Fax: 956.723.5870

velar@stx.rr.com

Kwik Print

2820 Springfield

Laredo, Tx 78041

Phone: 956.723.2271

Fax: 956.725.7103

kwikprint 2000@yahoo.com

Laredo Morning Times
111 Esperanza Drive
Laredo, Texas 78041
Phone: 956-728-2510
Phone: 956-728-2500
Fax: 956-728-2595
Adriana Devally
adriana@Imtonline.com

Laredo Paper & Office Supply
1501 Boston

Laredo, Tx 78041

Phone: 956.722.1547
Iposupply@hotmail.com

Laredo Printing

903 O'kane

Laredo, Tx 78040
Phone: 956.722.2724
Fax: 956.722.3317

Liberty Press

1180 N Mountain Spring Parkway
Springville, UT 84663

Phone: 800-296-6402

Fax: 801-853-5333

Ron Payne

rpayne@libertypress.org

Litho Business Forms, Inc
6202 Mcpherson Rd Ste 3
Laredo,tx 78041

Phone: 956.727.7593

Fax: 956.727.8456
eliasmendiola@stx.rr.com
litho@stx.rr.com

Madrid Printing
519 N. Mendiola Ave.
Laredo, Tx 78041
Phone: 956.723.9812

Marfield Corp. Stationery
P. O. Box 814210

Dallas, Tx 75381-4210
877-245-9122
sales@marfield.com

www.marfield.com

Marketing Depot
519 Farragut St Ste F
Laredo, Texas 78040
Fax: 956-218-8036
Sergio Farias

marketingdepotl@yahoo.com

Mendes Printing Co.
104 W. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Tx 78041
Phone: 956.722.2222
Fax: 956.722.8511
Attn: Ross

copy@mendesprinting.com

Mergenthaler Printing
1720 Santa Maria
Laredo, Tx 78040
Phone: 956.724.6130
Fax: 956.724.7039

Metroplex Printing And Finishing, Inc.

Eric Swanson

2143 N. Stemmons Freeway
Lewisville, Texas 75077
Phone: 817-318-0809

Fax: 817-318-3010

eswanson@metroplexfinishing.com

MGM Printing

2500 Airport Freeway
Fort Worth, Texas 76111
Phone: 817-831-7215
Fax:817-831-7341
tony@mgmprinting.com

Mignone Communications, Inc
dba Phillips Brothers Printers
2309 West White Oaks Dr
Springfield, IL 62704

Phone: 217-787-3014

Fax: 217-787-9624

Brett Miles

csr@pbpweb.com

National Document Business
P.O. Box 7789

Santa Rosa, CA 95407

Phone: 707-576-6305

Fax: 707-547-4562

Barbara Brown

barbara-brown@usa.com

ND4C.com

Next Day Four Color

12902 Delivery Drive

San Antonio, TX 78247
Phone: 800-968-2519

Fax: 866-908-7019
customerservice@nd4c.com

Nu Tech Image

201 W Hillside Ste 14
Laredo, Texas 78041
Phone: 956-725-4100
Fax: 956-725-4418

sales@nu-techimage.com

Office Max

5408 San Bernardo
Laredo, Tx 78041
Phone: 956.791.0251

Office Max, INC

2601 Technology Place
Norman OK 73071

Phone: 877-633-2629

Fax: 877-311-3715

James Mclntyre
jamesmcintyre@officemax.com




PACC

131 Lagos Ave
Laredo, Texas 78045
Phone: 956-728-7500
Fax: 956-723-7500
Roberto Hernandez

lobo@thepacc.us

Paco Diaz
956-771-9028
pacodiazz@gmail.com

Patria Offic Supply
301 E. Calton Rd
Laredo, Tx 78041
Phone: 956.723.2332
Fax: 956.724.8081

Phillips Brothers Printers
2309 West White Oaks Drive
Springfeild, IL 62704
Phone:217-787-3014

Fax: 217-787-9624

Carolyn Rush
carolyn@pbpweb.com

Print Co

401 Shiloh Dr. Ste 7
Laredo, Texas 78045
Phone: 956-717-1000
Fax: 956-717-1006
Hector Cano

princo@att.net

Print Express

4820 Mcpherson Rd Ste. 1
Laredo, Tx 78041

Phone: 956.723.6687

Fax: 956.726.9198
printxpress@sbcglobal.net

Printex Express

754 N Alamo Road Ste A
Alamo, Texas 78516

Phone: 956-781-2029

Fax: 956-781-2095

Yoli Martinez
printexexpress@aol.com
printex_express@yahoo.com

Printers Unlimited, Inc

112 Tarlton

Corpus Christi, Tx 78415
Phone: 361.883.1724

Fax: 361.888.8918
service@printersunlimited.com

Proforma RGV

940 Anzalduas Drive
San Benito, Texas 78586
Phone: 956-399-4446
Fax: 956-399-4434
Tresa or Bob Jackson

tresa.'ackson@proforma.com
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PTM Document Systems

2305 Circadian Way

Santa Rosa, Ca 95407

Becky Holcomb

Phone: 866-667-2881 Ext 6309
Fax: 707-547-4546
bholcomb@prinmt-2-mail.com

Quality Awards & Printing
502 W Calton Rd Ste 203
Laredo, Texas 78041

Phone: 956-523-0383

Fax: (same)

Ivan Quintanilla

quality awards@sbcglobal.net

Quill Corporation

100 Schelter Rd
Lincolnshire, Il 60069-3621
Phone: 800.634.4809

Fax: 800.789.2016
bid@quill.com

Rabo Printing Forms, Inc.
707 N. Freeway Ste. 114
Fort Worth, Tx 76102
Phone: 800.909.7226

Fax: 817.336.1636

Attn: Bob Godfrey
bobgodfrey@sbcglobal.net

Rapid Forms

301 Grove Rd

Thorofare, Nj 08086-9499
Phone: 800.257.8354

Fax: 800.451.8113

Rapidprint Of Laredo

820 San Bernardo

Laredo, Tx 78041

Phone: 956.727.2100

Fax: 956.727.1854
rapidprintlaredo@yahoo.com

San Antonio Express News
400 3rd Street

San Antonio, Texas 78205
Phone: 210-250-2512

Phone: 800-456-7411
Catherine Bordelon
cferguson@express-news.net

Scantron Corporation

34 Parker

Irvine, Ca 92618

Phone: 800.722.6876 X 7710
Fax: 949.639.7710

karen _murray@scantron.com

Sledge Media

1008 Dickey Ln #G4
Laredo, Texas 78043
Phone: 956-229-2019
Rudy Murrillo Jr.
rudy@sledge641.com
rmurrillo020@gmail.com
www.sledge641.com

Smart Promotional
2065 Quito Loop
Laredo, Texas 78045
Phone: 956-645-9423
Fax: 956-753-3478
Josefina M. Requena

smartpromo@sbcglobal.net

Staples

1511 Somerset Canyon Ln
Cedar Park, Texas 78613

Phone: 512-582-7007

James Pemberton
james.pemberton@staples.com

Sung Li Ja Cha, Inc

9801 Cantera Ct. Unit 801
Laredo, Texas 78045
Phone: 956-307-6017

Fax: 956-729-0857

Pedro Salce

Perla Campbell
sales@texasawards.com

The Graphix Store

4833-G Brentwood Stair Rd
Fort Worth, Texas 76103
Phone: 817-429-7746

Fax: 817-426-6626

Dustin Conniff
dustin@thegraphixstore.com

Texoma Web Offset Printing
P.O. Box 10

Gainesville, Texas

Phone: 940-665-6262

Fax: 940-665-6540
gstockard@texomaweb.com

The Bargain Book

3100 HWY 359

Laredo, Texas 78043

Phone: 956-722-0100

Fax: 956-722-0706

John Adcock
john.adcock@bargainbook.cc

The Graphix Store

4833-G Brentwood Stair Rd
Fort Worth, Texas 76103
Phone: 817-429-7746

Fax: 817-426-6626

Dustin Conniff
dustin@thegraphixstore.com

The Print Place

7913 Mcpherson Ste# 111
Laredo, Tx 78041

Phone: 956.723.0840
printplace@compuhardt.net

The Print Center at Region 4
For more information, contact:
The Print Center

Phone: 713.744.6888

printcenter@esc4.net



Tovar Imports, Inc.

2909 San Andres

Mission, Texas 78572
Phone: 956-222-9693

Fax: 877-470-1890

Jennifer Tovar
jennifer@tovarimports.com
sales@tovarimports.com
www.tovarimports.com

Universal Printing

5309 Mcpherson Ste. 1
Laredo, Tx 78041

Phone: 956.728.8780

Fax: 956.728.8782
universalprint96@yahoo.com

Torres Printing Facility

125 Private Road #4303
Hondo, Texas 78861

Phone: 830-426-5325

Fax: 830-741-7085

Linda Childs
linda.thornton@tdcj.state.tx.us

Trend Offset Printing

2323 McDaniel Dr
Carrollton, Texas 75006
Phone: 573-437-5373

Fax: 573-437-5249

Jeff Smith
jeff.smith@trendoffset.com

Visual Graphic A2
17551 Rock Port Road
Laredo, Texas 78045
Phone: 956-333-0054
Phone: 956-237-0524
Adriana Siso

lasiso@yahoo.com

Western Paper Co.

9101 Wall St. #450

Austin, Tx 78754

Phone: 361.779.0022

Fax: 361.994.8239

Attn: Richard Franco
rfranco@westernbrw.com

westernpaperbids@gmail.com

Xtreme Point

2503 Boulanger

Laredo, Texas 78041
Phone: 956-220-0502
Carlos Rene Ramirez Jr.
sketch@xtremepoint.net
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