PROPOSAL TABULATION FORM

Page 1 of 3
PROJECT NO.: 25-1051-49A - ALTERNATE PROPOSAL
PROJECT NAME: WYLIE ISD - 2025 HAIL DAMAGE AT MULTIPLE FACILITIES
PRE-BID DATE: 4/1/2025
BID DATE: 4/8/2025
2 =) ALT PROPOSAL 2 ALT PROPOSAL 7
o | = ALT PROPOSAL 1 ALT PROPOSAL 3 ALT PROPOSAL 4 ALT PROPOSAL 5 ALT PROPOSAL 6 ALT PROPOSAL 8
BIDDERS % ol 8 HIGH SCHOOL R';'SESSECCHT?S,'\I‘S HIGH SCHOOL HIGH SCHOOL HIGH SCHOOL HIGH SCHOOL TO_TAL PRICE WFECS)TOFE"SEE%ET‘JSSY WEST ELEMENTARY
EE| 9 |RooFsecTonsaaB)|  C0°EG i kap) ROOF SECTION E ROOF SECTION (J) ROOF SECTION (L)  |rooF secTions (& n)|  High School B.C.D&E) ROOF SECTIONS (A)
T ,D,F,G,H, .C,

CS ADVANTAGE \ $530,000.00 $2,080,000.00 $398,000.00 $500,000.00 $160,000.00 $100,000.00 $3,768,000.00 $1,100,000.00 $365,000.00
BARR ROOFING NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,196,150.00 $379,245.00
LYDICK-HOOKS ROOFING LUMP SUM LUMP SUM LUMP SUM LUMP SUM LUMP SUM LUMP SUM $4,044,300.00 $1,066,240.00 $367,360.00

WYLIE ISD - ALTERNATE PROPOSAL BID TABS - with bids



PROPOSAL TABULATION FORM

Page 2 of 3
PROJECT NO.: 25-1051-49A - ALTERNATE PROPOSAL
PROJECT NAME: WYLIE ISD - 2025 HAIL DAMAGE AT MULTIPLE FACILITIES
PRE-BID DATE: 4/1/2025
BID DATE: 4/8/2025
ALT PROPOSAL 9 ALT PROPOSAL 11
ALT PROPOSAL 10 JUNIOR HIGH ALT PROPOSAL 12 ALT PROPOSAL 13 ALT PROPOSAL 14 | ALT PROPOSAL 15 ALT PROPOSAL 16
BIDDERS TOTAL PRICE WERSC;FO'ETSEE%'\#%’I\'QTE WEST INTERMEDIATE TOTAL PBICE ROOF SECTIONS JUNIOR HIGH JUNIOR HIGH JUNIOR HIGH JUNIOR HIGH JUNIOR HIGH
Elementary (AB.C.F.G&H) ROOF SECTIONS (D & E) Intermediate (A,B,C,E,F,G,H,J) ROOF SECTION (D) |ROOF SECTIONS (K & R)] ROOF SECTION (N) | ROOF SECTION (P) ROOF SECTION (Q)
e (LM, S&T)
CS ADVANTAGE $1,465,000.00 $1,260,000.00 $260,000.00 $1,520,000.00 $1,040,000.00 $34,000.00 $240,000.00 $280,000.00 $140,000.00 $215,000.00
BARR ROOFING $1,575,395.00 $1,333,086.00 $318,449.00 $1,651,535.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LYDICK-HOOKS ROOFING $1,433,600.00 $1,530,655.00 $342,070.00 $1,872,725.00 Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum

WYLIE ISD - ALTERNATE PROPOSAL BID TABS - with bids




PROPOSAL TABULATION FORM

Page 3 of 3
PROJECT NO.: 25-1051-49A - ALTERNATE PROPOSAL
PROJECT NAME: WYLIE ISD - 2025 HAIL DAMAGE AT MULTIPLE FACILITIES
PRE-BID DATE: 4/1/2025
BID DATE: 4/8/2025
UNIT PRICE PROPOSAL | UNIT PRICE PROPOSAL | UNIT PRICE PROPOSAL | UNIT PRICE PROPOSAL
BIDDERS TOTAL PRICE REMOVE & REPLACE REMOVE & REPLACE INSTALL 4" INSTALL 4"
Junior High GYPSUM DECKING | DETERIORATED NAILERS| CAST IRON DRAINS PVC DRAIN
(Price per SQFT) (Price per Board Ft) (Price Each) (Price per Linear FT)

CS ADVANTAGE $1,949,000.00 $15.00 $10.00 $4,500.00 $50.00
BARR ROOFING NO BID $45.00 $3.50 $500.00 $16.00
LYDICK-HOOKS ROOFING $2,074,000.00 $35.00 $4.00 $4,500.00 $10.00

WYLIE ISD - ALTERNATE PROPOSAL BID TABS - with bids




