
Bid Request Number Bid #09-56

Title Transportation Stock Repair Parts

Bid Type BID

Open Date 8/7/2009 8:00:00 AM Central

Close Date 8/21/2009 1:00:00 PM Central

Line 1 Water Filter

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 18 EA 4.88 87.84

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 18 EA 6.05 108.9

Sewell Ford 18 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 18 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 18 EA No Bid

Line 2 Water Filter

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 56 EA 4.66 260.96

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 56 EA 6.05 338.8

O?Reilly Auto Parts 56 EA 7.42 415.52

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 56 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 56 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 56 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 56 EA No Bid

Line 3 Water Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 50 EA 16.35 817.5

O?Reilly Auto Parts 50 EA 19.23 961.5

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 50 EA 22.13 1106.5

Sewell Ford 50 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 50 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 50 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 50 EA No Bid

Line 4 Brake Shoes with Maintenance Kit

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 8 EA 67.49 539.92

Heavy Vehicle Parts, Inc. 8 EA 76.4 611.2

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

O?Reilly Auto Parts 8 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA No Bid

Line 5 Brake Shoes with Maintenance Kit



Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 88 EA 46.83 4121.04

Heavy Vehicle Parts, Inc. 88 EA 49 4312

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 88 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 88 EA No Bid

O?Reilly Auto Parts 88 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 88 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 88 EA No Bid

Line 6 Brake Shoes with Maintenance Kits

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Heavy Vehicle Parts, Inc. 36 EA 43.75 1575

Sewell Ford 36 EA 45.32 1631.52

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 36 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 36 EA No Bid

O?Reilly Auto Parts 36 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 36 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 36 EA No Bid

Line 7 Brake Drums

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 10 EA 103.6 1036

Heavy Vehicle Parts, Inc. 10 EA 110.5 1105

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 10 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 10 EA No Bid

O?Reilly Auto Parts 10 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 10 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 10 EA No Bid

Line 8 Brake Drums

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 38 EA 116.63 4431.94

Heavy Vehicle Parts, Inc. 38 EA 134.5 5111

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 38 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 38 EA No Bid

O?Reilly Auto Parts 38 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 38 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 38 EA No Bid

Line 9 Brake Drums

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 46 EA 83.73 3851.58

Heavy Vehicle Parts, Inc. 46 EA 84.5 3887

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 46 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 46 EA No Bid



O?Reilly Auto Parts 46 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 46 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 46 EA No Bid

Line 10 Brake Drums

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 24 EA 98.05 2353.2

Heavy Vehicle Parts, Inc. 24 EA 111.95 2686.8

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 24 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 24 EA No Bid

O?Reilly Auto Parts 24 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 24 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 24 EA No Bid

Line 11 Brake Drums

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 6 EA 178.96 1073.76

Heavy Vehicle Parts, Inc. 6 EA 179.47 1076.82

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

O?Reilly Auto Parts 6 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA No Bid

Line 12 Seals

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 6 EA 19.98 119.88

O?Reilly Auto Parts 6 EA 20.96 125.76

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Line 13 Seals

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 2 EA 26.44 52.88

O?Reilly Auto Parts 2 EA 27.74 55.48

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 2 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 2 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 2 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 2 EA No Bid

Line 14 Seals

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 2 EA 8.58 17.16



O?Reilly Auto Parts 2 EA 9 18

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 2 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 2 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 2 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 2 EA No Bid

Line 15 Seals

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 8 EA 5.46 43.68

O?Reilly Auto Parts 8 EA 5.72 45.76

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Line 16 Seals

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 4 EA 26 104

O?Reilly Auto Parts 4 EA 27.28 109.12

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 4 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 4 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 4 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 4 EA No Bid

Line 17 Seals

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 10 EA 25.2 252

O?Reilly Auto Parts 10 EA 26.44 264.4

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 10 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 10 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 10 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 10 EA No Bid

Line 18 Seals

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 6 EA 1.5 9

O?Reilly Auto Parts 6 EA 1.57 9.42

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Line 19 Seals

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 4 EA 2.17 8.68



O?Reilly Auto Parts 4 EA 2.27 9.08

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 4 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 4 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 4 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 4 EA No Bid

Line 20 Seals

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 8 EA 2.42 19.36

O?Reilly Auto Parts 8 EA 2.54 20.32

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Line 21 Seals

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 10 EA 1.38 13.8

O?Reilly Auto Parts 10 EA 1.45 14.5

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 10 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 10 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 10 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 10 EA No Bid

Line 22 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 2.59 15.54

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA 3.16 18.96

Sewell Ford 6 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Line 23 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 8 EA 2.82 22.56

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA 3.45 27.6

O?Reilly Auto Parts 8 EA 4.22 33.76

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 8 EA No Bid

Line 24 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification



Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 3 EA 8.88 26.64

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 3 EA 10.77 32.31

O?Reilly Auto Parts 3 EA 10.93 32.79

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 3 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 3 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 3 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 3 EA No Bid

Line 25 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 2.85 17.1

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA 3.45 20.7

O?Reilly Auto Parts 6 EA 5.03 30.18

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 6 EA No Bid

Line 26 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 2 EA 2.59 5.18

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 2 EA 3.16 6.32

Sewell Ford 2 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 2 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 2 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 2 EA No Bid

Line 27 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 2 EA 2.59 5.18

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 2 EA 3.16 6.32

O?Reilly Auto Parts 2 EA 3.66 7.32

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 2 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 2 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 2 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 2 EA No Bid

Line 28 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 14 EA 18.35 256.9

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 14 EA 24.63 344.82

O?Reilly Auto Parts 14 EA 30.54 427.56

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 14 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 14 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 14 EA No Bid



Sewell Ford 14 EA No Bid

Line 29 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 7 EA 2.88 20.16

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 7 EA 3.45 24.15

O?Reilly Auto Parts 7 EA 5.65 39.55

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 7 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 7 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 7 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 7 EA No Bid

Line 30 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 4 EA 4.88 19.52

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 4 EA 5.85 23.4

O?Reilly Auto Parts 4 EA 6.9 27.6

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 4 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 4 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 4 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 4 EA No Bid

Line 31 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 3 EA 2.88 8.64

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 3 EA 3.45 10.35

O?Reilly Auto Parts 3 EA 5.99 17.97

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 3 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 3 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 3 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 3 EA No Bid

Line 32 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 18 EA 20.79 374.22

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 18 EA 26.6 478.8

O?Reilly Auto Parts 18 EA 28.31 509.58

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 18 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 18 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 18 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 18 EA No Bid

Line 33 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 8 EA 9.39 75.12



B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA 11.36 90.88

O?Reilly Auto Parts 8 EA 15.74 125.92

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 8 EA No Bid

Line 34 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 6.59 39.54

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA 7.94 47.64

O?Reilly Auto Parts 6 EA 8.69 52.14

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 6 EA No Bid

Line 35 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 10.25 61.5

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA 12.71 76.26

O?Reilly Auto Parts 6 EA 16.97 101.82

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 6 EA No Bid

Line 36 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 10 EA 5.39 53.9

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 10 EA 6.56 65.6

O?Reilly Auto Parts 10 EA 10.13 101.3

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 10 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 10 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 10 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 10 EA No Bid

Line 37 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 8 EA 7.66 61.28

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA 9.27 74.16

O?Reilly Auto Parts 8 EA 9.77 78.16

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid



Sewell Ford 8 EA No Bid

Line 38 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 2.88 17.28

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA 3.45 20.7

O?Reilly Auto Parts 6 EA 5.17 31.02

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 6 EA No Bid

Line 39 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 5 EA 35.72 178.6

O?Reilly Auto Parts 5 EA 40.73 203.65

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 5 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 5 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 5 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 5 EA No Bid

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. (Alt 1) 5 EA 34.33 171.65 FILTER IS EQUIVALENT TO RS4636

Line 40 Fuel Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 12 EA 7.43 89.16

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 12 EA 10.64 127.68

O?Reilly Auto Parts 12 EA 12.54 150.48

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 12 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 12 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 12 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 12 EA No Bid

Line 41 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 93 EA 5.29 491.97

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 93 EA 6.85 637.05

O?Reilly Auto Parts 93 EA 9.76 907.68

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 93 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 93 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 93 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 93 EA No Bid

Line 42 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 38 EA 10.2 387.6



B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 38 EA 14.46 549.48

O?Reilly Auto Parts 38 EA 18.94 719.72

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 38 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 38 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 38 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 38 EA No Bid

Line 43 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 7 EA 5.35 37.45

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 7 EA 6.5 45.5

O?Reilly Auto Parts 7 EA 7.79 54.53

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 7 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 7 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 7 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 7 EA No Bid

Line 44 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 42 EA 4.25 178.5

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 42 EA 5.14 215.88

O?Reilly Auto Parts 42 EA 7.57 317.94

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 42 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 42 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 42 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 42 EA No Bid

Line 45 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 7 EA 6.3 44.1

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 7 EA 7.41 51.87

O?Reilly Auto Parts 7 EA 9.45 66.15

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 7 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 7 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 7 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 7 EA No Bid

Line 46 Air Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 5 EA 7.17 35.85

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 5 EA 7.24 36.2

O?Reilly Auto Parts 5 EA 8.13 40.65

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 5 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 5 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 5 EA No Bid



Sewell Ford 5 EA No Bid

Line 47 Oil Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 8 EA 2.53 20.24

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA 3.06 24.48

O?Reilly Auto Parts 8 EA 3.72 29.76

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 8 EA No Bid

Line 48 Oil Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 23 EA 2.11 48.53

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 23 EA 2.82 64.86

O?Reilly Auto Parts 23 EA 3.38 77.74

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 23 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 23 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 23 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 23 EA No Bid

Line 49 Oil Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 10 EA 2.22 22.2

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 10 EA 2.71 27.1

O?Reilly Auto Parts 10 EA 3.9 39

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 10 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 10 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 10 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 10 EA No Bid

Line 50 Oil Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 24 EA 2.21 53.04

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 24 EA 2.82 67.68

O?Reilly Auto Parts 24 EA 3.49 83.76

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 24 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 24 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 24 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 24 EA No Bid

Line 51

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 66 EA 2.22 146.52



B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 66 EA 2.59 170.94

O?Reilly Auto Parts 66 EA 3.29 217.14

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 66 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 66 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 66 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 66 EA No Bid

Line 52 Oil Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 73 EA 3.07 224.11

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 73 EA 3.79 276.67

O?Reilly Auto Parts 73 EA 5.41 394.93

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 73 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 73 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 73 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 73 EA No Bid

Line 53 Oil Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 66 EA 5.08 335.28

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 66 EA 7.45 491.7

O?Reilly Auto Parts 66 EA 10.4 686.4

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 66 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 66 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 66 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 66 EA No Bid

Line 54 Oil Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 29 EA 9.5 275.5

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 29 EA 11.54 334.66

O?Reilly Auto Parts 29 EA 17.99 521.71

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 29 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 29 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 29 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 29 EA No Bid

Line 55 Oil Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 150 EA 5.66 849

O?Reilly Auto Parts 150 EA 6.7 1005

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 150 EA 7.38 1107

Sewell Ford 150 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 150 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 150 EA No Bid



hose products inc. 150 EA No Bid

Line 56 Oil Filters

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 20 EA 13.13 262.6

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 20 EA 20.1 402

O?Reilly Auto Parts 20 EA 25.55 511

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 20 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 20 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 20 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 20 EA No Bid

Line 57 Batteries

V--65-6

Cranking Amps CA1065/CCA850

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

O?Reilly Auto Parts 7 EA 76.9 538.3

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 7 EA 79.38 555.66

Sewell Ford 7 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 7 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 7 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 7 EA No Bid

Line 58 Batteries

Product # V75-6

CA775/CCA620

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

O?Reilly Auto Parts 5 EA 51.4 257

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 5 EA 74.98 374.9

Sewell Ford 5 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 5 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 5 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 5 EA No Bid

Line 59 Batteries

Prod. # V3478-7

Cranking Amps 

CA890/CCA710

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

O?Reilly Auto Parts 13 EA 59.61 774.93

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 13 EA 73.76 958.88

Sewell Ford 13 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 13 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 13 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 13 EA No Bid

Line 60 Batteries

Prod. # 31S-5

Cranking Amps

CA840?CC670

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

O?Reilly Auto Parts 77 EA 76.96 5925.92

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 77 EA 83.53 6431.81

Sewell Ford 77 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 77 EA No Bid



HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 77 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 77 EA No Bid

Line 61 Transmission Oil Cooler Hose-Bulk

3/8" x 25'

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 2 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 2 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 2 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 2 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 2 EA 43.09 86.18 Goodyear product



Line 62 Heater Hoses Bulk

1/2" x 50'

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

hose products inc. 4 EA 68 272

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 4 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 4 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 4 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 4 EA 23.39 93.56 Goodyear product



Line 63 Heater Hoses

5/8" x 50'

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

hose products inc. 4 EA 70 280

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 4 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 4 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 4 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 4 EA 24.34 97.36 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 64 Heater Hoses

3/4" x 50'

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

hose products inc. 4 EA 74 296

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 4 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 4 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 4 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 4 EA 28.63 114.52 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 65 Heater Hoses

1" x 50'

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

hose products inc. 6 EA 170.5 1023

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 6 EA 41.38 248.28 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 66 Brake Pads (light vehicles)  Accepted brands are Bendix-FM, Napa-SD, and Raybestos-SS/SD

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification



HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 6 EA No Bid

Line 67 Brake Pads (light vehicles)  Accepted brands are Bendix-FM, Napa-SD, and Raybestos-SS/SD

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 4 EA 43.49 173.96

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 4 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 4 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 4 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 4 EA No Bid

Line 68 Brake Pads (light vehicles)  Accepted brands are Bendix-FM, Napa-SD, and Raybestos-SS/SD

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 4 EA 76.48 305.92

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 4 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 4 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 4 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 4 EA No Bid

Line 69 Brake Pads (light vehicles)  Accepted brands are Bendix-FM, Napa-SD, and Raybestos-SS/SD

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 8 EA 76.49 611.92

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA No Bid

Line 70 Brake Pads (light vehicles)  Accepted brands are Bendix-FM, Napa-SD, and Raybestos-SS/SD

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 10 EA 43.41 434.1

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 10 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 10 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 10 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 10 EA No Bid

Line 71 Brake Pads (light vehicles)  Accepted brands are Bendix-FM, Napa-SD, and Raybestos-SS/SD

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 8 EA 35.61 284.88

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA No Bid



Line 72 Bulbs

Product #53

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 10 EA 0.28 2.8

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 10 EA 0.34 3.4

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 10 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 10 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 10 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 10 EA 0.25 2.5 G.E. Lighting product

www.gelighting.com

Line 73 Bulbs

Product #37

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 198 EA 0.25 49.5

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 198 EA 0.34 67.32

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 198 EA 0.37 73.26

hose products inc. 198 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 198 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 198 EA 0.35 69.3 G.E. Lighting product

www.gelighting.com

Line 74 Bulbs

Product #57

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 9 EA 0.25 2.25

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 9 EA 0.31 2.79

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 9 EA 0.31 2.79

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 9 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 9 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 9 EA 0.18 1.62 G.E. Lighting product

www.gelighting.com

Line 75 Bulbs

Product #67

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA 0.29 1.74

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 0.32 1.92

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA 0.33 1.98

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 6 EA 0.32 1.92 G.E. Lighting product

www.gelighting.com

Line 76 Bulbs

Product #89

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 12 EA 0.31 3.72

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 12 EA 0.34 4.08

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 12 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 12 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 12 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 12 EA 0.33 3.96 G.E. Lighting product

www.gelighting.com



Line 77 Bulbs

Product #93

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 8 EA 0.31 2.48

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA 0.37 2.96

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA 0.51 4.08

Sewell Ford 8 EA 0.64 5.12

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

Line 78 Bulbs

Product #194

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 218 EA 0.19 41.42

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 218 EA 0.21 45.78

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 218 EA 0.29 63.22

hose products inc. 218 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 218 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 218 EA 0.19 41.42 G.E. Lighting product

www.gelighting.com

Line 79 Bulbs

Product #1076

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 22 EA 0.32 7.04

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 22 EA 0.74 16.28

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 22 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 22 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 22 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 22 EA 0.91 20.02 G.E. Lighting product

www.gelighting.com

Line 80 Bulbs

Product #1156

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 28 EA 0.31 8.68

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 28 EA 0.33 9.24

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 28 EA 0.38 10.64

hose products inc. 28 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 28 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 28 EA 0.33 9.24 G.E. Lighting product

www.gelighting.com

Line 81 Bulbs

Product #1157

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 179 EA 0.18 32.22

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 179 EA 0.21 37.59

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 179 EA 0.27 48.33

hose products inc. 179 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 179 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 179 EA 0.24 42.96 G.E. Lighting product

www.gelighting.com



Line 82 Bulbs

Product #1816

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 21 EA 0.3 6.3

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 21 EA 0.35 7.35

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 21 EA 0.38 7.98

hose products inc. 21 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 21 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 21 EA 0.35 7.35 G.E. Lighting product

www.gelighting.com

Line 83 Bulbs

Product #3157

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 32 EA 0.51 16.32

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 32 EA 0.55 17.6

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 32 EA 0.78 24.96

hose products inc. 32 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 32 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 32 EA 0.5 16 G.E. Lighting product

www.gelighting.com

Line 84 Hose Clamps

MINI

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 40 EA 0.3 12

hose products inc. 40 EA 0.6 24

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 40 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 40 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 40 EA No Bid

Line 85 Hose Clamps

#6

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 36 EA 0.35 12.6

hose products inc. 36 EA 0.79 28.44

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 36 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 36 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 36 EA 0.51 18.36 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 86 Hose Clamps

#10

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 52 EA 0.35 18.2

hose products inc. 52 EA 0.75 39

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 52 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 52 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 52 EA 0.86 44.72 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 87 Hose Clamps

#12

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification



B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 88 EA 0.35 30.8

hose products inc. 88 EA 0.83 73.04

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 88 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 88 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 88 EA 0.52 45.76 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 88 Hose Clamps

#16

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 66 EA 0.35 23.1

hose products inc. 66 EA 0.82 54.12

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 66 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 66 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 66 EA 0.87 57.42 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 89 Hose Clamps

#20

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 70 EA 0.35 24.5

hose products inc. 70 EA 0.83 58.1

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 70 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 70 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 70 EA 0.87 60.9 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 90 Hose Clamps

#24

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 34 EA 0.35 11.9

hose products inc. 34 EA 0.82 27.88

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 34 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 34 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 34 EA 0.87 29.58 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 91 Hose Clamps

#28

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 16 EA 0.35 5.6

hose products inc. 16 EA 0.78 12.48

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 16 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 16 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 16 EA 0.88 14.08 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 92 Hose Clamps

#32

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 18 EA 0.35 6.3

hose products inc. 18 EA 0.78 14.04

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 18 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 18 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 18 EA 0.88 15.84 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com



Line 93 Hose Clamps

#36

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 12 EA 0.35 4.2

hose products inc. 12 EA 0.86 10.32

Sewell Ford 12 EA 0.9 10.8

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 12 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 12 EA No Bid

Line 94 Hose Clamps

#40

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 12 EA 0.61 7.32

hose products inc. 12 EA 1.08 12.96

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 12 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 12 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 12 EA 1.09 13.08 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 95 Hose Clamps

#48

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 14 EA 0.64 8.96

hose products inc. 14 EA 1.23 17.22

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 14 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 14 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 14 EA 1.17 16.38 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 96 Flasher

#552

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Heavy Vehicle Parts, Inc. 50 EA 1.79 89.5

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 50 EA 3.25 162.5

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 50 EA 4.69 234.5

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 50 EA 7.97 398.5

hose products inc. 50 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 50 EA 4.02 201 Truck-Lite product

www.truck-lite.com

Line 97 Flasher

#44810 Grote

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 50 EA 6.19 309.5

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 50 EA 7.45 372.5

Heavy Vehicle Parts, Inc. 50 EA 7.99 399.5

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 50 EA 9.06 453

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 50 EA 10.6 530

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 50 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 50 EA No Bid

Line 98 Relay - 70-AC-5

ACRelay 30/40 AMP



Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Heavy Vehicle Parts, Inc. 70 EA 4.15 290.5

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 70 EA 4.31 301.7

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 70 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 70 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 70 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 70 EA No Bid

Line 99 Head Lamps

Product #6052

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 18 EA 4.55 81.9

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 18 EA 4.58 82.44

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 18 EA 7.49 134.82

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 18 EA 11.75 211.5

hose products inc. 18 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 18 EA 4.75 85.5 GE Product

www.gelighting.com

Line 100 Head Lamps

Product #H6054

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 160 EA 5.15 824

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 160 EA 8.31 1329.6

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 160 EA 10.37 1659.2

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 160 EA 13.75 2200

hose products inc. 160 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 160 EA 6.14 982.4 GE Product

www.gelighting.com

Line 101 Head Lamps

Product #H4656

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 20 EA 3.55 71

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 20 EA 5.19 103.8

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 20 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 20 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 20 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 20 EA 4.16 83.2 GE Product

www.gelighting.com

Line 102 Head Lamps

Product #9007 Bulb

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 20 EA 2.21 44.2

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 20 EA 5.76 115.2

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 20 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 20 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 20 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 20 EA 5.12 102.4 GE Product

www.gelighting.com

Line 103 Compressor Filters

Product #CA329



Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 2.11 12.66

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA 2.42 14.52

Sewell Ford 6 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Line 104 Compressor Filters

Product #PA2256

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 10 EA 7 70

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 10 EA 8.7 87

Sewell Ford 10 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 10 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 10 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 10 EA No Bid

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. (Alt 1)10 EA 7 70 FILTER IS EQUIVALENT TO PA2256

Line 105 Transmission Filters

Product#  FT1034FP

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 33 EA 8.79 290.07

Sewell Ford 33 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 33 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 33 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 33 EA No Bid

Line 106 Transmission Filters

Product#  FT1051AFP

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 12 EA 18.25 219

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 12 EA 25.71 308.52

Sewell Ford 12 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 12 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 12 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 12 EA No Bid

Line 107 Transmission Filters

Product#  19739

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 12 EA 18.25 219

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 12 EA 29.81 357.72

Sewell Ford 12 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 12 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 12 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 12 EA No Bid

Line 108 Transmission Spin-on Filters

BT8460



Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 28 EA 7.5 210

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 28 EA 8.98 251.44

Sewell Ford 28 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 28 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 28 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 28 EA No Bid

Line 109 Transmission Spin-on Filters

P1653A

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 51 EA 3.33 169.83

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 51 EA 3.58 182.58

Sewell Ford 51 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 51 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 51 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 51 EA No Bid

Line 110 Transmission Spin-on Filters

PH3519A

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 30 EA 2.81 84.3

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 30 EA 3.15 94.5

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 30 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 30 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 30 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 30 EA No Bid

Line 111 Wiper Blades

U-16R

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 8 EA 3.55 28.4

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA 3.99 31.92

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 8 EA 3.77 30.16 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com



Line 112 Wiper Blades

1118

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 16 EA 3.76 60.16

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 16 EA 4.32 69.12

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 16 EA 7.68 122.88

hose products inc. 16 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 16 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 16 EA 3.98 63.68 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com



Line 113 Wiper Blades

N-18R



Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 12 EA 3.39 40.68

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 12 EA 3.8 45.6

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 12 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 12 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 12 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 12 EA 3.7 44.4 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com



Line 114 Wiper Blades

51-18

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 20 EA 3.9 78

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 20 EA 4.55 91

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 20 EA 7.55 151

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 20 EA 7.64 152.8

hose products inc. 20 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 20 EA 4.69 93.8 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com



Line 115 Wiper Blades

31-18

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 23 EA 3.57 82.11

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 23 EA 4.53 104.19

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 23 EA 7.93 182.39

hose products inc. 23 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 23 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 23 EA 4.18 96.14 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com



Line 116 Wiper Blades

U-19R

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 8 EA 3.55 28.4

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA 3.99 31.92

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 8 EA 4.04 32.32 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com



Line 117 Wiper Blades

N-20R

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 12 EA 3.55 42.6

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 12 EA 3.99 47.88

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 12 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 12 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 12 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 12 EA 3.76 45.12 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com



Line 118 Wiper Blades

U-20R



Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 8 EA 3.57 28.56

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA 4.04 32.32

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 8 EA 3.77 30.16 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com



Line 119 Wiper Blades

U-22R

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 10 EA 3.57 35.7

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 10 EA 4.04 40.4

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 10 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 10 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 10 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 10 EA 3.82 38.2 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com



Line 120 Wiper Blades

31-20

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 16 EA 4.43 70.88

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 16 EA 5.56 88.96

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 16 EA 10.02 160.32

hose products inc. 16 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 16 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 16 EA 5.13 82.08 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com



Line 121 Wiper Blades

W-22R

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 24 EA 3.55 85.2

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 24 EA 3.71 89.04

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 24 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 24 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 24 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 24 EA 3.93 94.32 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com

Line 122 Wiper Blades

53-18

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 8 EA 3.33 26.64

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA 3.71 29.68

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 8 EA 4.49 35.92 ANCO wiper blade refills

www.federalmogul.com

Line 123 Alternators

Product must be new; not reconditioned

Product # 10459472



Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 5 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 5 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 5 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 5 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 5 EA 133.58 667.9 replacement for 10459472 alternator

Line 124 Alternators

Product must be new; not reconditioned

Product # 4870JB

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 5 EA 956.25 4781.25

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 5 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 5 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 5 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 5 EA 935 4675 Leece-Neville product

www.linkmfg.com

Line 125 Alternators

Product must be new; not reconditioned

Product # A0014947PA

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 5 EA 956.25 4781.25

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 5 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 5 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 5 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 5 EA 935 4675 Leece-Neville product

www.linkmfg.com

Line 126 Power Steering Filters

Product #P8044

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 5 EA 5.61 28.05

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 5 EA 6.87 34.35

Sewell Ford 5 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 5 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 5 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 5 EA No Bid

Line 127 Power Steering Filters

Product #HF6162

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 5 EA 5.29 26.45

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 5 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 5 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 5 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 5 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 5 EA 4.2 21 baldwin # p106hd oil filter

Line 128 Power Steering Filters

Product #16955284

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid



Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 1 EA No Bid

Line 129 Power Steering Filters

Product #57133

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 1 EA 11.11 11.11

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford 1 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 1 EA 13.45 13.45 baldwin # pt8407

Line 130 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 5 EA 7.11 35.55

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 5 EA 7.82 39.1

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 5 EA 8.1 40.5

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 5 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 5 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 5 EA No Bid

Line 131 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 5 EA 6.91 34.55

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 5 EA 7.99 39.95

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 5 EA 8.41 42.05

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 5 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 5 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 5 EA No Bid

Line 132 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 10.05 60.3

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 6 EA 9.63 57.78 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 6 EA 10.4 62.4 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 133 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 8 EA 6 48

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid



hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 8 EA 10.01 80.08 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 8 EA 10.82 86.56 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 134 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 10.86 65.16

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 6 EA 9.96 59.76 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 6 EA 10.84 65.04 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 135 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 4 EA 14.44 57.76

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 4 EA 17.85 71.4

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 4 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 4 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 4 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 4 EA 13.99 55.96 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 136 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 8 EA 14.33 114.64

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 8 EA 16.26 130.08

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 8 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 8 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 8 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 8 EA 14.76 118.08 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 137 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 4 EA 14.95 59.8

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 4 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 4 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 4 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 4 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 4 EA 15.4 61.6 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

Line 138 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 20 EA 15.05 301

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 20 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 20 EA 0 0



HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 20 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 20 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 20 EA 9.22 184.4 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 20 EA 17.93 358.6 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 139 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 2 EA 16.5 33

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 2 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 2 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 2 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 2 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 2 EA 18.47 36.94 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 2 EA 23.34 46.68 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 140 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 2 EA 23.83 47.66

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 2 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 2 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 2 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 2 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 2 EA 27.04 54.08 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 2 EA 31.21 62.42 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 141 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 2 EA 18.11 36.22

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 2 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 2 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 2 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 2 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 2 EA 12.41 24.82 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 2 EA 28.74 57.48 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 142 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 2 EA 17.17 34.34

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 2 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 2 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 2 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 2 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 2 EA 17.22 34.44 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 2 EA 19.76 39.52 DAYCO FAN BELT



Line 143 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 28 168

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 6 EA 28.61 171.66 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 6 EA 31.49 188.94 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 144 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 11.8 70.8

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 6 EA 27.92 167.52 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 6 EA 32.21 193.26 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 145 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 4 EA 14.13 56.52

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 4 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 4 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 4 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 4 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 4 EA 30.78 123.12 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 4 EA 34.6 138.4 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 146 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 24 144

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 6 EA 24.45 146.7 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 6 EA 25.07 150.42 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 147 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 20 EA 12 240

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 20 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 20 EA No Bid



hose products inc. 20 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 20 EA 24.09 481.8 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 20 EA 28.73 574.6 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 148 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 3 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 3 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 3 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 3 EA 0 0

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 3 EA 22.76 68.28 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 3 EA 27.52 82.56 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 149 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 12.66 75.96

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 6 EA 17.31 103.86 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 6 EA 18.72 112.32 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 150 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 15.91 95.46

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 6 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 6 EA 18.28 109.68 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 6 EA 18.76 112.56 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 151 Belts

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 6 EA 11 66

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 6 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 6 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 6 EA No Bid

Sewell Ford (Alt 1) 6 EA 11.68 70.08 Goodyear product

www.goodyearep.com

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. (Alt 1) 6 EA 13.02 78.12 DAYCO FAN BELT

Line 152 Catalog discount for Adhesives

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA 35 35

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25



Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA 20 20

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 0 0

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Line 153 Catalog discount for Alarms

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA 35 35

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA 20 20

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 0 0

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Line 154 Catalog discount for Alternators (New)

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA No Bid

Line 155 Catalog discount for Alternators (Rebuilt)

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Line 156 Catalog discount for Cleaners

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA No Bid

Line 157 Catalog discount for Engine/Transmission

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 1 EA 10 10

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Line 158 Catalog discount for Filters by Application



Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc. 1 EA 52.5 52.5

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA 15 15

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Line 159 Catalog discount for Fuses

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 30 30

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA 15 15

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Line 160 Catalog discount for Lubricants and Fluids

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA No Bid

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Line 161 Catalog discount for Small Parts

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA 35 35

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA 15 15

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 0 0

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Line 162 Catalog discount for Plugs

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA 20 20

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 15 15

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Line 163 Catalog discount for Test Kits

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid



hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA No Bid

Line 164 Catalog discount for Tools

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA 15 15

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA 0 0

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid

Line 165 Catalog discount for Valves

Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification

Sewell Ford 1 EA 25 25

Buck?s Wheel & Equipment Co. 1 EA 15 15

B-Line Filter and Supply Inc. 1 EA No Bid

HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS INC. 1 EA No Bid

hose products inc. 1 EA No Bid


