Ector County Independent School District
Bid #11-17

Classroom Technology Related Equipment
8/9/2011 2:00:00 PM Central

Line Items
Projector - 3000 Lumens

ANSI-SVGA 800 X 600
Linel In Focus IN2112 Resolution
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification
Abacus Computers Inc.* 1 EA $427.88
Y&S Technologies 1 EA $434.88
CDWG 1 EA $449.00
PC Mall Gov, Inc. 1 EA $464.00
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc 1 EA $474.45
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $478.49
Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. 1 EA $495.62
Logical Choice Technologies, Inc. 1 EA $505.00
Valiant IMC 1 EA $507.00
Lubbock Audio Visual, Inc. 1 EA $547.06
CommercialElectronic Supply 1 EA No Bid

Universal for Projector Ceiling
InFocus MountQ

Line 2 Projector
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification
Valiant IMCA 1 EA $84.87
Abacus Computers Inc.* 1 EA $90.50
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc 1 EA $103.61
PC Mall Gov, Inc. 1 EA $104.00
Y&S Technologies 1 EA $108.00
CDWG 1 EA $108.00
Logical Choice Technologies, Inc. 1 EA $110.00
Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. 1 EA $110.15
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $129.82
Lubbock Audio Visual, Inc. 1 EA $141.79
CommercialElectronic Supply 1 EA No Bid



Document Camerall
O
Must be compatible with
SMART Technologies

Line 3 AVerVision CP155 white boards.
Name OTY UOM  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification
Abacus Computers Inc.* 1 EA $432.88
CDWG 1 EA $445.00
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc 1 EA $459.26
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $469.79
PC Mall Gov, Inc. 1 EA $474.00
Y&S Technologies 1 EA $475.00
Logical Choice Technologies, Inc. 1 EA $475.00
Valiant IMC 1 EA $482.48
Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. 1 EA $492.22
Lubbock Audio Visual, Inc. 1 EA $591.01
CommercialElectronic Supply 1 EA No Bid

SP-LAMP- REPLACEMENT LAMP
Line 4 InFocus 057 for InFocus IN2112
Name OTY UOM  Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification
Abacus Computers Inc.* 10 EA $138.00
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc 10 EA $151.76
PC Mall Gov, Inc. 10 EA $154.00
CDWG 10 EA $155.00
Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. 10 EA $156.99
Y&S Technologies 10 EA $158.00
Logical Choice Technologies, Inc. 10 EA $158.00
Valiant IMC 10 EA $164.60
Checkpoint Services, Inc 10 EA $169.99
Lubbock Audio Visual, Inc. 10 EA $187.06
CommercialElectronic Supply 10 EA No Bid

Pro Digital PD- Teacher Amplifier

Line5 Front Row IR System
Name OTY UOM  Unit Price Mfar MfaNo Alternate Specification




Abacus Computers Inc.*

Logical Choice Technologies, Inc.
Checkpoint Services, Inc

Y&S Technologies

Lubbock Audio Visual, Inc.
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc
PC Mall Gov, Inc.
CommercialElectronic Supply
Valiant IMC

CDWG

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc.

*Awarded Vendor
Did not meet specification
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$863.00
$1,007.00
$1,029.99
$1,088.00
No Bid
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