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PROPOSED REVISIONS 

(See page 2) 
All personnel are employed subject to assignment and reassign-
ment by the Superintendent or designee when the Superintendent 
determines that the assignment or reassignment is in the best in-
terest of the District. Reassignment shall be defined as a transfer 
to another position, department, or facility that does not necessitate 
a change in the employment contract of a contract employee. Any 
change in an employee’s contract shall be in accordance with pol-
icy DC. 

Assignment and transfer of professional staff members to positions 
in various District schools, divisions, or departments shall be a joint 
effort by administrators and shall be consistent with District-ap-
proved personnel actions. [See BQ series and DK(LEGAL)] 

When possible, without violating contract obligations or policy pro-
visions, the principal or department supervisor shall have input into 
the selection and placement of personnel. Assignments shall be 
made to budgeted or approved positions only. If a vacancy exists 
for which an employee returning from leave is qualified, the em-
ployee returning shall have priority in being assigned to the va-
cancy on the campus or department where last assigned. 

No person shall be assigned to a campus or department where a 
member of his or her own family who is related by blood (consan-
guinity) within the third degree or by marriage (affinity) within the 
second degree serves as an administrator. [See DBE(EXHIBIT)] 
Adopted or foster relationships shall be treated as natural relation-
ships. For the purposes of this policy, the term “administrator” shall 
not mean counselor, librarian, or coordinator. 

The campus principal or department supervisor shall be responsi-
ble for the assignment and reassignment of all personnel to the 
specific grade, subject area, or position for which the employee is 
qualified in his or her area of certification or skill level within the 
campus or department. Requests from employees for changes in 
assignment at the campus or department shall be submitted in writ-
ing to the principal or department supervisor. 

The primary reason for transfers shall be for improvement of the 
District’s instructional programs. Generally, an employee shall be 
considered eligible for transfer only after he or she has been as-
signed to a campus for three or more years; however, the Superin-
tendent may approve an employee transfer request sooner if it is 
made on the basis of an extreme hardship. For purposes of this 

Superintendent’s 
Authority 

Supervision of 
Relatives Prohibited 

Reassignment 
Within Campus or 
Department 

Transfer 



United ISD  
240903  
  
ASSIGNMENT AND SCHEDULES DK 
 (LOCAL)  

  2 of 5 
  
DK(LOCAL)-X   

policy, extreme hardship may include, but not be limited to, physi-
cal or personal circumstances that necessitate transfer to another 
campus. 

The Superintendent shall consider District needs and campus de-
mographics in establishing an allowable maximum percentage of 
transfers per campus. 

Principals shall submit recommendations to the District human re-
sources department concerning personnel assignments at their re-
spective schools. 

All personnel may request a transfer to another employment posi-
tion within the District. Individuals electing to seek assignments to 
other campuses, positions, locations, and the like shall complete 
the District transfer form, which shall be submitted to the campus 
administrator or department supervisor and then to the human re-
sources department. The human resources department shall coor-
dinate the transfer with the appropriate administrator. A transfer 
shall not be made during the school year except in unusual or ex-
ceptional cases, as approved by the Superintendent. The Superin-
tendent shall make the final decision on all transfer requests and 
shall consider the District’s needs and campus demographics in 
establishing the maximum allowable percentage of transfers. The 
Superintendent shall consider the following factors in approving or 
declining a transfer in the following order: 

1. Identified needs of District campuses, departments, special 
assignments, and/or staffing-management committee recom-
mendations. 

2. Analysis of the number of transfer requests. 

3. Date of hire. 

4. Employee certification. 

5. Years of experience in the District. 

6. Years of experience at the present campus. 

7. Years of experience at the present grade or assignment. 

During the spring semester, a designated date shall be announced, 
and the appropriate administrator associate superintendent of sup-
port services shall furnish the Superintendent with a projection of 
estimated student enrollment for the next school year, as well as a 
projection of staff needs. 
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The factors to be considered in the reassignment of professional 
and paraprofessional staff members shall be in the following order: 

1. Identified needs of District campuses, departments, special 
assignments, and/or staffing-management committee recom-
mendations. 

2. Analysis of transfer volunteer requests. 

3. Date of hire. 

4. Employee certification. 

5. Years of experience in the District. 

6. Years of experience at the present campus. 

7. Years of experience at the present grade or assignment. 

Personnel may be reassigned at any time in the best interest of the 
District as determined by the Superintendent. 

Shifts in student population, the opening of a new school, and/or 
budgetary necessity may cause decreases or reductions in person-
nel allocations or reassignment of personnel from a campus or de-
partment. The human resources department shall be responsible 
for determining the individuals who shall be reassigned with the ap-
proval of the Superintendent. 

Procedures to be followed by the principal in approving staff as-
signments are: 

1. Identify the campus personnel needs; 

2. Notify the human resources department of campus needs; 

3. Select qualified applicants from the pool of pre-screened ap-
plicants (i.e., those who have been screened and have met all 
requirements) provided by the human resources department; 

4. Schedule and conduct interviews; and 

5. Notify the human resources department in writing of his or her 
choice of applicants. 

Noncontractual supplemental duties for which supplemental pay is 
received may be discontinued by either party at any time. An em-
ployee who wishes to relinquish a paid supplemental duty may do 
so by notifying the Superintendent or designee in writing. Paid sup-
plemental duties are not part of the District’s contractual obligation 
to the employee, and an employee shall hold no expectation of 
continuing assignment to any paid supplemental duty. 
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Subject to the Board-adopted budget and compensation plan and 
in harmony with employment contracts, the Superintendent shall 
determine required work calendars for all employees. [See DC, EB] 

Daily time schedules for all employees shall be determined by the 
Superintendent or designee and principals. 

Employees are expected to arrive at work at the time designated 
by their supervisors. Unexcused or excessive tardiness may result 
in disciplinary action, including termination of employment. 

Full-time employees shall render service in accordance with the 
following provisions: 

1. Beginning and ending work dates for each employee category 
shall be designated in the official salary notice. 

2. Leave such as for personal illness, illness in the family, death 
in the family, and personal business shall be considered as 
leave with pay, as stipulated in DEC(LOCAL). 

3. Holiday schedules for various employment periods shall be is-
sued by the Superintendent. 

4. A pay rate for each employee’s workday shall be calculated 
from the annual pay scale. 

5. Unless approved by the Superintendent or in emergency situ-
ations, employees shall work only the total number of days 
provided in the funding source for the position. 

In cases of emergency, or when schools must close, the Superin-
tendent is authorized to modify the above provisions within the 
constraints of the law. 

Teachers shall be on duty at least seven hours and 45 minutes 
each day as determined by the school principal. A principal may re-
quire additional duty time for in-service training, staff meetings, 
and/or “parent/teacher nights” with as much notice as possible to 
the teachers, unless urgent circumstances arise that demand im-
mediate attention. 

Paraprofessional and auxiliary/classified personnel, with the excep-
tion of transportation and department of safety personnel, shall be 
on duty seven to eight hours each day, as determined by their indi-
vidual job assignments and by the principal or department supervi-
sor. 

All other professional and support personnel shall be on duty a 
minimum of eight hours each day. Additional duty time shall be ex-
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pected when necessary to accomplish individual jobs in a satisfac-
tory and professional manner, as determined by the principal or de-
partment supervisor. 

For purposes of guidance, the following minimums are suggested: 

1. Employees on Administrative/Professional Scale (pay grades 
1-11) — at least 40 hours per week. 

2. Employees on Teacher Job Scale (teachers and nurses) — at 
least seven hours and 45 minutes per day. 

3. Paraprofessional Employees — seven to eight hours per day, 
depending on position, with a weekly range of 35-40 hours. 

4. Auxiliary/Classified Employees — six to eight hours per day, 
depending on position, with a weekly range of 30-40 hours. 

Appeals shall be made in accordance with DGBA(LOCAL). Appeals 
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