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(A)

(B)

©

(D)

BOARD OF TRUSTEES

AGENDA

Workshop Regular

Special

Report Only

Presenter(s):

Recognition

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE

LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED
PROPOSAL NO. 140508 FOR CAFETERIA FOOD AND SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE
SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding

this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DiISTRICT

Hlsked frv Tccellense

To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Assistant Superintendent for Business and Finance
From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director

Date: Tuesday, June 24, 2014

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 140508 for Cafeteria

Food and Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal Number 140508 for Cafeteria Food and Supplies be awarded in
accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the
attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 EipsoN Roap @  Eacre Pass, Texas 78852 @  TeL (830) 773-518]1 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

F-280

An EquaL OrrorruniTY EMPLOYER



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140508 - CAFETERIA FOOD AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
Htem No. Description Estimated | gy e kemH EAGLE GuLFcoasT | WABATTFOOD | yirepapaper | NoLANS EHLLIES ScHoOL REEA0D. BAREWAY, wiecs
Quantity GROCERY SERVICE DISTRIBUTION PRODUCTS SERVICE SUPPLY SUPPLY
CATEGORY: PAPER GOODS
PAP|18 |Aprons; White; Dishwasher; 36" x 45"; 100 CT.; 30 NO BID S 6.89 NO BID $ 6.35 [ § 12.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PAP|30 [Bowl; Styrofoam; 12 Oz.; 1,000 Ct.; 25§ 1871 [ § 39.75 NO BID 5 20.00 21.57 NO BID $ 21.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 19.99
PAP|50 [Cups: Cold; Styrofoam; 8 Oz.; 1,000 Ct; 20 (% 17.26 | § 17.71 NO BID 5 17.36 18.93 [ § 1911 § 16.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 17.00
PAP|53 |Cups: Lid; Sip-Thru; 8 Oz.; 1,000 Ct.; 20 13.72 NO BID NO BID 5 14.18 15.00 NO BID g 14.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID ] 13.00
PAP|55 |Cups: Lid; Vented; 8 Oz.; 1,000 Ct.; 10][$ 1026 [ § 10.75 NO BID 3 10618 11.25 NO BID E 1124 NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.20
PAP|60 |Cups: Cold; Styrofoam; 12 Oz.; 1,000 Ct.; 275 | § 2791 [§ 25.11 NO BID 5 2353 [ § 26.84 [ § 2711 § 23.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.00
PAP|63 |Cups: Lid; Sip-Thru; 12 Oz.; 1,000 Ct.; 10 19.09 [ § 14.38 NO BID 16.84 [ § 17.87 NO BID E 17.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 13.89
PAP|65 d; Vented; 120z.; 1,000 Ct.; B 10§ 1478 |$ 1363 NO BID $§ 1376 $ 26.84 'NO BID 3 14.24 NOBID NO BID NOBID 13.89
PAP|70 ys: 11b.; 1,000 Ct.; 24§ 21.00 | § 18.50 NO BID 3 1791 | § 26.53 NO BID $ 17.66 NO BID S 18.10 NO BID $ 20.25
PAP [100 |Napkins; 13 x 13; Disp ;10,000 CT; 40 $ 40.06 NO BID NO BID E 2840 $ 40.63 NO BID $ 32.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 35.00
PAP[110 |Napkins; 13 x 17; Dispenser; 6,000 CT.; 50| $ 41.06 NO BID NO BID S 3594 | $ 47.05 NO BID $ 40.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID 42.00
PAP|[130 |Oval Platters; Styrofoam; 7 x 9; 500 CT.; 50 NOC BID NO BID NO BID 3427 | § 36.63 NO BID 5 32.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID 24.50
PAP|150 |Souffle Cups: 2 Oz;; 5,000 CT.; 50| S 66.53 NO BID NO BID 23.36 | $ 35.50 NO BID 5 45.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID 46.00
PAP|155 |Souffle Cups: 1 Oz.; 5,000 CT.; 50§ 48.11 NO BID NO BID 44.26 | § 65.28 NO BID 5 36.46 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 37.00
PAP|160 |Tissue Menu: 12 x 12; 10/1,000 CT.; 25§ 80.11 59.14 NO BID E 75.41 | 3 94.50 NO BID 52.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 58.00
PAP[170 |Tray: Hinged Lid; 9 3/16 x 6 1/2 x 2 7/8; 50 NO BID 15.67 NO BID 14.53 | § 22.45 NO BID 15.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 17.75
PAP|180 |Tray: Hinged Lid; 9 x 9 x 3; Styrofoam; 300 NO BID 16.13 NO BID 14.41 [ § 24.51 NO BID 14.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 14.85
PAP|195 |Tray: Hinged Lid; 8 x 8 x 3; Clear Plaslic; 600 | § 48.30 [ § 59.00 NO BID 32.00 | § 47.12 NO BID $ 48.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID 35.15
PAP|198 |Portion Cups: 2 Oz.; Plastic; 2,500 CT.; 50§ 30.56 NO BID NO BID 23.36 | § 34.19 NO BID 3 24.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 26.32
PAP[199 |Portion Cups: Lids; 2 Oz.; Plastic; 2,500 CT.; 50 32.37 NO BID NO BID 20.56 | $ 31.49 NO BID S 24.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 30.04
PAP|200 |Portion Cups; 4 Oz.; Plastic; 2,500 CT.; 100 [ § 2548 | § 57.40 NO BID 4065 [ § 60.40 NO BID 3 40.83 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 42.64
PAP[202 |Portion Cups: Lids; 4 Oz.; Plastic; 2,400 CT.; 50 23.61 NO BID NO BID S 3993 [§ 46.25 NO BID $ 37.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID 42.64
PAP|203 |Portion Cups: 8 Oz.; Plastic; 500 CT., 1,700 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 36.81 NO BID NO BID $ 25.91 NO BID NO BID $ 3000 | § 27.75
PAP[204 |Portion Cups: Lids; 8 Oz.; Plastic; 500 CT.; 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID § 46.76 NO BID NO BID $ 16.89 NO BID NO BID $ 2350 [ § 17.48
PAP|205 |Chlorine Texas Paper Strips 70§ 2.84 NO BID NO BID S 231 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PAP[206 |Bowl: Container Syrofoam, 8 0z/1000ct 1,000 [ § 3172 [ § 32.46 NO BID $ 2824 [ § 34.79 NO BID $ 20.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 31.99
PAP|207 |Bowl: Container Lid, Translucent, No Vent 1,000 | § 3812 | § 18.85 NO BID $ 19.05 NO BID NO BID $ 19.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 22.00
CATEGORY: FROZEN FOODS - NON-ENTREE
FRZ|03 _|Frozen: Blueberies; 75§ 64.94 NO BID NO BID § 53.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|05 |Frozen: Broccoli Florets; 12/2.5 Ib.; 1,500 | § 30.68 NO BID NO BID $ 21.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ[10 |Frozen: Cakes: Pre-cut; 4/9" Round; 40 | § 4547 NO BID NO BID $ 49.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ[20 |Frozen: Eggs; 6/5; Papetli's or Equal. 1,000 | § 41.70 NO BID NO BID $ 33.49 NO BID NO BID $ 36.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ[21 |Frozen: Egg Patties; 300/1.250z. ; Grilled; 1,000 [§ 32.42 NO BID NO BID $ 36.34 NO BID NO BID $ 40.71 NC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|22 | oo OEEsOIET Oy THOS orous wverroane 25 36.12 NO BID NO BID $ 2325 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|26 |Frozen: Wedge Fries; 6/5 Ib.; Sweet Potato; 75§ 29.49 NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|27 _|Frozen: Hash Brown; 6/5 Ib.; Oven Bake Only; 25| § 39.54 NO BID NO BID : 2175 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|31 |Frozen: Green Peas; 20-30 Ib.; 100 | § 18.72 NO BID NO BID 3 17.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|32 |Frozen: Grean Beans; 20-30 Ib.; 100 [ § 17.72 NO BID NO BID E 16.41 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|33 |Frozen: Cor Ib.; Garden Fresh or Equal. 100 | § 16.83 NO BID NOBID [§ 15.41 NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
FRZ|34 |Frozen: Carrots; Diced; 20-30 Ib.; 100 | § 15.50 NO BID NO BID 15.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ[39 |Frozen: Pancakes; Whole Grain; 144/1.2 Oz.; 500 | § 17.20 NO BID NO BID 3 16.83 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|41 |Frozen: Pancakes; Mini Whole Grain; 72/8 CT.; 1,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 31.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|42 |Frozen: Pancakes; Mini Whole Grain; 72/8 CT.; 1,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 31.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|44 |Frozen: French Toast; Mini Whole Grain 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 29.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|53 |Frozen: Sweet Potato; Tater Gem; 6/2.5 Ib; 200 | § 27.21 NO BID NO BID 19.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|55 |Frozen: Tater Tots; 6/5 Ib.; 1,000 NO BID NC BID NO BID S 18.22 NO BID NO BID 5 21.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|57 |Frozen: Strawberries; Sliced; 200 | § 60.11 NO BID NO BID $ 46.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ[59 |Frozen: Waffles; Whole Grain; 144/1.2 Oz.; 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 21.77 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRZ|60 |Frozen: Sweet Potatoes, Flame-Roasted 6/2.5 Ib 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 32.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider. TABULATION SHEET PAGE 1 OF 8



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140508 - CAFETERIA FOOD AND SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

Estl D PHILLIPS RYHAMID RC FOOD SAFEWAY vicco
theen N Devctipion nmw BEN EXKEIH Ay HLGCOAET %’é‘? B BAR i SRR NOE AN DisTRIBUTION | SCHOOL SERVICE SUPPLY SUPPLY
CATEGORY: MISCELLANEOUS FOOD ITEMS
MIS|05 [Cheese Sauce; For Nachos: 6/10 Ib.; 600 | § 3323 § 31.99 NO BID 31.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS|10 |Chicken Broth: Canned; 12/49 Oz.; Clear; 30|58 26.84 NO BID NO BID 25.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 28.80
MIS[15 |Coconut: Snow Flake; 5/2 Ib.; Fancy; 25§ 26.24 NO BID NO BID E 22.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 23.00 NO BID NO BID
MIS|20 |Croutons: Plain; Homestyle; Whole Grain; 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 27.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 16.00 NO BID NO BID
MIS|25 |Gelatin: Cherry; 12/24 oz.; 50 | § 27.24 NO BID NO BID ] 2272 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS|60 |Gelatin: Raspbermy; 12/24 oz.; 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID E 22.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS|65 |Gelatin: Strawberry; 12/24 oz.; 50 | § 2517 NO BID NO BID E 2272 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS|115 |Raisins: Seedless; 30 Ib.; 30§ 46.84 NO BID NO BID 3 46.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 44.00 NO BID NO BID
__MIS|125 |Topping: Ready to Whip; 12/32 Oz.; _ 80§ 43.06 NO BID NO BID 3 42.08 NOBID | NOBID | NOBD | NOBID | NOBID | | NOBID | NOBID
MIS|130 |Yogurt: Cups; Strawberry; Non-Fat; 48/4 oz. 1,000 NO BID NOBID NOBID $ 11.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS|150 |Crispy Oven Fry: Coating Mix; 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS[165 |Oats: Instant/Quick; 12/42 oz.; 100 | § 27.89 NOBID NO BID 28.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS[171 |Cookies: Grahams; All Sports Bites; Apple; 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID 27.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS[172 |Cookies: Grahams; All Sports Bites; Vanilla; 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS|173 |Cookies; Grahams; Chocolate Bear; Whole Grain; 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID b 43.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS|174 |Cookies: Graham; Savory Biles; Tomato Basil; 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 30.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS|175 |Cookies: Grahams; Sound Bites; Vanilla; 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID 26.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS|176 |Cookies: Grahams; Strawberry Waffle; 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID 4313 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS[177 |Cookies: Graham; Sunrise Biles; Maple; 250 | § 24147 NO BID NO BID 27.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS|178 |Cookies: Grahams; Tropical Treats w/Calcium; 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID 26.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS|181 |Crackers: Goldfish; Cheddar Cheese; 250 | § 15.47 NO BID NO BID g 1379 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 17.20 NO BID NO BID
MIS|182 |Crackers: Goldfish Pretzel; Whole Grain; 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID E 41.10 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS[190 |Muffin: Wild Blueberry; Whole Grain; 72/2 oz; 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID g 24.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS[191 [Muffin: Bannana; Whole Grain; 72/2 oz. 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 24.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS[192 |Muffin: Apple Cinnamon WG; 72/2 oz. 100 NOBID NO BID NO BID $ 2418 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS[193 |Muffin: Double Chocolate Chip WG; 72/2 oz. 100 NOBID NO BID NO BID $ 2418 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIS[185 |Spray: Canola; Pan Coaling; High Yield; 6/17 oz.; 250 | § 25.43 NO BID NO BID 5 16.33 NO BID NO BID $ 26.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Please nole shaded arcas denote recommended product and provider. TABULATION SHEET PAGE 2 OF



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140508 - CAFETERIA FOOD AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
Estimated EAGLE LABATT FOOD PHILLIPS EYRAMID RC FOOD SAFEWAY vicco
e M Descipdon Quantity | BENEKETH GROCERY ELEERED BERCE | AIERAEAFER SR NOLVNG DISTRIBUTION | SSHO0% SERVICE SUPPLY SUPPLY
CATEGORY: ADDITIVES AND SEASONINGS
ADD|05 |Almond Extract: Imitation; 1 Pt.; 20§ 5.64 NO BID NO BID $ 468 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 14.00
ADD|10 |Baking Powder: 6/5 Ib.; 20 [§ 49.29 NO BID NO BID 4277 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 52.50 NO BID g 51.85
ADD|15 |Baking Soda: 12/1 Ib.; 30 | § 16.79 NO BID NO BID 18.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID E 13.55
ADD|20 |Basil Leaves: Whole; 17 Oz.; 208 18.68 NO BID NO BID 19.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.06
ADD|25 |Bay Leaves: Whole; 1/2 Oz.; 208 7.73 NO BID NO BID 6.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 6.75
ADD|30 |Beef Base: 12/1 Ib.; No Added MSG; Powder. 100 | § 85.95 NO BID NOBID [§ 4366 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD |40 |Chili Powder: 4/5 Ib.; 100 | § 128.88 NO BID NO BID 5 8168 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|45 |Cinnamon: Ground; 5 Ib.; 30§ 34.50 NO BID NO BID 5 18.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 15.39
ADD|[50 |[Cloves: Ground; 11b.; 30§ 16.58 NO BID NO BID $ 14.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID $ 15.48
ADD|60 |Cominos: Powdered; 5 Ib.; 60§ 23.50 NO BID NO BID 3 21.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 16.95
ADD|65 |Cornstarch: Edible; 24/1 Ib.; 303§ 19.21 NO BID NOBID | ¢ 17.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 17.80
ADD|70 |Food Color:1 pt.; Red, Yellow, Blue, Green; 12]§ 559 NO BID NO BID 5 4.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3.89
ADD|75 |Garlic: Powder, 5 Ib.; 40 % 26.39 NO BID NOBID |$ 2874 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 16.65
ADD[80 |Garlic: Granulated; 5 Ib.; 60 | § 34.17 NO BID NO BID $ 26.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 21.25
ADD|82 |Ginger: Powder 308 1349 NO BID NO BID $ 6.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7.96
ADD|83 |Glaze: Zesly Orange; 4/0.5 Gal.; 50 43.03 NO BID NOBID |$ 30.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|85 |Kitchen Bouquet: 411 gal. 30 [ 97.48 NO BID NO BID 7.60° NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 100.52
ADD[90 |Lemon Extract: 1/16 oz, 30 | § 28.74 NO BID NOBID |§ 552 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|92 |Marjoram: Dry Leaves; Sweet Whole; 1/3.5 oz.; 30| § 6.49 NO BID NO BID $ 567 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 5.80
ADD|95 |Milk: Evaporated; 48/13 Oz.; 75 5267 NOBID NOBID |[§ 19.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 19,80 NO BID $ 46.00
ADD|100 |Muslard: Dry; Ground: 1 Ib.; 30 [ § 6.08 NO BID NOBD | $ 426 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|105 |Nutmeg: Ground, 1 Ib.; 10 14,63 NOBID NO BID 11.97 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 17.90
ADD|107 |Oil: Canola; 1 Gallon; ONLY OIL; 200 | § 1236 | § 7.75 NOBID | § 6.95 NO BID NO BID $ 12.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 8.70
ADD|110 |Qil: Vegetable; 1 gallon; ONLY OIL; 200 | § 733§ 7.75 NO BID 3 7.25 NO BID NO BID $ 12.07 NO BID NC BID NO BID $ 7.80
ADD|115 |Oregano: Ground; 12 Oz; 30§ 9.99 NO BID NO BID g 5.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|120 |Pepper: Black; Ground; 4-5 Ib.; 100 | $ 37.28 NO BID NO BID $ 2295 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 32.00
ADD|125 |Powder: Onion; 1 Ib.; 100 6.42 NO BID NO BID $ 5.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 5.10
ADD|135 |Poultry Seasoning: Original; 10-12 Oz.; i 30 10.56 NOBID | NOBID $ 450 NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID ~ NOBID NO BID $ 7.39
ADD|140 |Sage: Rubbed; 6 Oz.; 8 8.34 NO BID NO BID $ 7.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 8.00
ADD|145 |Salt: lodized; 24/26 Oz, 60 12.19 NO BID NO BID $ 10.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [ 10.84
ADD|150 |Seeds: Sesame; 10 [ § 5.57 NO BID NO BID $ 5.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|160 Soup: Cream of Celery; 12/50 Oz.; 150 | § 36.59 NO BID NO BID > 32.82 NC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 39.00
ADD|165 |Soup: Cream of Mushroom; 12/50 Oz.; 150 39.45 NO BID NO BID S 37.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 43.00
ADD|170 |Sauce: Soy; 1 Gal.; 30 17.73 NO BID NO BID 5 12.83 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 4.50
ADD|174 |Spaghetti Sauce: 6/10 Ib.; 100 25.31 NO BID NO BID 24.39 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 23.60
ADD|175 |Spaghelti Sauce Mix: 6/12 Oz., 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 18.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|180 |Sugar: Granulated; 50 Ib.; 320 [ § 28.94 NO BID NO BID 5 2379 NO BID NO BID B 19.72 NO BID $ 17.50 NO BID $ 25.87
ADD|185 |Sugar: Light Brown; 25 Ib.; 150 19.71 NO BID NO BID 19.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|190 [Sugar: Powdered; 1/25 Ib.; 60 23.93 NO BID NO BID E 19.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|195 |Seasoning Mix: Taco; 12/12.5 Oz.; 50 20.25 NO BID NO BID 11.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|197 |Sauce: Teriyaki; 1 Gal.; 100 4212 NO BID NO BID 5 11.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 13.96
ADD|200 | Thyme: Ground; 11 Oz.; 10 8.04 NO BID NO BID 5.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 5.80
ADD|205 |Vanilla Extract: Imitation; 1 Gal.; 50 11.16 NO BID NOBID |$§ 857 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 6.00 NO BID E 6.95
ADD|210 |Vinegar: White; 6/1 Gal.; 50%; 60 | § 10.68 NO BID NOBID | § 10.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|215 |Water: Distilled; 6/1 Gal. 25| 6.47 NO BID NO BID 7.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.00
ADD|220 |Sauce: Worcestershire; 41 Gal.; 30 16.08 NO BID NO BID 15.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 14.50
_ADD|225 |Yeast: Dry: Instant; 20/ Ib.; ] 60 51.51 NO BID NO BID 5 4839 | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID 48.70
ADD|230 |Margarine: 30/1 Ib.; 800 18.52 NO BID NO BID 5 19.25 NO BID NO BID $ 51.82 NO BID $ 19.50 NOBID NO BID
ADD|235 |Gravy: Brown Mix; Country slyle; 6/24 Oz.; 300 19.29 NO BID NO BID 5 17.78 NO BID NO BID B 17.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|240 |Gravy: Pepper Mix; Country style; 6/24 Oz.; 100 | § 16.92 NOBID NOBID |[$ 16.47 NO BID NO BID $ 14.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|250 |Paprika: Extra Fancy; Domestic Ground; 16 Oz.; 30[s 8.89 NOBID NOBID | § 522 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4,85
ADD|270 |Sauce Mix, Cheddar Buds Instant, 8/2 Ibs 25§ 4328 NO BID NOBD [$ 43.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|271 |Sauce Mix, Alfredo Bus Instant, 8/1 Ibs 50 7223 NO BID NOBID [§ 41.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD|272 |Sauce Mix, Alfredo, 4/1 Ib 25§ 38.50 NOBID NOBD [§ 41.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 37.20
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140508 - CAFETERIA FOOD AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
Estimated EAGLE | LABATTFOOD PHILLIPS EYRAMID RC FOOD SAFEWAY. vicco
LI I Quantiy | PENEKETH GROCERY SUERCCASE BERVICERIE | A EALER SRR HOEARS DISTRIBUTION Pml Sl SERVICE SUPPLY SUPPLY
CATEGORY: CHEESE PRODUCTS
CHE[10 _|Cheese: Cheddar; Bulk; 40 Ib. Only; 100 ['§ 9840 107.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHE|15 |Cheese: Cheddar; Shredded; 4/5 Ib. Only; 20§ 71.50 | § 59.80 NO BID E 56.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHE|[20 |Cheese: Mozzarella; 8/6 Ib. Only; 100 | § 13152 [ § 143,52 NO BID E 130.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHE|25 |Cheese: American; Yellow; 6/5 Ib. Only; 300 [ § 80.26 | § 87.00 NO BID E 72.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHE|[30 |Cheese: American; Sliced; Yellow; 160 CT. ONLY; 400 | § 80.57 [ § 87.00 NO BID S 43.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CATEGORY: CEREAL PRODUCTS
CER|05 |Cereal: Bowl Pak; 96 CT.; Assorted; 1 Oz. Only; 5,000 42.98 NO BID NO BID $ 19.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER[12 _|Crackers: Club; Whole Grain; Individual; | 50 | $ 20.51 NO BID “NOBID $ 17.85 NO BID NO BID ~ NOBID _ 'NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID
CER|15 _|Flour: All Purpose; 25 Ib.; 800 | § 745§ 10.99 NO BID $ 8.71 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|20 |[Flour: All Purpose; Whole Wheat; 25 Ib, 800 | § 9.99 NO BID NOBID 10.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|[25 |Pasta; Macaroni; Elbow; 2/10 Ib. 200 | § 17.83 NO BID NO BID $ 16.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|27 |Pasta: Macaroni; Elbow; Whole Grain; 2/10 Ib. 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 16.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|30 |Hot Cereal: 12/28 Oz.; 20[§ 40.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER[40 _|Rice: Brown; Parboiled; Whole Grain; 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 14.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|49 _|Pasta: Spaghetti; Angel Hair, Whole Grain; 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 15.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|50 |Pasta: Spaghetti; Thin; 10"; 2/10 Ib.; 50§ 18.24 NO BID NO BID E 15.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|52 |Pasta: Spaghetti; Whole Grain; Thin; 10™; 100 [ § 22.05 NO BID NO BID 15.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|55 |Taco Shells: Yellow Com: 1 oz.; 200 CT.; 600 | § 12.34 NO BID NO BID 3 12.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|65 |Tortilla Chips: Round for Nachos; 5 Ib.; 50§ 20.65 NO BID NO BID 3 16.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|70 |Pasta: Rotini Spiral; 20 Ib.; 40 NOBID NO BID NO BID 16.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|72 _|Pasta: Rotini Spiral; Whole Grain; 20 Ib.; 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|75 _|Biscuit Mix: Whole Grain; 25lb.; 300 | § 27.50 NO BID NO BID 30.98 NO BID NO BID $ 22.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|80 |Pasta; Lasagna; Ribbed; 10"; 12/16 oz.; 240 | § 14.80 NO BID NO BID 14.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CER|85 |Cornmeal; Yellow; 25 Ib.; 50 | § 9.60 NO BID NO BID 9.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CATEGORY: DEHYDRATED FOODS
'DEH|05 [Bell Pepper: Dry; 1/28 Oz.; - 30§ 31.78 NOBID | NOBID $ 2342 | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID
DEH[10 |Eggs: Dehydrated; 1/50 Ib.; 60 NO BID NQ BID NO BID $ 186.43 NOBID | NOBID $ 204.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DEH|[15 [Milk: Non-Fat Dry; Bag; 1/25 Ib.; 75 | § 66.21 NO BID NO BID $ 69.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DEH|20 |Onions: Dehydrated;3 Ib.; 30 21.28 NOBID NO BID $ 15.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DEH|25 |Parsley: Flakes; Dried; 10 Oz; 30 | § 11.40 NO BID NO BID $ 9.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 8.00
DEH|30 |Potato: Granules; Dehydraled; 6/10 Ib.; 400 | § 45.18 NOBID NO BID $ 39.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 37.70 NO BID NO BID
DEH|35 |Mix: Refried Bean; 6/30 Oz.; 100 | § 26.40 NO BID NO BID $ 20.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 26.38
CATEGORY: BEVERAGES
BEV[05 |Lemonade Mix: White; 15/2 Gal.; 350 | § 4517 NOBID NO BID S 37.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BEV[20 |Tea Bags: Ice Brewed; 96/1 Oz; 160 | § 22.56 NOBID NQ BID $ 13.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 11.99
CATEGORY: FRUIT JUICES
JUI|10 |Juice: Grape; Individual Carton Only; 300 16.13 NO BID NO BID 5 17.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
JUI[15 |Juice: Orange; Individual Carton Only; 300 14.41 NO BID NO BID $ 15.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
JUI[20 |Juice: Fruit Flavor; Individual Carton Only; 300 12.25 NO BID NO BID 5 13.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
JUII25 |Juice: Apple; Individual Carton Only; 300 | § 13.22 NO BID NO BID $ 13.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140508 - CAFETERIA FOOD AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
Estimated EAGLE LABATT FOOD PHILLIPS EYRAMID) RC FOOD SAFEWAY vicco
Homhe, Descipton Quantyy | BENEKEITH GROCERY BUERCOAST: SERVICERE | LA LERAEARER IEEINOLANS DISTRIBUTION ,,:gggg.';s SERVICE SUPPLY SUPPLY
CATEGORY: CONDIMENTS
CON|[05 [Sauce: Barbecue; 4/1 Gal.; 0% 14.89 NO BID NO BID $ 29.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 29.00 NO BID NO BID
CON|07 _[Sauce: Barbecue; 4/1 gal.; 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 29.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 29.00 NO BID NO BID
CON|08 |Sauce: Barbecue; Individual Cup; 1oz 250 | § 11.99 NO BID NO BID 3 8.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CON|10 _[Ketchup: Individual; 9 Grams; 500 | § 21.45 NO BID NO BID 3 15.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 19.99
CON|15 _|Ketchup: Tomato; Fancy; 6/10 Ib.; 50§ 2234 NO BID NO BID 19.50* NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CON|20 [Sauce: Cranberry; Jellied; 6/10 Ib.; 20§ 36.57 NO BID NO BID 36.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CON|25 |[Dressing: French; 4/1 Gal.; 10 29.60 NO BID NO BID 3 29.93 NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CON|30 [Sauce: Louisiana Hat; 24/6 Oz, 10 14.44 NO BID NO BID 3 14.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CON|35 |Dressing ltalian; 4/1 Gal.; 105 3147 NOBID | NOBID 3115 NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID $ 2999
CON|40 |Dressing: Italian; Individual; 200/12 Gr. 15 15.01 NO BID NO BID ] 718 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID g 9.80
CON|45 |Jalapenos: Sliced; 4/1 Gal.; 150 24.50 NO BID NO BID 23.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID § 19.99
CON|55 |Jelly: Individual; 200 CT ; 2,000 | 8 927 | § 9.50 NO BID 3 8.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID E 8.38
CON|68 |Mayonnaise: 4/1 Gallon; 100 [ § 2402 7.50 NO BID 25.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 25.40 NO BID 26.99
CON|[70 [Mayonnaise: Individual; 200/12 Gr. 1,000 15.84 | § 9.35 NO BID 8.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 8.50
CON|75 [Mustard: Individual; Yellow; 500/5.5 Gr. 300 11.70 NO BID NO BID 6.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 6.50
CON|[80 [Mustard: Yellow; 4/1 Gal.; 20 11.40 NO BID NO BID $ 11.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CON|85 |Syrup: Pancake; 4/1 Gal.; 60 | S 24.10 NO BID NO BID $ 2142 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID E 22,50
CON|86 |Syrup: Pancake; Individual cups; 100/1 oz.; 500 | § 13.99 [ § 7.99 NO BID 8.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 10.00
CON|87 |Syrup: Pancake; Individual cups; 100/1 oz.; 500 | § 14.62 NO BID NO BID E 15.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00
CON|88 |Syrup: Pancake; Individual pouch; 100/1/oz.; 500 | § 10.26 NO BID NO BID 6.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 5.85
CON|90 |Pepper: Black; Individual; 1000 CT.; 50 | § 16.73 NO BID NO BID 9.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.00
CON|95 |[Pickles: Sliced; Dill; 1/5 Gal.; 200 | § 17.84 NO BID NO BID 15.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.38
CON|[100 [Pickles: Whole; Dill; 1/5 Gal.; 0|5 21.41 NO BID NO BID $ 22.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 24.50
CON|[105 |Dressing: Ranch Style; 4/1 Gal.; 303 35.88 NO BID NO BID $ 34.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 32.00
CON|110 |Peppers: Red; Diced; Canned; 24/14.5 Oz.; 60 [ § 34.50 NO BID NO BID 5 33.30 NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CON|[115 [Relish: Pickle; Dill; 4/1 Gal.; 60 | § 23.86 NO BID NO BID 5 21.49 NO BID NO BID $ 18.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CON|117 |Relish: Pickle; Sweet; 4/1 Gal.. 60 | § 27.66 NO BID NO BID $ 26.57 NO BID NO BID $ 19.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
'CON|120 |Dressing: Salad; 1 Gallon Only; - 50 | § 5.93 NO BID NO BID $ 656 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID [§ 5.50 NO BID $ 5.75
CON|125 [Salt: Individual; 1/3000 CT.; 45| % 581§ 4.99 NO BID $ 598 | NOBID NC BID $ 5.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4.85
CON|130 |Sour Cream: Individual; 100/1 Oz.; 20[ 8§ 10.85 NO BID NO BID $ 10.61 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CON|135 |Sauce: Tartar; Individual; 200/9 Gr.; 50§ 14.50 NO BID NO BID 5 7.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 12.50
CON|140 |Dressing: Thousand Island; 4/1 Gal.; 108§ 32.39 NO BID NO BID $ 28.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 32.00
CON|145 |Dressing: Thousand Island; Individual; 60| § 16.31 NO BID NO BID $ 8.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 15.00
CON|150 |Paste: Tomato;Canned; 6/10 Ib,; 200 | § 30.31 NO BID NO BID $ 30.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 28.70
CON|155 |Relish: Pickie; Individual; Sweet; 200/9 Gr.; 25§ 13.43 NO BID NO BID 3 6.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 8.00
CON|160 |Dressing: Thousand Island; 100/1.5 oz.; 70§ 12.60 NO BID NO BID $ 14.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 23.00
CON|162 |Dressing: Thousand Island; 200/12 Gr.; 70 | ¢ 15.35 NO BID NO BID $ 8.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID $ 15.00
CON 163 |Dressing: Ranch; 100/1.5 oz.; 200 | § 11.93 NO BID NO BID $ 14.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CON|164 |Dressing: Ranch; 200/12 Gr.; 100 [ § 15.17 NO BID NO BID 7.94 NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NC BID NO BID NO BID
CON|165 |Dressing: Buttermilk Ranch; 100/1.5 oz.; 150 | § 11.93 NO BID NO BID 14.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 25.10
CON|167 |Dressing: Buttermilk Ranch; 200/12 Gr.; 150 | $ 15.17 NO BID NO BID 8.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7.49
CON|170 |Dressing: French; 100/1.5 oz.; 60§ 13.11 NO BID NO BID 3 13.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
CONJ180 |All Spice: Ground; 1/16 oz.; 30§ 11.83 NO BID NO BID 9.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 10.25
CON|185 |Base: Chicken; 12/1 Ib.; No Added MSG; 100 [ $ 78.49 NO BID NO BID 3 53.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CON|[190 [Base: Tomalo with Chicken; Powder Buillon; 100 | § 51.96 NO BID NO BID E 41.33 NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 42.00
CATEGORY: CANNED FRUITS — B i e |
FRU|05 |Apple: Sliced; Canned; 6/#10; Grade A; 50| § 35.56 NOBID | NOBID |$ 33.77| NOBID NO BID $ 29.82 NO BID $ 27.65 NO BID NO BID
FRU[10 |Apple: Sauce; Canned; 6/#10; Grade A; 300 | § 28.81 NO BID NO BID $ 26.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 23.35 NO BID NO BID
FRU|20 |Fruit Cocktail: Canned; 6/#10; Grade A; 2,200 | § 39.76 NO BID NO BID $ 40.66 NO BID NO BID $ 41.00 NO BID $ 35.40 NO BID NO BID
FRU|25 |Orange: Mandarin; Canned; 6/#10; Grade A; 300 % 3017 NO BID NO BID 27.46 NO BID NO BID $ 21.90 NO BID 28.50 NO BID NO BID
FRU|30 |Peaches: Diced; Canned; 6/#10; Grade A; 1,000 | § 37.26 NO BID NO BID 36.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID 30.80 NO BID NO BID
FRU|45 |Pears: Diced; Canned; 6/#10; Grade A; 1,000 | $ 36.16 NO BID NO BID 38.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 28.40 NO BID NO BID
FRU|60 |Pineapple: Chunks; Canned; 6/#10; Grade A; 500 | § 30.56 NO BID NO BID S 30.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 28.50 NO BID NO BID
FRU|65 |Pineapple: Tidbits; Canned; 6/#10; Grade A; 1,200 | § 28.83 NO BID NQ BID S 28.85 NO BID NO BID $ 25.20 NO BID 27.40 NO BID NO BID
FRU|70 |Pineapple: Crushed; Canned; 6/#10; Grade A; 208 27.72 NO BID NO BID § 28.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 22.80 NO BID NO BID
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140508 - CAFETERIA FOOD AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
s Estimated EAGLE LABATT FOOD PHILLIPS EYRAMID RC FOOD SAFEWAY vicco
: Desarption Quantity | BENE KEITH GROCERY. SUCHCOART] S ERVICE R | GG AEE LU RN OEANS, DISTRBUTION. | SCHOOL SERVICE SUPPLY SUPPLY
CATEGORY: CANNED VEGETABLES
VEG|05 |Beans: Green; Short Cut; Canned; 6/#10; 400 19.02 NO BID NO BID $ 22.25 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
VEG|20 |Carrots: Diced; Canned; 6/#10; 100 19.44 NO BID NO BID 22.68* NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VEG|25 |Carrots: Sliced; Canned; 6/#10; 100 18.89 NO BID NO BID 22.81 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VEG|30 |Corn: Whale Kernel; Canned; 6/#10; 1,700 28.63 NO BID NO BID 22.39 NO BID NO BID $ 24.92 NO BID $ 21,65 NO BID $ 25.50
VEG|35 |Peas: Green; Canned; 6/#10; 150 34.77 NO BID NC BID § 27.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 26.00
VEG|40 |Beans: With Pork; Canned; 6/#10; 1,100 | § 20.28 NO BID NO BID 22.83* NO BID NO BID $ 25.23 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 25.25
VEG|41 |Beans: Black; Canned; 6/#10; 20 18.33 NO BID NO BID $ 22,22 NO BID NO BID $ 24.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VEG|45 |Potatoes: Sweel; Canned; 6/#10; 20 [ § 27.47 NO BID NO BID 35.02* NO BID NO BID NC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VEG[50 |Tomato: Whole; Canned; 6/#10; _ 500 | § 1583 NOBID NOBID |35 2101 NOBID | NOBID NO BID “NOBID _ NO BID NO BID 17.99
VEG|55 |Tomala: Sauce; Canned; 6/#10; 200 | § 19.20 NO BID NO BID $ 21.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.99
VEG|60 |Salsa: Canned; 6/#10; 250 NO BID NG BID NO BID 28.66" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 44.00
CATEGORY: INFANT FOODS
INF|05 |Apple: Sauce; Strained; 24/4.5 Oz.; 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|10 |Apricots: Strained; 24/4.5 Oz.; 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|15 _|Bananas: Strained; 24/4.5 Oz.; 20 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|20 _|Beef: Strained; 24/2.5 Oz.; 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NC BID NO BID NO BID NC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|30 |Carrots: Strained; 24/4.5 Oz.; 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|35 |Cereal: Infant; Barley; 12/8 Oz.; 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|45 |Cereal: Infant; Mixed: 12/8 Oz.; 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|50 |Cereal: Infant; Oat; 12/8 Oz.; 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|55 [Cereal: Infant; Rice; 12/8 Oz.; 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|60 |Chicken: Strained; 24/2.5 Oz.; 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|80 |Beans: Green; Strained; 24/4.5 Oz.. 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|105 |Juice: Mixed Fruit; Strained; 1/25 Oz.; 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF[110 |Juice: Orange; Strained /25 Oz.. 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF[115 [Juice: Pear; Strained 1/25 Oz.; 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|135 |Peaches: Strained; 24/4.5 Oz.; - 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID “NO BID NO BID NO BID ‘NOBID |
INF[140 |Pears: Strained; 24/4.5 Oz.; 20 NO BID “NOBID NO BID _NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID
INF|145 |Peas: Green; Strained; 24/4.5 Oz; 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INF|155 [Formula: 24/13 Oz; 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140508 - CAFETERIA FOOD AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
SR Distaiiton Estimated | oo e EAGLE GULFcoast | LABATTFOOD | o oo o o NoCRNE PHILLIPS ";m"”"“ RC FOOD SAFEWAY vicco
Quantity GROCERY SERVICE DISTRIBUTION PRODUCTS SERVICE SUPPLY SUPPLY
CATEGORY: ENTREE ITEMS

ENT|05 |Bacon: Sliced Slab; 1/25 Ib.; 25§ 92.33 NO BID NO BID 3 89.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT[10 |Beans: Pinto; Dry; 1/20 Ib.; 1,600 | § 15.07 NO BID NO BID 5 16.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.00 NO BID NO BID
ENT[11_[Beans: Black; Dry; 1/20 Ib.; 100 | § 16.38 NO BID NO BID 5 16.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT[20 |Beef: Ground; 80/20 %; Frozen; 8/5 Ib.; 1,500 9640 | § 103.60 NO BID 5 108.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|30 |Breakfast: Bar; Egg and Cheese; 80/2 Oz. 1,000 36.76 NO BID NO BID 5 38.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|50 |Breakfast: Pizza; Sausage; 3x4; 128/3.2 Oz; 1,000 46.98 NO BID NO BID 5 37.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|55 |Brisket: Raw; Boneless; Frozen; 65-70 Ib.. 60 | § 180.95 NO BID NO BID 5 234.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|57 [Ham: Pork; Watered; Frozen; 100 | $ 1.82 NO BID NO BID $ 1.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|60 |Ham: Turkey; 2/6-8 Ib.; Cured Turkey Thigh Meal; _ 150 | § 1476 | NOBID _ NO BID 5 31.08 NO BID NO BID ~ NOBID ~ NOBID NO BID NO BID “NOBID
ENT|70 |Burritos: Beef and Bean; Red Chilli; Whole Grain 1,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 52.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|71 _[Burritos: Bean and Cheese; WG 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID 50.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|75 |Beef: Palty; Charbroiled; 90/2.5 Oz.; CN Label; 200 | § 32.32 NO BID NO BID 31.81 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|80 |Chicken: Fried Steak; 40/3.88 Oz.; Whole Grain; 250 | § 27.18 NO BID NO BID 18.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|85 |Chicken: Frozen; Leg Quarters; Grade A; 4/10 Ib.; 2,500 | $ 4588 [ § 29.00 NO BID $ 28.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|90 |Chicken: Nuggets; 213/.85 Oz.; Whole Grain 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 56.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|[105 |Chicken: Thigh Meat; Raw; Frozen; 20 45.65 NO BID NO BID $ 68.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|[110 |Chicken: Boned; Canned; 6/48 Oz.; 200 66.98 NO BID NO BID 58.88" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|115 |Com Dogs: Turkey; 48/4 Oz.; 8/1 CN; 3,000 32.53 NO BID NO BID 5 1827 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT 125 |Fish: Pollock; Battered Wedge; 4 Oz.; 1/10 Ib.; 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 26.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT/|130 |Fish: Pollock; Oven Crunch; 40/4 Oz.; 300 [ § 35.52 NO BID NO BID $ 26.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|135 |Frankfurters: Turkey; 8/1; 6" 1/10 Ib.; CN 11746 2,000 [§ 11.30 NO BID NO BID 11.46 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|140 [Machacado: 1 Ib.; Low Sodium; 50 | § 18.69 NO BID NO BID E 16.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|150 |Pizza: Rectangle; Pepperoni, 4x6; 96/4.65 Oz.; 1,000 [ § 48.24 NO BID NO BID E 41141 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|[160 |Pizza: Rectangle; Cheese smart; 4x6; 96/4.65 Oz.; 300 [ § 47.09 NO BID NO BID $ 40.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|165 |Pizza: Wedge; Pepperoni; 96/4.97 Oz.; 1,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 49.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|[175 |Pork: Rib Patty; 100/2.5 Oz.; 100 [ $ 27.46 NO BID NO BID $ 29.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|185 |Steak: Salisbury; Char-Broiled; 114/3 Oz 200 | $ 44.89 NO BID NO BID $ 45.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ENT|[190 |Sausage in a Blanket: 80/2 Oz.; Whole Grain; 6,000 | § 3051 | NOBID NO BID 26.70 NO BID NO BID §  2763| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|200 |Sausage: Polish; Smoked Pork & Beef; 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 32.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|205 |Tuna: Chunk; Canned; 24/12 Oz.; Water Pack; 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID 66.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|210 |Tuna: Chunk; Canned; 6/66.5 Oz.; Waler Pack; 80| § 7272 NO BID NO BID 3 51.21 NO BID NO BID $ 61.56 NO BID 58.40 NO BID NO BID
ENT|215 |Turkeys: Whole; Grade A Frozen; 2/20-24 Ib.; 100 | § 57.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|220 |Chik'N Pretzels, CN Whole Grain, 83/1.930z 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 29.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ENT|221 |Boneless Drummies, CN Whole Grain, 200/.80z 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 29.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140508 - CAFETERIA FOOD AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
ey Estimated EAGLE LABATT FOOD PHILLIPS EITLAMID RC FOOD SAFEWAY vicco
Descriplion Quantty | BENE-KETH | opocery IR SERVICE | NATER A LARER S HOLAES DISTRIBUTION | SCHOOL SERVICE SUPPLY SUPPLY
CATEGORY: MISCELLANEOUS CAFETERIA SUPPLIES

J]450 |Paper, Napkins 850 | __NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBD |5 40.00 | __NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | S 35,53
M]200 |Aprons, Disposable 1,100 | § 934 | __NOBID NO BID NOBID | S 13.85| NOBID NOBID |5 498 NOBID NO BID 5.75
M|201 |Forks, Plastic 1100 NOBID | § 7005 948 | NOBID NOBID |$ 8.7 924| NOBID NOBID | S 6.60 6.75
M|202 [Spoans, Plastic 1,100 | _NOBID | 7005 948 | NOBID NOBD |$ 8.97 924| NOBID NOBID | S 660 | § 6.75
M|203 [Straws, Individual (unwrapped) 200 [ 5 6733 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2800 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $ 36.00
M|204 |Forks, Stainless Steel 120 | § 513 | NOBID NOBID __[S 458| NOBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | S 593
M|205 |Spoon, Stainless Steel 180 |5 364 NOBD NOBID |5 381 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | S 2.16
M]|206 |Bags, Bun Pan 250 | § 4138| NOBD |3 1649 NOBD | § 1500 | _NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |S 46.20
M|207 |Bags, Freezer - — ~ 250| NOBID NOBD |5 1142 NOBID |$  11.88| NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $§ 42.19
M|208 |Bags, Freezer 70§ 2642| NOBID NO BID NOBID | S 1250 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 33.50
M|209 |Bags, Sandwich 100 37.01| NOBID NO BID NOBID _|$ 10,00 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |5 34.80
M]|221 |Film, Plastic 100 2364| NOBID NO BID NOBID |5 4522 | _NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | S 23.99
M|223 |Foil, Aluminum 100 4856 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $  104.13| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 54.10
M|225 |Foil, Sheet 2,000 756 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | § 1469 | NOBID | § 666 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | § 7.59
M|226 |Foil, Sheet 250 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | S 2892 | _NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | 12.70
M|240 [Liners, Pan 180 | § 33.44|  NOBID NOBID | 3§ 2962 | § 39.00 | § 33.00 | § 3019 | NOBID NO BID NOBID |3 33.20
M|245 |Nets, Hair 30| NOBD NO BID NO BID NO BID ~0.62 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |3 10.00
M|250 |Sack, Lunch 500 | § 1316 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | § 1065 NOBID NO BID NOBID | § 10.20
M|255 |Sponge, Heavy-Duly Stainless Steel 0[S 1409 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | § 1095| NOBD | § 498 | § 399 | NOBID NOBID | $ 3.99
M|259 |Towel, Food Service 200 | § 4067 | __NOBID NO BID NOBID | ¢ 4117 | __NOBID NOBID | $ 10995 NOBID NO BID 47.99
M|260 [Tray, Breakfast 320 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 9758 | NOBID |5 5711| NOBID NO BID NOBID |$ 55.99
M|261 |Tray, Offer/Serve 340 | NOBID NOBID |§ 2125| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | § 25.58
M|262 [Tray, School Lunch 2.300 [ § 17.22| NOBID |S 1877 | NOBD | 8§ 2360 NOBID | S 2421| NOBID NO BID NO BID 17.75
M|426 |Gloves, Rubber 30| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.13| _NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 8.75
M[427 |Gloves, Rubber 30| NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |8 784 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.75
M|428 |Gloves, Rubber 30| NOBD NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.10 | _NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 8.75
M|429 [Glaves, Disposable 230 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.15° NO BID NOBID | $ 409| NOBD | § 2.05 | § 5.30

Proposal Notes:

* Not bid as specified
** Vendor submitted wrong pricing for item
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