Fill in response for each type of fuel you are bidding. If you are not bidding on a type

MINIDOKA COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT #331
FY 2018-2019 FUEL
Fuel Price as of July 31, 2018

you will need to list N/A as the response.

BIDDER & TERMINAL | STATE FUEL | DISCOUNTS IF TRANSFER :LIJ\‘EEIIIlIZ BIDDER'S COSTTO
PUMP LOCATION & OPTION | FUEL PRODUCT COST TAX APPLICABLE FEE CHARGE COST DISTRICT
UNLEADED CARDLOCK
NON-ETHANOL N/A
BAILEY OIL 85 OCTANE 2.4900 0.32 0.01 2.8200 2.9200
LYNCH OIL 85 OCTANE 2.4615 0.32 0 0.01 0 2.7915 2.8315
BAILEY OIL 87 OCTANE 2.5800 0.32 0.01 2.9100 3.0100
LYNCH OIL 97 OCTANE no bid
BAILEY OIL 91 OCTANE no bid
LYNCH OIL 91 OCTANE 2.6782 0.32 0 0.01 0 3.0082 3.0482
CARDLOCK
BAILEY OIL DIESEL 2.7925 0.32 0.01 3.1225 3.2225
LYNCH OIL DIESEL No Bid
BAILEY OIL RED DYE DIESEL no bid
LYNCH OIL RED DYE DIESEL no bid
ONSITE FUELING
BAILEY OIL DIESEL REG no bid
LYNCH OIL DIESEL REG 2.7650 0.32 -0.1 0.01 0 2.9950 3.0250
BAILEY OIL RED DYE DIESEL 2.7975 0.01 0.15 2.8075 2.9575
LYNCH OIL RED DYE DIESEL 2.7685 -0.01 0.001 0 2.6785 2.7085
OTHER:
LYNCH OIL Winter Additive 0.0800
BAILEY OIL Winter Additive 0.0800
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