No.

UNITED INDEPENDENT ScHooL DiIsTRICT

AGENDA ACTION ITEM

Topic: Consideration for approval of Bids, Proposals, and Qualifications

Submitted by: Ms. Cordelia Flores-Jackson of:_ Purchasing Department

Approved for transmittal to school board: February 16, 2009

Recommendations:

Staff recommends the UISD board of trustees approve the following Bids, Proposals, & Qualifications as
presented:

Bids/Proposals/Qualifications
District Wide:

RFP 001-2009 Furniture and Equipment for United High School
RFP 003-2009 Automotive Lab Equipment for United High School

Rationale:

Staff has complied with all applicable federal, state and local purchasing policies and procedures in
obtaining pricing information for the items listed above. Staff is recommending the awards based on
being the best value to the district.

Budgetary Information:
The budget includes the funds for these purchases

Board Policy Reference and Compliance
CH local - purchasing and acquisition
Texas education code 44.031




Bids/ Proposals/ Qualifications

District Wide

RFP 001-2009

Furniture and Equipment for United High School

RFP 003-2009
Automotive Lab Equipment for United High School

Summary of Recommendation(s)

Recommended Vendor(s)
Audio Visual Aids $30,137.00
Indeco Sales $545,591.38
J.R. Inc. $446,522.22
School Specialty $12,973.38
Tech Labs $24,940.00
See Attached Tabulation

Recommended Vendor(s)
Technical Laboratory Systems, Inc.
Amount $193,600.00




Board Approval
Awarding of Bids/Proposals
February 16, 2009

RFP 001-2009 Furniture and Equipment for United High School

Recommendation:
Requesting approval to purchase from the best bidder(s)/ offer(s) meeting specifications as follows:

Recommended Vendor Est. Amount
Audio Visual Aids $30,137.00

Indeco Sales $545,591.38

J.R. Inc. $446,522.22
School Specialty $12,973.38
Tech Labs $24,940.00

Administration distributed one hundred and nine (109) proposals and advertised on January 11, 2009 and January
18, 2009. Thirteen (13) proposals were received on January 21, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m. at the UISD Service Center
Purchasing Department.

Budget information:
2009-2010 Personal Property Financial Contractual Obligation (PPFCO)

Resource personnel:

Adalberto Ramirez, Director of Food Service
Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing
Karina Mendoza Guerra, Procurement Officer
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FOR CHILDREN

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Roberto J. Santos

Superintendent
MEMORANDUM
T UISD Board of Trustees
FROM: Cordelia Flores Jackson, Purchasing Director @%

DATE: February 5, 2009

SUBJECT: Recommending award of RFP 001-2009 Furniture and Equipment
for United High School

| recommend awarding RFP 001-2009 “Furniture & Equipment for United High
School " to the vendors providing the best value to the District as follows:

Vendor Est. Amount
Audio Visual Aids $30,137.00
Indeco Sales $545,591.38
J.R. Inc. $446,522.22
School Specialty $12,973.38
Tech Labs $24,940.00

These vendors met specifications and have an excellent service record with the
District. Factors that were considered in awarding this bid are quality of goods,
delivery schedule, warranty, and price. If you have any questions, please feel
free to call me at 473-7921.

Purchasing Department

Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director
3501 E. Saunders Rd. - Laredo, Texas 78041 - (956)473-7921 - Fax (956) 473-7950



I. CLASSROOM FURNITURE

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR INDECO J.R. Inc. Medco Rocky Duron & Associates Texas Furniture Source School Specialty A.Bargas & Associates Commercial Concepts Espacios, LLC. South Texas School Furniture
ITEM ITEM EST- Unit Price Extension Total Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension | Unit Price Extension Total Unit Price Extension Total Unit Price Extension Total Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Total Unit Price Extension Unit Price EXT. TOTAL
w.Inst. w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. w.Inst. w.Inst. w.Inst. Total w. Inst. w. Inst. Total w. Inst.
NO. DESCRIPTION QTy

1 |[Teacher's Desk Hon 88251 187 252.64 |S 4724368 | 26651 S 49,837.37] NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 253.65 | $ 47,432.55| NOBid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR 27631 | $ 51,669.97 519.00| $ 97,053.00
3 |Teacher's Chair Hon 5901 187 66.69 S 12,471.03 73.70 $ 13,781.90 | NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 68.69 $ 12,845.03] NO Bid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR 79.84 $  14,930.08 88.00| $ 16,456.00
4 [Computer Desk ABC CF06 72x30 2 317.29 |$ 634.58 | 404.15 |$ 808.30 | NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 368.00( $ 736.00
5 |Computer Desk ABC CF04 48x30 105 286.78 [S 30,111.90 | 269.96 [$ 28,345.80] NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 286.00| $ 30,030.00
6 [File Cabinet-letter Hon 314P 187 12397 |S$ 23,18239] 127.11 |$ 23,769.57 | NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 12598 | $ 23,558.26 | NOBid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR 148.68 | $ 27,803.16 200.00| $ 37,400.00
7 |Storage Cabinet Hon SC2472 20 267.84 |$ 5,356.80 ] 279.10 [$ 5582.00] NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 267.85 | S 5,357.00 | NOBid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR 264.99 | $ 5,299.80 357.00| $ 7,140.00
8 |Bookcase Basyx 3726T 187 190.50 (S 35623.50 ] 203.57 |$ 38,067.59 | NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 191.98 | $ 35,900.26 | NO Bid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR 190.84 | $ 35,687.08 218.00( $ 40,766.00
9 |Student Combo Virco 3400BR 3195 90.00 S 287,550.00 | 108.75 |$ 347,456.25] NO Bid NO Bid 152.16 | S 486,151.20 | NO Bid NO Bid 100.11 | $ 319,851.45| 11098 |$ 354,581.10 ] DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 90.00( $ 287,550.00
10 |ADA Student Desk scholarcraft 210 60 70.05 $ 4,203.00 | 114.66 |S 6,879.60 ] NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 98.28 $ 5,896.80 | DNMS DNMS DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 73.00( $ 4,380.00
11 |Student Chairs 18" Virco 3018 1500 42.61 $  63,915.00 48.18 $ 72,270.00 | NOBid NO Bid 71.50 $ 107,250.00 | NO Bid NO Bid 47.98 $  71,970.00 53.03 $ 79,545.00 | DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 39.00| $ 58,500.00
12 |Stool ABC 0802 692 47.46 S 3284232 50.08 $ 34,655.36 | DNMS DNMS NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMS DNMS 43.85 $ 30,344.20 | DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 36.00| $ 24,912.00
13 |Study Carrels Virco 8724365C 11 22338 |$ 2,457.18 ] 239.22 [$ 2,631.42] NOBid NO Bid 454.36 | $ 4,997.96 | NO Bid NO Bid 216.59 | $ 2,382.49 | NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 265.00| $ 2,915.00

DNMR = Does not meet requirements
DNMS = Does not meet specifications

All or None Pricing
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Il. Miscellaneous Furniture

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. Gaylord Bros. Audio Visual Aids Rocky Duron & Associatg Texas Furniture Source School Specialty Commercial Concepts Espacios, LLC. South Texas School Furniture
ITEM ITEM EST. | Unit Price | Extension [QUnit Price| Extension JUnitPrice| Extension [JUnitPrice| Extension | Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension JUnit Price | Extension [ Unit Price Extension
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY | w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total
1 |Overhead Projector Cart Bretford A2642 | 2 12944 | S 25888 $185.43 | S 370.86 | $ 122.00 | S 244.00 ] NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid $ 169.14 | S 338.28 DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid $ 107.00 | $ 214.00
2 |AV Presentation Cart Balt 89842 167 | 223.83 | $37,380.28 | NO Bid No Bid $179.00 | $29,893.00 | $284.29 | $ 47,477.00 | NO Bid NO Bid $ 18177 | $ 30,355.59 | DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid $ 203.00 | $ 33,901.00
3 |Folding Chairs Hon FCO1 1000 16.25 $16,248.60 | S 24.88 | $24,882.50 | NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid $ 1565|$ 1565000 S 16.48 | S 16,480.00 DNMR DNMR $ 16.87 | $16,870.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 17,000.00
4 |Chair Truck Virco HCT60472 12 354.96 | S 4,259.52 | $349.69 | $ 4,196.28 | NO Bid NO Bid $495.00 | $ 5,940.00 NO Bid NO Bid DNMS DNMS DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid $ 500.00 | $ 6,000.00

DNMR = Does not meet requirements

All or none pricing
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IV. Administration Furniture

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. Rocky Duron & Associates Texas Furniture Source School Specialty Commercial Concepts Espacios, LLC. South Texas School Furniture

ITEM ITEM EST. Unit Price ) Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price ) Unit Price .

w.Inst. Extension Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Extension Total w.Inst. Extension Total
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry

1 |Executive Desk 72" Hon 94271 1 666.31 S 666.31 NO Bid NO Bid 632.22 S 632.22 NO Bid No Bid 727.29 | $ 727.29) 727.29 | $ 727.29 | 810.00 | $ 810.00
2 |Executive Desk 66" Hon 94276 17 646.83 S 10,996.11 NO Bid NO Bid 615.54 S 10,464.18 NO Bid No Bid 707.91 | $ 12,034.47] 70791 |$ 12,034.47 | 788.00 |$ 13,396.00
3 |Executive Desk 60" Hon 94251 20 627.11 S 12,542.20 NO Bid NO Bid 595.72 S 11,914.40 NO Bid No Bid 686.06 | $ 13,721.20] 686.06 | S 13,721.20 | 764.00 |$ 15,280.00
4 |Bookcase Hon 1984 40 228.87 S 9,154.80 NO Bid NO Bid 215.65 S 8,626.00 NO Bid No Bid 134.82 [ $ 5,392.80] NOBid NO Bid 121.00 | $ 4,840.00
5 |Left/Right Desk w. Right/Left Return 5 919.09 S 4,595.45 NO Bid NO Bid 877.49 S 4,387.45 NO Bid No Bid 1005.18 | $  5,025.90 | 1005.18 | $ 5,025.90 | 1119.00 | $ 5,595.00
7 |Executive High Back Chair Hon 2091 1 166.34 S 166.34 NO Bid NO Bid 156.09 S 156.09 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 162.2 S 162.20 | 202.00 | $ 202.00
8 |Managerial Mid Back Chair Hon 2092 | 61 158.90 S 9,692.90 NO Bid NO Bid 149.07 S 9,093.27 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 15245 | $ 9,299.45] 193.00 |$ 11,773.00
9 [Secretarial Chairs Hon 7701 18 105.32 S 1,895.76 NO Bid NO Bid 99.03 S 1,782.54 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 107.88 | $ 1,941.84) 127.00 | $ 2,286.00
10 [Guest Chairs Hon 2093 70 129.13 S 9,039.10 NO Bid NO Bid 120.99 S 8,469.30 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 124.8 S 8,736.00| 156.00 |$ 10,920.00
11 |Lateral File Hon 94223 1 383.27 S 383.27 NO Bid NO Bid 364.97 S 364.97 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 43228 | $ 432.28 ] 466.00 | $ 466.00
12A [Conference Table 144" Hongo614/81227 1 517.71 S 517.71 NO Bid NO Bid 489.61 S 489.61 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 2288.00 | $ 2,288.00
12B [Conference Table 120" Hon 80613/81226 | 2 481.62 S 963.24 NO Bid NO Bid 455.20 S 910.40 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 2045.00 | $ 4,090.00
13 [Conference Table 72" Hon 1 342.59 S 342.59 NO Bid NO Bid 319.43 S 319.43 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 1058.00 | $ 1,058.00
14 |Round Tables Virco MT48R 14 431.39 S 6,039.46 703.71 $  9,852.00 NO Bid No Bid NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 485.00 | $ 6,790.00
15 |Stacking Chairs Virco 8925 84 39.71 S 3,335.64 46.50 S 3,906.00 NO Bid No Bid 37.68 3,165.12 | DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 55.00 S 4,620.00
16 |Rectangular Activity Table Hon Esr3s72L | 18 161.10 S 2,899.80 NO Bid NO Bid 153.85 S 2,769.30 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 173.82 | $ 3,128.76 | 183.00 | $ 3,294.00
17 [Reception Chairs Hon 2111 17 169.69 S 2,884.73 NO Bid NO Bid 159.25 S 2,707.25 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 14858 | $ 2,525.86 ] 183.00 | $ 3,111.00
18 |File Cabinet-Legal Hon 314 65 145.23 S 9,439.95 NO Bid NO Bid 144.32 S 9,380.80 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 14868 | $ 9,664.20 | 229.00 |$ 14,885.00
19 [Fire Proof File Cabinet-Legal Hon54cP | 7 1436.59 |$  10,056.13 NO Bid NO Bid 130826 | $  9,157.82 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 1184.35 | $ 8,290.45 | 1409.00 | $ 9,863.00

DNMR = Does not meet requirements

All or none pricing
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V. Cafeteria Furniture

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. School Specialty South Texas School Furniture
ITEM ITEM EST. Unit Price . Unit Price . Unit Price Extension
y— Extension Total wInst. Extension Total wInst. Total
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry
1 [Cafeteria Table KIUF126PRCHPY 75 1281.82( S  96,136.50 DNMS DNMS DNMS DNMS
2 |ADA Cafeteria Table kiwAUF126PRCHPY 3 1224.40( $ 3,673.20 DNMS DNMS DNMS DNMS
3 |Picnic Table Wecoat TSRC4-4SM 23 863.39] $ 19,857.97 867.04 S 19,941.92 805.00 S 18,515.00
4 |ADA Picnic Table 1 663.80| S 663.80 697.44 S 697.44 620.00 S 620.00

DNMS = Does not meet specifications
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VI. Nurses Equipment

RFP 001-2009

Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. Medco A.Bargas & Associates School Specialty South Texas School Furniture
ITEM ITEM EST. o . . . . . o . . .
Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension | Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry
1 First Aid Couch Royal 5 353.86| S 1,769.30 318.00( $ 1,590.00 S 2,068.55 288.98| S 1,444.90 317.00( $ 1,585.00
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VII. Library Furniture

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. South Texas School Furniture | Texas Furniture Source Commercial Concepts Espacios, LLC.
ITEM ITEM EST. Unit Price . Unit Price . Unit Price | Extension Unit Price Extension | Unit Price| Extension
w.Inst. Extension Total w.lInst. Extension Total w.lInst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry
1 |[Double Face Mobile Book Shelving 12 804.60| S 9,655.20 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2A |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 9 1073.72 S 9,663.48 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2B |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 51 942.64( S  48,074.64 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR No Bid No Bid
2C |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 6 668.88| S 4,013.28 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2D |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 11 610.88| S 6,719.68 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2E |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 2 1026.16| S 2,052.32 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2F |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 2 968.16| S 1,936.32 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2G |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 1 808.08| S 808.08 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2H |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 1 246.64| S 246.64 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 [Wood Student Chair 18" 180 118.68[ S  21,362.40 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4A [Rectangular Reading Table 36x72x29 29 503.00{ S 14,587.00 ] DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4B [Rectangular Reading Table 36x72x32 2 503.00| $ 1,006.00 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4C |Rectangular Reading Table 18x72x29 2 503.00| S 1,006.00 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 |]Atlas Case 1 990.20| $ 990.20 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6A |Computer Tables 30x30x29 Option A 24 601.60/ S 14,438.40 ] DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6B |Computer Tables ADA 30X30x32 OptA| 1 601.60| S 601.60 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7A |Computer Tables 30x30x29 Option B 4 775.60| S 3,102.40 ] DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7B |Computer Tables ADA 30x30x32 Opt B 1 775.60| S 775.60 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7C |Computer Tables 30x60x29 10 775.60| S 7,756.00 ] DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8A |Reading Area Seating Single Seat 6 319.37| S 1,916.22 367.00 S 2,202.00] 285.45 |$ 1,712.70 No Bid No Bid 361.98 $2,171.88
8B |Reading Area Seating Two Seat 2 558.69| S 1,117.38 | 642.00 | $ 1,284.00 | 501.05 |$ 1,002.10 No Bid No Bid 694.78 | $1,389.56
9A |Reading Area Tables Hon 80191 1 142.10( $ 142.10 160.00 S 160.00 133.78 | $ 133.78 No Bid No Bid 17398 | S 173.98
9B |Reading Area Tables Hon 80192 2 123.27( $ 246.54 ] 138.00 | S 276.00] 115.83 [ S 231.66 No Bid No Bid 155.31 | $ 310.62
10 |Book Truck 3 255.71| S 767.13 | 555.00 S 1,665.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 |Task Chairs 2 80.77| S 161.54 96.00 S 192.00 76.36 S 152.72 No Bid No Bid 86.23 S 172.46
12A [Circulation Desk-Triangular corner 2 486.76| S 973.52 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12B [Circulation -Free Standing Book Return| 1 627.12| S 627.12 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12C [Circulation-Depressible Book Truck 1 909.00| $ 909.00 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12E |Circulation-Hinged door shelving 2 841.72| S 1,683.44 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12F |Circulation-Open shelving unit 1 678.16| S 678.16 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12G |Circulation-Drawer&Shelve Unit 1 881.16| S 881.16 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12H |Circulation-Free Standing Desk 1 729.20( S 729.20 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12| (Circulation-Charging Desk 1 1244.24| S 1,244.24 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DNMR = Does not meet requirements
DNMS = Does not meet specifications
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RFP 001-2009

Furniture & Equipment for United High School
VIIl. Magnet Furniture

VENDOR Tech Lab System
ITEM ITEM EST.| Unit Price Extension
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY| w.Inst. Total
1 [Heavy Duty Work Steel Table 16 | $1,558.75 | S 24,940.00
Portable Drawing Boards 50 No Bid No Bid
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IX. Art & Graphic Furniture

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. Gaylord Bros. School Specialty
ITEM ITEM EST. o . . . o .
Unit Price| Extension [Unit Price| Extension | Unit Price| Extension
w.lInst. Total w.Inst. Total w.lInst. Total
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry
1 |Drafting Tables Fleetwood 44.633( 116 | 321.56 | $37,301.15| No Bid No Bid 459.09 | $ 53,254.44
2 |Art Cabinet Smith System 09450 4 364.72 | S 1,458.88 ( No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 |Art Drying Rack Bailey Ceramic Suj 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 306.82 | S 4,909.12
4 |All Around Cart Edsal Manufacturi| 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 88.07 S 352.28
5 |20-trays Tote cart with trays - Fleq 4 608.35 | S 2,433.40 | No Bid No Bid 647.73 | $ 2,590.92
6 |Pottery Model J Kick Wheel 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 |Steel Flat File Unit - Safco 4 2021.57 | $ 8,086.27 DNMS DNMS 1511.44 | S 6,045.76
8 |Free Standing Vinyl Floor Rack- M| 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 |30 Pocket Metal Magazine Racks-f 1 No Bid No Bid DNMS DNMS 22132 | S 221.32
10 |Wall Mount Paper Roll Dispenser-| 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DNMS = Does not meet specifications
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RFP 001-2009

Furniture & Equipment for United High School

X. Sewing Furniture

VENDOR J.R. Inc. School Specialty
ITEM ITEM EST. Unit Price | Extension | Unit Price | Extension

NO. DESCRIPTION Qry w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total

1 |Janome Sewing Machine 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 |Sewing Machine Flatbet Cabinet | 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 |Serger/Threading Machine 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 |Cabinet with Large Tote Tray Cab| 5 1233.96 | $S6,169.81 | 1255.68 6278.4

5 |Demonstration Table with Mirror| 1 660.76 | S 660.76 DNMS DNMS

6 [Cooking Demonstrator 1 1175.16 | $1,175.16 DNMS DNMS
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
FURNITURE & EQUIPMENT FOR UNITED HIGH SCHOOL

RFP 001-2009

MAILING LIST:

A.BARGAS & ASSOCIATES

P.O. BOX 792056

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78279-2056
PHONE: 1-800-344-2821

FAX 210-341-0033
abargasco@abargasco.com

CHICO BARGAS
hbargas@abargasco.com

ACHIEVEMENT PRODUCTS, INC
P.O. BOX 9033

CANTON, OH 44711

PHONE: 800-373-4699

FAX: 800-766-4303

GRANT CARDON
info@specialkidszone.com

ACP DIRECT SALES

P.O. BOX 703168

DALLAS, TX 75370

PHONE: 800-232-2979

FAX: 800-238-3117
customerservice@adpdirect.com
sales@acpdirect.com

ADIRONDACK

31-01 VERNON BLVD.

LONG ISLAND CITY, NY 11106
PHONE: 800-221-2444

FAX: 800-477-1330
joanne_jeffries@adirondackdirect.com

ATD-AMERICAN CO.

135 GREENWOOD AVE.
WYNCOTE PA 19095-1396
PHONE: 215-576-1000
FAX: 215-576-1827
DEBBIE ABBOTT
cfalcone@atd.com
dabbott@atd.com
mregion@atd.com

ALL SCHOOL SUPPLIES

817 W. COLTON AVE.
REDLANDS, CA 92374
PHONE: 909-335-6113

FAX: 909-335-6113
classroomsolutions@hotmail.com

AGRO LOGISTIC SYSTEMS INC
352 S LEMON AVE

WALNUT, CA 91789

PHONE: 909-594-7222

FAX: 909-594-7330

R VASUDEVAN
vasulo@roadrunner.com
info@agrologistic.com
www.agrologistic.com

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP.
2903 N. FLORES ST.

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78212
PHONE: 1-800-422-1282
PHONE: (210) 732-1234

FAX: 1-800-854-8140

FAX: (210) 734-3388

RON GEORGE
avacorp@audiovisualaids.com
dblalock@audiovisualaids.com
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A&W OFFICE SUPPLY

222 SOUTH STAPLES

CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78401
PHONE: 361.883.6784

FAX: 361.884.9013

MARCUS PANTOJA / WES WITTHER

awoffice@quik.com

AUGUST, INC.

354 CONGRESS PARK DRIVE
CENTERVILLE, OH 45459
PHONE: 937-434-2824

FAX: 937-434-9087
solutions@augustinc.com

BASIC SCIENCE SUPPLIES

P.O. BOX 12648

ROCHESTER, NY 14612

PHONE: 888-743-1722

FAX: 866-646-6676

ALISON BUNGO
abungo@basicsciencesupplies.com

BEST COMPUTER SUPPLIES
895 E. PATRIOT BLVD. #110
RENO, NV 89511

PHONE: 800-544-3472

FAX: 800-829-4881

KAY CURRAN
kay@theschoolsupplier.com
sales@theschoolsupplies.com

BILLYE LUSK & ASSOCIATES
9446 OLD KATY RD #101
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77055
PHONE: 713-461-4572

FAX: 713-461-9146
sales@billyeluskandassociates.com
www.billyluskandassociates.com

BRODART COMPANY

100 N. ROAD

P.O. BOX 300

MCELHATTAN, PA 17748
PHONE: 1-800-233-8467 EXT. 8360
FAX: 800-999-6799
english@brodart.com
select@brodart.com

PAT HOUSER

BROOK MAYS MUSIC

P.0. BOX 560085

DALLAS, TEXAS 75356-0085
PHONE: (800) 637-8966
FAX: (800) 637-9399

TREY SMITH

treysmith@brookmays.com

BUSINESS INTERIORS OF TEXAS INC
223 N CHAPARRAL ST

CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78401

PHONE: 361-882-3456

FAX: 361-882-5666

KEVIN LANDRUM
klandrum@bitexas.com



CDC PUBLISHING

4201 W PARMER LANE BLDG 200
AUSTIN, TX 78727

PHONE: 800-872-7878

FAX: 800-487-7878

CANDACE RODRIGUEZ
crodriguez@acdnews.com

CLASS UNIFORMS

502 W. CALTON RD
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-753-2527
FAX: 956-753-2527
GERARDO PENA
classuniforms@gmail.com

CHILDCRAFT EDUCATION CORP
P.0. BOX 3239

LANCASTER, PA 17604

PHONE: 800-631-5652

FAX: 717-653-7930

STEPHEN HERREN

COMMERCIAL CONCEPTS & FURNISHINGS
3622 NOLAND CT.

INDEPENDENCE, MO 64055

PHONE: 1-800-373-2472

PHONE: (816)254-7400

FAX: 1-800-632-3041

FAX: (816) 254-7447
jkanoy@ccfurn.com

JERRY KANOY

www.ccfurn.com

CORPORATE EXPRESS OF TEXAS
4036 BINZ ENGLEMAN RD. #202/1208
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78219
PHONE: 210-301-3100

FAX: 210-301-3110
mel.tedore@cexp.com

MEL TEDORE

CHARLES JACKSON

charles.jackson@cexp.com

DALLAS MIDWEST

4100 ALPHA RD. STE 111
DALLAS, TEXAS 75244
PHONE: 800-524-2417

FAX: 800-301-8314

GORGE MOSHER
ckeltner@dallasmidwest.com
ckeltner@ @abf.biz

DEMCO, INC.

P.O. BOX 7488

MADISON, WI 53704-7488
PHONE: 1-800-462-8709
FAX: 1-888-329-4728
AMBER DIAZ
amberd@demco.com

DESPACIOS LLC

7913 MCPHERSON RD STE 106
LAREDO,TX 78045

PHONE: 956-791-7183

RAUL SALINAS
rsalinas@espaciosonline.com

EDUCATIONAL RECORD CENTER
3233 BURNT MILL DR., STE. 100
WILMINGTON, NC 28403-2698
PHONE: (800) 438-1637

FAX: (888) 438-1637

SCOTT LONG

scott@erckids.com
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ELMO LOPEZ MUSIC CO.
1101 SAUNDERS
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 726-9111
FAX: (956) 729-9111
JOSE H. LOPEZ

elmc9111@sbcglobal.net

ERNIE MORRIS ENTERPRISES
P.O0. BOX 818

232 N. MAIN ST.

BUSHNELL, FL 33513

PHONE: 352- 793-2745

FAX: 352-793-2778

RON MORRIS/ADIN BURCHFIELD
emei@atlantic.net

aburchfield@erniemorris.com

E.J . OFFICE FURNITURE INC
1725 W. WILLIAMS DR
PHOENIX, AZ 85027

PHONE: 623-780-9393

FAX: 623-780-9419

JEFFERY DITTMAN

ejofficefurn@aol.com

EXECUTIVE OFFICE SUPPLY
3312 SANTA URSULA AVE.
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 722-6791

FAX: (956) 722-0690

executiv @netscorg.net
JUANITA FONTAINE

FREY SCIENTIFIC

100 PARAGON PARKWAY
MANFIELD, OHIO 44903
PHONE: 800-225-3739 EXT. 1390
FAX: 877-256-3739

ANNETT BENSON

customercare@freyscientific.com

FURNITURE FOR BUSINESS
1225 ROUND TABLE DRIVE
DALLAS, TX 75247

PHONE: (972) 992-0303

FAX: (214) 631-4424
CATHERINE THOMAS
catherine@furniture4business.com

GAMBLE MUSIC CO.

1313 W.RANDOLPH ST. #305
CHICAGO, IL 60607

PHONE: (312) 421-6652

FAX: (312) 421-7979

MANNY GUEVARA

custserv@gamblemusic.com

GAYLORD BROTHERS

P.O. BOX 4901

SYRACUSE, NY 13221-4901

PHONE: 800-469-1592

FAX: 800-891-5280

bids@gaylord.com

JEROME DUBOS / MELISSA PIERONI
mary.drescher@gaylord.com

GIARDINELLI

931 CHEVY WAY
MEDFORD, OR 97504-4127
PHONE: 800-288-2334
FAX: 800-652-4534



GREAT SOURCE EDUCATION GROUP

PHONE: 978-661-1514
LISA BINGEN
Lisa_Bingen@hmco.com

GREETING TREE

P.O. BOX 311594

NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 78131-1594
PHONE: 800-322-3199

FAX: 888-329-8733

TED GRIESBAUM
ted@aqreetingtree.com
www.greetingtree.com

HALLMARK OFFICE PRODUCT
5650 GUHN RD.STE. 124
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77040
PHONE: 713-688-1333

FAX: 713-688-1412

BILL STEPHENS
sales@hallmarkoffice.com

HERTZ FURNITURE SYSTEMS
95 MCKEE DR.

MAHWAH, NJ 07430

PHONE: 210-529-2100

FAX: 201-529-2800

FAX: 1-800-842-9290
ji@hertzfurniture.com
info@hertzfurniture.com
ldavison@hertzfurniture.com

karen@bhertzfurniture.com

HIGHSMITH FURNITURE
178 LFI COMPLEX LANE
LEXINGTON, NC. 27292
PHONE: 336-249-1004
FAX: 336-249-1007
info@highsmithfurniture.com

HIGHSMITH, INC.

W 5527 STATE RD. 106

P.0. BOX 800

FORT ATKINSON, WI 53538-0800
PHONE: 1-800-543-2180

FAX: 1-800-350-6236

FAX: (920) 563-3953

JANE C. EIKLAND

bids@highsmith.com

HILLJE MUSIC CENTER

3703 COLONY DR.

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78230
PHONE: (210) 696-0039

FAX: (210) 696-7927

SCOTT HILLIE

hilljemusic@aol.com

INDECO SALES, INC.

805 EAST 4TH STREET
BELTON, TEXAS 76513

PHONE: 254-939-5742

FAX: 254-939-5546
info@indecosales.com
wayne.goldston@indecosales.com
jereymays@indecosales.com

INTERNATIONAL OFFICE SUPPLY
DBA PATRIA

301 E. CALTON RD.

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 956-723-2332

FAX: 956-712-8772
patriamaria@yahoo.com

MEDICAL RESOURCES

550 SCHROCK ROAD
COLUMBUS, OH 43229
PHONE: (614)430-9375
1-800-860-4716

FAX: (614)433-7387
inquires@medical resources.com
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INTERSTATE MUSIC

13819 W. NATIONAL AVE.
NEW BERLIN, WI 53151
PHONE: (800) 982-2263

FAX: (262) 957-4538

ROBERT GOODDEN
bgoodden@interstatemusic.com

INTERSTOR DESING ASSOCIATES, INC
5074 STEADMONT DR.

HOUSTON, TEXAS 77040

PHONE: 713-690-7890

FAX: 713-690-7959
gary@interstordesign.com

J.R.INC.

P.0. BOX 2816

UNIVERSAL CITY, TX 78148
PHONE: 1-800-683-0846
PHONE: 210-658-6364

FAX: 210-658-0329
WILLIAM RODRIGUEZ

wijrodriguez@jrinc.org
WILLIAM RODRIGUEZ

JIM THOMPSON ASSOCIATES
1800 AUGUSTA #120
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77057
PHONE: 713-977-4838

JIM THOMPSON
jtarepfurn@aol.com
mhume@jtareps.com

JONES & COOK STATIONERS
4934 GREENWOOD DR.
CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78416
PHONE: 361-225-0772

FAX: 361-225-3055

JOHN OKAIE/OTOM GUERRERO
corpus@jonescook.com
tony@jonescook.com

K12 DISCOUNT.COM
P.0. BOX 2558

PINE BLUFF, AR 71613
PHONE: 877-512-3472
FAX: 870-536-7949
JAMES PASCALE

jamesp@k12discount.com

KAPLAN EARLY LEARNING COMPANY

P.0. BOX 609
1310 LEWISVILLE-CLEMMONS RD.

LEWISVILLE, NORTH CAROLINA 27023

PHONE: 800-334-2014
FAX: 800-452-7526
BRENDA ROBERTS
meadows@kaplanco.com
broberts@kaplanco.com

KRUEGER INTERNATIONAL INC
1330 BELLEVUE ST

GREEN BAY, WI 54302

PHONE: 920-468-8100

FAX: 920-468-2781

PAUL SCHUELLER

paul.schueller@ki.com

LAB RESOURCES, INC.

325 SOUTH PERSIMMON ST. STE B
TOMBALL, TX 77375

PHONE: 281-516-2200

FAX: 281-516-2202

LANA ALLAN
danny.allan@Ilab-resource.net
MUSIC IN MOTION, INC.

P.O. BOX 833814

RICHARDSON, TEXAS 75083-0403
PHONE: (800) 445-0649

FAX: (972) 231-0482

SHERYL ELLIS
sellis@musicmotion.com
bids@musicmotion.com



MEDICAL RESOURCE USA

1330 W. BLANCO RD

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78232
PHONE: 800.330.3591 x 118

FAX: 210.281.9604

JOSEPH P. BEGLEY
marissa@medicalresourceusa.com

MEDCO

500 TILLMORE AVE
TONAWANDA, NY 14150
PHONE: 800-556-3326
FAX: 800-222-1934
DARBIE PEIFFER
jamesw@medcosupply.com
darbiep@medcosupply.com
darbiep@medcosupply.com

MELS ELECTRONIC SERVICE
525 PRADA MACHIN DR
LAREDO, TX 78046

PHONE: 956-791-6615

FAX: 956-791-0733

MEL LOPEZ

mdlopez525@sbcalobal.net

MITY LITE INC

1301 WEST 400 NORTH
OREM, VT 84057
PHONE: 800-889-1481
FAX: 801-224-6191
PAUL LAWSON

paull@mitylite.com

MODERN COMPUTER FURNITURE
P.0. BOX 84

HOLLAND, OH 43528

PHONE: 800-300-4119

FAX: 800-300-3715
sales@mcfohio.com

TOMAS D. SKILLITER

MODERN SCHOOL SUPPLIES, INC.
P.0.BOX 958

HARTFORD,CT 06143

PHONE: 1-800-243-2329

FAX: 1-800-934-7206

DAVID LAHEY
sales@modernss.com

MRR REYES MEDICAL EQUIPMENT
5901 MCPHERSON STE 8A
LAREDO, TX 78040

PHONE: 956-796-9353

FAX: 956-724-2240

MAURICIO PEREZ

MMUISANO USA, INC
171762 ARROYO BANK DR
HARLINGEN, TX 78552
PHONE: 956.423.5053
FAX: 956.783.4662

JOSE A. CADENA
muisano@aol.com

MUSIC IS ELEMETARY
5228 MAYFIELD ROAD
CLEVELAND, OH 44124
PHONE: (800) 888-7502
FAX: (440) 461-3631
WILLIAM S. JOHNSON
music@en.com

NATIONAL EDUCATIONAL MUSIC CO.
1181 RT. 22 EAST

MOUNTAINSIDE, NJ 07092

PHONE: (908) 232-6700

FAX: (908) 789-3025

RAYMOND BENEDETTO
info@nemc.com
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OFFICE DEPOT

P.0. BOX 720105
MCALLEN, TX

PHONE: (956) 928-1212

FAX: (956) 928-1214

JASON MCKAY
jason.mckay@officedepot.com

OFFICE FURNITURE USA
1008 A EAST PECAN BLVD.
MCALLEN, TEXAS 78501
PHONE: 956-972-0791

FAX: 956-972-1146
ofusamcallen@yahoo.com

OFFICE ROAD/KAIYUAN

3005 WEST LOOP SOUTH STE 100
HOUSTON, TX 77027

PHONE: 713-892-8300

FAX: 713-892-8308

JAMES SCHESBROUGH
officeroad@officeroad.com

www.officeroad.com

OFFICE SOURCE, LTD

P.0. BOX 2680

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78299
PHONE: (210)212-7742

FAX: (210) 212-8845
GORDON DEERING

gdeering@officesourceltd.com

PAXTON PATTERSON

5919 WEST 65TH ST.
CHICAGO, IL 60638

PHONE: 800-323-8484 EXT. 302
FAX: 708-594-1904

RC WENDT

imich@paxpat.com

PERIPOLE - BERGERAULT, INC.
P.0.BOX 12909

SALEM, OR 97309-0909
PHONE: (800) 443-3592

FAX: (888) 724-6733

CAROL LUND

contact@peripolebergerault.com

SCHOOLOUTFITTER.COM
P.O. BOX 141231

CINCINNATI, OH 45250-1231
PHONE: 800-260-2776

FAX: 800-494-1036
webmaster@schooloutfitters.com
mpaulucci@schooloutfitters.com

SCHOOL SPECIALTY INC.
W6316 DESIGN DR.
GREENVILLE, WI 54942
PHONE: 1-888-388-3224

FAX: 1-877-315-5172

BRIAN DOHERTY
bdoherty@schoolspeciality.com
SCOTT KRUTZMAN
skurtzman@schoolspecialty.com
jtiemey@epsbooks.com

QUILL CORPORATION
100 SCHELTER RD.
LINCOLNSHIRE, IL 60069
PHONE: 800-634-0321
FAX: 800-789-2016
flora.george@quill.com
FLORA GEORGE
bid@quill.com

RECORD SYSTEM, LLC

P.O. BOX 790905

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78279-0905
MARIO RODRIGUEZ

PHONE: (210)341-4671

FAX: (210)341-4659
sales@recordsystemslic.com



REYNOLDS MANUFACTURING
P.O. BOX 6058

ABILENE, TX 79608

PHONE: 1-800-588-4031

FAX: 1-800-588-4033

VICKI REYNOLDS
vreynolds@nts-online.net

RHYTHM BAND INSTRUMENTS, INC.
P.O. BOX 126

FORT WORTH, TEXAS 76101-0126
PHONE: (800) 424-4724

FAX: (800) 784-9401

ANGELA LOWE
angela@rhythmband.com

ROCKY DURON & ASSOCIATES, INC.
9100 JOHN CARPENTER FREEWAY
DALLAS, TEXAS 75247

PHONE: (214) 358-3455

FAX: (214) 358-5713

MARCUS S. DURON
rduron@rockyduron.com

RM DAVID & ASSOCIATES
5509 DANA POINT DR.
ARLINGTON, TX 76017
PHONE: 817-784-0110
FAX: 817-784-0250

RUSTY DAVID
rusty@rmdavid.com

SAV-ON OFFICE SUPPLIES
2610 NORTH 10TH
MCALLEN, TEXAS 78501
PHONE: (956) 668-7616
FAX: (956) 668-7620

TOM STOCKER
$6898@savonltd.com
mherring@savonltd.com

SCHOOL HEALTH CORP.

865 MUIRFIELD DRIVE

HANOVER PARK, IL 60133

PHONE: 800.323.1305

FAX: 800.235.1305

JESSICA WETZEL/SCOTT JACOBSON
jwetzel@schoolhealth.com
bids@schoolhealth.com

SCI-ED WAREHOUSE

620 LAKEVIEW PARKWAY
VERNON HILLS, IL 60061
PHONE: 847-816-5060
FAX: 847-816-5051
MARTIN BRODSKY
daigger@daigger.com
www.daigger.com

STAPLES CONTRACT & COMMERCIAL
3711 BRIARPARK DR STE 400
HOUSTON, TX 77042

PHONE: 800-793-0468 EXT 246

FAX: 800-793-0476

CRYSTAL TANKERSLEY

crystal.tankersley@staples.com

SECUR IT

801 SAN DARIO
LAREDO, TX 78040
PHONE: 956-727-2232
FAX: 956-725-4468
secur-it@hotmail.com

SOUTH TEXAS SCHOOL FURNITURE
A DIVISION OF LAVACA COUNTY
107 NORTH MAIN

HALLETTSVILLE, TEXAS 77964
PHONE: 361-798-4364

FAX: 361-798-4365

LAURA JIRKOVSKY
auraj@texaslibrary.com

alanj@texaslibrary.com
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SOUTH TEXAS MEDICAL EQUIP. SUPPLIES
1403 CALLE DEL NORTE

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 956.712.4354

FAX: 956.712.4070

GERRADO VARGAS
stxmes@bizlaredo.rr.com

SOUTH TEXAS QUICK SHIP SALES
3000 JOE DIMAGGIO WAY UNIT 95
ROUND ROCK, TX 78664

PHONE: 512-246-9776/866-246-9776
FAX: 512-246-9786

KEN YERRINGTON
ken@keyenterprises.com

SPECTRUM INDUSTRIES, INC.
1600 JOHNSON ST.

P.O. BOX 400

CHIPPEWA FALLS, WI 54729
PHONE: 800-235-1262
FAX:1-800-335-0473

TERESA THOMSON
quotes@spectrumfurniture.com

thompso@spectrumfurniture.com

nellis@specturcmfurniture.com

STAGE-RIGHT CORPORATION
495 PIONEEE PARKWAY

CLARE, Ml 48617

PHONE: 800.438.4499/989-386-7393
FAX: 517.386.3500/989-386-3500
RICK ROE

rroe@stageright.com

SCHOOLHOUSE AUDIO-VISUAL
P.O. BOX 860831

PLANO, TEXAS 75086

PHONE: 800-338-8116

FAX: 972-424-3501

D.R. BETTS
sav@schoolhouseav.com

SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY

P.0. BOX 68968

SCHAUMBURG, IL 60168

PHONE: 1-800-485-2737

FAX: 1-800-485-2738
cbradner@schoolnurse supplyinc.com
DENNY KRAUS
dkraus@schoolnursesu
bids@schoolnursesu

lyinc.com
lyinc.com

VERSA PRODUCTS
13923 DOTY AVE.
HAWTHORNE, CA 90250
PHONE: 800-416-3961
FAX: 310-973-5485
sales@versatables.com

VIRCO, INC.

HWY 65 SOUTH

CONWAY, AR 72032
PHONE: 800-448-4726

FAX: (501) 513-1647 OR 7620
BRYAN HASKINS
bryanhaskins@virco.com

SAM TYLER

TECHNICAL LABORATORY SYSTEMS INC
P.O. BOX 218609

HOUSTON, TX 77218

PHONE: 800-445-1088

FAX: 281-391-1113

SHERRI JAMES

sherri@tech-labs.com

TEXAS CORRECTIONAL IND.
P.O0. BOX 4013

HUNTSVILLE, TEXAS 77342
PHONE: 1-800-833-4302

FAX: 936-437-6040

CONNIE LYNCH
connie.lynch@tdcj.state.tx.us
ED MASSEY

edward.massey@tdej.state.tx.us



THE CHILD CARE DEPOT
516-51ST STEET

WEST PALM BEACH, FL 33407
PHONE:1- 877-202-7116

FAX: 1-877-202-7119
info@childcaredepot.com

THE EDU-SOURCE CORP.
P.0.BOX 691948

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78269
PHONE: 1-800-258-8559

FAX: (210) 699-4386
FRANKMEDINA IV
edusource@satx.rr.com

THE LIBRARY STORE, LTD
10528 SAINT PAUL ST.
KENSINGTON, MD 20895
PHONE: 800-858-8117

FAX: 301-652-8811
info@librarystoreltd.com

THE LIBRARY STORE, INC
P.O. BOX 964

TREMONT, IL 61568
PHONE: 800.548.7204

FAX: 800.320.7706
LINETTE GRUNLOH
libstore@thelibrarystore.com

THE WRITE SHOP

P.0. BOX 1185

GEORGE WEST, TX 78022
PHONE: 800.637.2439

FAX: 877.449.3315
AUDREY GLENN

TONY'S BUSINESS INTERIORS
P.0.BOX 3111

MCALLEN, TX 78501-3111
PHONE: (956) 624-5241

FAX: (956) 584-8032

TONY GUERRERO

tonysbusinessinteriors@yahoo.com

TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS, INC.
20770 HWY 281 N. STE., 108 PMB427
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78258
PHONE: 1.800.578.8858 EXT. 6304
FAX: 1.800.589.5939

JAIME A. PALACIOS

jaime.palacios @trox.com

TUFF-WARE

210 S. HWY 175
SEAGOVILLE, TEXAS 75159
PHONE: 972-287-1060

FAX: 972-287-1892
sammie@tuffware.com
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VERNON LIBRARY SUPPLY, INC,
2851 COLE COURT

NORCROSS, GA. 30071

PHONE: 800-878-0253

FAX: 800-466-1165

FRANCINE

sales@vernlib.com

WENGER CORPORATION

555 PARK DRIVE

OWATONNA, MN 55060
PHONE: 1-800-733-0393 ext. 377
FAX: (507) 455-4258

JACKIE BERG
jackie.berg@wengercorp.com

WEST MUSIC

P.O. BOX 5521
CORALVILLE, IA 52241
PHONE: (800) 397-9378
FAX: (888) 470-3942
BETH VILLHAUER
bvillhauer@westmusic.com

WILLIAM V. MACGILL & CO.

1000 N. LAMBARD RD.

LAMBARD, IL 60148

PHONE: 800.323.2841

FAX: 800.727.3433

JENNIFER DAVIES/MELISSA BIRCH
jdavies@macgill.com
mbirch@macagill.com

WORTHINGTON DIRECT
6301 GASTON AVE., STE. 670
DALLAS, TEXAS 75214
PHONE: 800.599.6636

FAX: 800.943.6687
sales@worthington-direct.com

SCHOOL SPECIALTY EDUCATION
626 WEATHERLY DRIVE

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78239
PHONE: 210-265-5380

FAX: 210-656-3591

CELL: 210-473-1585

MIRIAM GUZMAN
maguzman@schoolspecialty.com
www.schoolspecialty.com

TECHNICAL LABORATORY SYSTEMS

P.O. BOX 218609
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77218
MIKE SUDDUTH

PHONE: 1-800-445-1088
MOBILE: 713-256-1763
FAX: 281-391-1113
mike@tech-labs.com



Board Approval
Awarding of Bids/Proposals
February 16, 2009

RFP 003-2009 Automotive Lab Equipment for United High School

Recommendation:
Requesting approval to purchase from the best bidder(s)/ offer(s) meeting specifications as follows:

Recommended Vendor Amount
Technical Laboratory Systems Inc $193,600

Administration distributed four (4) proposals and advertised on January 11, 2009 and January 18, 2009. Two (2)
proposals were received on January 21, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m. at the UISD Service Center Purchasing Department.

Budget information:
2009-2010 Personal Property Financial Contractual Obligation (PPFCQO)

Resource personnel:

Alicia Carrillo, CATE Director

Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing
Karina Mendoza Guerra, Procurement Officer




FOR CHELOREN

Board of Trustees

Pat Campos
President
District 3

Juan Antonio Molina, Jr.
Vice Presldent
District 4

Juan Roberto Ramirez
Secretary
District 6

Ricardo Molina, Sr.
Parliamentarlan
District 1

Ricardo Rodriguez
Member
District 2

William B. Johnson
Member
District 5

Judd Gilpin
Member
District 7

Roberto 1. Santos
Superintendent

201 Lindenwood Drive
Laredo, Texas 78045

UNITE

TO:
FROM:
SUBJECT;
DATE

Alicia G. Carrillo, Director

Career and Technology Education

Cordy Jackson

Alicia G. Carrillo AGC

Computer Lab for Auto Tech — UHS
February 3, 2009

The purpose of this memo is to recommend the Tech Labs program for United High School
as the only vendor that meets our specifications.

It is the policy of the United 1SD not to discriminate on the basis of race, color, naticnat origin, sex, or handicap in programs, sesvices
or aclivities, as required byTitle V| of the Civil Rights Act of 1964, as amended; Title X of the educational Amendments of 1972 and
Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, as amended.



UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
AUTOMOTIVE LAB FOR UNITED HIGH SCHOOL
RFP 003-2009

SECTION I.

VENDOR

DESCRIPTION TECHNICAL LABORATORY SYSTEMS INC A-TECH

SOFTWARE LICENSE

CLASS ACT MGT SOFTWARE/25

STATIONS $4,105.00 DNMS
BRAKING SYSTEMS POD

FUNDAMENTAL HYDRAULICS SYSTEMS $8,425.00 DNMS
DISC AND DRUM BRAKE SYSTEMS $8,685.00 DNMS
BRAKING SYSTEMS & ABS APPLICATIONS $11,105.00 DNMS
BRAKING COMPONENTS AND OPERATION $1,215.00 DNMS

AUTOMOTIVE ELECTRICAL/ELECTRONIC SYSTEMS POD

ELECTRICAL/ELECTRONIC

FUNDAMENTALS $3,950.00 DNMS
STARTING, CHARGING AND BASIC

IGNITION SYSTEMS $9,870.00 DNMS
VEHICLE DISPLAYS & ACCESSORIES $9,135.00 DNMS
AUTOMOTIVE ELECTRICS $8,015.00 DNMS
SUSPENSION AND STEERING SYSTEMS POD

FUNDAMENTAL MECHANICAL SYSTEMS $4,690.00 DNMS
STEERING & SUSPENSION COMPONENTS $16,965.00 DNMS
ON VEHICLE SUSPENSION AND

STEERING SYSTEMS $990.00 DNMS
WHEELS AND TIRES $990.00 DNMS
ENGINE PERFORMANCE POD

ENGINE MANAGEMENT SYSTEMS $7,775.00 DNMS
VEHICLE DIAGNOSIS $990.00 DNMS
IGNITION SYSTEM COMPONENTS AND

OPERATION $9,365.00 DNMS
FUEL SYSTEM COMPONENTS AND

OPERATION $990.00 DNMS
SPECIALTY POD

HEATING & AIR CONDITIONING SYSTEMS $7,650.00 DNMS
AIR CONDITIONING COMPONENTS &

OPERATION $16,965.00 DNMS
AUTOMOTIVE COMPONENTS, OPERATION

AND SERVICING $1,240.00 DNMS
AUTOMOTIVE TRANSMISSION SYSTEMS $1,855.00 DNMS
OSCILLOSCOPE

20 MHZ OSCILLOSCOPE $580.00 DNMS
FUNCTION GENERATOR $370.00 DNMS

AUTOLAB PRESENTATION PACKS AND STUDENT RESPONSE UNITS

AUTOLAB PRESENTATION/TEST PACK $990.00 DNMS

CLASS ACT SRS SYSTEM $3,645.00 DNMS

MAP INTERNET BASED INSTRUCTION LICENSE & TROUBLESHOOTING

IMAP AUTOMOTIVE PROGRAM $1,735.00 DNMS
AUTOMOTIVE ACADEMIC SUPPORT

TRAINING SYSTEM $1,500.00 DNMS
AUTOFAULT VIRTUAL

TROUBLESHOOTING SYSTEM $3,265.00 DNMS

TRAINING AND CUSTOMER SUPPORT

PHASE | TRAINING
1-2 DAYS ONISITE TO TRAIN INSTRUCTOR

BY LJ TRAINER NO CHARGE DNMS
PHASE I

1 DAY ONSITE TRAINING ON

MANAGEMENT/SYSTEM OPERATION NO CHARGE DNMS
PHASE 1l

TECHNICAL CONTENT/MANAGEMENT
SYSTEM PROVIDE AT NATIONAL
TRAINING CENTER AND INCLUDES 3
DAYS TRAINING COURSE, TRAVEL,

ACCOMMODATIONS AND MEALS $3,790.00 DNMS

TELEPHONE SUPPORT CONTACT

36 MONTHS LICENSE NO CHARGE DNMS
Subtotal $150,845.00 DNMS
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SECTION II.
FURNITURE AND SEATING

AUTOMOTIVE LAB FURNITURE TO
INCLUDE:
20-6" ANGLE TOP TABLES, 1 LSHAPED

INSTRUCTORS WORKSTATION $27,470.00 DNMS
30 LABORATORY CHAIRS W/0 ARMS &
CASTERS $5,850.00 DNMS
1 LABORATORY CHAIR WITH ARMS &
CASTERS $205.00 DNMS
Total price for Furniture $33,525.00 DNMS
Total Price with Furniture $184,370.00 DNMS
Shipping Charges $7,385.00 DNMS
Installation $1,845.00 DNMS
Grand Total Price $193,600.00 DNMS
SECTION llI
WARRANTY SEE PROPOSAL FOR FUTHER DETAILS DNMS
WILL PROVIDE (1) YEAR ON SITE WARRANTY
AND TWO (2) YEAR DEPOT WARRANTY.
HOWEVER, THE WARRANTY DOES NOT COVER
STUDENT MISUSE OR ABUSE, VANDALISM,
THEFT, OR ACTS OF GOD. IF TECH IS CALLED
TO PERFORM SERVICE ON THE EQUIPMENT AND DNMS
IT IS DETERMINED THAT THE PROBLEMS ARE
CAUSED BY MISUSE, ABUSE, THE SCHOOL
DISTRICT'S COMPUTER OR COMPUTER
NETWORKS, ETC THEN A SERVICE CHARGE
NOTES WILL APPLY.
COST FOR SERVICE CONTRACT YEAR On Site Warranty-
Year 2 - $2200 + parts/software-new development
Year 3 - $2400 + parts/software-new development
Year 4 - $2600 + parts/software-new development
DNMS

*DNMS - DO NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
AUTOMOTIVE LAB FOR UNITED HIGH SCHOOL

ATECH

12290 CHANDLER DRIVE
WALTON, KY 41094

DAN MCCULLOUGH

PHONE: 859-485-7229 EXT. 111
FAX: 859-485-7299
sales@atechtraining.com
www.atechtraining.com

TEACHING SYSTEMS, INC
AUSTIN-SAN ANTONIO-SOUTH TEXAS
JIM STEPTER

PHONE:

MOBILE: 210-363-4338

FAX: 830-885-5868
jim@teachingsystems.com

RFP 003-2009

TECHNICAL LABORATORY SYSTEMS

P.O. BOX 218609
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77218
MIKE SUDDUTH

PHONE: 1-800-445-1088
MOBILE: 713-256-1763
FAX: 281-391-1113
mike@tech-labs.com

WORLDWIDE AUTOMOTIVE
CC DISTRIBUTORS, INC
210 McBride

Corpus Christi, TX 76469
PHONE: (956) 236-5876
FAX: (956) 722-1998
CARLOS CANTU
ccantu@ccdistributors.com
BUY BOARD






