Bid 3837 Annual Contract for Charter Bus

Transportation Service

Lone Star Coaches, Inc.

Total Price

$5,057.20

Line #

Description

QTYy

luom

Unit

Extended

10

11

12

13

14

15
16

Charter Transportation, 56-Passenger Bus.
State cost per mile for dead head miles.
Charter Transportation, 56-Passenger Bus.
State cost per mile for each charter.
Charter Transportation, 56-Passenger Bus.
State charge for overnight trips, including
driver and additional driver if required (for
each evening).

Charter Transportation, 56-Passenger Bus.
State additional cost for restroom equipped
vehicle.

Charter Transportation, 56-Passenger Bus.
State cost for Technology Package, to
include WIFI ACCESS, DC OUTLET, DVD
ACCESSIBILITY.

Charter Transportation, 56-Passenger Bus.
State day rate.

Charter Transportation, 56-passenger Bus.
State charge for day rate, out of town only.
Charter Transportation, 56-Passenger Bus.
State minimum hours charge. Enter the
minimum hours in Bidder's Notes.

Charter Transportation, 56-Passenger Bus.
State charge for each additional hour over
minimum hours.

Charter Transportation, 56-Passenger Bus.
State one-way transfer charge. State
minimum hours in Bidder's Notes.

Charter Transportation, 56-Passenger Bus.
State charge for each additional hour over
minimum hours for transfer charge.

Charter Transportation, 56-passenger Bus.
State cost for each additional bus needed in
conjunction with any trip requested.

State per hour holdover charge for 56-
passenger bus

State your flat rate cancellation fee with
less than twenty-four (24) hour notice for
56-Passenger bus.

Hourly Rate for 56 Passenger Bus with
Driver

Cost for Additional Driver per Day

[

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

DAY

DAY

EA

HR

EA

HR

EA

HR

EA

HR
DAY

No Bid

$0.00

$0.00

$1,165.00

$575.00

$80.00

$485.00

No Bid

$250.00

No Bid

$2.45

$3.80

$0.00

$0.00

$1,165.00

$575.00

$80.00

$485.00

$250.00
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17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33
34

Extra Hour Service Rate (Time Overage)

Charter Transportation, 40-Passenger Bus.
State cost per mile for dead head miles.

Charter Bus Transportation, 40-Passenger.
State cost per mile for each charter.
Charter Bus Transportation, 40-Passenger.
State charge for overnight trips including
driver and additional driver if required (for
each evening).

Charter Bus Transportation, 40-Passenger.
State additional cost for restroom equipped
vehicle.

Charter Bus Transportation, 40-Passenger.
State cost for Technology Package on bus,
to include WIFI ACCESS, DC OUTLET, DVD
ACCESSIBILITY.

Charter Bus Transportation, 40-Passenger.
State day rate.

Charter Bus Transportation, 40-passenger.
State charge for day rate, out of town only.

Charter Bus Transportation, 40-Passenger.
State minimum hours charge. Enter the
minimum hours in Bidder's Notes.

Charter Bus Transportation, 40-Passenger.
State charge per each additional hour over
minimum hours.

Charter Bus Transportation, 40-Passenger.
State one-way transfer charge. State
minimum hours in Bidder's Notes.

Charter Bus Transportation, 40-Passenger.
State charge for each additional hour over
minimum hours for transfer charge.

Charter Transportation, 40-passenger bus.
State cost for each additional bus needed in
conjunction with any trip requested.

State per hour holdover charge for 40-
passenger bus

State your flat rate cancellation fee with
less than twenty-four hour notice for 40
passenger bus.

Hourly Rate for 40 Passenger Bus with
Driver

Cost for Additional Driver per Day

Extra Hour Service Rate (Time Overage)

HR

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

DAY

DAY

EA

HR

EA

HR

EA

HR

EA

HR

DAY
HR

No Bid

$0.00

$0.00

$1,075.00

$520.00

$75.00

$415.00

No Bid

$250.00

No Bid

$75.00

$80.00

$2.45

$3.50

$0.00

$0.00

$1,075.00

$520.00

$75.00

$415.00

$250.00

$75.00
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35

36

37

38

39

40

41

42

43

44

45

46

47

48

49

50
51

Charter Bus Transportation, 35-Passenger.
State cost per mile for dead head miles.

Charter Bus Transportation, 35-Passenger.
State cost per mile for each charter.
Charter Bus Transportation, 35-Passenger.
State charge for overnight trips including
driver and additional driver if required (for
each evening).

Charter Bus Transportation, 35-Passenger.
State additional cost for restroom equipped
vehicle.

Charter Bus Transportation, 35-Passenger.
State cost for Technology Package on bus,
to include WIFI ACCESS, DC OUTLET, DVD
ACCESSIBILITY.

Charter Bus Transportation, 35-Passenger.
State day rate.

Charter Bus Transportation, 35-passenger.
State charge for day rate, out of town only.

Charter Bus Transportation, 35-Passenger.
State minimum hours charge. Enter the
minimum hours in Bidder's Notes.

Charter Bus Transportation, 35-Passenger.
State charge for each additional hour over
minimum hours.

Charter Bus Transportation, 35-Passenger.
State one-way transfer charge. State
minimum hours in Bidder's Notes.

Charter Bus Transportation, 35-Passenger.
State charge for each additional hour over
minimum hours for transfer charge.

Charter Transportation, 35-passenger bus.
State cost for each additional bus needed in
conjunction with any trip requested.
State per hour holdover charge for 35-
passenger bus

State your flat rate cancellation fee with
less than twenty-four hour notice for 35
passenger bus.

Hourly Rate for 35 Passenger Bus with
Driver

Cost for Additional Driver per Day

Extra Hour Service Rate (Time Overage)

IR

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

DAY

DAY

EA

HR

EA

HR

EA

HR

EA

HR

DAY
HR

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
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52

53

54

55

56

57

58

59

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

67

Charter Bus Transportation, 24-Passenger.
State cost per mile for dead head miles.

Charter Bus Transportation, 24-Passenger.
State cost per mile for each charter.
Charter Bus Transportation, 24-Passenger.
State charge for overnight trips including
driver and additional driver if required (for
each evening).

Charter Bus Transportation, 24-Passenger.
State additional cost for restroom equipped
vehicle.

Charter Bus Transportation, 24-Passenger.
State cost for Technology Package on bus,
to include WIFI ACCESS, DC OUTLET, DVD
ACCESSIBILITY.

Charter Bus Transportation, 24-Passenger.
State day rate.

Charter Bus Transportation, 24-passenger.
State charge for day rate, out of town only.
Charter Transportation, 24-Passenger Bus.
State one-way transfer charge. State
minimum hours in Bidder's Notes.

Charter Bus Transportation, 24-Passenger.
State minimum hours charge. Enter the
minimum hours in Bidder's Notes.

Charter Bus Transportation, 24-Passenger.
State charge for each additional hour over
minimum hours.

Cost for Additional Driver per Day

Charter Bus Transportation, 24-Passenger.
State one-way transfer charge. State
minimum hours in Bidder's Notes.

Charter Bus Transportation, 24-Passenger.
State charge for each additional hour over
minimum hours for transfer charge.

Charter Transportation, 24-passenger bus.
State cost for each additional bus needed in
conjunction with any trip requested.

State your flat rate cancellation fee with
less than twenty-four hour notice for 24
passenger bus.

State per hour holdover charge for 24-
passenger bus

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

DAY

DAY

EA

EA

HR

DAY

EA

HR

EA

EA

HR

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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68

69
70

71

Hourly Rate for 24 Passenger Bus with
Driver

Cost for Additional Driver per Day

Extra Hour Service Rate (Time Overage)

State your percentage fuel surcharge when
over $4.00 /gallon. State in Bidder's Notes
indicator used for fuel surcharge.

=R

HR
DAY
HR

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

[°8)
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