AGENDA ITEM

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop X Regular Special
(A) Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

(B) X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE

LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED
PROPOSAL NO. 130625 FOR OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD
DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE

RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY
CH.

(C) Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

(D) Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




= |
89 EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT 00T, DISTRICT

FHaréed ;"n— Eesellente
To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Assistant Superintendent for Business and Finance
~ Digitally signed by
A ” . a :'_'.—!", Luis A. Vélez
From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director Cate: 20130701
£ 18:04:11 -05'00"
Date: Thursday, June 27, 2013

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 130625 for Office and
Teaching Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal Number 130625 for Office and Teaching Supplies be awarded in
accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the
attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matier, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson Roap @  EacLe Pass, Texas 78852 @  Te. (830) 773-5181 WY, LAGLEASSISD.NET

F-280

AN Equat Oprorrunimy Evprover



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 130625

OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES

PYRAMID
ITEM NOLANS OFFICE SCHOOL SCHOOL
NO. QTY. DESCRIPTION PRODUCTS QUILL SPECIALTY OFFICE DEPOT PRODUCTS

[ 7000 | 700 BANDS, RUBBER |  NoBID |  NOBID 5 0.74 | $ 2.03 |ISERIER 02

| 7005 | 2500 | FRY, DURACELL (AAA | nosi ; 1.65 NO BID 11.60° NO BID

| To0s ‘7 BATTERY, DURACELL (AA) | oD —L ~ 165|  NOBID 11.01* NO BID

! h: | ) BATTERY, DURAZELL (C) | EID $ . 334| nNOBID  |$ 12.24 NO BID

; | ATTERY, DURACELL (D) ' NORID © 334  noep |8 1sm2 NO BID
T009 BATTERY, DURACELL (9V) | NO BID S 3.34 NO BID $ 17.53 NO BID
T025 75 BOARD, MARKER TOWELETTES NO BID 5 4.01 | $ 481 | 5.37 |is 3,99
T026 150 BOARD, SPRAY CLEANER NO BID $ 158 | ¢ 1.92 1.28* $ 1.55
T033 200 BOX, FILE (LEGAL) $ 4.87 | $ 6.33 NO BID
T035 | 600 BOX, FILE (LETTER) 5 $ $ 2.36 | § 4.37 NO BID
T040 600 CARDS, INDEX (3" x 5) NO BID 5 $ 0.33 | $ 0.56 | 0.36
T041 200 CARDS, INDEX (4"x 6") NO BID 5 B 0.54 | $ 3.02 | § 0.56
T042 200 CARDS, INDEX (5" x 8") NO BID o | s 0.89 | § 420 | $ 0.96
T043 200 CARDS, INDEX (3" x 5") NO BID 5 $ 0.33 | $ 1.67 | $ 0.36
T120 60 CLIPS, BINDER (MINI) NO BID o | s 170 | $ 6.57 NO BID
T121 100 CLIPS, BINDER (SMALL) NO BID $ $ 190 | 1.00 | $ 2.50
T122 200 CLIPS, BINDER (MEDIUM) NO BID $ $ 040 [§ 0.24 | § 0.60
T123 200 CLIPS, BINDER (LARGE) NO BID $ 64.20 | $ 098 |6 065 | $ 1.35
T124 | 200 CLIPS, ASSORTED BINDER NO BID $ 070 | s 0.88 | 3.69 | $ 2.89
T125 150 CLIPS, PAPER 5 137 | $ 170 | $ 140 | $ 6.90 | $ 1.79
T126 200 CLIPS, PAPER (JUMBO) $ 430 | $ 5.10 | $ 420 [l 2,04 | $ 4.60
T127 100 | CLIPS, PAPER (ASSORTED COLORS) NO BID NO BID $ 1.70 | $ 5.88 NO BID

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE SHADED AREA(S) REFLECTS THE RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)

TABULATION SHEET PAGE 1 OF 7




EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 130625
OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES

PYRAMID
ITEM NOLANS OFFICE SCHOOL SCHOOL
NO. QTY DESCRIPTION PRODUCTS QUILL SPECIALTY OFFICE DEPOT PRODUCTS
l T128 ) ' CR/ ‘ 1D ! : .88 i ; 4 sz E - ﬁ},f’_’::‘:
T } ii ‘ i - ’ _J J _} ] - o L k O.‘}U § o G2
200 | SPENSER, TAI | NO BID | noem $ 1.68 | 2.09
’ ' ii:'“..'r‘—.":i, WHITELOARD ; ) BID ’ s 1.27 i % 717._1‘,‘__ “ ‘g D
! | | 7 ' | 2.0 | BID
* 7 |10 | EnveioPes, clasP (6 1/2'X91/27) | NOBID E 36 | 5.65 23.29 NO BID
_ T158 75 ENVELOPES, CLASP (9" X 12") NO BID $ H5el5% ¢ 6.47 | & 23.35 NO BID
T160 75 ENVELOPES, CLASP (10" X 13") NO BID $ 8.10 | $ 11.25 NO BID
T165 20 ENVELOPES, CLASP (10" X 15") NO BID $ 8.67 | $ 28.73 NO BID
T170 20 ENVELOPES, CLASP (12" X 15 1/2") NO BID $ 10.13 | $ 10.47 NO BID
T175 200 ENVELOPES, WHITE BUSINESS $ 679 | s 5.66 | $ 7.97 | 3 17.50 NO BID
T190 150 ERASER, PENCIL NO BID $ 3.65 | $ 433 | ¢ 3.16 3.29
T195 150 FASTENER, ROUND HEAD NO BID NO BID $ 0.56 | $ 0.74 | 55
T197 150 FASTENER, PRONG e NO BID $ 1.56 | $ 281 | $ 1.45
T200 50 FILE POCKET, LEGAL 5 1439 | $ 42.48 | $ 18.34 | $ 5.69
T205 50 FILE POCKET, LETTER $ 10.57 | $ 59.38 | § 19.56 | $ 10.69
T225 500 FILM, LAMINATING NO BID $ 1538 | $ 31.99 NO BID
T233 100 FILM, TRANSPARENCY NO BID $ 16.63 $ V G $ 24.16 | $ 12.95
T234 75 FLAG, POST-IT NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7.10. NO BID
T290 100 FOLDERS, FILE (BLUE) NO BID $ $ 7.24 | 13.92 | $ 9.79
T291 100 FOLDERS, FILE (RED) NO BID i $ 7.24 | $ 13.91 | $ 9.79
T292 100 FOLDERS, FILE (YELLOW) NO BID 5 7.25 | $ 7.24 | $ 13.98 | § 9.79

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE SHADED AREA(S) REFLECTS THE RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)

TABULATION SHEET PAGE 2 OF 7




EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 130625
OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES

‘ PYRAMID

ITEM NOLANS OFFICE SCHOOL SCHOOL

No. | qrv. | DESCRIPTION | PRODUCTS QUILL SPECIALTY OFFICE DEPOT PRODUCTS

;[ | » _ ERS, FILE (GREEN ] NO BID s 725 | ¢ 24| % | ! 5 9.79

| s | T R i fT{ | e ‘r ’ sale 736 _” ;_ 210 |

| T3 | - ‘ x ETTER) NO BID | 4.16 F 53508 0518|8519 :

! | >T | | NO ‘ ) 7 I

! - -;,,,! __100 l . FOLDERS,; FILE (ASST.) _ ' ____NOEBID ‘ 31 7771 ( "I 13.89 |3 11.29 I

| 7305 | 50 | roluers, FILE (HANGING) 1“_1ﬁ| nosD s 411 |8 $ 5.60 | $ 6.29
1310 ¥ FOLDERS, FILE (HANGING) LETTER NO BID $ S 461 | % 5.09
T311 30 FOLDERS, FILE (HANGING) ASST. NO BID $ $ 15.65 | $ 8.99
T312 50 FOLDERS, FILE (HANGING) NO BID i | s 11.25 | $ 7.39
T324 200 GLUE STICK NO BID $ $ 857 |6 7.08
T330 | 200 GLUE NO BID $ 7.08 | & 516 | $ X
T401 100 LABELS, ADDRESS (WHITE) NO BID B 23.16 | $ 18.92 | $ 20.95
T402 30 LABELS, ADDRESS (CLEAR) NO BID | 30.64 | $ 3091 | $ 27.59
T403 20 LABELS, FILING (WHITE) NO BID $ 19.63 | 14.43 | $ 12.95
T404 20 LABELS, FILING (ASSORTED) NO BID $ 16.04 | 12.86 | $ 11.49
T493 75 LAMP, PROJECTOR NO BID $ 6.01 | $ 10.54 | 6 =
T494 75 LAMP, PROJECTOR (EYB) NO BID NO BID $ 9.45 | 3.49.
T499 | 1,200 MARKERS, DRY ERASE (4) NO BID $ 3.09 | $ 2.57 |8 2.19
T505 800 MARKER, HIGHLIGHTING (ASST.) NO BID IS 1.65 | § 494 | $ 1.49
T506 75 MARKER, HIGHLIGHTING (BLUE) NO BID o $ 3.45 | $ 679 | 3.12
T507 75 MARKER, HIGHLIGHTING (GREEN) NO BID $ 243 | 3.45 | s 6.79 | $ 3.12

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE SHADED AREA(S) REFLECTS THE RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)

TABULATION SHEET PAGE 3 OF 7



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 130625
OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES

PYRAMID
ITEM NOLANS OFFICE SCHOOL SCHOOL
NO. yESC 3 PRODUCTS | QUILL | sPECIALTY OFFICE DEPOT | PRODUCTS |
| . | | e | } . | |
\ ' , (YELLOW) | NOG®ID ‘s e =243 { & 51 8 7S 302 ,
) RKER D (RUACH) | ) | | ) 81D | 11 i
515 2, PE (ReD) | NO BI ! D | | .39 o508 |
Frs ! . ! !
MARKERS, DY RASE (8) I NQO BiD ] NO BID | 5 08 : S 5.24 4.49 l
T5: P  MARKER, TRAISPARENCY noBsD |8 249 . , 4.09 1_0_2
T561 150 MOISTNER, ENVELOPE NO BID $ 0.96 | $ 1.28 | $ 1.63 NO BID
565 150 MOISTNER, FINGERTIP NO BID 5 057 $ 0.98 | $ 1.79 0.99
1570 | 5,000 NOTEBOOK, SPIRAL $ 0.52 NO BID $ 051 s 0.52 0.59
T571 40 NOTES, POP-UP (4"X4") NEON e 12,45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
T572 20 NOTES, POP-UP (4"X4") YELLOW | $ 1245|  NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
T573 150 NOTES, POP-UP (NEON) $ 672 [0 63| ¢ 12.65 | 11.99 5.90
T574 50 NOTES, POP-UP (YELLOW) NO BID 5 5 11.25 | 1.59 9.96
T575 50 NOTES, POP-UP DISPENSER (3"X3") NO BID 5 $ 4.90 | ¢ 9.39 421
T576 20 NOTES, POP-UP DISPENSER (4°X4") | $ 11.59 | § NO BID $ 20.79 NO BID
T577 100 NOTES, POST-IT (1 3/8"x1 7/8") NO BID $ 3.63 | $ 132 | 8 3ol s
T578 150 NOTES, POST-IT (2 7/8"x2 7/8") NO BID $ 8.94 | $ 2.88 | $ 4.19 2.47
T579 30 NOTES, POST-IT (2 7/8"x 4 7/8") NO BID $ 11.34 | $ 1288 % 9.19 _ EE
T580 40 NOTES, POST-IT (4"X6") NO BID $ 18.45 | $ 188 s 11.16 NO BID
T581 200 NOTES, POST-IT (1 3/8"x1 7/8") NO BID 5 453 | $ 5.53 | $ 5.34 4.75
T582 100 NOTES, POST-IT (2 7/8"x2 7/8") NO BID 5 421 | ¢ 553 | $ 13.11 4.59

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE SHADED AREA(S) REFLECTS THE RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)

TABULATION SHEET PAGE 4 OF 7
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 130625
OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES

l‘ PYRAMID

ITEM NOLANS OFFICE SCHOOL SCHOOL

NO ESC ON PRODUCTS | QUILL SPECIALTY OFFICE DEPOT PRODUCTS
! ‘ N ( | : A ; ' :

: | o —l et —c
! 1 & T (BLUE RID 1 < 1 I “ ) 17.93 ).84
l T701 | N, ST [ (RED) | ¢ | o 061 s
| 710 o . P s o
| 715 |  TWO HCLE PAPE IS s 1583]s 97916 716
[7 1717 _!_ PUNCH, THREE HOLE PAPER BID s 11.12 1763 |$ 1629 $ 12.60

T725 REMOVER, STAPLE NO BID S 0.30 | S 0.23 | % 0.24 | & 0.20

T825 | 2,500 RULER, PLASTIC NO BID 5 0.15 | $ $

T830 400 RULER, WOODEN NO BID $ 0.16 | $ $

T840 300 SCISSORS NO BID NO BID $ $

T848 200 SHARPENER, ELECTRIC PENCIL $ 10.19 | $ 13.41 | $ $

T849 50 SHARPENER, ELECTRIC PENCIL NO BID $ 94.68 | $ 117.40 | $

T850 150 SHARPENER, PENCIL NO BID NO BID NO BID :

T855 50 SHARPENER, PENCIL NO BID $ 6.75 | $ 7.11 | $ 8.20 | $ 6.19

T860 1,000 SHEARS, OFFICE NO BID NO BID $ 6.60 | $ 305|$ 165

T870 600 STAPLER ‘ TG 4.05 | 5.46 | $ 14.49 | $ 3.08

T872 30 STAPLER, ELECTRIC $ 35.00 | § 34.70 | 47.59 | $ 36.24 | $ 36.71

T873 50 STAPLES, ELECTRIC STAPLER NO BID $ 112 | 1.83 | $ 2.41 |i58 1.09

T875 | 1,100 STAPLES $ 047 | $ 0.59 | 0.58 | 0.18 | $ 0.49

T880 300 POWER, STRIP NO BID 5 786 | ¢ 13.76 | $ 8.68 | $ 8.29

T905 600 TAPE, ADDING MACHINE NO BID $ 25.70 | $ 034 | 3 0.44 | $ 0.39

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE SHADED AREA(S) REFLECTS THE RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)

TABULATION SHEET PAGE 6 OF 7
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