Milk and Bread RFP for Prospering Pals Cooperative (Price Comparisons) 2007-08

Milk Price Comparison

Schepp's 06 - '07

Schepp's '0/7-'08

Oak Farm's '07/-

Product Packaging Unit of Measure _ [Prices Bid Prices '08 Bid Prices

Whole White Milk Plastic Gallon 2.7500 3.1500 3.1500
2% White Milk Plastic Gallon 2.7500 3.1500 3.1500
2% White Milk Paper Half Pint 0.2196 0.2426 0.2426
1% White Milk Paper Half Pint 0.2196 0.2426 0.2426
Fat Free Chocolate Milk Paper Half Pint no bid 0.2426 0.2426
1% Chocolate Milk Paper Half Pint 0.2196 0.2426 0.2426
Skim White Milk Paper Half Pint 0.2196 0.2426 0.2426
Skim White Milk Plastic Half Pint 0.2675 0.2905 0.2905
1% White Milk Plastic Half Pint 0.2675 0.2905 0.2905
1% Chocolate Milk Plastic Half Pint 0.2675 0.2905 0.2905
1% Strawberry Milk Plastic Half Pint 0.2675 0.2905 0.2905
Lactose Free Milk Paper 8 oz no bid 0.4800 0.4800
1% Strawberry Milk Plastic Pint 0.7200 0.7700 0.7700
2% White Milk Plastic Pint 0.7200 0.7700 0.7700
1% Chocolate Milk Plastic Pint 0.7200 0.7700 0.7700
1% Buttermilk Plastic Half Gallon 1.5500 1.8500 1.8500
Half & Half Paper Quart 1.2500 1.3900 1.3900
Whipping Cream, Fresh Paper Quart 2.6500 2.9900 2.9900
Sour Cream 5# no bid 6.2500 6.2500
Cottage Cheese, 4% Small Curd 54 6.7500 7.2500 7.2500
Ice Cream Mix, 3.3% Chocolate  |9/case Half Gallon 1.8500 2.0500 2.0500
Ice Cream Mix, 3.5% Vanilla 9/case Half Gallon 1.8500 2.0500 2.0500
Hershey's Shake, Cookies 'n Crean|12/case 14 fl oz no bid 1.0500 1.0500
Hershey's Shake, Strawberry 12/case 14 fl oz no bid 1.0500 1.0500
Vita Fresh Juice, Orange 4 0z no bid 0.1795 0.1795
Vita Fresh Juice, Grape 40z 0.1550 0.1795 0.1795
Vita Fresh Juice, Apple 4 0z 0.1550 0.1795 0.1795




Bread Price Comparison

Mrs. Baird's '06-

Sara Lee '07-'08

Product Count Per Pack |'07 Prices Bid Prices
1.5# Texas Slice 15 slices 1.10/loaf 1.12/loaf
1.5# Wheat Sandwich 22 slices 1.10/loaf 1.10/loaf

4 inch White Bun 12 count .0875/bun .1217/bun
4 inch Wheat Bun .1738/bun .1925/bun
4 inch Sesame Seed Bun .0979/bun .1463/bun
6 inch Hot Dog Buns .0875/bun .1069/bun
6" Hoagie Roll .1531/bun .1783/bun




