
Qty Brand Item Price Total Price Total Price Total
2 Zildjian 18" Symphonic Viennese pair $453.38 $906.76 $679.95 $1,359.90 $419.43 $838.86
1 Zildjian 20" K Constantinople Special Selection pair $863.36 $863.36 $1,219.95 $1,219.95 $798.71 $798.71
1 Zildjian 18" Symphonic French pair $453.38 $453.38 $679.95 $679.95 $419.43 $419.43
2 Zildjian 20" K Constantinople Suspended $429.36 $858.72 $609.95 $1,219.90 $397.20 $794.40
1 Adams Revolution Copper Timpani-set of 5 $18,284.00 $18,284.00 $19,219.95 $19,219.95 No Bid No Bid
1 Musser 2.5 Octave Classic Bells $1,300.11 $1,300.11 $1,554.95 $1,554.95 $2,342.33 $2,342.33
1 Yamaha 4.3 Acoustalon Marimba $5,562.54 $5,562.54 $5,724.95 $5,724.95 $6,219.99 $6,219.99
2 Pageantry InnovationsGong Cart $1,350.00 $2,700.00 $950.00 $1,900.00 $950.00 $1,900.00
1 Paiste 36" Symphonic Gong No Bid No Bid $2,729.00 $2,729.00 No Bid No Bid
2 Dixon Cymbal Cradle $99.99 $199.88 $103.99 $207.98 No Bid No Bid
1 Yamaha 3.5 Acoustalon Xylo on Frame $4,018.03 $4,018.03 $4,189.95 $4,189.95 No Bid No Bid
1 Yamaha 4.5 Acoustalon Marimba $10,422.11 $10,422.11 $10,919.95 $10,919.95 $11,675.86 $11,675.86
5 Majestic Rolling Bell/Accessory Table $352.91 $1,764.55 $514.95 $2,574.75 $462.00 $2,310.00
2 Pearl Timpani Throne $384.66 $769.32 $464.95 $929.90 449.99 449.99
2 Yamaha Silver Studio Vibe on Multi Frame $6,010.84 $12,021.68 $6,189.95 $12,379.90 No Bid No Bid
1 Zildjian High Octove Crotales w case and mounting bar No Bid No Bid $2,295.95 $2,295.95 No Bid No Bid
1 Zildjian Low Octove Crotales w case and mounting bar No Bid No Bid $2,295.95 $2,295.95 No Bid No Bid
1 Ludwig 10/12/13/14 Ludwig Concert Tom Set with LAP441TS stand - Black Cortex$1,455.63 $1,455.63 $1,739.95 $1,739.95 No Bid No Bid
1 Ludwig 6" & 8" Ludwig Concert Tom Set with LAP441TS stand - Black Cortex $732.91 $732.91 $879.95 $879.95 No Bid No Bid
1 Ludwig 15" & 16" Ludwig Concert Tom Set with LAP441TS stand - Black Cortex $809.71 $809.71 $969.95 $969.95 No Bid No Bid

5 Yamaha Tubas with Cases $7,492.00 $37,460.00 No Bid No Bid $9,608.54 $48,042.70
5 Yamaha Mellophones - Silver $1,753.00 $8,767.15 No Bid No Bid $2,084.15 $10,420.75
5 Holton French Horns - Nickel Silver $3,427.27 $17,136.35 No Bid No Bid $3,999.61 $19,998.05
4 Yamaha Trombones - F Attachment $1,707.26 $6,829.04 No Bid No Bid $1,928.49 $7,713.92
3 Yamaha Trumpets - Xeno - Silver $2,646.05 $7,938.15 No Bid No Bid $2,987.87 $8,963.61
2 Yamaha Bass Clarinets $2,295.16 $4,590.32 No Bid No Bid $2,728.05 $5,456.10
2 Yamaha Saxophones - Alto $2,966.17 $5,932.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Schilke Trombones Small Shank Mouthpieces $93.31 $373.24 No Bid No Bid $85.33 $341.32
8 Vandoren Clarinet Mouthpieces $115.44 $923.52 No Bid No Bid $133.61 $1,068.88
4 Selmer Saxophone Mouthpieces $193.24 $772.96 No Bid No Bid $239.00 $956.00
4 Yamhaa Bass Clarinet Mouthpieces $36.71 $146.84 No Bid No Bid $43.86 $175.44
4 Schilke Trumpet Mouthipieces $71.77 $287.08 No Bid No Bid $111.67 $446.68

12 Legere Bb Clarinet Reeds $26.87 $322.44 No Bid No Bid $26.40 $292.80
8 Legere Alto Saxophone Reeds $25.76 $206.08 No Bid No Bid $26.40 $211.20
2 Legere Bari Sax Reeds $22.16 $44.32 No Bid No Bid $29.64 $59.28
4 Legere Bass Clarinet Reeds $30.05 $120.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Yamaha Low Reed Neck Straps $14.67 $58.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Award Amounts $149,249.08 $9,220.90 $2,851.40
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