Denton Independent School District

Classroom Display and AV Refresh Project Purchase Quotes
December 10, 2019

Item Description Vendor Qty Unit Price Total Vendor Qty Unit Price Total Vendor Qty Unit Price Total Vendor Qty Unit Price Total
Prime Delcom Pathway ProComputing
Systems
Option A:
Epson 1485Fi-based system 1,156 3,407.00 | $ 3,938,492.00 1,156 2,29885 | § 2,657,470.60 1,156 | $ 1,833.00 | $ 2,118,948.00 1,156 | § 2,694.00 | $ 3,114,264.00
Epson Projector Mount 1,156 99.00 | § 114,444.00 1,156 1,156 | $ 76.00 | $ 87,856.00 1,156 | $ 98.00 | $ 113,288.00
Epson Whiteboard 1,156 646.00 | § 746,776.00 1,156 1,156 | $ 512.00 | $ 591,872.00
Mooreco Whiteboard 1,156 1,156 531.11 18 613,963.16 1,156 | $ 485.00 | $ 560,660.00
Over the board bracket 1,156 | $ 190.00 | $ 219,640.00 1,156 | $ 85.00 | $ 98,260.00
Roemtech 350 H Speakers 1,156 254.00 | $ 293,624.00 1,156 170.59 | $ 197,202.04 1,156 $ 190,740.00 1,156 | $ 168.00 | $ 194,208.00
Quam Lay in Ceiling Mount Speaker 2,312 6120 $ 141,494.40 2,312 622118 143,829.52 2,312 $ 110,976.00 2312 $ 59.00 | $ 136,408.00
Electrical cabling (1 duplex recepticle with 2 outlets) $ 121,558.50 $ 192,670.52 $ 197,676.00 1,156 | $ 145.00 | $ 167,620.00
Network Drops $ 357,408.00 2,312 195.00 | $ 450,840.00 $ 357,600.00 2312 8 175.00 | $ 404,600.00
Cables $ 711,417.60 $ 154,487.40 $ 285,873.00 1,156 | $ 275.00 | $ 317,900.00
Raceway 175 $ 15,887.00
Installation $ 442,185.00 $ 1,127,812.99 $ 999,940.00 1,156 | § 375.00 | $ 433,500.00
Misc. Installation Materials $ 126,004.00
Relocation and Disposal of Existing Equipment $ 23,120.00
Shipping and Handling $ 14,159.00
TOTAL OPTION A $ 6,867,399.50 $ 5,538,276.23 $ 5,340,291.00 $ 5,540,708.00
Option B: NO BID
Epson 1485Fi-based system 1,156 1,156 2,29885 | § 2,657,470.60 1,156 $ 2,118,948.00 1,156 | § 2,694.00 | $ 3,114,264.00
Epson Projector Mount 1,156 1,156 1,156 $ 87,856.00 1,156 | § 98.00 | § 113,288.00
Epson Whiteboard 1,156 1,156 S31.11 | § 613,963.16 1,156 $ 591,872.00 1,156 | § 485.00 | § 613,963.16
Over the board bracket 1,156 | $ 85.00|$ 98,260.00
Extron WallVault System 1,156 1,156 1,994.95 | $ 2,306,162.20 1,156 $ 2,413,561.00 1,156 | § 1,975.00 | $ 2,283,100.00
Misc. Installation Materials $ 119,068.00
LL for PVS 407D Audio Decoding 1,156 | § - $ -
AV Associate Online Training Program 6 $ - $ -
Control Specialist Instructor 6 $ - $ -
GVCCS - GlobalViewer Campus 1 $ - $ -
Communication Suite
Network Management of Bells, PA, and 1 $ - $ -
Intercom Systems
USB - Plenum Ac3ve USB In-wall cabling Kit 1,156 | $ 60.00 69,360.00
Electrical cabling (1 duplex recepticle with 2 outlets) 1,156 1,156 $ 385,341.04 $ 197,676.00 1,156 | $ 145.00 | $ 167,620.00
Network Drops 2,312 2,312 195.00 | § 450,840.00 $ 357,600.00 2312 $ 175.00 404,600.00
Cables $ 90,674.16 $ 51,990.00
Raceway $ 15,887.00
Installation $ 1,314,279.42 $ 1,064,940.00 1,156 | $ 375.00 | $ 433,500.00
Relocation and Disposal of Existing Equipment $ 23,120.00
Shipping and Handling $ 42,837.00
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TOTAL OPTION B $ 7,818,730.58 $ 7,085,355.00 $ 7,297,955.16
Option C: NO BID NO BID
Vivitek Novo Touch 75” w/NovoPro Android Module 1,150 1,150 $ 8,306,450.00 1,150 | $ 2,595.00 | $ 2,984,250.00
Chief Over-the Whiteboard Interactive Display Mount 1,150 1,150 $ 218,500.00 1,150 | $ 12500 | $ 143,750.00
Epson 1485Fi-based system 6 6 $ 10,998.00 6 |$  2,694.00 S 16,164.00
Epson Projector Mount 6 6 $ 456.00 6 $ 98.00 | § 588.00
Epson Whiteboard 6 6 $ 3,072.00 6 $ 485.00 | $ 2,910.00
Over the board bracket 6 $ 85.00 | $ 510.00
Roemtech 350 H Speakers 1,156 1,156 $ 254,874.88 1,156 | § 168.00 | $ 194,208.00
Quam Lay in Ceiling Mount Speaker 2,312 2,312 $ 110,976.00 2312 $ 59.00 | $ 136,408.00
Electrical cabling (1 duplex recepticle with 2 outlets) 1,156 $ 197,676.00 1,156 | $ 145.00 | $ 167,620.00
Network Drops 2,312 $ 357,600.00 2312 $ 175.00 | $ 404,600.00
Cables $ 285,873.00 1,156 | $ 275.00 | $ 317,900.00
Raceway $ 15,887.00
Misc. Materials $ 130,232.00
Installation $ 626,190.00 1,156 | $ 375.00 | $ 433,500.00
Relocation and Disposal of Existing Equipment $ 23,120.00
Shipping and Handling $ 290,820.00
TOTAL OPTION C $ 10,832,724.88 $ 4,802,408.00
Option D: NO BID NO BID
Vivitek Novo Touch 75” w/NovoPro Android Module 1,150 1,150 $ 8,306,450.00 1,150 | $ 2,595.00 | $ 2,984,250.00
Chief Over-the Whiteboard Interactive Display Mount 1,150 1,150 $ 218,500.00 1,150 | $ 125.00 | $ 143,750.00
Epson 1485Fi-based system 6 6 $ 10,998.00 6 [$  2694.00]$ 16,164.00
Epson Projector Mount 6 6 $ 456.00 6 $ 98.00 | $ 588.00
Epson Whiteboard 6 6 $ 3,072.00 6 $ 485.00 | $ 2,910.00
Over the board bracket 6 $ 85.00 [ $ 510.00
Extron Wall Vault 1,156 1,156 $ 2,413,561.00 1,156 | § 1,975.00 | $ 2,283,100.00
Misc. Installation Materials $ 123,296.00
LL for PVS 407D Audio Decoding 1,156 | $ - $ -
AV Associate Online Training Program 6 $ - $ -
Control Specialist Instructor 6 $ - $ -
GVCCS - GlobalViewer Campus 1 $ - $ -
Communication Suite
Network Management of Bells, PA, and 1 $ - $ -
Intercom Systems
USB - Plenum Ac3ve USB In-wall cabling Kit 1,156 | § 60.00 69,360.00
Electrical cabling (1 duplex recepticle with 2 outlets) 1,156 $ 197,676.00 1,156 | $ 145.00 | $ 167,620.00
Network Drops 2,312 $ 357,600.00 2312 $ 175.00 404,600.00
Cables $ 51,990.00
Raceway $ 15,887.00
Installation $ 692,990.00 1,156 | $ 375.00 | $ 433,500.00
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Relocation and Disposal of Existing Equipment $ 23,120.00
Shipping and Handling $ 319,498.00
TOTAL OPTION D $ 12,735,094.00 $ 6,506,352.00
Option E: NO BID NO BID
Promethean ActivePanel Titanium 75" 1,150 1,150 $ 6,360,650.00 1,150 | § 2,445.00 [ $ 2,811,750.00
ActivConnect OPS-G series Android Module 1,150 1,150 $ 278,300.00 1,150 | $ 135.00 | $ 155,250.00
1,150 1,150 $ 218,500.00 1,150 | § 125.00 | § 143,750.00
Chief Over-the Whiteboard Interactive Display Mount
Epson 1485Fi-based system 6 6 $ 10,998.00 6 $ 2,694.00 | $ 16,164.00
Epson Projector Mount 6 6 $ 456.00 6 $ 98.00 | $ 588.00
Epson Whiteboard 6 6 $ 3,072.00 6 $ 475.00 | $ 2,850.00
Over the board bracket 6 $ 1,140.00 6 $ 85.00 | $ 510.00
Roemtech 350H Audio Amplifier 1,156 1,156 $ 254,874.88 1,156 | $ 155.00 | § 179,180.00
Quam Lay in Ceiling Mount Speaker 2,312 2,312 $ 110,976.00 2312 $ 59.00 | § 136,408.00
Electrical cabling (1 duplex recepticle with 2 outlets) 1,156 $ 197,676.00 1,156 | § 145.00 | $ 167,620.00
Network Drops 2,312 $ 357,600.00 2312 (8 175.00 | $ 404,600.00
Cables $ 285,873.00 1,156 | § 275.00 | $ 317,900.00
Raceway $ 15,887.00
Misc. Materials $ 135,982.00
Installation $ 626,190.00 1,156 | § 375.00 | $ 433,500.00
Relocation and Disposal of Existing Equipment $ 23,120.00
Shipping and Handling $ 284,555.00
TOTAL OPTION E $ 9,165,849.88 $ 4,770,070.00
Option F: NO BID NO BID
Promethean ActivePanel Titanium 75" 1,150 1,150 | $ 5,531.00 | $ 6,360,650.00 1150 |$ 2,410.00 [ $ 2,771,500.00
ActivConnect OPS-G series Android Module 1,150 1,150 | $ 242.00 | $ 278,300.00 1150 |$ 135.00 | $ 155,250.00
1,150 1,150 | $ 190.00 | $ 218,500.00 1150 |$ 125.00 | $ 143,750.00
Chief Over-the Whiteboard Interactive Display Mount
Epson 1485Fi-based system 6 6 $ 10,998.00 6 $ 2,694.00 | $ 16,164.00
Epson Projector Mount 6 6 $ 456.00 6 $ 98.00 | $ 588.00
Epson Whiteboard 6 6 $ 3,072.00 6 $ 475.00 | $ 2,850.00
Over the Board Bracket 6 $ 1,140.00 6 $ 75.00 | $ 450.00
Extron Wall Vault System 1,156 1,156 $ 2,413,561.00 1,156 | § 1,925.00 [ $ 2,225,300.00
Misc. Installation Materials $ 129,046.00
LL for PVS 407D Audio Decoding 1,156 | § - $ =
AV Associate Online Training Program 6 $ - $ -
Control Specialist Instructor 6 $ - $ -
GVCCS - GlobalViewer Campus 1 $ - $ -
Communication Suite
Network Management of Bells, PA, and 1 $ - $ -
Intercom Systems
USB - Plenum Ac3ve USB In-wall cabling Kit 1,156 | $ 60.00 | $ 69,360.00
Electrical cabling (1 duplex recepticle with 2 outlets) 1,156 $ 197,676.00 1,156 | $ 145.00 | $ 167,620.00
Network Drops 2,312 $ 357,600.00 2312 $ 175.00 | $ 404,600.00
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Cabling $ 51,990.00
Raceway $ 15,887.00
Installation $ 689,600.00 1,156 | $ 375.00 | $ 433,500.00
Relocation and Disposal of Existing Equipment $ 23,120.00
Shipping and Handling $ 313,233.00
TOTAL OPTION F $ 11,064,829.00 $ 6,390,932.00
Option G NO BID NO BID
Clear Touch75" 6000U Series Interactive Panel with USB L1SO S 2452601 § 2,820,490.00 1,156 $ 2,779,550.00
HID / AGG / 20 points of Touch Untrral HD
Chief Over-the-Whiteboard Interactive Display Mount or 1,150 | $ 200.00 | $ 230,000.00 1,156 $ 218,500.00
Equivalent Product
BL1485Fi Projector 6 $ 3,156.90 | $ 18,941.40 6 $ 10,998.00
BL1485Fi Projector Mount 6 $ 99.00 | $ 594.00 6 $ 456.00
Epson Whiteboard OR Mooreco Whiteboard 6 $ 646.00 | $ 3,876.00 6 $ 3,072.00
Over the Board Bracket 6 $ 1,140.00
Roemtech 350H Audio Amplifier 1,156 | $ 254.00 | $ 293,624.00 1156 $ 254,874.00
Quam Lay-In Ceiling Mount Speaker (80hm) 2312 | $ 61.20|§ 141,494.40 2,312 $ 110,976.00
Electrical cabling (1 duplex recepticle with 2 outlets) $ 121,588.50 $ 197,676.00
Network Drops $ 357,408.00 $ 357,600.00
Cables $ 711,417.60 $ 285,873.00
Raceway $ 15,887.00
Misc. Materials $ 118,732.00
Relocation and Disposal of Existing Equipment $ 23,120.00
Shipping and Handling $ 13,431.00
Installation $ 364,350.00 $ 622,800.00
TOTAL OPTION G $ 5,063,783.90 $ 5,014,685.00
Option H NO BID NO BID NO BID
Clear Touch75" 6000U Series Interactive Panel with USB 1,150 1,156 $ 2,779,550.00
/ AGG /20 points of Touch Untrral HD
Chief Over-the-Whiteboard Interactive Display Mount or 1,150 1,156 $ 218,500.00
Equivalent Product
BL1485Fi Projector 6 6 $ 10,998.00
BL1485Fi Projector Mount 6 6 $ 456.00
Epson Whiteboard OR Mooreco Whiteboard 6 6 $ 3,072.00
Over the Board Bracket 6 $ 1,140.00
Extron WallVault System 1,156 1,156 $ 2,413,561.00
Electrical cabling (1 duplex recepticle with 2 outlets) $ 197,676.00
Network Drops $ 357,600.00
Cables $ 51,990.00
Raceway $ 15,887.00
Misc. Installation Materials $ 111,796.00
Relocation and Disposal of Existing Equipment $ 23,120.00
Shipping and Handling $ 42,109.00

4 of 7



Denton Independent School District
Classroom Display and AV Refresh Project Purchase Quotes
December 10, 2019

Installation $ 691,190.00
TOTAL OPTION H $ 6,918,645.00
Option 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tatung 75" 4K, Surface Light Wave Touchscreen, 1,150 $ 2,774,950.00

10 Points of touch
1,150 $ 218,500.00

Chief Over-the-Whiteboard Interactive Display Mount

BL1485Fi Projector 6 $ 10,998.00

BL1485Fi Projector Mount 6 $ 456.00

Epson Whiteboard OR Mooreco Whiteboard 6 $ 3,072.00

6 $ 1,140.00

Chief Over-the-Whiteboard Interactive Display Mount

Roemtech 350H Audio Amplifier 1,156 $ 254,874.88

Quam Lay-In Ceiling Mount Speaker (80hm) 2,312 $ 110,976.00

Electrical cabling (1 duplex recepticle with 2 outlets) $ 197,676.00

Network Drops $ 357,600.00

Cables $ 285,873.00

Raceway $ 15,887.00

Misc. Installation Materials $ 118,732.00

Relocation and Disposal of Existing Equipment $ 23,120.00

Shipping and Handling $ 13,431.00

Installation $ 626,190.00
TOTAL OPTION I $ 5,013,475.88
Option J NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tatung 75" 4K, Surface Light Wave Touchscreen, 1,150 $ 2,774,950.00

10 Points of touch
1,150 $ 218,500.00

Chief Over-the-Whiteboard Interactive Display Mount

BL1485Fi Projector 6 $ 10,998.00

BL1485Fi Projector Mount 6 $ 456.00

Epson Whiteboard OR Mooreco Whiteboard 6 $ 3,072.00

6 $ 1,140.00

Chief Over-the-Whiteboard Interactive Display Mount

Extron WallVault System 1,156 $ 2,413,561.00

Electrical cabling (1 duplex recepticle with 2 outlets) $ 197,676.00

Network Drops $ 357,600.00

Cables $ 51,990.00

Raceway $ 15,887.00

Misc. Installation Materials $ 111,796.00

Relocation and Disposal of Existing Equipment $ 23,120.00

Shipping and Handling $ 42,109.00

Installation $ 691,190.00
TOTAL OPTION J $ 6,914,045.00
Alternate #1 - a NO BID
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35 $ 97474 | $ 34,115.90 35 $ 34,195.00 34 $ 1,075.00 | $ 36,550.00
Epson PowerLite 685W 3LCD Proj 3500 L WXGA 14K:1
HDMI DVI
Ultra Short Throw Wall Mount 35 $ 89.471$ 3,131.45 35 $ 3,360.00 34 $ 98.00 | $ 3,332.00
Extron Digital WallVault System 35 $ 2,01531 (8 70,535.85 35 $ 71,995.00 34 $ 1,925.00 | $ 65,450.00
LL for PVS 407D Audio Decoding 34 |8 - $ -
AV Associate Online Training Program 1 $ - $ -
Control Specialist Instructor 1 $ - $ -
GVCCS - GlobalViewer Campus 1 $ - $ -
Communication Suite
Network Management of Bells, PA, and 1 $ - $ -
Intercom Systems
Electrical $ 5,833.45 $ 5,985.00 34 $ 14500 $ 4,930.00
Network Drop 70 |'$ 195.00 | $ 13,650.00 $ 5,250.00 68 [$ 175001 $ 11,900.00
Cabling $ 204.75 $ 5,320.00
Misc. Installation Materials $ 910.00
Shipping and Handling $ 1,171.00
Installation $ 40,526.85 $ 25,243.00 34 |$ 29500 $ 10,030.00
TOTAL ALT. 1a $ 167,998.25 $ 153,429.00 $ 132,192.00
Alternate #1 - b NO BID
35 $ 974.74 | $ 34,115.90 35 $ 34,195.00 35 $ 1,075.00 | $ 37,625.00
Epson PowerLite 685W 3LCD Proj 3500 L WXGA 14K:1
HDMI DVI
Ultra Short Throw Wall Mount 35 $ 89.471$ 3,131.45 35 $ 3,360.00 35 $ 98.00 | $ 3,430.00
Epson PixiePlus Control System 35 |9$ 197.89 | $ 6,926.15 35 $ - $ -
Roemtech 350H Audio Amplifier 35 $ 170.59 | $ 5,970.65 35 $ 5,775.00 35 $ 235.00 | $ 8,225.00
Quam Lay-In Ceiling Mount Speaker (80hm) 70 $ 62218 4,354.70 70 $ 3,360.00 70 $ 59.00 | $ 4,130.00
Electrical $ 5,833.45 $ 11,970.00 35 $ 145.00 | $ 5,075.00
Network Drop 70 $ 195.00 | $ 13,650.00 $ 5,250.00 70 $ 175.00 | $ 12,250.00
Cabling $ 8,025.80 $ 7,105.00 35 $ 145.00 | $ 5,075.00
Misc. Installation Materials $ 2,345.00
Installation $ 20,173.23 $ 10,500.00 35 $ 295.00 | $ 10,325.00
Shipping and Handling $ 302.67
TOTAL ALT. 1b $ 102,181.33 $ 84,162.67 $ 86,135.00
Alternate #1 - ¢ NO BID
Powerlite 109W Proj WXGA 4000L 718 580.00 [ $ 41,180.00 70 $ 39,830.00 72 |$ 610.00|% 43,920.00
Chief Projector Mount 71 |'$ 157.64 | $ 11,192.44 70 $ 10,710.00
Chief Project Ceiling Plate 718 103.51 1% 7,349.21 70 $ 3,990.00 72 |$ 12500 % 9,000.00
Chief 1' Extension Pole 718 2993 (% 2,125.03 70 $ 1,820.00 72 1% 8500|$ 6,120.00
Extron Digital WallVault System 71 $ 2,01531 |8 143,087.01 70 $ 143,990.00 72 $ 31.00 $ 2,232.00
LL for PVS 407D Audio Decoding 72 [ $1,925.00 | $ 138,600.00
AV Associate Online Training Program 1 $ - $ -
Control Specialist Instructor 1 $ - $ -
GVCCS - GlobalViewer Campus 1 $ - $ -
Communication Suite
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Network Management of Bells, PA, and 1 $ - $ -
Intercom Systems
Electrical $ 11,833.57 $ 11,970.00 72 $ 145.00 | $ 10,440.00
Network Drop 142 |$ 195.00 | $ 27,690.00 $ 10,500.00 144 |§ 175.00 25,200.00
Cabling $ 415.35 $ 1,470.00
Misc. Installation Materials $ 4,550.00
Installation $ 78,115.62 $ 50,486.00 72 $ 295.00 | $ 21,240.00
Shipping and Handling $ 2,328.00
TOTAL ALT. 1c $ 322,988.23 $ 281,644.00 $ 256,752.00
Alternate #1 - d NO BID
Powerlite 109W Proj WXGA 4000L 71 $ 580.00 | § 41,180.00 70 $ 39,830.00 71 $ 610.00 | $ 43,310.00
Chief Projector Mount 71 71 $ 157.64 | $ 11,192.44 70 $ 10,710.00 71 $ 125.00 | $ 8,875.00
Chief Project Ceiling Plate 71 $ 103.51 | $ 7,349.21 70 $ 3,990.00 71 $ 85.00 | § 6,035.00
Chief 1' Extension Pole 71 $ 2993 |$ 2,125.03 70 $ 1,820.00 71 $ 31.00 | § 2,201.00
Epson PixiePlus Control System 71 $ 197.89 | $ 14,050.19 70 $ 12,530.00 71 $ 209.00 | § 14,839.00
Roemtech 350H Audio Amplifier 71 $ 170.59 | $ 12,111.89 70 $ 11,550.00 71 $ 23500 | § 16,685.00
Quam Lay-In Ceiling Mount Speaker (80hm) 142 |§ 62218 8,833.82 140 $ 6,720.00 142 | § 59.00 | § 8,378.00
Electrical $ 11,833.57 $ 11,970.00 71 $ 145.00 | § 10,295.00
Network Drop 142 |$ 195.00 | $ 27,690.00 $ 10,500.00 142 | § 175.00 | § 24,850.00
Misc. Installation Materials $ 4,970.00
Cabling $ 14,322.83 $ 14,210.00 71 $ 145.00 | § 10,295.00
Installation $ 67,640.28 $ 46,550.00 71 $ 295.00 | $ 20,945.00
Shipping and Handling $ 591.00
$ 218,329.26 $ 175,941.00 $ 166,708.00
TOTAL ALT. 1d
Total Prime Sysems Quote - Total Delcom Quote $ - Total Pathway Quote $ 11,499,902.00 Total Procomputing Corp. Quote $ 6,779,876.00
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