



Brownsville Independent School District

Agenda Category: General Function Board of Education Meeting: 10/05/2021

Item Title: Acquisition of Indoor Air Purification Systems for FNS Cafeterias and Kitchens District-wide X Action Information Discussion

BACKGROUND:

In preparation for the return of in person classes for the 2021-2022 school year, Administration performed a market analysis on indoor air purification systems and determined that the use of UV/LED light air purification devices for district-wide use was the best and safest option. On August 3, 2021, the Board approved an initial purchase of 110 units to be placed at each of the nurse's offices and reception areas at each campus. Now Administration is requesting approval, as presented on the Facilities Committee Meeting of September 22, 2021, to purchase additional units to be placed at all campus cafeterias and kitchens. Administration selected the quote method of procurement from district approved cooperatives. Following CH (Local) under the section of Purchasing Authority, the Purchasing Department notified, through our e-Bidding system, all interested cooperative vendors to submit a quote in response to Quote #CWQ 002-22 Indoor Air Purification Systems for FNS Cafeterias and Kitchens District-wide. On August 26, 2021, the quotes were received and opened with 23 vendors responding to the quote. The selection was made based on the best value to the District. Funding will be made through ESSER III funds.

FISCAL IMPLICATIONS:

Categorical Fund 282/ESSER III \$713,741.00 (With Added Value)

RECOMMENDATION:

Recommend approval to award Quote #CWQ 002-22 Indoor Air Purification Systems for FNS Cafeterias and Kitchens District-wide to South Texas Solar Systems of San Antonio, Texas, and to purchase the devices in the amount not to exceed \$713,741.00, with added value. Acquisition to be processed using the Region VIII Education Service Center (TIPS) Cooperative Purchasing, Resolution #009/21-22. Categorical Fund 282/ESSER III.

[Signatures]
Submitted by: Program Director/Purchasing Director

Approved for Submission to Board of Education:

[Signature]
Recommended by: Asst. Supt./CFO

Dr. Nellie Cantu
Approved by: Deputy Superintendent

[Signature]
Dr. René Gutiérrez
Superintendent

When Necessary, Additional Background May Follow This.

Air Purification Systems – Option 1

Option 1 – pay full cost

Cascade (\$5,222)

Jade Units (\$1,799)

3% Cash Back: \$21,412

Free Units: 10

Proposed Purchase of Air Purification Systems - With Value Added Items District Cafeterias						
Campus	Cascade	Unit Cost	Air Purification Units		Unit Cost	Total Cost
			Total	Jade		
High School Total	28	\$ 5,222	\$ 146,216	6	\$ 1,799	\$ 157,010
Middle School Total	27	\$ 5,222	\$ 140,994	3	\$ 1,799	\$ 146,391
Elementary School Total	71	\$ 5,222	\$ 370,762	22	\$ 1,799	\$ 410,340
Total District	126		\$ 657,972	31		\$ 713,741
Value Added Items						
3% Cash Back						\$ 21,412
10 Admin Jades						\$ 17,990
3-Year Distributor Parts Replacement Warranty						?
Additional Lifetime Service Warranty included with purchase of consumables						?
Net Price with Added Value Items						\$ 674,339
Difference when Compared to Discount Version						\$ 3,327

Maintenance Department

BISD Cafeterias

School	Address	Cafeteria Square Feet	Kitchen Square Feet
Aiken Elementary School	6290 Southmost Rd.	7,947	6579
Benavides Elementary School	3101 McAllen Rd.	5,946	3211
Breeden Elementary School	3955 Dana Avenue	7,052	3785
Brite Elementary School	450 S. Browne Ave.	5,582	3730
Burns Elementary School	1974 Alton Gloor Blvd.	5,775	2775
Canales Elementary School	1811 International Blvd.	5,757	2376
Castaneda Elementary School	3201 Lima Street	5,265	3007
Champion Elementary School	4750 Bowie Rd.	6,217	3247
Cromack Elementary School	3200 E. 30th Street	4,416	2764
Del Castillo Elementary School	105 Morningside Rd.	3,528	2027
Egly Elementary School	445 Land O' Lakes	3,542	2013
El Jardin Elementary School	6911 Boca Chica Blvd.	3,542	2377
Gallegos Elementary School	2700 Avenida Rancho Viejo	5,952	3264
Garden Park Elementary School	855 Military Highway	8,022	2977
Garza Elementary School	200 Esperanza Rd.	5,757	3400
Gonzalez Elementary School	4350 Jaime Zapata	5,725	2812
Hudson Elementary School	2980 FM 802	6,582	3175
Keller Elementary School	2540 W. Alton Gloor	6,360	3732
Longoria Elementary School	2400 E. Van Buren Street	4,416	2764
Martin Elementary School	1701 Stanford Avenue	4,416	2764
Morningside Elementary School	1025 Morningside Rd.	6,476	2984
Ortiz Elementary School	2500 West Alton Gloor	6,170	3190
Palm Grove Elementary School	7942 Southmost Rd.	3,729	3029
Paredes Elementary School	3700 Heritage Trail	6,615	3039
Peña Elementary School	4975 Salida de Luna	7,824	3041
Perez Elementary School	2514 Shidler Drive	3,615	2065
Pullam Elementary School	3200 Madrid Avenue	6,308	5611
Putegnat Elementary School	730 E. 8th Street	4,416	2764
Resaca Elementary School	901 Filmore Street	2,444	1290
Russell Elementary School	800 Lakeside Blvd.	4,416	2764
Sharp Elementary School	1439 Palm Blvd	3,452	2377
Skinner Elementary School	411 W. St. Charles Street	4,416	2764
Southmost Elementary School	5245 Southmost Rd.	6,938	3142
Vermillion Elementary School	6895 FM 802	4,569	2027
Victoria Heights Elementary School	2801 E. 13th Street	4,416	2764
Villa Nueva Elementary School	7455 Old Military Rd.	2,444	1290
Yturria Elementary School	2955 West Tandy Rd.	5,549	2989

Maintenance Department

School	Address	Cafeteria Square Feet	Kitchen Square Feet
Besteiro Middle School	6280 Southmost Rd.	7,523	0
Faulk Middle School	2000 Roosevelt Street	5,656	4592
Garcia Middle School	5701 FM 802	6,868	3513
Lucio Middle School	300 N. Vermillion Rd.	6,868	3513
Manzano Middle School	2580 W. Alton Gloor	7,668	5264
Oliveria Middle School	444 Land O' Lakes	6,480	2600
Perkins Middle School	4750 Austin Rd.	7,924	3165
Stell Middle School	1105 Los Ebanos Blvd.	6,120	4593
Stillman Middle School	2977 West Tandy Rd.	8,181	5160
Vela Middle School	4905 Paredes Line	7,924	3165
Hanna High School	2615 Price Rd.	9,865	4930
Lopez High School	3205 South Dakota Avenue	10,139	8760
Pace High School	314 W. Los Ebanos Blvd.	6,189	5131
Porter High School	3500 International Blvd.	6,189	5131
Rivera High School	6955 FM 802	13,838	6713
Veterans Memorial High School	4550 U.S. Military Hwy. 281	17,350	7535
Brownsville Early College H S	343 Ringgold Rd.	4,122	1010
Brownsville Academic Center	3308 Robindale Rd.	5,968	2098
Brownsville Learning Academy/CTE	1800 Cummings Place	708	0
Lincoln Park School	7 Orange Street	1,326	640



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Purchasing Department

To: Gilbert Saenz
South Texas Solar
Systems Inc.

From: Delia Rodriguez, RTSBA, CTPM
Purchasing Coordinator

Date: August 31, 2021

RE: (BAFO) Best and Final Offer for CWQ #002-22
Indoor Air Purification System For FNS Cafeterias &
Kitchens

Please accept this request for a Best and Final Offer. Your company has been qualified as a proposer to the referenced CWQ based on evaluation of your response to the CWQ being judged acceptable or reasonably susceptible to being made acceptable. You are invited to submit your Best and Final Offer for consideration in the award determination.

As part of the BAFO, the proposer may modify the initial offer; update pricing based on any changes the agency has made; and include any inducements that will improve the overall evaluation of the CWQ.

This BAFO must be authenticated by an officer of your company who is authorized to bind the company to the contract. The signature on the transmittal letter for the BAFO will serve as authentication. Transmittal shall be received no later than 9 AM, Wednesday, September 1, 2021.

Should you have any questions regarding this matter, please e-mail to mayala@bisd.us

Delia Rdz

Delia Rodriguez, RTSBA, CTPM
Purchasing Coordinator

To: Brownsville ISD
Delia Rodriguez, Purchasing Coordinator
CWQ#002-22

From: James Hiebert
Aberration Inc DBA South Texas Solar Systems

Please accept this as our best and final offer for Indoor Air Purification Systems.

CASCADES

1. Cascade Air Purifier 130 or more units- Best Offer Price \$4922.00 Each Delivered to BISD
 2. Cascade Air Purifier 130 or more units- Best Offer Price \$5222.00 Each Delivered to BISD
- Includes All added Value

JADES

1. 27 Jade Air Purifier Units-Best offer \$1799.00 includes Delivery
2. 27 Jade Air Purifier Units-Best offer \$1640.00 Includes Delivery

Added Value:

1. 3 year Distributor parts replacement warranty included,
2. Additional Lifetime service warranty included with purchase of consumables.
3. 3% Cash Back
4. 10 Admin Jades for use in admin buildings

Jades for Classrooms

Estimated 3240 Classrooms in BISD

3240 - Jade Units Best offer No additional warranties included \$1595.00 Per unit
-Current Stock levels show 90 day delivery time for 3240 units. We could expedite delivery but would cost \$290.00 per unit

3240 - Jade Units Best Offer with added Value \$1740.00
-Current Stock levels show 90 day delivery time for 3240 units. We could expedite delivery but would cost \$290.00 per unit

Added Value:

1. 3 year Distributor parts replacement warranty included,
2. Additional Lifetime service warranty included with purchase of consumables.
3. 3% Cash Back
4. 10 Admin Jades for use in admin buildings



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

1900 E. Price Road Room #107, Brownsville, Texas 78521
(956) 548-8361 Fax (956) 548-8367

Dr. René Gutiérrez
Superintendent

Rosario Peña, RTSBA
Purchasing Director

Date: September 3, 2021

To: Mrs. Rosario Peña, RTSBA
Purchasing Administrator

From: Marisela Ayala
Purchasing Senior Buyer

Ref: CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchens

The following items are not being recommended to the lowest bidder.

After careful review of the submitted quotes, the Selection Committee has determined by consensus that based on the District's needs the product being offered by South Texas Solar Systems is the "best value" to the district. Out of State vendor were not being considered due to availability of delivery and services.

Vendors did not Bid according to required Specifications:

Item# 1

Bactronix RGV = Unit has Built- In Bi-Polar Ionization

Competitive Choice (Aundrea Young) = Unit coverage of 800 sq. ft.

Everon Green LED and Solar = Unit captures up to 99.9% of particles

Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc. = Unit covers 750 sq. ft.

Item# 2

Competitive Choice (Aundrea Young) = No sq. ft. provided

Everon Green LED and Solar = Unit captures up to 99.9% of particles

Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc. = Unit covers 750 sq. ft.

MSC Industrial Supply = Replacement light not needed for the unit

Out of State Vendors:

Curtis Stout (Curtis H. Stout) = Little Rock AR.
EcoLite Holding LLC (Purge Virus) = Baton, Rouge, LA
Fisher Science Education = Hanover Park, IL
Germinator Mobile Sanitizing = Mustang, OK
Hughes Environmental Inc. = Louisville, KY
IQAIR North America = La Mirada, CA
Med Solutions LLC (Nathan Branch) = Alpharetta, GA
School Specialty = Greenville, WI

BISD does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, disability or genetic information in employment or provision of services, programs or activities.

BISD no discrimina a base de raza, color, origen nacional, sexo, religion, edad, incapacidad o informacion genética en el empleo o la disposición de servicios, programas o actividades.



**Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 6, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchens**

Item# 1 - Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchens (Units to cover up to 1,000 sq. feet)

Vendor	Vendor Local / Not Local	Cooperative	Contract Number	Model	Alternative Model	Pricing	Warranty Offered	Added Value	EBay#s	Warranty/Other	Lights	Warranty/Lights	Comments
Bedrock RV	Mission, TX	TIPS	200601	KiaaraAIR 1000N with Bi-Polar Ionization Built-In		\$1,250.00 Each	Lifetime w/3 Years component defects	Yes	\$ 148.00 Tpy.	Lifetime w/3 Years component defects	\$20.00	Lifetime w/3 Years component defects	Bi-Polar Ionization Built-In
Competitive Choice (Aundrea Young)	Houston, TX	Choice Partners	2000000-03	Air Purifier Mini Lux-JVCAIR Blue		\$600.00 Each	1-Year Warranty	Yes	\$200.00	1-Year Warranty	\$205.01 (includes filters)	1-Year Warranty	Covers 800 sq. ft. does not meet specs
Everon Green LED and Solar	Weslaco, TX	TIPS	200701	TRAC3 Air Purifiers	Meety Air / \$282.50	\$748.00 Each	Lifetime Warranty w/registration within 30 days of purchase	Yes	\$29.00	Lifetime Warranty w/registration within 30 days of purchase	\$897.00	Lifetime Warranty w/registration within 30 days of purchase	Covers up to 85.0% of perimeter
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.	San Antonio, TX	BuyBoard	675-16	TruSens 2-3000 Air Purifier		\$335.17 Each	2 - Year Limited Warranty	Yes	\$78.00	2 - Year Limited Warranty	\$28.11	2 - Year Limited Warranty	Covers 750 sq. ft. does not meet specs
South Texas Solar Systems Inc.	San Antonio, TX	TIPS	210004	A00		\$1,000.00	Manufacturers Warranty: 1 year from date turned on full Replacement 3 year Parts Replacement	Yes	\$127.00	Manufacturers Warranty: 1 year from date turned on full Replacement 3 year Parts	\$97.00	Manufacturers Warranty: 1 year from date turned on full Replacement 3 year Parts	Lifetime Service included when Components are purchased through STSS

Item# 2 - Air Purification System For FNS Cafeterias & Kitchens (Unit to cover up to 2,500 sq. feet)

Vendor	Vendor Local / Not Local	Cooperative	Contract Number	Model	Alternative Model	Pricing	Warranty Offered	Added Value	EBay	Warranty/Other	Lights	Warranty/Lights	Comments
Competitive Choice (Aundrea Young)	Houston, TX	2000000-03	2000000-03	Purifier Mini Lux-JVCAIR Blue		\$1,735.83 Each	1 Year Warranty	Yes	\$264.10	1 Year Warranty	\$117.00	1 Year Warranty	No sq ft provided
Everon Green LED and Solar	Weslaco, TX	TIPS	300701	TRAC3 Air Purifiers	TRAC3 / \$2,600.00	\$4,408.00 Each	Lifetime Warranty w/registration within 30 days of purchase	Yes	\$38.00	Lifetime Warranty w/registration within 30 days of purchase	\$4,178.00	Lifetime Warranty w/registration within 30 days of purchase	Covers up to 85.0% of perimeter
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.	San Antonio, TX	BuyBoard	675-16	TruSens 2-3000 Air Purifier		\$325.11 Each	2 - Year Limited Warranty	Yes	\$78.00	2 - Year Limited Warranty	\$28.11	2 - Year Limited Warranty	Covers 750 sq. ft. does not meet specs
MSC Industrial Supply	Forth Worth, TX	BuyBoard	677-16			\$1,000.00 Each	Limited (5) Year Warranty / 5 yr. w/ reg.		\$170.00	Limited (5) Year Warranty / 5 yr. w/ reg.	\$240.00	Limited (5) Year Warranty / 5 yr. w/ reg.	Replacement light not needed for this unit
South Texas Solar Systems Inc.	San Antonio, TX	TIPS	210004	JADE		\$5,322.00	Manufacturers Warranty: 1 year from date turned on full Replacement 3 year Parts Replacement	Yes	\$141.00	Manufacturers Warranty: 1 year from date turned on full Replacement 3 year Parts Replacement	\$80.00	Manufacturers Warranty: 1 year from date turned on full Replacement 3 year Parts Replacement	Lifetime Service included when Components are purchased through STSS



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

1 Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias Kitchens Units to cover up to 1,000 sq. feet						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Recommendation	
Red Barn TK, LLC	500	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	See attached Memorandum	
Fisher Science Education (Fisher Scientific Co LLC (Fisher Science Education Business Unit))	500	EA	\$253.91	\$126,955.00	See attached Memorandum	
[ALT1] Everon Green LED and Solar (Everon Green Energy Resources LLC)	500	EA	\$292.50	\$146,250.00	See attached Memorandum	
Med Solutions LLC (Nathan Branch)	500	EA	\$305.00	\$152,500.00	See attached Memorandum	
Hughes Environmental, Inc.	500	EA	\$309.00	\$154,500.00	See attached Memorandum	
Complete Supply Inc	500	EA	\$320.89	\$160,445.00	See attached Memorandum	
Gateway Painting & Office Supply, Inc.	500	EA	\$325.11	\$162,555.00	See attached Memorandum	
Hand Safety, LLC	500	EA	\$383.40	\$191,700.00	See attached Memorandum	
School Specialty, Inc.	500	EA	\$515.09	\$257,545.00	See attached Memorandum	
Chemical Response	500	EA	\$529.00	\$264,500.00	See attached Memorandum	
[ALT1] Joe W. Fly Co., Inc. (JF Filtration Inc.)	500	EA	\$595.00	\$297,500.00	See attached Memorandum	
Curtis Stout (Curtis H. Stout)	500	EA	\$628.00	\$314,000.00	See attached Memorandum	
MSC Industrial Supply	500	EA	\$650.00	\$325,000.00	See attached Memorandum	
competitive choice (Aundrea Young)	500	EA	\$699.66	\$349,830.00	See attached Memorandum	
Everon Green LED and Solar (Everon Green Energy Resources LLC)	500	EA	\$749.00	\$374,500.00	See attached Memorandum	
IQAIR NORTH AMERICA	500	EA	\$854.05	\$427,025.00	See attached Memorandum	
Genipator Mobile Sanitizing	500	EA	\$865.00	\$432,500.00	See attached Memorandum	
[ALT1] Red Barn TK, LLC	883	EA	\$499.00	\$440,617.00	See attached Memorandum	
R&R Distributors	500	EA	\$999.00	\$499,500.00	See attached Memorandum	
Office Depot, Inc.	500	EA	\$1,072.29	\$536,145.00	See attached Memorandum	
[ALT1] Office Depot, Inc.	500	EA	\$1,072.29	\$536,145.00	See attached Memorandum	
Bactronix RV	500	EA	\$1,250.00	\$625,000.00	See attached Memorandum	
Ecobite Holding LLC (Purge Virus)	500	EA	\$1,297.00	\$648,500.00	See attached Memorandum	
[ALT1] competitive choice (Aundrea Young)	500	EA	\$1,537.88	\$768,940.00	See attached Memorandum	
Gulf Coast Paper (Gulf Coast Paper a Division of Imperial Dade)	500	EA	\$1,692.00	\$846,000.00	See attached Memorandum	
[ALT1] Gulf Coast Paper (Gulf Coast Paper a Division of Imperial Dade)	500	EA	\$1,692.00	\$846,000.00	See attached Memorandum	
Joe W. Fly Co., Inc. (JF Filtration Inc.)	500	EA	\$1,757.00	\$878,500.00	See attached Memorandum	
South Texas Solar Systems Inc (Aberration Inc)	500	EA	\$1,899.00	\$949,500.00	Recommended	
Bougamillas Construction, LLC	500	EA	\$1,950.00	\$975,000.00	Recommended	



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

2 Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias Kitchens					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	
Red Barn TK, LLC	4	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	See attached Memorandum
Hughes Environmental, Inc	4	EA	\$309.00	\$1,236.00	See attached Memorandum
Complete Supply Inc	4	EA	\$320.83	\$1,283.56	See attached Memorandum
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.	4	EA	\$325.11	\$1,300.44	See attached Memorandum
Fisher Science Education (Fisher Scientific Co. LLC (Fisher Science Education Business Unit))	4	EA	\$464.84	\$1,859.36	See attached Memorandum
Chemical Response	4	EA	\$529.00	\$2,116.00	See attached Memorandum
[ALT1] Red Barn TK, LLC	5	EA	\$499.00	\$2,495.00	See attached Memorandum
Curtis Stout (Curtis H. Stout)	4	EA	\$792.00	\$3,168.00	See attached Memorandum
Hand Safety, LLC	4	EA	\$967.80	\$3,871.20	See attached Memorandum
MSC Industrial Supply	4	EA	\$1,400.00	\$5,600.00	See attached Memorandum
Med Solutions LLC (Nathan Branch)	4	EA	\$1,650.00	\$6,600.00	See attached Memorandum
competitive choice (Aundrea Young)	4	EA	\$1,735.83	\$6,943.32	See attached Memorandum
Joe W. Fly Co., Inc. (JF Filtration Inc.)	4	EA	\$2,042.00	\$8,168.00	See attached Memorandum
[ALT1] Everal Green LED and Solar (Everal Green Energy Resources LLC)	4	EA	\$2,699.00	\$10,796.00	See attached Memorandum
EcoLife Holding LLC (Purge-Vicus)	4	EA	\$4,090.00	\$16,360.00	See attached Memorandum
[ALT2] Everal Green LED and Solar (Everal Green Energy Resources LLC)	4	EA	\$4,199.00	\$16,796.00	See attached Memorandum
Bougarbilities Construction, LLC	4	EA	\$4,875.00	\$19,500.00	See attached Memorandum
South Texas Solar Systems Inc (Aberration Inc)	4	EA	\$5,322.00	\$21,288.00	Recommended
Everal Green LED and Solar (Everal Green Energy Resources LLC)	4	EA	\$5,499.00	\$21,996.00	
IOAIR NORTH AMERICA	4	EA	\$8,896.99	\$35,587.96	
Bactronix RGV	4	EA	No Bid		
Germinator Mobile Sanitizing	4	EA	No Bid		
R&R Distributors	4	EA	No Bid		
School Specialty, Inc.	4	EA	No Bid		
Gulf Coast Paper (Gulf Coast Paper a Division of Imperial Dade)	4	EA	No Bid		
Office Depot, Inc.	4	EA	No Bid		



**Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen**

3 Filters - FNS Cafeterias for Kitchens / Standard Size					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	
Complete Supply, LLC	500	EA	\$24.83	\$12,415.00	See attached Memorandum
R&R Distributors	500	EA	\$29.00	\$14,500.00	See attached Memorandum
Everon Green LED and Solar (Everon Green Energy Resources LLC)	500	EA	\$29.00	\$14,500.00	See attached Memorandum
[ALT1] Gulf Coast Paper (Gulf Coast Paper a Division of Imperial Dade)	125	EA	\$116.00	\$14,500.00	See attached Memorandum
Corbis Stout (Gurtis H. Stout)	500	EA	\$38.60	\$19,300.00	See attached Memorandum
School Specialty, Inc.	500	EA	\$64.61	\$32,305.00	See attached Memorandum
Hughes Environmental, Inc.	500	EA	\$66.00	\$33,000.00	See attached Memorandum
Med Solutions LLC (Nathan Branch)	500	EA	\$69.00	\$34,500.00	See attached Memorandum
Red Barn TK, LLC	500	EA	\$69.00	\$34,500.00	See attached Memorandum
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.	500	EA	\$78.00	\$39,000.00	See attached Memorandum
Hand Safety, LLC	500	EA	\$79.00	\$39,500.00	See attached Memorandum
[ALT2] Gulf Coast Paper (Gulf Coast Paper a Division of Imperial Dade)	250	EA	\$194.52	\$48,630.00	See attached Memorandum
[MSE] Industrial Supply	500	EA	\$100.00	\$50,000.00	See attached Memorandum
[ALT1] Red Barn TK, LLC	883	EA	\$69.00	\$60,927.00	See attached Memorandum
South Texas Solar Systems Inc (Aberation Inc)	500	EA	\$127.00	\$63,500.00	Recommended
Germinator Mobile Sanitizing	500	EA	\$129.00	\$64,500.00	
Bactonix RGV	500	EA	\$148.50	\$74,250.00	
Office Depot, Inc.	500	EA	\$181.80	\$90,900.00	
[ALT3] Office Depot, Inc.	500	EA	\$181.80	\$90,900.00	
Gulf Coast Paper (Gulf Coast Paper a Division of Imperial Dade)	500	EA	\$194.52	\$97,260.00	
EcoLite Holding LLC (Purge Virus)	500	EA	\$227.25	\$113,625.00	
Fisher Science Education (Fisher Scientific Co LLC (Fisher Science Education Business Unit))	500	EA	\$253.91	\$126,955.00	
Joe W. Fly Co., Inc. (JE Filtration Inc.)	500	EA	\$297.00	\$148,500.00	
competitive choice (Aundrea Young)	500	EA	\$309.40	\$154,700.00	
ICQAIR NORTH AMERICA	500	EA	\$894.05	\$427,025.00	
Chemical Response	500	EA	No Bid		
Bougambillas Construction, LLC	500	EA	No Bid		



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

4	FILTERS - FNS Cafeterias & Kitchens / Medium to Large Size				
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	
Red Barn TK, LLC	4	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	See attached Memorandum
Complete Supply Inc	4	EA	\$24.83	\$99.32	See attached Memorandum
Everon Green LED and Solar (Everon Green Energy Resources LLC)	4	EA	\$39.00	\$156.00	See attached Memorandum
Hughes Environmental, Inc	4	EA	\$66.00	\$264.00	See attached Memorandum
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.	4	EA	\$78.00	\$312.00	See attached Memorandum
[ALT1] Red Barn TK, LLC	5	EA	\$69.00	\$345.00	See attached Memorandum
Curtis Stout (Curtis H. Stout)	4	EA	\$86.40	\$345.60	See attached Memorandum
Med Solutions LLC (Nathan Branch)	4	EA	\$120.00	\$480.00	See attached Memorandum
South Texas Solar Systems Inc (Abetraction Inc)	4	EA	\$141.00	\$564.00	Recommended
MSC Industrial Supply	4	EA	\$170.00	\$680.00	
Hand Safety, LLC	4	EA	\$205.20	\$820.80	
competitive choice (Aundrea Young)	4	EA	\$256.10	\$1,024.40	
Joe W. Fly Co., Inc. (JF Filtration Inc)	4	EA	\$404.00	\$1,616.00	
Fisher Science Education (Fisher Scientific Co LLC (Fisher Science Education Business Unit))	4	EA	\$464.84	\$1,859.36	
Eco Lite Holding LLC (Purge Virus)	4	EA	\$492.98	\$1,969.92	
IQAIR NORTH AMERICA	4	EA	\$8,896.99	\$35,587.96	
Bougamillas Construction, LLC	4	EA	No Bid		
Germinator Mobile Sanitizing	4	EA	No Bid		
R&R Distributors	4	EA	No Bid		
Chemical Response	4	EA	No Bid		
School Specialty, Inc.	4	EA	No Bid		
Gulf Coast Paper (Gulf Coast Paper a Division of Imperial Dade)	4	EA	No Bid		
Office Depot, Inc.	4	EA	No Bid		
Bactronix RGV	4	EA	No Bid		



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

5	LIGHTS - FNS Cafeterias Kitchens				
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	
Med Solutions LLC (Matlab Branch)	500	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	See attached Memorandum
Hughes Environmental, Inc	500	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	See attached Memorandum
MSC Industrial Supply	500	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	See attached Memorandum
Bactronix RGV	500	EA	\$20.50	\$10,250.00	See attached Memorandum
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.	500	EA	\$26.11	\$13,055.00	See attached Memorandum
R&R Distributors	500	EA	\$29.00	\$14,500.00	See attached Memorandum
South Texas Solar Systems Inc (Aberration Inc)	500	EA	\$37.99	\$18,500.00	See attached Memorandum
School Specialty, Inc.	500	EA	\$50.38	\$25,190.00	Recommended
Curtis Stout (Curtis H. Stout)	500	EA	\$51.42	\$25,710.00	
Joe W. Fly Co., Inc. (JF Filtration Inc.)	500	EA	\$90.00	\$45,000.00	
Chemical Response	500	EA	\$108.00	\$50,000.00	
competitive choice (Aundrea Young)	500	EA	\$205.41	\$102,705.00	
Fisher Science Education (Fisher Scientific Co LLC (Fisher Science Education Business Unit))	500	EA	\$253.91	\$126,955.00	
Everon Green LED and Solar (Everon Green Energy Resources LLC)	500	EA	\$897.00	\$448,500.00	
Hand Safety, LLC	500	EA	No Bid		
Complete Supply Inc	500	EA	No Bid		
Red Barn TX, LLC	500	EA	No Bid		
Gulf Coast Paper (Gulf Coast Paper a Division of Imperial Dade)	500	EA	No Bid		
Bougamillas Construction, LLC	500	EA	No Bid		
IOAIR NORTH AMERICA	500	EA	No Bid		
EcoLite Holding LLC (Purge Virus)	500	EA	No Bid		
Office Depot, Inc.	500	EA	No Bid		
Germinator Mobile Sanitizing	500	EA	No Bid		



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

6	LIGHTS - FNS Cafeterias Kitchens				
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	
Hughes Environmental, Inc	4	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	See attached Memorandum
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.	4	EA	\$26.11	\$104.44	See attached Memorandum
Med Solutions LLC (Nathan Branch)	4	EA	\$50.00	\$200.00	See attached Memorandum
South Texas Solar Systems Inc (Aberration Inc)	4	EA	\$89.00	\$356.00	Recommended
Joe W. Fly Co., Inc. (JF Filtration Inc.)	4	EA	\$95.00	\$380.00	
Chemical Response	4	EA	\$100.00	\$400.00	
Curtis Stout (Curtis H. Stout)	4	EA	\$108.00	\$432.00	
competitive choice (Aundrea Young)	4	EA	\$117.00	\$468.00	
MISC Industrial Supply	4	EA	\$240.00	\$960.00	
Fisher Science Education (Fisher Scientific Co LLC (Fisher Science Education Business Unit))	4	EA	\$464.84	\$1,859.36	
Everon Green LED and Solar (Everon Green Energy Resources LLC)	4	EA	\$4,179.00	\$16,716.00	
Bougambillas Construction, LLC	4	EA	No Bid		
Hand Safety, LLC	4	EA	No Bid		
R&R Distributors	4	EA	No Bid		
Complete Supply Inc	4	EA	No Bid		
Office Depot, Inc.	4	EA	No Bid		
Red Barn TX, LLC	4	EA	No Bid		
School Specialty, Inc.	4	EA	No Bid		
JOAIR NORTH AMERICA	4	EA	No Bid		
EcoLite Holding LLC (Purge Virus)	4	EA	No Bid		
Bactronix RGV	4	EA	No Bid		
Gulf Coast Paper (Gulf Coast Paper a Division of Imperial Dade)	4	EA	No Bid		
Germinator Mobile Sanitizing	4	EA	No Bid		



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

<u>Participant Name</u>	<u>Response Date</u>	<u>Response Status</u>	<u>Address</u>	<u>City</u>	<u>State</u>	<u>Zip Code</u>
Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.	08/26/2021	Submitted	14803 Bulverde Rd.	San Antonio	TX	78247
Joe W. Fly Co., Inc. (JF Filtration Inc.)	08/26/2021	Submitted	209 Southgate Dr.	Harlingen	TX	78552
Bactronix RGV	08/26/2021	Submitted	118 S. Shary Rd.	Mission	TX	78572
Curtis Stout (Curtis H. Stout)	08/26/2021	Submitted	2400 Cantrell Road	Little Rock	AR	72202
Hughes Environmental, Inc	08/26/2021	Submitted	908 S 8th St	Louisville	KY	40203
competitive choice (Aundrea Young)	08/26/2021	Submitted	9303 Kirby	Houston	TX	77054
EcoLite Holding LLC (Purge Virus)	08/26/2021	Submitted	7910 Wrenwood Blvd., Ste.B	Baton Rouge	LA	70809
Red Barn TK, LLC	08/26/2021	Submitted	10 Pheasant Hill Road	Weston	CT	06883
IOAIR NORTH AMERICA	08/26/2021	Submitted	14351 Firestone Blvd	La Mirada	CA	90638
Bougambillas Construction, LLC	08/26/2021	Submitted	302 Kings Hwy Suite 204	Brownsville	TX	78520
Gulf Coast Paper (Gulf Coast Paper a Division of Imperial Dade)	08/26/2021	Submitted	635 Billy Mitchell Blvd	Brownsville	TX	78521
MSC Industrial Supply	08/26/2021	Submitted	15600 Trinity Boulevard	Fort Worth	TX	76155
Fisher Science Education (Fisher Scientific Co LLC)	08/26/2021	Submitted	PO Box 404705	Atlanta	GA	30384
Hand Safety, LLC	08/26/2021	Submitted	831 Reynolds Ln	Wichita Falls	TX	76301
Office Depot, Inc.	08/26/2021	Submitted	PO BOX 660	La Feria	TX	78559
Chemical Response	08/26/2021	Submitted	18635 Primera Rd, Unit 1	Harlingen	TX	78552
School Specialty, Inc.	08/26/2021	Submitted	32656 Collection Center Drive	Chicago	IL	60693
Everon Green LED and Solar	08/25/2021	Submitted	2617 Midvalley Dr	Weslaco	TX	78599
Med Solutions LLC (Nathan Branch)	08/25/2021	Submitted	2321 Commerce St	Alpharetta	GA	30009
R&R Distributors	08/25/2021	Submitted	4204 Stillwater CV	Edinburg	TX	78542
Germinator Mobile Sanitizing	08/25/2021	Submitted	1112 N Pheasant Way	Mustang	OK	73064
Complete Supply Inc	08/24/2021	Submitted	1624 W Crosby St #144	Carrollton	TX	75006
Advantage Imaging Supply, Inc.	08/23/2021	No Bid	32234 Paseo Adelanto, Ste.F	San Juan Capistrano	CA	92675
South Texas Solar Systems Inc (Aberration Inc)	08/20/2021	Submitted	10203 Kotzebue St	San Antonio	TX	78217
Unipak Corp.	08/20/2021	No Bid	POB 300027	Brooklyn	NY	11230
1st Choice Restaurant Equipment & Supply, LLC			15018 Tradesman Drive	San Antonio	TX	78249
1UT LLC			38 Creekbend	Brownsville	TX	78521
3C Mechanical Technologies			5774 S. University Parks Drive	Waco	TX	76706
4H General Contractors			3345 S Jones St	Fort Worth	TX	76110
9 TO 5 COMPUTER SUPPLY DIST., INC.			3948 3RD ST SOUTH SUITE 103	JACKSONVILLE BEACH	FL	32250
A Square Mechanical			5674 Ponce Trail	Brownsville	TX	78526
A&W OFFICE SUPPLY			222 S Staples St	Corpus Christi	TX	78401
A1 Facility Services (Alamo 1)			7001 N. 10th Street Suite E.	McAllen	TX	78504
A4 AUTO SUPPLY, INC.			1824 STATE HIGHWAY 100	PORT ISABEL	TX	78578
AACTUM, LLC DBA ECO TONER AUSTIN			16238 Ranch Road 620 Suite F-311	Austin	TX	78717
ABC Supply Co. Inc. Center 065			401 North "T" Street Suite "C"	Harlingen	TX	78566
ABM Education Services			3221 Comal Springs	Canyon Lake	TX	78133
Academy Global Learning			610 Rozelle Ave. Sugar Land, TX	Houston	TX	77498
ACCO Brands USA LLC		Viewed	PO Box 203412	Dallas	TX	75320
Ace Office Supplies (Amitech)			631 Triumph Ct, Unit 5	Orlando	FL	32805
Advanced Blending, Inc.			5230 SE Loop 820	Forest Hill	TX	76140
ADVANCED FILTRATION CONCEPTS, INC.		Viewed	14010 Gracebee Ave	Norwalk	CA	90650
AF CONSTRUCTION & REMODELING, LLC			1030 Ceiba Cr	Brownsville	TX	78521
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC			P O Box 801136	Miami	FL	33280



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

Agape Group	2512 Deer Trl	Brownsville	TX	78521
AGM FOOD (AGM FOOD LLC)	1805 E Ruben M Torres Blvd	Brownsville	TX	78521
Airgas (Airgas USA, LLC)	201 N 23rd ST	McAllen	TX	78501
AKRONROLS LLC	5380 SLEEPY HOLLOW DR	BROWNSVILLE	TX	78526
Alamo Iron Works	2771 Robindale Rd	Brownsville	TX	78526
Alex Enterprises (Av Garza Enterprises, LLC)	1221 N. Illinois Ave	Brownsville	TX	78520
All American Poly	40 Turner Place	Piscataway	NJ	08854
all florida paper	9150 NW 105TH WAY	MIAMI	FL	33178
All Star Trophies & T-Shirts	110 ALVAREZ CT	LOS FRESNOS	TX	78566
Allegheny Paper Shredders Corporation	PO Box 80	Delmont	PA	15626
AIMWorld Language Consultants, Inc.	172 Rollins Avenue	Rockville	MD	20852
Alvarado Architects & Associates, Inc.	307 South Main Street	Donna	TX	78537
AM Utilities and Construction LLC	4195 N. Bryan Road	MISSION	TX	78572
Amalgamated Services, Inc.	21024 S 80th Ave	Frankfort	IL	60423
AMBIENT AIR SYSTEMS LLC	428 Arboleda	Brownsville	TX	78521
Ameresco, Inc.	7929 Brookriver Drive	Dallas	TX	75247
American Abatement LLC	3725	SAN ANTONIO	TX	78211
American Eagle Computer Products	PO BOX 9442	Naperville	IL	60567
American Pride Paper and Plastics LLC	87 Arlington Avenue	Lakewood	NJ	08701
Amigo Workwear (Amigo Workwear LLC)	1521 Beaumont St	McAllen	TX	78501
Anchorage Unlimited	P.O. 543472	Grand Prairie	TX	75054
Another One Logistics	2350 Jensen ct	FORT WORTH	TX	76112
apple specialties	6 old dock road	yaphank	NY	11980
AqualiteUS (North Eastern Industries Inc.)	72 PROGRESS AVENUE	TYNGSBORO	MA	01879
Aquila Environmental	505 Pecan Street	Fort Worth	TX	76109
Araiza General Construction LLC	480B N. Sam Houston Blvd.	San Benito	TX	78586
Aramark Uniforms	101 South Pavilion Circle	West Monroe	LA	71291
ARKIFORM	810 N. Alton	Mission	TX	78573
Armsco (1980)	100 W Texas Ave	WEBSTER	TX	77598
ASPEN Refrigerants, Inc.	38-18 33rd Street	Long Island City	NY	11101
Asset Technologies, LLC	3600 Chamberlain Lane	LOUISVILLE	KY	40241
Automated Logic Contracting Services Inc	200 N McColi Rd, Ste B	McAllen	TX	78501
Award Company of America, LLC	6350 Old Montgomery Hwy	TUSCALOOSA	AL	35403
AYSIS Consulting, LLC	1301 Hackberry Avenue	McAllen	TX	78501
B*Town Realty	803 Old Port Isabel Rd	Brownsville	TX	78521
B2Z Engineering, LLC (Aisha Gonzalez)	900 S. Stewart Rd.	Mission	TX	78572
Babtex Inc, dba Oslin Nation Co.	3701 New York Ave	Arlington	TX	76014
Back2School Texas, LLC	5405 Bandera Rd. Suite 110	San Antonio	TX	78238
Baker Distributing Company	1931 Anei Circle Suite F	Brownsville	TX	78521
Battery Systems Inc	12322 Monarch Street	Garden Grove	CA	92841
BAYSIDE DISTRIBUTING LLC	PO Box 113	Port Isabel	TX	78578
BD Modular Sales and Leasing	5430 Glen Lakes Drive	Dallas	TX	75231
Big Ass Fans (Delta T, LLC)	P.O. Box 638767	Cincinnati	OH	45263
Big Man Fabrication, LLC	PO Box 1117	Raymondville	TX	78580
Biosure North America	30621 Sweetridge Circle	Boerne	TX	78015



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

Blackmon Mooring of San Antonio	4808 Perrin Creek	San Antonio	TX	78217
Blink Marketing Inc (Blink Swag)	1925 St Clair Ave NE STE 100	Cleveland	OH	44114
Blue Sky Supplies (Blue Sky Supplies LLC)	6140 SW University Way	El Paso	TX	79925
BlueScope Group	1608 B Cinnamon Path	Austin	TX	78704
BOX Pure Air (BOX Pure Air, LLC)	145 King St	Charleston	SC	29401
Boydco Holdings LLC	4909 Barnstable Lane	Lansing	MI	49203
BRANDT	6023 CORRIDOR PARKWAY	SCHERTZ	TX	78154
Braun Intertec Corporation	11001 Hampshire Ave S	Minneapolis	MIN	55438
Bright Star Environmental Services	355 W. Elizabeth St	Brownsville	TX	78520
BrightSpring Health Services (Res-Care, Inc.)	805 N Whittington Parkway	Louisville	KY	40222
Brightview Landscaping	0514 South Padre Island Drive #G-00	Corpus Christi	VT	78418
BROWNSVILLE SCRAP PAPER INC	5850 FM 511	Brownsville	TX	78526
Brownsville Sheet Metal Works	1954 S. Price Rd.	Brownsville	TX	78521
Burton Companies (Burton Companies, LLC)	P.O. Box 297	Weslaco	TX	78599
BVI RESOURCES (BEAUTIFUL VENTURES INC)	440 BENMAR DRIVE	HOUSTON	TX	77060
Caliber Sales and Consulting, LLC	8805 Main St	N Richland Hills	TX	76182
Calico Construction and Development LLC	1242 E Bus Highway 83 suite 7	Mission	TX	78572
Calico Packaging, LLC	P.O. Box 392654	Pittsburgh	PA	15251
CAPP USA (CAPP INC)	201 MARPLE AVE	CLIFTON HEIGHTS	PA	19018
Carlisle Insurance (Acrisure LLC)	500 N. Water Street	Corpus Christi	TX	78401
Carrier Corporation	P.o Box 93844	Chicago	IL	60673
Carrier Enterprise, LLC.	3671 FM 802	Brownsville	TX	78526
CATALYST PR INC (Catalyst PR)	1701 N Thompson St	Conroe	TX	77301
CC Distributors, Inc.	210 Mcbride Lane	Corpus Christi	TX	78408
CDW Government, LLC	230 N. Milwaukee Ave	Vernon Hills	IL	60061
Central Air and Heating Service, Inc	3028 Wilson Rd	Harlingen	TX	78552
Central Bolt & Industrial Supplies	404 N. Expressway 83	Brownsville	TX	78520
Central Poly-Bag Corp.	2400 Bedle Place	Linden	NJ	07036
Checkers Construction	5205 Donna dr	Brownsville	TX	78526
Chemsol Services, Inc.	P.O. Box 533207	Harlingen	TX	78553
Cielo Office Products	1408 E. Jasmine Ave.	McAllen	TX	78501
Cima Group	2685 N Coria St	Brownsville	TX	78520
Cintas Corporation #538 (Cintas Corporation)	700 Dawson St	Mercedes	TX	78570
Clary Business Machines (Sufian Munir Inc.)	8170, Miramar Road, San Diego, CA	San Diego	CA	92126
CLC Services Inc.	PO Box 157	Leming	TX	78050
Clean Earth Environmental Solutions	334 South Warminster Road	Haltom	PA	19040
Climate Pros	5510 N. Athol St.	Pharr	TX	78577
Coast To Coast Computer Products, Inc.	4277 Valley Fair Street	Simi Valley	CA	93063
College Thriver Inc	618 E. South Street Suite 500	orlando	FL	32801
Command7, LLC	810 East 9400 South	Salt Lake City	UT	84094
Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service	1377 N. Brazos	San Antonio	TX	78207
Complete Signs,LLC	4200 N. 22nd St. D	MC ALLEN	TX	78501
CONCIERGEpad	10601 SW 73 CT	Miami	FL	33156
ConstructConnect	3825 Edwards Road	Cincinnati	OH	45209
Construction Journal LLC	400 SW 7th Street	Stuart	FL	34994
		Viewed		
		Viewed		



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

CONTINENTAL WIRELESS, INC.	10455 Vista Park Rd	DALLAS	TX	75238
Convergent Technologies LLC (DG Investments Holdings 2, Inc.)	6710 W. Expressway 83	Harlingen	TX	78552
CoolSys Inc. and its Subsidiaries	145 S State College Blvd	BREA	CA	92821
Copy Graphics Inc.	221 North 10th St	McAllen	TX	78501
Copy Plus	4500 N10 Ste.240	McAllen	TX	78504
Core Pacific, Inc.	404 Galveston Rd	Brownsville	TX	78521
CPM Design, LLC	7765 Padre Island Hwy	Brownsville	TX	78522
crawford electric	4536 ruben m torres bld	brownsville	TX	78526
Cromtec Cyber Solutions	16907 Forked lake Drive	Houston	TX	77044
Culligan Water of the Rio Grande Valley	PO Box 1029	San Benito	TX	78586
Curtis 1000	1620 Xanthisma Ave.	McAllen	TX	78504
Cut-E	1221 Ceiba Circle	Brownsville	TX	78521
cwr computer supplies	1606s bowling green dr	cherryhill	NJ	08003
D.H. Pace Company, Inc	825 W Sandy Lake Rd	Coppell	TX	75019
DAB - Three Kings Corp (Three Kings Corp)	3006 HIGHWAY 72	CORINTH	MS	38334
Daikin Applied (Daikin Applied Americas Inc.)	13600 Industrial Park Boulevard	Minneapolis	MN	55441
DANIEL CHARLES	6685 GARDEN WOODS APT 2	BROWNSVILLE	TX	78526
De Kermantles	9250 lake Charles blvd	Los fresnos	TX	78566
De La Cruz Signature Designs (Mario De La Cruz)	2495 Boca Chica Blvd	Brownsville	TX	78526
Demco, Inc (Administrator)	4810 Forest Run Rd	Madison	WI	53704
DEMO CON INC	25224 N Kansas City Rd	La Feria	TX	78559
DERTY SPORTS	802 E. INTERSTATE SUITE E	Pharr	TX	78577
Desi Najera Jr Management Services Inc	400 E Alton Gloor Blvd	Brownsville	TX	78526
Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc.	4109 N. Conway	Palmhurst	TX	78573
Dezvia LLC	PO Box 4444	Mission	TX	78572
Diamond M Sports LLC	330 S Main	Fentress	TX	78622
Diaz Floors & Interiors, Inc.	1205 W. Polk	Pharr	TX	78577
DIGG COMMERCIAL LLC	1405 S FM 973	AUSTIN	TX	78725
Digital Dolphin Supplies	811 North Catalina Ave Suite 1104	Redondo Beach	CA	90277
Digital Print and Advertising	1752 Iris	Brownsville	TX	78526
Dillman and Dillman Consulting	21784 US-77 Frontage Rd	Harlingen	TX	78552
Diltex Inc	1750 W. Cameron Ave.	West Covina	CA	91790
Direct Digital Designs LLC	12111 stoneybridge	san antonio	TX	78247
Discount Glass and Metal	6217 Yera Street	Brownsville	TX	78521
Discount School Supply (Early Childhood LLC)	20 Ryan Ranch Rd	Monterey	CA	93940
Documation, Inc	4560 Lockhill Selma Ste. 100	San Antonio	TX	78249
Dos Naciones Landscaping Services	5290 Villa Bonita Street	Brownsville	TX	78521
DreamRanch Office Supplies (Dream Ranch LLC)	11614 JIM CHRISTAL RD	Krum	TX	76249
Dunbar Security Products	8525 Kelso Drive	Baltimore	MD	21221
DWN Ventures LLC dba Newman Sports Flooring	P O Box 816	Hutto	TX	78634
Dyna Pak	112 Helton Drive	Lawrenceburg	TN	38464
E.J. Wipers International, Inc.	1040 Mexico Boulevard	Brownsville	TX	78520
Eagle One Vendors LLC (GGSEOV)	1254 Paredes Ln Rd	BROWNSVILLE	TX	78520
EarthCo, LLC	1110 W. Jackson Ave	HARLINGEN	TX	78550
Ecolab Inc.	1 Ecolab Place	St. Paul	MN	55102



Board Meeting October 5, 2021

CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

CWQ# 002-22 - Page 7



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

Gopher Sport, Gopher Performance	Unsubmitted	2525 Lemond St. S.W.	Owatonna	MN	55060
Grainger (WW Grainger Inc)		921 East Pecan Blvd.	McAllen	TX	78501
Grande Valle Apparel (Adan Martinez)		22162 farmers ave	San benito	TX	78586
Green Planet, Inc.		6371 State Hwy 276 West	Royse City	TX	75189
green valley sprinklers llc		P.O.BOX 531289	HARLINGEN	TX	78553
Greenwood Office Outfitters		2951 Suffolk Drive	Fort Worth	TX	76133
Grupo GTE (GTE Holdings, LLC)		101 Convention Center Drive, Ste. 901	Las Vegas	NV	89109
GTS Technology Solutions, Inc		3211 Waterford Centre Blvd. Suite 121	Austin	TX	78758
GURO Enterprise LLC		1313 E Alton Gloor suit 1	Brownsville	TX	78526
Hathaspace (HEZE LLC)	Unsubmitted	444 W. Lake st	Chicago	IL	60606
HCDNE International IMPEX LLC		103 Summit Circle	Houston	PA	15342
HDL ENTERPRISES (HERIBERTO LOPEZ)		1015 N. TEXAS BLVD.	WESLACO	TX	78596
Heritage Environmental Services		11890 W IH10	Marion	TX	78124
Heritage-Crystal Clean, LLC		13621 Collections Center Drive	Chicago	IL	60693
Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC		170 Williams Drive, Suite 201	Ramsey	NJ	07446
Highend Advertising		2504 Santa Paula	Mission	TX	78572
Hill Country Med Waste LLC		361 Purple Martin Ave	Kyle	TX	78640
Hillyard, Texas		12871 Wetmore Rd.	San Antonio	TX	78247
HI-LO CONTRACTOR		825 E Alberta Rd.	Edinburg	TX	78539
Hobart Service		701 S. Ridge Ave	Troy	OH	45374
HOME DESIGN CENTER (V&L Enterprises, LLC)		7400 N 10th St, Ste L	McAllen	TX	78504
Honeywell (Honeywell Building Solutions)	Unsubmitted	11220 Bams Trl	Austin	TX	78754
Horizon Enterprises		2906 Baywater Ave	San Pedro	CA	90731
HOSSLEY LIGHTING ASSOCIATES		427 Breesport St	San Antonio	TX	78245
Hydraulic Mudpumps Inc. (HMI)		1025 E Albert Drive	Manitowoc	WI	54220
Hypurist LLC		5962 Greenwood Dr	Brownsville	TX	78526
IdentSys		7630 Commerce Way	Eden Prairie	MN	55344
IKIO LED LIGHTING LLC		8470 Allison Pt Blvd	Indianapolis	IN	46250
ImageLOCK LLC		4732 41 St	Sunnyside	NY	11104
Imagery Graphic Systems		http://imagerygraphic.com	San Antonio	TX	78217
Imperial Electric Motor		905 E. Tyler St.	Brownsville	TX	78520
Imperial Supplies LLC		PO Box 5362	Janesville	WI	53547
IMS Dodge (IMS)		945 Hornblend	San Diego	CA	92109
Industrial Air Solutions LLC		509 Tula Ave	Weslaco	TX	78596
Industrial Soap Company		9150 Latty Ave	Saint Louis	MO	63134
Inscos Distributing		224 Industrial Dr.	Brownsville	TX	78520
Insul-Tech (Insulation Technologies, Inc.)		120 Herman Dr.	Belle Chasse	LA	70037
Integra Realty Resources		617 RENAISSANCE WAY STE 100	Ridgeland	MS	39157
Interboro Packaging Corp.		114 Bracken Road	Montgomery	NY	12549
Interstate Business Solutions (Interstate & Associates LLC)		1635 Higdon Ferry Road , C142	Hot springs	AR	71913
Intrepid Psychological Services, PLLC	Unsubmitted	7512 N. 17th Street	McAllen	TX	78504
Jan Hall Promotions		1104Camwood Place	Brownsville	TX	78520
Jeans Restaurant Supply (TARI INC)	Unsubmitted	426 S. Staples	Corpus Christi	TX	78401
Johnson Controls, Inc.		2209 N South Padre Island Dr. Suite F	Corpus Christi	TX	78408
Johnstone Supply	Unsubmitted	4635 Mar St.	Brownsville	TX	78521



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A.	200 E Basse Rd, Floor 1	San Antonio	TX	78209
K12 Marketplace (K12 Marketplace, LLC)	P.O. 2115	Ozark	MO	65721
Kapalua Marine Fuels & Lubes	4911 E 7th Street	Austin	TX	78702
Karcher North America, Inc	6398 North Karcher Way	Aurora	CO	80239
Kennedy Bag Impressions, Inc.	P.O. Box 1628	Olmito	TX	78575
Keystone Parts and Supply	1870 FM 407	Rhome,	TX	76078
King Consultants Inc	1205 E 46th Street	Lubbock	TX	79404
Kingdom Roofing & Konstruction LLC.	7009 Bevington	Corpus Christi	TX	78413
Krish Ventures LLC (Ankur Bhandari)	4800 Steiner Ranch Blvd	Austin	TX	78732
LAKE SHORE LEARNING MATERIALS	2695 E. DOMINGUEZ ST.	CARSON	CA	90895
LaserLux (C&L Business Adventures, Inc.)	2000 E. Expressway 83	Mercedes	TX	78570
Lawson Products, Inc.	PO Box 734922	Chicago	IL	60673
LD Products, Inc.	3700 Cover Street	Long Beach	CA	90808
Leapopo Corporation, Inc	7111 Autumn Park	San Antonio	TX	78249
Lewis Electric Motors, Inc.	3300 Spur 54	Harlingen	TX	78551
LGC Global Energy FM	0 Woodward Suite 500 Detroit, MI 48	Detroit	MI	48202
Liberty Office Products (Liberty Data Products)	PO Box 630729	Houston	TX	77493
Life Safety Services, LLC	908 S 8th St	Louisville	KY	40203
Linebarger Goggan Blair & Sampson LLP	2700 Via Fortuna Ste. 500	Austin	TX	78746
Loera Builders , LLC	12 Sam Perl Blvd Ste D	Brownsville	TX	78520
Lowe's Companies INC	525 E Ruben Torres Blvd	Brownsville	TX	78520
M Motoring Auto Transport & Service	2441 Salerno Dr	Brownsville	TX	78520
Mag and Son Clothing	171 Pascone Place	Newington	CT	06111
Magik Water Solutions	33478 FM803	Los Fresnos	TX	78566
Maldonado Nursery & Landscaping INC.	402 W. Washington Ave.	Harlingen	TX	77084
Marco Artzpe Roofing	1278 Calle sanmarcos	Sanbenito	TX	78586
Mark One Manufacturing, Ltd. (Mark One Medical)	351 Industrial Drive	Minster	OH	45865
Marq Labs (Marque of Brands Americas, LLC)	291 Edgewood St	Alexandria	TN	37012
Martek Supply Source (FBA Holding Inc)	4270 Dow Rd, Suite 209	Melbourne	FL	32934
Martinez Hauling	446 N Indiana	Brownsville	TX	78521
Matera Paper Company (Ferguson Facilities Supply)	835 N. WW White Rd	San Antonio	TX	78219
MATHESON TRIGAS	1801 W BUSINESS 77	SAN BENITO	TX	78586
MAVICH	525 Commerce Street	Southlake	TX	76092
MaxiAids, LLC	42 executive blvc	farmingdale	NY	11735
MB Construcorordination	2720 vienna st	Brownsville	TX	78520
MC Austin (BKTB Group, Inc)	7801 North Lamar Blvd.	AUSTIN	TX	78752
McCoy's Building Supply (McCoy Corporation)	1350 IH 35 north	San Marcos	TX	78666
MCM Sporting Goods	1302 N. CONWAY AVE.	MISSION	TX	78572
Medek, LLC	315 E. Business Hwy 83	Alamo	TX	78516
Medify Air, LLC	1325 SW 30th Ave	Deerfield Beach	FL	33442
Mediwave Disposal, LLC	11090 Gateway Blvd. East	EL PASO	TX	79927
MEDPRO CONSULTING LLC	51 WESLEY CHAPEL BLVD SUITE #	WESLEY CHAPEL	FL	33544
Micron Disinfection, LLC	2100 N. Sepuveda Blvd	Manhattan Beach	CA	90266
Midstate Energy	23325 N 23rd Ave	Phoenix	AZ	85027
Midwest Air Filter	2215 apollo drive	Lansing	MI	48906

Viewed

Unsubmitted

Viewed



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

Millennium Engineers Group	PO Box 4569	Edinburg	TX	78540
Mini Wing USA	2516 via Tejon	Edinburg	CA	90274
Mobile Relays LLC (Ledema)	622 S. 11th St.	Mcallen	TX	78501
Modern Imaging Solutions Inc.	22122	Canoga Park	CA	91303
Molekule, Inc.	1301 Folsom St.	San Francisco	CA	94103
Moonlight Therapy Center	123 Old Port Isabel Rd Suite B7	Brownsville	TX	78521
Moore Supply / Hajoca Corp	2781 Robindale Rd. Suite B	Brownsville	TX	78526
MOVA TECH LLC	3409 Chardonay Dr	Brownsville	TX	78526
MTS Safety Products Inc.	P.O. BOX 204 GOLDEN, MS. 38847	GOLDEN	MS	38847
MURPHY ENTERPRISES OF AL INC	4364 Abbott's Way, , Alabama	HOOVER	AL	35226
Nalco Company, LLC	P.O. Box 730005	Dallas	TX	75373
National Art & School Supplies Inc.	National Art & School Supplies Inc.	Rahway	NJ	07065
NATIONAL ELECTRIC	3220 FM 802	BROWNSVILLE	TX	78526
National Safety Store (R&D Inventions LLC)	2450 Courage Blvd	BROWNSVILLE	TX	78521
NCH CORPORATION dba Certified Laboratories	2727 chemsearch blvd	IRVING	TX	75062
Nevill Document Solutions LLC	601A East Nolana Loop	Mcallen	TX	78504
NICKES MEDICAL SUPPLY, LLC	2820 N. Stanton St	El Paso	TX	79902
Nobelus	4841 Lumber Lane	Knoxville	TN	37921
NORESCO	One Research Dr., Ste. 400C	Westborough	MA	01581
NuWave Energy Solutions	320 Washington Street Suite 12	Norwell	MA	02061
NVS Corporate Services Inc	800 Wildrose Ln	Brownsville	TX	78520
Office Depot Kevin	2903 boulder creek dr	kingwood	TX	77339
Oransi	206 New Bern Place	Raleigh	NC	27601
Parts Town, LLC	27787 Network Place	Chicago	IL	60673
Performance Safety Group I, LP	781A Rudder Rd.	St. Louis	MO	63026
Perlmutter Purchasing Power	11434 Carninito Garcia	San Diego	CA	92131
Perry Mechanical Systems, LLC	PO Box 18757	Corpus Christi	TX	78480
Plan Room	6265 HWY 9	Felton	CA	95018
Ponder Business Services, LLC	950 Eagles Landing Parkway	Stockbridge	GA	30281
PortionPac Chemical Corporation	400 N Ashland Ave	Chicago	IL	60622
Positive Promotions, Inc.	PO Box 11537	Newark	NJ	7101
Poster Studio Express	103 Godwin Ave. PMB 255	Midland Park	NJ	07432
Power Washing Texas	2011 royal oak st	Brownsville	TX	78520
PPE WARRIOR INC	9058 N Deerbrook Trl	Brown Deer	WI	53223
Praxair Distribution Inc.	3557 east 14th street	brownsville	TX	78521
PRECISION IMAGING (L & B Group, LLC)	11450 rojas drive	El Paso	TX	79936
Precision Micrographics & Imaging , Inc.	8204 N Lamar C-20	Austin	TX	78753
Precision Saw and ToolTex	9071 FM 78	Converse	TX	78109
Premier Staffing Source, Inc. (Myma Cooks)	4840 Forbes Blvd., #200A	Lanham	MD	20706
PRINTCUBE, INC	4003 North 164th Drive	Goodyear	AZ	85395
PRO SOUND, INC. (EVANS)	1375 NE 123rd St	North Miami	FL	33161
Pro Tech Mechanical	1622 Saratoga Blvd	Corpus Christi	TX	78417
PRUNEDA TECH SERVICE (Octabio T Pruneda)	30897 FM 1575	Los Fresnos	TX	78566
PTSolutions (Berkshire Production Supply)	40333 w 14 mile rd	Novi	MI	48377
Pwxpress	1900 Coffeeport Rd	Jacksonville	FL	32208



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	6510 N 54TH ST	TAMPA	FL	33610
Quantum-Mechanical Contractors, LLC	2705 E Davis Rd.	Edinburg	TX	78542
Quill LLC	100 Schelter Rd	Lincolnshire	IL	60069
R.L. Abatement, Inc.	PO Box 332	Weslaco	TX	78599
R2Phyto Inc	20 WEST AVE	ATLANTIC HIGHLANDS	NJ	7716
Raba Kistner, Inc.	12821 W. Golden Lane	San Antonio	TX	78249
Raymond Geddes Co., inc	7110 BELAIR RD, STE 200	Baltimore	MD	21206
Ray's Business Products	PO BOX 443	Pharr	TX	78577
RDA Technologies	468 Regal Row	Brownsville	TX	78526
RE/MAX Sun Valley Realtors	1681 E Los Ebanos Blvd	Brownsville	TX	78520
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)	5250 Coffee Port Rd	Brownsville	TX	78521
Region One Education Service Center	1900 W Schunior St	Edinburg	TX	78541
RENOWORKS, LLC	105 Mason Ave	Brownsville	TX	78520
RG Environmental Services, LLC	123 Catalpa Street, Bldg 2	San Antonio	TX	78209
RGV Asphalt	722 E Anderson	Donna	TX	78537
RGV Cleaning Solutions (Roberto Pena)	PO Box 1105	Mission	TX	78573
RGV-AGC	PO Box 391	Harlingen	TX	78551
RI industries LLC dba RI Builders	858 w price rd	Brownsville	TX	78520
Richard Garza	129 Country Club Road	Brownsville	TX	78520
Rio Filter Supply	PO Box 3391	Harlingen	TX	78551
RIO GRANDE UNDERWRITERS INSURANCE GROUP INC	705 W Ocean Blvd Ste A	Los Fresnos	TX	78566
RML HAULING & MILLING, INC.	P O BOX 3293	BROWNSVILLE	TX	78523
RNDI Companies, Inc.	311 E I30	Rockwall	TX	75032
RO Engineering, PLLC	2705 E Davis Rd.	Edinburg, Texas	TX	78540
Rocketbook (Rocket Innovations, Inc.)	1 Nashua Street #2203	Boston	MA	02114
Rod Enterprise	1123 Gloria Ct	Sugar Land	TX	77478
Royal Refrigeration & Air Conditioning Inc	1755 N Vermillion Ave	Brownsville	TX	78521
RTI International	3040 East Cornwallis Road	Research Triangle Park	NC	27709
Rushco Energy Specialists, Inc.	10765 Tube Dr.	Fort Worth	TX	76053
Safeway Supply Inc	10841 Hillpoint Dr	San Antonio	TX	78217
Sam Tell and Son Inc	300 Smith St.	Farmingdale	NY	11735
Sarnis Club 8250	3590 W Alton Glore	Brownville	TX	78526
sanikarekit (hobet enterprises LLC)	2200 laredo road b4	brownsville	TX	78520
Sant Construction LLC	809 W La Quinta	Pharr	TX	78577
Scanning Pens Inc.	4585 140th Ave N	CLEARWATER	FL	33762
Scenicsource Fabrics, Inc.	1209 Security Dr.	Dallas	TX	75247
Schneider Electric	1650 W Crosby Rd.	Carrollton	TX	75006
School Outfitters	3736 Regent Ave	Cincinnati	OH	45212
SCHOOLLOCKER TEACHER SUPPLY	127 DOS PISTOLAS	DEL RIO	TX	78840
Seekr Essentials (Seekr global Inc)	4402 Travis Vista Drive	Austin	TX	78738
ServiceMaster Commercial Cleaning Services	1327 E. Washington Avenue #230	Harlingen	TX	78550
ServiceMaster Restoration by Empire	4264 Mesquite Ave	Lyford	TX	78569
Shred-it (Stencycle)	5710 E Grimes St	Harlingen	TX	78550
SIFS Plastics INC	24 Keith Ln	Brownsville	TX	78521
Signs and More LLC (Montemayor)	2108 Central Blvd.	Brownsville	TX	78520



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

Sitek Omni Servies, LLC	1780 Roughneck Drive	Humble	TX	77338
Sound Plastics & Machinery	1939 Royal Oak	Brownsville	TX	78520
SourceOne, Inc. (DE)	53 State Street	Boston	MA	02109
South Star Group	529 Old Port Isabel Rd 416	Brownsville	TX	78521
South Texas Leadership Center	3505 Boca Chica Blvd Suite 162	Brownsville	TX	78521
Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc.	1395 S Marietta Parkway	Marietta	GA	30067
Southwest Binding & Laminating	109 Millwell Ct.	Maryland Heights	MO	63043
Southwest School & Office Supply	3790 De Forest Circle	Jurupa Valley	CA	91752
Spiral Binding Company, Inc.	9200 Waterford Centre Blvd, Ste 550	Austin	TX	78758
Stallion Oilfield Services, Ltd.	950 Corbindale Rd.	Houston	TX	77024
STEM REVOLUTION LLC	1887 WHITNEY MESA DR #2072	Henderson	NV	89014
Studica	2326 LOCKPORT RD	SANBORN	NY	14132
Sun Aired Bag (QMS - SUN AIRED BAG)	3645 Inglewood Avenue,	Redondo Beach	CA	90278
Sustainability Solutions Group	11 Alex Cox Road	Tatamagouche	IS Canad	B0K1V0
Sustainable Modular Management	7500 Dallas Parkway	Plano	TX	75024
Synergy Builders Systems	6900 N 7th St	McAllen	TX	78504
T.L. RAMSEY HEATING & AIR INC.	P.O. Box 791507	San Antonio	TX	78279
Tadco Roofing (Tadco LLC)	902 E. Owassa Rd	Edinburg	TX	78542
TCI Roofing & Construction, Inc.	6705 N Taylor Rd	Mission	TX	78573
TDIndustries, Inc.	12700 O'Connor Rd.	San Antonio	TX	78233
Terrabella Environmental Services	1002 HOERNER RD	MISSION	TX	78572
Terracon Consultants, Inc.	PO Box 39	Lerning	TX	78050
Texas Fireguard, LLC	1506 Mid Cities Drive	Pharr	TX	78577
Texas Lift Techs (Texas Lift Techs LLC)	5757 East Rosedale Street	Fort Worth	TX	76112
The 10th	3533 Moreland Drive Suite A	Westaco	TX	78596
The Blue Book	6213 D St	Mercedes	TX	78570
the Class Ring Store/Gradzilla	10 BOXWOOD CT	Brownsville	TX	78521
The Grafik Spot, Ll.c.	800 East Main Street	Jefferson	NY	10535
The Gravastar Consulting and Personal Services LLC	2403 Buddy Owens	McAllen	TX	78504
The Great Box	1265 n Expressway 83	Brownsville	TX	78520
The Library Store, Inc.	3839 McKinney Avenue	Dallas	TX	75204
The Office Pal	3751 E. 14 st. Suite 106	Brownsville	TX	78521
The Yancy Group, Incorporated	301 E SOUTH ST	TREMONT	IL	61568
Theochem Laboratories	The Office Pal	Freehold	NJ	07728
Thirwall's Sheet Metal Company (THURCO INC)	233 Sherry Lane	Burleson	TX	76028
thyssenkrupp Elevator Corporation	7373 Rowlett Park Drive	Tampa	FL	33610
Titan Safety Products	225 Industrial Dr.	Brownsville	TX	78521
TMA LASER GROUP INC.	5655 Bear Lane, Suite 101B	Corpus Christi	TX	78405
Toshiba Business Solutions,USA	2045 Compton Ave Ste 201	Corona	CA	92881
Total Reporting	41656 Big Bear Blvd	BIG BEAR LAKE	CA	92315
TouchView Interactive	1101 W. Ferguson Ste D	Pharr	TX	78577
Tracs Manufacturing LLC	844 E Expressway 83	La Joya	TX	78560
Tradebe Environmental Services, LLC	830 W Chestnut St.	Brockton	MA	02301
	1739 Huntington Ln Suite 6N	Rockledge	FL	32955
	PO Box 674238	Dallas	TX	75267
	Unsubmitted			
	Unsubmitted			



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting October 5, 2021
CWQ# 002-22 Indoor Air Purification System for FNS Cafeterias & Kitchen

Trane Company	503 W. Owassa Road	Edinburg	TX	78539
Travis Association for the Blind	2307 Business Center Dr	Austin	TX	78744
Tri State Camera (Tri-State Camera Exch INC)	150 Sullivan St.	Brooklyn	NY	11231
Tri_gen Construction LLC	2900 N. Texas Blvd	Weslaco	TX	78599
Triple B Development Group LLC	1805 E Ruben M Torres Blvd B30	Brownsville	TX	78521
TTL, Inc.	3516 Greensboro Avenue	Tuscaloosa	AL	35401
Turnkey Technical Services LLC	1253 E Tri County Blvd	Oliver Springs	TN	37840
U.S. Water Services, Inc	12270 43rd Street NE	St. Michael	MIN	55376
UBEO LCC (Core Business Solutions)	4014 N. Jackson Rd.	Pharr	TX	78577
Unifirst Corp	515 E. Beech Ave	McAllen	TX	78501
Uniforms Sales and Laundry	355 W. Elizabeth Suite 102	Brownsville	TX	78520
Unify Energy Solutions	2517 Boardwalk Street	San Antonio	TX	78217
UNITED IMAGAING INC (UNITED RIBBON CO)	21201 Oxford St	Woodland Hills	CA	93065
United Medco, Inc.	4250 Coral Ridge Dr., #201	Coral Springs	FL	33065
United Rentals (North America), Inc	P.O. Box 100711	Atlanta	GA	30384
United Sales usa corp.	185 30	brooklyn	NY	11232
Unlimited Printing (NicoRay, LLC)	2685 N. Coria Street	Brownsville	TX	78520
Uweport LLC	3623 Latrobe dr ste 201	Charlotte	NC	28221
VALLEY GROCERS LLC.	634 E. FRONTON STREET	BROWNSVILLE	TX	78520
Valley Herbal Products	2601 Zinnia Ave	McAllen	TX	78504
Valley Trophy Service Co. (Lou D. Gracia)	1920 N. Vermillion Avenue	Brownsville	TX	78521
Vantage Point ITAD	4020 Will Rogers Parkway #600	Oklahoma City	OK	73108
Vega Roofing Inc.	9100 N Ware Rd	McAllen	TX	78504
Velnetworks LLC	7601 S Los Charcos Dr	Mission	TX	78572
Vertex Marketing	523 N Marathon Way	Stafford	TX	77477
Violet Defense	189 S. Orange Ave Suite 1400	Orlando	FL	32801
Virtual Builders Exchange	4047 Naco permin	San Antonio	TX	78217
Webbcard	445 Enrede Lane	Saint Augustine	FL	32095
Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	Western BRW	Dallas	TX	75284
western states fire protection	2601 E Expressway 83 Suite A	Donna	TX	78537
Whitmeyers Distilling Co., LLC	16711 Hollister St. Suite I	Houston	TX	77066
Woodhills Labs	7589 PRESTON RD STE 700	Frisco	TX	75034
World of Promotions	1310 Louis Ave	ELK Grove Village	IL	60007
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC	5420 N. Athol St.	Pharr	TX	78577
York Risk Services Group, Inc.	1 Upper Pond Road	Parsippany	NJ	07054
Zeitgeist Expressions Inc	PO BOX 29735	San Antonio	TX	78229
Zep Inc (ACUITY SPECIAL TY PRODUCTS, INC.)	0 CUMBERLAND BLVD, SE., SUITE	Atlanta	GA	30339
Ziwa Corporation	1952 S PRICE RD	BROWNSVILLE	TX	78521

487 Vendors Notified
23 Vendors Submitted