Central Community Unit School District 301

275 South Street

Burlington, IL 60109

School Bus Lease-Bid Tabulation

2/11/2026 @ 11:00 AM
]

Lease Year 1 Midwest Transit 26/27 Midwest Bus Sales 26/27 Central States Bus Sales 26/27 | Southern Bus & Mobility
8 |78 pass 33,998.00 271,984.00 - -
10 |30 pass* 31,240.00 312,400.00 - -
3 |21+1 or 12+3 wheelchair* 32,622.00 97,866.00 | No bid No bid No bid
1 |54+2 wheelchair 39,727.00 39,727.00 - -
22 | Total Bus Bid 721,977.00 - - -
Lease Year 2 Midwest Transit 27/28 Midwest Bus Sales 27/28 Central States Bus Sales 27/28 | Southern Bus & Mobility
8 |78 pass 33,998.00 271,984.00 - -
10 |30 pass* 31,240.00 312,400.00 - -
3 |21+1 or 12+3 wheelchair* 32,622.00 97,866.00 | No bid No bid No bid
1 |54+2 wheelchair 39,727.00 39,727.00 - -
22 | Total Bus Bid 721,977.00 - - -
Alternate Bid with A/C
Lease Year 1 Midwest Transit 26/27 Midwest Bus Sales 26/27 Central States Bus Sales 26/27 | Southern Bus & Mobility
8 |78 pass 41,317.00 330,536.00 - -
10 |30 pass* 31,240.00 312,400.00 Not per - -
3 |21+1 or 12+3 wheelchair* 32,622.00 97,866.00 bid specs - No bid No bid
1 |54+2 wheelchair 47,107.00 47,107.00 - -
22 | Total Bus Bid 787,909.00 - - -
Lease Year 2 Midwest Transit 27/28 Midwest Bus Sales 27/28 Central States Bus Sales 27/28 | Southern Bus & Mobility
8 |78 pass 41,317.00 330,536.00 - -
10 |30 pass* 31,240.00 312,400.00 - -
3 |21+1 or 12+3 wheelchair* 32,622.00 97,866.00 | No bid No bid No bid
1 |54+2 wheelchair 47,107.00 47,107.00 - -
22 | Total Bus Bid 787,909.00 - - -
Difference with a/c Midwest Transit Midwest Bus Sales Central States Bus Sales Southern Bus & Mobility
8 |Year 1(8 buses) 7,319.00 58,552.00 | No bid - No bid No bid
8 |Year 2 (8 buses) 7,319.00 58,552.00 - - - - -
Total Alternate Difference 117,104.00

* 30 passenger, 21+1or 12+3
wheelchair buses ALL include
full A/C

Incomplete bid packet. No bid on
new buses w/out A/C. Alternate
bid proposed older year models,
did not meet bid specifications

No bid due to inability to meet
delivery deadline

Only has small to
mid-size buses

Lowest bidder:

Midwest Transit Equipment




