Bid Request Number 3646 Addendum 1

Online Student Orientation and Student Management/Transcripting
Title System

LINE QTy uom UNIT PRICE
Comevo LLC
Student Orientation
1 1 EA $9,000.00
2 1 EA $0.00 | Included in Line 3
3 1 EA $5,040.00
4 1 EA No Bid | No Onsite Fee Charged
5 1 EA $0.00 | Included in Line 3
TOTAL $14,040.00
Student Management/Transcripting
6 1 EA No Bid
7 1 EA No Bid
8 1 EA No Bid
9 1 EA No Bid
10 1 EA No Bid
TOTAL $0.00
OrgSync
Student Orientation
1 1 EA $0.00 | Included in Line 2
2 1 EA $4,500.00
3 1 EA $0.00 | Included in Line 2
4 1 EA $0.00 | Included in Line 2
5 1 EA $2,500.00
TOTAL $7,000.00
Student Management/Transcripting
6 1 EA $2,000.00
7 1 EA $13,500.00
8 1 EA $0.00 | Included in Line 7
9 1 EA $0.00 | Included in Line 7
10 1 EA $2,500.00
TOTAL $18,000.00




