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GOVERNING BOARD AGENDA ITEM  
AMPHITHEATER UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 10 

________________________________________________________________________ 
 
DATE OF MEETING:    February 22, 2011 

 
TITLE: Approval of Out of State Travel 
_______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

 
BACKGROUND:    

 

STAFF 

 
Beth Malapanes from Canyon del Oro High School requests permission to attend the Marine 
Educator’s Workshop in San Diego, California, February 28-March 4, 2011.  There is no cost to the 
district.  Five school days will be missed and a substitute is not required. 

 
Cris Robson and Liane Futch from Canyon del Oro High School request permission to attend the 
National Science Teachers Association Conference in San Francisco, California, March 9-13, 2011.  
Approximate cost of the travel is $5,124 and will be paid for by federal funds designated for staff 
development.  Two school days will be missed and substitutes are required.  

 
Lee Street from Canyon del Oro High School requests permission to attend the Society for 
Photographic Education Conference in Atlanta, Georgia, March 10-13, 2011.  Approximate cost of 
the travel is $1,285 and will be paid for by federal funds designated for staff development.  Two 
school days will be missed and a substitute is required.  

 
Don Dickinson from Ironwood Ridge High School requests permission to attend the AP Annual 
Conference in San Francisco, California, July 19-24, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel is $2,657 
and will be paid for by federal funds designated for staff development.  No school days will be 
missed.  

 

STUDENTS 

 
Erik Wolf, Salina Wolf, and Julie Lau from Ironwood Ridge High School request permission to take 
24 students from IRHS Model United Nations Club to the Berkeley Model United Nations 
Conference in Berkeley, California, March 2-6, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel is $16,417 and 
will be paid for by student activity funds, gifts and donations, and tax credit donations.  Two school 
days will be missed and a substitute is required. 

 
Sarah San Jule and Alissa Gopp from Ironwood Ridge High School request permission to take 3 
students from Yearbook Club to the Herff Jones Yearbook Plant in Logan, Utah, March 10-12, 2011.  
Approximate cost of the travel is $2,376 and will be paid for by state funds, student activity funds, 
and tax credit donations.  Two school days will be missed and a substitute is required. 
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Teresa Irwin, Deanna Story, Brian Lincoln, and Victoria Story from Ironwood Ridge High School 
request permission to take 34 students from Encore Show Choir to the Burroughs Music Showcase 
Show Choir Competition in Burbank, California, March 31-April 3, 2011.  Approximate cost of the 
travel is $9,115 and will be paid for by student activity funds, gifts and donations, and tax credit 
donations.  One school day will be missed and a substitute is required. 
 
Paula Dorer, Lee Smith, Sharon Singer, Rachelle Hodge, Mark Hodge, and Glen Singleton from 
Ironwood Ridge High School request permission to take 54 students from Band/Orchestra to the 
Orchestra and Jazz Band Clinics in Anaheim, California, April 28-May 1, 2011.  Approximate cost of 
the travel is $19,096 and will be paid for by student activity funds, gifts and donations, and tax credit 
donations.  One and one half school days will be missed and a substitute is required. 
 
David Rogers, Janet Shipley, Sheri Woolridge, and Martin Escalante from Amphitheater High School 
request permission to take 52 students from Band/Orchestra to a music competition in San Antonio, 
Texas, April 28-May 1, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel is $24,712 and will be paid for by 
student activity funds and tax credit donations.  One school day will be missed and a substitute is 
required. 
 
Travel was previously approved at the November 16, 2010 Board meeting for Dee Fife, Ben Briggs, 
Cheri Newton, Julie Nicholas, John Fife, Danielle Mulleneaux, Susie Kittell, and Kevin Corner from 
Cross Middle School to take 84 students from the science department to Catalina Island Marine 
Institute in Catalina Island, California, March 1-4, 2011.  The chaperones have changed and will now 
include Amy Inbody, Patricia Montaño, Bobby Bosch, Tim Dooley, Lynn Shuman, Veronica Dvoskin, 
and Mary Foard. 
 
Travel was previously approved at the October 26, 2010 Board meeting for Russ Granillo, Shelly 
Matson, Pat McCaffrey, Cheryl Crawford, Bill Crawford, Mark Flannery, Cindy Flannery, Heather 
Pederson, Jessica Herring, Cory Layton, Christine Mulvey, Cathy Bishop, Bertha Rischar, Debbie 
Gaziano, Marie Alison, Heidi Elledge, Melissa Aragon, Megan Pederson, and Liz Sandin from Cross 
Middle School to take 125 students from band and choir to a performance and workshop in 
Anaheim, California, March 18-21, 2011.  The chaperones have changed and will now include 
Danielle Mulleneaux, Craig Allison, Marie Keith, Melinda Akowski, Tina Patrick, Tony Kadous, Ken 
Dunlap, Melody Buckner, Jeff Sargent, Jennifer Duran, Jane Cochran, Nicole Rogers, Pete 
Peterson, and Dan Howdeshell.  In addition, the cost has increased by $75 for an additional 
substitute. 
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 BUDGET 

CODE KEY 

 

140-11-100-2210-510-6360 Title II Staff development, Wetmore, registration 

140-11-100-2210-510-6582 Title II Staff development, Wetmore, staff travel 

140-11-100-2210-510-6113 Title II Staff development, Wetmore, substitute 

260-11-100-2210-281-6360 CTE Staff development, AHS, registration 

260-11-100-2210-281-6582 CTE Staff development, AHS, staff travel 

260-11-100-1001-281-6113 CTE Staff development, AHS, substitute 

526-00-100-3400-280-6892 Tax Credit Clsrm instr., bkstore, IRHS, student travel 

850-00-100-3400-280-6892 Student Activity Clsrm instr., bkstore, IRHS, student travel 

526-00-100-3400-280-6519 Tax Credit Clsrm instr., bkstore, IRHS, student transp. 

850-00-100-3400-280-6519 Student Activity Clsrm instr., bkstore, IRHS, student transp. 

530-00-100-3400-280-6113 Gifts & 

Donations 

Clsrm instr., bkstore, IRHS, substitute 

400-11-270-2190-280-6582 CTE Staff development, AHS, staff travel 

400-11-270-2190-280-6113 CTE Staff development, AHS, substitute 

526-00-100-3400-281-6519 Tax Credit Clsrm instr., bkstore, AHS, student transp. 

526-00-100-3400-281-6892 Tax Credit Clsrm instr., bkstore, AHS, student travel 

850-00-100-3400-281-6892 Student Activity Clsrm instr., bkstore, AHS, student travel 

530-00-100-3400-281-6113 Gifts & 

Donations 

Clsrm instr., bkstore, AHS, substitute 

 
 
________________________________________________________________________ 
INITIATED BY:                                                             

                                                                                
_______________________________________________________________________ 
Patrick Nelson, Associate Superintendent                                    Date:   February 14, 2011 

______________________________________ 
                                                                                    Vicki Balentine, Ph.D., Superintendent 


