
Policies to be updated: 3-Year and 5-Year Review: Summary of Updates 

 

2:10 School District Governance:    The policy, Legal References and footnotes are updated in response 
to a five-year review.  The policy and footnote 4 are updated to reflect changes to 5 ILCS 120/7€, 
amended by P.A. 101-640, permitting public bodies to meet with a quorum physically present during a 
public health emergence. 

 

2:20 Powers, and Duties of the School Board; Indemnification: The policy is unchanged.  The footnotes 
are updated for continuous improvement. 

 

2:30 School District Elections: The Legal References and footnotes are updated in response to a five-
year review. 

 

2:130 Board-Superintendent:  The policy and footnotes are updated in response to a five-year review.  
Statutory text from the footnotes was placed into the policy. 

 

2:240 Board Policy Development:  The policy and footnotes are updated with an optional subhead 
entitled Words Importing Gender.  These updates are in response to subscriber feedback and evolving 
diversity, equity, and inclusion work at the IASB. 

 

3:30 Chain of Command: The policy is unchanged Footnote 1 is added in response to a five-year review. 

 

5:10 Equal Employment Opportunity and Minority Recruitment:  The policy, Legal References, and 
footnotes are updated.  A new footnote is added in response to 775 ILCS 5/2-103.1, added by P.A. 101-
656, prohibiting an employer from disqualifying or taking other adverse action against 
applicants/employees based on conviction records unless certain conditions and notification 
requirements are met. 

 

5:30 Hiring Process and Criteria:  The policy is unchanged.  The footnotes are updated for the same 
reason stated in 5:10. 

 

6:100 Using Animals in the Educational Program:  The policy is unchanged.  The footnotes are updated 
to delete an administrative procedure reference and in response to a five-year review. 

 



6:145 Migrant Students:  The policy, Legal References, and footnotes are updated in response to a five-
year review. 

 

6:160 English Learners:   The policy and footnotes are updated.  Text was added to the Parent 
Involvement subhead restating the law requiring a district to establish a Transitional Bilingual Education 
Programs Parent Advisory Committee.  Footnotes explain 105 ILCS 5/14C-10. 

 

6:170 Title 1 Programs:  The policy is unchanged.  The footnotes are updated in response to a five-year 
review. 

 

6:235 Access to Electronic Networks: The policy, Legal References, Cross References, Administrative 
Procedure references, and footnotes are updated in response to the expanded use of educational 
technologies in schools and for other continuous improvements.  The Legal References are also updated 
in response to 20 U.S.C. 7131 and 115 ILCS 5/14(c-5) added by 101-620 Restrictions o Publications, High 
Schools, and 7:345, Use of Educational Technologies, are added to the Cross References. 

 

6:255 Assemblies and Ceremonies: The legal References are updated in response to a five-year review.  
The footnotes are also updated in response to a five-year review. 

 

6:260 Complaints about curriculum, Instructional Materials and Programs:  The policy, Legal 
References, Cross References, and footnotes are updated in response to a five-year review 

 

7:220 Bus Conduct: The policy is updated in response to a five-year review with a minor style change.  
The footnotes are updated in response to a five-year review. 

 

7:230 Misconduct by Students with Disabilities:  The policy is unchanged.  The footnotes are updated in 
response to a five-year review. 

 

7:280 Communicable and Chronic Infectious Disease:  The Legal References and footnotes are updated 
in response to a five-year review.  A repealed statue was deleted from the Legal Reference. 

 

8:890 Parent Organizations and Booster Clubs: The policy and footnotes are updated in response to a 
five-year review. 

 


