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AGENDA ITEM 4

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop X Regular Special
(A) Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

(B) X Action Item

) ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPT. FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
Presenter(s): LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED PROPOSAL
NO. 250906 ON MANUAL LABOR SERVICES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE
SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES

OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

(C) Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.
SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM

(P)




EagrLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

MEMORANDUM

To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
Luis A. Vélez

From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director 2024.06.24 13:31:31
-05'00'

Date: Thursday, June 27 2024

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 250906 for

Manual Labor Services

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends
that Sealed Proposal 250906 for Manual Labor Services be awarded in accordance
with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the attached
Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the Purchasing Department.

587 Madison Street ® EacLE Pass, TExas 78852 @ Ter (830) 773-5181 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

AN EquaL OrrorTuNITY EMPLOYER
F-280



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 250906 - MANUAL LABOR SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET

(price per hofrEsrtl:;zl sl;T:t(l)ll:rwise Hoied): CEDRO CONSTRUCTION, LLC | MEDINA'S BACKHOE SERVICE | MEDINA'S CONCRETE WORK SOUTH TEXAS ELECTRIC

EAGLE PASS, TX EAGLE PASS, TX EAGLE PASS, TX EAGLE PASS, TX
1 |ELECTRICAL (RATE PER HOUR) NO BID NO BID NO BID 125.00
2 |PLUMBING (RATE PER HOUR) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 |CARPENTRY (RATE PER HOUR) $ 60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. |MASONRY (RATE PER HOUR) $ 60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 |WELDING (RATE PER HOUR) $ 90.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6  |PAINTERS (RATE PER HOUR) $ 60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
7  |ROOFING REPAIR (RATE PER HOUR) $ 60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 |SUSPENDED CEILING (RATE PER HOUR) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |DRYWALL AND INSULATION (RATE PER HOUR) $ 60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 |CONCRETE LABOR/CEMENT MASON (RATE PERHOUR) | $ 60.00 NO BID $ 1325 NO BID
11 |CONCRETE FINISHERS $ 70.00 NO BID $ 16.50 NO BID
12 |CONCRETE FORM SETTERS $ 60.00 NO BID $ 15.50 NO BID
13 |CONCRETE REBAR SETTERS $ 60.00 NO BID $ 14.50 NO BID
14 |FENCE INSTALLATION/REPAIR $ 65.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$100.00 DUMP FEE
15 |MATERIAL HAULING (INCLUDING EQUIPMENT FEE) NO BID $20.00 PER LABOR HOUR NO BID NO BID
$60.00 TRACTOR FEE
16 |GROUND LEVELING (INCLUDING EQUIPMENT FEE) NO BID $20.00 PER LABOR HOUR NO BID NO BID
BID NOTES:
PLEASE NOTE SHADED AREA(S) DENOTES RECOMMENDED SERVICE PROVIDER(S) PAGE 1 OF 1



