
AGENDA ITEM 

boardBOARD OF TRUSTEES 
AGENDA 

     

(A)  Report Only Recognition 

Presenter(s): 

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation. 

(B)   Action Item 

Presenter(s): 
ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS & FINANCE
ROLANDO SALINAS, DEPUTY SUPT. FOR DISTRICT OPERATIONS 
MARIO E. GARCIA, FOOD SERVICE DIRECTOR
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR 

 Briefly describe the action required. 

(C)   Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required. 

   

(D)   Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding 
  this item. 

  Workshop Regular Special 
X 

BUDGETED FUNDS 

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD 
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 242210 FOR FOOD SERVICE CAFETERIA EQUIPMENT 
AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE 
AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED  BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR 
SERVICES  AS PER BOARD POLICY CH. 

X

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM 



MEMORANDUM 

To: 

From:  

Date: 

Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance 

Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director 

Tuesday, March 5, 2024

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 242210 Food Service
Cafeteria Equipment

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends 
that Sealed Proposal 242210 for Food Service Cafeteria Equipment be awarded 
in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as 
per the attached Tabulation Sheet. 

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please 
contact me at the Purchasing Department. 



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 242210 - FOOD SERVICE CAFETERIA EQUIPMENT - TABULATION SHEET

 A-TEX RESTAURANT 

SUPPLY 

 ACE MART RESTAURANT 

SUPPLY 

 CENTRAL RESTAURANT 

PRODUCT 

 JEAN'S RESTAURANT 

SUPPLY 

 MISSON RESTAURANT 

SUPPLY 
 VICCO SUPPLY LLC 

 SAN ANGELO, TX  SAN ANTONIO, TX  INDIANAPOLIS, IN  CORPUS CHRISTI, TX  MCALLEN, TX  EAGLE PASS, TX 

1 INSULATED FOOD CARRIER HOT/COLD

PROPOSED EQUIPMENT COST: 7,241.85$                        7,110.18$                        7,235.00$                        6,583.50$                        7,412.86$                        8,569.00$                        

SHIPPING/DELIVERY COST: 250.00$                           -$                                  -$                                  -$                                  -$                                  

INSTALLATION COST: $748.00 ** $302.50 ** -$                                  $475.00 ** -$                                  

OTHER COST:

OTHER COST DESCRIPTION:

EQUIPMENT LEAD TIME: 4 WEEKS 3 WEEKS 3 WEEKS 3 WEEKS NOT PROVIDED 4 WEEKS

PROPOSED ITEM AND SPECIFICATIONS: CAMBRO PCUCH615 CAMBRO PCUCH615 CAMBRO PCUCH615 CAMBRO PCUCH615 CAMBRO PCUCH615 CAMBRO PCUCH615

2 TWO SECTION GLASS DOOR MERCHANDISER

PROPOSED EQUIPMENT COST: 3,182.03$                        2,457.86$                        2,497.33$                        2,057.66$                        2,915.89$                        4,311.00$                        

SHIPPING/DELIVERY COST: -$                                  $0 *** 928.64$                           -$                                  -$                                  

INSTALLATION COST: $1,120.00 ** $302.50 ** -$                                  $475.00 ** -$                                  

OTHER COST:

OTHER COST DESCRIPTION:

EQUIPMENT LEAD TIME: 1 WEEK 3 WEEKS 4 WEEKS 3 WEEKS NOT PROVIDED 2 WEEKS

PROPOSED ITEM AND SPECIFICATIONS: ATOSA MCF8707GR OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC

3 REACH IN REFRIGERATOR TWO DOOR

PROPOSED EQUIPMENT COST: 2,876.13$                        4,801.35$                        4,497.53$                        4,705.33$                        5,623.52$                        5,802.00$                        

SHIPPING/DELIVERY COST: -$                                  $200.00 *** -$                                  -$                                  -$                                  

INSTALLATION COST: $1,120.00 ** $302.50 ** -$                                  $475.00 ** -$                                  

OTHER COST:

OTHER COST DESCRIPTION:

EQUIPMENT LEAD TIME: 1 WEEK 3 WEEKS 1 WEEK 1 WEEK NOT PROVIDED 2 WEEKS

PROPOSED ITEM AND SPECIFICATIONS: ATOSA MBF8507GR TRUE T-49-HC TRUE T-49-HC TRUE T-49-HC TRUE T-49-HC TRUE T-49-HC

4 TWO SECTION GLASS DOOR MERCHANDISER

PROPOSED EQUIPMENT COST: 3,182.03$                        2,457.86$                        2,497.33$                        2,057.66$                        2,915.89$                        4,311.00$                        

SHIPPING/DELIVERY COST: -$                                  $0 *** 928.64$                           -$                                  -$                                  

INSTALLATION COST: $1,120.00 ** $302.50 ** -$                                  $475.00 ** -$                                  

OTHER COST:

OTHER COST DESCRIPTION:

EQUIPMENT LEAD TIME: 1 WEEK 3 WEEKS 4 WEEKS 3 WEEKS NOT PROVIDED 2 WEEKS

PROPOSED ITEM AND SPECIFICATIONS: ATOSA MCF8707GR OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC

DESCRIPTION

ECC

DAEP
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 242210 - FOOD SERVICE CAFETERIA EQUIPMENT - TABULATION SHEET

 A-TEX RESTAURANT 

SUPPLY 

 ACE MART RESTAURANT 

SUPPLY 

 CENTRAL RESTAURANT 

PRODUCT 

 JEAN'S RESTAURANT 

SUPPLY 

 MISSON RESTAURANT 

SUPPLY 
 VICCO SUPPLY LLC 

 SAN ANGELO, TX  SAN ANTONIO, TX  INDIANAPOLIS, IN  CORPUS CHRISTI, TX  MCALLEN, TX  EAGLE PASS, TX 

DESCRIPTION

5 REACH IN REFRIGERATOR TWO DOOR

PROPOSED EQUIPMENT COST: 2,876.13$                        4,801.35$                        4,497.53$                        4,705.33$                        5,623.52$                        5,802.00$                        

SHIPPING/DELIVERY COST: -$                                  $200.00 *** -$                                  -$                                  -$                                  

INSTALLATION COST: $1,120.00 ** $302.50 ** -$                                  $475.00 ** -$                                  

OTHER COST:

OTHER COST DESCRIPTION:

EQUIPMENT LEAD TIME: 1 WEEK 3 WEEKS 1 WEEK 1 WEEK NOT PROVIDED 2 WEEKS

PROPOSED ITEM AND SPECIFICATIONS: ATOSA MBF8507GR TRUE T-49-HC TRUE T-49-HC TRUE T-49-HC TRUE T-49-HC TRUE T-49-HC

6 INSULATED FOOD CARRIER, HOT/COLD 

PROPOSED EQUIPMENT COST: 7,214.85$                        7,110.18$                        7,235.00$                        6,583.50$                        7,412.86$                        8,569.00$                        

SHIPPING/DELIVERY COST: 250.00$                           -$                                  -$                                  -$                                  -$                                  

INSTALLATION COST: $748.00 ** $203.50 ** -$                                  $475.00 ** -$                                  

OTHER COST:

OTHER COST DESCRIPTION:

EQUIPMENT LEAD TIME: 4 WEEKS 3 WEEKS 3 WEEKS 3 WEEKS NOT PROVIDED 4 WEEKS

PROPOSED ITEM AND SPECIFICATIONS: CAMBRO PCUCH615 CAMBRO PCUCH615 CAMBRO PCUCH615 CAMBRO PCUCH615 CAMBRO PCUCH615 CAMBRO PCUCH615

7 TWO SECTION GLASS DOOR MERCHANDISER

PROPOSED EQUIPMENT COST: 3,182.03$                        2,457.86$                        2,497.33$                        2,057.66$                        2,915.89$                        4,311.00$                        

SHIPPING/DELIVERY COST: -$                                  $0 *** 928.64$                           -$                                  -$                                  

INSTALLATION COST: $1,120.00 ** $302.50 ** $475.00 ** -$                                  

OTHER COST:

OTHER COST DESCRIPTION:

EQUIPMENT LEAD TIME: 1 WEEK 3 WEEKS 4 WEEKS 3 WEEKS NOT PROVIDED 2 WEEKS

PROPOSED ITEM AND SPECIFICATIONS: ATOSA MCF8707GR OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC OMCAN RE-CN-0041-G-HC

8 CONVEYOR/WRAPPER SYSTEM w/CONTAINERS

PROPOSED EQUIPMENT COST: 26,537.12$                      28,017.78$                      

SHIPPING/DELIVERY COST: 1,236.00$                        

INSTALLATION COST: 475.00$                           

OTHER COST:

OTHER COST DESCRIPTION:

EQUIPMENT LEAD TIME: 4 WEEKS 3 WEEKS

PROPOSED ITEM AND SPECIFICATIONS: MODELS 2218 & 1908E OLIVER 1908

BID NOTES:

* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED

** DENOTES OPTIONAL COST

*** COST CONDITIONAL ON MEETING CERTAIN PURCHASING REQUIREMENTS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

K.H. CENTRAL KITCHEN

KIRCHNER ELEM.
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