Title Classroom Technology-Related Equipment

Bid Type ' BID | |

Open Date 1/8/2010 8:00:00 AM Central

Close Date 1/22/2010 9:00:00 AM Central

Line 1 Projector - 3000 Lumens ANSI-XGA 1024 x 768 Resolution
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $ 682.00

CDWG 1 EA § 700.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA ' $ 813.70

CompUSA B2B 1 EA § 830.84

TFE 1 EA $ 839.00

Valiant IMC 1 EA § 848.00

Dell Inc 1 EA $§ 849.00

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA § 864.00

U.S.Tech 1 EA $ 882.00

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA § 896.95

ACP Direct | 1 EA NoBid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEN 1 EA No Bid

Copy Craft ‘ 1 EA $ -

Pyramid School Products 1 EA | No Bid

Line 2 Projector - 3000 Lumens ANSI-SVGA 800 X 600 Resolution
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA § 508.00

CDWG | 1  EA $ 520.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | $ 542.81

CompUSA B2B 1 EA § 553.54

Dell Inc 1 EA § 559.00

TFE 1 EA $ 559.00

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA § 564.00

Valiant IMC 1 EA § 568.36

U.S. Tech 1 EA § 592.00

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 | EA $§ 59795

ACP Direct 1 EA | No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA | No Bid




Copy Craft | 1 EA $ -
Pyramid School Products 1 EA | NoBid
Projector Ceiling Mount [
Line 3
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
B&H Photo Vido 1 EA § 4888
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $ 92.00
Valiant IMC 1 EA § 104.13
CDWG 1 EA § 107.00
TFE 1 EA § 109.75
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA ' $ 11895
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | $ 12141
U.S. Tech 1 EA $§ 125.00
Dell Inc 1 EA § 149.00
CompUSA B2B 1 EA No Bid
ACP Direct | 1 EA NoBid
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEM 1 EA No Bid
Copy Craft | 1 EA $ -
Pyramid School Products 1 EA No Bid
Man Pull-up/Pull-down Projection Screen[’
Line 4 84" Screen with 84" Wall Mounting Bracket
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
CompUSA B2B 1 EA § 4330
CDWG | 1 EA $  66.00
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $  68.00
Dell Inc | 1 EA $  69.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA ' $ 6932
Pyramid School Products 1 EA ' $ 8798
B&H Photo Vido 1 EA $ 94.50
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA § 100.95
U.S. Tech 1 EA § 102.00
TFE 1 EA § 158.00
Copy Craft 1 EA §$ 29892
ACP Direct 1 EA | No Bid
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE}M 1 EA No Bid




Valiant IMC (Alt 1) 1 EA §$ 79.98 Buhl WS-W80 w/AW6
Da-Lite Model B Manual Wall and Ceiling Projection Screen (no
TFE (Alt 1) 1 EA | $ 88.50 CSR) + Da-Lite Wall Mount Bracket
Man Pull-up/Pull-down Projection Screen(’
Line 5 100" Screen with 100" Wall Mounting Bracket
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
CompUSA B2B 1 EA | $ 5773
CDWG | 1 EA $  84.00
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA $ 88.00
Dell Inc | 1 EA $ 89.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | $ 91.43
Pyramid School Products 1 EA ' $ 10598
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA § 12695
TFE 1 EA $§ 325.00
Copy Craft 1 EA § 375.73
U.S. Tech 1 EA § -
ACP Direct 1 EA | No Bid
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA No Bid
96INX96IN MODEL B MANUAL WALL/CEILING MATTE
WHITE SQ FORMAT]
U.S. Tech (Alt 1) 1 EA $§ 126.00 96" x 96" - Matte White - 136" Diagonal
Valiant IMC (Alt 1) 1 EA $ 136.00 Buhl WS-W96 w/AW6
Draper 207139 Luma Manual Front Projection Screen with Auto
B&H Photo Vido (Alt 1) 1 EA ' $ 212.50 Return (96x96") B&H # DRLR9696HCG
TFE (Alt 1) 1 EA $ - |Da-Lite Model C Manual Wall and Ceiling Projection Screen
Document Cameral’
with AverPen[
Line 6 Must be compatible with SMART Technologies white boards.
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
CDWG 1 EA § 518.00
Dell Inc 1 EA $§ 549.00
Valiant IMC 1 EA § 555.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA ' $ 558.15
TFE | 1  EA $ 561.50




U.S.Tech | 1 EA $ 628.00

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA § 888.00

CompUSA B2B 1 EA  No Bid

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA No Bid

ACP Direct | 1 EA NoBid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA No Bid

Copy Craft | 1 EA $ -

Pyramid School Products 1 EA No Bid
Document Cameral’
with AverPen[

Line 7 Must be compatible with SMART Technologies white boards.

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

CDWG 1 EA § 575.00

Valiant IMC 1 EA $§ 63498

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA $ 637.88

TFE 1 EA § 64175

Dell Inc 1 EA § 649.00

U.S. Tech 1 EA § 716.00

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA § 969.00

CompUSA B2B 1 EA  No Bid

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

ACP Direct | 1 EA NoBid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA  No Bid

Copy Craft | 1 EA $ -

Pyramid School Products 1 EA No Bid
Document Cameral’
with AverPen[]

Line 8 Must be compatible with SMART Technologies white boards.

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

Dell Inc 1 EA § 455.00

CDWG 1 EA § 456.00




Valiant IMC 1 EA § 47748

TFE 1 EA § 481.30

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA $ 520.00

U.S. Tech | 1  EA $ 540.00

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA ' $ 828.00

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

ACP Direct | 1 EA NoBid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA No Bid

Copy Craft | 1 EA $ -

Pyramid School Products 1 EA No Bid

CompUSA B2B 1 EA | No Bid
Digital Camcorder 11010
Hard Drive?Minimum 30GB,Recommend 60GB, Secure
Digital (]
SD Cards?SDHC Compatible USB 2.0 cord, IEEE 1394 Firewire
(opt)A/V Connectors?2 Audio RCA, 1 Video RCA and S?Video[]
Zoom: Minimum 10X[J
Lithium Ion rechargeable battery(

Line 9 Softwa

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA § 283.99

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | $ 344.16

CompUSA B2B 1 EA § 371.12

CDWG | 1  EA $ 38649

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA ' $ 43895

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

U.S. Tech 1 EA | No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA | NoBid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA  No Bid

Copy Craft 1 EA $ -

Pyramid School Products 1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA | No Bid

TFE 1 EA  No Bid

Dell Inc 1 EA | No Bid




Presentation Center?Media Cartfor Large Projectors with
locking cabinet (Large enough to hold mini-tower) and [
steel pull-out mouse and keyboard shelf. [

Attached power strip/surge protector [
Adjustable/removable shelves(’

Line 10 Includes large work area for doc
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
CDWG 1 EA '$ 191.00
ACP Direct 1 EA '$ 211.00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEN 1 EA § 250.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA ' $ 25793
Pyramid School Products 1 EA ' $ 28698
Dell Inc 1 EA ' $ 499.00
U.S. Tech 1 EA § 644.00
Copy Craft 1 EA | $ 1,112.98
B&H Photo Vido 1 EA No Bid
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA | No Bid
Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid
TFE 1 EA | No Bid
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid
CompUSA B2B 1 EA | NoBid
Computer Headphones Without Microphone!’
Line 11 must be compatible with Dell Computers
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
CDWG 1 EA § 1.38
ACP Direct 1 EA § 1.99
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $ 6.29
Pyramid School Products 1 EA § 6.39
CompUSA B2B 1 EA § 7.22
Dell Inc 1 EA $ 9.00
U.S. Tech 1 EA § 10.00
TFE 1 EA $ 11.45
Copy Craft 1 EA $ 14.98
B&H Photo Vido 1 EA No Bid
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid




AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA  No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Valiant IMC (Alt 1) 1 EA $ 3.29 |Hamilton MS2L
Computer Headphones Compatible w/with microphone [’
Dell Computers(’

Line 12

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

ACP Direct 1 EA $ 3.80

Valiant IMC 1 EA § 4.29

Pyramid School Products 1 EA $ 7.99

TFE 1 EA $ 12.20

Dell Inc 1 EA $ 14.00

U.S. Tech 1 EA $ 17.00

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA ' $ 2495

Copy Craft | 1 EA $ 3819

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA No Bid

CDWG | 1 EA NoBid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
GPS System Garmin[][17][]
Approximate Dimensions: 4''x2"''x1"'[]
Resolution(WxH) 176 x 220 Pixels[
Display type: 256 level color TFT[
High Sensitivity Receiver, RoHS Version[]
USB Interface with USB cable included
US Basemap included, ability to add Basemaps!(’

Line 13 24MB

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

CDWG 1 EA § 165.61

Dell Inc 1 EA § 189.00

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

U.S. Tech 1 EA | No Bid

CompUSA B2B 1 EA  No Bid

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid




Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

ACP Direct | 1 EA NoBid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE}N 1 EA | No Bid

Copy Craft | 1 EA $ -

Pyramid School Products 1 EA | No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA No Bid

TFE 1 EA | No Bid
UHF Wireless Headset and Mic System[’
Wireless headset system with 150 + feet typical operating range
up to 300 + feet line of sight. Power, signal, AF LED status
indicators, and adjustable audio output level for optimal sound.
Externally powered !’

Line 14 by DC

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $ 94.85

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE}N 1 EA § 194.00

Dell Inc 1 EA § 589.00

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA No Bid

Copy Craft 1 EA $ -

Pyramid School Products 1 EA No Bid

Valiant IMC 1 EA | NoBid

TFE 1 EA  No Bid

CDWG 1 EA | No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

U.S. Tech 1 EA | NoBid

Line 15

2.4 Ghz Cordless Presenter ]

LCD timer, built in slideshow controls,[]
Integrated laser pointer. 50 foot operating[’]
Range. Wireless mini receiver, carrying’
Case, installation guide. [’




Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

Copy Craft 1 EA ' $ 3538

CDWG 1 EA $ 40.00

U.S. Tech 1 EA $ 58.00

Dell Inc 1 EA § 85.00

CompUSA B2B 1 EA | No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Pyramid School Products 1 EA | NoBid

Valiant IMC 1 EA | No Bid

TFE 1 EA | No Bid

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA | NoBid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA | No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA No Bid
Digital Flip Video Camcorder Ultra
A/V cable, LCD display?1.5" color[]
Flash card, digital zoom 2 x, video [
capture -3600 sec., 2GB flash-integrated [’
(soldered memory), USB cord, 1 composite[
video/audio output, built in microphone(’]

Line 16

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

Dell Inc 1 EA § 114.00

Valiant IMC 1 EA § 11949

CDWG 1 EA § 126.00

TFE 1 EA § 132.00

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA § 132.00

ACP Direct | 1 EA $ 13500

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA ' $ 13595

U.S. Tech | 1  EA $ 154.00

CompUSA B2B 1 EA § 176.05

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid

Copy Craft | 1 EA $ -




Pyramid School Products 1 EA No Bid
Listening Center (8 positions w/volume control) [’

Line 17

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

ACP Direct 1 EA §  58.00

Pyramid School Products 1 EA ' $§ 6698

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 | EA $§ 6895

U.S. Tech | 1 EA $ 118.00

CompUSA B2B 1 EA  No Bid

Dell Inc | 1 EA NoBid

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA  No Bid

Copy Craft 1 EA $ -

Valiant IMC 1 EA $ -

TFE 1 EA | No Bid

CDWG 1 EA  No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Valiant IMC (Alt 1) 1 EA § 49.97 Hamilton MPC-8V-300F
CD Player/Cassette Player Recorder Boombox[]

Line 18

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

TFE 1 EA § 31.00

CDWG 1 EA $ 32.00

ACP Direct 1 EA § 44.00

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $ 44.22

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA ' $ 4695

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE)N 1 EA $ 47.95

Pyramid School Products 1 EA ' $ 5795

U.S. Tech | 1 EA $ 240.00

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid

Dell Inc | 1 EA NoBid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid

Copy Craft | 1 EA $ -

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid




Valiant IMC (Alt 1)

EA

$ 32.00

Coby CX-CD248

Line 19 Laminator (Heat)

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

Pyramid School Products 1 EA | $ 1,350.95

Valiant IMC | 1 EA $ 1,443.90

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA | $ 1,549.95

bookbinding & laminating inc 1 EA $ 1,589.50

U.S. Tech 1 EA | $ 2,055.00

Copy Craft 1 EA | $ 2,060.09

Dell Inc 1 EA | No Bid

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | NoBid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA | NoBid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA No Bid

TFE 1 EA | No Bid

CDWG 1 EA  No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Line 20 Utility Cart 3-shelf with electrical outlets

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

Pyramid School Products 1 EA '$§ 6898

ACP Direct | 1  EA $ 76.00

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $ 85.95

Dell Inc 1 EA § 179.00

U.S. Tech 1 EA § 298.00

CompUSA B2B 1 EA  No Bid

TFE 1 EA | No Bid

CDWG 1 EA  No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | NoBid

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA  No Bid

Valiant IMC (Alt 1) 1 EA § 68.00 Buhl PC1642E
Adjustable TV Cart[]

Copy Craft (Alt 1) 1 EA § 155.11

Copy Craft (Alt 2) 1 EA § 21.23 Basic Home/Office Surge Protector, 6 Outlets, 15ft Cord




Line 21 DVD/VCR Combo Player
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
CDWG 1 EA $ 70.00

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA $ 71.00

Valiant IMC 1 EA $ 74.00

CompUSA B2B 1 EA § 81.04

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA $ 83.95

Dell Inc 1 EA § 8447

TFE 1 EA $ 90.00

Copy Craft 1 EA $ 20420

U.S. Tech 1 EA § 242.00

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid

Pyramid School Products 1 EA | No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

ACP Direct | 1 EA NoBid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Line 22 DVD Players +/- Recorders
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
CDWG 1 EA § 112.00

Valiant IMC 1 EA § 116.00

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA ' $ 11995

CompUSA B2B 1 EA § 144.07

U.S. Tech 1 EA § 186.00

Copy Craft 1 EA § 204.20

TFE 1 EA | $ 1,350.00

Pyramid School Products 1 EA | NoBid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

ACP Direct 1 EA | NoBid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA  No Bid

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Dell Inc 1 EA $ -




DVD Home Theater System[’

DVD Player/AV Receiver Surround [’
Sound, Dolby Pro Logic II, Dolby[’
Digital, DTS decoder, 125 watt-4[]
Channels: 250 watt-2 channels.[]
USB direct input, iPod ready.[]
1xaudio line-in front, 1 x USB front[]

Line 23 1x HDMI output rear, 1 x com
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
CDWG 1 EA § 166.41
CompUSA B2B 1 EA § 190.76
U.S. Tech 1 EA § 423.00
Dell Inc 1 EA | No Bid
Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA No Bid
B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | NoBid
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA | No Bid
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid
ACP Direct | 1 EA NoBid
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE) 1 EA | No Bid
Copy Craft | 1  EA $ -
Pyramid School Products 1 EA | No Bid
Valiant IMC 1 EA | No Bid
TFE 1 EA | No Bid
Bluetooth over the ear microphone. Must be compatible with
Line 24 Dell computers.
Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification
CompUSA B2B 1 EA $ 47.92
U.S.Tech 1 EA $ 100.00
B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | NoBid
Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA | No Bid
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid
ACP Direct | 1 EA NoBid
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE) 1 EA | No Bid
Copy Craft | 1  EA $ -
Pyramid School Products 1 EA | No Bid
Valiant IMC | 1 EA NoBid




TFE 1 EA  No Bid

CDWG 1 EA | No Bid

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Line 25 USB Microphone

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

CompUSA B2B 1 EA §$ 1648

Dell Inc 1 EA $ 18.00

TFE 1 EA $ 20.20

Copy Craft 1 EA ' $§ 2296

CDWG 1 EA $ 26.11

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | NoBid

B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA | No Bid

ACP Direct | 1 EA NoBid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA  No Bid

Pyramid School Products 1 EA | No Bid

Valiant IMC | 1 EA NoBid
Part # 980186-0403
Logitech Microphone!]
LOGITECH DESKTOP MICROPHONE USB MIC FOR PC OR
MACO

U.S. Tech (Alt 1) 1 EA $ 30.00 Noise Canceling - 100Hz to 16kHz - Cable

Line 26 USB Headphone with microphone

Name QTY UOM | Unit Price |Alternate Specification

CompUSA B2B 1 EA $ 17.62

Pyramid School Products 1 EA $ 17.98

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 EA ' $ 2495

CDWG 1 EA $ 26.11

ACP Direct 1 EA $ 28.00

Dell Inc 1 EA §  29.00

Copy Craft 1 EA § 38.19

TFE 1 EA $ 45.10

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 EA | No Bid

US.Tech | 1 EA $ -




B&H Photo Vido 1 EA | No Bid
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTE} 1 EA No Bid
Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 EA No Bid
Valiant IMC (Alt 1) 1 EA | $ 17.50 Hamilton HA2USBSM
Logitech H330 USB Stereo Headset! |
USB HEADSET H3300]
U.S. Tech (Alt 1) 1 EA | $ 35.00 'Wired Connectivity - Stereo - Over-the-head




